
City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Prepared by Purchasing Deoartment 3/16/2015

Opened:  March 2, 2015

For:
Regulatory Database Information and Environmentally 
Related Material

Aqushen, LLC-        
dba: Agushen-TRS

GeoSearch, LLC. MapPro Environmental 
Data, Inc.

SCI Engineering, Inc.

6100005660 DS
2520 S. IH 35,                
Suite 200

3006 Bee Caves, Suite 
A-230

P.O. Box 37427 700 N. St. Mary's 
Street, Suite 1400

Item Description

Estimated 
Annual 

Quantity
Austin,
TX 78704

Austin, 
TX 78746

Houston, 
TX 77237

San Antonio, 
TX 78205

1 Database Information Package Report 25
(Range up to 1 mile, Items 2-11)
Unit Price $375.00 $265.00 $550.00 $325.00
Extended Price  $9,375.00 $6,625.00 $13,750.00 $8,125.00

2 Database Report 5
Unit Price $90.00 $70.00 $125.00 $170.00
Extended Price $450.00 $350.00 $625.00 $850.00

3 Scanned Digital USGS 7.5 minute 5
Topographic Map of the area of concern
Unit Price $10.00 $10.00 $15.00 No Bid
Extended Price $50.00 $50.00 $75.00

4 Historical Topographic Map Report 5
Unit Price $30.00 $60.00 $35.00 $135.00
Extended Price $150.00 $300.00 $175.00 $675.00

5 City Directory Search Report 2
Unit Price $75.00 $90.00 $100.00 $135.00
Extended Price $150.00 $180.00 $200.00 $270.00

6 Texas Historic Photo Decade Package 5
Unit Price $60.00 $65.00 $75.00 $165.00
Extended Price $300.00 $325.00 $375.00 $825.00

7 Sanborn Fire Insurance Map 2
Unit Price $135.00 $60.00 $200.00 $115.00
Extended Price $270.00 $120.00 $400.00 $230.00

8 National Wetlands Inventory Map 5
Unit Price $15.00 $25.00 $10.00 No Bid
Extended Price $75.00 $125.00 $50.00

9 Soil Survey Data Report 3
Unit Price $20.00 $25.00 $10.00 $55.00
Extended Price $60.00 $75.00 $30.00 $165.00

10 Floodplains Map 5
Unit Price $10.00 $25.00 $10.00 No Bid
Extended Price $50.00 $125.00 $50.00

11 Extended Database Information Package Report 3
Unit Price $150.00 $310.00 $250.00 No Bid
Extended Price $450.00 $930.00 $750.00

12 Enviromental Lien Search Report 2
Unit Price $95.00 $150.00 $100.00 $270.00
Extended Price $190.00 $300.00 $200.00 $540.00

13 Geospatial Features and Data 20
Unit Price $25.00 $200.00 $25.00 $115.00
Extended Price $500.00 $4,000.00 $500.00 $2,300.00

14 Reissuing of Database Information Package 5
Unit Price $225.00 $135.00 $250.00 No Bid
Extended Price $1,125.00 $675.00 $1,250.00

15 NEPA Survey Report 5
Unit Price $135.00 $90.00 $160.00 $120.00
Extended Price $675.00 $450.00 $800.00 $600.00

16 Water Well Search Report 2
Unit Price $95.00 $125.00 $150.00 $180.00
Extended Price $190.00 $250.00 $300.00 $360.00

17
Oil and Gas Well Texas Railroad Commission               
Search Report 2
Unit Price $95.00 $145.00 $100.00 $180.00
Extended Price $190.00 $290.00 $200.00 $360.00

18 Chain of Title Search Report 2
Unit Price $225.00 $295.00 $250.00 $370.00
Extended Price $450.00 $590.00 $500.00 $740.00

19 Data Collection Technician 20
Unit Price $35.00 $50.00 $45.00 $70.00
Extended Price $700.00 $1,000.00 $900.00 $1,400.00

Delivery - Electronically 1 Day 1 Day 1 Day 1 Day

Payment Terms Net  30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30


	Draft 61-5660

