
City of San Antonio
Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: October 10, 2014

For: Book Jackets and Music CD Poly Cases
Brodart Co. Midwest Tape, LLC

6100005075 VF 500 Arch Street 6950 Hall Street

Item Description
Estimated 

Annual 
Quantity

Williamsport,
PA  17701

Holland,
OH  43528

1 BOOK JACKETS, Pre-Cut and Rolls    
1a # 9 Pre-Cut Book Jacket 150 $10.66 No Bid

Manufacturer Name Brodart Co.
Manufacturer Part # 10-409-602
Quantity per pack 100 each/pack
Subtotal $1,599.00

1b # 10 Pre-Cut Book Jacket 150 $12.00 No Bid
Manufacturer Name Brodart Co.
Manufacturer Part # 10-409-603
Quantity per pack 100 each/pack
Subtotal $1,800.00

1c # 12 Pre-Cut Book Jacket 100 $15.35 No Bid
Manufacturer Name Brodart Co.
Manufacturer Part # 10-409-604
Quantity per pack 100 each/pack
Subtotal $1,535.00

1d # 14 Pre-Cut Book Jacket 10 $19.80 No Bid
Manufacturer Name Brodart Co.
Manufacturer Part # 10-409-605
Quantity per pack 100 each/pack
Subtotal $198.00

1e # 16 Pre-Cut Book Jacket 10 $22.98 No Bid
Manufacturer Name Brodart Co.
Manufacturer Part # 10-409-606
Quantity per pack 100 each/pack
Subtotal $229.80

1f # 16 Book Jacket Rolls 5 $27.59 No Bid
Manufacturer Name Brodart Co.
Manufacturer Part # 10-516-001
Quantity per pack 100 yards/roll
Subtotal $137.95

2 BOOK JACKET PVA ADHESIVE 300 $1.47 No Bid
Manufacturer Name Brodart Co.
Manufacturer Part # 40-415-001
Subtotal $441.00

3 MUSIC CD POLYBOX CASES, Single and Double    
3a Music CD Poly Cases, Single 3,000 No Bid $0.72

Manufacturer Name Single CD Poly Box - Clear
Manufacturer Part # 10254310
Subtotal $2,160.00

3b Music CD Poly Cases, Double 1,000 No Bid $0.79
Manufacturer Name Double CD Poly Box - Clear
Manufacturer Part # 10285349
Subtotal $790.00

Terms Net 30 Net 30

Estimated Annual Total
Estimated Annual Award
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