City of San Antonio Draft
Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 17, 2015
Annual Contract For SAPD Narcotics Test Kits
For: Alcohol Countermeasure |Mistral Security Scott Company Sirchie Acquisition
or:
Systems, Inc. Incorporated Company, LLC.
6100005949 AAS 10952 Santa Monica 7910Woodmont Avenue
Blvd. #820 1422 Wood Creek Drive |100 Hunter Place
Los Angeles, Bethesda Flower Mound Youngsville
Item Description Estimated [CA 90025 MD 20814 TX 75028 NC 27596
Quantity
1 Nark Il Marquis Reagent, Opium Alkaloids 60
Manufacturer: Sirchie Each No Bid Mistral Security Scott Company Sirchie
Product No.: NARK2001 85101 Incomplete Nark2001
No. Of Tests /Kit: 10 Incomplete 10
Price Each $8.47 $8.25 $11.00
Price Total $508.20 $495.00 $660.00
Unlimited Shelf Life/ Expiration Date: 2 years Incomplete Unlimited
Warranty: 1 year Incomplete 1 year
Nark Il Nitric Acid Regent
2 (Heroin/Morphine) 60 No Bid
Manufacturer: Sirchie Each Mistral Security Scott Company Sirchie
Product No.: NARK2002 85104 Incomplete Nark2002
No. Of Tests /Kit: 10 Incomplete 10
Price Each $9.20 $9.25 $11.00
Price Total $552.00 $555.00 $660.00
Unlimited Shelf Life/ Expiration Date: 2 years Incomplete Unlimited
Warranty: 1 year Incomplete 1 year
Nark Il Dille-Koppany Reagent
3 (Barbiturates) 15 No Bid
Manufacturer: Sirchie Each Mistral Security Scott Company Sirchie
Product No.: NARK2003 85107 Incomplete Nark2003
No. Of Tests /Kit: 10 Incomplete 10
Price Each $10.62 $9.25 $14.00
Price Total $159.30 $138.75 $210.00
Unlimited Shelf Life/ Expiration Date: 2 years Incomplete Unlimited
Warranty: 1 year Incomplete 1 year
4 Nark Il Ehrlichs Modified Reagent (LSD) 15 No Bid
Manufacturer: Sirchie Each Mistral Security Scott Company Sirchie
Product No.: NARK2004 85110 Incomplete Nark2004
No. Of Tests /Kit: 10 Incomplete 10
Price Each $13.14 $9.25 $14.00
Price Total $197.10 $138.75 $210.00
Unlimited Shelf Life/ Expiration Date: 2 years Incomplete Unlimited
Warranty: 1 year Incomplete 1 year
Nark Il Duguenois-Levine Reagent
5 (Marijuana Hashish Hash-QOil THC) 150 No Bid
Manufacturer: Sirchie Each Mistral Security Scott Company Sirchie
Product No.: NARK2005 85113 Incomplete Nark2005
No. Of Tests /Kit: 10 Incomplete 10
Price Each $13.32 $20.00 $14.00
Price Total $1,998.00 $3,000.00 $2,100.00
Unlimited Shelf Life/ Expiration Date: 2 years Incomplete Unlimited
Warranty: 1 year Incomplete 1 year
Nark Il Scott Reagent Modified - for
6 Cocaine Salts and Cocaine Base 900 No Bid
Manufacturer: Sirchie Each Mistral Security Scott Company Sirchie
Product No.: NARK2007 85122 Incomplete Nark2007
No. Of Tests /Kit: 10 Incomplete 10
Price Each $13.29 $7.50 $14.00
Price Total $11,961.00 $6,750.00 $12,600.00
Unlimited Shelf Life/ Expiration Date: 2 years Incomplete Unlimited
Warranty: 1 year Incomplete 1 year
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7 Nark Il Methadone Reagent 60 No Bid
Manufacturer: Sirchie Each Mistral Security Scott Company Sirchie
Product No.: NARK2008 85125 Incomplete Nark2008
No. Of Tests /Kit: 10 Incomplete 10
Price Each $10.55 $9.25 $14.00
Price Total $633.00 $555.00 $840.00
Unlimited Shelf Life/ Expiration Date: 2 years Incomplete Unlimited
Warranty: 1 year Incomplete 1 year

8 Nark Il PCP Methaqualone Reagent 15 No Bid
Manufacturer: Sirchie Each Mistral Security Scott Company Sirchie
Product No.: NARK2009 85143 Incomplete Nark2009
No. Of Tests /Kit: 10 Incomplete 10
Price Each $10.79 $9.25 $14.00
Price Total $161.85 $138.75 $210.00
Unlimited Shelf Life/ Expiration Date: 2 years Incomplete Unlimited
Warranty: 1 year Incomplete 1 year
Nark Il Special Opiates Reagent

9 (Fentanyl/Heroin/Oxycodone) 30 No Bid
Manufacturer: Sirchie Each Mistral Security Scott Company Sirchie
Product No.: NARK20010 85137 Incomplete Nark20010
No. Of Tests /Kit: 10 Incomplete 10
Price Each $8.51 $9.25 $14.00
Price Total $255.30 $277.50 $420.00
Unlimited Shelf Life/ Expiration Date: 2 years Incomplete Unlimited
Warranty: 1 year Incomplete 1 year
Nark 1l Meckes Modified Reagent (All

10 Heroin) 525 No Bid
Manufacturer: Sirchie Each Mistral Security Scott Company Sirchie
Product No.: NARK20011 85140 Incomplete Nark20011
No. Of Tests /Kit: 10 Incomplete 10
Price Each $10.66 $9.25 $14.00
Price Total $5,596.50 $4,856.25 $7,350.00
Unlimited Shelf Life/ Expiration Date: 2 years Incomplete Unlimited
Warranty: 1 year Incomplete 1 year
Nark Il Ephedrine Psudoephedrine

11 Reagent 15 No Bid
Manufacturer: Sirchie Each Mistral Security Scott Company Sirchie
Product No.: NARK20013 85155 Incomplete Nark20013
No. Of Tests /Kit: 10 Incomplete 10
Price Each $11.25 $9.25 $14.00
Price Total $168.75 $138.75 $210.00
Unlimited Shelf Life/ Expiration Date: 2 years Incomplete Unlimited
Warranty: 1 year Incomplete 1 year
Nark Il Sodium Nitro Prusside Reagent

12 (Methamphetamine/MDMA) 900 No Bid
Manufacturer: Sirchie Each Mistral Security Scott Company Sirchie
Product No.: NARK20015 85164 Incomplete Nark20015
No. Of Tests /Kit: 10 Incomplete 10
Price Each $13.11 $9.25 $14.00
Price Total $11,799.00 $8,325.00 $12,600.00
Unlimited Shelf Life/ Expiration Date: 2 years Incomplete Unlimited
Warranty: 1 year Incomplete 1 year
Nark Il KN Reagent (Marijuana Green

13 Plant and Seed) 15 No Bid
Manufacturer: Sirchie Each Mistral Security Scott Company Sirchie
Product No.: NARK20020 85119 Incomplete Nark20020
No. Of Tests /Kit: 10 Incomplete 10
Price Each $11.12 $9.25 $14.00
Price Total $166.80 $138.75 $210.00
Unlimited Shelf Life/ Expiration Date: 2 years Incomplete Unlimited
Warranty: 1 year Incomplete 1 year

14 Nark Il GHB Reagent 15 No Bid
Manufacturer: Sirchie Each Mistral Security Scott Company Sirchie
Product No.: NARK20021 85149 Incomplete Nark20021
No. Of Tests /Kit: 10 Incomplete 5
Price Each $8.48 $9.25 $14.00
Price Total $127.20 $138.75 $210.00
Unlimited Shelf Life/ Expiration Date: 2 years Incomplete Unlimited
Warranty: 1 year Incomplete 1 year
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15 Nark Il Synthetic Cannabinoid Reagent 75 No Bid
Manufacturer: Sirchie Each Mistral Security Scott Company Sirchie
Product No.: NARK20023 85205A/13 Incomplete Nark20023
No. Of Tests /Kit: 5 Incomplete 10
Price Each $13.13 $9.25 $14.00
Price Total $984.75 $693.75 $1,050.00
Unlimited Shelf Life/ Expiration Date: 2 years Incomplete Unlimited
Warranty: 1 year Incomplete 1 year

16 Nark Il MDPV Bath Salts Reagents 30 No Bid
Manufacturer: Sirchie Each Mistral Security Scott Company Sirchie
Product No.: NARK20024 85170 Incomplete Nark20024
No. Of Tests /Kit: 10 Incomplete 10
Price Each $8.48 $9.25 $14.00
Price Total $254.40 $277.50 $420.00
Unlimited Shelf Life/ Expiration Date: 2 years Incomplete Unlimited
Warranty: 1 year Incomplete 1 year

17 Nark Il Mephedrone Bath Salts Reagent 30 No Bid
Manufacturer: Sirchie Each Mistral Security Scott Company Sirchie
Product No.: NARK20025 85173 Incomplete Nark20025
No. Of Tests /Kit: 10 Incomplete 10
Price Each $10.92 $9.25 $14.00
Price Total $327.60 $277.50 $420.00
Unlimited Shelf Life/ Expiration Date: 2 years Incomplete Unlimited
Warranty: 1 year Incomplete 1 year
Nark Il a-PVP (alpha Pyrrolidin-

18 opentiophenone) Bath Salts Reagent 30 No Bid
Manufacturer: Sirchie Each Mistral Security Scott Company Sirchie
Product No.: NARK20026 85195 Incomplete Nark20026
No. Of Tests /Kit: 10 Incomplete 10
Price Each $13.28 $9.25 $14.00
Price Total $398.40 $277.50 $420.00
Unlimited Shelf Life/ Expiration Date: 2 years Incomplete Unlimited
Warranty: 1 year Incomplete 1 year
Nark Il 2-C Synthetics Reagent

19 (MDMSA/LS) 30 No Bid
Manufacturer: Sirchie Each Mistral Security Scott Company Sirchie
Product No.: NARK20029 85203 Incomplete Nark20029
No. Of Tests /Kit: 10 Incomplete 10
Price Each $10.78 $9.25 $14.00
Price Total $323.40 $277.50 $420.00
Unlimited Shelf Life/ Expiration Date: 2 years Incomplete Unlimited
Warranty: 1 year Incomplete 1 year
Nark Il Psilocybin/Psilocin Mushrooms

20 Reagent 225 No Bid
Manufacturer: Sirchie Each Mistral Security Scott Company Sirchie
Product No.: NARK20029 85167 Incomplete Nark20029
No. Of Tests /Kit: 10 Incomplete 10
Price Each $10.82 $9.25 $14.00
Price Total $2,434.50 $2,081.25 $3,150.00
Unlimited Shelf Life/ Expiration Date: 2 years Incomplete Unlimited
Warranty: 1 year Incomplete 1 year

21 Nark Il Mollies Reagent 60 No Bid
Manufacturer: Sirchie Each Mistral Security Scott Company Sirchie
Product No.: NARK20032 85202 Incomplete Nark20032
No. Of Tests /Kit: 10 Incomplete 10
Price Each $13.95 $9.25 $11.00
Price Total $837.00 $555.00 $660.00
Unlimited Shelf Life/ Expiration Date: 2 years Incomplete Unlimited
Warranty: 1 year Incomplete 1 year
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22 NS20150 Cocaine ID Swipes 18
Manufacturer: Sirchie Each Securetec Mistral Security Scott Company Sirchie
Product No.: NS20150 LD-06-COC 85105 Incomplete NS20150
No. Of Tests /Kit: 50 10 Incomplete 50 Swipes/Box
Price Each $650.00 $18.37 $8.25 $31.96
Price Total $11,700.00 $330.66 $148.50 $575.28
Unlimited Shelf Life/ Expiration Date: 2 years 2 years Incomplete Unlimited
Warranty: 2 years 1 year Incomplete 1 year
Nark Il Valium Rohypnol Ketamine
23 Reagent 15 No Bid

Manufacturer: Sirchie Each Mistral Security Scott Company Sirchie
Product No.: NARK20014 85158 Incomplete Nark20014
No. Of Tests /Kit: 10 Incomplete 10
Price Each $10.65 $9.25 $14.00
Price Total $159.75 $138.75 $210.00
Unlimited Shelf Life/ Expiration Date: 2 years Incomplete Unlimited
Warranty: 1 year Incomplete 1 year
Delivery: 10 Days Per Specifications 10 days 10 days 10 days 10 days
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Prompt Payment Discount 2%, NET10 None None None
Estimated Total $11,700.00 $40,334.46 $30,373.50 $45,815.28
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