Opened: December 3, 2014

City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

For: Annual Contract Solar School Flasher and Parts ALTERNATE
Consolidated Traffic |Consolidated Traffic |Electrotechnics K&K Systems, Inc Paradigm Traffic Texas Highway Traffic Parts Inc.
Controls, Inc. Controls, Inc. Corporation Svstems, Inc. Products
6100005145 AJ 1016 Enterprise 1016 Enterprise 1310 Commerce 687 Palmetto Road 2201 E. Division St. |1309 Clark PO Box 837
Place Place Street
ITEM ESAt:::;Td Arlington, Arlington, Marshall, Tupelo, Arlington, Round Rock, Spring,
DESCRIPTION Ouantities | 7% 76001 TX 76001 TX, 75672 MS, 38801 TX 76011 TX 78681 TX 77383
12" Amber LED Solar traffic signal lens, to
1 comply with ITE specifications, TXDOT
approved, warranted against defects for
(5) years, and 16W LED maximum, Leotek
TSL-12Y-LX-1L1-B1 or approved equal 50
Net Unit Price $58.80 $58.80 $62.50 $97.00 No Bid $110.00 No Bid
Extended Price $2,940.00 $2,940.00 $3,125.00 $4,850.00 $5,500.00
Leotek Leotek Trastar Duralight Dialight
Manufacturer & Product No. TSL-12Y-LX-1L1-B1| TSL-12Y-LX-1L1-B1 JXC300HFTDCYL JXC-300DCYLS DI-433-3230-905XL
Warranty (years) 5 5 2 5 5
2 Gelled-electrolyte solar battery, Deka
#8G27 or approved equal 100
Net Unit Price $289.41 $289.41 $142.28 $180.00 No Bid $250.00 No Bid
Extended Price $28,941.00 $28,941.00 $14,228.00 $18,000.00 $25,000.00
Deka Deka’ Universal| Weida WB MK Battery
Manufacturer & Product No. 8G27 8G27 UB121000 121100 MK-E-27SLDG
3 Cabinet, School Zone Flasher 50
Net Unit Price No Bid $864.71 $464.70 $225.00 No Bid $325.00 No Bid
Extended Price $43,235.50 $23,235.00 $11,250.00 $16,250.00
RTC Eltec K&K Systems, Inc PI-CO Precision
Manufacturer & Product No. 501302 830244 KKSL 241515 2 Battery Cabinet
4 DPC-2000 Controller, Precision Solar
#864100 or approved equal 50
Net Unit Price No Bid $192.29 $318.52 $788.00 No Bid $140.00 No Bid
Extended Price $9,614.50 $15,926.00 $39,400.00 $7,000.00
RTC Eltec (Prostar &
502598LCB + Eltec FS2) K&K Systems, Inc THP
Manufacturer & Product No. 500451P4 730256 Cross Talk-4 DPC2000-24hr-Dual
Guss Tube w/ Vinyl insert, threaded on 50
5 both sides, Pelco #AB2007-58 or
approved equal
Net Unit Price $31.35 $31.35 No Bid $60.00 $29.40 $33.00 No Bid
Extended Price $1,567.50 $1,567.50 $3,000.00 $1,470.00 $1,650.00
Pelco Pelco T-Parts NIPL- Pelco Pelco
Manufacturer & Product No. AB-2007-58 AB-2007-58 Y58-TIT-INN AB-2007-58-PNC AB-2007-58-PNC
6 Post Top, Acorn type, Pelco #5401 or
approved equal 50
Net Unit Price $11.94 $11.94 No Bid $17.60 $11.15 $13.00 $14.00
Extended Price $597.00 $597.00 $880.00 $557.50 $650.00 $700.00
Pelco Pelco Akron Pelco Pelco CH
Manufacturer & Product No. PB-5401 PB-5401 8879 PB 5401 PB-5401-PNC 5811
7 Wiring Harness for DPC-2000 Controller 50
Net Unit Price No Bid $25.88 $21.26 $35.00 No Bid $25.00 No Bid
Extended Price $1,294.00 $1,063.00 $1,750.00 $1,250.00
RTC Eltec K&K Systems, Inc THP
Manufacturer & Product No. 503518 700330 Cross Talk-4W Solar Harness
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Opened: December 3, 2014

City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

For: Annual Contract Solar School Flasher and Parts ALTERNATE
Consolidated Traffic |Consolidated Traffic |Electrotechnics K&K Systems, Inc Paradigm Traffic Texas Highway Traffic Parts Inc.
Controls, Inc. Controls. Inc. Corporation Svstems, Inc. Products
6100005145 AJ 1016 Enterprise 1016 Enterprise 1310 Commerce 687 Palmetto Road 2201 E. Division St. |1309 Clark PO Box 837
Place Place Street
ITEM ESAt:::;Td Avrlington, Arlington, Marshall, Tupelo, Arlington, Round Rock, Spring,
DESCRIPTION Ouantities TX 76001 TX 76001 TX, 75672 MS, 38801 TX 76011 TX 78681 TX 77383
8 Cabinet Mounting Bracket Mast Arm,
Pelco #SE0126 or approved equal 50
Net Unit Price $12.06 $12.06 No Bid $13.50 $11.35 $13.00 No Bid
Extended Price $603.00 $603.00 $675.00 $567.50 $650.00
Pelco Pelco T-PARTS Pelco Pelco
Manufacturer & Product No. SE-0126 SE-0126 7533 SE-0126 SE-0126-PNC
Astro Sign Brac, Stellar for Overhead
9 Street Sign, AS-0128-24-29 or approved
equal 50
Net Unit Price $89.53 $89.53 No Bid $136.00 $84.00 $93.00 No Bid
Extended Price $4,476.50 $4,476.50 $6.800.00 $4,200.00 $4,650.00
Pelco Pelco T-PARTS EZBRC- Pelco Pelco
Manufacturer & Product No. AS-0128-24-29 AS-0128-24-29 877-Y24-BIN-NNP AB-0128-24-29| AS-0128-24-29-PNC
10 Notched Coupling, 1-%2" X 2", Pelco
#SE0346 or approved equal 200
Net Unit Price $5.53 $5.53 No Bid $12.00 $5.25 $5.75 $9.00
Extended Price $1,106.00 $1,106.00 $2.,400.00 $1,050.00 $1,150.00 $1,800.00
Pelco Pelco T-PARTS Pelco Pelco CH
Manufacturer & Product No. SE-0346 SE-0346 5140 SE-0346 SE-0346-PNC 5140
1 One Way Signal Mounting Kit, Pelco
#SE3003 or approved equal 60
Net Unit Price $7.76 $7.76 No Bid $12.50 $7.25 $8.00 $9.15
Extended Price $465.60 $465.60 $750.00 $435.00 $480.00 $549.00
Pelco Pelco T-PARTS Pelco Pelco CH
Manufacturer & Product No. SE-3003 SE-3003 5083 SE-3003 SE-3003-P01 5083
12 Aluminum Square Base w/ Plastic Door,
Pelco #PB5335 or approved equal 150
Net Unit Price $110.59 $110.59 No Bid $136.00 $109.00 $120.00 No Bid
Extended Price $16,588.50 $16,588.50 $20,400.00 $16,350.00 $18,000.00
Pelco Pelco Akron Pelco Pelco
Manufacturer & Product No. PB-5335 PB-5335 PB-BAS-1-PX PB-5335 SP-1014-TX-PNC
1 Anchor Bolts, 4 per Set, Pelco #PB5306 or
3
approved equal 150
Net Unit Price $26.94 $26.94 No Bid $45.00 $25.00 $28.00 No Bid
Extended Price $4,041.00 $4,041.00 $6,750.00 $3,750.00 $4,200.00
Pelco Pelco Ziggler PAB- Pelco Pelco
Manufacturer & Product No. PB-5306 PB-5306 24 PB-5306 PB-5306-61V
Signal Mntg. Assy. Tri Stud for 8" or 12"
14 only signal, Pelco #SE-0567 or approved
equal 50
Net Unit Price $35.59 $35.59 No Bid $45.00 $32.00 $37.00 $29.95
Extended Price $1,779.50 $1,779.50 $2,250.00 $1,600.00 $1,850.00 $1,497.50
Pelco
Pelco Pelco T-PARTS Pelco SE-0567-P29 CH
Manufacturer & Product No. SE-0567 SE-0567 7328 SE-0567 (vellow) 7328
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Opened: December 3, 2014

City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

For: Annual Contract Solar School Flasher and Parts ALTERNATE
Consolidated Traffic |Consolidated Traffic |Electrotechnics K&K Systems, Inc Paradigm Traffic Texas Highway Traffic Parts Inc.
Controls, Inc. Controls. Inc. Corporation Svstems, Inc. Products
6100005145 AJ 1016 Enterprise 1016 Enterprise 1310 Commerce 687 Palmetto Road 2201 E. Division St. |1309 Clark PO Box 837
Place Place Street
ITEM ESAt:::;Td Avrlington, Arlington, Marshall, Tupelo, Arlington, Round Rock, Spring,
DESCRIPTION Ouantities TX 76001 TX 76001 TX, 75672 MS, 38801 TX 76011 TX 78681 TX 77383
4" Sign Clamp, Pelco#AB0287-04 or
15
approved equal 100
Net Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.50 $9.45 $19.00 $8.45
Extended Price $1,250.00 $945.00 $1,900.00 $845.00
T-PARTS Pelco Pelco CH
Manufacturer & Product No. 1064 AB-0502-04-PNC SH-0206-4-PNC| 1063 3" x 6" surface
Unbreakable Solar Panel with mounting
bracket for 4" pole, preset at 37 degrees
and .090 gauge aluminum back plate.
16  [Service entries to junction box shall be
weathertight. 70 W solar panel supplied
w/ mounting hardware for 4" side of pole
installation 150
Net Unit Price $383.85 $383.85 $286.20 $283.00 No Bid $465.00 $444.95
Extended Price $57,577.50 $57,577.50 $42,930.00 $42,450.00 $69,750.00 $66,742.50
Solar Tech & CH
Picker| 384 is SPM085P-TS-
RTC RTC Eltec (80-watt PS85W-21F-pole F (85 watt); 475 is
1S-70-12 + IS- 1S-70-12 + IS- Industrial Solar) K&K Systems, Inc Solar Harness not| mounting hardware
Manufacturer & Product No. 50/140SPM 50/140SPM PBSOL080TP01| DS-A1-70 & SMSP-70 included for S-O-P
Pole and Base Collar Assembly, for
17 square base, Pelco #PB-5325 or approved
equal 150
Net Unit Price $50.88 $50.88 No Bid $74.00 $47.70 $53.00 $45.00
Extended Price $7.632.00 $7.632.00 $11,100.00 $7.155.00 $7.950.00 $6,750.00
CH
7794 for CPIl or
Akron bases; 6700
Pelco Pelco Akron 1000- Pelco Pelco for Pelco or
Manufacturer & Product No. PB-5325 PB-5325 15 PB-5325 PB-5325-PNC Permacast bases
18 Cabinet Mounting Brackets, two (2) per
set, Pelco #SP 5293 or approved equal 150
Net Unit Price $57.18 $57.18 No Bid $55.00 $54.00 $60.00 $47.00
Extended Price $8,577.00 $8,577.00 $8,250.00 $8,100.00 $9,000.00 $7,050.00
Pelco Pelco T-PARTS Pelco Pelco CH
Manufacturer & Product No. SP-5293 SP-5293 6368 SP-5293 SP-5293-PNC 2 of 6368
19 Spun Aluminum Pole, 17', Pelco #PB-5100;
17 or approved equal 120 No Bid
Net Unit Price $274.82 $274.82 $230.00 $269.00 $320.00 No Bid
Extended Price $32,978.40 $32,978.40 $27,600.00 $32,280.00 $38,400.00
Pelco Pelco K&K Systems, Inc Pelco Pelco
Manufacturer & Product No. PB-5007-17 PB-5007-17 CTR-17 PB-5100-17 PB-5100-17-PNC
Unbreakable Solar Panel with mounting
bracket for mast arm installation, preset at
37 degrees and .090 gauge aluminum
20 back plate. Service entries to junction box
shall be weathertight. 70 W solar panel
supplied w/ mounting hardware for mast
arm pole installation 150
Net Unit Price $528.25 $528.25 $386.21 $293.00 No Bid $540.00 $449.95
Extended Price $79,237.50 $79,237.50 $57,931.50 $43,950.00 $81,000.00 $67,492.50
Solar Tech & CH
Picker| 384 is SPMO85P-TS-
Eltec (80-watt PS85W-2F-mast arm F (85 watt); 468 is
RTC RTC Industrial Solar) K&K Systems, Inc Solar Harness not| Mast Arm Mounting
Manufacturer & Product No. I1S-70-12-MA IS-70-12-MA| PBSOL080SPBO1| DS-A1-70 & SMTP-70 included Harware 66" cable
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
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