City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Date: November 7, 2014
Annual Contract for Fire Sprinkler Inspections and
For: Maintenance for Alamodome Local Local Local Non-Local
Fire & Life Safety America Impact Fire Services Mulder Fire Protection Western States Fire Protection
6100005157 LB 12079 Starcrest Drive 11923 Radium 5807 La Colonia 13122 Lookout Way
ltem Description Estimated Annual |San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Quantity TX 78247 TX 78216 TX 78218 TX 78233
Year One
1A. Annual Fire Sprinkler Inspections 1
Price per each $4,320.00 $4,100.00 $3,500.00 $21,302.00
Total Price $4,320.00 $4,100.00 $3,500.00 $21,302.00
1B. Annual Fire Pump Flow Test
1B.l.|Internal Fire Pump Flow Test 1
Price per each $1,600.00 $3,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,340.00
Total Price $1,600.00 $3,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,340.00
1B.II.|External Fire Pump Flow Test 1
Price per each $4,200.00 $74.00 $2,000.00 $1,340.00
Total Price $4,200.00 $74.00 $2,000.00 $1,340.00
1C. Annual Fire Line Backflow Preventer Inspection
1c] Model FEBCO 805YDC, Serial #B14180, Size: 10",
""|Location: NW Fire Room — Field Quad D 1
Price per each $75.00 $74.00 $175.00 $90.00
Total Price $75.00 $74.00 $175.00 $90.00
1c Mode! FEBCO _805YDC, Ser_ial #B14179, Size: 10,
"""|Location: NE Fire Room — Field Quad A 1
Price per each $75.00 $74.00 $175.00 $90.00
Total Price $75.00 $74.00 $175.00 $90.00
1CIIL. Mode! WILKINS 305A, Serial #U14151, Size: 6”,
Location: Warehouse — Lot A 1
Price per each $75.00 $74.00 $125.00 $90.00
Total Price $75.00 $74.00 $125.00 $90.00
1CIV Mode! WAT'I_'S 709 DC, Serial #126506, Size: 3",
" " "|Location: Boiler Room — Lot A 1
Price per each $75.00 $74.00 $100.00 $90.00
Total Price $75.00 $74.00 $100.00 $90.00
1.V Model WATTS 1_0, Serial #07567, Size: 1 1/2”, Location:
" '|Generator Building — Lot A 1
Price per each $75.00 $74.00 $100.00 $90.00
Total Price $75.00 $74.00 $100.00 $90.00
2A. Other Than Annual Inspections 3
Price per quarter $3,600.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $4,652.00
Annual Total Price $10,800.00 $10,500.00 $10,500.00 $13,956.00
3A. Weekly Inspections 52
Price per each $150.00 $145.00 $175.00 $335.00
Total Price $7,800.00 $7,540.00 $9,100.00 $17,420.00




City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Date: November 7, 2014
Annual Contract for Fire Sprinkler Inspections and
For: Maintenance for Alamodome Local Local Local Non-Local
Fire & Life Safety America Impact Fire Services Mulder Fire Protection Western States Fire Protection
6100005157 LB 12079 Starcrest Drive 11923 Radium 5807 La Colonia 13122 Lookout Way
It D inti Estimated Annual [San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
em escription Quantity TX 78247 TX 78216 TX 78218 TX 78233
4A. 5-Year Internal Valve Inspection 1
Price per each $12,000.00 $10,600.00 $5,200.00 $10,735.00
Total Price $12,000.00 $10,600.00 $5,200.00 $10,735.00
5. Labor and Parts
5A. Hourly Labor Rate | - Regular Working Hours
5A.1.|Journeyman 80
Price per hour $90.00 $89.00 $85.00 $85.00
Total Price $7,200.00 $7,120.00 $6,800.00 $6,800.00
5A.1l.|Apprentice 80
Price per hour $65.00 $64.00 $60.00 $80.00
Total Price $5,200.00 $5,120.00 $4,800.00 $6,400.00
5A.1Il.|Helper 80
Price per hour $45.00 $44.00 $40.00 No Bid
Total Price $3,600.00 $3,520.00 $3,200.00
5B. Hourly Labor Rate Il - After Hours/Overtime
5B.1.|Journeyman 20
Price per hour $135.00 $134.00 $100.00 $115.00
Total Price $2,700.00 $2,680.00 $2,000.00 $2,300.00
5B.1I.|Apprentice 20
Price per hour $127.50 $125.00 $80.00 $110.00
Total Price $2,550.00 $2,500.00 $1,600.00 $2,200.00
5B.1II.{Helper 20
Price per hour $67.50 $66.00 $60.00 No Bid
Total Price $1,350.00 $1,320.00 $1,200.00
5C. Parts up-charge 25.00% 24.00% 15.00% 10.00%
Subtotal $63,695.00 $58,444.00 $52,575.00 $84,243.00
Year Two
1A. Annual Fire Sprinkler Inspections 1
Price per each $4,320.00 $4,100.00 $3,500.00 $21,302.00
Total Price $4,320.00 $4,100.00 $3,500.00 $21,302.00
1B. Annual Fire Pump Flow Test
1B.l.|Internal Fire Pump Flow Test 1
Price per each $1,600.00 $3,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,340.00
Total Price $1,600.00 $3,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,340.00
1B.Il.|External Fire Pump Flow Test 1
Price per each $4,200.00 $74.00 $2,000.00 $1,340.00
Total Price $4,200.00 $74.00 $2,000.00 $1,340.00




City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Date: November 7, 2014
Annual Contract for Fire Sprinkler Inspections and
For: Maintenance for Alamodome Local Local Local Non-Local
Fire & Life Safety America Impact Fire Services Mulder Fire Protection Western States Fire Protection
6100005157 LB 12079 Starcrest Drive 11923 Radium 5807 La Colonia 13122 Lookout Way
It D inti Estimated Annual [San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
em escription Quantity TX 78247 TX 78216 TX 78218 TX 78233
1C. Annual Fire Line Backflow Preventer Inspection
1c] Model FEBCO 805YDC, Serial #B14180, Size: 107,
""|Location: NW Fire Room — Field Quad D 1
Price per each $75.00 $74.00 $175.00 $90.00
Total Price $75.00 $74.00 $175.00 $90.00
1c Model FEBCO 805YDC, Serial #B14179, Size: 107,
"""|Location: NE Fire Room — Field Quad A 1
Price per each $75.00 $74.00 $175.00 $90.00
Total Price $75.00 $74.00 $175.00 $90.00
e Model WILKINS 305A, Serial #U14151, Size: 6”,
"’|Location: Warehouse — Lot A 1
Price per each $75.00 $74.00 $125.00 $90.00
Total Price $75.00 $74.00 $125.00 $90.00
1CIV Model WATTS 709 DC, Serial #126506, Size: 3",
" ’|Location: Boiler Room — Lot A 1
Price per each $75.00 $74.00 $100.00 $90.00
Total Price $75.00 $74.00 $100.00 $90.00
1CV Model WATTS 10, Serial #07567, Size: 1 1/2”, Location:
" "|Generator Building — Lot A 1
Price per each $75.00 $74.00 $100.00 $90.00
Total Price $75.00 $74.00 $100.00 $90.00
2A. Other Than Annual Inspections 3
Price per each $3,600.00 $3,500.00 $4,652.00
Total Price $10,800.00 $0.00 $10,500.00 $13,956.00
3A. Weekly Inspections 52
Price per each $150.00 $145.00 $175.00 $335.00
Total Price $7,800.00 $7,540.00 $9,100.00 $17,420.00
4A. 5-Year Internal Valve Inspection-Not required for Year 2
5. Labor and Parts
5A. Hourly Labor Rate | - Regular Working Hours
5A.1.[{Journeyman 80
Price per hour $90.00 $89.00 $85.00 $85.00
Total Price $7,200.00 $7,120.00 $6,800.00 $6,800.00
5A.1I.|Apprentice 80
Price per hour $65.00 $64.00 $60.00 $80.00
Total Price $5,200.00 $5,120.00 $4,800.00 $6,400.00




City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Date: November 7, 2014
Annual Contract for Fire Sprinkler Inspections and
For: Maintenance for Alamodome Local Local Local Non-Local
Fire & Life Safety America Impact Fire Services Mulder Fire Protection Western States Fire Protection
6100005157 LB 12079 Starcrest Drive 11923 Radium 5807 La Colonia 13122 Lookout Way
It D inti Estimated Annual [San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
em escription Quantity TX 78247 TX 78216 TX 78218 TX 78233
5A.1Il.|Helper 80
Price per hour $45.00 $44.00 $40.00 No Bid
Total Price $3,600.00 $3,520.00 $3,200.00
5B. Hourly Labor Rate Il - After Hours/Overtime
5B.1.|Journeyman 20
Price per hour $135.00 $134.00 $100.00 $115.00
Total Price $2,700.00 $2,680.00 $2,000.00 $2,300.00
5B.1I.[Apprentice 20
Price per hour $127.50 $125.00 $80.00 $110.00
Total Price $2,550.00 $2,500.00 $1,600.00 $2,200.00
5B.lII.|Helper 20
Price per hour $67.50 $66.00 $60.00 No Bid
Total Price $1,350.00 $1,320.00 $1,200.00
5C. Parts up-charge 25.00% 24.00% 15.00% 10.00%
Subtotal $51,695.00 $37,344.00 $47,375.00 $73,508.00
Year 3
1A Annual Fire Sprinkler Inspections 1
Price per each $4,320.00 $4,100.00 $3,500.00 $22,380.00
Total Price $4,320.00 $4,100.00 $3,500.00 $22,380.00
1B. Annual Fire Pump Flow Test
1B.l.|Internal Fire Pump Flow Test 1
Price per each $1,600.00 $3,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,407.00
Total Price $1,600.00 $3,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,407.00
1B.Il.|External Fire Pump Flow Test 1
Price per each $4,200.00 $74.00 $2,000.00 $1,407.00
Total Price $4,200.00 $74.00 $2,000.00 $1,407.00
1C. Annual Fire Line Backflow Preventer Inspection
1c) Model FEBCO 805YDC, Serial #B14180, Size: 107,
"“|Location: NW Fire Room — Field Quad D 1
Price per each $75.00 $74.00 $175.00 $94.00
Total Price $75.00 $74.00 $175.00 $94.00
1c Model FEBCO 805YDC, Serial #B14179, Size: 107,
""" [Location: NE Fire Room — Field Quad A 1
Price per each $75.00 $74.00 $175.00 $94.00
Total Price $75.00 $74.00 $175.00 $94.00




City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Date: November 7, 2014
Annual Contract for Fire Sprinkler Inspections and
For: Maintenance for Alamodome Local Local Local Non-Local
Fire & Life Safety America Impact Fire Services Mulder Fire Protection Western States Fire Protection
6100005157 LB 12079 Starcrest Drive 11923 Radium 5807 La Colonia 13122 Lookout Way
It D inti Estimated Annual [San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
em escription Quantity TX 78247 TX 78216 TX 78218 TX 78233
e Model WILKINS 305A, Serial #U14151, Size: 6”,
""|Location: Warehouse — Lot A 1
Price per each $75.00 $74.00 $125.00 $94.00
Total Price $75.00 $74.00 $125.00 $94.00
1CIV Model WATTS 709 DC, Serial #126506, Size: 3,
" " ’|Location: Boiler Room — Lot A 1
Price per each $75.00 $74.00 $100.00 $94.00
Total Price $75.00 $74.00 $100.00 $94.00
1C.V Model WATTS 10, Serial #07567, Size: 1 1/2”, Location:
" '[Generator Building — Lot A 1
Price per each $75.00 $74.00 $100.00 $94.00
Total Price $75.00 $74.00 $100.00 $94.00
2A. Other Than Annual Inspections 3
Price per quarter $3,600.00 $3,500.00 $4,884.00
Total Price $10,800.00 $0.00 $10,500.00 $14,652.00
3A. Weekly Inspections 52
Price per each $150.00 $145.00 $175.00 $351.00
Total Price $7,800.00 $7,540.00 $9,100.00 $18,252.00
4A. 5-Year Internal Valve Inspection-Not required for Year 3
5. Labor and Parts
5A. Hourly Labor Rate | - Regular Working Hours
5A.1.|Journeyman 80
Price per hour $90.00 $89.00 $85.00 $90.00
Total Price $7,200.00 $7,120.00 $6,800.00 $7,200.00
5A.1l.|Apprentice 80
Price per hour $65.00 $64.00 $60.00 $84.00
Total Price $5,200.00 $5,120.00 $4,800.00 $6,720.00
5A.1Il.|Helper 80
Price per hour $45.00 $44.00 $40.00 No Bid
Total Price $3,600.00 $3,520.00 $3,200.00
5B. Hourly Labor Rate Il - After Hours/Overtime
5B.l.[{Journeyman 20
Price per hour $135.00 $134.00 $100.00 $121.00
Total Price $2,700.00 $2,680.00 $2,000.00 $2,420.00
5B.II.|Apprentice 20
Price per hour $127.50 $125.00 $80.00 $115.00
Total Price $2,550.00 $2,500.00 $1,600.00 $2,300.00




City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Date: November 7, 2014
Annual Contract for Fire Sprinkler Inspections and
For: Maintenance for Alamodome Local Local Local Non-Local
Fire & Life Safety America Impact Fire Services Mulder Fire Protection Western States Fire Protection
6100005157 LB 12079 Starcrest Drive 11923 Radium 5807 La Colonia 13122 Lookout Way
It D inti Estimated Annual [San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
em escription Quantity TX 78247 TX 78216 TX 78218 TX 78233
5B.lII.|Helper 20
Price per hour $67.50 $66.00 $60.00 No Bid
Total Price $1,350.00 $1,320.00 $1,200.00
5C. Parts up-charge 25.00% 24.00% 15.00% 10.00%
Subtotal $51,695.00 $37,344.00 $47,375.00 $77,208.00
Year 4
1A. Annual Fire Sprinkler Inspections 1
Price per each $4,320.00 $4,100.00 $3,500.00 $22,380.00
Total Price $4,320.00 $4,100.00 $3,500.00 $22,380.00
1B. Annual Fire Pump Flow Test
1B.I.|Internal Fire Pump Flow Test 1
Price per each $1,600.00 $3,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,407.00
Total Price $1,600.00 $3,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,407.00
1B.II.|External Fire Pump Flow Test 1
Price per each $4,200.00 $74.00 $2,000.00 $1,407.00
Total Price $4,200.00 $74.00 $2,000.00 $1,407.00
1C. Annual Fire Line Backflow Preventer Inspection
1c) Model FEBCO 805YDC, Serial #B14180, Size: 10",
""|Location: NW Fire Room — Field Quad D 1
Price per each $75.00 $74.00 $175.00 $94.00
Total Price $75.00 $74.00 $175.00 $94.00
1c Model FEBCO 805YDC, Serial #B14179, Size: 10",
"""|Location: NE Fire Room — Field Quad A 1
Price per each $75.00 $74.00 $175.00 $94.00
Total Price $75.00 $74.00 $175.00 $94.00
e Model WILKINS 305A, Serial #U14151, Size: 6”,
""|Location: Warehouse — Lot A 1
Price per each $75.00 $74.00 $125.00 $94.00
Total Price $75.00 $74.00 $125.00 $94.00
1CIV Model WATTS 709 DC, Serial #126506, Size: 3,
" " "|Location: Boiler Room — Lot A 1
Price per each $75.00 $74.00 $100.00 $94.00
Total Price $75.00 $74.00 $100.00 $94.00
1C.V Model WATTS 10, Serial #07567, Size: 1 1/2”, Location:
" "|Generator Building — Lot A 1
Price per each $75.00 $74.00 $100.00 $94.00
Total Price $75.00 $74.00 $100.00 $94.00




City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Date: November 7, 2014
Annual Contract for Fire Sprinkler Inspections and
For: Maintenance for Alamodome Local Local Local Non-Local
Fire & Life Safety America Impact Fire Services Mulder Fire Protection Western States Fire Protection
6100005157 LB 12079 Starcrest Drive 11923 Radium 5807 La Colonia 13122 Lookout Way
It D inti Estimated Annual [San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
em escription Quantity TX 78247 TX 78216 TX 78218 TX 78233
2A. Other Than Annual Inspections 3
Price per quarter $3,600.00 $3,500.00 $4,884.00
Total Price $10,800.00 $0.00 $10,500.00 $14,652.00
3A. Weekly Inspections 52
Price per each $150.00 $145.00 $175.00 $351.00
Total Price $7,800.00 $7,540.00 $9,100.00 $18,252.00
4A. 5-Year Internal Valve Inspection-Not required for Year 4
5. Labor and Parts
5A. Hourly Labor Rate | - Regular Working Hours
5A.1.|Journeyman 80
Price per hour $90.00 $89.00 $85.00 $90.00
Total Price $7,200.00 $7,120.00 $6,800.00 $7,200.00
5A.1l.|Apprentice 80
Price per hour $65.00 $64.00 $60.00 $84.00
Total Price $5,200.00 $5,120.00 $4,800.00 $6,720.00
5A.1Il.|Helper 80
Price per hour $45.00 $44.00 $40.00 No Bid
Total Price $3,600.00 $3,520.00 $3,200.00
5B. Hourly Labor Rate Il - After Hours/Overtime
5B.l.[{Journeyman 20
Price per hour $135.00 $134.00 $100.00 $121.00
Total Price $2,700.00 $2,680.00 $2,000.00 $2,420.00
5B.1I.|Apprentice 20
Price per hour $127.50 $125.00 $80.00 $115.00
Total Price $2,550.00 $2,500.00 $1,600.00 $2,300.00
5B.11I.[Helper 20
Price per hour $67.50 $66.00 $60.00 No Bid
Total Price $1,350.00 $1,320.00 $1,200.00
5C. Parts up-charge 25.00% 24.00% 15.00% 10.00%
Subtotal $51,695.00 $37,344.00 $47,375.00 $77,208.00
Year 5
1A. Annual Fire Sprinkler Inspections 1
Price per each $4,320.00 $4,100.00 $3,500.00 $23,499.00
Total Price $4,320.00 $4,100.00 $3,500.00 $23,499.00




City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Date: November 7, 2014
Annual Contract for Fire Sprinkler Inspections and
For: Maintenance for Alamodome Local Local Local Non-Local
Fire & Life Safety America Impact Fire Services Mulder Fire Protection Western States Fire Protection
6100005157 LB 12079 Starcrest Drive 11923 Radium 5807 La Colonia 13122 Lookout Way
It D inti Estimated Annual [San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
em escription Quantity TX 78247 TX 78216 TX 78218 TX 78233
1B. Annual Fire Pump Flow Test
1B.l.|Internal Fire Pump Flow Test 1
Price per each $1,600.00 $3,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,478.00
Total Price $1,600.00 $3,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,478.00
1B.Il.|External Fire Pump Flow Test 1
Price per each $4,200.00 $74.00 $2,000.00 $1,470.00
Total Price $4,200.00 $74.00 $2,000.00 $1,470.00
1C. Annual Fire Line Backflow Preventer Inspection
1c] Model FEBCO 805YDC, Serial #B14180, Size: 10",
""|Location: NW Fire Room — Field Quad D 1
Price per each $75.00 $74.00 $175.00 $99.00
Total Price $75.00 $74.00 $175.00 $99.00
1c Model FEBCO 805YDC, Serial #814179, Size: 10",
"""|Location: NE Fire Room — Field Quad A 1
Price per each $75.00 $74.00 $175.00 $99.00
Total Price $75.00 $74.00 $175.00 $99.00
e Model WILKINS 305A, Serial #U14151, Size: 6”,
""|Location: Warehouse — Lot A 1
Price per each $75.00 $74.00 $125.00 $98.00
Total Price $75.00 $74.00 $125.00 $98.00
1CIV Model WATTS 709 DC, Serial #126506, Size: 3,
" " "|Location: Boiler Room — Lot A 1
Price per each $75.00 $74.00 $100.00 $98.00
Total Price $75.00 $74.00 $100.00 $98.00
1C.V Model WATTS 10, Serial #07567, Size: 1 1/2”, Location:
" "|Generator Building — Lot A 1
Price per each $75.00 $74.00 $100.00 $98.00
Total Price $75.00 $74.00 $100.00 $98.00
2A. Other Than Annual Inspections 3
Price per quarter $3,600.00 $3,500.00 $5,128.00
Total Price $10,800.00 $0.00 $10,500.00 $15,384.00
3A. Weekly Inspections 52
Price per each $150.00 $145.00 $175.00 $368.00
Total Price $7,800.00 $7,540.00 $9,100.00 $19,136.00




City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Date: November 7, 2014
Annual Contract for Fire Sprinkler Inspections and
For: Maintenance for Alamodome Local Local Local Non-Local
Fire & Life Safety America Impact Fire Services Mulder Fire Protection Western States Fire Protection
6100005157 LB 12079 Starcrest Drive 11923 Radium 5807 La Colonia 13122 Lookout Way
It D inti Estimated Annual [San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
em escription Quantity TX 78247 TX 78216 TX 78218 TX 78233
4A. 5-Year Internal Valve Inspection-Not required for Year 5
5. Labor and Parts
5A. Hourly Labor Rate | - Regular Working Hours
5A.1.|Journeyman 80
Price per hour $90.00 $89.00 $85.00 $95.00
Total Price $7,200.00 $7,120.00 $6,800.00 $7,600.00
5A.1l.|Apprentice 80
Price per hour $65.00 $64.00 $60.00 $88.00
Total Price $5,200.00 $5,120.00 $4,800.00 $7,040.00
5A.1Il.|Helper 80
Price per hour $45.00 $44.00 $40.00 No Bid
Total Price $3,600.00 $3,520.00 $3,200.00
5B. Hourly Labor Rate Il - After Hours/Overtime
5B.1.|Journeyman 20
Price per hour $135.00 $134.00 $100.00 $127.00
Total Price $2,700.00 $2,680.00 $2,000.00 $2,540.00
5B.1I.|Apprentice 20
Price per hour $127.50 $125.00 $80.00 $120.00
Total Price $2,550.00 $2,500.00 $1,600.00 $2,400.00
5B.1II.{Helper 20
Price per hour $67.50 $66.00 $60.00 No Bid
Total Price $1,350.00 $1,320.00 $1,200.00
5C. Parts up-charge 25.00% 24.00% 15.00% 10.00%
Subtotal $51,695.00 $37,344.00 $47,375.00 $81,039.00




