City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 21, 2014
For: Alternators and Starters Big Moe Automotive Genuine Parts Company Straus-Frank Enterprises
LLC Dba Carquest Auto
Parts
6100004315 MM 5096 Blanco # 2 6374 Rittiman Road 328 W. Peden
Estimated
Annual San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Item Description Quantity TX 78216 TX 78218 TX 78204
1A EXCHANGE UNITS FOR MOTORCRAFT
ALTERNATORS
a Percent of Discount Offered 0.00% 15.00% 16.00%
b Products Identification (Manufacturer) Big Moe BBB Industries ERE
c Type of Price Schedule (dealer, jobber, etc) Government Jobber Retail
d Price Schedule Number 110 RPTO086 P3 BLS90
e Date of price Schedule 1/1/2014 2014 9/1/2013
f Price Schedule Column on Which Discount is Price Each Jobber P3 BLS90
Based (i.e. distributor, net, wholesale, etc)
g Warranty 90 Days Limited Lifetime Manufacturer warranty
passed through-Limited
Lifetime Remy & Motorcar
Parts of America
1B SPECIFIED ITEMS
1 6W7Z10346AA 50 EA
Part Number 11026 213-8498
Manufacturer Big Moe BBB Industries ERE
Price Per Each $259.00 $202.45 $250.31
Extended Price $10,123.00 $12,515.50
2 DG1710346C 6 EA
Part Number 11629 213-9210
Manuifactirer Big Moe BBB Industries
Price Per Each $318.00 $167.13 NO BID
Extended Price $1,002.78
3 BL1Z10346A 6 EA
Part Number 11590 213-8879
Manufacturer Big Moe BBB Industries
Price Per Each $128.00 $193.12 NO BID
Extended Price $1,158.72
4 DC2710346B 6 EA
Part Number 11434 213-9212
Manufacturer Big Moe BBB Industries ERE
Price Per Each $89.00 $179.52 $205.79
Extended Price $1,077.12 $1,234.75
5 AL5Z10346A 20 EA
Part Number 11278 213-3208K
Manufacturer Big Moe BBB Industries
Price Per Each $42.00 $116.38 NO BID
Extended Price $2,327.60
6 9E5Z10346A 4 EA
Part Number 11542 213-8847
Manufacturer Big Moe BBB Industries ERE
Price Per Each $42.00 $204.00 $195.71
Extended Price $816.00 $782.84
7 9C3Z10346A 6 EA
Part Number 11293 213-8880
Manufacturer Big Moe BBB Industries ERE
Price Per Each $189.00 $155.71 $281.39
Extended Price $934.26 $1,688.34
2A EXCHANGE UNITES FOR DELCO-REMY
ALTERNATORS INCLUDING C.S & SI
SERIES ALTERNATORS WITH INTERNAL &
EXTERNAL REGULATORS, 12 & 24 VOLT
a Percent of Discount Offered 0.00% 15.00% 16.00%
b Products Identification (Manufacturer) Big Moe BBB Industries ERE Remy & Motorcar
c Type of Price Schedule (dealer, jobber, etc) Government Jobber Retail
d Price Schedule Number 110 RPTO086 P3 BLS90
e Date of price Schedule 1/1/2014 2014 9/1/2013
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 21, 2014
For: Alternators and Starters Big Moe Automotive Genuine Parts Company Straus-Frank Enterprises
LLC Dba Carquest Auto
Parts
6100004315 MM 5096 Blanco # 2 6374 Rittiman Road 328 W. Peden
Estimated
Annual San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Item Description Quantity TX 78216 TX 78218 TX 78204
f Price Schedule Column on Which Discount is Price Each Jobber P3
Based (i.e. distributor, net, wholesale, etc)
[s} Warranty 90 Days Limited Lifetime Limited Lifetime
2B SPECIFIED ITEMS
1 25877026 3EA
Part Number 8301 213-4828
Manufacturer Big Moe BBB Industries ERE
Price Per Each $149.00 $109.48 $194.87
Extended Price $328.44 $584.61
2 20911162 20 EA
Part Number 11640 213-9667
Manufacturer Big Moe BBB Industries ERE
Price Per Each $42.00 $137.08 $165.47
Extended Price $2,741.60 $3,309.40
3 15794597 20 EA
Part Number 11069 213-9532
Manufacturer Big Moe BBB Industries ERE
Price Per Each $169.00 $119.83 $152.87
Extended Price $2,396.60 $3,057.40
4 23105717 3EA
Part Number 11252 213-9754
Manufacturer Big Moe BBB Industries ERE
Price Per Each $43.00 $118.81 $148.67
Extended Price $356.43 $446.01
5 25808702 3EA
Part Number 11021 213-9651
Manufacturer Big Moe BBB Industries ERE
Price Per Each $42.00 $88.83 $143.63
Extended Price $266.49 $430.89
6 22781131 5EA
Part Number 8292 213-4826
Manufacturer Big Moe BBB Industries ERE
Price Per Each $149.00 $106.08 $178.07
Extended Price $530.40 $890.35
3A EXCHANGE UNITES FOR
DAIMLER/CHRYSLER CORPORATION
ALTERNATORS
a Percent of Discount Offered 0.00% 15.00% 16.00%
b Products Identification (Manufacturer) Big Moe BBB Industries ERE Remy & Motorcar
c Type of Price Schedule (dealer, jobber, etc) Government Jobber Retail
d Price Schedule Number 110 RPTO086 P3 BLS90
e Date of price Schedule 1/1/2014 2014 9/1/2013
f Price Schedule Column on Which Discount is Price Each Jobber P3
Based (i.e. distributor, net, wholesale, etc)
q Warranty 90 Days Limited Lifetime Limited Lifetime
3B SPECIFIED ITEMS
1 4801866AB 4 EA
Part Number 11574 213-9749
Manufacturer Big Moe BBB Industries
Price Per Each $39.00 $142.17 NO BID
Extended Price $568.68
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 21, 2014
For: Alternators and Starters Big Moe Automotive Genuine Parts Company Straus-Frank Enterprises
LLC Dba Carquest Auto
Parts
6100004315 MM 5096 Blanco # 2 6374 Rittiman Road 328 W. Peden
Estimated
Annual San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Item Description Quantity TX 78216 TX 78218 TX 78204
2 56041693AC 8 EA
Part Number 13873 213-9477
Manufacturer Big Moe BBB Industries ERE
Price Per Each $39.00 $88.85 $119.27
Extended Price $710.80 $954.16
3 56029700AD 6EA
Part Number 11276 213-8876
Manufacturer Big Moe BBB Industries ERE
Price Per Each $39.00 $111.52 $157.07
Extended Price $669.12 $942.42
4 56028699AA 10 EA
Part Number 13985 213-9521
Manufacturer Big Moe BBB Industries ERE
Price Per Each $149.00 $126.69 $152.03
Extended Price $1,266.90 $1,520.30
4A EXCHANGE UNITS FOR MOTORCRAFT
STARTERS
a Percent of Discount Offered 0.00% 15.00% 16.00%
b Products Identification (Manufacturer) Big Moe BBB Industries ERE Remy & Motorcar
c Type of Price Schedule (dealer, jobber, etc) Government Jobber Retail
d Price Schedule Number 110 RPTO086 P3 BLS90
e Date of price Schedule 1/1/2014 2014 9/1/2013
f Price Schedule Column on Which Discount is Price Each Jobber P3
Based (i.e. distributor, net, wholesale, etc)
q Warranty 90 Days Limited Lifetime Limited Lifetime
4B SPECIFIED ITEMS
1 9C2Z11002A 8 EA
Part Number 3267 244-9312
Manufacturer Big Moe BBB Industries ERE
Price Per Each $39.00 $89.04 $111.71
Extended Price $712.32 $893.68
2 CK4Z11002A 6 EA
Part Number 150-401 244-9292
Manufacturer Big Moe BBB Industries
Price Per Each $42.00 $99.17 NO BID
Extended Price $595.02
3 9L3Z11002A 4 EA
Part Number 6646 244-9292
Manufacturer Big Moe BBB Industries ERE
Price Per Each $169.00 $99.17 $125.99
Extended Price $396.68 $503.96
4 9C2Z11002A 4 EA
Part Number 3267 244-9312
Manufacturer Big Moe BBB Industries ERE
Price Per Each $39.00 $89.04 $111.71
Extended Price $356.16 $446.84
5 6L2711002C 6 EA
Part Number 3273 244-9289
Manufacturer Big Moe BBB Industries ERE
Price Per Each $39.00 $92.27 $139.43
Extended Price $553.62 $836.58
6 BB5Z11002B 3EA
Part Number 19227 244-9307
Manufacturer Big Moe BBB Industries
Price Per Each $38.00 $68.01 NO BID
Extended Price $204.03
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 21, 2014
For: Alternators and Starters Big Moe Automotive Genuine Parts Company Straus-Frank Enterprises
LLC Dba Carquest Auto
Parts
6100004315 MM 5096 Blanco # 2 6374 Rittiman Road 328 W. Peden
Estimated
Annual San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Item Description Quantity TX 78216 TX 78218 TX 78204
5A EXCHANGE UNITS FOR DELCO-REMY
STARTERS
a Percent of Discount Offered 0.00% 15.00% 16.00%
b Products Identification (Manufacturer) Big Moe BBB Industries ERE Remy & Motorcar
c Type of Price Schedule (dealer, jobber, etc) Government Jobber Retail
d Price Schedule Number 110 RPTO086 P3 BLS90
e Date of price Schedule 1/1/2014 2014 9/1/2013
f Price Schedule Column on Which Discount is Price Each Jobber P3
Based (i.e. distributor, net, wholesale, etc)
q Warranty 90 Days Limited Lifetime Limited Lifetime
5B SPECIFIED ITEMS
1 19180529 3EA
Part Number 6970 246-5178
Manufacturer Big Moe BBB Industries ERE
Price Per Each $39.00 $109.40 $137.75
Extended Price $328.20 $413.25
2 89017845 10 EA
Part Number 6785 246-5163
Manufacturer Big Moe BBB Industries ERE
Price Per Each $39.00 $112.96 $138.59
Extended Price $1,129.60 $1,385.90
3 89017755 10 EA
Part Number 6786 246-5162
Manufacturer Big Moe BBB Industries ERE
Price Per Each $39.00 $134.65 $167.99
Extended Price $1,346.50 $1,679.90
4 12645298 2EA
Part Number 17997 244-6992
Manufacturer Big Moe BBB Industries ERE
Price Per Each $40.00 $130.28 $158.75
Extended Price $260.56 $317.50
5 89017761 4 EA
Part Number 6784 246-5161
Manufacturer Big Moe BBB Industries ERE
Price Per Each $28.00 $126.62 $167.99
Extended Price $506.48 $671.96
6 89017844 6 EA
Part Number 6757 246-5122
Manufacturer Big Moe BBB Industries ERE
Price Per Each $118.00 $113.05 $156.23
Extended Price $678.30 $937.38
6A EXCHANGE UNITS FOR
DAIMLER/CHRYSLER CORPORATION
STARTERS
a Percent of Discount Offered 0.00% 15.00% 16.00%
b Products Identification (Manufacturer) Big Moe BBB Industries ERE Remy & Motorcar
c Type of Price Schedule (dealer, jobber, etc) Government Jobber Retail
d Price Schedule Number 110 RPT086 P3 BLS90
e Date of price Schedule 1/1/2014 2014 9/1/2013
f Price Schedule Column on Which Discount is Price Each Jobber P3
Based (i.e. distributor, net, wholesale, etc)
g Warranty 90 Days Limited Lifetime Limited Lifetime
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 21, 2014
For: Alternators and Starters Big Moe Automotive Genuine Parts Company Straus-Frank Enterprises
LLC Dba Carquest Auto
Parts
6100004315 MM 5096 Blanco # 2 6374 Rittiman Road 328 W. Peden
Estimated
Annual San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Item Description Quantity TX 78216 TX 78218 TX 78204
6B SPECIFIED ITEMS
1 4608801AB 4 EA
Part Number 17896 244-6951
Manufacturer Big Moe BBB Industries ERE
Price Per Each $38.00 $73.05 $83.99
Extended Price $292.20 $83.99
2 4801256AC 6 EA
Part Number 17950 244-6986
Manufacturer Big Moe BBB Industries ERE
Price Per Each $89.00 $100.27 $167.99
Extended Price $601.62 $167.99
3 56029750AB 8 EA
Part Number 17995 244-6962
Manufacturer Big Moe BBB Industries ERE
Price Per Each $38.00 $75.48 $93.23
Extended Price $603.84 $93.23
4 56029274AA 10 EA
Part Number 17932 244-6987
Manufacturer Big Moe BBB Industries ERE
Price Per Each $38.00 $80.07 $83.99
Extended Price $800.70 $83.99
Delivery 3 Days 3 Days 3 Days
Prompt Payment Discount 2%, 10 Days 2%, 10 Days Net 30
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