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Draft Bid Tabulation

Page 1 of 2

Opened: April 21, 2014

For: Airport Lighting Parts, Signs, and Accessories NAS

ADB Airfield Solutions, LLC Airport Lighting Systems, Inc. Graybar Electric Co.

SM 977 Gahanna Parkway 931 S. Church St. 4503 Perrin Creek

Item Description Evaluation 
Quantity

Columbus,                                          
OH 43230

Grapevine,                                          
TX 76051

San Antonio,                                          
TX 78217

1 Crouse-Hinds by Eaton Airport Lighting Parts, Signs, and 
Accessories Catalog
Percent of discount offered No Bid 12% 20%
Type of price schedule/catalog (dealer, jobber, etc.) Manufacturer's N/A
Price schedule/catalog number 2014 N/A
Date of price schedule/catalog 2014 2013
Price schedule/catalog column on which discount is based 
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale,etc.) List Price N/A

Specified Items for Evaluation Purposes Only:

62 Watt Sign lamp # 20590 1
Unit Price Before Discount No Bid $42.00 $43.47
% Discount 12% 20%
Unit Price After Discount $36.96 $34.78
Price Schedule/Catalog Information and Date 2014 N/A

45 Watt Taxiway Lamp #10047-1497 1
Unit Price Before Discount No Bid $11.25 $11.64
% Discount 12% 20%
Unit Price After Discount $9.90 $9.31
Price Schedule/Catalog Information and Date 2014 N/A

1.5" Frangible Coupling #50049 1
Unit Price Before Discount No Bid $11.25 $11.64
% Discount 12% 20%
Unit Price After Discount $9.90 $9.31
Price Schedule/Catalog Information and Date 2014 N/A

Sign Panel Size 3-2 Model #60667-7 1
Unit Price Before Discount No Bid $1,232.18 $1,275.31
% Discount 12% 20%
Unit Price After Discount $1,084.32 $1,020.25
Price Schedule/Catalog Information and Date 2014 N/A

Guidance Sign Size 3-1 Model #85831-5-1-20 1
Unit Price Before Discount No Bid $3,454.70 $3,575.61
% Discount 12% 20%
Unit Price After Discount $3,040.14 $2,860.49
Price Schedule/Catalog Information and Date 2014 N/A

2 ADB Airport Lighting Parts, Signs, and Accessories Catalog
Percent of discount offered 0% 1% No Bid 
Type of price schedule/catalog (dealer, jobber, etc.) Price List Manufacturer's
Price schedule/catalog number Price List 2013
Date of price schedule/catalog 2013 2013
Price schedule/catalog column on which discount is based 

   
Price List - 2013 List Price

Specified Items for Evaluation Purposes Only:

18 watt Sign Lamp # 48A0376 1
Unit Price Before Discount $13.85 $13.85 No Bid 
% Discount 0% 1%
Unit Price After Discount $13.85 $13.71
Price Schedule/Catalog Information and Date Price List 2013 2013

48 watt Runway lamp # 48A0420 1
Unit Price Before Discount $14.76 $14.76 No Bid 
% Discount 0% 1%
Unit Price After Discount $14.76 $14.61
Price Schedule/Catalog Information and Date Price List 2013 2013

Runway TDZ Light # 44A4763-211 1
Unit Price Before Discount $303.09 $303.09 No Bid 
% Discount 0% 1%
Unit Price After Discount $303.09 $300.06
Price Schedule/Catalog Information and Date Price List 2013 2013

Sign Panel Size 3 -2 Mod # 44A60841/320 1

6100003923
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Unit Price Before Discount $792.57 $792.57 No Bid 
% Discount 0% 1%
Unit Price After Discount $792.57 $784.64
Price Schedule/Catalog Information and Date Price List 2013 2013

Guidance Sign Size 3 -2 Mod # SF33-3240230 1
Unit Price Before Discount $4,762.34 $4,762.34 No Bid 
% Discount 0% 1%
Unit Price After Discount $4,762.34 $4,714.72
Price Schedule/Catalog Information and Date Price List 2013 2013

3 Liberty Airport Lighting Parts, Signs, and Accessories Catalog
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Percent of discount offered
Type of price schedule/catalog (dealer, jobber, etc.)
Price schedule/catalog number
Date of price schedule/catalog
Price schedule/catalog column on which discount is based 

   

Specified Items for Evaluation Purposes Only:

DMCU, CCR interface Megger # WBC-801-111 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Unit Price Before Discount
% Discount
Unit Price After Discount
Price Schedule/Catalog Information and Date

HV Monitoring Assembly # WBC-023-102 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Unit Price Before Discount
% Discount
Unit Price After Discount
Price Schedule/Catalog Information and Date

Power Supply for D518 120 volt # E348315 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Unit Price Before Discount

% Discount
Unit Price After Discount
Price Schedule/Catalog Information and Date

Industrial PC Core i5 # TCP-5120-BTO 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Unit Price Before Discount
% Discount
Unit Price After Discount

Price Schedule/Catalog Information and Date

AC input Module 480 volt # WBC-021-480 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Unit Price Before Discount
% Discount
Unit Price After Discount
Price Schedule/Catalog Information and Date

Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
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