
City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 31, 2013  Bid # 1

For: Heavy Equipment Anderson Machinery 
Company

Asco, Inc. Bane Machinery Briggs Equipment Cooper Equipment 
Co.

Doggett Equipment 
Services, LTD

Freightliner of San 
Antonio, LTD

Grande Truck Center H & E Equipment 
Services, Inc.

Holt Cat McCourt & Sons 
Equipment, Inc.

6100003104 LD 9415 N.E. Loop 410 4146 IH 10 East 2449 Manana 711 North W.W. White 
Rd.

17474 Judson Rd. 4001N. Pan Am 
Expwy

8700 IH 10 East 4562 IH 10 East 5433 Randolph Blvd. 3302 S.W.W. White 
Rd.

5141 Hwy 71 W.

Item Description QTY San Antonio,                
TX 78219

San Antonio,                 
TX 78219

Dallas,                        
TX 75220

San Antonio,            
TX 78219

San Antonio,               
TX 78247

San Antonio,              
TX 78219

Converse,                  
TX 78109

San Antonio,              
TX 78219

San Antonio,                 
TX 78233

San Antonio,                 
TX 78222

La Grange,                 
TX 78945

1A Forklift, 6,000 lbs., LPG 3
Price Each: No Bid $28,025.00 No Bid $28,475.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total: $84,075.00 $85,425.00   
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2013 Doosan G30 2013 Yale GLP060VX   
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

Hyundai 2.4L 65hp LPG Mazda 2.2L; 
47HP @ 2800 RPM

  

Transmission Offered: 1 SPD Powershift Standard Electric 
Powershift 1 Speed

Warranty: 1 YR Full, 5 YR Brake 12 month/2000 hours; 
36Month/ 6000 Hours 

Powertrain 
Warranty Service Provider Name: ASCO Briggs Equipment

Warranty Facility Address: 4146 IH 10 East, San 
Antonio, TX 78219

711 North W.W. White 
Road., San Antonio, 

TX 78219
Delivery 100 Days 95   
Production Cut-off Date Nov 1,2013 N/A   
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date

Oct 31 N/A

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

Yes N/A   

1B Forklift, 8,000 lbs., LPG 1  
Price Each No Bid $40,450.00 No Bid $37,455.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total $40,450.00 $37,455.00   
Year, Make & Model Offered ` 2013 Yale GLP080VX   

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

GM 4.3L, 94HP GM 4.3 Liter, 98 Hp @ 
2500 RPM

  

Transmission Offered: 2SPD Powershift 1 Speed Powershift 
Heavy Duty

Warranty: 1 YR Full, 5 YR Brake 12 month/2000 hours 
Manufacturers 

Warranty Service Provider Name: ASCO Briggs Equipment

Warranty Facility Address: 4146 IH 10 East, San 
Antonio, TX 78219

711 North W.W. White 
Rd., San Antonio, 

TX 78219
Delivery 130 Days 133   
Production Cut-off Date Nov 1 N/A   
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date

Oct 31 N/A

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

Yes N/A   

1C Forklift, 8,000 lbs., Diesel 1  
Price Each No Bid $35,450.00 No Bid $44,690.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total $35,450.00 $44,690.00   
Year, Make & Model Offered 2013 Doosan D35S 2013 Yale GDP080VX   

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

Yanmar 3.3L, 59HP Kubota 3.8L Tier 4 
Diesel; 74 horsepower 

@ 2400 rpm

  

Transmission Offered: 2SPD Powershift Powershift 1 speed 
(No automatic engine 
protection/ shutdown)

Warranty: 1 YR Full, 5 YR Brake 12 month/2000 hours; 
36 Month/ 6000 Hours 
Powertrain  Warranty 

Warranty Service Provider Name: ASCO Briggs Equipment

Warranty Facility Address: 4146 IH 10 East, San 
Antonio, TX 78219

711 North W.W. White 
Rd., San Antonio, TX 

78219
Delivery 130 Days 133 Days   
Production Cut-off Date Nov 1 N/A   
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date

Oct 1 N/A

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

Yes N/A   
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 31, 2013  Bid # 1

For: Heavy Equipment Anderson Machinery 
Company

Asco, Inc. Bane Machinery Briggs Equipment Cooper Equipment 
Co.

Doggett Equipment 
Services, LTD

Freightliner of San 
Antonio, LTD

Grande Truck Center H & E Equipment 
Services, Inc.

Holt Cat McCourt & Sons 
Equipment, Inc.

6100003104 LD 9415 N.E. Loop 410 4146 IH 10 East 2449 Manana 711 North W.W. White 
Rd.

17474 Judson Rd. 4001N. Pan Am 
Expwy

8700 IH 10 East 4562 IH 10 East 5433 Randolph Blvd. 3302 S.W.W. White 
Rd.

5141 Hwy 71 W.

Item Description QTY San Antonio,                
TX 78219

San Antonio,                 
TX 78219

Dallas,                        
TX 75220

San Antonio,            
TX 78219

San Antonio,               
TX 78247

San Antonio,              
TX 78219

Converse,                  
TX 78109

San Antonio,              
TX 78219

San Antonio,                 
TX 78233

San Antonio,                 
TX 78222

La Grange,                 
TX 78945

2A Loader / Backhoe, 4WD, Enclosed Cab 2
Price Each No Bid $64,879.27 No Bid $79,415.74 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $67,500.00 No Bid
Total $129,758.54 $158,831.48   $135,000.00
Year, Make & Model Offered 2013 Case 580SN 2013 Terex TLB-840 

PCRE
   2013 Cat 416F

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

Case F5, 95HP Perkins 1104D 88 HP 
Net

  Cat C4.4, ACERT 87 
NET HP

Warranty: 1 YR/Unlimited Hr 
Full/2 YR Engine, 

2000Hr

1 Year  12 Months unlimited 
hour total machine

Warranty Service Provider Name: ASCO Briggs Equipment Holt Cat

Warranty Facility Address: 4146 IH 10 East, San 
Antonio, TX 78219

711 North W.W. White 
Rd., San Antonio, TX 

78219

3302 S.W.W. White 
Rd., San Antonio, TX 

78222
Delivery 90 Days 60 Days   90 days
Production Cut-off Date Nov 1 N/A   N/A
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date

Sept 1 N/A 10/15/13

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

Yes N/A   No

2B Loader / Backhoe, 4WD, Open Cab 1
Price Each No Bid $72,258.00 No Bid $76,067.56 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $76,500.00 No Bid
Total $72,258.00 $76,067.56   $76,500.00
Year, Make & Model Offered 2013, Case 580SN 2013 Terex TLB 840 

LA 2 ROPS
  2013 Cat 416F

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

Case F5, 95HP Perkins 1104D 88 HP 
Net

  Cat C4.4, ACERT 87 
Net HP

Warranty: 1 YR/Unlimited HR 
Full/2 YR Engine, 

2000HR

1 Year 12 Months unlimited 
hour total machine

Warranty Service Provider Name: ASCO Briggs Equipment Holt Cat

Warranty Facility Address: 4146 IH 10 East, San 
Antonio, TX 78219

711 North W.W. White 
Rd., San Antonio, TX 

78219

3302 S.W.W. White 
Rd., San Antonio, TX 

78222
Delivery 90 Days 60 Days   90 days
Production Cut-off Date Nov 1 N/A   N/A
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date

Sept 1 N/A 10/15/13

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

Yes N/A   No

3 Trailer Mounted Trash Pumps 3
Price Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $26,744.00 No Bid No Bid
Total    $80,232.00  
Year, Make & Model Offered    2013 Magnum MTP 

6000D-6" Mobile Dry 
Prime Trash Pump

 

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

   Kubota V3600E3 BKE 
A3-IT4 57.3 H.P.

 

Warranty: 1 Year/ Unlimited 
Hours; 2yrs/2000 

Hours
Warranty Service Provider Name: H & E Equipment 

Services, Inc.

Warranty Facility Address: 5433 Randolph Blvd. 
San Antonio, TX 

78233-6216
Delivery    21 Days  
Production Cut-off Date    Dec 19, 2013  
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date

     Nov 15, 2013

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

   No  

Prepared by Purchasing 8/20/2013 2 of 14



City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 31, 2013  Bid # 1

For: Heavy Equipment Anderson Machinery 
Company

Asco, Inc. Bane Machinery Briggs Equipment Cooper Equipment 
Co.

Doggett Equipment 
Services, LTD

Freightliner of San 
Antonio, LTD

Grande Truck Center H & E Equipment 
Services, Inc.

Holt Cat McCourt & Sons 
Equipment, Inc.

6100003104 LD 9415 N.E. Loop 410 4146 IH 10 East 2449 Manana 711 North W.W. White 
Rd.

17474 Judson Rd. 4001N. Pan Am 
Expwy

8700 IH 10 East 4562 IH 10 East 5433 Randolph Blvd. 3302 S.W.W. White 
Rd.

5141 Hwy 71 W.

Item Description QTY San Antonio,                
TX 78219

San Antonio,                 
TX 78219

Dallas,                        
TX 75220

San Antonio,            
TX 78219

San Antonio,               
TX 78247

San Antonio,              
TX 78219

Converse,                  
TX 78109

San Antonio,              
TX 78219

San Antonio,                 
TX 78233

San Antonio,                 
TX 78222

La Grange,                 
TX 78945

4 Loader, Skid Steer, with Auger, Mini 
Excavator and Pallet Forks

2

Price Each No Bid $37,889.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $32,668.00 $45,000.00 No Bid
Total $75,778.00 $65,336.00 $90,000.00
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2013 Case SV185 2013 GEHL SL4640E 

Power 2 Skid Loader
2013 Cat 236B3

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

Case ISM N844LTA-
DI-F-45, 57Hp

Yanmar 4-TNV98 - 68 
H.P. @ 2500RPM - 

Tier 4

Cat C3.4, Tier 4 I , 71 
Net HP

Warranty: 1 YR Full (Unlimited 
HR) / 2 YR, 2000HR 

Engine

 1 Year Warranty 12 Months unlimited 
hour total machine

Warranty Service Provider Name: ASCO H & E Equipment 
Services, Inc.

Holt Cat

Warranty Facility Address: 4146 IH 10 East, San 
Antonio, TX 78219

5433 Randolph Blvd. 
San Antonio, TX 

78233-6216

3302 S.W.W. White 
Rd., San Antonio, TX 

78222
Delivery 90 Days 40 Days 90 days

Production Cut-off Date Nov 1 Dec 20, 2013 N/A

Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date

Sept 1 Oct 28, 2013 10/15/13

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

Yes No No

5 Loader, 4-Wheel Drive, Articulated, 
Minimum 3 CY capacity 

1

Price Each $149,850.00 $129,768.00 No Bid $142,945.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $186,192.00 No Bid
Total $149,850.00 $129,768.00 $142,945.60   $186,192.00
Year, Make & Model Offered 2013, Liugong 842III 2013, Case 621F 2013 Terex TL210 

Loader-Cab A/C
  2013 Cat 930K

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

Cummins QSB 6.7, 
193HP

FPT F4HFE613Z, 
162HP

Cummins QSB 6.7, 
160HP Net

  Cat C6.6, ACERT Tier 
4 I, 160 Net HP

Warranty: 2 Years, 2000 Hours 1 YR Full (Unlimited 
HR) / 2 YR, 2000HR 

Engine

1 Year 12 Months unlimited 
hour total machine

Warranty Service Provider Name: Anderson Machinery 
Company

ASCO Briggs Equipment Holt Cat

Warranty Facility Address: 9415 N.E. Loop 410, 
San Antonio, TX 

78219 

4146 IH 10 East, San 
Antonio, TX 78219

711 North W.W. White 
Rd., San Antonio, TX 

78219

3302 S.W.W. White 
Rd., San Antonio, TX 

78222
Delivery 90-120 Days 75 Days 120 Days   100 days
Production Cut-off Date 11/30/2013 Nov 1 N/A   N/A
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date

11/30/2013 Sept 1 N/A 10/15/13

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

Yes Yes N/A   No

6 Loader, 4-Wheel Drive, Articulated, 
Minimum 5 CY 

2

Price Each $188,495.00 $196,645.00 No Bid $201,338.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $240,450.00 No Bid
Total $376,990.00 $393,290.00 $402,677.20   $480,900.00
Year, Make & Model Offered 2013, Liugong 856III Case, 821F, 2013 2013 Terex TL310 

Loader-Cab A/C 
  2013 Cat 950K

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

Cummins QSB 6.7, 
220HP

FPT F4HFE613X, 
211HP

Cummins QSB 6.7, 
203HP Net 

  Cat C7.1 ACERT Tier 
4 I, 221 Net HP

Warranty: 2 Years, 2000 Hours 1 YR Unlimited HR 
Full / 2 YR, 2000HR 

Engine

1 Year 12 Months unlimited 
hour total machine

Warranty Service Provider Name: Anderson Machinery 
Company

ASCO Briggs Equipment Holt Cat

Warranty Facility Address: 9415 N.E. Loop 410, 
San Antonio, TX 

78219 

4146 IH 10 East, San 
Antonio, TX 78219

711 North W.W. White 
Rd., San Antonio, TX 

78219

3302 S.W.W. White 
Rd., San Antonio, TX 

78222

Delivery 90-120 Days 75 Days 120 Days   90 days
Production Cut-off Date 11/30/2013 Nov 1 N/A   N/A
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date

11/30/2013 Sept 1 N/A 10/15/13

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

Yes Yes N/A   No
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 31, 2013  Bid # 1

For: Heavy Equipment Anderson Machinery 
Company

Asco, Inc. Bane Machinery Briggs Equipment Cooper Equipment 
Co.

Doggett Equipment 
Services, LTD

Freightliner of San 
Antonio, LTD

Grande Truck Center H & E Equipment 
Services, Inc.

Holt Cat McCourt & Sons 
Equipment, Inc.

6100003104 LD 9415 N.E. Loop 410 4146 IH 10 East 2449 Manana 711 North W.W. White 
Rd.

17474 Judson Rd. 4001N. Pan Am 
Expwy

8700 IH 10 East 4562 IH 10 East 5433 Randolph Blvd. 3302 S.W.W. White 
Rd.

5141 Hwy 71 W.

Item Description QTY San Antonio,                
TX 78219

San Antonio,                 
TX 78219

Dallas,                        
TX 75220

San Antonio,            
TX 78219

San Antonio,               
TX 78247

San Antonio,              
TX 78219

Converse,                  
TX 78109

San Antonio,              
TX 78219

San Antonio,                 
TX 78233

San Antonio,                 
TX 78222

La Grange,                 
TX 78945

7 Dozer/Tractor, Tracked 1
Price Each $428,315.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total $428,315.00      
Year, Make & Model Offered 2013, Dressta TD-20      

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

Cummins QSC 240HP      

Warranty: 2 Years, 2000 Hours

Warranty Service Provider Name: Anderson Machinery 
Company

Warranty Facility Address: 9415 N.E. Loop 410, 
San Antonio, TX 

78219 
Delivery 120-150 Days      
Production Cut-off Date 11/30/2013      
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date

11/30/2013

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

Yes      

8 Dozer, Low Ground Pressure, with Winch 1
Price Each No Bid $186,840.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  No Bid $170,064.00 No Bid
Total $186,840.00      $170,064.00
Year, Make & Model Offered 2013, Case 1150M      2013 Cat D6K2 LGP

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

FPT667TA/E4A, 
123HP

     Cat C6.6 ACERT Tier 
4 I, 148 Net HP

Warranty: 1 YR Unlimited HR 
Full / 2 YR, 2000HR 

12 Months unlimited 
hour total machine

Warranty Service Provider Name: ASCO Holt Cat

Warranty Facility Address: 4146 IH 10 East, San 
Antonio, TX 78219

3302 S.W.W. White 
Rd., San Antonio, TX 

Delivery 120 Days      150 days
Production Cut-off Date Nov 1      N/A
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date

Sept 1 10/15/13

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

Yes      No

9 Milling/Cold Planer Machine 2
Price Each $392,897.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $449,105.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid  No Bid $401,827.00 No Bid
Total $785,794.00 $898,210.00 $803,654.00
Year, Make & Model Offered 2013, Bomag 

BM2000/60-2
2013 W200i 2013 Cat PM200

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

Deutz TCD 2015, 
590HP, Tier 3

Cummins QSX15 
580HP

Cat C18 550 Net HP

Warranty: 1 Year Unlimited 
Hours

1Yr Unlimited Hours 12 Months unlimited 
hour total machine

Warranty Service Provider Name: Anderson Machinery 
Company

Cooper Equipment 
Company

Holt Cat

Warranty Facility Address: 9415 N.E. Loop 410, 
San Antonio, TX 

78219 

17474 Judson Rd., 
San Antonio, TX 

78247 

3302 S.W.W. White 
Rd., San Antonio, TX 

78222
Delivery 60-90 Days 60-140 Days 100 days
Production Cut-off Date 11/30/2013 Jan 2014 N/A
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date

11/30/2013 12/31/2013 10/15/13

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

Yes No No
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 31, 2013  Bid # 1

For: Heavy Equipment Anderson Machinery 
Company

Asco, Inc. Bane Machinery Briggs Equipment Cooper Equipment 
Co.

Doggett Equipment 
Services, LTD

Freightliner of San 
Antonio, LTD

Grande Truck Center H & E Equipment 
Services, Inc.

Holt Cat McCourt & Sons 
Equipment, Inc.

6100003104 LD 9415 N.E. Loop 410 4146 IH 10 East 2449 Manana 711 North W.W. White 
Rd.

17474 Judson Rd. 4001N. Pan Am 
Expwy

8700 IH 10 East 4562 IH 10 East 5433 Randolph Blvd. 3302 S.W.W. White 
Rd.

5141 Hwy 71 W.

Item Description QTY San Antonio,                
TX 78219

San Antonio,                 
TX 78219

Dallas,                        
TX 75220

San Antonio,            
TX 78219

San Antonio,               
TX 78247

San Antonio,              
TX 78219

Converse,                  
TX 78109

San Antonio,              
TX 78219

San Antonio,                 
TX 78233

San Antonio,                 
TX 78222

La Grange,                 
TX 78945

10 Rubber Tire Paver, Minimum 11 Ton 4
Price Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $255,264.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid  No Bid $239,191.00 No Bid
Total $1,021,056.00 $956,764.00
Year, Make & Model Offered 2013 Vogele 5103-2 2013 Cat AP600D
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

Cummins QSB 6.7 C-
170, 170 H.P. 

Cat C6.6 165 Net HP

Warranty: 1 YR Unlimited Hours 12 Months unlimited 
hour total machine

Warranty Service Provider Name: Cooper Equipment 
Company

Holt Cat

Warranty Facility Address: 17474 Judson Rd., 
San Antonio, TX 

78247 

3302 S.W.W. White 
Rd., San Antonio, TX 

78222
Delivery 60-140 Days 150 days
Production Cut-off Date Jan 01, 2014 N/A
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date

Jan 01, 2014 10/15/13

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

No No

11 Roller, Tired Pneumatic, Rigid Frame, 15 
ton minimum

1

Price Each No Bid $97,648.22 No Bid No Bid $112,048.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid  No Bid $86,045.00 No Bid
Total $97,648.22 $112,048.00 $86,045.00
Year, Make & Model Offered 2013, Case PT240 2013 Hamm GRW-

280-15
2013 Cat CW14 HW

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

Cummins QSB 33-
C99, 99HP

Deutz TCD 20 12 L04 
2V, 134H.P.

Cat C3.4B Tier 4 I, 89 
Net HP

Warranty: 1 YR Unlimited HR 
Full / 2 YR, 2000HR 

Engine

1 YR Unlimited Hours 12 Months

Warranty Service Provider Name: ASCO Cooper Equipment 
Company

Holt Cat

Warranty Facility Address: 4146 IH 10 East, San 
Antonio, TX 78219

17474 Judson Rd., 
San Antonio, TX 

78247 

3302 S.W.W. White 
Rd., San Antonio, TX 

78222
Delivery 75 Days 60-140 Days 190 days
Production Cut-off Date Nov 1 Jan 01, 2014 N/A
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date

Sept 1 Dec 31, 2013 10/15/13

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

Yes No No

12 Brush Chipper, Self Feeding Trailer 
Mounted

1

Price Each No Bid No Bid No Bid $29,620.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total $29,620.00
Year, Make & Model Offered 2013 Terex 

Woodsman 730
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

Kubota V360DT

Warranty: 1 Year
Warranty Service Provider Name: Briggs Equipment

Warranty Facility Address: 711 North W.W. White 
Rd., San Antonio, TX 

78219
Delivery 120 Days
Production Cut-off Date N/A
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date

N/A

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

N/A

Prepared by Purchasing 8/20/2013 5 of 14



City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 31, 2013  Bid # 1

For: Heavy Equipment Anderson Machinery 
Company

Asco, Inc. Bane Machinery Briggs Equipment Cooper Equipment 
Co.

Doggett Equipment 
Services, LTD

Freightliner of San 
Antonio, LTD

Grande Truck Center H & E Equipment 
Services, Inc.

Holt Cat McCourt & Sons 
Equipment, Inc.

6100003104 LD 9415 N.E. Loop 410 4146 IH 10 East 2449 Manana 711 North W.W. White 
Rd.

17474 Judson Rd. 4001N. Pan Am 
Expwy

8700 IH 10 East 4562 IH 10 East 5433 Randolph Blvd. 3302 S.W.W. White 
Rd.

5141 Hwy 71 W.

Item Description QTY San Antonio,                
TX 78219

San Antonio,                 
TX 78219

Dallas,                        
TX 75220

San Antonio,            
TX 78219

San Antonio,               
TX 78247

San Antonio,              
TX 78219

Converse,                  
TX 78109

San Antonio,              
TX 78219

San Antonio,                 
TX 78233

San Antonio,                 
TX 78222

La Grange,                 
TX 78945

13 Trailer, Minimum 55 Ton, Self-Lifting 
Detachable Gooseneck:

2

Price Each: No Bid $91,042.00 No Bid No Bid $73,558.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid  No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total: $182,084.00 $147,116.00
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2014, Felling XF-PVR-

110-3 HDG
2013 Etnyre 

Blackhawk 55 Ton 
Paver Special

Warranty: 1 YR Full, 3 YR paint, 
5YR Structural

1 YR 

Warranty Service Provider Name: ASCO Cooper Equipment 
Company

Warranty Facility Address: 4146 IH 10 East, San 
Antonio, TX 78219

17474 Judson Rd., 
San Antonio, TX 

78247 
Delivery: 375 Days 275 Days
Production Cut-off Date: Nov 1 Jan 01, 2014
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date:

Sept 1 Dec 31, 2013

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date:

Yes, Till Dec 31, 2013 No

14 Minimum (GVWR 33,000 lbs.) Cab & 
Chassis with Fuel and Lube Body:

1

Price Each: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $143,115.00 $145,750.00  No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total: $143,115.00 $145,750.00
Year, Make & Model of Cab & Chassis 
Offered:

2014 Freightliner M2-
106

2013 Ford F750 
Regular Cab

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

Cummins ISB-6.7 
250HP-660TQ

Cummins 6.7 ISB 250 
H.P. 660 lb. ft. Torque

Transmission Offered: Allison 3500 RDS Allison RDS 3500
Warranty Cab & Chassis: 1 Yr-Unlimited 2 Years

Year, Make & Model of Fuel & Lube Body: 2013 Niece FC 750 2013 KFLT-1 
Knapheide

Warranty Fuel & Lube Body: 1 Year 12 Months

Warranty Service Provider Name: Freightliner of San 
Antonio, LTD

Terex

Warranty Facility Address: 8700 IH 10 East, 
Converse, TX 78109

San Antonio, TX 
78219

Delivery 120-150 Days 150-180 Days
Production Cut-off Date 10/31/13 9/20/2013
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date

10/30/13 9/18/2013

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

Not Provided No

15
Minimum 33,000 GVWR lbs. Cab & Chassis 
with 2,000 Gallon Water Distribution Body

1

Price Each: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $95,249.00 $89,151.00  No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total: $95,249.00 $89,152.00
Year, Make & Model of Cab & Chassis 
Offered:

2014 Freightliner M2-
106

2013 Ford F750 
Regular Cab

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

Cummins ISB-6.7 
250HP-660TQ

Cummins 6.7 ISB 250 
H.P. 660 lb. ft. Torque

Transmission Offered: Allison 3500 RDS Allison RDS 3500
Warranty Cab & Chassis: 1 Year-Unlimited 2 Years

Year, Make & Model of Water Distribution 
Body:

2013 Niece WT 2000 2013 2000 G Ledwell 
Water Tank

Warranty Water Distribution Body: 1 Year 1 Year
Warranty Service Provider Name: Freightliner of San 

Antonio, LTD
Terex

Warranty Facility Address: 8700 IH 10 East, 
Converse, TX 78109

San Antonio, TX 
78219

Delivery 120-150 Days Not Provided
Production Cut-off Date 10/31/13 9/20/2013
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date

10/31/13 9/18/2013

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

Not Provided No
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 31, 2013  Bid # 1

For: Heavy Equipment Anderson Machinery 
Company

Asco, Inc. Bane Machinery Briggs Equipment Cooper Equipment 
Co.

Doggett Equipment 
Services, LTD

Freightliner of San 
Antonio, LTD

Grande Truck Center H & E Equipment 
Services, Inc.

Holt Cat McCourt & Sons 
Equipment, Inc.

6100003104 LD 9415 N.E. Loop 410 4146 IH 10 East 2449 Manana 711 North W.W. White 
Rd.

17474 Judson Rd. 4001N. Pan Am 
Expwy

8700 IH 10 East 4562 IH 10 East 5433 Randolph Blvd. 3302 S.W.W. White 
Rd.

5141 Hwy 71 W.

Item Description QTY San Antonio,                
TX 78219

San Antonio,                 
TX 78219

Dallas,                        
TX 75220

San Antonio,            
TX 78219

San Antonio,               
TX 78247

San Antonio,              
TX 78219

Converse,                  
TX 78109

San Antonio,              
TX 78219

San Antonio,                 
TX 78233

San Antonio,                 
TX 78222

La Grange,                 
TX 78945

16 Ice Resurfacing Machine 1
Price Each: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total:
Trade–In Zamboni Model 500; Total 
Trade–In Price: 
Year, Make & Model Offered
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 
Transmission Offered:
Warranty:
Warranty Service Provider Name:
Warranty Facility Address:
Delivery 
Production Cut-off Date
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

17 Shredder/Grinder – Horizontal Type 1
Price Each: No Bid No Bid $857,000.00 No Bid No Bid $675,935.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $849,500.00
Total: $857,000.00 $675,935.00 $849,500.00
Trade-In Vermeer Model TG 525; Total 
Trade-In Price

$157,000.00 Not Provided N/A

Year, Make & Model Offered 2013 Diamond Z, 
Diamond Z Horizontal 

7000 Tier IV Interum

2013 Yr., Morbark 
4600XL

2013 CBI 6800 BT 
Track Mounted 
Horizontal Hog 

Grinder

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

Caterpillar C-27 Tier 
IV Interim, 1050HP

Caterpillar C-27, 
1050HP

Cat C27, 1050 HP 
Tier 4 

Transmission Offered: Fluid Coupling Drive PTTECH 
Electric/Hydraulic for 

Horse Power to 
1,200HP

PI Tech Model HP 
2015

Warranty: 1 Yr 5 years/3,000 Hours 
Maximum-whichever 

comes first

Six (6) Month Extend 
warranty optional

Warranty Service Provider Name: Bane Machinery / 
Anderson Machinery

Doggett Equipment 
Services, LTD

McCourt & Sons 
Equipment, Inc.

Warranty Facility Address: 9415 N.E. Loop 410 
Loop,  San Antonio, 

TX 78219 

4001N. Pan Am 
Expwy., San Antonio, 

TX 78219

5141 Hwy 71 W., La 
Grange, TX 78945

Delivery 126-154 Days 45-90 days 42 Days
Production Cut-off Date Possibly by 6 weeks 

of bid opening 
"Negotiable"

10/2/2013 8/20/2013

Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date

Sept 12, 2013 10/1/2013 8/26/2013

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

Yes, Up to 90 days 
pass cut-off 

No Yes

Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 31, 2013

For: Heavy Equipment

6100003104 LD

Item Description QTY

1A Forklift, 6,000 lbs., LPG 3
Price Each:
Total:
Year, Make & Model Offered:
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 
Transmission Offered:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Name:

Warranty Facility Address:

Delivery 
Production Cut-off Date
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

1B Forklift, 8,000 lbs., LPG 1
Price Each
Total
Year, Make & Model Offered

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 
Transmission Offered:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Name:

Warranty Facility Address:

Delivery 
Production Cut-off Date
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

1C Forklift, 8,000 lbs., Diesel 1
Price Each
Total
Year, Make & Model Offered

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

Transmission Offered:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Name:

Warranty Facility Address:

Delivery 
Production Cut-off Date
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

Bid # 2  Bid # 1 Bid # 2 Bid # 1 Bid # 2 Bid # 3

McCourt & Sons 
Equipment, Inc.

Niece Equipment Quality Equipment Co. RDO Equipment 
Company

RDO Equipment 
Company

Roadtec, Inc. Tractor City Vermeer Texas-
Louisiana

Vermeer Texas-
Louisiana

Vermeer Texas-
Louisiana

Waukesha-Pearce 
Industries, Inc.

5141 Hwy 71 W. 3039 Hwy 71 E. 11146 IH 35 North 19275 IH 35 N. 19275 IH 35 N. 800 Manufacturers 
Road

2800 S.E. Loop 410 16593 IH 35 North 16593 IH 35 North 16593 IH 35 North 3740 S. E. Loop 410

La Grange,                 
TX 78945

Del Valle,                  
TX 78617

San Antonio                 
TX 78233

New Braunfels,           
TX 78132

New Braunfels,           
TX 78132

Chattanooga,             
TN 37405

San Antonio,               
TX 78222 

Selma,                        
TX 78154 

Selma,                        
TX 78154 

Selma,                        
TX 78154 

San Antonio,                 
TX 78222

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
 
 

 

 
 

 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 31, 2013

For: Heavy Equipment

6100003104 LD

Item Description QTY

2A Loader / Backhoe, 4WD, Enclosed Cab 2
Price Each
Total
Year, Make & Model Offered

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Name:

Warranty Facility Address:

Delivery 
Production Cut-off Date
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

2B Loader / Backhoe, 4WD, Open Cab 1
Price Each
Total
Year, Make & Model Offered

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Name:

Warranty Facility Address:

Delivery 
Production Cut-off Date
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

3 Trailer Mounted Trash Pumps 3
Price Each
Total
Year, Make & Model Offered

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Name:

Warranty Facility Address:

Delivery 
Production Cut-off Date
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

Bid # 2  Bid # 1 Bid # 2 Bid # 1 Bid # 2 Bid # 3

McCourt & Sons 
Equipment, Inc.

Niece Equipment Quality Equipment Co. RDO Equipment 
Company

RDO Equipment 
Company

Roadtec, Inc. Tractor City Vermeer Texas-
Louisiana

Vermeer Texas-
Louisiana

Vermeer Texas-
Louisiana

Waukesha-Pearce 
Industries, Inc.

5141 Hwy 71 W. 3039 Hwy 71 E. 11146 IH 35 North 19275 IH 35 N. 19275 IH 35 N. 800 Manufacturers 
Road

2800 S.E. Loop 410 16593 IH 35 North 16593 IH 35 North 16593 IH 35 North 3740 S. E. Loop 410

La Grange,                 
TX 78945

Del Valle,                  
TX 78617

San Antonio                 
TX 78233

New Braunfels,           
TX 78132

New Braunfels,           
TX 78132

Chattanooga,             
TN 37405

San Antonio,               
TX 78222 

Selma,                        
TX 78154 

Selma,                        
TX 78154 

Selma,                        
TX 78154 

San Antonio,                 
TX 78222

No Bid No Bid No Bid $70,495.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
 $140,990.00
 2013 John Deere 

310K 
 John Deere 

Powertech 
E4045T072 -88 Net 

HP
12 Months-Full 

Machine-Unlimited 
Hrs 

RDO Equipment 
Company

19275 IH 35 N., New 
Braunfels, TX 78132

 30-45 Days
 11/15/2013

11/1/2015

 Yes

No Bid No Bid No Bid $79,490.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$79,490.00

2013 John Deere 
Model 310K 

Backhoe/2013 Okada 
ORU1000 Hammer

John Deere 
Powertech 

E4045T072 -88 Net 
HP12 Months-Full 

Machine-Hammer 
Unlimited Hrs 

RDO Equipment 
Company

19275 IH 35 N., New 
Braunfels, TX 78132

30-45 Days
11/15/2013

11/1/2015

Yes

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 31, 2013

For: Heavy Equipment

6100003104 LD

Item Description QTY

4 Loader, Skid Steer, with Auger, Mini 
Excavator and Pallet Forks

2

Price Each
Total
Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Name:

Warranty Facility Address:

Delivery 

Production Cut-off Date

Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

5 Loader, 4-Wheel Drive, Articulated, 
Minimum 3 CY capacity 

1

Price Each
Total
Year, Make & Model Offered

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Name:

Warranty Facility Address:

Delivery 
Production Cut-off Date
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

6 Loader, 4-Wheel Drive, Articulated, 
Minimum 5 CY 

2

Price Each
Total
Year, Make & Model Offered

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Name:

Warranty Facility Address:

Delivery 
Production Cut-off Date
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

Bid # 2  Bid # 1 Bid # 2 Bid # 1 Bid # 2 Bid # 3

McCourt & Sons 
Equipment, Inc.

Niece Equipment Quality Equipment Co. RDO Equipment 
Company

RDO Equipment 
Company

Roadtec, Inc. Tractor City Vermeer Texas-
Louisiana

Vermeer Texas-
Louisiana

Vermeer Texas-
Louisiana

Waukesha-Pearce 
Industries, Inc.

5141 Hwy 71 W. 3039 Hwy 71 E. 11146 IH 35 North 19275 IH 35 N. 19275 IH 35 N. 800 Manufacturers 
Road

2800 S.E. Loop 410 16593 IH 35 North 16593 IH 35 North 16593 IH 35 North 3740 S. E. Loop 410

La Grange,                 
TX 78945

Del Valle,                  
TX 78617

San Antonio                 
TX 78233

New Braunfels,           
TX 78132

New Braunfels,           
TX 78132

Chattanooga,             
TN 37405

San Antonio,               
TX 78222 

Selma,                        
TX 78154 

Selma,                        
TX 78154 

Selma,                        
TX 78154 

San Antonio,                 
TX 78222

No Bid No Bid $33,312.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid $36,999.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $41,824.00
$66,624.32 $73,998.00 $83,648.00

2013, Bobcat S570 2013 John Deere 
318D

2013 Takeuchi TS60R

Kubota 2607 John Deere Power 
Tech E4024HT

Perkins 404D-22T, 
56.4 HP

1 year full 1 Year 1 Year-Unlimited Hour-
Takeuchi

Quality Equipment Co. Tractor City Waukesha-Pearce 
Industries, Inc.

11146 IH 35 North, 
San Antonio, TX 

78233

2800 S.E. Loop 410, 
San Antonio, TX 

78222 

3740 S. E. Loop 410, 
San Antonio, TX 

78222
45 Days 60 Days 90 Days

Sept 11, 2013 10/1/2013 11/30/2013

Aug 20, 2013 9/6/2013 11/30/2013

No No No

 

No Bid No Bid No Bid $178,595.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $134,830.00
 $178,595.00 $134,830.00
 2013 John Deere 

544K
2013 Komatsu WA270-

7
 John Deere 

Powertech PVX6068 
163 Net HP

Komatsu SAA6D107E-
2, 149 HP 

12 Months-Unlimited 
Hrs-Full Machine 

1 Year-Unlimited Hour

RDO Equipment 
Company

Waukesha-Pearce 
Industries, Inc.

19275 IH 35 N., New 
Braunfels, TX 78132

3740 S. E. Loop 410, 
San Antonio, TX 

78222
 30-45 Days 90- 120 Days
 11/15/2013 11/30/2013

11/1/2015 11/30/2013

 Yes No

No Bid No Bid No Bid $254,895.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $232,144.00
$509,790.00 $464,288.00

2013 John Deere 
644K

2013 Komatsu WA380-
7

John Deere 
Powertech Plus 6068 

232 Net HP

Komatsu SAA6D107E-
2, 191 HP 

12 Months-Full 
Machine-Unlimited 

Hrs 

1 Year-Unlimited Hour

RDO Equipment 
Company

Waukesha-Pearce 
Industries, Inc.

19275 IH 35 N., New 
Braunfels, TX 78132

3740 S. E. Loop 410, 
San Antonio, TX 

78222

30-45 Days 90 Days
11/15/2013 12/31/2013

11/1/2015 12/31/2013

Yes No
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 31, 2013

For: Heavy Equipment

6100003104 LD

Item Description QTY

7 Dozer/Tractor, Tracked 1
Price Each
Total
Year, Make & Model Offered

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Name:

Warranty Facility Address:

Delivery 
Production Cut-off Date
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

8 Dozer, Low Ground Pressure, with Winch 1
Price Each
Total
Year, Make & Model Offered

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Name:

Warranty Facility Address:

Delivery 
Production Cut-off Date
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

9 Milling/Cold Planer Machine 2
Price Each
Total
Year, Make & Model Offered

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 
Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Name:

Warranty Facility Address:

Delivery 
Production Cut-off Date
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

Bid # 2  Bid # 1 Bid # 2 Bid # 1 Bid # 2 Bid # 3

McCourt & Sons 
Equipment, Inc.

Niece Equipment Quality Equipment Co. RDO Equipment 
Company

RDO Equipment 
Company

Roadtec, Inc. Tractor City Vermeer Texas-
Louisiana

Vermeer Texas-
Louisiana

Vermeer Texas-
Louisiana

Waukesha-Pearce 
Industries, Inc.

5141 Hwy 71 W. 3039 Hwy 71 E. 11146 IH 35 North 19275 IH 35 N. 19275 IH 35 N. 800 Manufacturers 
Road

2800 S.E. Loop 410 16593 IH 35 North 16593 IH 35 North 16593 IH 35 North 3740 S. E. Loop 410

La Grange,                 
TX 78945

Del Valle,                  
TX 78617

San Antonio                 
TX 78233

New Braunfels,           
TX 78132

New Braunfels,           
TX 78132

Chattanooga,             
TN 37405

San Antonio,               
TX 78222 

Selma,                        
TX 78154 

Selma,                        
TX 78154 

Selma,                        
TX 78154 

San Antonio,                 
TX 78222

No Bid No Bid No Bid $406,995.00 $532,295.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $456,433.00
 $406,995.00 $532,295.00 $456,433.00
 2013 John Deere 

950J
2013 John Deere 

950J
2013 Komatsu D85EX-

15E0
 Liebherr D936-LA6 

247 Net HP
Liebherr D946-LA6 

335 Net HP
Komatsu SAA6D125E-

5, 264 HP 

12 Months-Full 
Machine-Unlimited 

Hrs 

12 Months-Full 
Machine-Unlimited 

Hrs 

1 Year-Unlimited Hour

RDO Equipment 
Company

RDO Equipment 
Company

Waukesha-Pearce 
Industries, Inc.

19275 IH 35 N., New 
Braunfels, TX 78132

19275 IH 35 N., New 
Braunfels, TX 78132

3740 S. E. Loop 410, 
San Antonio, TX 

78222
 90-120 Days 90-120 Days 180 Days
 11/15/2013 11/15/2013 10/15/2013

11/1/2015 11/1/2015 10/15/2013

 Yes Yes No

No Bid No Bid No Bid $193,495.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $199,830.00
$193,495.00 $199,830.00

2013 John Deere 
700K

2013 Komatsu D51PX-
22

John Deere 
Powertech PVX6068 

125 Net HP

Komatsu SAA6D107E-
1

12 Months-Unlimited 
Hrs-Full Machine 

1 Year-Unlimited Hour

RDO Equipment 
Company

Waukesha-Pearce 
Industries, Inc.

19275 IH 35 N., New 
Braunfels, TX 78132

3740 S. E. Loop 410, 
San Antonio, TX 

30-90 Days 90-120 Days
11/15/2013 9/30/2013

11/1/2015 9/30/2013

Yes No

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $484,497.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$968,994.00

2013 Roadtec RX-
600e

Cummins QSX-15 Tier 
4i 600 Hp

1 Year /Unlimited 
Hours

Closner Equipment 
Company, Inc.

21910 FM 2252, 
Schertz, TX 78154

45 Days
12/31/2013
11/15/2013

No
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 31, 2013

For: Heavy Equipment

6100003104 LD

Item Description QTY

10 Rubber Tire Paver, Minimum 11 Ton 4
Price Each
Total
Year, Make & Model Offered
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 
Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Name:

Warranty Facility Address:

Delivery 
Production Cut-off Date
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

11 Roller, Tired Pneumatic, Rigid Frame, 15 
ton minimum

1

Price Each
Total
Year, Make & Model Offered

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 
Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Name:

Warranty Facility Address:

Delivery 
Production Cut-off Date
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

12 Brush Chipper, Self Feeding Trailer 
Mounted

1

Price Each
Total
Year, Make & Model Offered

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 
Warranty:
Warranty Service Provider Name:

Warranty Facility Address:

Delivery 
Production Cut-off Date
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

Bid # 2  Bid # 1 Bid # 2 Bid # 1 Bid # 2 Bid # 3

McCourt & Sons 
Equipment, Inc.

Niece Equipment Quality Equipment Co. RDO Equipment 
Company

RDO Equipment 
Company

Roadtec, Inc. Tractor City Vermeer Texas-
Louisiana

Vermeer Texas-
Louisiana

Vermeer Texas-
Louisiana

Waukesha-Pearce 
Industries, Inc.

5141 Hwy 71 W. 3039 Hwy 71 E. 11146 IH 35 North 19275 IH 35 N. 19275 IH 35 N. 800 Manufacturers 
Road

2800 S.E. Loop 410 16593 IH 35 North 16593 IH 35 North 16593 IH 35 North 3740 S. E. Loop 410

La Grange,                 
TX 78945

Del Valle,                  
TX 78617

San Antonio                 
TX 78233

New Braunfels,           
TX 78132

New Braunfels,           
TX 78132

Chattanooga,             
TN 37405

San Antonio,               
TX 78222 

Selma,                        
TX 78154 

Selma,                        
TX 78154 

Selma,                        
TX 78154 

San Antonio,                 
TX 78222

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $62,433.00
$62,433.00

2013 Bomag 
BW11RH

Cummins 4B3.3T, 74 
HP

1 Year

Waukesha-Pearce 
Industries, Inc.

3740 S. E. Loop 410, 
San Antonio, TX 

78222
180 Days

10/31/2013
10/31/2013

No

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $34,691.00 No Bid No Bid $34,500.00 No Bid
$34,691.00 $34,500.00

2013 Rayco RC1220-
Tier 4i

2013 Vermeer 
BC1000XL

KubotaV3600, 66.8 
SAE Net HP

Cummins B3.3L Turbo 
Tier 4i, 74 HP

1 Year Standard 1 Year
Tractor City Vermeer Texas-

Louisiana
2800 S.E. Loop 410, 

San Antonio, TX 
78222 

16593 IH 35 North, 
Selma, TX 78154

60 Days 30 Days
Not Provided 10/1/13
Not Provided 10/1/13

Not Provided No
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 31, 2013

For: Heavy Equipment

6100003104 LD

Item Description QTY

13 Trailer, Minimum 55 Ton, Self-Lifting 
Detachable Gooseneck:

2

Price Each:
Total:
Year, Make & Model Offered:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Name:

Warranty Facility Address:

Delivery:
Production Cut-off Date:
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date:

14 Minimum (GVWR 33,000 lbs.) Cab & 
Chassis with Fuel and Lube Body:

1

Price Each:
Total:
Year, Make & Model of Cab & Chassis 
Offered:
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

Transmission Offered:
Warranty Cab & Chassis:

Year, Make & Model of Fuel & Lube Body:

Warranty Fuel & Lube Body:

Warranty Service Provider Name:

Warranty Facility Address:

Delivery 
Production Cut-off Date
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

15
Minimum 33,000 GVWR lbs. Cab & Chassis 
with 2,000 Gallon Water Distribution Body

1

Price Each:
Total:
Year, Make & Model of Cab & Chassis 
Offered:
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

Transmission Offered:
Warranty Cab & Chassis:

Year, Make & Model of Water Distribution 
Body:
Warranty Water Distribution Body:
Warranty Service Provider Name:

Warranty Facility Address:

Delivery 
Production Cut-off Date
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

Bid # 2  Bid # 1 Bid # 2 Bid # 1 Bid # 2 Bid # 3

McCourt & Sons 
Equipment, Inc.

Niece Equipment Quality Equipment Co. RDO Equipment 
Company

RDO Equipment 
Company

Roadtec, Inc. Tractor City Vermeer Texas-
Louisiana

Vermeer Texas-
Louisiana

Vermeer Texas-
Louisiana

Waukesha-Pearce 
Industries, Inc.

5141 Hwy 71 W. 3039 Hwy 71 E. 11146 IH 35 North 19275 IH 35 N. 19275 IH 35 N. 800 Manufacturers 
Road

2800 S.E. Loop 410 16593 IH 35 North 16593 IH 35 North 16593 IH 35 North 3740 S. E. Loop 410

La Grange,                 
TX 78945

Del Valle,                  
TX 78617

San Antonio                 
TX 78233

New Braunfels,           
TX 78132

New Braunfels,           
TX 78132

Chattanooga,             
TN 37405

San Antonio,               
TX 78222 

Selma,                        
TX 78154 

Selma,                        
TX 78154 

Selma,                        
TX 78154 

San Antonio,                 
TX 78222

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid $139,302.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$139,302.00

2014 Freightliner M2-
106

Cummins ISB 250 HP

Allison 3500 RDS
1 year on bumper to 

bumper, 2 year on 
drivetrain 

2013 Niece FL750  

1 Year on body, 
standard manufacturer 

warranty on 
components

Niece Equipment

3039 Hwy 71 E., Del 
Valle, TX 78617

70-84 Days
N/A
N/A

Yes

No Bid $91,526.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$91,526.00

2014 Freightliner M2-
106

Cummins ISB 250 HP

Allison 3500 RDS
1 year on bumper to 

bumper, 2 year on 
drivetrain 

2013 Niece WT2000  

1 Year
Niece Equipment

3039 Hwy 71 E., Del 
Valle, TX 78617

70-84 Days
N/A
N/A

Yes
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 31, 2013

For: Heavy Equipment

6100003104 LD

Item Description QTY

16 Ice Resurfacing Machine 1
Price Each:
Total:
Trade–In Zamboni Model 500; Total 
Trade–In Price: 
Year, Make & Model Offered
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 
Transmission Offered:
Warranty:
Warranty Service Provider Name:
Warranty Facility Address:
Delivery 
Production Cut-off Date
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

17 Shredder/Grinder – Horizontal Type 1
Price Each:
Total:
Trade-In Vermeer Model TG 525; Total 
Trade-In Price
Year, Make & Model Offered

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 
Transmission Offered:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Name:

Warranty Facility Address:

Delivery 
Production Cut-off Date

Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date

Payment Terms

Bid # 2  Bid # 1 Bid # 2 Bid # 1 Bid # 2 Bid # 3

McCourt & Sons 
Equipment, Inc.

Niece Equipment Quality Equipment Co. RDO Equipment 
Company

RDO Equipment 
Company

Roadtec, Inc. Tractor City Vermeer Texas-
Louisiana

Vermeer Texas-
Louisiana

Vermeer Texas-
Louisiana

Waukesha-Pearce 
Industries, Inc.

5141 Hwy 71 W. 3039 Hwy 71 E. 11146 IH 35 North 19275 IH 35 N. 19275 IH 35 N. 800 Manufacturers 
Road

2800 S.E. Loop 410 16593 IH 35 North 16593 IH 35 North 16593 IH 35 North 3740 S. E. Loop 410

La Grange,                 
TX 78945

Del Valle,                  
TX 78617

San Antonio                 
TX 78233

New Braunfels,           
TX 78132

New Braunfels,           
TX 78132

Chattanooga,             
TN 37405

San Antonio,               
TX 78222 

Selma,                        
TX 78154 

Selma,                        
TX 78154 

Selma,                        
TX 78154 

San Antonio,                 
TX 78222

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$814,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $841,650.00 $841,650.00 No Bid $589,830.00
$814,500.00 $841,650.00 $841,650.00  $589,830.00

N/A $85,000.00 $85,000.00  $48,000.00

2013 CBI 6800 BT 
Track Mounted 
Horizontal Hog 

Grinder

2013 Vermeer 
HG8000 (With 25 

Hours) also includes 
super single Tires and 

HD mill abrasion 
package

2013 Vermeer 
HG8000 

 2013 Doppstadt 
AK630

Cat C27, 1050 HP 
Tier 2 

Caterpillar C27 1050 
HP Tier 2 D-Rated

Caterpillar C27 1050 
HP Tier 2 D-Rated

 Daimler Chrysler 
OM502LA, 630 HP

PI Tech Model HP 
2015

Hydraulically-
Operated wet clutch 
with integrated PTO

Hydraulically-
Operated wet clutch 
with integrated PTO

 None Hydrodynamic 
Fluid Coupling-Non 

Friction Clutch

Six (6) Month Extend 
warranty optional

Standard 1 Year Standard 1 Year  1 Year/1000Hours-
Doppstadt, 2 

Years/3000Hours-
Engine

McCourt & Sons 
Equipment, Inc.

Vermeer Texas-
Louisiana

Vermeer Texas-
Louisiana

 Waukesha-Pearce 
Industries, Inc.

5141 Hwy 71 W., La 
Grange, TX 78945

16593 IH 35 North, 
Selma, TX 78154

16593 IH 35 North, 
Selma, TX 78154

 3740 S. E. Loop 410, 
San Antonio, TX 

78222
42 Days 30 Days 90 Days  90-120 Days

8/20/2013 8/15/2013 11/1/2013  10/31/2013

8/26/2013 8/15/2013 9/1/2013  10/31/2013

Yes No No  No

Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 2%, Net 10 days Net 30 Days Net 30 Days Net 30 Days Net 30
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