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AN ORDINANCE 20 13 - 0 5 - 3 0 - 0 353 
ACCEPTING THE OFFER FROM PHILPOTT MOTORS, BENSON HONDA AND 
NORTH PARK VOLKSWAGEN TO PROVIDE 43 GASOLINEIELECTRIC POWERED 
HYBRID ADMINISTRATIVE SEDANS TO THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO FOR A 
TOTAL COST OF $1,033,342.20, FROM THE EQUIPMENT RENEWAL AND 
REPLACEMENT FUND. 

* * * * * 

WHEREAS, offers were submitted by Benson Honda, North Park Volkswagen and Philpott Motors 
to provide the City of San Antonio Police Department with 22 gasoline/electric hybrid powered 
administrative sedans for a total cost of $544,693.20; and 

WHEREAS, the Texas Local Government Code indicates that competitive bidding is not required 
under section 252.022(a)(2), which provides for a procurement necessary to protect the public 
health or safety; and 

WHEREAS, a bid was submitted to provide the City of San Antonio with 21 gasoline/electric 
powered hybrid administrative sedans; and 

WHEREAS, the low bid was submitted by Philpott Motors for a total cost of $488,649.00; NOW 
THEREFORE: 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO: 

SECTION 1. The offers submitted by Benson Honda, North Park Volkswagen and Philpott Motors 
to provide the City of San Antonio Police Department with 22 gasoline/electric hybrid powered 
administrative sedans for a total cost of $544,693 .20 are hereby accepted, subject to and contingent 
upon the deposit of all required bonds, performance deposits, insurance certificates and 
endorsements. Copies of the contracts are available for inspection in the offices of the Purchasing & 
General Services Division of the Finance Department 

SECTION 2. The bid submitted by Philpott Motors to provide the City with 21 gasoline/electric 
powered hybrid administrative sedans for a total cost of $488,649.00 is hereby accepted, subject to 
and contingent upon the deposit of all required bonds, performance deposits, insurance certificates 
and endorsements. Attached hereto and incorporated herein for all purposes as Exhibit I are the bid 
tabulation sheet and bid. 

SECTION 3. Funding in the amount of $1 ,033 ,342.20 for this ordinance is available in Fund 
72001000, Cost Center 3503200001 and General Ledger 5501050, as part of the Fiscal Year 2013 
Budget. 

SECTION 4. Payment not to exceed the budgeted amount of$814,639.20 is authorized to Philpott 
Motors and should be encumbered with a purchase order. 
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SECTION 5. Payment not to exceed the budgeted amount of $152,400.00 is authorized to North 
Park Volkswagen and should be encumbered with a purchase order. 

SECTION 6. Payment not to exceed the budgeted amount of $66,303.00 is authorized to Benson 
Honda and should be encumbered with a purchase order. 

SECTION 7. The financial allocations in this Ordinance are subject to approval by the Director of 
Finance, City of San Antonio. The Director of Finance may, subject to concurrence by the City 
Manager or the City Manager's designee, correct allocations to specific SAP Fund Numbers, SAP 
Project Definitions, SAP WBS Elements, SAP Internal Orders, SAP Fund Centers, SAP Cost 
Centers, SAP Functional Areas, SAP Funds Reservation Document Numbers and SAP GL 
Accounts as necessary to carry out the purpose of this Ordinance. 

SECTION 8. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight or more affirmative 
votes; otherwise, it is effective on the tenth day after passage. 

PASSED and APPROVED this 30th day of May, 2013. 

Julian Castro 

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM: 

~Michael D. Bernard, Cit Arney 
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Agenda Voting Results - 6 

Name: 6, 7,8,9A,9B, 11, 12, 13, 14, 15A, 15B, 16A, 16B, 16C, 17, 18, 20A, 20B, 
20C, 21, 22, 25, 26, 27, 28, 29A, 29B, 30A, 30B 

Date: 05/3012013 

Time: 10:49:32 AM 

Vote Type: Motion to Approve 

Description: An Ordinance accepting the offer from Philpott Motors, Benson Honda and 
North Park Volkswagen to provide 43 Gasoline/Electric Powered Hybrid 
Administrative Sedans to the City of San Antonio for a total cost of 
$1,033,342.20, from the Equipment Renewal and Replacement Fund. [Ben 
Gorzell, Chief Financial Officer; Troy Elliott, Director, Finance] 

Result: Passed 

Voter Group 
Not Yea Nay Abstain Motion Second 

Present 

Julian Castro Mayor x 

Diego Bernal District 1 x 

Ivy R. Taylor District 2 x 

Leticia Ozuna District 3 x 

Rey Saldaiia District 4 x x 

David Medina Jr. District 5 x 

Ray Lopez District 6 x 

Cris Medina District 7 x 

W. Reed Williams District 8 x x 

Elisa Chan District 9 x 

Carlton Soules District 10 x 

http:// cosawebl agendabuilder/votingresults. aspx?I temld= 1 0233 &Src= RFCA 5/3012013 



EXHIBIT I 
City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: February 15, 2013 

For: Administrative Sedans (Various) Philpott Motors North Park Volkswagen Benson Honda 

1400 N. Hwy 69 21315 Wesllnterstate 10 9400 San Pedro Ave. 

6100002497 LD 
Item Description Qly Nederland, San Antonio, San Anlonio , 

TX 77627 TX 78257 21C TX 78216 
409-853-3442 581-1000 210-341-3311 

1 2013 or Newer Toyota Camry Four Door Sedans, 4 
Gasoline/Electric Powered Hybrid 
Price Each $23,873.00 No Bid No Bid 

Price Total $95,492.00 
Year Offered 201 
Warranty Miles/Months 36,000/36 

Manufacture Cut-Off Date June 1, 2013 
Last day order can be placed without missing cut- June 1, 2013 

off date 
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date Nc 

Delivery 90 Day, 

2 2013 or Newer Volkswagen Jetta Hybrid Four 6 
Door Sedans Gasoline/Electric Powered Hybrid 
Price Each No Bil $25,400.00 No Bid 

Price Total $152,400.00 

Year Offered 201 

Warranty Miles/Months 36,000/36 
Manufacture Cut-Off Date June 201 

Last day order can be placed without missing cut- June 2013 

off date 
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date Nc 
Delivery 45 Day, 

3 2012 or Newer Hyundai Sonata Hybrid Four Door 4 
Sedans Gasoline/Electric Powered Hybrid 
Price Each $26,221 .00 No Bid No Bid 

Price Total $104,884.00 
Year Offered 2012 
Warranty Miles/Months 100,000/10 

Lifetime Battery Warranty 

Manufacture Cut-Off Date June 1, 2013 
Last day order can be placed without missing cut- June1 , 2013 
off date 

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date Nc 
Delivery 10 Days 

4 2013 or Newer Ford Fusion Four Door Sedans, 5 
Gasoline/Electric Powered Hybrid 
Price Each $25,122.84 No Bid No Bid 
Price Total $125,614.20 
Year Offered 201 
Warranty Miles/Months 36,000/36 
Manufacture Cut-Off Date May 1,201 
Last day order can be placed without missing cut- May 1,201 
off date 

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date Nc 
Delivery 90 Dav, 

5 2013 or Newer Honda Insight Four Door Sedans , 3 
Gasoline/Electric Powered Hybrid 
Price Each No Bid No Bic $22,101 .00 

Price Total $66,303.00 

Year Offered 201 
Warranty Miles/Months 36 ,000/3E 

Manufacture Cut-Off Date June 30, 201 
Last day order can be placed without missing cut- June 30, 201 

off date 
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date 

30 D:~: Delivery 

Payment Terms Net 30 Net 3C Net 3C 

Total $325,990.20 $152,400.00 $66,303.00 

Totat Award $325,990.20 $152,400.00 $66,303.00 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened : February 20, 2013 

For: Administrative Sedans (Gasoline/Electric Powered Philpott Motors Caldwell Country Ford 
Hybrid) 

1400 Hwy 69 800 Hwy 21 E. 

6100002498 LD 
Item Description Qty Nederland, Caldwell , 

TX 77627 TX 77836 
409-853-3442 

NAS 
1 Four Door Sedans, Gasoline/Electric Powered 21 

Hybrid 

Price Each $23,269.00 $22,582.00' 
Price Total $488,649.00 $474,222.00 

Year, Make & Model Offered 2013 Toyota Prius 2013 Ford C-Max Hybrid 
Warranty Miles/Months 36,000/36 36,000/36 

Manufacture Cut-Off Date June1,2013 May 3, 2013 
Last day order can be placed without missing cut- June 1, 2013 April 22, 2013 
off date 
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date No No 
Delivery 90 Days 120 Days 

2 Deleted 

Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 

Total $488,649.00 $474,222.00 
Total Award $488649.00 

'Item 1: Caldwell Country Ford did not meet minimum mlles-per-gallon requirement. 
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