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AN ORDINANCE 2013 - 02 - 14 - 0 11 0 

AUTHORIZING THE FOLLOWING CONTRACTS ESTABLISHING 
UNIT PRICES FOR GOODS AND SERVICES FOR AN ESTIMATED 
ANNUAL COST OF $616,000.00: (A) CAPPS VAN & TRUCK RENTAL 
AND EAN HOLDINGS, LLC FOR RENTAL OF VARIOUS VEHICLES, 
(B) RIVER BIRCH WAY, LLC DBA BATTERIES PLUS, 
CONTINENTAL BATTERY, FULL SERVICE AUTO PARTS AND 
GENUINE PARTS COMPANY FOR AUTOMOTIVE, INDUSTRIAL, 
AND UTILITY BATTERIES, AND (C) NEW ENGLAND FIRE 
EQUIPMENT & APPARATUS CORP. AND SIDDONS-MARTIN 
EMERGENCY GROUP FOR FIRE TRUCK WATER PUMP, PUMP 
PARTS & PUMP ACCESSORIES. 

* * * * * 

WHEREAS, the City is able to obtain significant savings by purchasing various materials and 
services on an annual contract basis; and 

WHEREAS, these bids are from the following companies to furnish the City with (A) Capps 
Van & Truck Rental and EAN Holdings, LLC for rental of various vehicles, (B) River Birch 
Way, LLC d/b/a Batteries Plus, Continental Battery, Full Service Auto Parts and Genuine 
Parts Company for automotive, industrial, and utility batteries, and (C) New England Fire 
Equipment & Apparatus Corp. and Siddons-Martin Emergency Group for fire truck water 
pump, pump parts & pump accessories; and 

WHEREAS, this ordinance approves eight competitively bid contracts; and 

WHEREAS, all expenditures will be in accordance with the applicable fiscal year's budget 
approved by City Council; NOW THEREFORE: 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO: 

SECTION 1. The bids of the following companies to furnish the City with: (A) Capps Van & 
Truck Rental and EAN Holdings, LLC for rental of various vehicles, (B) River Birch Way, LLC 
dba Batteries Plus, Continental Battery, Full Service Auto Parts and Genuine Parts Company for 
automotive, industrial, and utility batteries, and (C) New England Fire Equipment & Apparatus 
Corp. and Siddons-Martin Emergency Group for fire truck water pump, pump parts & pump 
accessories on an annual contract basis as shown on the attached bid tabulation sheets, are hereby 
accepted, subject to and contingent upon the deposit of all required bonds, performance deposits, 
insurance certificates and endorsements. The bid tabulation sheets are attached hereto and 
incorporated herein for all purposes as Exhibit I. Copies of the bids are available for inspection 
in the offices of the Purchasing & General Services Division of the Finance Department. 
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SECTION 2. It has been found and declared that the low bids from Full Service Auto Parts 
[items 1(4), 1(13), 1(17), 1I(1), n(2)] , River Birchway LLC d/b/a Batteries Plus [items 1(14), 
1( 15)] , Gonzalez Auto Parts [items 1(14), 1(15), IIl(lO)], Continental Battery [item 1(16)], 
Genuine Parts Company [item 1(30)], and O'Reilly Automotive Stores, Inc. d/b/a O'Reilly Auto 
Parts [item 1ll(l0)] for automotive, industrial , and utility batteries failed to meet the City's 
specifications and/or requirements. 

SECTION 3. The amounts will be encumbered upon issuance of various purchase orders, and 
payment is authorized to the vendors identified herein. All current fiscal year expenditures will 
be in accordance with the Fiscal Year 2013 budget approved by City Council, and future fiscal 
year expenditures are contingent upon future City Council budget approvals. 

SECTION 4. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight affirmative votes; 
otherwise it is effective on the tenth day after passage hereof. 

PASSED and APPROVED this 14th day of February, 2013. 

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM: 

~~~Ui1~~ [cael . ernar~ i Attorney 
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V otingResults 

Name: 

Date: 

Time: 

Vote Type: 

Description: 

Result: 

Voter 

Julian Castro 

Diego Bernal 

Ivy R. Taylor 

Leticia Ozuna 

Rey Saldana 

David Medina Jr. 

Ray Lopez 

Cris Medina 

W. Reed Williams 

Elisa Chan 

Carlton Soules 

Request for 
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6,7,9,10, llA, 12, 13, 14, IS 
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10:01:08 AM 

Motion to Approve 

City of 
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San Antonio'" 

~ 
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.-·'t ---

An Ordinance authorizing the following contracts establishing unit prices for 
goods and services for an estimated annual cost of $616,000.00: (A) Capps 
Van & Truck Rental and EAN Holdings, LLC for rental of various vehicles, 
(B) River Birch Way, LLC dba Batteries Plus, Continental Battery, Full 
Service Auto Parts and Genuine Parts Company for automotive, industrial, 
and utility batteries and (C) New England Fire Equipment & Apparatus Corp. 
and Siddons-Martin Emergency Group for fire truck water pump, pump parts 
& pump accessories. [Ben Gorzell, Chief Financial Officer; Troy Elliott, 
Director, Finance 1 
Passed 

Group Not Yea Nay Abstain Motion Second 
Present 

Mayor x 

District I x 

District 2 x x 

District 3 x x 

District 4 x 

District 5 x 

District 6 x 

District 7 x 

District 8 x 

District 9 x 

District 10 x 

http:// cosawebl agendabuilder/votingresults.aspx?l temId= I 0028&Src= RFCA 2114/2013 



February 14,2013 

COMMODITY 

ANNUAL CONTRACT 
TABLE OF CONTENTS 

Contracts procured on the basis oflow bid: 
A. Rental of Various Vehicles 

6100001410 CE 

Upon award through September 30, 2014 with 
a one year option to extend 

B. Automotive, Industrial, and Utility Batteries 

6100001462 CE 

Upon award through June 30, 2015 

C. Fire Truck Water Pump, Pump Parts & Pump 
Accessories 

6100002080 LD 

Upon award through December 31, 2015 
with two, one year options to extend 

RFCA# 10028 

EXHIBIT I 

RFCA # 10028 

VENDOR 

Capps Van & Truck Rental 
Items: IC, 2C, 3C, 4C, SA, 9A 

EAN Holdings, LLC . 
Items: lA, IB, 4B, 6A, 7A, 8A 

Estimated Amount: $158,000.00 
annually 

River Birch Way, LLC dba Batteries 
Plus 
Item I, Number 2,6,7,11,13,17,21, 
24,27 

Continental Battery 
Item 1, Number 4, 5, 25, 26, 28, 29, 30 

Full Service Auto Parts 
Item 1, Number 3,8,9,10, 12, 14, 15, 
16, 18, 19,20,22,23 

Genuine Parts Company 
Item I, Number I, Items 2 & 3 

Estimated Amount: $408,000.00 
annually 

New England Fire Equipment & 
Apparatus Corp. 
Items: 1 and 3 

Siddons-Martin Emergency Group 
Item: 2 

Estimated Amount: $50,000.00 
annually 



City of San Antonio 

Contract Summary Sheet 
Date: 2/14/2013 
Agenda Item: 10028 

NamelTitle (Caption as shown on agenda): 
Rental of Various Vehicles 6100001410 CE 
Brief Description of Item(s) and Use: 
This contract will provide all City departments with a contractor to lease vehicles on a daily, weekly, and 
monthly rental period. These include Y, ton and % ton pick-up trucks, full size and small size sport utility 
vehicles, mid-size and compact size sedans and cargo vans. These vehicles will be used on an as needed 
basis by various City departments for conducting City business as determined by the specific needs of the 
departments to include traveling to and from City facilities, transporting personnel, and light hauling. These 
vehicles will also be utilized for undercover operations and crime prevention locally by the High Intensity Drug 
Trafficking Area Agency to enhance and coordinate drug control in conjunction with Local, State, and Federal 
law enforcement agencies. 

Total $: $158,000.00 annually 

Contract Upon award through September 30, 2014 with a one year option to extend 
Period: 

Method of Competitive (2 bids received) 
Procurement: 

23.26% increase due to rising cost of raw materials when comparing similar vehicles 
Price Trend: 

Contract Info: Formal - Annual ~ Support/Maintenance _ Lease -

Recommended 
Capps Van & Truck Rental, 85555 John Carpenter Fwy, Dallas, TX 75247 

Contractor(s): 
Item 1C, 2C, 3C, 4C, SA, 9A 

EAN Holdings, LLC, 1505 Harry Wurzbach, San Antonio, TX 78209 
Item 1A, 1 B, 4B, 6A, 7 A, 8A 

Previous Capps Van & Truck Rental , 8555 John Carpenter Fwy., Dallas, TX 75247 
Contractor(s): 

Comments: None 

AntiCipated 
Future N/A 
Requirements 
and Action: 

Procurement Should this contract not be approved, necessary field work may be compromised and thus 

Alternative: create the potential of delays in delivery of essential services to the citizens of San 
Antonio. This would also hamper the undercover operations of the Police department. 



Using Citywide 
Department(s): 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: September 12, 2012 
For: Rental of Various Vehicles Capps Van & Truck Rental EAN Holdings, LLC. 
6100001 41 0 CE 8555 John Carpenter Fwy 1505 Harry Wurzbach 

Dallas, San Antonio, 
Item Description TX 75247 TX 78209 

214-630-6555 210-882-1412 , 112 Ton Pick Up Trucks, 2 Wheel Drive 
A Regular Cab 
1 Rental· Flat Da~y Rate No Bk $60.{)( 
2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rale No ~k $360.()( 
3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate No Bk $1,21O.()( 

Makes & Models Offered Chevrolet Silverado Ford F150 

B Extended Cab 
1 Rental- Flat Daily Rale No BI $60.0 
2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate No Bi $360.0 
3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate No Bi $1 ,2 10.OC 

Makes & Modets Offered Che ... rolet Silverado Ford F15 

C Crew or Super Crew Cab 
1 Rental- Flat Da~y Rate $47.9 $60.00 
2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate $225,{)( $360.00 
3 Renlal- Flat Monthly Rate $795.{)( $1,210.00 

Makes & Models Offered Chev Silverado Ford F150 Dodae Ram Chevrolet Silverado, Ford F150 

II 112 Ton Pick Up Trucks, 4 Wheel Drive 
A Deleted 

B Deleted 

C Crew or Super Crew Cab 
1 Rental· Flat Da~y Rate $57,,* No Bid 
2 Rental· Flat Weekly Rate $250()( No Bid 
3 Rental· Flat Monthly Rate $875.0 No Bid 

Makes & Models Offered Chevy Silverado Ford FI50 Dodoe Ram 

"' 3/4 Ton Pick Up Trucks, 2 Wheel Dri ... e 
A Deleted 

B Deleted 

C Crew or Super Crew Cab 
1 Rental· Flat Da~y Rate $69,'* No Bid 
2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate $300.0 No Bid 
3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate $995.0 No Bid 

Makes & Models Offered Chevy Silverado Dodge Ram 

'V 314 Ton Pick. Up Trucks, 4 Wheel Drive 
A Deleted 

B Extended Cab 
1 Rental· Flat Daily Rate NoBk $79.OC 
2 Reotal- Flat Weekly Rate No Bk $439{)( 
3 Rental· Flat Monthly Rate NoBk . $1,430.()( 

Makes & Models Offered Chevrolet Silverado Ford F250 Dodoe Ram 

C Crew or Super Crew Cab 
1 Rental- Flat Daily Rate $69.9 $79.00 
2 Rental- Flat Weekly Rate $300.0 $439.00 
3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate $995 .0 $1,430.00 

Makes & Models Offered Chev Silverado DOOoe Ram Chevrolet Silverado, Ford F250. Dodge Ram 

V Fun Size Sport Utility Vehicles 
A Regular 2 Wheel OrNe 
1 Rental· Flat Daily Rate $129.95 $84.00 
2 Rental- Flat Weekty Rate $695.00 $504.00 
3 Rental- Flat Monthly Rate $1,150.00 $1,740.00 

Makes & Models Offered Che""T,,,,,, Chevrolet Tahoe, GMC Yukon, Ford 

B Deleted 

V, Small Size Sport Utility Vehicles 
A 2 Wheel Drive, Gasoline Powered 
1 Rental- Flat Da~y Rale No Bid $56.00 
2 Renlal - Flat Weekly Rate NoB" $336.00 
3 Renlal- Flat Monthly Rate No Bid $1.232.00 

Makes & Models Offered Jeeo Libertv. Ford Escaoe. Kia Soortaoe ..lee 

B Deleted 

Prepared by Purchasing 1/12/2013 Page 1 



Opened: 
For: 
6100001410 

Item 

C 

VII 
A 
1 
2 
3 

B 

VIII 
A 
1 
2 
3 

B 

IX 
A 
1 
2 
3 

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

September 12, 2012 
Renta! of Various Vehicles Capps Van & Truck Rental 

CE 8555 John Carpenter Fwy 
Dallas, 

Description TX 75247 
214-630-6555 

Deleted 

Mid Size Sedan 
Gasoline Powered 

Rental- Flat Daily Rate 
Rental- Flat Weekly Rate 
Rental- Flat Monthly Rate 
Makes & Models Offered 

Deleted 

Compact Size Sedan 
Gasoline Powered 
Rental- Flat Daily Rate 
Rental- Flat Weekly Rate 
Rental- Flat Monthly Rate 
Makes & Models Offered 

Deleted 

Cargo Van 
Gasoline Powered 
Rental- Flat Daily Rate 
Rental- Flat Weekly Rate 
Rental- Flat Monthly Rate 
Makes & Models Offered 
Deleted Item(s). Items 2A & 28, 3A & 38, 4A, 58, 68 & 6C, 78, 88 are no bid items 
Items 5A & 9A awarded by monthly rate based on hiStoric utilization 

Prepared by Purchasing 1112/2013 

No Bid 
No Bid 
NO Bid 

NoSi 
NoBi 
NoBi 

$59.95 
$279.0C 
1729.0C 

Che\l\l E)(nress Va 

EAN Holdings. LLC. 

1505 Harry Wuabach 
San Anlonio, 
TX 78209 
210-882-1412 

$35.50 
$213.00 
$759.00 

Ford Fusion Nissan Cube Dod e Aven er 

1355C 
!213.0C 
$759.00 

Chevrolet Cobalt Ford Focus Tovota Corolla 

$55.00 
$330.00 

$1,210.00 
Express 1500 Camo, Eoonoline 1500 Cafl:lo 
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City of San Antonio 
Contract Summary Sheet 

NamelTitle (Caption as shown on agenda): 
Automotive, Industrial, and Utility Batteries 6100001462 CE 
Brief Description of Item(s) and Use: 

Date: 2/14/2013 
Agenda Item: 10028 

This contract will provide the Building and Equipment Services, Fire and Aviation departments with automotive, 
industrial, and utility batteries to support various types of vehicles and equipment. Units utilizing the batteries 
include passenger vehicles, emergency, light, medium, and heavy duty trucks, utility vehicles, and other various 
equipment. This contract will be monitored by the BuildinQ and Equipment Services Department. 

Total $: $408,000.00 annually 

Contract Period: Upon award through June 30, 2015 

Method of Procurement: Competitive (7 bids received) 

Price Trend: 6.35% increase 

Contract Info: Formal - Annual -L Support/Maintenance _ Lease -
Batteries Plus, 6891 Bandera Rd., San Antonio, TX 78238 
Item 1, Number 2,6,7,11,13,17,21,24,27 

Continental Battery, 6735 Walzem, San Antonio, TX 78239 

Recommended 
Item 1, Number 4, 5, 25, 26, 28, 29, 30 

Contractor(s): 
Full Service Auto Parts, 4737 Broom Street, San Antonio, TX 78217 
Item 1, Number 3,8,9,10,12, 14, 15,16,18,19,20,22, 23 

Genuine Parts Company, 6374 Rittiman Road, San Antonio, TX 78218 
Item 1, Number 1, Items 2 & 3 

Previous Contractor(s): Continental Batteries, 6735 Walzem, San Antonio , TX 78239 

Comments: Items identified NAS in the bid tabulation did not meet minimum reserve capacity 
identified in bid specifications 

Anticipated Future 
Requirements and N/A 
Action: 

Should this contract not be approved, the City will be required to pay regular 
Procurement dealership and retail prices for automotive, industrial and utility storage batteries, 
Alternative: thus resulting in vehicle and equipment down time for units utilized by Building & 

Equipment Services, Fire, and Aviation departments. 

Using Building and Equipment Services, Fire, Aviation 
Department(s): 
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Total Core Charge Price 51.000'0; $2.500. ,~ 51 ,roO:;;; Sl.ooO:O( 51,~';X $1,roO:OC 

,. GfOIlp: 78 Dual Termina l '00 

;~ 7~~ 
Quol<!<l Reserve Clpacity , 

" '" " " Supplier Code. SlI340 ~, 780TPS Q1 XDT gA7~.~ 7eDT·0X) 

UrN I Price 
$C,:'; $7,9:; 574.0 5123.2 $8~:~ Total Price 57.40{;' 512,3~~ $2~~9:; 56,~:;X $7'~1:~ Gor.C ... r .... Pri<:e 51 0,0 . " $12. "'" 512 . 

Total Cor. CMr .... Price 1000,0 S2,5OO.';; 51,2(1'0:0. $I,~:OC 51,000:0.: $ 1 .~:i)( 5t.200 

" GfO'-'P: 00 '00 '" 
~~ 'OC &OO! "~ 

OIJol<!<l R ......... Capacity , 
.": Supplier Code _ 

S~; 
~ $878~ Unit Pnee $11 .0 $75.1 514~:~ S7t~ 510~:~ 

Total Prk:e ~'':~ $7, le~'~ 57'51~:; $8.8~:~ 51 4 .~:~ $7JW $10.12~ ,;; 
Core Cha"ile Pric<I 510. ." $ 1 ,~:()( $l.~:; St,~:;; $ 1,~:;; ." Total Core ChoI' <,/O Price $1 ,000. ,~ $1.~,;:;;: 

~ Group; I14R ~ 

I14RI~ 75;'S: "'1~ 
.. 

g4R~.~ Quol<!<l Re .. ",e Clp""'ly " 
, 

Supplier Code . SU~R;.~ sao~ 
~,~ 

UniIPrice 51O~:~ 
$110.10 $132,38 $11le. $*90 5101. 

To18IPrioe SC , ~~:~ 
$4,8:>30; $O.~.: $7.Q4~:~ Sl1 ,SIIO ~.75~:~ SO,:~:~ 

Core Charge Pric<I 
SI

5Z5
,00 $~~~;;; ." 510 .00 "" Total Core Chi ,~ ... ,~ "W .~ ... 5720. 
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City 01 San /II"tonl<> Ilk! hllulIo tlon 

Opened: J\.WIe 27,2012 
For: /IIut_-.. tndustrill, .nd Util~y eltterie. B.tle<MI. PtuI IRM r Cootinentlla.ttery Ful h,v\oe/ll"'" Gen""'" Poru "lin El<oclronica Gonnl .. ""to Pam O'Rejjjy "ulOmcti .. 

Bln:hwlyUCj ,~ Company SIo, •• I".; .. 
ba O~IIly/ilulO 
,.~ 

ft1OOOOI~2 " Il8'0l1 B-.Rd. 6135Walum .737a-"StretI G~14 Rillman R<>8d 1I:)'(21H3SHOM mil SWMlilaryDr. 233 S. Pn ...... 

"".-.. s.nlvl~ • San_~. Sanlvl_. $an lvllOniC>. SanAnlDrio. Spngliekl. .. ,. X 78238 ~n~ TX 78217 TX 78218 ~=, TX 78211 uoesao2 , .. OMett ;- , , , , • , , ,.-
'" 

l/T1UlY B.t.JTERIES 
... ""'ac"""' N_cl~. ElddoolllnerielPlu lJ<)janl~ ~~ 

... _, 
No. "': l~ """ E .. IP-. 

Oht-.:t: ~''''' BOII.tI •• , No Son ' 
UfO_Mll'o-

Gmu 
B,."" HIlmi of Bootlerles O~red Rayovlc I W8fI<., Troj.on IUniV<'tr.la NOB;': ~, NO, I .. : T,Q)I """ Su~SII 

Bille BOlle'I<o.: No, 5·,, : 
u" lve, .. 1 P ...... 

n"".., 
, GroIJp: Tl05 '00 

~~~ ~'" '.::: GC:~~ 
Ouo\ood R._ C~ « .. .. 
SUpplier CocII. " '.,~ GCIlOO 

~,- 11c.i-~ ,~~ $I~:~ $102 .... 5101.1i1! 
T_Price $",325.01 $'O,~.~ ~'" 514,3~~~ 5211.600.01 $15.~:: 111I.l~; 
eoreClla,II'"_ 118_01 ~~~ 

~'" '~: ''::: $1~:0( 
TuCot.Cllaf91P"" $2,700.01 $0,150_01 $2,100_ $3,000_ 12.250. 3 1.100. 

, Gr-=Tl2$ ~ 

S~I GC ~:. ::: ~'" '.:; T~~ GG;~ EV~~ ~~R"""'Cai>acIty 
-~, 

~""" $1 011.01 $1 28.11 $QS,O S2O~~ St02,.4 $1~.~ 
TOIIIPric:. 

S3.!~:; S3.8~.; Nollie $2,g~:; ~''':.~ $1,07;.; SU~:~ COI'.cna'~Prh:I ~:. $!~'~ ~:c. $!~:o; $~:~ Tot_ Corl Chlf91 Price 15.0:0; $1.3W. toIOBi< 

, Gr.,...: T14S ~ 

~:4 '.:; T~: 
OU_Fl __ ~ 

" ~, W ~,. -_. WGC 14~ ;'~~:4 .. - $13;:; II!:; ~~ '~~ "':~ .... ,-- $7,!:~ ".::;:~ S5,~;:~ SI3.ro;'~ $0 .11:; eorlClla,II'"Pob 
$1!:itJ '" '" s!'!:c.c T_ Cot. Chaf91 PrIce 11,080. S2.roi.:c.c ~'" S1.0e0:';': 31.200.0; ~ .. 

• ~: n75 ro 

$.IG~~ ~4 ~'" T:: GC8V.~ ~~ Rasetve CIpacity " GC~; SUppIi« CQdo - ,~ .. 
~,- $11:~ $l1f~ NoBle 

Sl1~'~ S I~~~ ltO~:; 111~! lOlai Pnc. S2. 1 ~:~ S2.~~:~ $2'2~;:; ,,~~ 12.041 S2.:~:0( Corl Cha,\Ii' PrIcI 
1~:01 

... 
$:: :0< 

S1 :.~ 
Total COl" cn.'\Ii' Prh:I $\100,0( ~, ,~. ,m. $200,0( 

• GrOUl\, I..IBI2,2O " 
E~1 1J81'2-z;! 

OuoIe<lFl,......c...-v 12""'p~ 

$~ 
~, " 

, 
SUppilot CocII· 9.M12i~.; ES12-1 E~~~~ UN1Pr1ot $~::: 

~., ,-- mio. 
~:; ~" SII~~:~ SI .~:~ ~! earIClla,II'_ .. G.., 

~'" 
~~~ -::= Toa.! Cot.Cllaf91 PrIce ~,,... ,~. 

~""" NoC P,o SIOO. 

, ~: 1J8121eo ro 
~'" ES;~ UB112~ 0u0Ied R,...... C..atY le~~ 'M , , 

SUpplier CocII. Sl.MI2.~~~ n ES1&-1 ES12-1 

~,- $.11 .01 $33_3 S5!: $SI .G $75.5 "'!'GI 
Tot.1 Pnc. $833.~ -.• NeBIe SI ,O~~ NO:~!; $1.5~:~ ~:; earl C".,~ PrIcI :~~:'!. $1~:~ ~:~~~ Tot. 1 Cort Cha ,~ ,~ ~, N01P,o"",,, "''' ,,~ 



City 01 hn "'nto"'" Bid T"ul~t~n 

",.... June 27, 2012 
Fot: Automo~"", InOU.trl.Iol...-.I Ulilily Battetioo. B,IIfIN . PI<r.I(RI_ C""""~Bauery Fu~ Se,,;oo "'ulO Genuine Parts .oJte . EleClrOnk:. Gonulez AUIO Pa'b O'RelIy "utomoll"" 

Bift""'-Y LlC) ,~. "'"-, Slor •• lnc., 
dba O'RMly Auto 
~ 

OIOOOOI~Z " N81a-.Rd (l135W,1Hn'I .131B_SV .. 314 RilliMan Rotd n302IH35NorW1 33N SW ~,y Dr. 233S.P.--. 

'"'- s...""IOnio. s..."""' .... s...Ankmi<>. s.......-.-. .., ...... -". &,. TX 18238 TX 7823'11 TX 18217 TX 18218 TX 18233 rx 18211 ~~, 

,,- DIIlc, l ". , 
" 

, • , 
" 

,., , Group: UBI280 " Quoted R • ..",.., C.pacily 8A~~ M" '" .. ~ , 
Su;>pIie<~' SLMl~~ n ES7-1 UBI28 

~~iE ES:i~! lkIItPliol ::E 52!:: " .. 52::;1 s~,! Totoll'rlol 1425. "" 545::: eor .. CI>foVe I'IIc. ~:: .... No~~ ::::: 51::~ s~~:~ T_ec..CIIt'ge Price ,,-
, G,oup: UBI2550 " W!<MOC~~ UB1~ O",,1o!d R • • rv- Capacity • M '" - • " .. 

SUp~ Cod.' " ,,= ES22NF 

~,- SI~! ~;'~ 
S8(I,05( SI~:; $18g ,g $107.81 

Toto l Prlee S I .0~:~ NoB' $l.eo~:~ $2,2~,4 S2,013,1 .". 
CortICNlrge Price NoC~~ 5~:o; ",. s~!!:o; ::~= I:';: " .. T <>tal Cor, Clltrge PrIaI No CNo';' 

, Group: UBI23S0 n 
" .. ESI~ UB1~ ''"~~ AG~I 

~~C~ ~~- ~ -""" Wt<DC1~ n 
t.nl Prieto "'. se;:~ Sl ,~a::~ 

l 1001g .~; ":; TOIaIPrIaI S1.31~; 11.410. HoB' S2,~.;; 
SU:i.~ $1,g1~:o; 

eoreCl1'r{Ie Pno. ::g=~ S~:~ ::~": 
Not Provide " Totol Con Ch.rge Prleoo '" Not Provi<Ie sno. s~:~ 

" GrouP' UB I~ • '" '" 
.--~ QuOled Re_ Ct.,tdty 

!~ 
",. " UB.I~ •• • -""'. $U.Al!~~ 

,~, E54.5-1 ,,,. 
Unill'rlol S1~:~ s~§E S~:~~~ S2;:~ 

513.4 ,-- ~SS S~~~ '" ,,~ $I~;~ eor.~Prlee ,,~ 

"'~ NalPmvido '::00 ~:oc T_ec..Cha'~_ " SlzO:O; ",. '" NoIP,.,.;de 

" Group: UBl2Z0t • 
'''':'?~ UBI2~ Quoted Raerve Capacily ~" '" " 

, ~ .. 
SUppller Codo • HEP~P!~~ ~01 Pro'<ided UB ,220 ES2-,2 
UnltPrlc<l '" ~:~ SJ~:: $~~!:~ S3~.~ " .. TotalF'ricoo :'= ~, 

S28~~ eor8~Prlee Nol 51~:~ :!':;:: =~= 
S2~:: 

NoOic:l Total ec., C""III PfIc:e SI:t1.1. '" .~. 

" DElIVERY & SERVICE 
Mileage Rate lot s.n. o.y Servk:a Poor SI .()( 55 .25 ~. "'""" " .00 " .00 " .00 -
Qio.~F .. P .. a.l*y $2,00 Per 0 Volt S3()( $2.00 P. r e Vo 5l,()( Sl.()( 55,00 ».00 ",00 

Per '2 Vol S3,00 P.r 12 Vo 

SUbt<>tol S~M70.g( SlS.12Q.II-4 137,703.1 $ I(IO,W'O.e "'.00 "'00 "'.00 

SUb~ <A Core Clltrve 514.320,()( S\3,032.()( U.(I(I2.6< S33,U4.()( $45.220,00 Sse,IIIO ,OC S5l..rJ4 ,00 

SUb_ 01 Ch_ lor Oispoul <A Jo...t. ... ~. SI .ZUO.()( S2,085.()( SII,03O.OI m~m S'3.710.00 SI3, 7,e.00 
Baneri .. 

Estimate , .. , _. 
101185 M' • '" 

• Fot e""kI.1Ion purpo_, con ""''III 1M and diljlOU <A jun k b.lttern "'" co_,ed. 
,. ltemsl<l*<1tin.<! N"S in t:h<O bid tobIJ lation did not me.1 minimum 'e ........ ctptdly klentitied in bid specifict!lor\a 



City of San Antonio 

Contract Summary Sheet Date: 2/14/2013 
Agenda Item: 10028 

NamefTitle( Caption as shown on agenda): 
Fire Truck Water Pump, Pump Parts & Pump Accessories 6100002080 LD 
Brief Description of Item(s) and Use: 
This contract will provide the San Antonio Fire Department, Logistics/Services Division with replacement 
pumps, pump parts and pump accessories for fire pumper trucks and other fire trucks in the City's fleet. This 
contract will be maintained, monitored, and utilized by the San Antonio Fire Department Logistics/Services 
Division. 

Total $: $50,000.00 annually 

Contract Period: Upon award through December 31, 2015, with two, one year options to extend 

Method of Procurement: Competitive (2 bids received) 

Price Trend: 8% increase 

Contract Info: Formal - Annual l Support/Maintenance _ Lease -

Recommended New England Fire Equipment & Apparatus Corp., 10 Stillman Road, North 

Contractor(s): Haven, CT 06473 
Items: 1 and 3 

Siddons-Martin Emergency Group, 14233 Interdrive W., Houston, TX 77032 
Item: 2 

Previous Contractor(s): New England Fire Equipment & Apparatus Corp., 10 Stillman Road, North 
Haven, CT 06473 

Spartan Chassis, Inc., 30418 East Meadows, Mesquite, TX 75150 

Comments: 

Anticipated Future N/A 
Requirements and 
Action: 

Procurement Should this contract not be approved, the San Antonio Fire Department, 

Alternative: 
Logistics/Services Division will be required to purchase replacement pumps, 
pump parts and pump accessories on an as needed basis wherein increased 
cost due to non-contract buying could be realized and this may increase the 
down time of vehicles, thus delaying timely completion of maintenance and 
repair. 



,--I ~eS_~nag_rtm_ent(~s):_~1 Fi_re ___________ 1 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: October 31, 2012 
For: Fire Truck Water Pump, Pump Parts & Pump Accessories New England Fire Siddons-Martin 

Equipment & Apparatus Emergency Group 
Corp. 

6100002080 lD '0 Stillman Road 14233 Inter Drive w. 

~st. North Haven, Houston, 
"em Description Annual CT06473 TX 77032 

Usage IZ03-"o-,"" 1",_ 
1 Waterous Pump Parts 

Percent of Discount Offered: 18% 10% 
Product identification (Mfr.): Waterous Waterous 
Type Price Schedule (dealer, jobber, etc .. ): Deale Not Provided 
Price Schedule Number: F-10 76-0 Not Provided 
Dale of Price Schedule: February 1, 201 Not Provided 
Price Schedule Column on which discount is based (Le., 
distributor, net, wholesale): Lis Not Provided 

2 Darley Pump Parts 
Percent of Discount Offered: No Bid 10% 
Product identification (Mfr.): Darle 
Type Price Schedule (dealer, jobber, etc . . ): Not Provided 
Price Schedule Number: Not Provided 
Date of Price Schedule: Not Provided 
Price Schedule Column on which discount is based (Le. , 
distribulor, net, wholesale): Not Provided 

3 Hale Parts 
Percent of Discount Offered: 10% 10% 
Producl identification (Mfr.): Hale Hale 
Type Price Schedule (dealer, jobber, etc .. ): Deale Not Provided 
Price Schedule Number: Rev. 1 Not Provided 
Date of Price Schedule: 01/01/201 Not Provided 
Price Schedule Column on which d iscount is based (I.e., 
distributor, net, wholesale): List Not Provided 

4 Delivery 1-7 Days 10 Days 

Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 

Prepared by Purchasing 1112/2013 Page 1 


