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ANORDINANCE  2012-10-11-0799

AUTHORIZING A CONTRACT WITH CLEANING IDEAS CORPORATION
D/B/A SANIVAC/DAVIS MANUFACTURING FOR FOOD SERVICE SUPPLIES
FOR THE SENIOR SERVICES DIVISION OF THE DEPARTMENT OF HUMAN
SERVICES FOR AN ESTIMATED ANNUAL COST OF $94,000.00.

% * * * *

WHEREAS, bids were submitted to provide the City of San Antonio Department of Human Services with
food service supplies; and

WHEREAS, the bid(s) submitted by All American Poly and Central Poly Corp failed to meet the City’s
specifications and/or requirements; and

WHEREAS, Cleaning Ideas Corporation d/b/a Sanivac/Davis Manufacturing was the low responsive
bidder for a cost of $94,000.00; NOW THEREFORE:

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO:

SECTION 1. The bid from Cleaning Ideas Corporation d/b/a Sanivac/Davis Manufacturing for food
service supplies for an estimated annual cost of $94,000.00 is hereby accepted, subject to and contingent
upon the deposit of all required bonds, performance deposits, insurance certificates and endorsements. The
bid tabulation sheet is attached hereto and incorporated herein for all purposes as Exhibit I. Copies of the
bids are available for inspection in the offices of the Purchasing & General Services Division of the
Finance Department.

- SECTION 2. It has been found and declared that the low bids of All American Poly and Central Poly
Corp failed to meet the City’s specifications and/or requirements.

SECTION 3. The amount will be encumbered upon issuance of a purchase order, and payment is
authorized to Cleaning Ideas Corporation d/b/a Sanivac/Davis Manufacturing. All current fiscal year
expenditures will be in accordance with the Fiscal Year 2013 budget approved by City Council, and future
fiscal year expenditures are contingent upon future City Council budget approvals.

SECTION 4. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight affirmative votes; otherwise
it is effective on the tenth day after passage hereof.

PASSED and APPROVED this 11" day of October, 2012.

Julian Castro

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM:

Guuﬂu i i

1aM Va(c/k City C}érk WIchael D. Bernard, dity Attorney
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Agenda Voting Results - 5

Name:|5, 6,7, 10A, 10B, 10C, 11, 12, 13, 15A, 15B, 15C, 15D, 15E, 16, 18, 19A,
19B, 19C, 19D
Date:|10/11/2012
Time:|10:56:06 AM
Vote Type:|Motion to Approve
Description: | An Ordinance authorizing a contract with Cleaning Ideas Corporation d/b/a
Sanivac/Davis Manufacturing for food service supplies for the Senior Services
Division of the Department of Human Services for an estimated annual cost of
$94,000.00. [Ben Gorzell, Chief Financial Officer; Troy Elliott, Director,
Finance]
Result: [Passed
= ———————— — — — —————— — ———— — — — ———— |
Not . .
Voter Group Yea | Nay | Abstain Motion Second
Present
Julidn Castro Mayor X
Diego Bernal District 1 X X
Ivy R. Taylor District 2 X
Leticia Ozuna District 3 X X
Rey Saldafia District 4 X
David Medina Jr. | District 5 X
Ray Lopez District 6 X
Cris Medina District 7 X
W. Reed Williams| District 8 X
Elisa Chan District 9 X
Carlton Soules | District 10 X
http://cosaweb/agendabuilder/votingresults.aspx?ItemId=9664&Src=RFCA
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Exhibit I

Opened: July 18, 2012
For: Food Service Supplies for the Senior Services Division
Cleaning Idea Corporation dba All American Poly Central Poly Corp.
Sanivac/Davis Mfg.
6100001518 DD 1023 Morales St. 40 Tumer Place 2400 Bedie Place
Estimated |San Antonio, Piscataway, Linden,
Item Description Quantities |TX 78207 NJ 08854 NJ 07036
210-227-9161
NAS NAS
1 Nylon haimets, large, dark brown, light weight
Price Per Case 50 $14.80) No Bid $61.68
Price Total $740.00) $3,084.00
Brand Name and Number Cellucap/HN400LBS] Ammex #HN24B
Number of Hairnets per Box 144 100
Number of Boxes per Case N/A] 10
2 General Purpose Disposable Polythene Gloves, Medium
Price Per Case 25 $46.40) No Bid $34.84
Price Total $1,160.00] $871.00
Brand Name and Number Food Service RR-G300m) 1BS #HYBF002
Number of Gloves per Dispenser Box 1,000 100
Number of Dispenser Boxes per Case 10 10
3 General Purpose Disposable Polyethylene Gloves, Large
Price Per Cases 50 $46.40) No Bid $34.84
Price Total $2,320.00f $1,742.00
Brand Name and Number Food Services RR-G3002| IBS #HYBF003]
Number of Gloves per Dispenser Box 1,000 100
Number of Dispenser Boxes per Case 10 10
4 T-Shirt/'Grocery Bags, White 8"x5"°x18" , & mil gauge
Price Per Case 300 $24.30 No Bid No Bid
Price Totat $7,290.00)
Brand Name and Number ELKAYCT1318]
Number of Bags Per Case 1,000]
5 Can Liners, 23"x10"x39", Super Tuff, White or Clear
Can liners, 33 gallon
Price Per Case 100 $18.80 $17.93 $15.40
Price Total $1,880.00) $1,793.00 $1,540.00
Brand Name and Number White Super Tuff RR-3339xHW, 231039 AAP Central Poly #CP231039N
Number of Bags per Box 150 150 150
Number of Boxes per Case 1 1 1
6 Can liners, 22"x16"x58", Super Tuff, White and Clear
Can Liners, 58 Gallon
Price Per Case 200 $21.44 $24.59 $14.80
Price Total $4,288.00) $4,918.00 $2,960.00
Brand Name and Number White Super Tuff RR-3858xHW| 221658 AAP Central Poly #CP221658N
Number of Bags per Box 109] 100 100
Number of Boxes per Case 1 1 1
7 Cups, 8 oz, Styrofoam, White
Price Per Case 75 $20.01 No Bid No Bid
Price Total $1,500.75
Brand Name and Number Dart 8J8
Number of Cups Per Case 1,000,
8 Cups, 8 oz, Squat Foam, White
Price Per Case 125 $36.80) No Bid No Bid
Price Total $4,600.00}
Brand Name and Number 85J20)
Number of Cups Per Case 1,000
9 Plates, 8", Single Compartment, White, Styrofoam
Price Per Case 20 $17.7§) No Bid No Bid
Price Total $355.20
Brand Name and Number Genpak 80800
Number of Plates per Sleeve 125)
Number of Sleeves per Case [
10 Forks, Full Size, Plastic, Heavyweight, Clear
Price Per Case 20 $34.21 No Bid No Bid
Price Total $684.20)
Brand Name and Number Darnel Bistro DU-8120000)
Number of Forks per Case 1,000]
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 18, 2012
For: Food Service Supplies for the Senjor Services Division
Cleaning Idea Corporation dba All American Poly Central Poly Corp.
Sanivac/Davis Mfg.
6100001518 DD 1023 Morales St. 40 Tumer Place 2400 Bedle Place
Estimated |San Antonio, Piscataway, Linden,
Item Description Quantities |TX 78207 NJ 08854 NJ 07036
210-227-9161
11 Spoons, Full Size, Plastic, Heavyweight, Clear
Price Per Case 20 $34.21 No Bid No Bid
Price Total $684.20]
8rand Name and Number Damel Bistr Du 94210000)
Number of Spoons per Case 1,000
12 Knives, Fuli Size, Plastic, Heavyweight, Clear
Price Per Case 20 $34.21 No Bid No Bid
Price Total $684.20)
Brand Name and Number Darnel Bistr DU 82210000,
Number Knives per Case 1,000
13 Wrapped Cutiery Kit with Fork, Spoon, Knife and Napkin
Full Size
Price Per Case 3,250 $18.04 No Bid No Bid
Price Total $58,630.00]
Brand Name and Number AB-MKS]
Number of Kits per Case 250
14 Disposable Napkins, White, 13"x12" open, 1-ply, Recycled
Price Per Case 125 $45.53) No Bid No Bid
Price Total $5,691.25)
Brand Name and Number Cascade 197-1837
Napkin Size 13"x12"
Number of Packages per Case 18/334=6012 c{
15 Deleted
16 Paper Towels, Kitchen, 2-ply, White 9"x11"
Price Per Case 50 $22.36) No Bid $31.66
Price Total $1,118.00) $1,583.00
Brand Name and Number Roses Bella Donna Atlas #A585
Towel and Ply Size 9x11 2 Ply - 85 Sheet Rol 2 Ply, 11x18, 86 Shts
Number of Rolls per Case 304 30
17 Single Fold Paper Towels, 1-ply, 8 1/2"x10 1/4", Naturat White
Price Per Case 100 $19.74 No Bid $19.30
Price Total $1,974.00) $1,930.00
Brand Name and Number Baywest/Primesource 75004301 Putney #P&00
Towel and Ply Size 10.5x9.3 1 Ply, 9 1/4x10 1/4, 12-334|
Number of Packs per Case 18} 12
Number of Towels per Pack 250 334
Payment Terms Net 30|
Estimated Annual Award $93,599.80
Deleted item 15 will be bid at a fater date.
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