LOC/jlm
09/11/14
Item No. 14

ANORDINANCE 2014-09-11-068%4

AUTHORIZING THE FOLLOWING CONTRACTS ESTABLISHING
UNIT PRICES FOR GOODS AND SERVICES FOR AN ESTIMATED
ANNUAL COST OF $1,542,000.00: (A) CASCO INDUSTRIES FOR
FIREFIGHTING FOAM, (B) GRANDE TRUCK CENTER FOR
TELMA BRAKE RETARDERS PARTS AND SERVICE, (C)
VULCAN CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS, LP FOR ROCK
PRODUCTS, (D) DEWINNE EQUIPMENT CO., JAMES
LAWNMOWER AND JOHN H. SOROLA, INC. FOR
LAWNMOWERS, EDGERS, CHAIN SAWS, PARTS AND SERVICE,
(E) JOHNSON CONTROLS, INC. TO EXTEND THE
MAINTENANCE AGREEMENT FOR THE METASYS SYSTEM AT
ALAMODOME FOR ONE YEAR, (F) AUSTIN VACUUM S.A., INC.
AND GULF COAST PAPER CO. FOR CITY WIDE JANITORIAL
SUPPLIES, (G) GULF COAST PAPER CO. FOR TRASH LINERS,
(H) HLP, INC. FOR SHELTER SOFTWARE CASE MANAGEMENT
MAINTENANCE AND SUPPORT, AND @ TASER
INTERNATIONAL, INC. FOR SAPD TASER SUPPLIES.

WHEREAS, the City is able to obtain significant savings by purchasing various materials and
services on an annual contract basis; and

WHEREAS, these bids are from the following companies to furnish the City with: (A) Casco
Industries for firefighting foam, (B) Grande Truck Center for Telma Brake Retarders parts and
service, (C) Vulcan Construction Materials, LP for rock products, (D) DeWinne Equipment Co.
(Items 1- 2, 4 and 10), James Lawnmower (Items 5, 11-12) and John H. Sorola, Inc. (Item 9) for
lawnmowers, edgers, chain saws, parts and service, (E) Johnson Controls, Inc. to extend the
maintenance agreement for the METASYS system at Alamodome for one year, (F) Austin
Vacuum S.A., Inc. and Gulf Coast Paper Co. for city wide janitorial supplies, (G) Gulf Coast
Paper Co. for trash liners, (H) HLP, Inc. for shelter software case management maintenance and
support, and (I) TASER International, Inc. for SAPD Taser Supplies; and

WHEREAS, this ordinance approves three low bid contracts, three contracts awarded to other
than the low bidder(s) because the low bidder(s) did not meet the City’s specifications or
requirements, one contract amendment to extend the term for one year, three contracts procured
utilizing cooperative purchasing, one contract which provide for a procurement necessary to
protect the public health or safety, and one sole source contract; and

WHEREAS, all expenditures will be in accordance with the applicable fiscal year’s budget
approved by City Council; NOW THEREFORE:

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO:



LOC/jlm
09/11/14
Item No. 14

SECTION 1. The bids of the following companies to furnish the City with: (A) Casco
Industries for firefighting foam, (B) Grande Truck Center for Telma Brake Retarders parts and
service, (C) Vulcan Construction Materials, LP for rock products, (D) DeWinne Equipment Co.
(Items 1- 2, 4 and 10), James Lawnmower (Items 5, 11-12) and John H. Sorola, Inc. (Item 9) for
lawnmowers, edgers, chain saws, parts and service, (E) Johnson Controls, Inc. to extend the
maintenance agreement for the METASYS system at Alamodome for one year, (F) Austin
Vacuum S.A., Inc. and Gulf Coast Paper Co. for city wide janitorial supplies, (G) Gulf Coast
Paper Co. for trash liners, (H) HLP, Inc. for shelter software case management maintenance and
support, and (I) TASER International, Inc. for SAPD Taser Supplies on an annual contract basis
as shown on the attached bid tabulation sheets, are hereby accepted, subject to and contingent
upon the deposit of all required bonds, performance deposits, insurance certificates and
endorsements. The bid tabulation sheets are attached hereto and incorporated herein for all
purposes as Exhibit I. Copies of the bids are available for inspection in the offices of the
Purchasing Division of the Finance Department.

SECTION 2. The amounts will be encumbered upon issuance of various purchase orders, and
payment is authorized to the vendors identified herein. All current fiscal year expenditures will
be in accordance with the Fiscal Year 2014 budget approved by City Council, and future fiscal
year expenditures are contingent upon future City council budget approvals.

SECTION 3. It has been found and declared that the low bid of Mustang Equipment for
lawnmowers, edgers, chain saws, parts and service failed to meet the City’s specifications and/or
requirements.

SECTION 4. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight affirmative votes;
otherwise it is effective on the tenth day after passage hereof.

PASSED and APPROVED this 11" day of September, 2014.

«.

M AY¥Y O
Ivy R. Taylor

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM:

7&%@%% MG &xﬂﬂﬁlﬁn

>6\/ Keficia M. Vaggk, City Clerk obert F. Greenblum, C1t3(/Attorney




Voting Results Interface Page 12 of 18

Agenda Item: 14 (in consent vote: 5,6, 7, 8,9, 10, 11, 12, 13, 14, 15,16, 17, 18,19)

Date: 09/11/2014

Time: 09:31:56 AM

Vote Type: Motion to Approve

Description: An Ordinance authorizing the following contracts establishing unit prices for goods and services

for an estimated annual cost of $1,542,000.00: (A) Casco Industries for firefighting foam, (B)
Grande Truck Center for Telma Brake Retarders parts and service, (C) Vulcan Construction
Materials, LP for rock products, (D) DeWinne Equipment Co., James Lawnmower and John H.
Sorola, Inc. for lawnmowers, edgers, chain saws, parts and service, (E) Johnson Controls, Inc. to
extend the maintenance agreement for the METASYS system at Alamodome for one year, (F)
Austin Vacuum S.A., Inc. and Gulf Coast Paper Co. for city wide janitorial supplies, (G) Gulf
Coast Paper Co. for trash liners, (H) HLP, Inc. for shelter software case management
maintenance and support, and (I) TASER International, Inc. for SAPD Taser Supplies. [Ben
Gorzell, Chief Financial Officer; Troy Elliott, Director, Finance]

Result: Passed
Voter Group Not Yea Nay Abstain Motion Second
Present .
Ivy R. Taylor Mayor X
Diego Bernal District 1 X
Keith Toney District 2 X
Rebecca Viagran District 3 X
Rey Saldafia District 4 X
Shirley Gonzales District 5 X
Ray Lopez District 6 X
Mari Aguirre-Rodriguez District 7 X
Ron Nirenberg District 8 X X

Joe Krier District 9 X

Michael Gallagher District 10 X X

http://cosaweb/Votelnterface/Default.aspx ‘ 9/11/2014



City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation

Opened:

For:

July 18, 2014
Annual Conctract for Firefighting Foam

6100004621

SC

Exhibit 1

Item

Description

Estimated
Annual
Quantity

Casco Industries

607 W. 62 Street,
P.O. Box 8007
Shreveport,

LA 71148-8007
817-797-8148

1

2A

2B

2C

CLASS A FOAM, 5 GALLON PAILS, CHEMGUARD CAP
OR APPROVED EQUAL

Manufacturer

P/N

# Gallons Per Pail

Net Unit Price (per 5 gallon pail)
Extended Price (quantity x unit price)

CLASS B FOAM, 5 GALLON PAILS, CHEMGUARD
#C301P OR APPROVED EQUAL

Manufacturer

P/N

# Gallons Per Pail

Net Unit Price (per 5 gallon pail)
Extended Price (quantity x unit price)

CLASS B FOAM, 55 GALLON DRUMS, CHEMGUARD
#C301D OR APPROVED EQUAL

Manufacturer

P/N

# Gallons Per Pail

Net Unit Price (per 5 gallon pail)
Extended Price (quantity x unit price)

CLASS B FOAM, 275 GALLON TOTES, CHEMGUARD
#C135 OR APPROVED EQUAL

Manufacturer

P/N

# Gallons Per Pail

Net Unit Price (per 5 gallon pail)
Extended Price (quantity x unit price)

Payment Terms
Delivery

Estimated Annual Total

200

Chemguard{
CAP]

Estimated Annual Award

$36,241.34

Page 1 of 1



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 11, 2014 Local
For: Annual Contract for Telma Brake Retarders Parts and Grande Truck Center
Service
6100004714 HH[4562 IH-10 East
San Antonio,
ltem Description TX 78219
210-666-7144
1 Telma Brake Retarders Parts
1 Parts Discount
a Percent of Discount Offered 0%
b Products Identification (Manufacturer) Telma
c Type of Price Schedule List
d Price Schedule Number n/a
e Date of Price Schedule 1/1/2014
f Price Schedule Column on Which Discount is Based List
q Warranty 2 Years
2 Labor and Service
a Labor and Service Rate per Hour $98.00
b Expedited/Labor and Service Rate n/a
c Re-stocking orders are placed every - days on -- {(day of Daily
week)

d Vendor Business Days Monday-Saturday
e Vendor Hours of Operation M-F 8AM-midnight,Sat 8AM-5PM
f Parts and Service Facilities Name Grande Truck Center
¢] Parts and Service Facilities Address 4562 IH-10 East SA,TX 78219

Prompt Payment Discount

2% 10 days

Prepared by Purchasing 8/5/2014

Page 1



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 25, 2014
For: Annual Contract for Purchase of Rock Products Local
Vulcan Construction Materials, LP
6100004806 AJ 800 Isom Road, Ste. 300
San Antonio,
TX, 78216
Item Description Quantity |210-524-3546
1 1 1/8" Utility Rock 450
Price Per Ton Picked up by City Truck $10.00
Total Price $4,500.00
1 1/8" Utility Rock 50
Price Per Ton Delivered $16.00
Total Price $800.00
2 Deleted
3 Wash Rock 3/4" 720
Price Per Ton Picked up by City Truck $11.00
Total Price $7,920.00
Wash Rock 3/4" 80
Price Per Ton Delivered $17.00
Total Price $1,360.00
4 Trap Rock FS 200
Price Per Ton Picked up by City Truck $20.00
Total Price $4,000.00
Trap Rock FS 1,800
Price Per Ton Delivered $35.00
Total Price $63,000.00
Delivery 5 days
Payment Terms Net 30
Estimated Annual Total $81,580.00
Estimated Annual Award $81,580.00

**Item 2 deleted will bid at later date




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 13, 2014
For: Annual Contract for Lawnmowers, Edgers, Chain Saws,
) Parts and Service Local Local Local
DeWinne Equipment Co. |[James Lawnmower John H. Sorola, Inc. Mustang Equipment
6100004525 LM 11002 Bandera Rd. 5034 Rigsby 523 W. Cypress 3540 N. Loop 1604E
San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
ftem Description Quantity | TX 78250 TX 78222 TX 78212 TX 78247
210-684-5206 210-648-3636 210-224-8597 210-238-6033
NAS
1 BRIGGS & STRATTON
A) Parts
1 Percent of discount offered 10%] 21% 20%| 12%)|
2 Product Identification (Manufacturer) BS| Briggs & Stratton| Briggs & Stratton Briggs & Stratton|
3 Type of price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) MFG Dealer] Dealer] Dealer|
4 Price Schedule Number 1013} C-Systems; C-Systems Price File NA|
5 Date of Price Schedule 10/1/2013] 31512014 10/1/2013] NA|
Price schedule column on which discount is based MFG] List List] NET]|
6 (i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)
Warranty 60 daysj 30 days| 60 days| 60 days no warranty on electrical
7 parts|
B) Labor and Service
1 Labor Rate for Service {(annual estimate 12 hours) 12 $30.00] $48.00 $65.00 $75.00)
Price Total $360.00§ $576.00 $780.00] $900.00|
2 DELETED 1
Subtotal $360.00] $576.00 $780.00 $900.00
C) Pickup and Service Hours
Parts will be avaitable for pick up within calendar 5 days| 3 -5 days| 5 days| 5 days;
1 days after receipt of order.
Business hours are from AM. to P.M. 8am - 5 pm, 5 days per| 8am -5 pm, 5 days per| 8am - § pm, § days per| 8am - 5 pm, 5 days per week|
2 days per week. week| week| week
D) Specified tems for Bid Evaluation Only
2 ECHO
A) Parts
1 Percent of discount offered 10%| 21% 15% 15%
2 Product Identification (Manufacturer) Eco Echo Echo| Echo|
3 Type of price schedule {dealer, jobber, etc.) MFG; Dealer| Dealer| Dealer|
4 Price Schedule Number C-Systems; C-Systems Price File| NA|
5 Date of Price Schedule 31512014 4/2212014 NA|
Price schedule column on which discount is based MFG List] List Price; Net|
6 (i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)
Warranty 60 days| 30 days| 60 days| 60 days no warranty on electricat
7 parts|
B) Labor and Service
1 Labor Rate for Service (annual estimate 50 hours) 50 $30.00} $48.00 $65.00| $75.00
Price Total $1,500.00) $2,400.00 $3,250.00/ $3,750.00!
2 DELETED 1
Subtotal $1,500.001 $2.,400.00 $3,250.00 $3,750.00]
<) Pickup and Service Hours
Parts will be available for pick up within calendar 5 days] 3 -5 days| 5 days| 5 days|
1 days after receipt of order.
Business hours are from AM. to P.M. 8.am - 5 pm, 5 days per| 8am -5 pm, 5§ days per| 8am -5 pm, § days per| 8am - 5 pm, 5 days per week
2 days per week. week| week| week
D) ltems for Bid Eva! Only
3 DELETED
4 GRAVELY No Bid No Bid No Bid
A) Parts
1 Percent of discount offered 10%i
2 Product ldentification {(Manufacturer) GR
3 Type of price schedule {dealer, jobber, etc.) MFG]
4 Price Schedule Number
5 Date of Price Schedule
Price schedule column on which discount is based MFG]
8 (i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)
7 Warranty 60 days
B) Labor and Service
1 Labor Rate for Service (annual estimate 30 hours) 30 $30.00}
Price Total $900.00f
2 DELETED 1
Subtotal $800.00]
C) Pickup and Service Hours
Parts will be available for pick up within calendar 5 days]
1 days after receipt of order.
Business hours are from AM.to P.M. 8am - 5 pm, 5 days per]|
2 days per week. week|
D) ified tems for Bid E: Only
5 HONDA
A) Parts No Bid|
1 Percent of discount offered 15% 20% 15%|
2 Product Identification (Manufacturer)} Honda{ Honda Honda|
3 Type of price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Dealel Dealet] Dealer|
4 Price Schedule Number C C-System Price File| NA
5 Date of Price Schedule 6/12/2014] 21172014 NA|
Price schedule column on which discount is based Lis List Price Net
[ {i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)
Warranty 30 days 60 days| 60 days no warranty on
7 parts
B) Labor and Service
1 Labor Rate for Service (annual estimate 60 hours) 60 $65.00 $75.00]
Price Total $3,800.00 $4,500.00]
2 DELETED 1 $0.20)
Subtotal $0.00] $3,900.00) $4,500.00




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 13, 2014
For: Annual Contract for Lawnmowers, Edgers, Chain Saws,
: Parts and Service Local Local Local
DeWinne Equipment Co. |James Lawnmower John H. Sorola, Inc. Mustang Equipment
6100004525 LM 11002 Rd. 5034 Rigsby 523 W. Cypress 3540 N. Loop 1604E
San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
ftom Description Quantity [ TX 78250 TX 78222 TX 78212 TX 78247
210-684-5296 210-648-3636 210-224-8597 210-238-6033
c) Pickup and Service Hours
Parts will be available for pick up within calendar 3- 5 days] 5 days| 5 days|
1 days after receipt of order.
Business hours are from AM.to P.M. 8am -5 pm, 5 days perf| 8am -5 pm, 5 days per 8am -5 pm, 5 days per week|
2 days per week. week} week|
D) pecified tems for Bid E Only
6 DELETED
DELETED
8 DELETED
2 REDMAX Specified tems No Bid No Bid
A) Parts
1 Percent of discount offered 15%! 12%
2 Product Identification {Manufacturer) Redmax Redmax]
3 Type of price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Dealerf Dealer|
4 Price Schedule Number C-System Price Filg] NA|
5 Date of Price Schedule 11212014 NA|
Price schedule column on which discount is based List Pricef Net|
6 (i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)
Warranty 60 days§ 60 days no warranty on electrical
7 parts|
B) Labor and Service
1 Labor Rate for Service (annual estimate 75 hours) 75 $65.001 $75.00]
Price Total $4,875.008 $5,625.00
2 DELETED 1
Subtotal $0.00 $0.00 $4,875.00| $5,625.00
c) Pickup and Service Hours
Parts will be available for pick up within calendar 5 days] § days|
1 days after receipt of order.
Business hours are from AM.to PM. 8am - § pm, 5 days per| 8am - 5 pm, 5 days per week|
2 days per week. week}
D) ified tems for Bid E Only
10 SCHINDAWA
A) Parts
1 Percent of discount offered 10%] 21% 15%)| 15%)|
2 Product Identification (Manufacturer) ECOJ Schir by chol SchindaiwalEchol
3 Type of price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) MFG| Dealer] Dealer] Dealer|
4 Price Schedule Number C-Systems; C-System Price File| NA|
5 Date of Price Schedule 3/5/2014] 412212014 NA|
Price schedule column on which discount is based MFG List] List Price Net|
[ (i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)
Warranty 60 daysy 30 days| 60 days| 60 days no warranty on electrical
7 parts;
B) Labor and Service
1 Labor Rate for Service (annual estimate 30 hours) 30 $30.00f $48.00, $65.00; $75.00]
Price Total $9800.00) $1,440.00 $1,950.00, $2,250.00
2 DELETED 1
Subtotal $900.00] $1,440.00 $1,950.00) $2,250.00
c) Pickup and Service Hours
Parts will be available for pick up within calendar 5 daysf 3 -5 days| 5 days! 5 days!
1 days after receipt of order.
Business hours are from AM. to P.M. 8 am - 5 pm, 5 days per] 8am -5 pm, 5 days per| 8am -5 pm, 5 days per| 8am - 5 pm, 5 days per week
2 days per week. week| week| week|
D) ltems for Bid E Only
1" SNAPPER No Bid|
A) Parts
1 Percent of discount offered 21%) 15%)| No Bid|
2 Product ldentification (Manufacturer) PP
3 Type of price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Dealel Dealer]
4 Price Schedule Number C-Systems] C-System Price File|
5 Date of Price Schedule 5/16/2014) 3/31/2014
Price schedule column on which discount is based Lisf List Price
[:] (i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)
7 Warranty 30 days 60 days|
B) Labor and Service
1 Labor Rate for Service (annual estimate 20 hours) 20 $48.00| $65.00
Price Total $960.00; $1,300.00
2 DELETED 1 OJ
Subtotal $0.0 $960.01 $1,300.00
<) Pickup and Service Hours
Parts will be available for pick up within calendar 5 days] 5 days|
1 days after receipt of order.
Business hours are from AM. to P.M. 8am -5pm, 5 days per| 8am -5 pm, 5 days per|
2 days per week. week| week|
D) ified tems for Bid E Only
12 STHHL No Bid|
A) Parts
1 Percent of discount offered 21%] 15%)| 12%
2 Product Identification (Manufacturer) Stihl Stihl| Stihl
3 Type of price schedule {dealer, jobber, etc.) Deale Dealer| Dealer|
4 Price Schedule Number C-Systemsy C-System Price File| NA




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 13, 2014
For: Annual Contract for Lawnmowers, Edgers, Chain Saws,
) Parts and Service Local Local Local
DeWinne Equipment Co. [James Lawnmower John H. Sorola, Inc. Mustang Equipment
6100004525 LM 11002 Bandera Rd. 5034 Rigsby 523 W. Cypress 3540 N. Loop 1604E
San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, $an Antonio,
kem Description Quantity [TX 78250 TX 78222 TX 78212 TX 78247
210-684-5286 210-648-3636 210-224-8597 210-238-6033
5 Date of Price Schedule 5122012 57812014 NA
Price schedule column on which discount is based Lis List Price Netj
6 (i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)
Warranty 30 dayg 80 days| 60 days no warranty on electrical|
7 parts|
B) Labor and Service
1 Labor Rate for Service {(annual estimate 68 hours) 68 $48.001 $65.00 $75.00|
Price Total $3,264.00f $4,420.00) $5,100.00
2 DELETED 1
Subtotal $0.00] $3,264.00) $4,420.00| $5,100.00
Cc) Pickup and Service Hours
Parts will be available for pick up within calendar 3 - 5 dayy] 5 days| 5 days|
1 days after receipt of order.
Business hours are from AM. to P.M. 8am -5 pm, 5 days per]] 8am - 5 pm, 5 days per| 8am - 5 pm, 5 days per week
2 days per week. week| week|
D) ified tems for Bid E Only
C) Pickup and Service Hours
Parts will be available for pick up within calendar 3-5 days| 3-5 days, 3-5 days;
1 days after receipt of order.
Business hours are from AM.to P.M. 8 am - 5 pm, 5 days per| 8am -5 pm, 5days per] 8am -5 pm,5 days per| 8am - 5 pm, 5 days per week
2 days per week. week week| week|
Prompt Payment Discount Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 1%, 10 daysj

Deleted ttems: #3 Feris, #6 Hustler, #7 John Deere, and #8 Kohler items will be re-bid at a later time.

Deleted Mileage: this line item is not needed.

Dewinne- the vendor provided the 10% discount price in the extended price column.
ftem identified NAS: Mustang Equipment bid rejected for failure to sign and submit the signature page.

Schindaiwa parts have universal manufacturers.



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Amendment Date: 10/1/2014

For: Amendment to Maintenance Agreement for the METASYS System at the

Sole Source

Alamodome 3660 Thousand Oaks Dr.
San Antonio,
A739-09 LB TX 78216
Item Description Estimated Annual [210-524-7066
Quantity

Johnson Controls, Inc.

METASYS Maintenance Agreement, Amendment
Year 6

Parts and Labor

Estimated Annual Total

$277,032.00

$4o,ooo.oo”

$317,032.00

Estimated Annual Award

$317,032.00|




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 1, 2014

BuyBoard, Local

BuyBoard, Local

Austin Vacuum S.A,,

Gulf Coast Paper Co.

For: Annual Contract for City Wide Janitorial Supplies Inc
11765 West Ave., 8655 N.E. Loop 410
Suite 2
San Antonio, San Antonio,
TX 78216 TX 78219
6100004447 JM 1210-349-0583 210-225-2674
item Description
1 Chemicals & Cleaners
Catalog Title and Year AVSA Janitorial Chemicals &
Food Service Cleaners]
Paper/ Safety 201
Percent of Discount Offered 0% 0%
Product Identification (Manufacturer) All Spartan & Various|
Type of Price Schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Dealer] Gulf Coas
Price Schedule Number 397-12
Date of latest Price Schedule 7/28/201 6/1/2013
Price Schedule column on which Discount is based (i.e. BuyBoard Catalog|| Gulf Coast Buyboard
distributor, net, wholesale, etc.) Price Catalog
2 Cleaning Equipment & Supplies
Catalog Title and Year AVSA Janitorial Cleaning Supplies
Food Service
Paper/ Safety 2014
Percent of Discount Offered 0% 0%
Product Identification (Manufacturer) Allll  Advance & Various|
Type of Price Schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Dealer Gulf Coas
Price Schedule Number 397-12
Date of latest Price Schedule 7/28/2014 6/1/2013
Price Schedule column on which Discount is based (i.e. BuyBoard Catalog|| Gulf Coast Buyboard
distributor, net, wholesale, etc.) Price Catalog
3 Hand Soap & Sanitizers
Catalog Title and Year AVSA Janitorial Hand Soap &
Food Service Sanitizers
Paper/ Safety 2014
Percent of Discount Offered 0%) 0%
Product Identification (Manufacturer) All Deb & Various
Type of Price Schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Dealel Gulf Coas'
Price Schedule Number 397-12
Date of latest Price Schedule 7/28/2014 6/1/2013
Price Schedule column on which Discount is based (i.e. BuyBoard Catalog|| Guif Coast Buyboard
distributor, net, wholesale, etc.) Price Catalog|
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30;




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 9, 2014 BuyBoard, Local
. . . . . . Gulf Coast Paper Co.
For: Annuat Contract for City Wide Janitorial Supplies - Trash Liners
8655 N.E. Loop 410
San Antonio,
TX 78219
6100004811 JM 210-225-2674
Item Description
1 Trash Liners
Catalog Title and Year Trash Liners
Percent of Discount Offered 0%
Product Identification (Manufacturer) Berry Plastic
Type of Price Schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Gulf Coas
Price Schedule Number 397-12
Date of latest Price Schedule 6/1/201
Price Schedule column on which Discount is based (i.e. distributor, || Gulf Coast Buyboard
net, wholesale, etc.) Price Catalog
Payment Terms Net 3




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 28, 2014 Sole Source
_ Annual Contract for Shelter Software Case Management HLP, Inc.
For: .
System Maintenance and Support
0888 West Belleview Ave.,
6100004827 wp |Suite 110
Littleten,
C0O 80123
Item Description Qty |[800-459-8376
1 Chameleon Software M&S 1
10/1/2014 - 9/30/2015
Price Each $24,000.00,
Price Total $24,000.00,
2 Chameleon Software M&S 1
10/1/2015 - 9/30/2016
Price Each $24,000.00
Price Total $24,000.00
3 Chameleon Software M&S 1
10/1/2016 - 9/30/2017
Price Each $24,000.00
Price Total $24,000.00
4 Computer Service Software & Training Optional 1
(includes travel time)
Rate Per Day $900.00
$900.00
Payment Terms Net 30
Estimated Annual Total $24,000.00f
Estimated Annual Award $24,000.00]|




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 13, 2014
For: Annual Contract for SAPD Taser Supplies Taser International, Inc.
17800 N. 85th St.
6100004179 AAS Scottsdale,
Estimated |AZ 85255
item Description Quantity |800-978-2737
1 15 ft Training Cartridge 4300
Manufacture Name; Taser|
Product Number: 34200
Warranty: 1 year
Price Each $21.6
Price Total $46,569.00
2 21 ft Issued Duty Cartridge 1900
Manufacture Name; Taser|
Product Number: 44200
Warranty: 1 year
Price Each $23.67
Price Total $22,486.50
3 XDPM - Battery Pack Assembled 1181
Manufacture Name: Taser
Product Number: 26701
Warranty: 1 year
Price Each $40.9
Price Total $24,180.9
Delivery 4-6 weeks
Payment Terms Net 30
Estimated Annual Total $93,236.48
Estimated Annual Award $93,236.48




