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ANORDINANCE  2010-03-04-01 59

ACCEPTING BIDS FOR THE FOLLOWING CONTRACTS IN THE
ESTIMATED ANNUAL AMOUNT OF §1,324,000.00: (A)
SOUTHWEST WHEEL FOR MEDIUM AND HEAVY TRUCK,
TRAILER DRUM AND BRAKE PARTS AND; (B) COOPER
EQUIPMENT CO. FOR WIRTGEN RECLAIMER AND MILLING
MACHINE PARTS AND SERVICES; (C) DIVERSIFIED
INSPECTIONS/INDEPENDENT TESTING LABORATORIES FOR
INSPECTION OF AERIAL APPARATUS AND GROUND LADDERS;
D) T&W TIRE FOR EMERGENCY TIRES AND (E) PROTECH
ACCESS FOR MAINTENANCE OF AVIATION DEPARTMENT
PARKING SYSTEM.

WHEREAS, the City is able to obtain significant savings by purchasing various materials and
services on an annual contract basis; and

WHEREAS, these bids are from the following companies for the following goods and services:
(A) Southwest Wheel for medium and heavy truck, trailer drum and brake parts and; (B) Cooper
Equipment Co. for Wirtgen Reclaimer and Milling machine parts and services; (C) Diversified
Inspection/Independent Testing Laboratories for inspection of aerial apparatus and ground
ladders; (D) T&W Tire for emergency tires and (E) Protech Access for maintenance of Aviation
Department parking system; and

WHEREAS, this ordinance approves 3 low bid contracts and 2 contracts awarded to other than
the low bidder(s) because the low bidder(s) did not meet the City’s specifications or
requirements; and

WHEREAS, all expenditures will be in accordance with the FY 2010 budgets approved by City
Council; NOW THEREFORE:

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO:

SECTION 1. The following bids are hereby accepted, subject to and contingent upon the
deposit of all required bonds, performance deposits, insurance certificates, and endorsements:
(A) Southwest Wheel for medium and heavy truck, trailer drum and brake parts and; (B) Cooper
Equipment Co. for Wirtgen Reclaimer and Milling machine parts and services; (C) Diversified
Inspection/Independent Testing Laboratories for inspection of aerial apparatus and ground
ladders; and (D) T&W Tire for emergency tires and (E) Protech Access for maintenance of
Aviation Department parking system. The bid tabulation sheets are attached hereto and
incorporated herein for all purposes as Exhibit I, and show the exact items for which bids are
accepted. Copies of the bids are available for inspection in the offices of the Purchasing &
General Services Department. ‘
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SECTION 2. It has been found and declared that the low bids of America Tire Distributors, A to
Z Tire, GCR Tire Centers, Hesselbein Tire, Southern Tire Mart, Tire Centers, Inc. and Wingfoot
Commercial Tire Systems for emergency tires, and of Federal APD, Inc. for maintenance of
Aviation Department parking system failed to meet the City’s specifications and/or requirements.

SECTION 3. The amounts will be encumbered upon issuance of various purchase orders, and
payment is authorized to various vendors. All expenditures will be in accordance with the Fiscal
Year 2010 budget approved by City Council.

SECTION 4. This ordinance shall be effective immediately upon passage by eight or more
affirmative votes; otherwise, it shall be effective on the tenth day after passage.

PASSED and APPROVED this 4" day of March, 2010.

A Y O R
Julian Castro

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM:

Leticia M. VacCg City,C/lerk ‘““Michael D. Bernard,
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Agenda Voting Results - 6

Name: |6, 7,9, 10, 11, 12, 13, 14A, 14B, 14C, 14D, 14E, 14F, 14G, 14H, 141,
141, 14K, 18, 19

Date: [03/04/2010
Time: [10:11:48 AM
Vote Type: | Motion to Approve

Description: | An Ordinance accepting bids for the following contracts in the estimated
annual amount of $1,324,000.00: (A) Southwest Wheel for medium and
heavy truck, trailer drum and brake parts and (B) Cooper Equipment Co.
for Wirtgen reclaimer and milling machine parts and services; (C)
Diversified Inspections/Independent Testing Laboratories for inspection
of aerial apparatus and ground ladders; (D) T&W Tire for emergency
tires and (E) ProTech Access for maintenance of Aviation Department
parking system. [Sharon De La Garza, Assistant City Manager; Janie
Cantu, Director, Purchasing & General Services]

Result: | Passed
%

Voter Group P:e]:etn ¢ Yea | Nay | Abstain | Motion | Second
Julian Castro Mayor X
Mary Alice P. Cisneros| District 1 X X

Ivy R. Taylor District 2 X

Jennifer V. Ramos District 3 X .4
Philip A. Cortez District 4 X
David Medina Jr. District 5 &
Ray Lopez District 6 %
Justin Rodriguez District 7 X
W. Reed Williams District 8 X
Elisa Chan District 9 x
John G. Clamp District 10 X

http://cosaweb/agendabuilder/votingresults.aspx?Itemld=5985& Src=RFCA 3/5/2010



ANNUAL CONTRACT
TABLE OF CONTENTS
March 4, 2010
COMMODITY MBE/WBE

Contracts procured on the basis of low bid:

A.

Medium & Heavy Truck, Trailer Drum &
Brake Parts

A022-10-DB

Upon award through December 31, 2012
with 2, 1 year options to extend

Wirtgen Reclaimer & Milling Machine Parts
& Service

A901-10-DS

Upon award through December 31, 2012
with 2, 1 year options to extend

Inspection of Aerial Apparatus & Ground
Ladders

A976-10-DDG

Avpril 1, 2010 through March 31, 2013
with 2, 1 year options to extend

Contract procured on the basis of low qualifying bid:

D

Emergency Tires
A013-10-DDG
April 1, 2010 through March 31, 2012

with 2, 1 year options to extend -

Maintenance of Aviation Department Parking
System

A1058-10-PC

Upon award through November 30, 2011
with 1, 1 year option to extend

RFCA #5985

Exhibit I

RFCA #5985

VENDOR

Southwest Wheel
Entire Bid

Estimated Amount: $534,000.00
annually

Cooper Equipment Co.
Entire Bid

Estimated Amount: $250,000.00
annually

Diversified Inspections/Independent
Testing Laboratories

Entire Bid

Estimated Amount: $25,000.00
annually; $125,000.00 contract period

T&W Tire
Entire Bid

Estimated Amount: $376,000.00
annually

ProTech Access
Entire Bid

Estimated Amount: $139,000.00
annually



City of San Antonio
Contract Summary Sheet
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Date: 03/04/10
Agenda item: 5985

Name/Title (Caption as shown on agenda):
Medium & Heavy Truck, Trailer Drum & Brake Parts A022-10 DB

Brief Description of Item(s) and Use:

This contract will provide Solid Waste Management, Public Works, Fire, and Parks & Recreation departments
with a contractor that will furnish drum & brake parts for medium & heavy trucks and trailers maintained by
Fleet Maintenance & Operations Department. This contract will support approximately one-thousand three
hundred (1300) trucks and trailers in the City’s fleet.

Total $: $534,000.00 annually

Contract Period: Upon award through December 31, 2012 with 2, 1 year options to extend

Method of Procurement: | Competitive (5 bids received)

15% increase due to higher costs in raw materials needed for product

Price Trend: manufacture.

Contract Info: Formal Annual X _ Support/Maintenance Lease
Recommended Southwest Wheel, 343 Gember Rd., San Antonio, TX 78217 (MSWN)
Contractor(s):

Previous Contractor(s): | Southwest Wheel, 343 Gembler Rd., San Antonio, TX 78217 (MSWN)

Comments: N/A

Anticipated Future

Requirements and N/A
Action:
< —— Should this contract not be approved, the Fleet Maintenance & Operations

Department will be required to procure drum and brake parts on as needed
basis, wherein increasing cost due to non-contract buying maybe realized, thus
increasing equipment downtime and repair costs.

Alternative:

Using

Department(s): Solid Waste Management, Public Works, Fire, Parks & Recreation




Opened: October 19, 2009

- City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

For: Medium & Heavy Truck, Trailer Drum & Brake
Parts
Southwest Wheel Genuine Parts Company McCombs HFC, Ltd., dba Red O'Reilly Automaotive Inc. Rush Truck Center of Texas, L.P. dba
McCombs Ford Rush Truck Center San Antonio
A022-10 DB 343 Gembler Road 6374 Rittiman Rd. 8333 |H 10 East 233 S. Patterson 8810 |H-10
San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Springfield, San Antonio,
Item Description TX 78217 TX 78218 TX 78230 MO, 65802 TX 78220
210-226-0301
| Brake Shoe Hardware Kits & Accessories
Percent of discount offered Net + 2C% 15% Cost +24% 10% 37.5%
Product identification (mfr.) Sirco| Haldex| Bendix BWP Midland Brake (MB)
Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Distributor] Jobber| Dealer (Ford CTP) Jobber Quote 10/09/09
Price schedule number 60108WD RPTO086 Not provided Not provided 887468
Date of price schedule 6/1/2008 Oct-2009 06/29/09 - 12/27/09 Not provided 10/9/2009
Price schedule column on which discount is based Distributor MNet| Jobber Dealer Net(Cost) Jobber Price/Per,
] Brake Drums & Spoke Wheels
Percent of discount offered 65 % 21% Cost + 24% 10% 61%
Product identification (mfr.) Webb Webb (TWD) Webb/Gunite K/C| Web Cast Drums (WEB)
Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) List Price| Jobber Dealer (Ford CTP) Jobber Quote
Price schedule number 060109 OES P RPTO086 Not provided Not provided 887468
Date of price schedule 6/1/2009 Oct-2009 06/29/09 - 12/27/09 Not provided 10/9/2009
Price schedule column on which discount is based List Price Jobber Dealer Net(Cost) Jobber Price/Per
1] Air Brake Components
Percent of discount offered Net + 12% 10% Cost + 24% 10% 48%|
Product identification Haldex Haldex Bendix] Brake Best Heavy Duty| Allied Signal AKA Bendix (BX)
Type price schedule Distribuior Jobber| Dealer (Ford CTP) Jobber: Quote
Price schedule number L4300 RPT086 Not provided Not provided 887468
Date of price schedule 1/1/2099 Oct-2009 06/29/09 - 12/27/09 Not provided 10/9/2009
Price schedule column on which discount is based Distributor Met Jobber Dealer Net(Cost) Jobber Price/Per,
IV |Air Brake Fittings
Percent of discount offered 0% 10% No Bid 15% 27.4%
Product identification (mfr.) Corcrief] Weatherhead Gates Imperial Supplies (IMS)
Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Industrial Pr ce Jobber Jobber Quote
Price schedule number INP-C& J4 RPTO086 Not provided 887468
Date of price schedule 4/14/2% 38| Oct-2009 Not provided 10/9/2009
Price schedule column on which discount is based iet Jobber, Jobber Price/Per|
\% Air Brake Tubing & Hose
Percent of discount offered Net + 1&%) 10% Cost + 40% 15% Gates/0% TMI 46.1%
Product identification (mfr.) Velvic) Haldex Velvac] Gates/TMI Dynacraft (DY)
Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Distributor] Jobber| Dealer (Ford CTP) Jobber Quote
Price schedule number PLOS-4| RPT086 Not provided Not provided 887468
Date of price schedule 4/4/2009 Oct-2009 06/29/09 - 12/27/09 Not provided 10/9/2009
Price schedule column on which discount is based Distributor Met Jobber Dealer Net(Cost) Jobber| Price/Per
i
| Prepared by Purchasing 2/5/2010 Page 1




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: October 19, 2009
For: Medium & Heavy Truck, Trailer Drum & Brake
Parts 4
Southwest Wheel Genuine Parts Company McCombs HFC, Ltd., dba Red O'Reilly Automotive Inc. Rush Truck Center of Texas, L.P. dba
McCombs Ford Rush Truck Center San Antonio
A022-10 DB 343 Gembler Road 6374 Rittiman Rd. 8333 |H 10 East 233 S. Patterson 8810 IH-10
L San Antonio, . |San Antonio, San Antonio, Springfield, San Antonio,
Item Description TX 78217 { [TX 78218 TX 78230 MO, 65802 TX 78220
210-226-0301 i
1
VI |Gladhand & Accessories :
Percent of discount offered €% 20% Cost + 24% 10% 36.9%
Product identification (mfr.) Phillips| Phillips Phillips Brake Best Heavy Duty, Phillips Electric (PA)
Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Distributor| Jobber! Dealer (Ford CTP) Jobber! Quote
Price schedule number UDP-07::9 RPT086 Not provided Not provided 887468
Date of price schedule 7112018 Oct-2009 06/29/09 - 12/27/09 Not provided 10/9/2009
Price schedule column on which discount is based Distributor Net Jobber Dealer Net(Cost) Jobber! Price/Per
Vil |Brake Chamber Complete (New)
Percent of discount offered 45% 15% Cost + 24% 10% 26.24%
Product identification (mfr.) Ranger Brake Products, Inc| Haldex! Haldex Brake Best Heavy Duty| Bendix (BX) Midland Brake (MD)
Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) List Prite Jobber Dealer (Ford CTP) Jobber Quiote
Price schedule number Ranger 2008 RPTOB6 Not provided Not provided 887468
Date of price schedule 10/20/2008} Oct-2009 06/29/09 - 12/27/09 Not provided 10/9/2009
Price schedule column on which discount is based List Price Jobber: Dealer Net(Cost) Jobber! Price/Per
VII  |Re-Lined Shoes, Non-Asbestos (Exchange) !
Percent of discount offered Net + 1£%)| 5% Cost + 24% 10% 14.98%
¥’ S - ; Roadleveler Brake Shoes (RLB)
Product identificati mfr. Neo-Br: » Haldex| Bendix| Brake Best Heavy Dut:
FonGeticentifcRiEn ) 00-Br4 ety Heavy Duty Friction aka Haldex (HD)
Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Warehouse Distributor, Jobber! Dealer (Ford CTP) Jobber: Quote
Price schedule number NEO 070108 RPTO086 Not provided Not provided 887468
Date of price schedule 7/1/12008 Oct-2009 06/29/09 - 12/27/09 Not provided 10/9/2009
Price schedule column on which discount is based W.D. Net Jobber, Dealer Net(Cost) Jobber' Price/Per
IX  |Automatic Slack Adjusters with Clevis
Percent of discount offered Net + 15%) 10% Cost + 24% 10%! 37.5%
Product identification (mfr.) Sirco Haldex; Gunite! Brake Best Heavy Duty| Midland Brake (MD)
Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Distribu..or Jobber Dealer (Ford CTP) Jobber Quote
Price schedule number 60108WD| RPTO86 Not provided Not provided 887468
Date of price schedule 6/1/2008 Oct-2009 06/29/09 - 12/27/09 Not provided 10/9/2009
Price schedule column on which discount is based Distributor Met Jobber Dealer Net(Cost) Jobber!| Price/Per
1
i Prepared by Purchasing 2/5/2010 Page 2




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: October 19, 2009

For: Medium & Heavy Truck, Trailer Drum & Brake
Parts

Southwest Wheel Genuine Parts Company McCombs HFC, Ltd., dba Red O'Reilly Automotive Inc. Rush Truck Center of Texas, L.P. dba
McCombs Ford Rush Truck Center San Antonio
A022-10 DB |343 Gembler Road 6374 Rittiman Rd. 8333 |H 10 East 233 S. Patterson 8810 |H-10
. San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Springfield, San Antonio,
Item Description TX 78217 TX 78218 TX 78230 MO, 65802 TX 78220
210-226-0301
X Disc Brake Rotors
. Bendix Rotors List Less 57%) ’
Percent of discount offered Meritor Rotors List Less 60% 15% Cost + 24% No Bid 45.9%
Product identification (mfr.) Bendix & Meritor| Meritor/Bendix Meritor| Rockwell International (RI)
Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) List Jobber Dealer (Ford CTP) Quote
Price schedule number Bendix=BW1469 Meritor=LP 1108 RPT086 Not provided 887468
Date of price schedule Bendix 07/01/2009 Meritor] Oct-2009 06/29/09 - 12/27/09 10/9/2009
Price schedule column on which discount is based List Price| Jobber Dealer Net(Cost) Price/Per
Xl Disc Pads ‘
. Bendix Rotors List Less 57 % 4 ” : 5 ;
Percent of discount offered Meritor Rotors List Less 65% 15% Cost + 24% No Bid 45.9% off list
Product identification (mfr.) Bendix & Meriior] Meritor/Bendix Meritor/Bendix Rockwell International (RI)
Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) List] Jobber Dealer (Ford CTP) Quote
Price schedule number Bendix=BW1469 Meritor=LP1‘.3§ﬂ RPT086 Not provided 887468
Date of price schedule Bendix 07/01/2009 Mer'io Oct-2009 06/29/09 - 12/27/09 10/9/2009
Price schedule column on which discount is based List Price Jobber Dealer Net(Cost) Price/Per
Delivery 1 Caay, 1 Day 1 Day 1 Day 3 Days
Payment Terms 2%- 10} 2%-10 1% - 10 2%-10 Net 30
i
Prepared by Purchasing 2/5/2010 Page 3




City of San Antonio

Contract Summary Sheet Ra—
Agenda Item: 5985

Name/Title (Caption as shown on agenda):
Wirtgen Reclaimer & Milling Machine Parts & Service A901-10 DS

Brief Description of Item(s) and Use:

This contract provides repair parts and service for Wirtgen Reclaimer and Milling machines utilized for
recycling asphalt for street repairs by the Public Works Department in locations throughout the City. This
contract will support approximately three (3) units in the City’s Fleet.

Total $: $250,000.00 annually

Contract Period: Upon award through December 31, 2012 with 2, 1 year options to extend

Method of Procurement: | Competitive (1 bid received)

Price Trend: 12% increase due to rise in cost of raw materials needed for product
manufacture

Contract Info: Formal Annual X Support Maintenance Lease

Recommended . .

Contractor(s): Cooper Equipment Co., 17474 Judson Rd; San Antonio, TX 78247 (MLWN)

Previous Contractor(s):

Cooper Equipment Co., 17474 Judson Rd; San Antonio, TX 78247 (MLWN)

Comments: N/A

Anticipated Future

Rec!uwements and N/A

Action:

Procurement Should this contract not be approved, City departments will be required to
Alerniative: procure parts and preventive maintenance on an as needed basis. Lack of a

contract could result in delaying repairs, resulting in an inefficient and less cost
effective method of servicing City owned equipment.

Using
Department(s): Fleet Maintenance & Operations and Public Works




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: December 18, 2009
For: Wirtgen Reclaimer & Milling Machine Parts & Service
Cooper Equipment Co.
A901-10 DS [17474 Judson Rd.
San Antonio,
Item Description TX 78247
210-657-5151
1 Wirtgen Reclaimer & Milling Machine Parts )
A Percent of discount offered List plus 8%
B Product identification (Manufacturer) Wirtgen America
C Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Dealer list
D Price schedule number Wirtgen Price Tape 2009
E Date of price schedule Nov. 16, 2009
F Price schedule column on which discount is based
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.) List
2 Labor and Service
A Labor rate per hour $95.00
B Mileage Charge $2.50
C Deliveries for normal wear items 1 Day
D Deliveries for other than normal wear items 5 Days
E Parts will be available for pick up 5 Days
Payment Terms Net 30

Prepared by Purchasiiiij ©/4/2010

Page 1



City of San Antonio

Contract Summary Sheet

Date: 3/4/10
Agenda item: 5985

Name/Title (Caption as shown on agenda):
Inspection of Aerial Apparatus & Ground Ladders A976-10 DDG

Brief Description of item(s) and Use:

This contract will provide the Fire Department with a contractor for inspections of the aerial apparatus vehicles
(ladder trucks) and all ground ladders for approximately 45 fire trucks. This will ensure that the Fire
Department complies with the inspection requirements per the National Fire Protection Agency (NFPA) 1911
required for the aerial apparatus vehicles.

Total $:

$25,000.00 annually, $125,000.00 contract period

Contract Period:

April 1, 2010 through March 31, 2013 with 2, 1 year options to extend

Method of Procurement:

Competitive (2 bids received)

Price Trend:

No change

Contract Info:

Formal __ Annual _X Support/Maintenance __ Lease __

Recommended
Contractor(s):

Diversified Inspections/independent Testing Laboratories, P.O. Box 39669,
Phoenix, AZ 85069 (MLWN)

Previous Contractor(s):

Diversified inspections/Independent Testing Laboratories, P.O. Box 39669,
Phoenix, AZ 85069 (MLWN)

Comments:

N/A

Anticipated Future
Requirements and
Action:

N/A

Should this contract not be approved, the Fire Department will be required to

Z:&ig:x:w procure inspection services, as required by the National Fire Protection Agency
’ (NFPA) 1911 guidelines, on an as needed basis; thus delaying the return of
these vehicles into operational status and could lead to a decrease in availability
of emergency services to the residents of San Antonio.
Using Fire

Department(s):




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 30, 2009

For: Inspection of Aerial Apparatus & Ground Diversified Inspections/ Underwriters Laboratories, Inc.
Ladders Independent Testing Laboratories
P.O. Box 39669 333 Pfingsten Rd.
A976-10 DDG
Phoenix, Northbrook,
Estimated |AZ 85069 IL 60062-2096
Item Description Quantity 00T
1 Annual Inspection of Aerial Apparatus 26 Each
Per inspection $550.00] $800.00
Total $14,300.00 $20,800.00
2 Annual Inspection of Ground Ladder 6780 Feet
Per Ladder Foot $1.50] $2.00
Total $10,170.00, $13,560.00
Payment Terms Net 30] Net 30
Estimated Annual Total $24,470.00 $34,360.00
Estimated Annual Award S24,47o.00]r $34,360.00
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City of San Antonio

Contract Summary Sheet

Date: 03/04/10
Agenda Item: 5985

Name/Title (Caption as shown on agenda):
Emergency Tires A013-10 DDG

Brief Description of Item(s) and Use:
This contract will provide the Fire Department with replacement emergency tires and repair services for tires
on emergency vehicles. This contract will service approximately 250 emergency vehicles within the City’s

fleet.

Total $:

$376,000.00 annually

Contract Period:

April 1, 2010 through December 31, 2012 with 2, 1 year options to extend.

Method of Procurement:

Competitive (8 bids received)

Price Trend: 14.21% increase due to rise in cost of raw materials needed for product
manufacture.
Contract Info: Formal ___ Annual _X__ Support/Maintenance __ Lease

Recommended
Contractor(s):

T&W Tire, 5834 IH-10 East, San Antonio, TX 78219 (MLWN)

Previous Contractor(s):

American Tire Distributors, 201 North Rupert St., Dallas, TX 76107 (MLWN)

T&W Tire, 5834 IH-10 East, San Antonio, TX 78219 (MLWN)

Comments:

NAS:
NAS:
NAS:
NAS:
NAS:
NAS:
NAS:

America Tire Distributors did not provide pricing for all items specified.

A to 7 Tire dnes not offer repair service as specified.

GCR Tire Centers does not provide emergency tires as specified.
Hesselbein Tire does not offer repair services as specified.

Southern Tire Mart does not provide emergency tires as specified.

Tire Centers, Inc. did not provide pricing for all items as specified.
Wingfoot Commercial Tires Systems did not provide pricing for all items as

specified.

Anticipated Future
Requirements and

N/A

Action:
Should this contract not be approved, the Fire Department will be required to

Procurement . . o

Altermative: procure emergency tires on an as needed basis wherein increased cost QUe to

) non-contract buying would be realized and this may increase the down time of

emergency vehicles, thus decreasing the availability of emergency services to
the citizens of San Antonio.

Using Fire

Department(s):




Opened: November 16, 2009

City of San Antonio

Bid Tabulation

For: Emergency Tires |
T&W Tire " |Ato Z Tire & Battery, Inc. American Tire Distributors GCR Tire Centers Hesselbein Tire SW |Southern Tire Mart
5834 IH 10 East ' |812 West 4th, PO Box 9138 8531 N. New Braunfels. 17051 IH 35N 4823 Corner Parkway 6081 IH-10 East
A013-10 DDG : Suite 100
San Antonio, i
Est TX 78218 ' [Amarillo, San Antonio, Schertz, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Item Description Usage 1210-210-661-8271 ! |TX 79105-9138 TX 78217 TX 78154 TX 78219 TX 78218
0 NAS NAS NAS NAS NAS
I.  [Firestone Tires >
Discount Percent Off 42% 0% Varies by Tire Description| 0% 0% 22% All Passenger]
47% PV 41, PVS, GT Pursuif
22% LT Truck Radial
18% Medium Truck radial
! 18% Small off the road bias|
24% Medium & large OTR]
i
A 1]295/75R22.5, 14 Ply, Load Range G, All Position 6 :
Price Each $185.00) $217.95 $216.75 $222.46) $222.00/
Price Total 32l $1.110.00 $1,307.70) $1,300.50) $1,334.76} $1,332.00]
Tread Design & Article Number Dunlop SP 343 271-132-59% Cooper Roadmaster RM185| All Position Hwy 15656t Firestone FS 56 Toyo M122 14 Ply 54800 Firestone FS560 14 Ply
! #92053| 156-566 (156-566),
2|295/75R22.5. 14 Ply, Load Range G, Drive Axle 6
Price Each $22¢100 $200,0q $219.99 $218.75| $250.39 $225.00|
Price Total $1,32¢:00 $1,200.00 $1,318.94 $1,312.50] $1,502.34] $1,350.00
Tread Design & Article Number Dunlop SP 431 271-128-:99 Cooper Roadmaster RM275| Drive Axle 281050 Firestone FD 663 Toyo M61014 Ply 55651( Firestone FD663 14 Pl
#92153) 281-050} (281-050)|
B8 Delete
Cc Delete
D 385/65R22.5, 18 Ply, Load Range J, All Position 12 p
Price Each $32¢.00 $300.00 $313.98] $312.75 $353.00) $322.00
Price Total $3,948.0 $3,600.00) $3,767.76] $3,753.00] $4,236.00) $3,864.00
Tread Design & Article Number Dunlop SP 231 271-131-183 Roadlux R128 #0091 On/Off All Position| Firestone T-839] Kumho Hwy 983 18 Ply 1442813 Firestone T839 18 Pt
2945386 294-586] (294-586)
E 315/80R22.5, 18 Ply, Load Range J, All Position 12
Price Each $281.00 $240.00 $275.99 $274.75 $396.90] $286.00
Price Total $3,372.00 $2,880.00f $3,311.88| $3,297.00 $4,762.80) $3,432,0'j
Tread Design & Article Number Dunlop SP 245 271-113-47% Samsom GL96 88033 All Position Highway| Firestone FS400 18 PI Toyo M111Z 20 Ply 54616 Firestone FS400 18 Ph
216109 216-10 (216-109)|
F 425/65R22.5, 20 Ply, Load Range L, All Position 10 .
Price Each $350.00 $390.00) $349.9¢ $348.75 $422.50| $360.0
Price Total $3,500.04 $3,200.00) $3,499.9; 53,487_5(j $4,225.00 $3,600.0
Tread Design & Article Number Dunlop SP281 271-131-481 Roadlux R128 #0096 On/Off All Position Highwayj Firestone T-83! Kumho 983 20 Ply 14966319 Firestone T839 20 Piy
294594‘ 294-594 (294-594)|
G 1 [11R22.5, 16 Ply, Load Range H, All Position 70
Price Each $221.50 $185.00] $234 .04 $233.75 $222.9 $245,0q
Price Total $15,508.04 $12,950.00 $16,445.8 $16,362.50) $15,606.5 $17,150.00
Tread Design & Article Number 11R225 Dunlop SP16( Samson GL83 61158031 All Position Stee Firestone FS507| Kumho KRS02 16 Ply 1634719 Firestone FS507 16 P
271-108-£73 297011 297-011 (297-011)|
2|11R22.5, 14 Ply, Load Range H, Drive Axle 70
Price Each $224.00 $195.00) $224.94 $223.75 $254.80) $235.00
Price Total $15,680.04 $13,650.00 $15,745.8 $15,662.50| $17,836.00| $16.450.00}
Tread Design & Article Number 11R225 Dunlop SP43 Samson GL 75 61107504 Drive Axle 28104 Firestone FD663 Toyo M610Z 14 Ply 556524 Firestone FD663 14 Ply
271-127-779 281-042 (281-042)|
H 1 [12R22.5, 16 Ply, Load Range H, Steering Axle 70 |
Price Each $290.50 $215.00) $244.95 $243.75 $276.50 $255.00
Price Total $20,334.0( $15,050.00f $17,146.5 317,06245?J $19,355.0 $17,850.00
Tread Design & Article Number 12R225 Dunlop SP 333 Samson GL74 #87408 Steering/All Position| Firestone FS561 Kumho KRS02 16 Ply 16471314 Firestone FS560 16 Pyl
271-122-579 156523 156-523 (156-523)|
2/12R22.5, 16 Ply, Load Range H, Drive Axle 70
Price Each $306.00 $235.00| $306.9! $305.75 $285.00) $318.00
Price Total $21,420.0¢ $16,450.00 $21,486.5 $21,402.50] $19,950.00f $22,260.00]
Tread Design & Article Number 12R225 Dunlop SF581 Samson GL 87 #88355 Drive Axle 151009 Firestone FD663} Kumho 943 16 Ply 1251719 Firestone FD663 16 Pl
271-110-374 151-009 (151-009)|
. [Deleted §
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City of San Antonio

Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 16, 2009
For: Emergency Tires
T&W Tire A to Z Tire & Battery, Inc. American Tire Distributors GCR Tire Centers Hesselbein Tire SW Southern Tire Mart
5834 IH 10 East : 812 West 4th, PO Box 9138 8531 N. New Braunfels. 17051 IH 35N 4823 Corner Parkway 6081 |H-10 East
A013-10 DDG . Suite 100
San Antonio,
Est. |TX 78219 + {Amarillo, San Antonio, Schertz, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Item Description Usage [210-210-661-8271 TX 79105-9138 TX 78217 TX 78154 TX 78219 TX 78219
. |Michelin Tires
Discount Percent Off D%] 0% Varies by Tire Description| 0% 0% 42%)
A 1 1295/75R22.5, 14 Ply, Load Range G, Steering Axle 6 i
Price Each $330.0'§ $259.00] No bid $216.75) $222.46] $265.00
Price Total $1,980.0f $1,554.00 $1.300.50 $1,334.7 $1,590.00
Tread Design & Article Number XZE2 -5539d Toyo M147 783106 Firestone FS560 14 Ply. Toyo M122 14 Ply 548004 Continental HSL 14 Pl
156-566 (05685450000)
2|295/75R22.5, 14 Ply, Load Range G, Drive Axle 6
Price Each $330.04 $230.00] No bid| $218.75| $250.39) $285.00]
Price Total $1,980.04 $1,380.00) $1,312.50] $1,502.3 $1,710.00
Tread Design & Article Number XZE2-55899 Toyo M627 78830( Firestone FD663 14 Ply Toyo M610 556510 14 Ply Continental HDL 14 Pl
281-050| (05685420000,
B LT235/85R 16, Load Range E, All Position 90
Price Each $128.89 $107.00] $125.89 $79.30| $86.05 $128.00]
Price Total $11,60C.1 $9,630.00f $11,330.10 $7,137.00) $7,744.5 $11,520.00
Tread Design & Article Number LTX M/S -07364 Cooper SRM Il 64310 Al Position Hwy| Firestone Transforce HT 10 Ply. Transforce HT LRE 189-714 Michelin LTX M/S 10 Ply
07364 189-718| (07364)|
c 385/65R22.5, 18 Ply, Load Range J, Steering Axle 12
Price Each $472.29 $440.00 $369.62 $312.75 $353.00] $360.00}
Price Total $5,667.04 $5,280.00f $4,435.44 $3,753.00 $4,236.0i $4,320.00)
Tread Design & Article Number XFE-36391 Toyo M320 54907 Steer Axie 36991 Firestone T839 18 Ply] Kumho Hwy 983 18 Ply 144281 Continental HTR 20 Ply
294-586 (05723220000)
D 315/80R22.5, 18 Ply, Load Range J, Steering Axle 12
Price Each $404104 $395.00] $401.09 $274.75 $396.90) $360.00
Price Total $4'84€i'72 $4,740.00 $4,813.08] $3,297.00) $4,762.8ﬁ $4,320.00
Tread Design & Article Number XZAl-4795§ Toyo M111 781099 Steer Axle 47056¢) Firestone FS400 18 Pl Toyo M111Z 20 Ply 54616t Continental HSU 20 Pl
1 216-109| (05683320000
E 425/65R22.5, 18 Ply, Load Range L, Steering Axle 10
Price Each $479.82 $470.00] $477.23| $376.75) $422.50 $400.00
Price Total $4,798.20 $4.700.00] $4,772.30, $3.767.50 $4,225.01 $4,000.00|
Tread Design & Articie Number XFE-11:429 Toyo M320 54909 Steer Axle 7829 Bridgestone M844 20 Ply Kumho 983 20 Ply 146631 Continental HTR 20 Pl
291-684 (05723160000,
F 1 |11R22.5. 16 Ply, Load Range H, Steering Axle 70
Price Each $29¢.004 $227.00) $284.34 $220.75] $222.25 $275.00
Price Total $20,930.00 $15,890.00) $19,903.80| $15,452.50 $15,557.50] $19,250.00|
Tread Design & Article Number XZE2-67D42 Toyo M147 78311 Steer Axle 9528 Firestone FS560 16 Ply| Kumho KRS02 16 Ply 163471 Continental HSR2 16 Ply
156-558 (05683631000,
2[11R22.5, 16 Ply, Load Range H, Drive Axle 70
Price Each $294.0 $245.00 $307.69 $223.75) $260.43 $285.00
Price Total $20,92: ,03 $17,150.00] $21,538.30] $15,662.50} $18,230.10 $19,850.00|
Tread Design & Article Number XZE2-87042 Toyo M627 788303 Drive Axle 73493 Firestone FD663 14 Ply Toyo M610Z 16 Ply 556530 Continental HDL 16 P
281-042) 05
G 1 |12R22.5, 16 Ply, Load Range H, Steering Axle 70
Price Each $35° .5 $345.00) $348.30 $243.75] $276.50) $310.00
Price Total $24 6071 $24,150.00| $24,381.00 $17,062.50| $19,355.00| $21,700.00|
Tread Design & Article Number XZE-8533! Toyo M320 784604 Steer Axle 85335 Firestone FS560 16 Ply Kumho KRS02 16 Ply 1647313 Continental HSR 186 Pl
156-523] (05210360000)
2|12R22.5, 16 Ply, Load Range H, Drive Axle 70
Price Each $351 .53 $390.00) $355.41 $305.75 $285.00) $340.00
Price Total $24,607.1 $27,300.00) $24,878.70] $21,402.50| $19,950.00] $23,800.00)
Tread Design & Article Number XZE-85334 Toyo M605Z 78422 Drive Axle 51753 Firestone FD663 16 Ply Kumho 943 16 Ply 1251713 Continental HDR 16 Pl
151-009 (05220210000,
H 225/70R19.5, 12 Ply, Load Range F, All Position 12 ¢
Price Each $207’,Oﬂ $125.00) $221.14 $152.75) $179.34 $185.00
Price Total $2,484.0 $1,500.00] $2,653.68| $1,833.00 $2,152.08 $2,220.00]
Tread Design & Article Number XZE-91043 Cooper RM160 92802 All Position Highway| Firestone FS560 12 Ply Toyo M143 12 Ply 562154 Continental HSR 14 Pl
81473 160-716} (05685550000
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Opened: November 16, 2009

City of San Antonio

Bid Tabulation

For: Emergency Tires
T&W Tire A to Z Tire & Battery, Inc. American Tire Distributors GCR Tire Centers Hesselbein Tire SW Southern Tire Mart
5834 |H 10 East .|812 West 4th, PO Box 9138 8531 N. New Braunfels. 17051 IH 35N 4823 Corner Parkway 6081 IH-10 East
A013-10 DDG Suite 100
San Antonio,
Est. [TX 78219 Amarillo, San Antonio, Schertz, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Item Description Usage |210-210-661-8271 " [TX79105-9138 TX 78217 TX 78154 TX 78219 TX 78219
] LT7245/70R17/ENT, 10 Ply, Load Range E, All Position 200 !
Price Each $145.02 $133.00f $128.09) $94.45| $125.30} $142.00
Price Total $29,004.00 $26,600.00} $25,618.00| $18,890.00| $25,060.00] $23,400.0(j
Tread Design & Article Number LTX A/S -907 Toyo OPHT 782034 All Position Highway| Firestone Transforce HT 10 Ply}  Duravis R500 HD LRE 191-894) Michelin LTX A/S 10 P}
i 19436 191-316, (90771)
!
J LT245/70R17 LRE LTX, Tubeless, Steel Belted,
Highway Rib 200
Price Each $145.02 $133.00] $142.02] $94.45 $125.30) $135.00
Price Total $29,004.00 $26,600.00) $28,404.00| $18,890.00) $25,060.00| $27,000.00
Tread Design & Article Number LTX A/S -8077 Toyo OPHT 782034 Highway 90771| Firestone Transforce HT 10 Ply, Duravis R500 HD LRE 181-894| Michelin LTX M/S 108T]
£ 191-316| (91940)
'
V. [Goodyear Tires
Discount Percent Off 50 % - Light TijicH 0% No bid 0% 0% 22% All Passenger
42% - Med Comme;zial 47% PV 41, PVS, GT Pursui
’ 22% LT Truck Radial
18% Medium Truck radial
18% Small off the road bias|
24 %Medium & large OTR]
A 1 [295/75R22.5, 14 Ply, Load Range G, Steering Axie 6 i
Price Each 52674554 $260.00| No bid $216.75 $222.46) $222.00
Price Total $1,60¢ 90 $1,560.00 $1,300.50 $1,334.76) $1,332.00
Tread Design & Article Number s Firestone FS560 14 Ply Toyo M122 AP 14 P Firestone FS560 14 Pl
G661-7568171:331 Toyo M154 548700 156-566 y 54300’(: (156-566)]
2|295/75R22.5, 14 Ply, Load Range G, Drive Axle 6
Price Each $261.70) $230.00) No bid $218.75) $250.39] $225.00
Price Total $1,57¢.20 $1,380.00 $1,312.50} $1,502.34) $1,350.00
Tread Design & Article Number G182 -75681711 Toyo M627 788304 Firestone FD663 14 Ply, Toyo M610 14 Ply 55651 Firestone FD663 14 Pl
218-050| (281-050)
B LT235/85R16, Load Range E, All Position 90
Price Each $100.60 $110.00| No bid $79.30} $86.05 $82.00|
Price Total $9,05¢.00 $9,900.00 $7,137.00 $7,744.50) $7,380.00
Tread Design & Article Number SRA -17974%717 Toyo OPHT 782054 Firestone Transforce HT 10 Ply. Transforce HT LRE 189-718 Firestone Transforce HT 10 Ply
189-718] (189-718)|
c 385/65R22.5, 18 Ply, Load Range J, Steering Axle 12 .
Price Each $360.20) $440.00) No bid $312.75 $353.00) $322.00]
Price Total $4,322.40 $5.280.00) $3.753.00| $4,236.D(j $3,864.00
G286 - 759-315-204 Toyo M320 549070 Firestone T839 18 Ply] Kumho Hwy 983 18 Ply 144281 Firestone T839 18 Pl
Tread Design & Article Number 294-586| (294-586)|
D 315/80R22.5. 18 Ply, Load Range J, Steering Axle 12
Price Each $331 .35{ $395.00) No bid $274.75] $396.90) $286.00]
Price Total $3,976.2q $4,740.00 $3,297.00] 54,762.8!‘)J $3,432.00]
Tread Design & Article Number G291 - 756-254-424 Toyo M111 781099 Firestone FS400 18 Ply. Toyo M111Z 20 Ply 546164 Firestone FS400 18 Ph)
216-109| (216-109)|
E 425/65R22.5, 18 Ply, Load Range L 10
Price Each $357.00 $470.00 No bid $348.75 $422.50, $360.00|
Price Total $3,970.09 $4,700.00 $3,487.50| $4,225.00} $3,600.00
Tread Design & Article Number (286 759-313-20 Toyo M320 549094 Firestone T838 20 P\ Kumho 983 20 Ply 1466319 Firestone T839 20 Ply
294-594 (294-594)
F 1 {11R22.5, 16 Ply, Load Range H, Steering Axle 70
Price Each $28:.54 $290.00] No bid $220.75] $222.95) $245.00
Price Total $19,850.60 $20,300.00| $15,452.50 $15,606.50] $17,150.00]
Tread Design & Article Number G661-138-179-333 Toyo M154 54873( Firestone FS560 16 Ply Kumho KRS02 16 Ply 1634713 Firestone FS507 16 Pl
156-558 (297-011)
2|11R22.5, 16 Ply, Load Range H, Drive Axle 70
Price Each $276.00¢ $320.00) No bid $223.75| $254.80, $235.00
Price Total $19,326.0Q $22,400.00| $15,662.50] $17,836.00| $16,450.00|
138-803-185 G183 Toyo M503 784600 Firestone FD663 14 Ply Toyo M610Z 14 Ply 55652 Firestone FD663 16 Ply
Tread Design & Article Number 281-042f (281-042)
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Opened: November 16, 2009

City of San Antonio

Bid Tabulation

For: Emergency Tires
T&W Tire A to Z Tire & Battery, Inc. American Tire Distributors GCR Tire Centers Hesselbein Tire SW {Southern Tire Mart
5834 IH 10 East 812 West 4th, PO Box 9138 8531 N. New Braunfels. 17051 IH 35N 4823 Corner Parkway 6081 IH-10 East
A013-10 DDG Suite 100
San Antonio,
Est. |TX 78219 Amarillo, San Antonio, Schertz, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Item Description Usage [210-210-661-8271 TX 79105-9138 TX 78217 TX 78154 TX 78219 TX 78219
G 1|12R22.5, 16 Ply, Load Range H, Steering Axle 70 .
Price Each $283;5 $345.00) No bid $243.75 $276.50] $255.00)
Price Total $19,850.6 $24,150.00| $17,062.50| $19,355.00| $17,850.00|
Tread Design & Article Number G149 138-864-18 Toyo M320 78460 Firestone FS560 16 Pl Kumho KRS02 16 Ply 1647313 Firestone FS560 16 Ply
156-523| (156-523)|
H 12R22.5, 16 Ply, Load Range H, Drive Axle 70
Price Each $360.00] No bid $305.75) $285.00] $318.00)
Price Total $25,200.00) $21,402.50 $19,950.00 $22,260.00)
Tread Design & Article Number Toyo M506 784195 Firestone FS560 12 Ply Kumho 943 16 Pl Firestone FD663 16 PI,
151-009| 1251713 (151-009)
1 225/70R19.5, 12 Ply, Load Range F, All Position 12
Price Each szw.o& $190.00) No bid $152.75) $179.34] $165.00]
Price Total $2,616.01 $2,280.00] $1,833.00 $2,152.08] $1,980.00|
Tread Design & Article Number G670RV 139-418-05 Toyo M143 562144 Firestone FS560 12 Ply Toyo M143 12 Ply 56214 Firestone FS560 12 Ply
160-716| (160-716)
V. Labor, Delivery and Service
A Standard Labor rate per hour, M-F, 8am - 5pm $60.0q No Charge| No Charge| $45.00| No Charge| $45.00|
B After hours rate per hour, to include City Holidays $90.0q No Charge| No Charge| $75.00| No Charge| $72.00]
c Mileage Charge (if applicable) No Chargef No Chargel| No Charge| $1.00| No Charge] $1.00|
D Service Charge for Flat Repair $2 0 No Charge No Charge| $22.50 No Charge| $20.004
Service Charge for Flat Repair, after hours to include
E City Holidays $5 0 No Charge| No Charge| $22.50( No Charge| $20.00|
Delivery 3 oays| 1 Day| 1-2 Days| 1-5 Days| Twice Daily! 1-3 days|
Payment Terms Net'.3d Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 1% 10 Days|
Estimated Annual Total $375,961.1 $359,154.00| | U $305,341.50| $336,683.46] $353,833.00)
Total Annual Award $375,961.12

Deleted: Item Il - Item no longer needed
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 16, 2009
For: Emergency Tires
Tire Centers, LLC Wingfoot Commercial Tire
[Systems, LLC
11589 Interstate Highway 35N {8477 NE Loop 410
AQ13-10
San Antonio, San Antonio,
TX 78233 TX 78218
Item Description
NAS NAS
L Firestone Tires
Discount Percent Off No bid| 0%,
A 1]295/75R22.5, 14 Ply, .oad Range G, All Position
Price Each No bid| $220.20
Price Total $1,321.20]
Tread Design & Articie Number Dunlop SP343 LR-G/14]
(271132585,
2|295/75R22.5. 14 Ply, .vad Range G, Drive Axle
Price Each No bid| $220.45
Price Total $1,322.70]
Tread Design & Artick Number Dunlop SP431 (271128195,
B Delete
[ Delete
D 385/65R22.5, 18 Ply, Load Range J, All Position
Piice Each g No bid $329.68
Price Total $3,956.16]
Tread Design & Articic Number Duntop SP231 (271131183,
E 315/80R22.5, 18 Ply, i.oad Range J. All Position
Price Each ‘ No bid| $281.80]
Price Total . $3,381.60
Tread Design & Article Number Dunlop SP345 (271113472,
F 425/65R22.5, 20 Ply, .0ad Range L, Alt Position
Price Each ’ No bid $349.13
Price Total $3,491.30)
Tread Design & Artick Number Dunlop SP281 (271131487
G 1 [11R22.5, 16 Ply, Loac Range H, All Position
Price Each No bid $222.44
Price Total $15,570.8
Tread Design & Article Number Dunlop SP160}
(271108673)|
2[11R22.5, 14 Ply, Load Range H, Drive Axle
Price Each No bid $224.44
Price Total $15,710.80)
Tread Design & Articliz Number Dunlop SP431
(71127773,
H 1 [12R22.5, 16 Ply, Loac Range H, Steering Axle
Price Each No bid| $306.23)
Price Total $21,436.10
Tread Design & Article Number Dunlop SP581
(271110978
2|12R22.5, 16 Ply, Load Range H, Drive Axle
Price Each No bid| $291.27,
Price Total $20,388.90)
Tread Design & Articic Number Dunlop SP832]
(271122579,
1. Deleted
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 16, 2009
For: Emergency Tires
Tire Centers, LLC Wingfoot Commercial Tire
Systems, LLC
11589 Interstate Highway 35N [8477 NE Loop 410
A013-10
San Antonio, San Antonio,
TX 78233 TX 78218
Item fescription
. [Michelin Tires ;
Discount Percent Ofl 50% less $5.00 No bid|
A 1 ]295/75R22.5, 14 Ply, L.oad Range G, Steering Axle
Price Each $326.67] No bid
Price Total $1,960.02
Tread Design & Article Number XZE2 #5589
2|295/75R22.5, 14 Ply, ‘_oad Range G, Drive Axle
Price Each | $326.67] No bid|
Price Total $1,960.02
Tread Design & Article: Number XZE2 #558951
B LT235/85R16, Load Range E, All Position
Price Each . $123.89 No bid
Price Total $11,150.10
Tread Design & Articiz Number LTX M/S #07367
H
[o] 385/65R22.5, 18 Ply, ".oad Range J, Steering Axle
Price Each $469.62, No bid
Price Total ¢ $5,635.44)
Tread Design & Article, Number XFE#36991
D 315/80R22.5, 18 Ply, i.oad Range J, Steering Axle
Price Each i $421.40) No bid
Piice Total $5,056.80
Tread Design & Article Number XZUs #9090&
E 425/65R22.5. 18 Ply, .oad Range L, Steeting Axle
Price Each $477.33 No bid
Price Total $4,773.30
Tread Design & Articie Number XFE #1 182%
F 1 |11R22.5, 16 Ply, Load Range H, Steering Axle
Price Each $295.51 No bid
Price Total g $20,685.70]
Tread Design & Article Number XZE2 #6704q
2|11R22.5, 16 Ply, Load Range H, Drive Axle
Price Each $295.51 No bid
Price Total $20,685.70}
Tread Design & Article Number XZE2 #67042
G 1 |12R22.5, 16 Ply, Loac Range H, Steering Axle
Price Each $348.30) No bid
Price Total $24,381.00|
Tread Design & Articlk: Number XZE #8533%
2|12R22.5, 16 Ply, Loac Range H, Diive Axle
Price Each $350.33] No bid
Price Total $24,523.10,
Tread Design & Articiz Number XZY3 #47974
H 225/70R19.5, 12 Ply, !.oad Range F, All Position
Price Each $221.14] No bid
Price Total $2,653.68]
Tread Design & Articla Number XZE #81473)]
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Opened:
For:

November 16, 2009
Emergency Tires

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Tire Centers, LLC

11589 Interstate Highway 35N

Wingfoot Commercial Tire
{Systems, LLC
8477 NE Loop 410

A013-10 )
San Antonio, San Antonio,
2 TX 78233 TX 78218
Item ‘;escription
I LT245/70R17/ENT, 1¢,Ply, Load Range E, All Position
Price Each $142.19) No bid
Price Total E $28,438.00]
Tread Design & Article Number LTX M/S 2 #38161
J LT245/70R17 LRE LTX, Tubeless, Steel Belted,
Highway Rib
Price Each L $142.19 No bid
Price Total $28,438.00}
Tread Design & Article; Number LTX M/S 2 #3816
. Goodyear Tires
Discount Percent Off No bid 42% Medium Trucl
50% LT Radi:{
A 1 1285/75R22.5, 14 Ply, L.oad Range G, Steering Axle
Price Each No bid $268.33)
Price Total . $1,609.98|
Tread Design & Article Number G661 HSA (756-817-337)
2|295/75R22.5, 14 Ply, :, 0ad Range G, Drive Axle
Price Each No bid $262.35]
Price Total $1,574.10)
Tread Design & Article Number G182 RSD (756-315-200)
B LT235/85R 16, Load Range E, All Position
Price Each 3 No bid $100.60
Price Total $9,054.00
Tread Design & Article Number Wrangler SR-A (179-745-217),
Cc 385/65R22.5, 18 Ply, .oad Range J, Steering Axle
Price Each No bid $361.10]
Price Total $4,333.20]
(G286 SS (759-315-200;
Tread Design & Articie Number
D 315/80R22.5. 18 Ply, i.oad Range J. Steering Axle
Price Each No bid $332.17|
Price Total $3,986.04
Tread Design & Artick: Number G291 (756-254-420)
E 425/65R22.5, 18 Ply, ..cad Range L
Price Each L No bid $398.00
Price Total $3,980.00
Tread Desigh & Artid: Number G286 SS (759-313-200)
T
F 1 |[11R22.5, 16 Ply, Loaci Range H, Steering Axle
Price Each : No bid $284.30
Price Total $19,901.00]
Tread Design & Article Number G661 HSA (138-179-337,
2|11R22.5, 16 Ply, Load Range H, Drive Axle
Price Each No bid $262.34
Price Total $18,363.80

Tread Design & Article Number

G182 RSD (138-803-185;
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' City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 16, 2009

For: Emergency Tires
Tire Centers, LLC |[Wingfoot Commercial Tire
Systems, LLC
11589 Interstate Highway 35N |8477 NE Loop 410
A013-10
San Antonio, San Antonio,
TX 78233 TX 78218
Item Description
G 1[12R22.5, 16 Ply, Load Range H, Steering Axle
Price Each No bid $284.29
Price Total i $19,900.30]
Tread Design & Article Number G149 RSA (138-864-186
H 12R22.5, 16 Ply, Load"Range H, Drive Axle
Price Each | No bid $298.25
Price Total $20,877.50)
Tread Design & Article Number G182 RSD (138-302-669,
225/70R19.5, 12 Ply, | oad Range F, All Position
Price Each No bid $219.50
Price Total $2,634.00]
Tread Design & Article Number G670RV (139-418-050,
V. [Labor, Delivery and Skrvice
A |Standard Labor rate ppr hour. M-F, 8am - 5pm $50.00} $76.50]
B After hours rate per | : i, to include City Holidays $85.00| $103.50]
[o] [Mileage Charge (if api:ticable) No Charge| $1.00|
D Service Charge for Flat Repair $5.00] No Charge|
Service Charge for Flit Repair, after hours to include
E City Holidays ' $5.00f No Charge|
Delivery 1-3 days| 7 days
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30

Estimated Annual Tot:!

[Total Annual Award |

Deleted: ltem li - Item no longer neéded
'
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City of San Antonio

Contract Summary Sheet  Date: 3/04110

Agenda Iltem: 5985

Name/Title (Caption as shown on agenda):
Maintenance of Aviation Department Parking System A1058-10 PC

Brief Description of Item(s) and Use:

This contract will provide the Aviation Department, Parking & Transportation Division, with a contractor to
perform maintenance, equipment repairs and provide parts for the department’s Parking and Revenue Control
System (PARCS). During regular service hours, services will include maintenance and repairs to ensure
proper function. During after-hours and holidays, services will include emergency on call services to ensure
prompt repair and recovery of the PARCS. This complete system processes the needs of approximately 2.5
million exit transactions annually.

Total $:

$139,000.00 annually

Contract Period:

Upon award through November 30, 2011 with 1, 1 year option to extend

Method of Procurement:

Competitive (2 bids received)

Price Trend:

15.43% increase due to the increased cost of labor

Contract Info:

Formal __ Annual X Support/Maintenance __ lLease

Recommended
Contractor(s):

ProTech Access, 4401 S. Pinemont, Suite, Suite 200, Houston, TX 77041
(MLWN)

Previous Contractor(s):

Federal APD Inc., 42775 Nine Mile Road, Novi, M| 48375 (MLWN)

Comments:

NAS: Federal APD Inc. does not meet statutory licensing requirements.

Antibifjaféa Future
Requirements and

N/A

Action:

Procurement Should this contract not be approved, more frequent parking system outages

Alternative: would occur resulting in a negative fiscal impact and declining customer service
levels. Existing Aviation Department maintenance staff would be diverted from
other critical Aviation maintenance needs in order to provide operation and
maintenance services for the Parking Revenue Control System.

Using Aviation

Department(s):




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 28, 2009

ProTech Access

Federal APD, Inc.

For: Maintenance of Aviation Department Parking System
A1058-10 PC {4401 S. Pinemont, Suite 200 |42775 Nine Mile Road
Houston, Novi,
TX 77041 MI 48375
ltem Description Est. Qty 713-776-8324 248-374-9600
NAS
1 |Preventative Maintenance- Regular Service Hours 9
Price Per Month $9,200.00 $9,200.00
Price Total $82,800.00 $82,800.00]
Term: (Upon award- November 30, 2010)
After Hours Maintenance 3 $175.00 $150.00
Price Per Hour $525.00 $450.00
Price Total
Term: (Upon award- November 30, 2010)
Holiday Hours Maintenance 3 $225.00 $200.00
Price Per Hour $675.00 $600.00
Price Total
Term: (Upon award- November 30, 2010)
Estimated Total Year 1 $84,000.00 $83,850.00]
2 |Preventative Maintenance- Regular Service Hours 12
Price Per Month $9,660.00 $9,660.00]
Price Total $115,920.00 $115,920.00
Term: (December 1, 2010- November 30, 2011)
After Hours Maintenance 3 $185.00 $150.00
Price Per Hour $555.00 $450.00
Price Total
Term: (December 1, 2010- November 30, 2011)
Holiday Hours Maintenance 3
Price Per Hour $235.0d $200.00
Price Total $705.0q $600.00
Term: (December 1, 2010- November 30, 2011)
Estimated Total Year 2 $117,180.0Q $116,970.00]
3 |Preventative Maintenance- Regular Service Hours 12
Price Per Month $10,150.0Q $9,752.00
Price Total $121,800.00 $117,024.00)
Term: (December 1, 2011- November 30, 2012)
After Hours Maintenance 3
Price Per Hour $195.00 $150.00
Price Total $585.00 $450.00]
Term: (December 1, 2011- November 30, 2012)




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 28, 2009

ProTech Access

Federal APD, Inc.

For: Maintenance of Aviation Department Parking System
A1058-10 PC |4401 S. Pinemont, Suite 200 {42775 Nine Mile Road
Houston, Novi,
TX 77041 MI 48375
Item Description Est. Qty 713-776-8324 248-374-9600
Holiday Hours Maintenance 3 $250.00 $200.00]
Price Per Hour $750.00 $600.00]
Price Total
Term: (December 1, 2011- November 30, 2012)
Estimated Total Year 3 $123,135.00 $118,074.00
4 |Catalog Parts Discount 20% 25%)

Catalog Price

Payment Terms

Lis

List

Net 30 2% 10 dayj




