
LOC; cab 
04/16/09 
Item No.8 

AN ORDINANCE '200 q - 04- 1 6 - 0 287 

ACCEPTING THE FOLLOWING BIDS TO PROVIDE THE CITY WITH 
THE FOLLOWING COMMODITIES AND SERVICES ON AN ANNUAL 
CONTRACT BASIS FOR FY 2009 FOR A COMBINED ESTIMATED 
COST OF $290,000.00, INCLUDING: (A) UNIVERSAL AUTOMATIC 
DOORS FOR AUTOMATIC DOOR MAINTENANCE; (B) S.W. PUBLIC 
SAFETY FOR POLICE VEHICLE GRAPHIC KITS; (C) BLOND 
LIGHTING & FIXTURE (ITEMS lA-H; 5A-H; 13A-F; 15.7-11, 15-19, 21, 
22, 24, 26-34, 36, 37, 40, 49 AND 51); CRAWFORD ELECTRIC SUPPLY 
COMPANY, INC. (ITEMS 3A-H; 11; 15.1-6, '12-14, 42, 43, 50, 54, 55 AND 
57-59); AND GRAYBAR ELECTRIC CO. (ITEMS 2A-H; 6-10; 12; 15.39 
AND 44) FOR ELECTRICAL PARTS AND FIXTURES; AND (D) R.R. 
BOWKER LLC FOR CATALOG ENRICHMENT SERVICES. 

* * * * * 

WHEREAS, the City is able to obtain significant savings by purchasing various materials and 
services on an annual contract basis; and 

WHEREAS, these bids are from various companies to furnish the City with: (A) Universal 
Automatic Doors for automatic door maintenance; (B) S.W. Public Safety for police vehicle 
graphic kits; (C) Blond Lighting & Fixture (Items la-h; 5a-h; 13a-f; 15.7-11, 15-19,21,22,24, 
26-34,36,37,40,49 and 51); Crawford Electric Supply Company, Inc. (Items 3a-h; 11; 15.1-6, 
12-14,42,43,50,54,55 and 57-59); and Graybar Electric Co. (items 2a-h; 6-10; 12; 15.39 and 
44) for electrical parts and fixtures; and (D) RR. Bowker LLC for catalog enrichment services; 
and 
WHEREAS, this ordinance approves 5 low bid contracts and 1 sole source contract; and 

WHEREAS, all expenditures will be in accordance with the 2009 budget approved by City 
Council; NOW THEREFORE: 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO: 

SECTION 1. The following bids arc hereby accepted, subject to and contingent upon the 
deposit of all required bonds, performance deposits, insurance certificates, and endorsements: 
(A) Universal Automatic Doors for automatic door maintenance; (B) S.W. Public Safety for 
police vehicle graphic kits; (C) Blond Lighting & Fixture (Items la-h; 5a-h; 13a-f; 15.7-11, 15
19,21,22,24,26-34,36,37,40,49 and 51); Crawford Electric Supply Company, Inc. (Items 3a
h; 11; 15.1-6, 12-14,42,43,50,54,55 and 57-59); and Graybar Electric Co. (items 2a-h; 6-10; 
12; 15.39 and 44) for electrical parts and fixtures; and (D) R.R. Bowker LLC for catalog 
enrichment services. The bid tabulation sheets are attached hereto and incorporated herein for aU 
purposes as Exhibit I. Copies of the bids are available for inspection in the offices of the 
Purchasing & General Services Department. 

http:290,000.00


SECTION 2. The bid from Dealer's Electrical for electrical parts and fixtures is hereby rejected 
for failure to sign the bid. The line items marked "NAS" on the bid tabulations for the bids from 
Crawford Electric Supply Company, Inc. and Graybar Electric Co. for electrical parts and 
fixtures are hereby rejected, since those bids for those line items failed to meet the City's 
specifications and/or requirements. 

SECTION 3. The amounts will be encumbered upon issuance of various purchase orders, and 
payment is authorized to various vendors. All expenditures will be in accordance with the FY 
2009 budget approved by City Council. The combined estimated cost for the contracts listed on 
this ordinance is approximately $290,000.00. 

SECTION 4. This ordinance shall take effect April 26, 2009. 

PASSED and APPROVED this 16th day of April, 2009. 

MAY 0 
PHfl HARDBERGER 

ATTEST: 

http:290,000.00


 
 

Agenda Item: 8   ( in consent vote:  8, 9, 10, 12, 13, 14, 17, 19, 20, 21, 22, 26 )

Date: 04/16/2009

Time: 11:32:23 AM

Vote Type: Motion to Approve

Description: An Ordinance accepting the following bids to provide the City with the following commodities and 
services on an annual contract basis for FY 2009 for a combined estimated cost of $290,000.00, 
including: (A) Universal Automatic Doors for automatic door maintenance; (B) S.W. Public Safety 
for police vehicle graphic kits; (C) Blond Lighting & Fixture (Items 1A-H; 5A-H; 13A-F; 15.7-11, 
15-19, 21, 22, 24, 26-34, 36, 37, 40, 49 and 51); Crawford Electric Supply Company, Inc. ( Items 
3A-H; 11; 15.1-6, 12-14, 42, 43, 50, 54, 55 and 57-59); and Graybar Electric Co. (Items 2A-H; 6-
10; 12; 15.39 and 44) for electrical parts and fixtures; and (D) R.R. Bowker LLC for catalog 
enrichment services. [Sharon De La Garza, Assistant City Manager; Janie Cantu, Director, 
Purchasing & General Services]

Result: Passed

Voter Group Not 
Present

Yea Nay Abstain Motion Second

Phil Hardberger Mayor  x     

Mary Alice P. Cisneros District 1  x     

Sheila D. McNeil District 2  x    x

Jennifer V. Ramos District 3  x     

Philip A. Cortez District 4  x     

Lourdes Galvan District 5  x     

Delicia Herrera District 6  x   x  

Justin Rodriguez District 7  x     

Diane G. Cibrian District 8  x     

Louis E. Rowe District 9  x     

John G. Clamp District 10  x     
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Exhibit I 

ANNUAL CONTRACT 
TABLE OF CONTENTS 

April 16, 2009 

COMMODITY 

Contracts procured on the basis of low bid: 

A. 	 Automatic Door Maintenance 
A074-09-AA 
Upon award through June 30, 2011 
with 2, 1 year options to extend 

B. 	 Police Vehicle Graphic Kits 
A1424-09-CC 
Upon award through June 30, 2012 
with 2, 1 year options to extend 

C. 	 Electrical Parts and Fixtures 
A391-09-LD 
Upon award through June 30, 2012 
with 2, 1 year options to extend 

MBE/WBE 

WBE 

RFCA#4782 

VENDOR 

Universal Automatic Doors 

Entire Bid 

Estimated Amount: $20,000.00 
annually; $80,000.00 contract period 

S.W. Public Safety 

Entire Bid 


Estimated Amount: $135,000.00 

annually 


Blond Lighting and Fixture 

Items: 1A-H; SAwH; 13A-F; 15.7-11, 

15-19,21,22,24,26-34,36,37,40,49 

and 51 


Crawford Electric Supply Company, 

Inc. 

Items: 3A-H; 11; 15.1-6, 12-14,42,43, 

50,54,55 and 57-59 


Graybar Electric Co. 

Items: 2A-H; 6-10; 12; 15.39 and 44 


Estimated Amount: $100,000.00 
annually 

RFCA #4782 


http:100,000.00
http:135,000.00
http:80,000.00
http:20,000.00


Contract procured on the basis of sole source: 

D. 	 Catalog Enrichment Services 
AlOIO-09-LS 
Upon award through July 20,2011 
with 1, 3 year option to extend 

RR Bowker LLC 

Entire Bid 

Estimated Amount: $35,000.00 
annually; $175,000.00 contract period 

RFCA #4782 


http:175,000.00
http:35,000.00


City of San Antonio 

Contract Summary Sheet 

Date: 4116/2009 

Agenda Item: 4782 

Name/Title (Caption as shown on agenda): 

Automatic Door Maintenance A074-09 AA 

Brief Description of Item(s) and Use: 

This contract will provide preventative maintenance and repair services of the automatic doors for the Airport, 

Police and Library branches located throughout the City. This service is needed to maintain the automatic 

doors and extend their 0 erationallife. 


Total $: $20,000.00 annually; $80,000.00 contract period 

Contract Period: Upon award through June 30, 2011 with 2, 1 year options to extend 

Method of Procurement: 

Price Trend: 2% increase 

Contract Info: Formal __ Annual -L Support/Maintenance __ Lease __ 

Recommended 
Contractor(s): 

Universal Automatic Doors. 562 CR 112, Floresville, TX 78114 (MSWN) 

Previous Contractor(s): Universal Automatic Doors, 311 Breesport, San Antonio, TX 78216 (MSWN) 

Comments: N/A 

Anticipated Future N/A 
Requirements and 
Action: 

Procurement Should this contract not be approved, the automatic doors installed at various 
Alternative: facilities throughout the City would be repaired on an as needed basis. However, 

procuring these services on an as needed basis would jeopardize the periodic 
inspections currently in place that ensure the doors are not just problem free but 
meet the safet com liance standards. 

USing 
Department(s): Aviation, Library and Police 



CITY OF SAN ANTONIO BID TABULATION 

Opened: February 20, 2009 

Unlversal Autom.tic Doors 

AIl74-09 AA 562 CR 112 
FI::.le;,:;m=,.......--------------------....:;::::..--1Florasville,Tx 78114 

til 

IV 

V 

VI 

VII 

Deseliptlon 

Automatic Door Parts for Pit·Q-Matic & Stanley Doors 
Discount off price list 
Price schedule 
Effective date of schedule 
Labor rate per hour 
Labor rate for overtime per hour 

Automatic Door Parts for Keene Monroe Serie. 7000 
Discount off price list 
Price SChedule 
Effective date 01 schedute 
Labor rate per hour 
Labor rate for overtime per hour 

Automatic Door Parts for Besam Push·Buiton Swmging 
Doors 
Discount off pnca list 
Price schedule 
Effective date of schedule 
LabOr rate per hour 
Labor rate lor overtime per hour 

Automatic Door Parts for Dorma ES-A Movement 
Sensor Sliding Doors 
Discount off price list 
Price schedule 
Effective dale of schedule 
Labor rate per hour 
Labor rate for overtime per hour 

Automatic Door Parts for Door·O·Matic Push Button 

A·1 Auto<loor Systems, Inc, Torma. TechnolQ1liBS, Inc, 

110 Bianco Road 11603 Starcl1!st Drive 
San Antonio, TX 78212 San Antonio, TX 78247 

5% 25% 
Mfg, Lisl Mfg, List 

12009 
$49, 

$58,00 
$5a.oO 

$99,00 

5(1/9 25% 
Mfg, List Mfg, List 

2009 111/2009 
$49,95$58.00 
$99,00$58,00 

25% 
Mfg, List 

5% 
Mig, List 

2009 1/1/2009 
$49,95$56,00 
$99,00$56,00 

25% 
Mfg, List 

10% 
Mfg, List 
11112009 

$58,00 
2009 

$49,95 
$58,00 $99,00 

5% 
Mfg, List 

200!l 
$58,00 
$56,00 

25% 
Mfg, List 

5% 
Mfg, List 
1/1/20092009 

$49,95 
$58,00 
$58,00 

$99.00 

25% 
Mfg, Ust 

5% 
Mfg, List 
111/20092009 

549,95 
$58,00 
$56,00 

$99,00 

1 Day15 Days 

Doors 

Effective date 01 schedule 
Labor rate per hour 
Labor rate fer overtime per hour 

Delivery 

25% 
Mfg, ~ist 

2008 
$70,00 
$90,00 

Page 1 



- -

City of San Antonio 
Date: 411612009Contract Summary Sheet 
Agenda Item: 4782 

NamelTitle (Caption as shown on agenda): 

Police Vehicle Graphic Kits A1424-09 CC 

Brief Description of Item(s) and Use: 

This contract will furnish vehicle graphics and graphics kits for the purpose of identifying all Police Department 

marked emergency vehicles. These graphics and graphics kits will be applied to new vehicles brought into the 

City's fleet as well as for the replacement of damaged, worn or faded vehicle graphics and graphics kits. 


Total $: $135,000.00 annually 

Contract Period: Upon award through June 30, 2012 with 2, 1 year options to extend 

Method of Procurement: Competitive (3 bids received) 

Price Trend: New Contract - no price history available 

Contract Info: Formal Annual -1L SupporUMaintenance _ Lease 

S.W. Public Safety, 3370 Nacogdoches Rd., #168, San Antonio, TX 78217 
Recommended (MSWN)
Contractor{s): 

N/A 

Previous Contractor(s): 

N/AComments: 

Anticipated Future 
Requirements and N/A
Action: 

Procurement Should this contract not be approved, the Police Department will be required to 
Alternative: purchase these vehicle graphics and graphics kits on an as needed basis 

wherein increase costs due to non-contract buying could be realized. Lack of a 
contract could also affect delivery times of materials which could negatively 
impact the availabi lity of the City's public safety fleet. 

Using Police 

Department{s): 

http:135,000.00


City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: March 20, 2009 

Fo~ Police Vehicle Graphic Kits 

A1424-09 CC 

S.w, Public Safety 

3370 Nacogdoches Rd, # 168 

San Antonio, TX 78217 

Five Star Collision Center 

5712 Five Palms Dr. 

San Antonia, TX 78242 

Signs By Tomorrow 

100 Taylor # 103 

San Antonio, TX 78205 
Estimated 

Item Description Annual 
Quantitv 

(210) 590-9363 

1 

A 

VEHICLE GRAPHIC KITS 

2009 - 2010 Ford Crown Victoria 320 
Price Each $345.0( $375,00 $725.20 

2 

A 

Price Total 

MOTORCYCLE GRAPHIC KITS 

Police Motorcycle 15 

$110,400.00 $120,000,00 $232,064.00 

Price Each $290.0C $350.00 $380,25 

3 

A 

Price Total 

INDIVIDUAL VEHICLE GRAPHICS 

Badge & Patch Gold "Supervise(' 50 

$4,350,00 $5,250,00 $5,703.75 

Price Each $30,00 $40.00 $15,39 

B 

Price Total 

Badge & Patch "Patrol" 100 

$1,500,00 $2,000,00 $769,50 

Price Each $25.00 $40,00 $1.71 

C 

Price Total 

Badge Inserts (K-9, CRU, etc.) 150 

$2,500.00 $4,000,00 $171.00 

Price Each $3,00 $2000 $1,71 

0 

Price Total 

Driver & Passenger Rear Door 50 

$450.00 $3,000,00 $256.50 

Price Each $60,00 $8500 $151,25 

E 

Price Total 

Driver & Passenger Front Door 50 

$3,000.00 $4,250,00 $7,562.50 

Price Each $60,00 $145,00 $151,25 

F 

Price Total 

"Protecting the Alamo City" 50 

$3,000,00 $7,250,00 $7,562,50 

Price Each $20,00 $4000 $109,95 

G 

Price Total 

Trunk Lid - "POLICE" & "911 EMERGENCY" 50 

$1,000.00 $2,000,00 $5,497.50 

Price Each $20,00 $40.00 $92,26 

H 

Price Total 

12" Roof numbers 0-9 100 

$1,000.00 $2,000,00 $4,613.00 

Price Each $10,00 $900 $10.26 

I 

Price Total 

Front Fender" "SUPERVISOR" 50 

$1,000.00 $900,00 $1,026.00 

Price Each $20.00 $20,00 $18.47 

J 

Price Total 

Unit Identification Letters 1,000 

$1,000,00 $1,000,00 $923,50 

Price Each $1,00 $4.00 $0,55 

K 

Price Total 

Unit Identification Numbers 4,000 

$1,00000 $4,000,00 $55000 

Price Each $1,00 $4,00 $055 
Price Total $4,000.00 $16,000,00 $2,200,00 

Estimated Annual Total $134200.00 $171,650,00 $268,899,75 

Estimated Annual Award $134,200.00 

Prepared by Purchasing 3/26/2009 



Date: 4/16/2009City of San Antonio 

Contract Summary Sheet Agenda Item: 4782 

NamelTltle (Caption as shown on agenda): 
Electrical Parts and Fixtures A391~09 LD 
Brief Description of Item(s) and Use: 
This contract will provide the Purchasing & General Services Department, Facility Services Division and Parks 
and Recreation Department with electrical parts and fixtures on an annual contract basis. These parts are 
needed to support the repair and maintenance of City facilities. 

Total $: 

Contract Period: 

Method of Procurement: 

Price Trend: 

Contract Info: 

Recommended 
Contractor(s): 

Previous Contractor(s): 

Comments: 

Anticipated Future 
Requirements and 
Action: 

$100,000.00 annually 

Upon award through June 30, 2012, with 2, 1 year options to extend 

Competitive (4 bids received) 

9% increase due to the rising cost of raw materials needed for product 
manufacture. 

Formal _ Annual ~ Support/Maintenance _ Lease 

Blond Lighting & Fixture, 620 E. Dewey, San Antonio, TX 78212 (FSWN) 
Items: 1A-H; 5A*H; 13A-F; 15.7-11,15-19,21,22,24,26-34,36,37,40,49 and 
51 

Crawford Electric Supply Company, Inc., 2510 East Bitters Rd., San 
Antonio, TX, 78217 (MLWN) 
Items: 3A-H; 11; 15.1-6,12-14,42,43,50,54,55 and 57-59 

Graybar Electric Co., 4503 Perrin Creek, San Antonio, TX 78217 (MLWN) 
Items: 2A-H; 6-10; 12; 15.39 and 44 

American Light, 10615 Sentinel Dr., San Antonio, TX 78217 (MSWN) 
Consolidated Electrical Distributors, 102 E. Josephine, San Antonio, TX 78215 
(MLWN) 
Dealers Electrical Supply, 2510 Bitters Road, San Antonio, TX 78063 (MLWN) 
Graybar Electric Co., 4503 Perrin Creek, San Antonio, TX 78217 (MLWN) 
Summit Electric Supply, 2401 Brockton Drive, San Antonio, TX 78217 (MSWN) 

NAS: Dealers Electric Supply did not sign bid, Crawford Electric Supply 
Company, Inc. and Graybar Electric Co. did not provide net prices as specified. 

N/A 



Procurement 
Alternative: 

Should this contract not be approved, the City will be required to purchase items 
on an as needed basis wherein increased costs due to non-contract buying could 
be realized. Lack of a contract could also affect delivery times of materials; which 
could cause possible delays in completion of City projects. 

Using 

Department(s): 

Purchasing & General Services and Parks and Recreation 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opllnlld J/jInuljll)' JO. 200Q 

For: EI.ctrlcal Parts &. Flxturu 

Blond Lighting & Fixture GrlilybAf EIIII"\ri~ Co CraWford t:.1&etrlc Supply DelillllH8 Elol;\ric;al 
COI11pany, Inc. 

A391-0e JW 020 E" O.IMIIY 4503 Pll!ltr In Creek. 2510 Elillt Bitt." Rd, 2400 Freedom 

san Arltonlo, TX SAn Antonio, TX Siln Antonio, TX San AntonlQ, TXUnit ofD..crlptlon 162,:Z 78217 78217 78217M...ur. 

CuU.r Hamm. r 
A. Circuit Bresk.ere, one & two pole, 12o/NoV AC, 20-100 Amp, plug-on 

25% No Bid NoBld 

Ptoduelldl!Pl'lune.tlot, (MfJ'.J 
F'l!Irt:;l!Iti.tofdl~ounlotter&d 

Cuthu-H;tImmer 


Typll pril:01I5cl'lll!lduh!l (dl!llilet,jobbelr, !!Itt;) 
 PfI,f."..dVlllnQor I..istlng 

Prlc;lIlIc;nlldl,JlII number 
 10101106 

10101108 

Prlc. Ben.dlll. cQh.Jrnn on 'Nhicn di"col,lnt i. b\lsiKI (I • , di"tripl,llor, n.t, 001;11111101111) 

Oilt. CJfprll;.ach.dl,Jl. (l;IIhl$\) 

NIA 

B. Circuit BreaKers, one &. two pole, 120/240V AC, 20·100 Amp, bolt-on 

Pllrcl!ttltot'dle;eourltofferl!ld 
 25% NoBid No Bid No Bid 

Product Idel1l1fitiatlorl (Mfr ) CuUlu-H.1imml!tt 


Type price schedule (de;!!1 er, Jobber, I!!lc.) 
 pr.f9rr.dVIIII1Qor l-ililing 


pri!;111 ~chlKll,Jllli nl,Jml:Jer 
 10101108 

DOIIIIII of pric. 'l;Ihedule (III lest) 
 10101108 

NIAPrice !!chedule column on oM\i~h dle;counlle; bee;l!!d (l.1!! , dle;trlbutor, Mt, OOole 8ale) 

C. Cln::;ull Brelilk-I!!r!!, Ihrl!!e poll!!, 240/eOOV AC, 15-100 Amp, plug-on 

Percenlof dll!lcouritolTetl!!ld 
 25% No Bid No Bid NoBld 

Produciiderlllncatioll (Mtr J Culll!tr-Hammer 


TYPIII pric. ,chlldule (deOiller, Jobber, elc.) 
 Pr.f9rr.d V.nQor l..i"ling 


Price echedule number 
 10/01108 


OIfl\l!lofprICI!!e;CMdUII!!I(latest) 
 10101108 

PrlcllI Bchl!ldule column on which discount II ba8ed (1.111, dlilrlbl,tlor, n.I, OOollll~itle) 
 NIA 

O. Circuli arukers, three pole, NMIOOVAC, 15-100 Amp, boll-on 

Plllrceni of dIscount olTl!!red 
 25% NoBld No 91d 

Product IdenlificaUori (Mft.) CLtlllllr~Hllmml!!r 

Pr."'rr.d V.ndor I-isling 


PrlCIII ,ohlilQl,Jlo numbor 

Typll price ,chedull!! (deallilr, jobbl!!r, I!!II:.) 

10/01 lOS 

Ditllll of ~Icill ich.dl,Jl. (1IiIt.5t) 
 10101108 

~rlce sehedule column on which dlicounlli b88ed (I.•, dlalrltll,tlor, n.t, 0001..511.) 
 NIA 

1:.. loadcenterswith breakers 

Percl!tnl of dlscourlt offered 
 No Bid Noeld No Bid 


PfI;;II::lut;llt::Ianlifil;;!!lion(Mfr ) 

Type price IIchedule (dellll!tr, jobbl!!l, I!!tti.) 
 Pr.f9rrItQ Vendor Ullting 


Price sehl!ldull!! rlumber 
 10/0'108 
10101108 


Price IIchedule Coli..lhirl orl which dlscourlt Ie besl!ld (I.e. dIstrIbutor, MI, OOole 8ale) 

Dli<tI!t of price sel'llllldule (latest) 

NolPrevld!ld 

Panelbo"rd a with br.it k.re 

Percenl of dlicol,Jnl off.,.d 
 25% No Bid NoBld NoBid 

Produclldentlficittlon (Mfr,) CUller-Hammer 


Type prlcl!! ~hedull!!l (dealer, jobbl!!lr, I!!Itc) 
 PrefltfredVendor lietlrig 


Pricill ,chlKll,Jlo nl,lml:ler 
 10/01/08 
10/01108 


priCIll Iich.QI,tI. Qoll,trnn on which t::Ii,t;ol,lnl is bllsed (1.1t, di,tribu\cr, nel, ....tIoll!!l!Iall!t) 

Olill., ofprlc. 'l;h.Qule(llIlellt) 

NIA 

S'Mtches 

Percent ot discount offllred 
 25% No aid No81d No Bid 

Product Identlflcatlon (Mfr,) Culler-Hammer 


Type price schedule (deal er, jobber, .IC,) 
 Prl!!'effedVeMor listing 


PrlCI!t I!Ichl!tdull!! rlumbl!lr 
 10101106 


Dati!! o'prlcl!!e;chedUII!!(lall!tst) 
 10101108 
NIAPrlcellchl!ldull!! columrl Oil which dlscourlt Is basl!ld (l.e. distributor, net,OOolesale) 

H, Molor Con trol 

P.rcllnll;lf di'CQunl off!lred 
 25% No Bid No Bid No6id 

Prodl,lQtldantific;illion (Mfr) 

Type prlcl!t schedule (deeler, Jobber, etc.) Prei"l!!rrlildVl!trldof Ul!ltlng 


Pric!lschedule number 
 10101108 

DIIIIII of pfiC. ,cheQule (Iii lest) 
 10101108 

Pric!! ,chedule column on whIch dl,count II!I blll!led (l.I!!., dhlll'lbutor, rll!!l, >M'H:Ilesall!t) 
 NIA 

8ql,l.r. "D" CQmpwny 

Circuli 9rl!teKerS, Orll!t & two pole, 120/24oV AC, 20-100 Amp, plug-on 

Pt!lrcehlofdll!lcourilolTl!tted 53.1.tI% 815% 

PrOdlJCI Idl!!nllficll.t10tl (Mfr J Square ( Squll.fl!t [) 

Type prlcl!t ~hI!Idule (dl!!laler, jObbl!lr, 1!!l1e.) U.S Communities OI!!Iall!!l 

Prltil!t I!Ichedull!t rlul'l1b1!1r MA-15-43272-2 114 
DiiteofprlCI!I !lChl!tdull!!(latl!tsl) Miln::;h2007 

Prlcill iChlKll,JllliColl,Jmn on which dl,counl i., pilsed (I.e., dl,lI'lbu\cr, nel, ....tIolelilille) 

02101/08 
SO01740lGI;::STUST L.isl 

6, CirQuit i3rukClr, Ont:l 5. ~ pole, I~O/~40V AC, ~0~100 Amp, bolt-on 

1 
 NoBld No 91d 31%P.rcllnt of diicol,tnt off.r.d 

Square [)S:~~;:71. Product IdentU'caUon (Mfr ,J 
U.S Communttl.1iI Deale.r;3 TyPill price 8chedl,tle (d.al.r,jobbill-r, IIItC,) 

MA·IS·43272·;2 174 

5 
4 Price achadul. number 

02101/08 March 1.001 D"t. ofprlc. ich.dl,tl. (1IiIIe~l) 
500114 DICEST LIST Ue;1e Price IIci"1ed(II. column on which diico(mlli b",.d (1,111" dlilrlbl,tlOf, n.l, OOola.itllll) 

C. Circuli arellker~, Ihr_ pole, 24 0/800V AC, 15-100 Amp, plug-on 

Perc!!nl of dillcoun I offered 
 NoBld 53.28% 38,5% 
Produc;lldentificllUon (Mfr) Sql,tllr lt [ Square D 
TYPII price ,ch.dl,Jl. (d."I.r.lobblllr, .tc,) U.S Communiliall Dl!llill!lr 

F'rlcl!Ischl!!lduleriumbl!lr MA-IS-43272-2 174 

Date ofprlcl!!Ischl!!ldule (Iall!!lst) 02101108 Mit~h2007 

SQ01740lGESTUST 1..151Price schedull!!l column on OOlch dle;count Is based (I a., distributor, Mt, wholeiel.) 

Cit cull Bfell.k.I!!Irs, tI"Irl!tl!l poll!!l, 240f600V AC, 15-100 Amp, oolt-orl 

Pl!ttcl!trllofdll!lcoutllolTl!!lrl!td 
 No Bid NoBla No1 
Productldet1Uflca!lon (Mfr.) S:~Il.~~ 

US. COmn1unlllee o...llIIr 
Prltiee;chedUII!t nUmbl!tr 
Type p(lcl!!I schedule (dealer, Jobber, ete.) 

MA~IS-43272-2 174 
02l01l0S March 2007 

Price schedule column on which dl!ltiOUnll1!l bilsed i I!!. dl!llribulor, n!lt, WI'Ioll!tl!ll!ill!! 
Dille of price IIChedule (hililsl) 

SOD 174 pIG e:;ST LIST list 

F'raparad by Purchasing 31261200Q 

http:1IiIt.5t


City of San Antonio Bid T.bul.!iun 

Opened Jenuary 30, 2009 

EleGtrlcSupply 

ComPilny, Inc 
2400 FreedOli"l2510 Ealll a!lt6ra A.d.A3Qt·09 JW 

Slin Ant(;Jt1la, TXSan A"lllI"lio, TX 
78217 18217 

LO<ldt;~.'N!lI'lbrpken 

P1iucanl of ,h:count cffenm Noel 

Produc:;t idl!Jnf!tk;;,,'11;ln (Mfr.) 

TyPl' pm:. IWhodulo /doal4tf, jobbttr, 5\1;:.) 

Pr\1:;e m;hadule number 

Dab! or prICe 8enedule (Ie~!l;t) 


Price e.ehedulti eOlUllVl on lAtIlch d18~oum Ii!, baud 11.5, dil!ltribuWf, mit. wholollllla) 


P. Panelboatd8 wH.h break!!lnll 

F>«cent or dlaeuunl ot'I'ered 
 No Bid 

Productldet'lttne.atton (Mfr.) 


T:rw ~riee »cl'ltdloll. (delll er, jobber. etc) 


NoBI 

Pr'iea I!!ehadule number 
Olilt. of price sd,.-dlolle (llIItUt} 

Price "en.QuI. column on \\Ih~h dI"COUflt 18 bued (I e" dlatrlb'.JkI(, net, ""'o!&&ele) 


o. 
33% 

5(.IuaffiD 
NeBid 

Doal., 
17, 

Ml:rch2(!07 
U&t 

H 
N-oaldNaB!~ 

MA-IS·43272·2 

0111.; ofprlca M;hmiula (Iatets!j 
 Mtllt.ihW07 

PrIce aehetd!,l\6 colUmn on Ylihich di3COUI1t i~ MlW:Id (i 1:'" distriPvtQl', nel, wflOIllifill5l 

02101/08 
SqD 174 DIG EST LIST Llel 

3 Gln.ral Electrh: Comp.nv 
A Cin:::uite~.~., Or'4' 8. two pol•. 120'240V .i.C, 2()..l(lOAmp, plug"Ol'l 

1 
 No Bid 

:( 
No-Bid NoBl1."!~n1QfdIWCOlJ!'ltQtt.rlt(! "'% 

Gen.ral EJ.;;lri-=·THOI.. 

3 


PrQdu~t idw!t,1'Iciitlon {Mfr,) 
Buy Log-low& Mit(! VoIwg 


componenrn.& EQillpment 

F'rlCI1I ach&d\Jl!!I "IuJ"\'lbl!lt 


TVf14 pt1c. 1ehedIJle {deal.r, jobOOr, .tc.) 

BUYl 
Ol!!l8Dl!llte Ofprlcl!I ~ehadute (hlllft~t) 

Prlel!ll'lchedull!l columl'! tin -...v!"Heh dilltount III buttd (i.e" dlslr!butor, ~, ....,...$liIl.) 

Circuit BreakenJ, 0l11li & two pol a, 120f240V AC,20~1 00 Amp, bolto(ln 

ParOC!lnlof di5.Gol.on!offeretd 
 No BidNo~;d No Bid 
Produot idetnflfi" .. tion (Mfr.} 


Typ. prie. itCh.oul. (d...!.r. jobb.r, .".) 
 M&d, Volt. 
Equipment 


PrleellJ(lhetdule number 
 Buy log 

Date o! prlc.l'lehlMitto (lalMl) 
 01108 


PrIce IWhed..tk! column on which di50mmt 15 ba$tlCi (La, di$trlbvtQr, /'Wt, whQI,pl.) 
 Lie: 

Noeld 00% No Bid 
OeMf1il1 E:.!&Cu!c-THOl 

Buy log 
Buy log-LO'W" & Mad. Voltag 

Compon.nl!i & Eq\Jlprnll!lht 

Oat. of pric. 4CNtCWe (liI!fitl 

NoBld 

OltOS 

L.i~Prlc. $Chlltdule ~ollJfflflol1 ~hdj.e(Wl'\tl. bilaed\! e. di;trlbutor. net. whole sal.. ) 

o ClteoltBrUWII:, IhtM polo, 240ltiOOV AC. 1-5"100AlTlp, bolt'QI' 

Pli!!'"Gerrt of clISCOLm! ol'lltrmd 
 NaBid 

fl'toduel Idls'ILlIellllO!'! {Mfr.) 


No Sid 
GorIl!lr.tll':ll!Ictlle-1HOB "''' 

Type pl'i<'.a:t t>i!:hadula {dalilar, Jobbl!lr, a1[;.) 

Price &ehediJlo r\UJ"\'lbI!It 


Dirtt o1prlc.. 6chedule (Ialflsl) 

Prio. ;ehtdul. column on wrnoh dl8count Ill. butd (I.., aiellibutor, net, whoje S41e, 


E LOi!dc.nter Il with breakerll 
1 Perc.n!Qfqi!'.lQQunloff.,.~ NaBid 
2 Prodwcl identit'h:;allon (Mfr.) 


;,1 
 TYP4:;Jrie.JC"'d,,!.(d~.,.,jobb4r .tc) 

4 
 Pril;iIII~tt.d"I. n"mb..

NoB,d NoBld 

NaBld 

No Bid 

Datl\t of prin 8ctad"l. (liI!.~t) 


Prle••c~ column 00 which OIacount Il!i r.a8fld Lit., distributor, not. Whaleule 


51.82% 

01108 

LI 

Prepared by PlJt~l'\ell:ll'!g 3/2612009 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Siond ligh~"g " FlxtUf9 Grayb<H Electric Co. CfllWford EklielltC SupPly O&tlets 8eewa! 
COO'Ip.r.y. rnc 

A391-09 JW 621>E.Dftrfty 4603 Pert hi Cr'eek 2510 ibM Billit!'e Rd. :1'400 Fr-.lcrn 

$a'! AntDnlo, rx SilmAntonio, TX San"'nlOrno,1)(
DNertptlon U""'" 76212 7$:;117 76217M...u!\t 

"~rl¢ (FPE) 
A, II & two PQl •• 120/240'1 AC, 20-100 Amp ph.JQ--On 


P«eel'lt of diuount off1!II'od 
 NoB!d No Bidm. No BId 
Fl';IIdlllil'aI Pacriil; 


TyPe pr~ 6Che<Jt.de \0",& Jobber, etc,) 

PfOOuclldMIUt'leatlOt'! (Mfr.) 

'0",",.,
Price uhlid..d* hUmber 

NIA 

Price 8chedule eolw'tifl on v.t.Ieh tRSQourn IS bIII!IIlIid (1,8., 41$lrlbl.rtof, net, v.tIol$ulej 

Date 01 price eeNldUI& (hiU!lItj 

NI 

Clrclllt Breakers, one.& two pole, 1~4QV Ai;;, 20·100 Amp, bQ/Hm 
¢oereel'l! of dl~Elunt ~ Noeld No Bid 

Ptodvettd6t'lUtklttJDn (Mfr.) 
2>"1. NoBle 

Fedivlll Pll(:ifio 
J..... 


Pr-ICft ~h.;ylit I')I,IfT1I;Mtt 

ryptl~~dUh!'fd.III.,.,jol:lbtr, .w,/ 

All PP pl,.lrct151Il9l> Ihrv Sroker 

Dlllt..of priCt $ChfdI!. t.a teal) 


Nt 
Nt 

PriGD :schedule cl)!WI'\I'I Q(l wnh;;h dl,c;Qunt 18 baaed {I e., dieitib\.Aor. not, wholDlilIlej 

C. CltGult Bruker" thl'ft JWIt', 240/000VAC, 15-100 Amp plug-on 
NoQidNi:lBld 

Pate r:I pnCtt ~h.dl,ll. (Ia t4iGt) 
Pne. IChtQ\.II, coh,rnn on ~ch !:1ist:iCUllt t&l:!-\8&d ii.e., di~trlbulor, milt, wholIliH~) 

Cin;:\,ul Br..k~5, three pol&, 240/000\1 AC, 15-100 Amp, boll-on 
Pa~nt Qf QliWYnt offered NI!tBld Nolh:l 
Prodl,Jet iI;:IfJI1\dic;;atlQO (Mfr ) 
Type price &Ch,dule (dhh!lf. jclbbtV. etc.) 
Pri~. :Klhtdul. number 
Oill. of prlc. 6ChedUito {liHeet) 
Pne. Khtdl,.l!. column on wf\iehdil'let.lur.l 18 MIl6d (i,e, dIWlbi.rlDr, n.t. ~.nll.) 

No Bid 

E. lG6dcMlSftl With breakers: 

Pere.nt 01 d!6I";OUf\l oft'erod 
 No Bid 
Produ1:t Ii:h!!ntlf'ie etlon (Mfr.) 

NoBie 

r~prl¢Otl;ihedulo(f,iqI.r,jQbW, .to,; 
F'rleil !$CtmdUln rrumt-

Deta Of priM ~hl!lldukt (Iii h!llltj 

Price a¢h&dule column on which tlillcQl,.lfll j, baaed (Le .. dleifibuW. MC, v,nOleS:8.lej 


f". Panelbo.rd5 with brpk", 

PSftMt of discount ofhtrlIId 
 No Bid 
Proo..clldentlllcetiOn (M'!r ,J 

25% NoBtd 
Faderw PlIGjfio

J_Typn prlc.lIGhedulll (dHlw j~, etc.) 
Ail FP purCh<tllbll thru Brokllnl 


Date Of prlee: ~/'\l!Idule (1.ln~) 


PrIce acl'\lJdubJ l'Iumb6r 
Nt' 

PrIce scMduI4 eoh.Jh'If'I 0/1 which di"5count i, bQMd (t•. , d1itrlbutor, net, WOO<ftli&lej N/A 

o. ,sWltch&a 

Percent or dilSCOunt ottw.d 
 NoB!d 


ProdUct l(!entlt'IGatlon (Mfr.) 

2.% Noeld 

Fld.t~ PacffiQ 

TyPl'!l priM schedule ,dr:!alm, jobbtr, .11';·) 
 J.... 
Price Ilch6dull!!I IiUmber All FP pYn;Nalilll'lN Brokln 

Date of pri ..n !Iochadl,ll" (llJ"'t) 
 N/A 
price 5"hodulo coll,.lmn on >M-rich ,brount I, baaed (1.&.. dialr1bUtot, net, ~!mI,,) NlA 

H, Moten Control 
No Bid 

Product Idtll1ti1lo;tilon IMfr.) 
25% NoBlaPIMcef\t of d!scl!lutlt offnrod 

Fe<;Iwai Pacillc 

Ty~ Pfk.lcru.du" (des!er, lob~r, frlc.) 
 Jobbo 

Price &:;1'....ivhlJ rrumt .,11 FP pij/Vt1.ua1hru Brokefs 

Date 01 price a¢~ (Iltml) 
 NlA 

Price aei'l6dUl«o Miut'l'lt! 00 which dl"CCl1,lnt Iiii bfo1ilil.d (I.., dla!fibuWr. Mt WtOleye) 
 NlA 

£hu~t~lt.1 Mlltaliia Tubing ~ ElbO'i¥l 11/%" ..... ) 
A. Perenrd of di5Gount offlJttl4 
B. Pr(XIuci Idnntltk;!ltlon (Mk) All"'" 
C. TyPe price ~heclU!1I (d.nr, jobber, etc.) 
D. PIlt:.e IJcheduie numb IIIr 


D.Mn of prk. $(:Mdl,l!. (lat..l) 


Prif:e !JchtdlJl. ~oIWTln on v.n~h discount III tmMld (i 6, dtlltr.butor, nol. Whol4olilfo1ir.} 


G.!Ilvlnlu:d ftUOid Conduit. Nipples, Coupling." Elbows t112*....~ 
15%A. Plllr~lIIM1 of dilCount Qffwed 

A!Hod Products 


C Typ«o prlee !\;l'In/lduln (>:;Inaler, j,,~, .tc,) 

a. ProQl,l~lld.nritlctloon (Mfr,) 

Jobba 
01101/10ao Prj;;:. ;;c/'\"d\Ile number 

~" O;a:t.;!:;i pnc-" ,ot1edul" (18~6t) 011011109 

F Pric. K'Mdl.d. C'O!umn on'M\l{;h !tlleOOhI 1& hll&nd (1.1t., !;hlfibl,l\Q(, net, whoiHtlldo) 
 0"" 

• Rigid Ho~lic CQOdI,lII, Elbows, C<.uplln;a & Adaptftt• 

Coal f1IuIl1&% 

O~~~~i 
01/30109: 

DIstribUtor L1ift 

67%A P~j of diaeounl ott.r$d lS% 
Carl(ln6. PrQ':N1;1 ldentfficaUon (Mfr.) AlII.c Prod4lQW

J_ TrM'C. T~ pOG1!o 1!Ieh&dui& (~t. jobbelr. ~.) 
Alp..... 2-C4«5MSP 12107 

E Oat41 of pric. IiIGlIeduj~ {tStftt) 
D Pric. $c-ollidul. nurrbl\l¥ 011Q1iOO 

01/01 Ozm4JOS: 
an. lI~t:Prll:<l'1 ~h""di,i" ooIurr.n 00 ~h d/!ecunt III blillnd (I ,0., dl:sl.ributQr, 0.1, whoIeatle) 

Wlr~nt 0.",11'1•• (unrlton, Hull., ... PM !;If Equal} 
15~A> :12%A. Pm~t of diacount offwed 

BrYiIIM 
(;, Type prie6 1lCh6dUl6 (de.il!lr, jobbelr, .te.) 
B. PmdUQ\ ia.fltificRliQn (Mfr,) COop6t Wiring OoviCIlll!l 

Trade Sid PkQPHfemtd V~mIcr Ll 
'aPL 113$T 

0.1# of pric. l1Ch.~;1.d. (itlt.8t} 
NtAPrj". Kru.dvl. flUrrD8f 

00126)08N/ 
Sid Pk Prir;I:I 5[;htd1,l~ OQII.lmn on >MIlch dlacount Is bll!l!Id I.e., dl"trlbultv, "et, wtwlei-ille One 

http:Pfk.lcru.du
http:IChtQ\.II
http:6Che<Jt.de


City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Oponllld' JljlllL1l1ry ao, 2009 

Blond Lighting & flJdurl!! Oraybar Electric Co. Crillwfl;ll"d 1;;11II!;trlc Supply Delllll!lr!!; f:.lt!letrleal 

CompanY,lnc 

AM1-o9 JW i!i20 E O......y 4ijQ3pllrrinCreak 2510 l::a8t Bitters Rd. 2400 FrNdom 

n.m C••eriptlon 
Unit of 

M•••ur. 

581'1 A!'Itonlo, 1 X 
18212 

SliInAntonio, TX 
713217 

San Antonie, TX 
78217 

Sarl Al1toolo, 1 X 
18211 

" St••1Switch Box.., Outlet Box•• & Coy.r. (R.eo, St•• I City or Eql-l.I) 

A, p.r,..nt of dl:il;o~nt off'M"..d 10% 25%toe5% 
 10% 72% 

RACOB. 	 Prodl.lCtig,.ntlfil;liItion (Mfr,) COOpr!ll' Crou!!;I!!-Hlt'Id Steel Cit Appleton 
C. 	 Typl!t prl~1I l!K;hl!ldull!l (dl!l.ll!lt, Jobber, l!lte.) Pr.ftorr..dV.ndorU:it U S. Cammunl ~II!II Distributor Oi,tribl.ltor 

D Prico ~I;n.dula numb.r N/A MA·IS·4;:l272·2 CESCO OC-0806 
E. 	 Oillt.ofpnl;. ,ch.dul.(IIIIIII:ilt) NfA 02/011013 01/30109 08104/08 

O!r:stributor Llr!lt F. 	 Pri!;. 'l;h.dl.ll.l;ol~mn on v.nil;h dllil;o~n\ I, bIiIMd (I.." dl,trib~lor, n.l, whol.$iIIl.) 00. Vendors Best Pricelili\ Price 

11 	 We,tUH!ltptoor BoX,t. & COVI!tn (p*rr.ct-LlI'I*, Squ.t. [], R.co or E:qual) 
Pl!lr~l!Irit of dl8~OUrit ottert!ld 10% 35% 10% 24% 

Product Identlflcatlon (Mfr,) Mulbl!ttr Perfectlina RACORACO 

•. 

Di,tributor 
 Ba~eC. 	 Type price schedule (dealer, Jobber, etc.) JQbIJor/Pr.t.rred u.s. Commu!'Iltles 

O. 	 Ptlr::;e r!I~hl!ldull!l riuli1bl!lt 12101108 MA~IS-43272-2 CESCO 202340 
D.irte of prl~e r!I~ht!ldull!I (I,ttl!!st) 	 12101108 02101108 01130109 200• 
Prlr::;l1 r!lchedUII!I coluli1n on v.nl~h dlS~oUrit I!I; b,tr!ll!ld (I.I!I., dlsttlbutot, I'lI!rt, Wholl!ls~ll!I) 	 On. Vrmdorll a.$1 Price List Olstrlbutor List Bas. Prl,.. 

,. 8t••1EM T Compr...lon Co nneetor. .. Coup ling. (Mid.,....t or E Q\I.I) 
A. 	 Pl!!reenlo1 dlscou!'It offered 10% 25"1a to 65 10% 72% 
B. 	 PrcduclldllntlficaUen (Mfr.) Cooper Crouse·Hlnd StllllIl CII BtldQt!lpotl Appleton 
C. 	 Type price achedul. (dealer, Jobber, etc) Pl"llferrlldVllndor Llri u.s Communltlea OilltrlbutorOi8trib\~tQr 
D. 	 PriclIlIChedule numbl!lr N/A MA~IS.43272~2 CE:5CO DC.oOOS 
E. 	 Dlllte of pri~l!Is~hl!ldull!I (le1r!tr!lt) N/A 02101108 o1lJO/oQ 0810410S 
F. 	 Price r!I~l'rI!Idull!I colum!'l O!'l v.nlel'r dlseou!'lt Is besl!ld (I.e., dlr!ltrlbutor, !'let, Wl'lolesa!e) 000 VllndorliBesl Price LI!!r DIs1libutor List Pnl;o 

" Termln.I_, Conneotors. Cablll Tlea (P,rmdult Dr Equ..l) 

A. Rinlil Tlllrrnlnlll" vinyl in~ul .. ted 

Perce!'lt of discount offered 15% 43% 10% a5% 
Productlde!'ltlfleetlon (Mfr.) GlillrdlllYlr·ar:lnd Pandult NSI 3M 
Type prlee schedule (deal er. JObber, etc,) 	 Pl"llfr:lrrt:KIVllnda U.S. Communllll!!l1 Trllde 
Prl~e r!lcl'rl!ldull!l !'lumber 09lO11Oe MA-IS-43272-2 

DIs-tributor 
CESCO 001 

D,ttl!! of pfl~e r!I~hI!Idull!l (Iatl!!et) 	 OW01108 02101108 01130109 02/04107 
F'tl~e r!I~hI!Idull!l ~oluml'\ 00 Wl'rlel'r dlr!l~outlt Is basr!ld (I.e., distributor, I'II!It, Wl'rOles,tle) 	 Flv. V.nQor, Besl Prit;e Lillt Distributor Llat 31L1at 

B. 	 fatk Tl!ltli1lnelr!l, IIlnyll!'lr!lUI,t1r!td 

P~.nl of Qi,C;;O\.lnt effered 15% 4;:l% 10% ::16% 
PrQl;i\.lQtidlllnijfil;;rIlion (Mfr.) Gardr!r !'Il!rr-Bl!!l1d e Panduit 3M 
Type priclI IIchedule (de .. ler, Jebber, ete.) Preferrr!ldVendo U S, Com mLlnltiOll-

NS' 
Dilltributor Trade 

Price IIched14le riumbet 00101108 MA·Is.-4J27.N~ CESCO 001 
DIiIt. of prio. Kh.d~lo (1~1II.$t) 	 09101/08 02101108 011JOIOll 02104107 

Oi,tribtltorl.,l,tPrio. ,chlld\.lllll!;olumn on v.njr;lh QI'QQ\mt 1$ baMd (i,III, dl$trlb~l;I;Ir, nllt, wholll,iIIle) 	 filiI!! Vet'ldora Best Price list 31 Llllt 

Lor::;klng Fetk Tl!lrli1ln,tlr!l, III!'Iyllnaulated 
PercenlofQlsce\.lnteffered 	 15% 43% 10% 35% 
PreQud idllnl.jfrc.tian (Mfr.) Oardener-Bende Pillnr;!14lt 3MNS' 
Type prlclII schedule (de;i.ler, Jabber, elc;.) 	 Preferred Vendo U,S, CQmrnl,lnitrlll1l ~r!lttlbutot Trad@ 
Price schedulll number 09101I0a MA·IS·4327 2~2 CESCO 001 
DOllie efpricellchedule (lalDllt) 	 091l:)1/08 02101106 01130/09 02/04107 
Pril;. $!;h.d\.ll. c;;olurnn r;ln which dl~CO\.lnl is buad (i •. di,\rib14tor, nl:l1. whale,ale) rive Vendors B.at Pric. LI~t Distributorl..ist 31 List 

D. P·Conn $I;: rl:lW"on C r;lnnllctr;lr" nul stylll 

1 PII~.nl of di,counl of'flJ,rad 15% 43% 
 10% 35% 
2 Product Identlficlltlon (Mfr,) Garde ner-Bend e Pandult Id.ljllindiutrio~ 3M, Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) 	 Preferred Vendo U.S Communities Oi:itrlbr.llor Trade 

Price acht!ldule number 01illOl/0B MA-IS-43272-2 CESCO 001 
Date 01 price sehedule(la1r!tat) 09101108 02101108 01/30/Og 

•. 
02104107 

Prl~el5[;hedule ~olUm!'l On INI'Ild'\ dlr!l~O\Jnt Ir!I b,tr!led (Ie. distributor, !'let, wholl!llSall!l) Flv. Vendor, 6 I:I,t Price List DIstributor List 31 List 

C;i.bll!I Tles-Markl!lt Typit 
plIfljentofdlscountoffl!ll"lld 	 15% 43% 10% 35% 
Prod\.ll;t idontlfi!;liItion (Mfr ) l3er~ril!lr-aende P~ndult IQlllljlllnQLl5tr1e~ 3M 
Ty~ prl!;. Kh.d\.l11I (d.al.r, jobbor, 0\1;,) Prefl!ltn!!dVer'ldO u.S. Communities Oi~lriiJ\.l\QI" Tt..de 
PriCO'C~~1410 number OQl011OS MA·IS·43272·2 cgsco 001 
Dale of pricI:I IIchedule (IrlrlDllt) 00/01108 02101108 01130109 02104107 
F'rlce r!I~hedule ~oluli1!'1 on 1NI'I1~1'r dls~oU!'It Ir!I brlrr!ll!ld (I.e. dlr!lttlbutot,nl!lt,Wl'roll!lr!lrlrll!l) FI ....e V.ndor" eo,1 prlQlIIl..ist DIr!ltrlbutorLl!!rt 31 list 

Cable Tles-Salf lecklng Type 
Pet~ent of dlr!lcoU!'It offerl!ld 	 15% 4:;1% 10% 35% 
Pfodu~t Idr!tntlfi~atlO!'l (Mfr.) Ollrdenllr-B.nde PliIIl1dLlit Idl!lrlrlltidu!!rtl'll!Is 3M 
Typa priclIsc~edulll (deljller, Jobber, IIlc.) Prefl!lrrl!ldVt!It'Ido US. Communltln Distributer Tfr!rde 
Price IIchedule number OQ/01108 MA·IS·43::172·2 CESCO Not Pro ....ldt!ld 
Dr!rte ofprl~l!Is~l'rl!ldull!l (I,tter!lt) 00101/08 0;2101108 011301O9 02104/01 
Pllcr!r s~hr!ldull!I ~olum!'l O!'l ~Ich dls~oUrit Is basr!ld (I.I!I., distributor, !'Il!It, v.nole sale) FI", Vondor" 6.,1 pric;;e L.is\ DIr!ltrlbutorLi!lot 31 List 

" O.I.tllll'd 

15 	 Sp.cifi.d Itorna 
112" SIIIf:II fie.(lble ~ondult"iln!lenfil!lld, lOOn Call ClFT NAS NAS 
Net Price 142,80 Cost Plur!l22"(o $33,55 

!3rill1d Narn.of Itl:lm Ofh!Ir.Q AFC AFCTV arloua MIg. "~~~ AFC 
Pilirl Nl.lmiJor for erand Nllmo Off""'Q Commodity rll!lXst&r!r11/21001tColl Flox012 GRFO:;iO 

J/4" $Iellli fiell;iiJl.c;;ondult-.greCll1field, 100ft.. Coil. C/FT NAS NAS 
NOl Prlco $5980 CostF'lus22% S45,6g $45,66 
BrOllnr::l Name of ltam Offered AFC Mc+verloua Mfg. AFe AFC 
Part Numbllr fer Br .. nd Nrlrme Offered commodity Flexateel 314 100ft Coil Flax 034 GRF075 

1·· St&r!rl nexlble ~ondult-gr&r!r11f1eld, lOon Coli ClFT 	 NAS NAS 
Nr!rl PrI~1!I Slo8.00 Cost Plu, 22% $83,215 $8321 
Bland Nrlrlrll!lof 11r!t!'l1 Ofi'err!ld AFe AFC+Vario~s Mfg, AFC AFC 
P~rt Number lor Brand Name Offered 	 Commodity FI.x"lo.1 1 100ft CQil Flex 100 GRf 100 

1 1/4" Steel flexible cOMult-greenfleld, 100ft. Coli clFT NA. 	 NAS 
Net Priee $13900 Co~t Ply" 22% $113B6 $109.07 
BfliII'Id Name of l1r!tm Offered AFe AFC+Vllriau, Mflil. AFC AFC 
Pillrt Numb.r for Brand Nllm. Off.rlld Cornmodily Flllxllteel11/4100HCaii rlt!IX 125 oRF 125 

Prepared by Pu rChaaing 3/2rJ/2009 

http:Pr.ftorr..dV


City of S .. n Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Openea: JSl'mit")' 30, 2009 

'O'. El4M:tnc.a1 Parta & rtdun.'!!s 

BfM;;j LJghtlng & rlXtilre GrlJ.ybilir EI~tr!(l CQ. :Crawford Electric Supflly De_r, E1~lri,.~ 
Comp.-.:ny, 1m;, 

~l'OO JW 6:20 1.;. OlMltV 4503 ""em" C«M!». 2510EOI$tei".,.,R~ 

'tem OnerlpUo", 
Unitf)f s..n An\ontO TX Sirh Antonio. TX Silln Antonio, 1>: 

.....w. 1~212' 16211 18217 

ClFT -S2$.OO Cosl Plus 22% $224.42 

Item OfTeotad A'O APC'" VarioUlI Mfg. M'C 

Brand Nal'Yla Offered Comf'!1l'Jcli tV FI•.utN11 112 100ft COli GR;F 150 

2" SiQI flplbh& CoMUIt-gt64n!le!d, 100ft GQl!, C!1'"f HAS 
jllll!!! Pric~ $211<1.00 CollI Plull 2:2% 
Br1lnd NIII~ Qf I.", Offered AFC AFC+VwlQU5 Mfg. 
P'art Nl,IlfIwfor Snmd NaM6 OtT6h;d Commodity FI.QI..I 2 100ft Col! 

Wint, QOPPtr, ,0110, lHHN-THWN. '12, 6t:Kl wit, IlU colors. M/FT HAS 
Nat F'rlea Co!!.! Plu, i8% $68.95 $!;i3.ti 

Br;IInQ Name of Item Oftl!tred $Qy1P¥'.ir. VlVJOUe MfG J..rn.r!Cal'l Enc:ora 

Part NUlflberfut Bra'\d: Nar'l'll!! Cofffttou £:(lrnl'Tll.3dlty THHN 12 SOt. {Co/i1fl50OS _,2 THHN12S0L, 

Wire, eappflr. BUB/Idee!, THHN~THVVN, #12, e00 \toll, all t.a:lil!!nli """ HAs 
Net PrIce $5...0 CQ"i PII,JIII HI% $10.4::1 $58.70 

BrSM Namo Of If.orrI ort.r.c So,",",, Va;r'oulllMFG AM6rh:;a." e"""", 
Part Number for Br.nd N;IImllll Off.red CommoolW tHHN 12 STI't (Color} 500$ 1'MN12X Ti1HN12STR 

WIre, eOp;>09t, I!;trl'mded. THI-IN-THVVN, #14, 6 00 volL il1l c~, WIT NAIl 
NelPrl~«I $39.80 Co;l Plull '8% 
Bnllnd tome at It om Offer'; $oulhv.ire V6IIri¢u~MFO 

for 6rl!!I'd Name Offered COl'l'1rru:;dlty THHN 14 STRtCo'orlSOOS THN14>\ 

" ~\nI:ntlttd, THHN-THWN, 1m, 600 volt. biac~ MIn NAg HAS 
$1S6.5O CIJ"tPl~1e% $HI9.44 

$outTIv.1f V;IIIriQUlI M,cG MlfII'lt.:M 

Commodity THHN III Sm: BlK 500$ niNe 

" ,iIIVIM'\Q.d, THHN~fHWN, #2, 000 vpil. blll(:k MiFT N.... 
COltPiIJli 18% $n~,e9 $560.68 

VariO'.lsMF!] ~rlcan EMme 

THHN:2 Sf: bI.cl!. 500S THN2 THHN26K 

" ,!!IoHd. ROmtt:o:, ;;t:!-;rWlG, eoo \/€Ill "'l'T NA$ 
$147.00 COlt PllJI, 21% Me,sa $154.35 

Swthwlre V4rhJtJIlMJ:'G America!) Encore 

Coml'f\Odlty "1M WQ 11!2 250 C TN I<MX" NM122V¥G 

1J ,solid.~, #10-2 WIG, 000 vall WT NA. 
$238.00 CtlilltPIIJ,2:1% $2"'~ $2:44.88 

ScillhY,'im V!ilrlouaMFG Arnerli;"l"1 
CommQ4!ty NM WO 1012 250 C TN RMX101 

,. ,lKIIjd,~,#e. 2WIG,SOOwll MI!'T HAS 
$4HI.OO Cosl Plu; 21% $$5.07 $404.76 

""W,,"~ VllriOIJIIIMFO Amet-k;lIn """"Co,.,rruxtity NM lNG 6r.2 250 CTN I'M'''''' NMB2WG 

15 ,;~u.d, THHN-THwN, #10.600 volt ilh 0011)(&. HAS 
CollI Plus 1$% $109.28 ... 13 

Soutt'twlre ViilrlouaMFO AmtIril;'lIn """,,_ 
Commodity THHN 10 Su iColor) SOO S THNiO X 1HHN10STR 

'. ,eot!d, THHN-iHWN, .10, 000 \tolt all wore "in NA$ 
$7g,00 Coat ?lua: 18% $108.29 $e4,78 

Southwlr. Vllltlou!lMFG Arrterlean Ene.,. 
Commodity THHN 10 S .. ! CoIQr 600S lHt-.l10 THHN10SOl 

17 , lllran~. THHN·THWN, 16, BOO volt black M/f"T HA. NAS 
$239.00 CciatPlU81B% Im.53 

&wthwirD Verloue MfO Am4Iri¢!iln 
THHN" S;r b!eelo. 500 S THNI5 THHNOOK 

1$ , ;stranded, UF, 'tt~, 000 vtlIt MlH ..... HAS 
Co,tPha:32% No Bid $414.45 

Df Item Offeret:l &uthwlre V!ilrlouaMfG ErKlore 

tor Brand N.me OIfoulIil ComMOdity U'$'lI RHH 116 STR bl..,1;1!. 500 u... 

t. , Winded, THHNwTtiWN, 1'4, 000 \t0lt, blacll Mer - ...... 
S:31e.00 CosIPius14'Al $461AS $301.JO 

Sol.lthwire Varlou,MFG Amerleat'! E!Wofe

Com_' THHN 4 Sir:! bhllek. 'SOQS THN4 THHN48K 

20 

2\ ~f, wanded, THi-iN-iHWN, 2KllXXl v..lt, blaex NAIl 
1,0~'::>OO Cost PilJli 18% $1,400.00 $1.002,{)5 

Sooth>Mtl!!l Amaric .. n EhcOl'e 

Commodity THHN 2/0 THNOO iHHN 20 

22 ,IIII,rWl~, THHN-THWN, 110, BOQ volt. bI!ilck MH 
$&40,00 $1,122.12 :1802... 

SouthWlI1!l Am40rlcan 5m::or. 
Commodlt THHN 1/0 sm b;ack. 1000 ~ THNO TH..., 

Z1 

" ,8trahd~THHN.TI"IWN. 4.'0, fiOOvOlI, bS.a~k M/FT .... 
NelPrlee CD'$t PiU!I 18% $2,22447 51,100M 

Brillnd N'tm.Qf 1!1vn Oft'6t6d 5oulh'Aire Yllriou~ MJ:'(;i American Etlct:lte 

Part Nvmbw Qf Brllln<! Na rt\e on'cl!md ComtMdlt THHN 410 STR 81.K 1000R THNOOOO frlHN 40 

" O.....d 

" Wlr~, t>:Jppltl', ThfoIN, 250,000 MCM. bl.ol!. -N.tPdce 1,93{).OO toe!. PIUs 18% $2.035.71) $2,~~~~:!
'8rilnd lIIam. of Item on'!!Irl!ld 56uthwlre Vilrl"uaMPa AmeriQan 
;PIlrtNuml>erof Brand N.meOffl!!f~ Ccm'!modlt THHN ]SOMCM Str blk. 1000R THN250 THHN~' 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Open!ld Jlllnullry 30, 200e 

For ElectrlcQI PQrtli & Flxwrn 

Blood Llahtlna &, FlxMe Grljlyi;l!lrEI!ll;ltric Co Craw'l'ord E:.1&Ctrlc SUI)P/V 
Cot'npltotIY,Ir.c. 

JW 820 E. D ...... y 

f-1-"'-m--r----------o.-.-"-,.-u.-n----------.---,uc-nC-"-.'o--iSliln Antonio, TX 

w-.UR 78212 

A3el-09 

Si!IIn Antonio, TX 
7'B217 

2510 t:.astBltters Rd 

Sliin Antonio. TX 
78}17 

27 Wire, copP8r, THHN, 350,000 MCM, black 
N!ltPrlc!I 
Brand Nani!!lor ItI!tm Dft'l!Irl!ld 
P.1Iott Numbt!lt or Brat'ld Nlilltt'l!!l ot'I"!!Ir!!ld 

28 Wirlll, coppllr, THHN, SOO,OOO MCM, blllck 
N.tPrlc. 
BrAnd Nam. of It.m oo.r.d 
Part Number 01 Brand Name Offered 

29 Win!!, copper, aolld, THHN, #4, bare 
Nl!ltF'rlce 
Brand NlllTlIIIof It!lmot'l"lIr!!ld 
Pllrt Numb!!r of Brllnd Namll ot'I"lIrllld 

30 Wirlll, coppt:lr, ~olicl, THHN, 'B, bllrll 

N.tPrlc. 
Brilnd NIIITltIIQf ItllmOfflllr!!d 
P!lrt Num~r fQr 6rllncl Nllmo DffIirllld 

al Wire. coppllr, IJtrandl!!d, THW, 1114, bl;!lck 

N.tPric. 
arlilnd Nlilm. of Itllm OffiJ,rl!!d 
Part Num~r for Brand Nllml!! ot'I"l!!l"!IId 

32 Wir•. QQPpllr, IJlrlilndl!!d, THW, M;I, bilicli. 
NlltPric. 
Brllnd Nllm.of Ill!!rnDffllrl!!d 
Pllrt Numbtllr for Brllnd Nllm!!l ot'I"l!!l"IId 

a3 Rod, Ground 518" x 8', BI;!Ickburn 
NlitPriclI 
I3r,.m:jNilm"ofltl!!mot'l"l!!rlld 
PArt Number fQr Br"nd Nllm. OH.r.d 

34 Clilmp, GrQund Rod 5113'". Burndy, 
Net Price 
Brand Name of Item Offered 
PaltNumb6r 'or Brlilll'id Name Offered 

JC5 Bell ends, pvC, 4/1. 
NIII Prlcl!! 

Brand Name of Item Offered 
PQrt Number for Brlilnd Nilm. Offl9r.d 

a7 CilP, pvC, 4". 

N.t PMc. 

J9 CQI"In.ctor, Grounding, Surndy, 14·4T. PNKS20 
Nl!ltPrl[;!!I 

Brand Name of Item Offered 
Part Number for Brand Name Offered 

40 Connector, Grounding, Burndy, 14-1/0T, PN KS25 DB 

N.t Pric. 
!:IfaM Nam!!l of ItI!tm OfI'ered 
Patt NW'I'\b&r fot Bral'id NetTIe OHl!lr&d 

42 Glue, PVC 
Net Price 
Br;!lnd Nllmll 0' Ili!!m Offl!!rl!!d 
P;!Irl Numbor for Brllnd N;!Iml!! DffIirl!!d 

43 Lubricant, Wl~ Puiline 
Nl!!tPricll 
Brllne! Nllml!!of Itl!!mDfflir!!d 
Pari Numbt!lt 'or Brlind Nllml!! ot'I"l!!rl!!d 

44 LI-lg. Ground, j3lli1ckburn 
N&tPrlce 
Br...ndNllml!!oflt.rn~rltd 
Part Num~r for 6rilnd Nil mil OffIIr.d 

49 Contllct Clean.r, ,~ oz cans, CRC Industria! or equal 
NII1PrlcI!! 

BrAnd Name of Item Offered 
Part Number for Brend Na me OHered 

~ RTI.I Silil;:on. Adh.~I""liInd Sl!!iIllilnt. cllllllr Ie oz, c"n 
NetPrlcl!I 

Brllnd Name 01 Item Offered 
PArt Numberfur Brliloo Name Offered 

WFT 

MlFT 

WFT 

EA 

EA 

EA 

EA 

PT 

OT 

.A 

EA 

""s 
52,7QO,00 CoslPlu!! 18% 
SOl,lthwlrll Vllrloul!I MFG 

Commodliy THHN aSOMCM Sit blk 1000R 

$3,830.00 
50uthVvire 

NAS 
C08tPlu81e% 
Varlo\l~ MFGi 

Commodity THHN 500 MCM 5tr blK 1000R 

$389.00 
SOl,lthwir. 

Commodity 

$239.00 
50uthwke 

Commodity 

$369.00 
50uthwke 

Commodity 

$249.00 
Southwke 

Commodity 

$11,50 
Oenerlcltem 

Coml't'lodlty 

$1.89 
Glln.riclt!lm 

Commodlt 

$4.8 
Gi"n.ricl\!!m 

Commodity 

$11.50 
Gl!lnl!lrl[;ltl!lm 

Commodlt 

NAS 
Cost Plus 32% 

Vilrlou!l MFG 
BARE; CU SO 4 

NAS 
Co~t Plu~ :;12% 

Vilriou5 MFG 
SARI;; CU SO 6 

NAS 
C08t Plu~ 24% 

Vlilriou5 MFG 
THW 4 STR BL.K 1000 R 

NAS 

VlilrioulJ MFG 
mW fI STR BI-K 1000 R 

NAS 
Co~1 Plus 25% 

I;;rilech 

6158eO 

HAS 
Coe;t Plu s 25% 

BI.eckburl'l 

G' 

""S 
C08t Plu~ 1'1% 

PVC ItI!tm 6 
igell-End-4 

NAS 
Coe;t Plus 19% 

PVC Item 8 
CAP4 

stag $1.47 

ILSCD Burndy 
IK-4! _____..LK5il.l20~ 

NAS 
i3 96 B Column ·50% 

IL.SCO l3urndy I-U95 & Conn!lctors 

!  _____""IK;;;".:.:":::j0 KS250B 

""S 

$3,e84 78 
American 

THN350 

$5,OB677 
Ah"'lI!lI'It:;illlt'I 

THNSOD 

5461.48 
American 

BAR4 

$263.1B 
Amerlcal'l 

BARs 

No Bid 

NoBla 

S&e Sehl!tdule 
Erltl!tcl'l 

GLV5I8 x 8' 

""S 
See Sch.dyl 

NSI 
GRC·58 

HAS 
SI!!I!! Schi!!dul!! 

"AS 

PVC 
PVC4QOEHi 

s.. Sch.dul. 
PVC 

PVC400CAP 

NoBld 

No Sid 

No Sid NA~05t PIUI!l19%~------"T.'"3:l1d 

$5.69 
Gll.rdener-Bl!lnde 

19-0oe 

No Bid 

$7.• 
PolYWilter 

FD·9 

NoBld 

pvC It.m 8 Dill!!! 
Not Provid.d 1 Pint91u!l 

$5.62 S4.6fI 
IDEAL Item 269 Id.,,1 oth.r ~i~~ In 'Ql"lI!1dull!! 

31.358 Ylillow 77 

$0." 
Burnd 

YABC-L-BOX 

NAS 
BCoIumn-;XI% 

eRe 

""S 
B Coll.lmn • 30% 

'M 
Notprovidllld 

No Bid 

$Q,21 
eRe 

"'" 
$15.45 

eRe 
14055 

SlIIn Ar.torllo, TX 
7B217 

""S 

NAS 

NAS 

""S 

NAS 

$;i!',S;31.:l4 
Encore 

THHN3SO 

$3,00863 
Encore 

THHN500 

$339.11 

$202.23 
Encor. 

Bara6 SOL 

NoBld 

No Bid 

$10,54 
Oalvat1lErlco 

GN05BSco 

$0.e3 

GIiIIVOIInllOrI"o 
GiN05eAcofl1 

$4.35 
C"rIOI1/C;lll1tllx 

PVFBELI-EN 400 

NAS 
$9.90 

CilrlonlClmte)!. 

""s 

""s 

PVfCAF'400 

$174 
l;3urnd y 

KS20 

$4.17 
Burndy 

KS25DB 

$4,11 
Rector~,I!I1 

REC55B05 

$3.65 
Polywater 

03' 

No Bid 

$12 7~ 

02140 

$1308 

eRe 
14055 

Prepared by Purchasing 312612009 




City of San Anlonio Bid Tabulation 

Blond Llgl'Itlt'lg& Fixture 

A301·0 .. JW 820 E. DeWl!lY 

f--""T"---------------------,--,U,-n,;:-'o--;'----1s.nAnlOnlo,TX 

Item DIIIIDrlptlon MlI&IIllnt 78212 

51 CommurllC5Ition C5Ibl., 4 connector, 18 '151l,lge, 1grd 5Ind ahi.ld, Beldon lle418 MfFT 
Nl!ltPrlce 192.00 

6r5lnd NAm. of lIem Off.r.d Oenesl 
PArt Number mr Br5lnd N .. me Off.r.d 1215 

54 Cord, neoprene Jacket, stranded, copper, SJO, #1e13, 300 volt MlFT 
N.tPriclll 5389.00 
Btllnd Name of Item Offt!II'ed CQlllmlln 
POIIrtNumbeir fOr Brand Name Offl!lfed SJ01613 

55 Cord, t'laOp~t'lEI Jacket, IItrat'lded, cOP~', 5JO, #101/3, JOO volt MlFT 
Nel Price $529.00 
BfaM Nat\"le of Item OffElred Colemlln 
Part Number for Brand Name Off.r.d SJ014/3 

~ DIII.tlld FT 

57 W)rlll, ..It.<m!nl,lm, trlplt:tll,-a FT 
Nel Price SO." 
SrllnQ NAme Qf ltam OffllrDl;! Alcan 
Pllrl Numbllr for Brllnd Nilme OfftIr.d Oommodlty 

58 Wire, aluminum, triplex, #2 FT 
NEltPrlce NDBid 
Brand Name of Item Offered 
Part Number for Brand Name Offered 

59 Wire, IIlumlnum, Irlplel(, #110 'T 
NIIIPri~ $1.05 
Brllnd Name of Item Offered Alc5In 
ParI Number for Br1!lnd Nlllml!1 Offered Commodity 

Delivery 7-10 Dil\!5 

Opened: JOilnuary 30, 2009 

For. E:lel:<lrlc;OII Pllrl!!. & Fi:dul1lll1 

Grayb5lr Elec!rilj: Co, Crilwford Elettrlc Supply 
CQmPllny, In~. 

4503 Perr in Crllllll\ 2510 EII5IBIII1!Pfil Rd. 

5an Antonio, TX SIiII1 Anlonlo, TX 
16217 78217 

NA' 
Cost Plus 26% $641.17 

Belden Beldon 
9416 g416 

NA. 
CQ~I PII,l~ JO% 

C1!IrOI & V1!IrlouII Mtg '''~,:::, 
SJODW 1613 Blk 250 CTN OORSJOlet3 

NA. 
C01!lt Plus JO% 5502.Q!;i 

Carol & Various MIg A1W 
SJooW 14/3 Blk 25u CTN CDRSJD14/3 

NAS 

Dealers Electrical 

2400 Freedom 

5lI.tlAntonlo, TX 
1621'1 

NAS 

SO.31 
SlIIldon .." 

5:257,7:3 
Coll!1m.ah 

SJ0183 

NAS 
$388.98 

Colemiln 
SJ01ii1J 

$0.47 

Alcan 
TR16VOL 

$0.77 
AIt;8tl 

TR12CON 

$1,17 
Aleiln 

TR10NER 

3-15 Dill I!I 

COill PlUI!I 32% 

N.Xill1' & $Ql,lthwir 
Voll,lti! XI. P 500' CQils 

NA. 
C081 Plu8 32% 

Nsxana & Southwlr 
COt'ICl'I XLP 500' Coils 

NAS 
Co,IPll,lsJ2% 

Nllixiln5& Southwlre 
NlI:rilinOil X/...P 500' Coils 

",:'1 
Klt'lg 

vOlulA 

50,71 
King 

CONCH 

$1.00 
King 

CI:NI 

, Do1-3 Dalls 
Deleted: Items' 14, 15.20,23. 25, 35, 38, 41. 45--49, 52, 53. 56 ilnd 60·94, 
NA$; p.OIll1r, 511111;'trll; Supply Qid not 5iliiln bid, CrOllwford E:lmc;lric; Supply CompOIIny, Inl:<. and Graybar Elmc;lrit; Co. did \"101 ptovlde Mt prlce8 a8 speclned. 

Pt1!lpOilred by PlJtt;I'IIII~l\g 3/2812009 

http:Coll!1m.ah


City of San Antonio 

Contract Summary Sheet 
Date: 4/16/2009 

Agenda Item: 4782 

i Name/Title (Caption as shown on agenda): 
Catalog Enrichment Services A1010·09 LS 
Brief Description of Item(s) and Use: ! 

This contract will provide the San Antonio Public Library with an annual contract to provide content enrichment • 
to the bibliographic records in the online publ ic access catalog. In addition, this contract will improve precision i 

in the search and retrieval of information contained within I arge bibliographic databases. i 

Total $: $35,000.00 annually; $175,000.00 contract period 
• 

Contract Period: Upon award through July 20, 2011 wi th 1, 3 year option to extend 

Method of Procurement: ource 

5%Price Trend: Decrease 

Contract Info: Formal _ Annual L Support/Maintenance Lease _ 

i Recommended 
R.R. Bowker, LLC., 630 Central Avenue, New Providence, NJ 07974 (MLWN) Contractor(s): 

R.R. Bowker, LLC., 630 Central Avenue, New Providence, NJ 07974 (MLWN) 
Previous Contractor(s): 

Comments: N/A 

I Anticipated Future 
• Requirements and N/A 
, Action: 

Procurement Should this contract not be approved, the Library Department would have to 

Alternative: 
 remove the existing catalog enrichment service from their database. In doing so, 

customers would no longer have the abil ity to search on the Library's website for 
bibliographic book data. 

Using Library 

Department(s) : 
 I 

http:175,000.00
http:35,000.00


City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: April 16, 2009 

For: Catalog Enrichment Services Sale Source 
R.R. Bowker, LLC. 

A1010-09 

Item Description 

LS 
Estimated Annual 

Quantity 

630 Central Avenue 
New Providence, NJ 07974 
888-269-5372 

1 BookUst Reviews 1 
Price Each $2,647.H 

Total $2,647.H 

2 Choice Reviews 1 

Price Each $3,148.0C 

Total $3.148.0( 

3 Cover Images 1 
Price Each $2,647.~~ 
Tot .. 1 $2,647.1 

4 Fiction and Biography Profiles 1 
Price Each $2,074.82 

Total $2,074.82 

5 Find Similar Titles 1 
Price Each $1,967.50 

Total $1,967.50 

6 Horn Book Reviews 1 

Price Each $2,647.18 

Total $2,647.18 

7 Library Journal Reviews 1 
Price Each $2,647.18 

Total $2,647.18 

8 Video and Music (Media 1) 1 

Price Each $3.076.46 
Total $3,076.46 

9 Publishers Weekly Reviews 1 
Price Each $2,647.18 

Total $2,64718 

10 School Library Journal Reviews 1 
Price Each $2,647.18 

Total $2,647.18 

11 Series List 1 
Price Each $2,504.09 
Total $2,504.09 

12 Spanish Language Content 1 
Price Each $2,074.82 
Total $2,074.82 

13 Summaries and Annotations 1 
Price Each $1,788.64 

Total $1,788.64 

14 !Tables of Contents 1 
!Price Each $2,361.00 
I Total $2,361.00 

I 1 $34,878.41IEstimated Annual Total 
$34,878.41~ted Annual Award 1 

http:34,878.41
http:34,878.41

