
LOC: cah 
11119/09 
Item No.9 

AN ORDINANCE 200 9 - 11 - 1 9 - 0 q 0 5 
ACCEPTING THE BIDS FROM \VAUKESHA-PIERCE INDUSTRIES, 
INC., TRACTOR CITY, VOLVO CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT & 
SERVICES, ALAMO AG-CON EQUIPMENT, INC., EQUIPMENT 
DEPOT, STECO, A DIVISION OF BLUE TEE CO., TEREX UTILITY, 
RDO EQUIPMENT COMPANY; COOPER EQUIPMENT CO. AND 
CLOSNER EQUIPMENT CO., INC. FOR REPLACEMENT OF 18 
HEAVY EQUIPMENT ITEMS FOR A COST OF $937,855.14, FUNDED 
BY THE EQUIPMENT RENEWAL AND REPLACEMENT FUND. 

* * * * * 

WHEREAS, bids were submitted to provide the City of San Antonio Public Works, Parks and 
Recreation and Purchasing and General Services Departments with 18 items of heavy equipment; 
and 

WHEREAS, the low bids were submitted by Waukesha-Pierce Industries, Inc., for Item I, tor an 
estimated cost of $301,2l3.40; Tractor City for Item for an estimated cost of $231,868.00; 
Volvo Construction Equipment & Services for Item 3, for an estimated cost of $67,272.00; 
Alamo Ag-Con Equipment, Inc. for Item 4, for an estimated cost of $22,197.00; Equipment 
Depot for Item 6, for an estimated cost of$19,062.74; Steco, a division of Blue Tee Co. for Item 
8, for an estimated cost of $92,700.00; Terex Utility tor Item 9, for an estimated cost of 
$16,488.00; ROO Equipment Company for Item 10, for an estimated cost of$28,520.00; Coopcr 
Equipment Co for Itcm 12, for an estimated cost of $37,986.00; Cooper Equipment Co for Item 
14, for an estimated cost of $80,572.00; and C10sner Equipment Co., Inc. for Item 13, for an 
estimated cost of$39,976.00; for a total cost of$937,855.14; NO\V THEREFORE: 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO: 

SECTION 1. The bids submitted by Waukesha-Pierce Industries, Inc., Tractor City; Volvo 
Construction Equipment & Services, Alamo Ag-Con Equipment, Inc., Equipment Depot, Steco, 
a division of Blue Tee Co., Terex Utility, ROO Equipment Company, Cooper Equipment Co. 
and Closner Equipment Co., Inc. to provide the City with 18 items of heavy equipment, as 
indicated above, for a total cost of $937,855.14 are hereby accepted, subjcct to and contingent 
upon the dcposit of all required bonds, perfonnance deposits, insurance certificates and 
endorsements. The bid tabulation sheets are attached hereto and incorporated herein for all 
purposes as Exhibit I. Copies of the bids are available for inspection in the offices of the 
Purchasing & General Services Department. 

SECTION 2. Funding in the amount of $937,855.14 for this ordinance is available in Fund 
7200] 000, Cost Center 1503200001, General Ledger 5501050, as part of the FY 2010 Budget. 

SECTION 3. Pa yment not to exceed the budgeted amount up to $937,855.14 is authorized to 
the various vendors established and should be encumbered with purchase orders. 

SECTION 4. The financial allocations in this Ordinance are subject to approval by the Director 
of Finance, City of San Antonio. The Director may, subject to concurrence by the City Manager 
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or the City Manager's designee, correct allocations to specific Cost Centers and Fund Numbers 
as necessary to carry out the purpose of this Ordinance. 

SECTION 5. This ordinance shall be effective immediately upon passage by eight or more 
affirmative votes; otherwise, it shall be effective on the tenth day after passage. 

PASSED and APPROVED this 19th day of November, 2009. 

ATTEST: ":(,';;'[ .I:d{
~erk .~ \ 



 
 

Agenda Item: 9   ( in consent vote:  6, 7, 8, 9, 10, 12, 13, 15, 16A, 16B, 16D, 17A, 17B, 17D, 18B, 19A, 20A, 
20B, 20C, 20D, 21, 23, 24, 25, 26, 27, 28, 29, 30, 31, 32, 33A, 33B, 33C, 33D, 33E, 33F, 34A, 
34B )

Date: 11/19/2009

Time: 01:19:13 PM

Vote Type: Motion to Approve

Description: An Ordinance accepting the bids from Waukesha-Pierce Industries, Inc., Tractor City, Volvo 
Construction Equipment & Services, Alamo Ag-Con Equipment, Inc., Equipment Depot, Steco, a 
division of Blue Tee Co., Terex Utility, RDO Equipment Company, Cooper Equipment Co. and 
Closner Equipment Co., Inc. for replacement of 18 heavy equipment items for a cost of $937,855.14 
funded by the Equipment Renewal and Replacement Fund. [Penny Postoak Ferguson, Assistant City 
Manager; Janie Cantu, Director, Purchasing & General Services]

Result: Passed

Voter Group Not 
Present

Yea Nay Abstain Motion Second

Julián Castro Mayor x      

Mary Alice P. Cisneros District 1  x   x  

Ivy R. Taylor District 2 x      

Jennifer V. Ramos District 3  x     

Philip A. Cortez District 4  x     

David Medina Jr. District 5  x     

Ray Lopez District 6  x     

Justin Rodriguez District 7  x     

W. Reed Williams District 8 x      

Elisa Chan District 9  x     

John G. Clamp District 10  x    x
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CIty of San ,l\ntonlO Bid T aDulation Exhibit I 

Opened: August 17. 2009 
Waukesna·Pierce Tractor City Volvo ConstrucTJOn Alamo Ag-Con IEquipment Depot ~te~, a dill. of Blue Terex Utility RDO EqUipment Cooper EqUIpment iClosn., Eq"'pment 

For t~eavy Eqtllpment Industries Inc. Equipment & Equlprnent Inc Tee Co Company CD Company, 
Services I

09132 SCIDDG 3740S[ Loop410 2800 Loop 410 6485 II i 35 South 2940SE LoopA~G j393~lH35North 2215 Van Buren IPO 1 19275 N I;; 35 17474 Judson Rd PO 80x 917 

San Antonio, San New Braunfels San Antcrnc. San Anloll;o. Erlld, I~~n Antonio, New Braunfels San Antonio 1~~;~54TX 78222 TX 78222 TX 78132 TX 78222 TX 78219 OK 73701 78294 TX 78132-4877 TX 78247 
Item Description OTY 710-648-4444 210-848-1765 710-834-99;1 210-6483673 210220·1221 580·237-1433 210-476-7777 830-632-3100 210-657-5151 210-137-2131 

1 ~ydrau!ic Excavator, Carrier Mounted, 4X4 1
P;,ce $306,713.4 NoB; NoBI No Bid No BIC No Sic No BI NoBie NoBI No Bi, 
Pnce $306,7134 

Less trade in Unit #646 55,500.0 
Tota~ Less trade-in 5301,213.4 

Make 2009 Gradal 
Model XL31001114X 

Delivery 90-120 Day 

2 Mulchmg Machine, Track. type 2 
Price per Each No Bi $136,265.0 No Bi No Bid No Bid No Sic No Bi No Bic No Bi No Bjd 
Pnce Total $272,530.0 

Less trade in Unit #774. $14,175.0 
Less trade in Unit #778: $26,487.0 
Total Les51rade-ins· 5231,868.0 

MaKe 2009 Rayc 
Model G1DC 

Delivery 30 Day 

3 Compressor, T railer Mounted 4 
Price per Each NoBi No Bi 519,6930 No BId No 8Jd No Bic No Bi No Bic No BI No g" 
Price Total $78.772 ° 
Less trade in Unit #669. $3,0000 
Less trade in Unit #1372' 52,500.0 
Less trade in Unit #675' 53,0000 
Less trade in Unit #1490: 53,000.0 
Total less Trade ins· $67,272 0 

Make New Ingersoll 
Rand/Doosa, 

Mode! P250WJ[ 

Delivery 75 Day 

4 Loadefs, Sk.id Steer 1 
Price per Each No Bi 538,999.00 535,035.0 530,197.0 530.45008 No BI< No Bi 536,000.0{ No Sid No Bid 
Price Total $38,999.00 $35,0350 530,197.0 5:10,460.08 536,OOO.0( 

Less trade in Unit #2128: S8,060.00 $4,000.0 $8,0000 $6,000.00 S6,00O.OC 
TDtal Less trade·jn 530,939.00 $:11,035.0 522,t970 524,460.08 530,0000( 

Mak.e 2009 John Deere 2009 \loly, 2009 New Hoflan New Holian 7010 John Dp.ere 
Model 328 Me't( L18 1.185 378 Skid Stee 

Loade 

Delivery 45 Days 120 Day 90·180 Day 60-90 Day, 45 Days 

5 Deleted 

6 Forl<hff 6,000 Lbs., LPG 1 
Price per Each No Bi NoBi No Bl No 81 521,562.7 No Bie No 6i No Bi No Bi No Bid 
Price Tota! 521,562.7 

Less trade Unit #618: 52,SOO.OC 
Total Less trade-in" $19,062."1 

Make 2009 Glarl 
Moool GQ3C 

Deliverv 



City of San Antonio Bid T abl.!~atlOn 

Opened: August 17. 2009 
Waukesha~Pierr.e Tractor City I~~;:i~~;~tstruction Alamo Ag-Con Equipment Depot Steco, a dlv of Blue Terex Utility ROO Equipment Cooper equipment Closner equipment 

For Heavy Equipment Industnes Inc Equipment, Inc_ ree Company Co Company, 
Iservices 

09-132 SCIDDG 3740 SE Loop 410 2800 SE Loop 410 6485 iH 35 South 2940 S.E. Loop 410 3935 iH 35 North 2215 S, V,m Buren PO Box 1119 19275 N. IH 35 17474 Judson Rd PO Box 917 

-------------­ -
San Antonio, San Antonio. New Braunfels, San Antonio, San Antonio, Enid, San Anionlo New Braunfels, San Antonio, Schertz, 
TX 78222 TX 78222 TX 78132 lX 78272 TX 78219 OK 73701 TX 78294 TX 78132-4877 TX 78247 TX 78154 

Item DescriPtion QTY 21 0~4B-4444 210~48-1765 210-834-9957 21 0~48-3673 210-225-1221 580·237-1433 21D~76 7777 830-632-3100 210~57-5151 210-732-2131 

7 Deleted 

8 Trailer, Half Round, End Dump, Minimum 76 
2

Cubic Yard 
Pnce per Each No B" No Bid No 81 No 81 No 81 $48,8500 No B" No 81 No SIC No BId 
Price Total 597,7000 

Less trade in Unit #1198: 525000 
Less trade in Unlt #1199: 52."000 
Total Less trade-ins· S927000 

Make 2009 Stec 
Model RIP325< 

Delivery 90 Day 

9 
Trailer, Pole Transporter, Minimum GVWR 

1
20,000Ibs 
Price per E act'! No Bi No Bi No Bi No 8i No Bi No Bi $17,488.0{ No 61 No Bi No Bi 
Price lotai S17.488 ° 
Less trade in Unit#1448: $1,0000 
To1ai Less trade-In: $16,488.0 

Make 2009 Butle 
Model BP-20B 

Delivery 4~E)ay 

10 Traijers, Minimum 40,000 GVWR, Non Tilt 
2

Platform 
Price per Each NoBi No ell No Bi NoB! No Bi No 81 NoBi 516,960.0 No Bid No Bi 
Price Total 533,9200 

Less trade in Unit #1080: 52,700.0 
Less trade in Unit #1 081: $2,700.0 
Total Less trade-ins: 528,520.0 

Make NI 

Model NI 

Delivery 45 Day 

11 Deleted 

12 Self propelled Paver, Asphalt 1 
Price per Each No Bi No 8, No Brd No Bid No 8i No 81 NoBI< No Bi $40,486.0{ ~;::~~~:Price Total $40,486.0( 

less trade in Uni1 #2805 52.500.01 $4;;~~:Total Less trade-in' $37,986.0 

Make 2009 Pucket 2009 Mauldin 
Model 561 S90-F 

Delivery 35 Day 45 Days 

13 Street Sweeper 1 
Price Per Each No BI NaSi NaSi No BI No 8i No Bi No 8ic No Bi 

$42,86~~~ 
539,9760 

Price Total 539,976.0 

Make 2009 Broc 2009 Superia 
Model RJT 35 DTBOeT Tier II 

~~~!i_~~_'X 21 Day 45 Day 



City of San Anlonlo Bid I abulat!on 

Opened. August 17, 2009 

for Heavy EqlJlpment 

09·132 

Item Description 

14 
Trailer Mounted Hot Pour Joint/Crack Sealing 
Machine 

Pnce Pel Each 
Pnce Total 

Make 
Model 

Detivery 

Estimated Total 

~~~........l~!_tima~ Total Aw~rd 


No Bid' Rental, Romeo Equipment, Co. 
and 11 w111 be rebid at 3 later date 

Waukesha-Pierce Tractor City 
Industries Inc 

SCIDDGI3740 SE Loop 410 12800 SE Loop 410 

San AntonIo, San Antonio, 
TX 78222TX 78222 

QTY 210-648-4444 210-648·1765 

NoBl No 

S301.2134 $67.272001 

NoBi 

Equipment Depot 

2940 S.L Loop 410 13935 IH 35 

San Antonio 
78222 

210-648·3673 

522.19700 519.002.741 

Steco, a div. of Blue ITerex Utility 
Tee Co. 

2215 S. Van Buren Ipo Box 

NaSi 

San 
TX 78294 
210-47~7777 

NoBi 

ROO EqUipment 
Company 

19710 N 

New Braunfels, 
TX 78132·4877 
830·632 3100 

$39,976.0 



City of San Antonio BId Tabulation 

Opened: August-17,-2009----­ -­

For Heavy Equipment 

09-132 SCIDDG 

Conley Lott N1Chois 0 
Texas. inc 

415 N. Loop 12 

IIrving 
TX 

CrafcQ Texas, Inc 

105 TO'NSr Dnve 

San Antonio, 
TX 78232 

Holt Cat 

3302 S, WIV White 
Rd 
San Antonio, 
TX 78220 

Roadtec, inc. 

PO Box 180515 

Chattanooga, 
TN 37405 

San Anlonio 
Southwest Trailers 

10302 IH 35 North 

San Antonio. 
TX 78233 

Vermeer Equipment 
of1exas, 

4455 Om£:ctor Dr. 

San Antonio, 
TX 78219 

Item Descriotion QTY 

1 HydraulIC Excavator, Carner Mounted, 4X4 
Price per Each 
Price Total 

Less trade in Unit #646' 
Total Less trade-in: 

Make 
Model 

Delivery 

1 
NoBi No Bid No Bi NoBi, No Bid No Bk 

2 Mulching Machine, Track type 
Price per Each 
Price Total 

Less trade In Unit #774' 
Less trade in Unit #77 8' 
Tota! Less trade-ins 

Make 
Model 

Delivery 

2 
NO' 8f No Bid S188,250 00 

S376,SOO,OC 

S16,OOO,OC 
S9,500,OO 

S351,000,OC 

2009 Ca 
SK140C CTL WI FAE 

175 Heac 

30 Day 

No BlC NO' Bid $169,90000 
S339,800,OC 

SO 00 
SO.OC 

5339,800.00 

2009 GyraTr., 

30 Day 

3 Compressor, Trailer Mounted 
Price per Each 
Price TOlal 

Less trade in Unit #669' 
Less trade in Unrt#672 
Less trade in Unit #675 
Less trade in Unit #1490: 
T ota! Less Trade ins: 

Make 

Model 

Delivery 

4 
No Sic NoBi No Bi Na Bic No Brd No Bid 

4 Loaders, Skid Steer 

IPrice 
POe<! 

Less trade in Unit #2"128. 
Total Less trade-in: 

Make 
Mode! 

Delivery 

1 
No Bi No Bid $39,50000 

$39,500.0! 

$6,000,O( 
$33,5000( 

2009 Ca 
252B It 

30 Day 

NoB" No Bid No 81 

5 Deleted 

6 Forldin 6,000 Lb" LPG 
Price Each 
Price 

Less trade in Unit #618: 
T ctal less trade~m: 

Make 
Model 

IDe!ive" 

1 
No 8i No Sid No Bid No Bi No Bid No Bid 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened August 17, 2009 

Holt Cal Roadtec, jnc. San AntonIo Vermeer 
For Heavy Equipment Southwest Trailers of Texas, 

09·132 105 Tower Drive 3302 S Vffl'M1lte PO Box 180515 10302 IH 35 North 4455 Director Dr. 
Rd 

San AntoniO, San Antonio, Chattanooga, San Antonio, San Antonio, 
TX 78232 TX 78220 TN 37405 TX 78233 TX 78219 


Item 
 ~scfi tion QTY 

Deleted 

Trailer, Half Round, End Dump, Minimum 26 
Cubic Yard 
Price No Bid NoBjNoBi No Bi No Bid No Bid 
Pnes 

Less trade In Umt#1198 
Less trade in Unit #1199. 

Total I ess trade-Ins: 


Make 

Model 


DelivclY 

Trailer, Pole Transporter, Minimum GVVV'R 

lb. 


NoBI 
 No Bid No Bi NoSi No Bi NoBit:l 

Less trade in Unit #144B. 

Total Less trade-in: 


Make 

Model 


Delivery 

Trailers, Minimum 40,000 GVVVR, Non Tilt 
10 

Platfoml 

Price 
 No Bi No Bid No BI $15,88800 No Bid 
Price 

No Bi 
531,776.00 

Less trade in Unit#10BO: $1,000.00 

Less trade in Unit #1081: 
 $1,000.00 

Total Less trade-ins: 
 529.776.00 

Make 2009 SOllthwes 

Gooseneck 


Model 
 PHD26862225 

Oehvery 90 Day 

11 Deleted 

Paver, Asphalt 


No 8id 

12 

No 8i No Bi No 8i No Bid 

Less trade in Unit #2805: 

Total Less trade-in: 


One New Lee 80 

Model 

Mak. 

iOOOF Pave 

Delivery 

13 


NoBi 
 NO Bid NoBi NoBi No Bid No Bid 
PriGe lotal 

Make 

Model 


Delivery 

http:529.776.00
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened August 17, 2009 
Conley L ott Nichols 0 Crafco Texas, inc Holt Cat Roadtec, 10c San Antonio IVermeer Equipment 

For. Heavy Equipme1l Texas, ;nc. Southwest Trailers of Texas, 

09132 SCIDDG 415 N. Loop 12 105 Tower Drlve 3302 S WI/V Vllhlte PO Box 1flO515 10302 IH North 4455 Director Dr 
Rd'-- ­

San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, ~,:g; ~". 
TX 78232 TX 78220 TX 78233 TX 78219 TN 

Item Description QTY 

Trailer Moun1ed Hot Poor JoinllCrack Sealing 


14 2
Machine 

Price Per Each 
 NaSi $40,650.00 NoB! NoBl No Bid No BId 
Price Total S40,650.0( 

Make 2009 Crafco 

Moce! 
 EZ Series II 500 

WISOCFM 
Compresso 

Delivery 30 Days 

Es1:imated Tctal S384,5000(551,745.00 $40,65000 SO 00 529,77600 S339,800.00 
Estimated Total Award 

No Bid Romeo 
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