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AN ORDINANCE 2013-06-13-04.13 
AUTHORIZING THE FOLLOWING CONTRACTS 
ESTABLISHING UNIT PRICES FOR GOODS AND SERVICES 
FOR AN ESTIMATED ANNUAL COST OF $317,000.00: (A) 
ACME SAFE & LOCK CO. FOR LOCKSMITH SERVICES, (B) 
DIGITAL DISPLAY SOLUTIONS, INC. FOR AUDIO VISUAL 
MAINTENANCE AND SUPPORT AND (C) GEO-SOLUTIONS, 
INC. FOR EROSION CONTROL AND MATERIALS. 

* * * * * 

WHEREAS, the City is able to obtain significant savings by purchasing various materials 
and services on an annual contract basis; and 

WHEREAS, these bids are from the following companies to furnish the City with: (A) Acme 
Safe & Lock Co. for locksmith services, (B) Digital Display Solutions, Inc. for audio visual 
maintenance and support, and (C) Oeo-Solutions, Inc. for erosion control and materials; and 

WHEREAS, this ordinance approves 3 low bid contracts; and 

WHEREAS, all expenditures will be in accordance with the applicable fiscal year's budget 
approved by City Council; NOW THEREFORE: 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO: 

SECTION 1. The bids of the following companies to furnish the City with: (A) Acme Safe 
& Lock Co. for locksmith services, (B) Digital Display Solutions, Inc. for audio visual 
maintenance and support, and (C) Oeo-Solutions, Inc. for erosion control and materials, on an 
annual contract basis as shown on the attached bid tabulation sheets, are hereby accepted, 
subject to and contingent upon the deposit of all required bonds, performance deposits, 
insurance certificates and endorsements. The bid tabulation sheets are attached hereto and 
incorporated herein for all purposes as Exhibit I. Copies of the bids and amendments are 
available for inspection in the offices of the Purchasing & Oeneral Services Division of the 
Finance Department. 

The term of the contract with Oeo-Solutions, Inc. for erosion control and materials shall begin 
upon the effective date of this ordinance and terminate on June 30, 2016, with options to 
renew for two additional one year periods, to be effected as provided for in the contract. 

SECTION 2. The amounts will be encumbered upon issuance of various purchase orders, 
and payment is authorized to the vendors identified herein. All current fiscal year 
expenditures will be in accordance with the Fiscal Year 2013 budget approved by City 
Council, and future fiscal year expenditures are contingent upon future City Council budget 
approvals. 
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Item No.6 

SECTION 3. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight affirmative 
votes; otherwise it is effective on the tenth day after passage hereof. 

PASSED and APPROVED this 13th day of June, 2013 . 

Julian Castro 

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM: 

2 
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City of rlI!'-_ft¥.fii:~ 

Agenda Voting Results - 6 

Name: 4,6, 7,10,11,13,14, 15,16, 17A, 17B, 18 

Date: 06113/2013 

Time: 09:27:52 AM 

Vote Type: Motion to Approve 

Description: An Ordinance authorizing the following contracts establishing unit prices for 
goods and services for an estimated annual cost of $317,000.00: (A) Acme 
Safe & Lock Co. for locksmith services, (B) Digital Display Solutions, Inc. 
for audio visual maintenance and support and (C) Geo-Solutions, Inc. for 
erosion control and materials. [Ben Gorzell, Chief Financial Officer; Troy 
Elliott, Director, Finance] 

Result: Passed 

Voter Group Not 
Yea Nay Abstain Motion Second Present 

Julian Castro Mayor x 

Diego Bernal District 1 x x 

Ivy R. Taylor District 2 x 

Rebecca Viagran District 3 x 

Rey Saldafia District 4 x x 

David Medina Jr. District 5 x 

Ray Lopez District 6 x 

Cris Medina District 7 x 

W. Reed Williams District 8 x 

Elisa Chan District 9 x 

Carlton Soules District 10 x 

httn:/ 1 cosawebl a2:endabuilder/votingresul ts.aspx?I temld= 1 048 9&Src= RFCA 6114/2013 



ANNUAL CONTRACT 
TABLE OF CONTENTS 

EXHIBIT I 

June 13, 2013 RFCA # 10489 

COMMODITY 

Contracts procured on the basis of low bid: 

A. Locksmith Services 

6100002329 JF 

Upon award through March 31, 2016 
with two, one year options to renew 

B. Audio Visual Maintenance and Supp011 

6100002647 LM 

Upon award through June 30, 2014 
with two, one year options to renew 

C. Erosion Control and Materials 

6100002754 DS 

Upon award through June 30, 2016 

RFCA# 10489 

VENDOR 

Acme Safe & Lock Co. 

Entire Bid 

Estimated Amount: $127,000.00 
annually 

Digital Display Solutions, Inc, 

Entire Bid 

Estimated Amount: $82,000.00 
annually 

Geo-Solutions, Inc. 

Entire Bid 

Estimated Amount: $108,000.00 
annually 



City of San Antonio 

Contract Summary Sheet Date: 6/13/2013 
Agenda Item: 10489 

NamelTitle (Caption as shown on agenda): 
Locksmith Services 6100002329 JF 
Brief Description of Item(s) and Use: 
This contract will provide City of San Antonio with a contractor to provide locksmith services to various City 
departments. The contractor will perform full security locksmith services and miscellaneous maintenance and 
repairs to include but not limited to: lockset installation, key duplication , key fitting, key numbering, repair any 
existing lock problems, install and service mechanical push button locks. These services are required on an as-
needed basis for performing repairs at all City owned and leased facilities and vehicles. 

Total $: $127,000.00 annually 

Contract Period: Upon award through March 31 , 2016 with two, one year options to renew 

Method of Procurement: Competitive (1 bid received) 

Price Trend: No change 

Contract Info: Formal Annual ~ SupporUMaintenance _ Lease --
Recommended 
Contractor(s) : Acme Safe & Lock Co., 138 Kenley Place, San Antonio, TX 78232 

Previous Contractor(s): Acme Safe & Lock Co., 11953 Starcrest, San Antonio, TX 78247 

Comments: N/A 

Anticipated Future 
Requirements and N/A 
Action: 

Procurement Should this contract not be approved , departments would be required to procure 
Alternative: locksmith services on an as needed basis wherein increased costs due to non-

contract buying would be realized . 

Using Citywide 
Department(s): 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: March 15,2013 

For: Locksmith Services 

Acme Safe & Lock Co. 
6100002329 JF 138 Kenley Place 

Estimated 
San Antonio, 

Item Description TX 78232 
Annual Usage 210-495-7528 

I Locksmith Service 
A Ace Key Duplicated 300 

Price each $0.49 
Total Price $147.00 

B Luggage Key Fitted 10 
Price each $12.44 
Total Price $124.40 

C Regular Key Duplicated 7,900 
Price each $0.89 
Total Price $7,031.00 

D Double Sided Keys Duplicated 250 

Price each $2.99 
Total Price $747.50 

E Sargent Sectional Keys Duplicated 1,000 
Price each $1.75 
Total Price $1 ,750.00 

F Abloy Key Duplicated 250 
Price each $4.45 
Total Price $1,112.50 

G Medeco Key Duplicated 20 
Price each $12.95 
Total Price $259.00 

H VATS Key Duplicated 20 
Price each $4.99 
Total Price $99.80 

I Combination Changed Cylinder Type Lock 650 

Price each $7.99 
Total Price $5,193.50 

J Combination Changed Knob Lock 10 
Price each $9.95 
Total Price $99.50 

K Key by Code 650 
Price each $3.95 
Total Price $2,567.50 

L Fitting Key to Cylinder Lock 70 
Price each $19.95 
Total Price $1,396.50 

Subtotal $20,528.20 

II Outside Calls Service (Excluding Service Charge] 
A Change Combination on Safe 200 

Price each $44.40 
Total Price $8,880.00 

B Change Combination on Lock Cylinder Type 800 
Price each $5.95 
Total Price $4,760.00 

Prepared by Purchasing 5/23/2013 Page 1 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: March 15,2013 

For: Locksmith Services 

Acme Safe & Lock Co. 
6100002329 JF 138 Kenley Place 

Estimated 
San Antonio, 

Item Description TX 78232 
Annual Usage 210-495-7528 

C Change Combination Lock Knob Type 300 

Price each $9.90 
Total Price $2,970.0C 

D Remove Cylinder or Knob 2,400 
Price each $2.49 
Total Price $5,976.00 

ERe-install Cylinder or Knob 2,400 
Price each $2.49 
Total Price $5,976.00 

F Fit Key to Knob 200 
Price each $7.49 
Total Price $1,498.00 

G Fit Key to Cylinder 200 
Price each $7.99 
Total Price $1,598.00 

H Unlocking House, Automobile, File, Desk, etc. 200 
Price each $22.49 
Total Price $4,498.00 

I Numbering Keys (Each Digit) 3,300 
Price per digit $0.15 
Total Price $495.00 

Subtotal $36,651.00 

III Installation Services (Excluding Service Charge] 
A Prepare Wooden Door for Lockset, Deadbolt 80 

Price each $22.44 
Total Price $1 ,795.20 

B Prepare Wooden Door for Mortise Lockset 50 

Price each $22.99 
Total Price $1 ,149.50 

C Prepare Metal Door for Lockset, Deadbolt 60 

Price each $19.95 
Total Price $1,197.00 

D Prepare Metal Door for Mortise Lockset 100 
Price each $24.49 
Total Price $2,449.00 

E Remove existing Lockset, Deadbolt 400 
Price each $11.95 
Total Price $4,780.00 

F Remove existing Mortise, Lockset 200 
Price each $12.49 
Total Price $2,498.00 

G Install Lockset, Deadbolt 400 
Price each $12.44 
Total Price $4976.Q.Q 

Prepared by Purchasing 5/23/2013 Page 2 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: March 15, 2013 

For: Locksmith Services 

Acme Safe & Lock Co. 
6100002329 JF 138 Kenley Place 

Estimated 
San Antonio, 

Item Description TX 78232 
Annual Usage 210-495-7528 

H Install Mortise Lockset 200 
Price each $22.4~ 
Total Price $4,488.00 

I Install Padlock 400 
Price each $0.25 
Total Price $100.00 

Subtotal $23,432.70 

IV Locksmith Services to Vehicles (Excluding Service 
Charge) 

A Removing steering wheel and ignition 10 
Price each $4.95 
Total Price $49.50 

B Recode ignition lock 500 
Price each $6.95 
Total Price $3,475.00 

C Re-install steering wheel and ignition 10 
Price each $4.98 
Total Price $49.80 

D Remove one door panel lock 10 
Price each $4.48 
Total Price $44.80 

E Rekey one door panel lock 1,000 
Price each $5.88 
Total Price $5,880.00 

F Re-install one door panel lock 10 
Price each $4.44 
Total Price $44.40 

G Remove trunk lock 10 
Price each $4.44 
Total Price $44.40 

H Rekey trunk lock 500 
Price each $4.89 
Total Price $2,445.00 

I Re-install trunk lock 10 
Price each $2.99 
Total Price $29.90 

J Face cap (each) 300 
Price each $2.44 
Total Price $732.00 

K Remove trunk emblem 10 
Price each $12.49 
Total Price $124.90 

L Re-install trunk emblem 10 
Price each $0.99 
Total Price $9.9C 

Prepared by Purchasing 5/23/2013 Page 3 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: March 15, 2013 

For: Locksmith Services 

Acme Safe & Lock Co. 
6100002329 JF 138 Kenley Place 

Estimated 
San Antonio, 

Item Description TX 78232 
Annual Usage 210-495-7528 

M Fit key to American made automobile 10 
Price each $12.44 
Total Price $124.40 

N Fit key to foreign made automobile 10 
Price each $12.44 
Total Price $124.40 

o Fit key to motorcycle or scooter 10 
Price each $12.44 
Total Price $124.40 

P Rekey trunk hatch assembly 300 
Price each $12.95 
Total Price $3,885.00 

Q Auto lock dust cover assembly 10 
Price each $14.29 
Total Price $142.90 

Subtotal $17,330.70 

V Parts 

A Medeco 
Percent of discount offered 35% 
Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc) Dealer 
Price schedule number A2013 
Date of price schedule 4/1 /2013 
Price schedule column on which discount is based Wholesale 

Specified Items: 

Single Cylinder Maxum Deadbolt Lock, 1 1/8" 10 
Faceplate, 2 3/4" Backset 11*C602 
Model 11-C60~ 

Manufacturer Medecc 

List Price $191.5C 

Discount Offered $67.0 

Net Price $124.4f 

Total Price $1,244.75 

LFIC Single Cylinder Maxum Deadbolt Lock, Less Bolt 10 
11*C30L 
Model 11-C30L 

Manufacturer Medeco 

List Price $202.00 

Discount Offered $70.70 

Net Price $131.30 

Total Price $1,313.0C 

Single Cylinder Maxum Deadbolt Lock, 1" Faceplate, 10 
23/8" Backset 11*C613 
Model 11-C613 

Manufacturer Medecc 

List Price $196.50 

Discount Offered $68.78 

Net Price $127.7 

Total Price $1,277.2e 

Subtotal $3,835.0C 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: March 15. 2013 

For: Locksmith Services 

Acme Safe & Lock Co. 
6100002329 JF 138 Kenley Place 

Estimated 
San Antonio . 

Item Description TX 78232 
Annual Usage 210-495-7528 

BArrow 
Percent of discount offered 41~ 
Type price schedule (dealer. jobber. etc) Distributo 
Price schedule number 2 
Date of price schedule 1/16/201 
Price schedule column on which discount is based List 

Specified Items: 

ARROW ML01 Medium Duty Passage 26D 10 
Model ML0126D 
Manufacturer Ar;~~ List Price $202.9 
Discount Offered $83.22 
Net Price $119.76 
Total Price $1.197.58 

Arrow RLX81 Entrance Level Lock 10 
Model RLX81 
Manufacturer Arrow 
List Price $117.76 
Discount Offered $48.28 
Net Price $69.48 
Total Price $694.78 

Subtotal $1.892.37 

C LSDA 
Percent of discount offered 41% 
Type price schedule (dealer. jobber. etc) Dealer 
Price schedule number PL-01-16-201 J 
Date of price schedule 1/16/201 
Price schedule column on which discount is based Wholesale 

LSDA LH1300 Lock 10 
Model LH1300 
Manufacturer LSDA 

List Price $280.00 
Discount Offered $114.80 

Net Price $165.20 
Total Price $1.652.00 

Deleted 

Deleted 

Subtotal $1.652.00 

D Sargent 
Percent of discount offered 41% 

Type price schedule (dealer. jobber. etc) Distributor 

Price schedule number 25 

Date of price schedule 4/1/201J 

Price schedule column on which discount is based Distributo 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened : March 15. 2013 

For: Locksmith Services 

Acme Safe & Lock Co. 
6100002329 JF 138 Kenley Place 

Estimated 
San Antonio . 

Item Description TX 78232 
Annual Usage 210-495-7528 

Sargent Mortise Lever Lock LNB-8204-26D 10 
Model 8204-LNB-26C 
Manufacturer Sargen 
List Price $716.0C 
Discount Offered $293.5E 
Net Price $422.4~ 

Total Price $4.224.4C 

Sargent Cylindrical Level Lock 10G05 26D 10 
Model 10G05-26C 
Manufacturer Sargen 
List Price $491.00 
Discount Offered $201.31 
Net Price $289.69 
Total Price $2.896.9C 

Sargent Passage Lever 11 U15-26D 10 
Model 11U15-26C 
Manufacturer Sargen 
List Price $386.00 
Discount Offered $158.2€ 
Net Price $227.7~ 

Total Price $2.277.4C 

Subtotal $9.398.70 

E Abloy 
Percent of discount offered 400/. 
Type price schedule (dealer. jobber. etc) Deale 
Price schedule number 16 
Date of price schedule 04/01/2012 
Price schedule column on which discount is based Wholesale 

Deleted 

Deleted 

Abloy Deadbolt CY413 10 

Model CY413 

Manufacturer Ablo\ 

List Price $232.1 

Discount Offered $92.85 

Net Price $1 39.28 

Total Price $1.392.71 

Subtotal $1 .392.71 

F Schlage 
Percent of discount offered 410/. 
Type price schedule (dealer. jobber. etc) Distributo 
Price schedule number 7 
Date of price schedule 3/4/201 
Price schedule column on which discount is based Distributo 

Prepared by Purchasing 5/23/2013 Page 6 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: March 15.2013 

For: Locksmith Services 

Acme Safe & Lock Co. 
6100002329 JF 138 Kenley Place 

Estimated 
San Antonio. 

Item Description TX 78232 
Annual Usage 210-495-7528 

Schlage Deadlock B660 P G26 10 
Model B660-62E 
Manufacturer Schlage 
List Price $144.0C 
Discount Offered $59.0 
Net Price $84.9E 
Total Price $849.6C 

Schlage Mortise Lock Body L9050/60/70 10 
Model L283-13J 
Manufacturer Schlage 
List Price $270.00 
Discount Offered $110.70 
Net Price $159.30 
Total Price $1.593.00 

Subtotal $2,442.60 

VII Service 
Service Charge 550 
Price each $14.99 
Total Price $8.244.50 

Estimated Annual Total $126.800.5: 

Estimated Annual Award $126,800.5: 

Prepared by Purchasing 5/23/2013 Page 7 



City of San Antonio 
t Contract Summary Sheet 

Date: 6/13/2013 
Agenda Item: 10489 

NamelTitle (Caption as shown on agenda): 
Audio Visual Maintenance and Support 610000002647 LM 
Brief Description of Item(s) and Use: 
This contract will provide the Fire Department's Emergency Operations Center (EOC) Division with audio 
visual equipment preventive maintenance service. This equipment consists of projectors, monitors, AN & 
RGB switchers, audio amplifiers, mixers, speakers, and the Crestron Control system. Preventive 
maintenance for audio visual equipment ensures no interruption to communication with first responders during 
major emerQency incidents. 

Total $: $82,000.00 annually 

Contract Period: Upon award through June 30, 2014 with two, one year options to renew 

Method of Procurement: Competitive (1 bid received) 

Price Trend: 20.56% decrease - New vendor was the lowest bidder 

Contract Info: Formal _ Annual ~ Support/Maintenance _ Lease -

Recommended 
Contractor(s): Digital Display Solutions, Inc., 12081 Starcrest Dr., San Antonio, TX 78247 

Previous Contractor(s): INX LLC, A Presidio Company, 777 E. Sonterra Blvd., Ste. 300, San Antonio, TX 
78258 

Comments: N/A 

Anticipated Future 
Requirements and N/A 
Action: 

Procurement Should this contract not be approved, the Office of Emergency Management 
Alternative: staff would be required to procure repairs to malfunctioning equipment on an as 

needed basis, potentially causing downtime during a critical incident. 

Using 
Fire Department(s): 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: April 15, 2013 

For: Audio Visual Maintenance and Support 
Digital Display Solutions, Inc. 

6100002647 LM 12081 Starcrest Dr. 
San Antonio, 

Item Description Quantity TX 78247 
21 0-404-1233 

1 Quarterly Preventative Maintenance 4 
Price Each $20,500.00 
Price Total $82,000.00 

2 Labor for on-site support 
Audio-Visual Techinician Standard Rate $78.00 
per hour as required 
Audio-Visual Techinician Overtime Rate $117.00 
per hour as required 

Certified Video Conferencing Technician $100.00 

Standard Rate per hour as required 
Certified Video Conferencing Technician $150.00 
Overtime Rate per hour as required 
Control System Programmer Standard $115.00 
Rate per hour as required 
Control System Programmer Overtime $172.50 
Rate per hour as required 

Prompt Payment Discount 2%, 10 days 

Delivery 1 day 

Payment Terms Net 30 

Estimated Annual Total $82,000.00 
Estimated Annual Award $82000.00 



·~. City of San Antonio 

• 
Contract Summary Sheet Date: 6/13/2013 

Agenda Item: 10489 

NamelTitle (Caption as shown on agenda): 
Erosion Control and Materials 6100002754 DS 
Brief Description of Item(s) and Use: 
This contract will provide the Department of Public Works with a contractor to furnish geosynthetic erosion 
control materials required to reduce surface pollutants from entering the storm water system. The products 
procured from this contract will be used to prevent accelerated erosion and assist the Public Works staff in the 
control of sedimentation within drainage project sites at various locations throughout the City, as required by 
the NPDES (National Pollutant Discharge Elimination System) permit. It is a requirement to utilize best 
management practices for water pollution for all projects to control sediment and erosion within the project 
site. 

Total $: $108,000.00 annually 

Contract Period: Upon award through June 30, 2016 

Method of Procurement: Competitive (2 bids received) 

Price Trend: 44% increase due to the risinQ cost of fuel and raw materials 

Contract Info: Formal _ Annual 2L Support/Maintenance _ Lease -

Recommended 
Contractor(s): Geo-Solutions, Inc, 7011 W. Bee Cave Road, Austin, TX 78746 

Previous Contractor(s): 
Geo-Solutions, Inc, 7011 W. Bee Cave Road, Austin, TX 78746 

Comments: 

Anticipated Future 
Requirements and N/A 
Action: 

Procurement Should this contract not be approved, the Department of Public Works will be 
Alternative: required to procure erosion control and materials on an as needed basis. If there 

is not a readily available source of erosion control materials, the City will not be in 
compliance with NPDES permit requirements. The City would incur higher cost 
and possible infrastructure damage, uncontrolled flooding , massive erosion 
causing property damage, extensive rework and safety concerns to the residents 
of the City. 

Using 
Public Works Department(s): 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: April 3, 2013 

For: Erosion Control and Materials Geo-Solutions, Inc. C-3 Environmental 

6100002754 
7011 Bee Caves Road 132 Nell Deane Blvd. 

DS 

Item 
Austin, Schertz, 

Description TX 78746 TX 78154 
512-330-0796 

1 Type 1A Ultra Short-Term Erosion Control Blanket - « 60 days) 
Manufacturer: Western NAG 

SR-1 , Rapid Go Netting DS150 
Item Number: (8' x 112.5 
Price per roll: $27.50 $30 .36 
Price per square yard : 0.275 $0.38 
Square yards per roll: 100 80 

2 Type 1A Short-Term Erosion Control Blanket - (up to 12 months) 
Manufacturer: Western NAG 

SR-1, Rapid Go Netting S150 
Item Number: (8' x 112.5 
Price Per Roll: $27.50 $25.01 
Price Per Square Yard: 0.275 $0.31 
Square Yards Per Roll: 100 80 

3 Type 2A Extended-Term Erosion Control Blanket - (> 12 months and < 24 months) 
Manufacturer: Western NAG 
Item Number: CS-3 (7.5' x 120') SC150 
Price per roll: $65.00 $69.00 
Price per square yard: $0.65 $0.86 
Square yards per roll: 100 80 

4 Type 3A Long-Term Erosion Control Blanket - (> 24 months and < 36 months) 
Manufacturer: Western NAG 
Item Number: CC-4 (7.5' x 120') C125 
Price per roll: $75.00 $89.24 
Price per square yard: $0.75 $1.11 
Square yards per roll: 100 80 

5 Permanent Turf Reinforcement Mats (TRMs) 
5A. Type 1B Permanent Turf Reinforcement Mats (TRMs) 

Manufacturer: Propex T-RECS TRM 
Item Number: Landlok 435 
Price per roll: $280.00 $493.35 
Price per square yard : $2.80 $8.22 
Square yards per roll: 100 60 

5B. Type 2B Permanent Turf Reinforcement Mats (TRMs) 
Manufacturer: Propex ECP2 TRM 
Item Number: Landlok 450 
Price per roll: $300.00 $345.00 
Price per square yard $3.00 $3.45 
Square yards per roll 100 100 

5C. Type 3B Permanent Turf Reinforcement Mats (TRMs) 
Manufacturer: Propex RECYC 1GX TRM 
Item Number: Pyramat 
Price per roll: $850.00 $218.50 
Price per square yard: $10.00 $2.18 
Square yards per roll: 85 100 

6 Accessories Needed for Installation of Temporary Erosion Control 
Blankets and Permanent Turf Reinforcement Mats 

6.A.1. Wire Staples - Bulk 
Manufacturer: Geo-Solutions, Inc. 
Item Number: Staples 6" 11 gauge 
Price Per 500: n/a $12.65 
Price Per 1,000: $27.50 $25.30 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: April 3, 2013 

For: Erosion Control and Materials Geo-Solutions, Inc. C-3 Environmental 

7011 Bee Caves Road 132 Nell Deane Blvd. 
6100002754 DS 

Austin , Schertz, 
Item Description TX 78746 TX 78154 

512-330-0796 

6.A.2. Deleted 

6.B.1 . Biodegradable Stakes - 4 inch 
Manufacturer: Western No bid 
Item Number: 4" Bio-Stakes 
Price per bundle: $40.25 
Stakes per bundle: 500 

6.B.2. Biodegradable Stakes - 6 inch 
Manufacturer: Western No bid 
Item Number: 6" Bio-Stake 
Price per bundle: $50.75 
Stakes per bundle: 500 

6.C.1. Biodegradable Hardwood Stakes - 6 inch 
Manufacturer: North American Green No bid 
Item Number: 6" EcoStake 
Price per bundle: $83.25 
Stakes per bundle: 1,000 

6.C.2. Biodegradable Hardwood Stakes - 12 inch 
Manufacturer: North American Green No bid 
Item Number: 12" EcoStake 
Price per bundle: $78.75 
Stakes per bundle: 500 

6.C.3. Biodegradable Hardwood Stakes, Tapered - 18 inch 
Manufacturer: Easy Drive No bid 
Item Number: 18" Stake 
Price per bundle: $12.00 
Stakes per bundle: 50 

6.C.4. Biodegradable Hardwood Stakes, Tapered - 24 inch 
Manufacturer: Easy Drive No bid 
Item Number: 24" Stake 
Price per bundle: $13.50 
Stakes per bundle: 50 

6.D.1. Deleted 

6.D.2. Deleted 

6.E.1. Deleted 

6.E.2. Cartridge Stake Guns - Manual 
Manufacturer: North American Green No bid 
Item Number: F300B, Case of 24 
Price per each: $518.50 per case 

7.A. Temporary Sediment Control Fence wi Stakes - 36" x 100' 
Manufacturer: Geo-Solutions 
Item Number: 
Price per roll: $40.00 $51.29 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: April 3, 2013 

For: Erosion Control and Materials Geo-Solutions, Inc. C-3 Environmental 

6100002754 OS 
7011 Bee Caves Road 132 Nell Deane Blvd. 

Item 
Austin, Schertz, 

Description TX 78746 TX 78154 
512-330-0796 

8 Biodegradable Sediment Filtration System 
Manufacturer: Western No bid 
Item Number: CS-3, (7.5' 120') 
Price per roll: $65.00 
Price per square yard : $0.65 
Square yards per roll: $100.00 

9 Gabion, Galvanized (Woven Wire Mesh) 
9.A. 6' length x 3' width x 3' height x 2 cells 

Manufacturer: 
Item Number: 

Maccaferri Terra Aqua 

Price per each: $60.25 $73.08 

9.B. 9' length x 3' width x 3' height x 3 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri Terra Aqua 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $85.00 $104.19 

9.C. 12' length x 3' width x 3' height x 4 cells 
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri Terra Aqua 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $95.50 $131 .27 

9.0. 6' length x 3' width x 1.5' height x 2 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri Terra Aqua 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $43.75 $54.10 

9.E. 9' length x 3' width x 1.5' height x 3 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri Terra Aqua 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $60.25 $77.10 

9.F. 12' length x 3' width x 1.5' height x 4 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri Terra Aqua 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $68.50 $96.08 

9.G. 6' length x 3' width x l' height x 2 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri Terra Aqua 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $39.00 $48.70 

9.H. 9' length x 3' width x l' height x 3 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri Terra Aqua 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $58.00 $74.95 

9.1. 12' length x 3' width x l' height x 4 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri Terra Aqua 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $61.50 $86.59 

10 Gabion, Galvanized (Woven Wire Mesh - PVC Coated) 
10.A. 6' length x 3' width x 3' height x 2 cells 

Manufacturer: Maccaferri Terra Aqua 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $70.75 $91.40 

10.B. 9' length x 3' width x 3' height x 3 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri Terra Aqua 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $99.00 $131.15 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: April 3, 2013 

For: Erosion Control and Materials Geo-Solutions, Inc. C-3 Environmental 

7011 Bee Caves Road 132 Nell Deane Blvd. 
6100002754 OS 

Item Description 
Austin , Schertz, 
TX 78746 TX 78154 
512-330-0796 

10.C. 12' length x 3' width x 3' height x 4 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri Terra Aqua 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $116.75 $141.73 

10.0. 6' length x 3' width x 1.5' height x 2 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri Terra Aqua 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $49.75 $64.51 

10.E. 9' length x 3' width x 1.5' height x 3 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri Terra Aqua 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $70.75 90.32 

10.F. 12' length x 3' width x 1.5' height x 4 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri Terra Aqua 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $81.50 $112.41 

10.G. 6' length x 3' width x l' height x 2 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri Terra Aqua 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $45.00 $55.91 

10.H. 9' length x 3' width x l' height x 3 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri Terra Aqua 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $61.50 $80.64 

10.1. 12' length x 3' width x l' height x 4 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri Terra Aqua 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $72.00 $102.63 

11 Reno Mattress, Galvanized (Woven Wire Mesh) 
11.A. 9' length x 6' width x 6" height x 3 cells 

Manufacturer: Maccaferri Terra Aqua 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $71.25 $71.62 

11.8. 12' length x 6' width x 6" height x 4 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri Terra Aqua 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $93.50 $107.26 

11.C. 9' length x 6' width x 9" height x 3 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri Terra Aqua 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $78.00 $89.91 

11.0. 12' length x 6' width x 9" height x 4 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri Terra Aqua 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $102.75 $115.42 

11.E. 12' length x 6' width x 12" height x 4 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri Terra Aqua 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $106.75 $119.51 

11.F. 15' length x 3' width x 6" height x 5 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $54.75 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: April 3, 2013 

For: Erosion Control and Materials Geo-Solutions, Inc. C-3 Environmental 

6100002754 
7011 Bee Caves Road 132 Nell Deane Blvd. 

DS 

Item 
Austin , Schertz, 

Description TX 78746 TX 78154 
512-330-0796 

11.G. 15' length x 3' width x 9" height x 5 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $60.50 

11 .H. 15' length x 3' width x 12" height x 5 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $67.00 

11.1. 15' length x 6' width x 6" height x 5 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $107.00 

11 .J. 15' length x 6' width x 9" height x 5 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $118.25 

11.K. 15' length x 6' width x 12" height x 5 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $122.50 

11.L. 18' length x 3' width x 6" height x 6 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $66.00 

11.M. 18' length x 3' width x 9" height x 6 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $72.50 

11.N. 18' length x 3' width x 12" height x 6 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per Each $102.50 

11.0. 18' length x 6' width x 6" height x 6 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $128.25 

11.P. 18' length x 6' width x 9" height x 6 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $141 .50 

11.Q. 18' length x 6' width x 12" height x 6 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $147.00 

11 .R. 21' length x 3' width x 6" height x 7 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $77.00 

11.S. 21' length x 3' width x 9" height x 7 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 

Item Number: 
Price per each: $84.75 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: April 3, 2013 

For: Erosion Control and Materials Geo-Solutions, Inc. C-3 Environmental 

7011 Bee Caves Road 132 Nell Deane Blvd. 
6100002754 OS 

Austin , Schertz, 
Item Description TX 78746 TX 78154 

512-330-0796 

11.T. 21 ' length x 3' width x 12" height x 7 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $93.75 

11.U. 21' length x 6' width x 6" height x 7 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $149.25 

11.v. 21' length x 6' width x 9" height x 7 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $164.75 

11 .W. 21' length x 6' width x 12" height x 7 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $171.50 

11.X. 24' length x 3' width x 6" height x 8 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $88.25 

11.Y. 24' length x 3' width x 9" height x 8 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $97.00 

11.AA. 24' length x 3' width x 12" height x 8 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $107.00 

11.AB. 24' length x 6' width x 6" height x 8 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $170.50 

11 .AC. 24' length x 6' width x 9" height x 8 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $188.25 

11.AD. 24' length x 6' width x 12" height x 8 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $196.00 

11.AE. 27' length x 3' width x 6" height x 9 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $94.25 

11.AF. 27' length x 3' width x 9" height x 9 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $109.25 

11.AG. 27' length x 3' width x 12" height x 9 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $120.50 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: April 3, 2013 

For: Erosion Control and Materials Geo-Solutions, Inc. C-3 Environmental 

6100002754 
7011 Bee Caves Road 132 Nell Deane Blvd . 

OS 

Item 
Austin , Schertz, 

Description TX 78746 TX 78154 
512-330-0796 

11.AH. 27' length x 6' width x 6" height x 9 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $191.50 

11.AI. 27' length x 6' width x 9" height x 9 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $211.50 

11.AJ. 27' length x 6' width x 12" height x 9 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $220.50 

11.AK. 30' length x 6' width x 6" height x 10 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $110.50 

11.Al. 30' length x 3' width x 9" height x 10 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $121.50 

11.AM. 30' length x 3' width x 12" height x 10 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $133.75 

11.AN. 30' length x 6' width x 6" height x 10 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $212.50 

11.AO. 30' length x 6' width x 9" height x 10 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $234.75 

11.AP. 30' length x 6' width x 12" height x 10 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $308.75 

12 Reno Mattress, Galvanized (Woven Wire Mesh - PVC Coated) 
12.A. 9' length x 6' width x 6" height x 3 cells 

Manufacturer: Maccaferri Terra Aqua 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $79.25 $112.90 

12.B. 12' length x 6' width x 6" height x 4 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri Terra Aqua 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $105.25 $143.01 

12.C. 9' length x 6' width x 9" height x 3 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri Terra Aqua 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $87.50 $122.57 

12.0. 12' length x 6' width x 9" height x 4 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri Terra Aqua 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $115.75 $152.68 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: April 3, 2013 

For: Erosion Control and Materials Geo-Solutions, Inc. C-3 Environmental 

6100002754 
7011 Bee Caves Road 132 Nell Deane Blvd . 

OS 

Item 
Austin , Schertz, 

Description TX 78746 TX 78154 
512-330-0796 

12.E. 9' length x 6' width x 12" height x 3 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri Terra Aqua 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $97.00 $129.36 

12.F. 12' length x 6' width x 12" height x 4 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri Terra Aqua 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $120.50 $159.13 

12.G. 15' length x 3' width x 6" height x 5 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $73.75 

12.H. 15' length x 3' width x 9" height x 5 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $81.25 

12.1. 15' length x 3' width x 12" height x 5 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $80.50 

12.J. 15' length x 6' width x 6" height x 5 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $128.25 

12K 15' length x 6' width x 9" height x 5 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $141.50 

12.L. 15' length x 6' width x 12" height x 5 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $145.50 

12.M. 18' length x 3' width x 6" height x 6 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $79.25 

12.N. 18' length x 3' width x 9" height x 6 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $87.00 

12.0. 18' length x 3' width x 12" height x 6 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $96.00 

12.P. 18' length x 6' width x 6" height x 6 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each $153.75 

12.Q. 18' length x 6' width x 9" height x 6 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 

Item Number: 
Price per each: $164.25 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: April 3, 2013 

For: Erosion Control and Materials Geo-Solutions, Inc. C-3 Environmental 

6100002754 
7011 Bee Caves Road 132 Nell Deane Blvd. 

DS 
Austin , Schertz, 

Item Description TX 78746 TX 78154 
512-330-0796 

12.R. 18' length x 6' width x 12" height x 6 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $176.00 

12.S. 21' length x 3' width x 6" height x 7 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $92.50 

12.T. 21' length x 3' width x 9" height x 7 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $101.50 

12.U. 21' length x 3' width x 12" height x 7 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $112.50 

12.v. 21' length x 6' width x 6" height x 7 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $179.25 

12.W. 21' length x 6' width x 9" height x 7 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $198.25 

12.X. 21' length x 6' width x 12" height x 7 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $206.00 

12.Y. 24' length x 3' width x 6" height x 8 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $106.00 

12.Z. 24' length x 3' width x 9" height x 8 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $116.00 

12.AA. 24' length x 3' width x 12" height x 8 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $128.25 

12.AB. 24' length x 6' width x 6" height x 8 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $204.75 

12.AC. 24' length x 6' width x 9" height x 8 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $224.75 

12.AD. 24' length x 6' width x 12" height x 8 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $234.75 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: April 3, 2013 

For: Erosion Control and Materials Geo-Solutions, Inc. C-3 Environmental 

7011 Bee Caves Road 132 Nell Deane Blvd. 
6100002754 DS 

Item Description 
Austin , 
TX 78746 

Schertz, 
TX 78154 

512-330-0796 

12.AE. 27' length x 3' width x 6" height x 9 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $119.25 

12.AF. 27' length x 3' width x 9" height x 9 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $131.50 

12.AG. 27' length x 3' width x 12" height x 9 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $144.75 

12.AH. 27' length x 6' width x 6" height x 9 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $229.25 

12.AI. 27' length x 6' width x 9" height x 9 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $253.75 

12.AJ. 27' length x 6' width x 12" height x 9 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $263.75 

12.AK. 30' length x 3' width x 6" height x 10 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $132.50 

12.AL. 30' length x 3' width x 9" height x 10 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $146.00 

12.AM. 30' length x 3' width x 12" height x 10 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $160.50 

12.AN. 30' length x 6' width x 6" height x 10 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $254.75 

12.AO. 30' length x 6' width x 9" height x 10 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $281.50 

12.AP. 30' length x 6' width x 12" height x 10 cells 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per each: $293.75 

13 Rock Filter Dams 
13.A. 20 Gauge Galvanized Wire - 6' x 150" rolls (for use with Types 1,2, & 3) 

Manufacturer: G C Supply 
Item Number: Poultry netting 6' x 150 
Price per roll: $78.75 $87.97 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: April 3, 2013 

For: Erosion Control and Materials Geo-Solutions, Inc. C-3 Environmental 

7011 Bee Caves Road 132 Nell Deane Blvd. 
6100002754 DS 

Austin, Schertz, 
Item Description TX 78746 TX 78154 

512-330-0796 

13.B. Type 4 Sack Gabions (Reinforced) - 2' width x 3' length 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per roll: $22.50 

13.C. Type 4 Sack Gabions (Reinforced) - 2' width x 6' length 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per roll: $27.00 

13.0. Type 4 Sack Gabions (Reinforced) - 2' width x 9' length 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per roll: $39.25 

13.E. Type 4 Sack Gabions (Reinforced) - 3' width x 3' length 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per roll: $26.00 

13.F. Type 4 Sack Gabions (Reinforced) - 3' width x 6' length 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per roll: $31 .50 

13.G. Type 4 Sack Gabions (Reinforced) - 3' width x 9' length 
Manufacturer: Maccaferri No bid 
Item Number: 
Price per roll: $46.00 

14 Curb, Gutter, and Median Inlet Protection 
14.A. Curb Bag 

Manufacturer: Dandy 
Item Number: GeoCurve 
Price per each: $35.00 $86.25 

14.B. Curb Block 
Manufacturer: Dandy No bid 
Item Number: Curb 10' 
Price per each: $82.25 

14.C. Curb Sack 
Manufacturer: Dandy 
Item Number: Curb Sack 4' x 2' 
Price per each: $48.50 86.25 

15 Flat Grate and Mountable Curb Inlet Protection 
15.A. Bag 

Manufacturer: Dandy 
Item Number: Bag 
Price per each: $36.00 $86.25 

15.B. Sack 
Manufacturer: Pollution Solutions 
Item Number: Yellow Jacket 34 3 x 4 
Price per each: $50.00 $86.25 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: April 3, 2013 

For: Erosion Control and Materials Geo-Solutions, Inc. C-3 Environmental 

6100002754 
7011 Bee Caves Road 132 Nell Deane Blvd. 

DS 

Item Description 
Austin, Schertz, 
TX 78746 TX 78154 
512-330-0796 

15.C. Pop Up 
Manufacturer: Dandy No bid 
Item Number: Pop 
Price per each: $83.25 

16 Warning Barrier Fencing 
16.A. 4' width x 100' length (4.5" x 2.0" aperture size) 

Manufacturer: CDOW 
Item Number: Safety Fence 
Price per roll: $19.75 $22.71 

16.B. 4' width x 100'Iength (3.5" x 1.3" aperture size) 
Manufacturer: CDOW 
Item Number: Safety Fence 
Price per roll: $19.75 $55.77 

17 T-Post 
17.A. Lightweight T -post 

Manufacturer: W. Silver 
Item Number: 6'1.25 
Price per 100: $406.25 $2.02 
Price per 500: $2,031.25 $2.02 

17.B. Heavy weight T -post 
Manufacturer: W. Silver 
Item Number: 6' 1.33 
Price per 100: $412.50 $2.85 
Price per 500: $2,062.50 $2.85 

18 Non-Woven Geotextiles 
Manufacturer: Mirafi Terra Tex 
Item Number: 160N 
Price per roll: $495.00 $368.00 
Price per square yard: $0.99 $0.61 
Square yards per roll: 500 600 

19 Hydraulic Mulches 
19.A. Wood Fiber/Cellulose Fiber Blend 

Manufacturer: Central Fiber Enviro-Mix 
Item Number: Wood Fiber Blend 
Price per bag: $9.65 $11.21 
Pounds per bag: 50 50 

19.B. Wood Fiber 
Manufacturer: Central Fiber Enviro-Gold 
Item Number: Wood Fiber 
Price per bag: $10.65 $12.93 
Pounds per bag: 50 50 

19.C. Cellulose Fiber 
Manufacturer: Central Fiber Enviro Grow 
Item Number: Paper Fiber 
Price per bag: $9.40 $10.17 
Pounds per bag: 50 50 

20 Flexible Growth Medium- FGM 
Manufacturer: Profile Products Earth Guard 
Item Number: Flexterra HP-FGM 
Price per bag: $40.75 $35.60 
Pounds per bag: 50 50 

Prompt Payment Discount: 1/2% 10 Days Net 30 
Delivery: 3-Days 3-Days 

Estimated Annual Total $10B,OOO.OC Incomplete 

Estimated Annual Award $1 08,OOO.O~ 

Deleted - Items 6.A.2. 6.0.1, 6.0.2 and 6.E.l based on discontinuation of products. 
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