
LOC 
10/2/08 
Item No. 6 

AN ORDINANCE 2 0 0 8 - 1 0 - 0 2 - 0 8 7 1  
ACCEPTING THE BIDS FROM WAUKESHA-PEARCE INDUSTRIES, INC., 
FOUR SEASONS EQUIPMENT, INC., COOPER EQUIPMENT CO., 
VERMEER EQUIPMENT OF TEXAS, INC., EQUIPMENT DEPOT, CLOSNER 
EQUIPMENT CO., INC., STEWART AND STEVENSON, AND GREEN 
MOUNTAIN EQUIPMENT AND RENTAL, TO PROVIDE THE CITY WITH 
HEAVY EQUIPMENT FOR A COST OF $2,698,973.00, FROM THE 
EQUIPMENT RENEWAL AND REPLACEMENT FUND, AIRPORT 
OPERATIONS FUND, HOTIALAMODOME FUND AND GOLF OPERATIONS 
AND MAINTENANCE FUND. 

WHEREAS, bids were submitted to provide the City of San Antonio with heavy equipment 
which will be utilized by various City departments; and 

WHEREAS, the bid submitted by Texana Machinery for items 2A and 2B was incomplete; and 

WHEREAS, Waukesha-Pearce - Item 1 ; Four Seasons Equipment - Items 2A & 2B; Cooper Equipment 
Co. - Items 3, 6, 7, 8, 12, & 18; Vermeer Equipment of Texas, Inc. - Item 4; Equipment Depot - Items 9 
& 20; Closner Equipment Co., Inc. - Item 11; Stewart & Stevenson - Item 13; and Green Mountain 
Equipment and Rental - Items 15 & 16 were the low responsive bidders for an estimated cost of 
$2,698,973.00; NOW THEREFORE: 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO: 

SECTION 1. The low, responsive bid of Waukesha-Pearce - Item 1 ; Four Seasons Equipment - Items 
2A & 2B; Cooper Equipment Co. - Items 3, 6, 7, 8, 12, & 18; Vermeer Equipment of Texas, Inc. - Item 
4; Equipment Depot - Items 9 & 20; Closner Equipment Co., Inc. - Item 1 1 ; Stewart & Stevenson - Item 
13; and Green Mountain Equipment and Rental - Items 15 & 16 to provide the City of San Antonio with 
heavy equipment for an estimated cost of $2,698,973.00 is hereby accepted, subject to and contingent 
upon the deposit of all required bonds, performance deposits, insurance certificates and endorsements. 
The bid and bid tabulation sheet are attached hereto and incorporated herein for all purposes as Exhibit I. 

SECTION 2. It has been found and declared that the bid from Texana Machinery for items 2A and 2B 
was incomplete. 

SECTION 3. Funding for this ordinance is available in the Fund, Cost Center, General Ledger listed 
below as part of the FY08 Budget. 

Fund Text 

Equip Renewal 

Aviation Operations 

HOT 1 ALAMODOME 

Golf 
TOTAL: $2,698,973.00 

Fund No 

7200 1000 

5 100 1000 

290 16000 

29090000 

Amount 

$2,495,124.00 

$24,595.00 

$98,380.00 

$80,874.00 

Cost Center 

1503200001 

3302060001 

4504010001 

8054000001 

General Ledger 

5709090 

5709060 

5709060 

5709060 

GL Text 

M&E Auto 

M&E Auto 

M&E Auto 

M&E Auto 



SECTION 4. Payment is authorized in the amounts/vendors listed below and should be encumbered 
with a purchase order. 

SECTION 5. The financial allocations in this Ordinance are subject to approval by the Director of 
Finance, City of San Antonio. The Director may, subject to concurrence by the City Manager or the City 
Manager's designee, correct allocations to specific Cost Centers and Fund Numbers as necessary to carry 
out the purpose of this Ordinance. 

SECTION 6. This ordinance shall take effect October 12,2008. 

PASSED AND APPROVED this 2"* day of October, 2008. 
a 

PHIL HARDBERGER 

ATTEST: 

APPROVED AS TO FORM: 
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Agenda Voting Results - 6

Name: 5, 6, 8, 11, 13, 14, 15, 16, 18, 20, 23, 24, 25, 27, 28, 30B
Date: 10/02/2008
Time: 10:40:42 AM

Vote Type: Motion to Approve
Description: An Ordinance accepting the bids from Waukesha-Pearce Industries, Inc., Four

Seasons Equipment, Inc., Cooper Equipment Co., Vermeer Equipment of
Texas, Inc., Equipment Depot, Closner Equipment Co., Inc., Stewart and
Stevenson, and Green Mountain Equipment and Rental, to provide the City
with heavy equipment for a cost of $2,698,973.00, from the Equipment
Renewal and Replacement Fund, Airport Operations Fund, HOT/Alamodome
Fund and Golf Operations and Maintenance Fund. [Sharon De La Garza,
Assistant City Manager; Janie Cantu, Director, Purchasing & General Services]

Result: Passed

Voter Group Not
Present Yea Nay Abstain Motion Second

Phil Hardberger Mayor  x     
Mary Alice P. Cisneros District 1  x   x  

Sheila D. McNeil District 2  x     
Jennifer V. Ramos District 3  x     
Philip A. Cortez District 4  x    x
Lourdes Galvan District 5 x      
Delicia Herrera District 6  x     
Justin Rodriguez District 7 x      
Diane G. Cibrian District 8  x     
Louis E. Rowe District 9  x     
John G. Clamp District 10  x     



Exhibit I 
City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

210-667-9490 

rpose Bucket. Grappler Bucket 

ss trade in Unit #734: 
ss trade in Unil#735: 
ss trade in Unit #4533: 
ss trade in Unit X4500: 
tal Less Trade ins: 

ss trade in Unit #805: 
ss trade in Unit #809: 
ss trade in Unit #828: 
tal Less trade-ins: 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

tal Less trade-ins: 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

For: Heavy Equipment 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: August 15. 2008 
Waukesha-Pearce Four Seasons Cooper Equipment Vermeer Equipment Equipment Depot Closner Equipment Stewart 8i Stevenson 

For. Heavy Equipment Industries, Inc. Equipment, Inc. Co. of Texas. Inc Co.. Inc. 

08-097 ND 3740 SE Loop 410 9702 IH 10 East 17474 Judson Rd. 4455 Director Drive 3935 1H 35 North P.O. Box 917 5717 IH 10 East 

San Antonio, TX Converse, TX 78109 San Antonio, TX San Antonio. TX San Antonio, TX Schertz. TX 78154 San Antonio. TX 
78222 210-667-9490 78247 78219 782 19 210-732-2131 . 78219 

Item Description QN 21 0-648-4444 210-657-5151 21 0-337-7700 210-225-1221 210-662-5670 
14 Deleted 

15 LoaderIBackhoe 2WD 2 
Price Per Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Price Total 

Price Per Each 

Price Per Each 

Holt Cat: No Bid 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

1 
Green Mountain Equipment & Alamo Ag-Con Crafco Texas. Inc. RDO Equipment Texana Machinery W8J Truck B 

For: Heavy Equipment Rental Equipment Company Equipment lnc. 

08-097 ND 6450 N Loop 1604 E 2940 S.E. Loop 410 105 Tower Drive 5400 N. IH 35 4146 IH 10 E P.O. Box 1308 

San Antonio, TX 78247 San Antonio, TX 78222 San Antonio. TX 78232 San Antonio. TX 78218 San Antonio. TX 78219 Helotes. TX 78023 
2 10-650-4600 210-648-3673 2 10-496-2070 21 0-333-8000 21 0-509-0040 210-661-6300 

Item Description QN 

1 Hydraulic Excavator. Carrier Mounted, 4x4 2 
Price per Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Price Total 

Less trade in Unit #898: 
Less trade in Unit #899: 
Total Less trade-ins: 

Make 
Model 

Delivery 

2A Loaders, 4-Wheel Drive, Articulated, General 
Purpose Bucket, Fork Assembly 1 INCOMPLETE 
Price per Each $1 10,330.00 No Bid No Bid $1 14.140.00 $1 11,888.00 No Bid 
Price Total (Item 2A) $1 10.330.00 $1 14.140.00 $1 11,888 00 

Make JCB John Deere Case 
Model 426ZX 544K 621EMTMR 

28 Loaders. 4-Wheel Drive, Articulated. General 
Purpose Bucket, Grappler Bucket 2 

Price per Each $124.325.00 No Bid No Bid $1 33,000.00 Not Provided No Bid 
Price Total (Item 28) $248,650.00 $266.000.00 
Price Total (Items 2A & 2B) $358,980.00 $380.140 00 

Less trade in Unit 6734: $14,000.00 $23.600.00 $23.500.00 
Less trade in Unit #735: $16.000.00 $21.000.00 $17,000.00 
Less trade in Unit t4533: $16,000.00 $22,100.00 $21.500.00 
Less trade in Unit #4500: $20.000.00 $1 5.300.00 $15,000.00 
Total Less Trade ins: $292,980.00 $298.140.00 

Make JCB John Deere Not Provided 
Model 426ZX 544K 

Delivery 120 days 45 days 

3 Double Drum Vibratoly Compactors 3 
Price per Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Price Total 

Less trade in Unit #805: 
Less trade in Unit #809: 
Less trade in Unit #828: 
Total Less trade-ins: 

Make 
Model 

Delivery 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

d 
For. Heavy Equipment 

Green Mountain Equipment & 
Rental 

6450 N Loop 1604 E 

San Antonio, TX 78247 
21 0-650-4600 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

08-097 

Item 
4 

5 

6 

7 

8 

Alamo Ag-Con 
Equipment 

2940 S.E. Loop 410 

San Antonio. TX 78222 
21 0-648-3673 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

Description 
Waste Woodlsrush Tub Grinder 
Price per Each 
Price Total 

Less trade in Unit #4406: 
Total Less trade-in: 

Make 
Model 

Delivery 

Deleted 

Roller, Tired Pneumatic, Articulated 
Price per Each 
Price Total 

Less trade in Unit #818: 
Total Less trade-ins: 

Make 
Model 

Delivery 

Roller. Tired Pneumatic. Rigid Frame. 15 ton 
minimum 
Price per Each 
Price Total 

Less trade in Unit #819: 
Less trade in Unit #821: 
Less trade in Unit #823: 
Less trade in Unit #824: 
Total Less trade-ins: 

Make 
Model 

Delivery 

Chip Spreader 
Price per Each 
Price Total 

Less trade in Unit # 861: 
Less trade in Unit # 882: 
Total Less trade-ins: 

Make 

Model 

Delivery 

ND 

QTY 
1 

2 

4 

1 

Crafco Texas, Inc. 

105 Tower Drive 

San Antonio, TX 78232 
2 10-496-2070 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

RDO Equipment 
Company 

5400 N. IH 35 

San Antonio, TX 78218 
2 10-661-6300 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

Texana Machinery 

4146 IH 10 E 

San Antonio, TX 78219 
2 10-333-8000 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

W8J Truck & 
Equipment lnc. 

P.O. Box 1308 

Helotes. TX 78023 
21 0-509-0040 

No Bid 

$86.000.00 
<$86,000.00> 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 
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CITY OF SAN ANTONIO
Request for Council Action

Agenda Item # 6
Council Meeting Date: 10/2/2008
RFCA Tracking No: R-3819 

DEPARTMENT:  Purchasing and General
Services

DEPARTMENT HEAD:  Janie Cantu

 
COUNCIL DISTRICT(S) IMPACTED:
City Wide
 
SUBJECT:
Purchase of Heavy Equipment for Various City Departments

SUMMARY: 

This ordinance authorizes the acceptance of a contract with the following: Waukesha-
Pearce Industries, Inc., $587,904.00; Four Seasons Equipment, Inc., $257,240.00;
Cooper Equipment Co., $932,949.00; Vermeer Equipment of Texas, Inc., $478,484.00;
Equipment Depot, $184,153.00; Closner Equipment Co., Inc., $147,954.00; Stewart and
Stevenson, $29,415.00; and Green Mountain Equipment and Rental, $80,874.00; to
provide various City departments with heavy equipment for a total cost of
$2,698,973.00.

 
BACKGROUND INFORMATION:
The attached tabulation of thirteen (13) bids to provide the Public Works, Solid Waste
Management, Parks and Recreation, Aviation and Convention Sports and Entertainment
Facilities departments with thirty (30) heavy equipment units is hereby submitted for City
Council consideration and action.
 
No bids were received for items 5, 10 and 17.  These items will be rebid at a later date. 
Item 14 was deleted from the bid due to a change in departmental requirements.  The
low responsive bids were submitted by Waukesha-Pearce – Item 1; Four Seasons
Equipment – Items 2A & 2B; Cooper Equipment Co. – Items 3, 6, 7, 8, 12, & 18;
Vermeer Equipment of Texas, Inc. – Item 4; Equipment Depot – Items 9 & 20; Closner
Equipment Co., Inc. – Item 11; Stewart & Stevenson – Item 13; and Green Mountain
Equipment and Rental – Items 15 & 16 for an estimated total amount of $2,698,973.00.
 
This purchase will provide twenty-two (22) replacement units to the City’s heavy
equipment fleet which includes hydraulic excavators, articulated loaders, double drum
vibratory compactors, brush tub grinder, articulated and rigid frame rollers, chip
spreader, skid steer loaders, curb and gutter machine, motor grader, forklifts, and an
asphalt transport trailer.  This purchase will also provide eight (8) additional units to the
City’s heavy equipment fleet which includes three (3) loader/backhoes for the Golf
Operations Department, one (1) propane powered forklift for the Aviation Department
and four (4) propane powered forklifts for the Convention Sports and Entertainment
Facilities Department.
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The life expectancy of the new equipment is 120 months.  Equipment purchased will be
placed in the Vehicle Replacement Program beginning FY 2009 with the exception of the
units for Golf Operations and Aviation.  Six (6) propane powered forklifts are being
purchased.  Alternative fueled equipment for the remaining applications are not currently
available.  Vehicles and equipment that meet their expected life cycle are usually sold at
auction but are sometimes traded-in to the selling dealer.  The equipment that is being
replaced will be traded-in and the value of the old equipment will be applied to the
purchase price of the new equipment.  

 
ISSUE:

This contract will provide twenty-two (22) replacement and eight (8) additional pieces of
heavy equipment in various configurations to include hydraulic excavators, articulated
loaders, double drum vibratory compactors, brush tub grinder, articulated and rigid
frame rollers, chip spreader, skid steer loaders, curb and gutter machine, motor grader,
forklifts, asphalt transport trailer, and loader/backhoes.  This equipment will be used by
various departments for routine maintenance of streets and city properties.  The
replacement of this equipment is consistent with the City’s Vehicle Replacement
Program. 
 
The successful bidders are required to coordinate training to demonstrate the safe
operation of all equipment being purchased.  The contract allows for additional
purchases through December 31, 2008, depending on the availability of funds.

 
ALTERNATIVES:
The existing equipment has reached the end of its useful service life in accordance with
the Vehicle Replacement Program.  An alternative would be to continue utilizing existing
units; however, these units would require increased maintenance and repairs resulting in
additional expenses and unavailability of equipment which could impact the departments’
ability to meet mission requirements.  Should this contract not be approved, routine but
necessary services such as streets maintenance may be compromised.

 
FISCAL IMPACT: 
The total cost of this purchase is $2,698,973.00.  This purchase will be funded utilizing
the Equipment Renewal and Replacement Fund, Airport Operations Fund,
HOT/Alamodome Fund and Golf Operations and Maintenance Fund.

 
RECOMMENDATION:

Staff recommends the approval of this purchase with Waukesha-Pearce Industries, Inc., Four
Seasons Equipment, Inc., Cooper Equipment Co., Vermeer Equipment of Texas, Inc., Equipment
Depot, Closner Equipment Co., Inc., Stewart and Stevenson, and Green Mountain Equipment and
Rental for a total cost of $2,698,973.00.

 
ATTACHMENT(S):

File Description File Name

Waukesha-Pearce Industries, Inc. Waukesha-Pearce Industries, Inc. - Contract.pdf

Waukesha-Pearce Industries, Inc. - Addendums
I and II

Addendums I and II - Waukesha-Pearce Industries,
Inc..pdf

http://cosaweb/rfca/upload/R_3819_20080828083616.pdf
http://cosaweb/rfca/upload/R_3819_20080828083710.pdf
http://cosaweb/rfca/upload/R_3819_20080828083710.pdf
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Four Seasons Equipment, Inc. - Contract Four Seasons - Contract.pdf

Addendums I and II - Four Seasons Equipment,
Inc. Addendums I and II - Four Seasons.pdf

Cooper Equipment Co. - Contract Cooper Equipment Co. - Contract.pdf

Addendums I and II - Cooper Equipment Co. Addendums I and II - Cooper Equipment.pdf

Vermeer Equipment Co. - Contract Vermeer Equipment of Texas, Inc. - Contract.pdf

Addendums I and II - Vermeer Equipment of
Texas, Inc.

Addendums I and II - Vermeer Equipment of Texas, Inc. -
Contract.pdf

Equipment Depot - Contract Equipment Depot - Contract.pdf

Closner Equipment Co. - Contract Closner Contract.pdf

Addendums I and II - Closner Equipment Co. Addendums I and II - Closner.pdf

Steward & Stevenson - Contract Stewart & Stevenson - Contract.pdf

Addendums I and II - Stewart & Stevenson Addendums I and II - Stewart & Stevenson.pdf

Green Mountain Equipment & Rental - Contract Green Mountain Equipment and Rental - Contract.pdf

Addendums I and II - Green Mountain
Equipment & Rental

Addendums I and II -Green Mountain Equipment and
Rental Ltd..pdf

Bid Tab #3819 Heavy_Equipment.pdf

Voting Results  

Ordinance/Supplemental Documents 200810020871.pdf

DEPARTMENT HEAD AUTHORIZATIONS:
 Janie B. Cantu   Director   Purchasing and General Services

APPROVED FOR COUNCIL CONSIDERATION:
 Sharon De La Garza   Assistant City Manager    

http://cosaweb/rfca/upload/R_3819_20080828083757.pdf
http://cosaweb/rfca/upload/R_3819_20080828083823.pdf
http://cosaweb/rfca/upload/R_3819_20080828083823.pdf
http://cosaweb/rfca/upload/R_3819_20080828083852.pdf
http://cosaweb/rfca/upload/R_3819_20080828083916.pdf
http://cosaweb/rfca/upload/R_3819_20080828084031.pdf
http://cosaweb/rfca/upload/R_3819_20080828084140.pdf
http://cosaweb/rfca/upload/R_3819_20080828084140.pdf
http://cosaweb/rfca/upload/R_3819_20080828084205.pdf
http://cosaweb/rfca/upload/R_3819_20080828084228.pdf
http://cosaweb/rfca/upload/R_3819_20080828084248.pdf
http://cosaweb/rfca/upload/R_3819_20080828084323.pdf
http://cosaweb/rfca/upload/R_3819_20080828084343.pdf
http://cosaweb/rfca/upload/R_3819_20080828084404.pdf
http://cosaweb/rfca/upload/R_3819_20080828084438.pdf
http://cosaweb/rfca/upload/R_3819_20080828084438.pdf
http://cosaweb/rfca/upload/R_3819_20080916042036.pdf
http://cosaweb/rfca/upload/R_3819_20081006032536.pdf
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