City of San Antonio
Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened:

December 11, 2015

For: AIC EMS Medications & Equipment

Bound Tree Medical, LLC

Moore Medical

1690 New Britain Ave.

Henry Schein Inc.

Life-Assist, Inc.

Midwest Medical Supply

Co., Inc.

6100006766 sc ooy Tutle Crossing PO Box 3222 11277 Sunrise Park Drive |13400 Lakefront Drive
Ttem Description Est. Annual|Dublin, OH Farmington, CT Irmo, SC Rancho Cordova, CA Earth City, MO
Quantity 43016 06032 20063 95742 63045
CATEGORY A: PHARMACEUTICAL
1 Acetaminophen-TYLENOL Tabs, 325 mg per tab, Packet (2 tabs | 25,000
per packet), OR APPROVED EQUAL Packets
Mig. Suggested Retail Price per unit $0.39 $4.50/BX NO BID $8.50 NO BID
Percentage Discount% 54.31% 0% 41.2%
COSA Net Price $0.06/PK $0.06"] $0.06/PK
Extended Total $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00
2 Adenosine Inj., 12mg/mL (3mg/mL), PFS, (For Rapid Bolus 8,900 PFS
Intravenous Use; SINO:N2PLDK6C326Y;
(GTIN:(01)20325021301689), OR APPROVED EQUAL
Mig. Suggested Retail Price per unit $85.99) $20.99/EA| NO BID $51.50) NO BID
Percentage Discount% 68.79% 0% 55.3%
COSA Net Price $26.84/PFS $29.99) $23.00)
Extended Total $238,876.00 $266,911.00 $204,700.00
3 Amidate, Vial 40mg/20mi - MDV - (2mg/mi) , OR APPROVED | 1,000 Vials
EQUAL
Mig. Suggested Retail Price per unit $30.99) $8.99/EA NO BID $16.00) NO BID
Percentage Discount% 72.99% 0% 56.3%
COSA Net Price $837VL $8.99 $7.00
Extended Total $8,370.00 $8,980.00 $7,000.00
4 Auophine Sulfate, 1mg (0.1mg/mi) 10ml, PFS (Needless), OR | 2,500 PFS
APPROVED EQUAL
Mig. Suggested Retail Price per unit $13.89) $13.24/EA] NO BID $13.86] NO BID
Percentage Discount% 22.32% 0% 35.1%
COSA Net Price $10.79/PFS $13.24] $9.00
Extended Total $26,975.00) $33,100.00) $22,500.00)
5 Bottled Nitroglycerine IV, 25mg/250mL, Bottle, OR APPROVED | 325 Bottles
EQUAL
Mig. Suggested Retail Price per unit $10.79) NO BID NO BID $33.33] NO BID
Percentage Discount% 57.66% 35.7%
COSA Net Price $8.38/8T $21.42]
Extended Total $2,723.50 $6,961.50
6 Dexlemethasone 10mg (Decadron), 10mg/mi, Vial (10mg/mi (1ml| 4,000 Vials
SDV) . OR APPROVED EQUAL
Mig. Suggested Retail Price per unit $6.09 $6.25/BX NO BID $3.90 NO BID
Percentage Discount% 70.61% 0% 56.0%
COSA Net Price s179VL| $0.25/VL $1.72
Extended Total $7,160.00 $1,000.00 $6,880.00
7 Dexlemethasone 4mg (Decadron), 4mg/mi, Vial (dexamethasone| 3,000 Vials
5mi Vial) , OR APPROVED EQUAL
Mig. Suggested Retail Price per unit $0.49 $6.25/EA NO BID $5.40 NO BID
iage Discount%% 26.55% 0% 46.7%
COSA Net Price $6.97VL $6.25 $2.88
Extended Total $20,910.00) $18,750.00) $8,640.00
8 Dextrose 10% inj. 250ml, Bags, OR APPROVED EQUAL 2,500 Cases
Mig. Suggested Retail Price per unit $4.64 SL69/EA NO BID $153.00) NO BID
Percentage Discount% 52.80% 0% 49.7%
COSA Net Price $78.84ICS $1.69 $77.00)
Extended Total $107,100.00 $4,225.00 $192,500.00
9 Diltiazem Hydrochioride Injection-CARDIZEM, 25mg/smL. 350 Vials
(5mgimL), VIAL (for direct IV Bolus inj. and continuous IV
infusion; Store under Refrigeration; SmL single-dose Fliptop Vial.)
, OR APPROVED EQUAL
Mig. Suggested Retail Price per unit $7.29 $1150/EA| NO BID $6.20 NO BID
Percentage Discount% 60.68% 0% 63.7%
COSA Net Price s220VL| $11.50) $2.25
Extended Total $773.50) $4,025.00 $787.50)
10 Diphenhydramine HCL-BENADRYL Tabs, 25mg, (1 Tab per 162,000
packet), Hay Fever/ Allergies; Easy to Swallow Caplets; Tamper | packets
Evident Unit Dose Packets; Dispenser BoxOR APPROVED
EQUAL
Mig. Suggested Retail Price per unit $4.47 $7.00/BX NO BID $0.25 NO BID
Percentage Discount% 52.57% 0% 44.0%
COSA Net Price $0.02/PK $0.035/PK"" $0.14
Extended Total $3,240.00 $6,480.00 $22,680.00)
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City of San Antonio
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Opened: December 11, 2015 i
P Bound Tree Medical, LLC [Moore Medical Henry Schein Inc. Life-Assist, Inc. Midwest Medical Supply
For: AIC EMS Medications & Equipment Co., Inc.
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FE} I DRYLTNJ, S0mg/L, 15,000 Vials
VIAL (For deep IM or slow IV use; pH 4.0-6.5) ,OR APPROVED
EQUAL
Mig. Suggested Retail Price per unit $4.02 $24.99/BX NO BID| $1.9 NO BID)
Percentage Discount% 75.37% 0% 55.1%
COSA Net Price $0.99VL| $0.9996/VL* $0.88)
Extended Total $14,850.00) $15,000.00) $13,200.00)
12 Dopamine Hydrochloride and 5% Dextrose Injection USP 300 Pre-Mixed,
400mg/250mL (1600mcg/mL), PRE-MIX BAG, (In Viaflex Plus Bags
container Silver/Red; MFG part # 280842) ,OR APPROVED
EQUAL
Mig. Suggested Retail Price per unit $29.99 $11.99/BG NO BID) $18.85 NO BID|
Percentage Discount% 56.00% 0% 42.7%
COSA Net Price $13.17/8G $11.99 $10.80
Extended Total $3,951.00 $3,597.00 $3,240.00
13 Droperidol (Inapsine), 2.5mg/m (2ml vial), Vial, OR APPROVED | 5,000 Vials
EQUAL
Mig. Suggested Retail Price per unit $7.49) NO BID| NO BID| NO BID| NO BID|
Percentage Discounts 0.00%
COSA Net Price $7.49NVL|
Extended Total $37,450.00)
14 Epinephrine 1:10,000 IjUSP, (0.1mg/ml) 1mg per 10ml, PFS, | 5,000 PFS
(Needless) , OR APPROVED EQUAL
Mig. Suggested Retail Price per unit $9.89) $6.50/EA| NO BID| $9.30) NO BID|
Percentage Discounts 43.58% 0% 39.6%
COSA Net Price $5.58/PFS| $6.50) $5.62)
Extended Total $27,900.00) $32,500.00) $28,100.00)
15 Fentanyl, 100meg/2mL (S0meg/mL), PFS, carpuject, OR 15,000 PFS
APPROVED EQUAL
Mig. Suggested Retail Price per unit $76.99 NO BID| NO BID| $9.00) NO BID|
Percentage Discounts 71.49% 68.0%
COSA Net Price $2.20/PFS| 5288
Extended Total $33,000.00) $43,200.00)
16 Ketamine, 100mg/ml, Vial, (10 MDV per box - 5ml Vial - 1,000 Vials
5000mg/5mi) , OR APPROVED EQUAL
Mig. Suggested Retail Price per unit $189.99 NO BID| NO BID| $33.88 NO BID|
Percentage Discounts 48.87% 64.6%
COSA Net Price $9.721VL| $12.00
Extended Total $9,720.00 $12,000.00)
17 Lidocaine 2%, 100mg (20mg/mi), PFS, ( 100mg (20mg/mi) , 4,000 PFS
OR APPROVED EQUAL
Mig. Suggested Retail Price per unit $7.79) $3.10/EA NO BID) $4.70) NO BID|
Percentage Discount% 57.12% 0% 42.6%
COSA Net Price $3.34/PFS| $3.10) $2.70)
Extended Total $13,360.00) $12,400.00) $10,800.00)
18 Magnesium Sulfate 50%, 1g/2mL (500mg/mL), VIAL (For IM and | 4 350 Vials
IV use) , OR APPROVED EQUAL
Mig. Suggested Retail Price per unit $6.29) $169/EA NO BID| $3.40) NO BID|
Percentage Discount% 60.41% 0% 47.1%
COSA Net Price $2.49VL| $1.69) $1.80)
Extended Total $10,831.50) $7,351.50 $7,830.00
19 Methylpreanisolone sodium succinate for inj -SOLU-MEDROL | 3 675 vials
125mg/2mL, Vial, (For IM or IV use; 25-2mL Act-O-Vials
Systems; Injectables) , OR APPROVED EQUAL
Mig. Suggested Retail Price per unit $10.99 $195.00/PK NO BID| $10.24 NO BID|
Percentage Discounts 2411% 0%) 31.6%
COSA Net Price $8.34NVL| $7.80VL $7.00)
Extended Total $30,649.50) $28,665.00) $25,725.00)

Page 2 of 8




City of San Antonio
Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: December 11, 2015 Bound Tree Medical, LLC [Moore Medical Henry Schein Inc. Life-Assist, Inc. Midwest Medical Supply
For: AIC EMS Medications & Equipment Co., Inc.
6100006766 sc ooy Tutle Crossing 11690 New Britain Ave. | oo goy 3222 11277 Sunrise Park Drive |13400 Lakefront Drive
Ttem Description Est. Annual|Dublin, OH Farmington, CT Irmo, SC Rancho Cordova, CA Earth City, MO
Quantity |43016 06032 20063 95742 63045
20 Midazolam-VERSED, 1mgimi, VIAL, (10mi vial) , OR 3,000 Vials
APPROVED EQUAL
Mig. Suggested Retail Price per unit $59.99 NO BID) NO BID| $7.70) NO BID|
Percentage Discount% 57.14% 44.2%
COSA Net Price $1.03VL| $4.30)
Extended Total $3,080.00 $12,900.00)
2 Midazolam-VERSED, Smgimi, VIAL, (2mi vial) , OR APPROVED| 3,000 Vials
Mig. Suggested Retail Price per unit $27.79 NO BID| NO BID) $10.45 NO BID|
Percentage Discount% 38.07% 74.2%
COSA Net Price $L72VL] $2.70)
Extended Total $5,160.00 $8,100.00
2 Naloxone Hydrochioride, (Lmg/mi) 2mg per 2mi, PFS, (Neediess)| 7,500 PFS
, OR APPROVED EQUAL
Mig. Suggested Retail Price per unit $56.99 $38.99 NO BID| $44.10 NO BID|
Percentage Discount% 36.46% 0% 27.4%
COSA Net Price $36.21/PFS $38.99 $32.00
Extended Total $271,575.00) $292,425.00) $240,000.00)
23 NitroBid-NTG Ointment USP, 2%, 1g 2% NTG, FOILPAC, (NET | 19,200
WT 1g Foilpac 48 PER BOX with PAD; Topical Use only) , OR Foilpacs
APPROVED EQUAL
Mig. Suggested Retail Price per unit $228.99 $115.00/BX NO BID| $3.25) NO BID|
Percentage Discount% 26.98% 0%) 34.8%
COSA Net Price $3.48/PK $2.40/PK* $2.12)
Extended Total $66,816.00) $46,080.00) $40,704.00)
24 Norepinenephrine bitartrate inj, USP-LEVOPHED, 4mg/4mL  |5,503 Ampules
(1mg/mL), AMPUL (IV only) , OR APPROVED EQUAL
Mig. Suggested Retail Price per unit $35.29 $189.00/PKG NO BID| $30.26 NO BID|
Percentage Discount% 48.03% 0% 47.1%
COSA Net Price $18.34/AMP| $18.90/AMP* $16.00
Extended Total $100,925.02 $104,006.70) $88,048.00)
2 Olanzapine-ZYPREXA INJ, 10mg, Vial, (For IM use ONLY; 1,213 Vials
Injection, powder, for solution.) ,OR APPROVED EQUAL
Mig. Suggested Retail Price per unit $85.99 NO BID| NO BID| $97.65 NO BID|
Percentage Discount% 36.86% 59.0%
COSA Net Price $54.201VL| $40.00
Extended Total $65,853.77] $48,520.00)
2 Ondansetron Injection, USP-ZOFRAN INJ, 4mg/2mL (2mg/mL), | 14,970 Vials
Vial, (Single Dose Flip Top Vial) , OR APPROVED EQUAL
Mig. Suggested Retail Price per unit $2.08 $16.50/PKG| NO BID| $1.28 NO BID|
Percentage Discount% 68.27% 0% 49.2%
COSA Net Price $0.66/VL| $0.66/VL™ $0.65,
Extended Total $9,880.20 $9,880.20 $9,730.50
27 Ondansetron-ZOFRAN ODT, 4mg Tabs, (Box of 30 Tablets (2 | 22,659 Boxes
biister cards ea containing 10 tablets), Orally Disintegrating
Tablets) , OR APPROVED EQUAL
Mig. Suggested Retail Price per unit $47.99 $6.99/PKG, NO BID| $61.50 NO BID|
Percentage Discount% 79.22% 0% 73.3%
COSA Net Price $9.97/BX $6.99 $16.42
Extended Total $225,910.23] $158,386.41] $372,060.78|
28 Prednisone Tablets, USP, 10mg Tabs, (Box of 21 tabs in biister | 23,615 Boxes
pack), OR APPROVED EQUAL
Mig. Suggested Retail Price per unit $62.99 $6.54/PKG; NO BID| $46.60 NO BID|
Percentage Discount% 63.80% 0% 48.5%
COSA Net Price $4.79/BX $6.54) $24.00
Extended Total $113,115.85| $154,442.10) $566,760.00)
20 Prednisone Tablets, USP, 50mg Tabs, (100 count bottle), 20,000 Bottles
OR APPROVED EQUAL
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Quantity 43016 06032 20063 95742 63045
Mig. Suggested Retail Price per unit $109.99) NO BID NO BID $81.40) NO BID
Percentage Discount% 52.719% 59.5%
COSA Net Price $52.01/BT $33.00)
Extended Total $1,040,200.00 $660,000.00
20 Rocuronium Bromide Inj., 10mg/5ml, Vial, OR APPROVED 2,500 Vials
EQUAL
Mig. Suggested Retail Price per unit $10.99) $10.15/EA] NO BID $10.16] NO BID
Percentage Discount% 77.54% 0% 64.1%
COSA Net Price $4.40VL $10.15| $3.65
Extended Total $11,225.00) $25,375.00) $9,125.00
2 Succinylcholine Inj, 20mg/ml, Vial, (200mg (20mg/mi) (10mi 2,500 Vials
MDV), OR APPROVED EQUAL
Mig. Suggested Retail Price per unit $26.79) $25.00VL| NO BID $24.80) NO BID
Percentage Discount% 22.96% 0% 31.5%
COSA Net Price $20.64/VL| $25.00) $17.00)
Extended Total $51,600.00) $62,500.00) $42,500.00)
2 Vecuronium, 10mg, Vial, (Vecuronium Bromide Injection), OR | 2,500 Vials
APPROVED EQUAL
Mig. Suggested Retail Price per unit $20.49) $12.00/EA| NO BID $12.00) NO BID
Percentage Discount% 0.00% 0% 45.0%
COSA Net Price $20.40/VL| $12.00) $6.60
Extended Total $73,725.00) $30,000.00) $16,500.00)
33 Glucagon Emergency Kit, IMG 1ML Kit Img/mi Kit Kit - MSB031,| 320 Kits
OR APPROVED EQUAL
Mig. Suggested Retail Price per unit $272.99) $225.00/KT] NO BID $284.00) NO BID
Percentage Discount% 22.19% 0% 15.5%
COSA Net Price $212.42/KT] $225.00) $240.00)
Extended Total $67,974.40) $72,000.00) $76,800.00)
3 Lice Bedding Spray, 50z Can - #49348-023767,0R APPROVED| 50 Cans
AL
Mig. Suggested Retail Price per unit $13.89) $5.75/EA NO BID $8.34 NO BID
Percentage Discount% 52.56% 0% 46.0%
COSA Net Price $6.50/CAN $5.75 $4.50
Extended Total $320.50) $287.50) $225.00)
35 Nitrostat,. 4mg tablets, 100 Tablets per bottle,OR APPROVED | 220 Bottles
Mig. Suggested Retail Price per unit $36.29) $41.99/BT NO BID $50.00) NO BID
Percentage Discount% 14.05% 0% 201%
COSA Net Price $31.10/8T $41.90) $39.95|
Extended Total $6,861.80 $9,237.80 $8,789.00
36 Injection (50mg/mL)-, 3,000 Vials
OR APPROVED EQUAL
Mig. Suggested Retail Price per unit $6.29 SLI5VL NO BID $3.25 NO BID
Percentage Discount% 71.54% 0% 52.9%
COSA Net Price SL79VL $115 $1.53
Extended Total $5,370.00 $3,450.00 $4,580.00
3 Metoprolol I artrate Injection, USF smg/mi(Lmg/mi) smgrsmi 300 Vials
Vial - 5mi MDV, OR APPROVED EQUAL
Mig. Suggested Retail Price per unit $7.19 $14.00/PK NO BID $3.36 NO BID
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Percentage Discount% 77.05%) 0% 56.3%
COSA Net Price $L65/VL| $LAONL™ $1.47
Extended Total $495.00) $420.00) $441.00)
38 Diazepam 10mg/2mi PFS - 2mi Carpujet, OR APPROVED 1,500 PES
EQUAL
Mfg. Suggested Retail Price per unit $245.99) NO BID| NO BID| $38.00) NO BID|
Percentage Discount% 21.89%) 37.9%
COSA Net Price $10.22/PFS $23.60)
Extended Total $28,830.00) $35,400.00)
39 Sodium Baicarbonate 8.4% 1 mEg/ml PFS - Abboject - Glass, | 4,000 PFS
OR APPROVED EQUAL
Mfg. Suggested Retail Price per unit $15.79) $10.99/EA| NO BID| $14.85) NO BID|
Percentage Discount% 25.97%) 0% 39.4%
COSA Net Price $11.69/PFS $10.99) $9.00
Extended Total $46,760.00) $43,960.00) $36,000.00)
40 Calcium 100mg/mi PFS - Luer-Jet (3304), OR APPROVED 20,000 PFS
EQUAL
Mfg. Suggested Retail Price per unit $14.39) $10.99/EA| NO BID| $13.86) NO BID]
Percentage Discount% 27.24%) 0% 37.2%
COSA Net Price $10.47/PFS $10.99) $8.70
Extended Total $209,400.00) $219,800.00) $174,000.00)
CATALOG DISCOUNT, MEDICATIONS
Percent of Discount Offered % 21% 30-40%) NO BID] 35% NO BID|
Catalog/Price List Title and/or Number www.boundtree.com| N/A #927 or
www life-assist.com|
Price Schedule Column on Which Discount is Based List] N/A List]
Date of Catalog/Price List 12/11/20157) NI/A
Please see exclusion lette|
for additional informatior 2015/2016}
Subtotal for Category A $3,004,436.77] $1,676,745.21] $3,060,437.28|
CATEGORY B: EMS EQUIPMENT
1 14G Needle Chest Decompression Angiocath Autoguarc 6,200 Boxes
Shielded Catheter 14 Gauge 3.25"/2.1x83mm; REF 382268,
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
Mfg. Suggested Retail Price per unit $19.29) $15.99) $255.79) $215.00) $220.32)
Percentage Discount% 66.25%) 0% 15.1% 37.9% 34.8%
COSA Net Price $65.10/BX $15.99) $217.17) $133.50) $143.65
Extended Total $403,620.00) $99,138.00) $1,346,454.00) $827,700.00) $890,630.00)
2 SAM Pelvic Sling Il size Extra Small /PKG hip circumfrence 27- | 50 packages
47" 1 69-119cm; NSN#6515-01-509-6866, NO SUBSTITUTIONS
Mfg. Suggested Retail Price per unit $86.99) NO BID| $103.99) $79.00) $85.75)
Percentage Discount¥% 35.49%) 15.1% 34.2% 31.8251%
COSA Net Price $56.12/PK $88.29) $52.00) $58.46)
Extended Total $2,806.00) $4,414.50 $2,600.00) $2,923.00)
3 SAM Pelvic Sling Il size Extra Large 1/PKG hip circumfrence 36 | 200 Packages
60" / 91-152cm; NSN#6515-01-509-6866, NO SUBSTITUTIONS
Mfg. Suggested Retail Price per unit $86.99) NO BID| $103.99) $79.00) $85.75)
Percentage Discount% 35.49%) 15.1% 34.2% 31.8251%
COSA Net Price $56.12/PK $88.29) $52.00) $58.46)
Extended Total $11,224.00) $17,658.00) $10,400.00) $11,692.00)
4 MAD Nasal Intranasal Mucosal Atomization Device 1/PKG Mig'c 2,500
by Wolfe Tory Medical, Inc, NO SUBSTITUTIONS Packages
Mfg. Suggested Retail Price per unit $7.59 $135.00/BX of 25| $8.29 $7.00 $5.94
Percentage Discount% 27.67%) 0% 15.1% 33.6% 33.3333%
COSA Net Price $5.49/PK $5.40/PK™ $7.04 $4.65 $3.96
Extended Total $13,725.00) $13,500.00) $17,600.00) $11,625.00) $9,900.00)
5 Tactical Tourniquet 1/PKG SOF TACTICAL TOURNIQUET; 700 Packages
PART #SOFTT-NH; 042213
NSN#6515-01-530-7015,NO SUBSTITUTIONS
Mfg. Suggested Retail Price per unit $34.99) $24.99/EA| $31.29) $28.50) $35.88)
Percentage Discount% 35.44%) 0% 15.1% 24.6% 31.8283%
COSA Net Price $22.50/PK $24.99) $26.57) $21.50 $24.46)
Extended Total $15,813.00) $17,493.00) $18,599.00) $15,050.00) $17,122.00)
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3 QUIKCTot Combat Gauze Feat Free; for emporary external Use 1] 250 Boxes
control traumatic bleeding; 1 sterile strip 3 INx 4 YDS.
(7.5CM x3.7 M)
NSN # 6510-01-562-3325, NO SUBSTITUTIONS
Mfg. Suggested Retail Price per unit $44.99) $39.00/EA| $4,289.00) $4,480.00) $5,883.25)
age Discount% 23.07%) 0% 15.1% 31.3% 31.81%)
COSA Net Price $34.61/BX $39.00) $36.41/EA™ $30.80/BX* $4,011.00)
Extended Total $8,652.50) $9,750.00) $9,102.50) $7,700.00) $1,002,750.00)
7 Nebulizer,MicroMist Nebulizer w/Tee, Tubing Mouthpiece anc 3,000 Each
Reservior,NO SUBSTITUTIONS
Mfg. Suggested Retail Price per unit $1.47 $49.00/BX of 50 $1.53 $1.24 $1.12
Percentage Discount¥% 51.029%) 0% 15.1% 51.6% 33.93%)
COSA Net Price $0.72/EA $0.98/EA™ $1.30 $0.60 $0.74
Extended Total $2,160.00) $2,940.00) $3,900.00) $1,800.00) $2,220.00)
8 Braun Pump Add on set 24/case Set Pump 15 Drop 1/2 add on | 1,000 Cases
wiultrasite (BBMA490030), NO SUBSTITUTIONS
Mfg. Suggested Retail Price per unit $6.69 $4.49/EA| $179.95) $154.75) $150.95)
Percentage Discount% 35.43%) 0% 15.1% 35.7% 43.08%)
COSA Net Price $103.68/CS| $107.76/CS™| $152.78 $99.50) $91.04)
Extended Total $103,680.00) $107,760.00) $152,780.00) $99,500.00) $91,040.00)
9 Celox Rapid 2' Z-fold pkg NSN # 6510-01-623-9903NO 2,000 Each
SUBSTITUTIONS
Mfg. Suggested Retail Price per unit $37.79) $31.50/EA| $49.50) $39.99) $58.88)
Percentage Discount% 32.76%) 0% 15.1% 275% 31.81%)
COSA Net Price $25.41/EA] $31.50 $42.03 $29.00) $40.15)
Extended Total $50,820.00) $63,000.00) $84,060.00) $58,000.00) $80,300.00)
10 Chest Seal NSN# 6510-01-642-6212,NO SUBSTITUTIONS
Packages
Mfg. Suggested Retail Price per unit $18.29) $12.79/EA] $14.99) $22.99) $18.42)
Percentage Discount% 33.62%) 0% 15.1% 54.3% 31.81%)
COSA Net Price $12.14/PK $12.79) $12.73 $10.50 $12.56
Extended Total $12,140.00) $12,790.00) $12,730.00) $10,500.00) $12,560.00)
1 Tactical CricKit 1/pkg Tactical Surgical Cricothyroidotomy Kit,NO| 500 Each
SUBSTITUTIONS
Mfg. Suggested Retail Price per unit $92.99) $52.99/EA| $87.49) $73.99) $90.90)
Percentage Discount% 31.81%) 0% 15.1% 33.1% 31.81%)
COSA Net Price $63.41/EA] $52.99) $74.28 $49.50 $61.98)
Extended Total $31,705.00) $26,495.00) $37,140.00) $24,750.00) $30,990.00)
12 Cavicide Disinfectant 1 gallon containersNO SUBSTITUTIONS | 300 Cases
Mfg. Suggested Retail Price per unit $33.99) $91.89/CS| $163.96) $116.00) $122.65)
Percentage Discount% 41.54%) 0% 15.1% 30.2% 25.00%)
COSA Net Price $79.48/CS| $91.89) $139.21] $81.00) $91.99)
Extended Total $23,844.00) $27,567.00) $41,763.00) $24,300.00) $27,597.00)
13 Temporal T 1/pkg,NO SUBSTITUTIONS 10 Each
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City of San Antonio
Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: December 11, 2015 i
P Bound Tree Medical, LLC [Moore Medical Henry Schein Inc. Life-Assist, Inc. Midwest Medical Supply
For: A/C EMS Medications & Equipment Co., Inc.
6100006766 sc ooy Tutle Crossing 11690 New Britain Ave. | oo goy 3222 11277 Sunrise Park Drive |13400 Lakefront Drive
Ttem Description Est. Annual|Dublin, OH Farmington, CT Irmo, SC Rancho Cordova, CA Earth City, MO
Quantity 43016 06032 20063 95742 63045
Mig. Suggested Retail Price per unit $759.99) $369.00/EA| $177.99) $418.00) $510.72]
Percentage Discount% 30.54% 0% 15.1% 23.4% 31.82%
COSA Net Price $459.47/EA| $369.00) $151.12] $320.00) $348.21]
Extended Total $4,584.70 $3,680.00 $1511.20 $3,200.00 $3,482.10
14 Wipe Adult 9x13 12pkicase 46 per pack - 12 packs per case, 400 Cases
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
Mig. Suggested Retail Price per unit $44.28] NO BID $37.99) $46.00) $38.25|
Percentage Discount% 43.90% 15.1% 45.7% 40%)
COSA Net Price $24.84(CS| $32.26] $25.00) $22.95|
Extended Total $9,936.00 $12,904.00) $10,000.00) $9,180.00
CATALOG DISCOUNT, EMS EQUIPMENT
Percent of Discount Offered % 29% 30-40% 15.1% 35% 20%)
Catalog/Price List Title and/or Number Medical Emergency| Henry Schein Website- #927 or]
Product Catalog A Medical  www.life-assist.com| www.mmsmedical.com
Price Schedule Column on Which Discount is Based List| NiA| henryschein.com| List| List Price|
Date of Catalog/Price List 2015-2016] NiA| 12-09-2015| 2015/2016] NIA|
Subtotal of Category B $694,720.20 $384,123.00 $1,760,616.20 $1,107,125.00 $2,192,386.10
CATEGORY C: EMS SPECIALTY KITS
1 King Tubes Kits-Yellow, NO SUBSTITUTIONS 400 Kits
Mig. Suggested Retail Price per unit $48.99) NO BID NO BID $49.00) NO BID
Percentage Discount% 36.40% 45.9%)
COSA Net Price $3116/KT $26.50)
Extended Total $12,464.00) $10,600.00)
2 King Tubes Kits-Red, NO SUBSTITUTIONS 400 Kits
Mig. Suggested Retail Price per unit $48.99) NO BID NO BID $49.00) NO BID
Percentage Discount% 36.40% 45.9%)
COSA Net Price $3116/KT $26.50)
Extended Total $12,464.00) $10,600.00)
3 King Tubes Kits-Purple, NO SUBSTITUTIONS 300 Kits
Mig. Suggested Retail Price per unit $48.99) NO BID NO BID $49.00) NO BID
Percentage Discount% 36.40% 45.9%
COSA Net Price $3116/KT $26.50)
Extended Total $9,348.00 $7,950.00
4 02 Max BiTrac ED Mask wiNeb Adult Large w/Sset ValveNO | 1,000 Each
SUBSTITUTIONS
Mig. Suggested Retail Price per unit $65.99) NO BID NO BID $65.99) NO BID
Percentage Discount% 43.95% 48.5%
COSA Net Price $36.99/EA| $34.00)
Extended Total $36,990.00) $34,000.00)
5 02 Max BiTrac ED Mask wiNeb Adult Med w/Sset Valve, NO 1,000 Each
SUBSTITUTIONS
Mig. Suggested Retail Price per unit $65.99) NO BID NO BID $65.99) NO BID
Percentage Discounts% 43.95% 485%
COSA Net Price $36.99/EA| $34.00)
Extended Total $36,990.00) $34,000.00)
Subtotal for Category C $108,256.00 NO BID NO BID $97,150.00) NO BID
CATEGORY D: SPECIALTY CPR EQUIPMENT
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City of San Antonio
Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened:

December 11, 2015

For: AIC EMS Medications & Equipment

Bound Tree Medical, LLC

Moore Medical

1690 New Britain Ave.

Henry Schein Inc.

Life-Assist, Inc.

Midwest Medical Supply
Co., Inc.

6100006766 sc ooy Tutle Crossing PO Box 3222 11277 Sunrise Park Drive |13400 Lakefront Drive
Ttem Description Est. Annual|Dublin, OH Farmington, CT Irmo, SC Rancho Cordova, CA |Earth City, MO
Quantity 43016 06032 29063 95742 63045

1 Res-Q POD, NO SUBSTITUTIONS 400 Each
Mfg. Suggested Retail Price per unit NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Percentage Discount%
COSA Net Price
Extended Total

2 Res-Q CPR, NO SUBSTITUTIONS 400 Each
Mfg. Suggested Retail Price per unit NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Percentage Discount%
COSA Net Price
Extended Total
Subtotal for Category D
Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 1.5% 15 Days|
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