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VF A Marketing & Service Co. Bullchase Inc.

Description
Annual 

Estimated 
Quantity

5830 Cliffmont
San Antonio,

TX  78250-3937

201 S Lakeline Blvd Ste 503
Cedar Park,

TX  78613

Specified Items

ALKALINE BATTERIES

9 Volt Alkaline Battery, Energizer EN22, 1 per pack 5 $1.04 No Bid

Extended Cost $5.20

Manufacturer Rayovac

Part Number AL-9V

Quantity Per Pack 1

9 Volt Alkaline Battery, Energizer EN22, 2 per pack 5 $2.08 No Bid

Extended Cost $10.40

Manufacturer Rayovac

Part Number AL-9V

Quantity Per Pack 2

9 Volt Alkaline Battery, Energizer EN22, 4 per pack 10 $4.16 No Bid

Extended Cost $41.60

Manufacturer Rayovac

Part Number AL-9V

Quantity Per Pack 4

9 Volt Alkaline Battery, Energizer EN22, 12 per pack 10 $12.48 $12.00

Extended Cost $124.80 $120.00

Manufacturer Rayovac Energizer

Part Number AL-9V EN22

Quantity Per Pack 12 12

9 Volt Alkaline Battery, Energizer EN22, 72 per pack 15 $74.88 No Bid

Extended Cost $1,123.20

Manufacturer Rayovac

Part Number AL-9V

Quantity Per Pack 72

AA 1.5 Volt Alkaline Battery, Energizer EN91, 2 per pack 5 $0.58 No Bid

Extended Cost $2.90

Manufacturer Rayovac

Part Number AL-AA

Quantity Per Pack 2

1

1b

Opened:  October 28, 2016

Group A

1a

Item

6100008070

For:  Annual Contract for Various Small Cell Batteries - Rebid

 



City of San Antonio
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VF A Marketing & Service Co. Bullchase Inc.

Description
Annual 

Estimated 
Quantity

5830 Cliffmont
San Antonio,

TX  78250-3937

201 S Lakeline Blvd Ste 503
Cedar Park,

TX  78613

Opened:  October 28, 2016

Item

6100008070

For:  Annual Contract for Various Small Cell Batteries - Rebid

AA 1.5 Volt Alkaline Battery, Energizer EN91, 4 per pack 5 $1.16 No Bid

Extended Cost $5.80

Manufacturer Rayovac

Part Number AL-AA

Quantity Per Pack 4

AA 1.5 Volt Alkaline Battery, Energizer EN91, 8 per pack 5 $2.32 No Bid

Extended Cost $11.60

Manufacturer Rayovac

Part Number AL-AA

Quantity Per Pack 8

AA 1.5 Volt Alkaline Battery, Energizer EN91, 16 per pack 10 $4.64 No Bid

Extended Cost $46.40

Manufacturer Rayovac

Part Number AL-AA

Quantity Per Pack 16

AA 1.5 Volt Alkaline Battery, Energizer EN91, 24 per pack 10 $6.96 $6.00

Extended Cost $69.60 $60.00

Manufacturer Rayovac Energizer

Part Number AL-AA EN91

Quantity Per Pack 24 24

AA 1.5 Volt Alkaline Battery, Energizer EN91, 36 per pack 15 $10.44 No Bid

Extended Cost $156.60

Manufacturer Rayovac

Part Number AL-AA

Quantity Per Pack 36

AA 1.5 Volt Alkaline Battery, Energizer EN91, 144 per pack 20 $41.76 No Bid

Extended Cost $835.20

Manufacturer Rayovac

Part Number AL-AA

Quantity Per Pack 144
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VF A Marketing & Service Co. Bullchase Inc.

Description
Annual 

Estimated 
Quantity

5830 Cliffmont
San Antonio,

TX  78250-3937

201 S Lakeline Blvd Ste 503
Cedar Park,

TX  78613

Opened:  October 28, 2016

Item

6100008070

For:  Annual Contract for Various Small Cell Batteries - Rebid

AAA 1.5 Volt Alkaline Battery, Energizer EN92, 4 per pack 5 $1.16 No Bid

Extended Cost $5.80

Manufacturer Rayovac

Part Number AL-AAA

Quantity Per Pack 4

AAA 1.5 Volt Alkaline Battery, Energizer EN92, 8 per pack 5 $2.32 No Bid

Extended Cost $11.60

Manufacturer Rayovac

Part Number AL-AAA

Quantity Per Pack 8

AAA 1.5 Volt Alkaline Battery, Energizer EN92, 24 per pack 10 $6.96 $6.00

Extended Cost $69.60 $60.00

Manufacturer Rayovac Energizer

Part Number AL-AAA EN92

Quantity Per Pack 24 24

AAA 1.5 Volt Alkaline Battery, Energizer EN92, 36 per pack 15 $10.44 No Bid

Extended Cost $156.60

Manufacturer Rayovac

Part Number AL-AAA

Quantity Per Pack 36

AAA 1.5 Volt Alkaline Battery, Energizer EN92, 144 per pack 15 $41.76 No Bid

Extended Cost $626.40

Manufacturer Rayovac

Part Number AL-AAA

Quantity Per Pack 144

C 1.5 Volt Alkaline Battery, Energizer EN93, 4 per pack 5 $2.08 No Bid

Extended Cost $10.40

Manufacturer Rayovac

Part Number AL-C

Quantity Per Pack 4

1d

1c



City of San Antonio
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VF A Marketing & Service Co. Bullchase Inc.

Description
Annual 

Estimated 
Quantity

5830 Cliffmont
San Antonio,

TX  78250-3937

201 S Lakeline Blvd Ste 503
Cedar Park,

TX  78613

Opened:  October 28, 2016

Item

6100008070

For:  Annual Contract for Various Small Cell Batteries - Rebid

C 1.5 Volt Alkaline Battery, Energizer EN93, 8 per pack 5 $4.16 No Bid

Extended Cost $20.80

Manufacturer Rayovac

Part Number AL-C

Quantity Per Pack 8

C 1.5 Volt Alkaline Battery, Energizer EN93, 12 per pack 15 $6.24 $7.00

Extended Cost $93.60 $105.00

Manufacturer Rayovac Energizer

Part Number AL-C EN93

Quantity Per Pack 12 12

C 1.5 Volt Alkaline Battery, Energizer EN93, 72 per pack 15 $37.44 No Bid

Extended Cost $561.60

Manufacturer Rayovac

Part Number AL-C

Quantity Per Pack 72

D 1.5 Volt Alkaline Battery, Energizer EN95, 3 per pack 5 $2.04 No Bid

Extended Cost $10.20

Manufacturer Rayovac

Part Number AL-D

Quantity Per Pack 3

D 1.5 Volt Alkaline Battery, Energizer EN95, 5 per pack 5 $3.40 No Bid

Extended Cost $17.00

Manufacturer Rayovac

Part Number AL-D

Quantity Per Pack 5

D 1.5 Volt Alkaline Battery, Energizer EN95, 8 per pack 10 $5.44 No Bid

Extended Cost $54.40

Manufacturer Rayovac

Part Number AL-D

Quantity Per Pack 8

1e
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VF A Marketing & Service Co. Bullchase Inc.

Description
Annual 

Estimated 
Quantity

5830 Cliffmont
San Antonio,

TX  78250-3937

201 S Lakeline Blvd Ste 503
Cedar Park,

TX  78613

Opened:  October 28, 2016

Item

6100008070

For:  Annual Contract for Various Small Cell Batteries - Rebid

D 1.5 Volt Alkaline Battery, Energizer EN95, 12 per pack 15 $8.16 $8.48

Extended Cost $122.40 $127.20

Manufacturer Rayovac Energizer

Part Number AL-D EN95

Quantity Per Pack 12 12

D 1.5 Volt Alkaline Battery, Energizer EN95, 72 per pack 20 $48.96 No Bid

Extended Cost $979.20

Manufacturer Rayovac

Part Number AL-D

Quantity Per Pack 72

J 6.0 Volt Alkaline Battery, Energizer EN539, 6 per pack 2 $33.60 $9.24 / $55.44

Extended Cost $67.20 $110.88

Manufacturer Ultra Last Duracell

Part Number J-Alkaline OUR7K67

Quantity Per Pack 6 1

LITHIUM BATTERIES

9 Volt Lithium Battery, Ultralife U9LV, 1 per pack 5 $6.64 $9.24

Extended Cost $33.20 $46.20

Manufacturer Rayovac X2 Power

Part Number R9VL-1 PM010000

Quantity Per Pack 1 1

9 Volt Lithium Battery, Ultralife U9LV, 2 per pack 5 $13.28 No Bid

Extended Cost $66.40

Manufacturer Rayovac

Part Number R9VL-1

Quantity Per Pack 2

9 Volt Lithium Battery, Ultralife U9LV, 4 per pack 5 $26.56 No Bid

Extended Cost $132.80

Manufacturer Rayovac

Part Number R9VL-1

Quantity Per Pack 4

2

2a

1f



City of San Antonio
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VF A Marketing & Service Co. Bullchase Inc.

Description
Annual 

Estimated 
Quantity

5830 Cliffmont
San Antonio,

TX  78250-3937

201 S Lakeline Blvd Ste 503
Cedar Park,

TX  78613

Opened:  October 28, 2016

Item

6100008070

For:  Annual Contract for Various Small Cell Batteries - Rebid

9 Volt Lithium Battery, Ultralife U9LV, 20 per pack 10 $132.80 No Bid

Extended Cost $1,328.00

Manufacturer Rayovac

Part Number R9VL-1

Quantity Per Pack 20

9 Volt Lithium Battery, Ultralife U9LV, 72 per pack 15 $478.08 No Bid

Extended Cost $7,171.20

Manufacturer Rayovac

Part Number R9VL-1

Quantity Per Pack 72

AA 1.5 Volt Lithium Battery, Energizer L91, 2 per pack 5 $7.60 No Bid

Extended Cost $38.00

Manufacturer Eveready

Part Number L91

Quantity Per Pack 2

AA 1.5 Volt Lithium Battery, Energizer L91, 4 per pack 5 $15.20 No Bid

Extended Cost $76.00

Manufacturer Eveready

Part Number L91

Quantity Per Pack 4

AA 1.5 Volt Lithium Battery, Energizer L91, 8 per pack 5 $30.40 No Bid

Extended Cost $152.00

Manufacturer Eveready

Part Number L91

Quantity Per Pack 8

AA 1.5 Volt Lithium Battery, Energizer L91, 16 per pack 10 $60.80 No Bid

Extended Cost $608.00

Manufacturer Eveready

Part Number L91

Quantity Per Pack 16

2b
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VF A Marketing & Service Co. Bullchase Inc.

Description
Annual 

Estimated 
Quantity

5830 Cliffmont
San Antonio,

TX  78250-3937

201 S Lakeline Blvd Ste 503
Cedar Park,

TX  78613

Opened:  October 28, 2016

Item

6100008070

For:  Annual Contract for Various Small Cell Batteries - Rebid

AA 1.5 Volt Lithium Battery, Energizer L91, 24 per pack 15 $91.20 $46.40

Extended Cost $1,368.00 $696.00

Manufacturer Eveready Energizer

Part Number L91 L91

Quantity Per Pack 24 24

AA 1.5 Volt Lithium Battery, Energizer L91, 144 per pack 20 $547.20 No Bid

Extended Cost $10,944.00

Manufacturer Eveready

Part Number L91

Quantity Per Pack 144

3.0 Volt Button Cell Coin Lithium Battery, Energizer CR2016, 2 
per pack 5 $2.40 $6.16 / $12.32

Extended Cost $12.00 $61.60

Manufacturer Rayovac Energizer

Part Number KECR2016-1 CR2016

Quantity Per Pack 2 1

3.0 Volt Button Cell Coin Lithium Battery, Energizer CR2016, 4 
per pack 5 $4.80 No Bid

Extended Cost $24.00

Manufacturer Rayovac

Part Number KECR2016-1

Quantity Per Pack 4

3.0 Volt Button Cell Coin Lithium Battery, Energizer CR2016, 20 
per pack 10 $24.00 No Bid

Extended Cost $240.00

Manufacturer Rayovac

Part Number KECR2016-1

Quantity Per Pack 20

3.0 Volt Button Cell Coin Lithium Battery, Energizer CR2016, 24 
per pack 15 $28.80 No Bid

Extended Cost $432.00

Manufacturer Rayovac

Part Number KECR2016-1

Quantity Per Pack 24

2c



City of San Antonio
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VF A Marketing & Service Co. Bullchase Inc.

Description
Annual 

Estimated 
Quantity

5830 Cliffmont
San Antonio,

TX  78250-3937

201 S Lakeline Blvd Ste 503
Cedar Park,

TX  78613

Opened:  October 28, 2016

Item

6100008070

For:  Annual Contract for Various Small Cell Batteries - Rebid

3.0 Volt Button Cell Coin Lithium Battery, Energizer CR2032, 2 
per pack 5 $2.40 $6.16 / $61.60

Extended Cost $12.00 $61.60

Manufacturer Rayovac Energizer

Part Number KECR2032 CR2032

Quantity Per Pack 2 1

3.0 Volt Button Cell Coin Lithium Battery, Energizer CR2032, 4 
per pack 5 $4.80 No Bid

Extended Cost $24.00

Manufacturer Rayovac

Part Number KECR2032

Quantity Per Pack 4

3.0 Volt Button Cell Coin Lithium Battery, Energizer CR2032, 20 
per pack 10 $24.00 No Bid

Extended Cost $240.00

Manufacturer Rayovac

Part Number KECR2032

Quantity Per Pack 20

3.0 Volt Button Cell Coin Lithium Battery, Energizer CR2032, 24 
per pack 15 $28.80 No Bid

Extended Cost $432.00

Manufacturer Rayovac

Part Number KECR2032

Quantity Per Pack 24

3.0 Volt Button Cell Coin Lithium Battery, Duracell DL2025,  1 
per pack 5 $1.35 No Bid

Extended Cost $6.75

Manufacturer Rayovac

Part Number KECR2025

Quantity Per Pack 1

3.0 Volt Button Cell Coin Lithium Battery, Duracell DL2025,   6 
per pack 5 $8.10 $1.80 / $5.40

Extended Cost $40.50 $54.00

Manufacturer Rayovac Energizer

Part Number KECR2025 2025BP-2N

Quantity Per Pack 6 2

2d

2e



City of San Antonio
Draft Bid Tabulation
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VF A Marketing & Service Co. Bullchase Inc.

Description
Annual 

Estimated 
Quantity

5830 Cliffmont
San Antonio,

TX  78250-3937

201 S Lakeline Blvd Ste 503
Cedar Park,

TX  78613

Opened:  October 28, 2016

Item

6100008070

For:  Annual Contract for Various Small Cell Batteries - Rebid

3.0 Volt Photo Lithium Battery, Energizer 123 (EL123AP),     1 
per pack 5 $1.49 $2.55

Extended Cost $7.45 $12.75

Manufacturer Rayovac Energizer

Part Number RL-123A-1 EL123APBP

Quantity Per Pack 1 1

3.0 Volt Photo Lithium Battery, Energizer 123 (EL123AP),     6 
per pack 5 $8.94 No Bid

Extended Cost $44.70

Manufacturer Rayovac

Part Number RL-123A-1

Quantity Per Pack 6

3.0 Volt Photo Lithium Battery, Energizer 123 (EL123AP),     20 
per pack 10 $29.80 No Bid

Extended Cost $298.00

Manufacturer Rayovac

Part Number RL-123A-1

Quantity Per Pack 20

3.0 Volt Photo Lithium Battery, Energizer 123 (EL123AP),      24 
per pack 15 $35.76 No Bid

Extended Cost $536.40

Manufacturer Rayovac

Part Number RL-123A-1

Quantity Per Pack 24

RECHARGEABLE BATTERIES
AA 1.2 Volt Rechargeable NiMH Battery, Energizer NH-15-BP, 
4 per pack 5 $10.92 $11.68

Extended Cost $54.60 $58.40

Manufacturer Rayovac Energizer

Part Number PL715-4 GENB NH15BP-4

Quantity Per Pack 4 4

AA 1.2 Volt Rechargeable NiMH Battery, Energizer NH-15-BP, 
8 per pack 5 $21.84 No Bid

Extended Cost $109.20

Manufacturer Rayovac

Part Number PL715-4 GENB

Quantity Per Pack 8

3

3a

2f
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VF A Marketing & Service Co. Bullchase Inc.

Description
Annual 

Estimated 
Quantity

5830 Cliffmont
San Antonio,

TX  78250-3937

201 S Lakeline Blvd Ste 503
Cedar Park,

TX  78613

Opened:  October 28, 2016

Item

6100008070

For:  Annual Contract for Various Small Cell Batteries - Rebid

AAA 1.2 Volt Rechargeable NiMH Battery, Energizer NH-15-BP, 
4 per pack 5 $10.92 $7.30 / $14.60

Extended Cost $54.60 $73.00

Manufacturer Rayovac Energizer

Part Number PL724-4B GENB NHISBP-2

Quantity Per Pack Not Specified 2

C 1.2 Volt Rechargeable NiMH Battery, Energizer NH-35-BP, 2 
per pack 5 $10.92 $9.08

Extended Cost $54.60 $45.40

Manufacturer Rayovac Energizer

Part Number PL714-2 GEND NH35BP-2

Quantity Per Pack 2 2

D 1.2 Volt Rechargeable NiMH Battery, Energizer NH-50-BP, 2 
per pack 5 $10.92 $9.08

Extended Cost $54.60 $45.40

Manufacturer Rayovac Energizer

Part Number PL713-2 GEND NH50BP-2

Quantity Per Pack 2 2

9V Rechargeable NiMH Battery, Energizer NH-22NBP, 1 per 
pack 5 $10.92 $9.08

Extended Cost $54.60 $45.40

Manufacturer Rayovac Energizer

Part Number PL1604-1 GEND NH22NBP

Quantity Per Pack 1 1

Universal Chargers, Energizer CHFC2, 1 per pack 5 $20.88 $26.65

Extended Cost $104.40 $133.25

Manufacturer Rayovac Energizer

Part Number PS-203 GEND CHFC

Quantity Per Pack 1 1

Discount Off Catalog / Price List

Category 1: Alkaline Batteries

Catalog % Discount Offered 18% 35%

Name of Catalog Battery Price List, March 16 Grainger

Category 2: Photo Lithium Batteries

Catalog % Discount Offered 18% 35%

Name of Catalog Battery Price List, March 16 Grainger

3b

3c

3e

3d

3f

Group B
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VF A Marketing & Service Co. Bullchase Inc.

Description
Annual 

Estimated 
Quantity

5830 Cliffmont
San Antonio,

TX  78250-3937

201 S Lakeline Blvd Ste 503
Cedar Park,

TX  78613

Opened:  October 28, 2016

Item

6100008070

For:  Annual Contract for Various Small Cell Batteries - Rebid

Category 3: Lithium Coin Batteries

Catalog % Discount Offered 18% 35%

Name of Catalog Battery Price List, March 16 Grainger

Category 4: Lithium Batteries

Catalog % Discount Offered 18% 35%

Name of Catalog Battery Price List, March 16 Grainger

Category 5: Ni-MH Rechargeable Batteries

Catalog % Discount Offered 18% 35%

Name of Catalog Battery Price List, March 16 Grainger

Category 6: Ni-MH High Capacity Rechargeable Batteries

Catalog % Discount Offered 18% 35%

Name of Catalog Battery Price List, March 16 Grainger

Category 7: Chargers for Rechargeable Batteries

Catalog % Discount Offered 18% 35%

Name of Catalog Battery Price List, March 16 Grainger

Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30

Estimated Total

Estimated Total Award
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