City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 4, 2016
For: Annual Contract for Shop Tools Parts & Service
Genuine Parts Company Sankey Equipment Co Inc
6100007454 DG 6374 Rittiman Rd. 4331 Milling Rd
Estimated San Antonio, San Antonio,
Annual TX 78218 TX 78219
Item Description Usage
1A Ingersoll-Rand Power Tool Parts
A|Percent of discount offered 50% 5%
B|Product identification (Manufacturer): Ingersoll- Rand| Ingersoll Rand Power Tools
C|Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.): Jobber MSRP
D|Price schedule number: RPTO086 None on price sheet
E|Date of price schedule: 3-2016 2/1/16
F|Price schedule column on which discount is based: List Special
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)
G|Warranty (minimum 90 day): Limited 90 days against
defects in material &
12 months workmanship only
1B Specified Items - Ingersoll-Rand Power Tool Parts
Manufacturer: Ingersoll
Part Number: 285B-50 7
Manufacturer Offered No bid Ingersoll
Part Number Offered No bid 285B-50
Price Per Each No bid $9.42
$ Discount No bid $0.47
Price Per Each After Discount: No bid $8.95
Extended Price: No bid $62.65
Manufacturer: Ingersoll
Part Number: 30172 7
Manufacturer Offered No bid Ingersoll
Part Number Offered No bid 30172
Price Per Each No bid $34.16
$ Discount No bid $1.71
Price Per Each After Discount: No bid $32.45
Extended Price: No bid $227.15
Manufacturer: Ingersoll
Part Number: 30603 7
Manufacturer Offered No bid Ingersoll
Part Number Offered No bid 30603
Price Per Each No bid $98.95
$ Discount No bid $4.95
Price Per Each After Discount: No bid $94.00
Extended Price: No bid $658.00
1C Labor and Service - Ingersoll-Rand Power Tool Parts
Regular Labor and Service Rate:per hour No bid $70.00
Expedited Labor and Service Rate: per hour No bid $105.00
2A Chicago-Pneumatic Parts
AlPercent of discount offered 43% 5%
B|Product identification (Manufacturer): Chicago Pneumatic Chicago Pneumatic
C|Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.): Jobber MSRP
D|Price schedule number: RPT086 None
E|Date of price schedule: 3-2016 2/1/16
F|Price schedule column on which discount is based: List Special
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)
G|Warranty (minimum 90 day): Limited 90 days against
defects in material &
12 months workmanship only
2B Specified Items - Chicago-Pneumatic Parts
Manufacturer: Chicago-Pneumatic
Part Number: 2050487113 5
Manufacturer Offered No bid Chicago Pneumatic
Part Number Offered No bid 2050487113
Price Per Each No bid $53.92
$ Discount No bid $2.70
Price Per Each After Discount: No bid $51.22
Extended Price: No bid $256.10
Manufacturer: Chicago-Pneumatic
Part Number: 2050486963 5
Manufacturer Offered No bid Chicago Pneumatic
Part Number Offered No bid 2050486963
Price Per Each No bid $99.14
$ Discount No bid $4.96
Price Per Each After Discount: No bid $94.18
Extended Price: No bid $470.90




City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 4, 2016
For: Annual Contract for Shop Tools Parts & Service
Genuine Parts Company Sankey Equipment Co Inc
6100007454 DG 6374 Rittiman Rd. 4331 Milling Rd
Estimated San Antonio, San Antonio,
Annual TX 78218 TX 78219
Item Description Usage
Manufacturer: Chicago-Pneumatic
Part Number: 2050489723 5
Manufacturer Offered No bid Chicago Pneumatic
Part Number Offered No bid 2050489723
Price Per Each No bid $48.18
$ Discount No bid $2.41
Price Per Each After Discount: No bid $45.77
Extended Price: No bid $228.85
2C Labor and Service - Chicago-Pneumatic Parts
Regular Labor and Service Rate:per hour No bid $70.00
Expedited Labor and Service Rate: per hour No bid $105.00
3A Hein-Warner Parts
A|Percent of discount offered No bid 5%
B|Product identification (Manufacturer): No bid Hein Werner
C|Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.): No bid MSRP
D|Price schedule number; No bid none on sheet
E|Date of price schedule: No bid 2016
F|Price schedule column on which discount is based: No bid Special
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)
G|Warranty (minimum 90 day): Limited 90 days against
defects in material &
No bid workmanship only
3B Specified Items - Hein-Warner Parts
Manufacturer: Hein-Warner
Part Number: B93652B 5
Manufacturer Offered No bid Hein Werner
Part Number Offered No bid B93652B
Price Per Each No bid $362.27
$ Discount No bid $18.11
Price Per Each After Discount: No bid $344.16
Extended Price: No bid $1,720.80
Manufacturer: Hein-Warner
Part Number: HW93642-K0 5
Manufacturer Offered No bid Hein Werner
Part Number Offered No bid HW93642-K0
Price Per Each No bid $19.15
$ Discount No bid $0.96
Price Per Each After Discount: No bid $18.19
Extended Price: No bid $90.95
Manufacturer: Hein-Warner
Part Number: HW93690-L0 5
Manufacturer Offered No bid Hein Werner
Part Number Offered No bid HW93690-L0
Price Per Each No bid $12.77
$ Discount No bid $0.64
Price Per Each After Discount: No bid $12.13
Extended Price: No bid $60.65
3C Labor and Service - Hein-Warner Parts
Regular Labor and Service Rate:per hour No bid $70.00
Expedited Labor and Service Rate: per hour No bid $105.00
4A Lincoln/Walker Parts
A|Percent of discount offered 50% 5%
B|Product identification (Manufacturer): Lincoln Lincoln/Walker
C|Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.): Jobber MSRP
D|Price schedule number: RPTO086 none on price sheet
E|Date of price schedule: 3-2016 2016
F|Price schedule column on which discount is based: List Special
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)
G|Warranty (minimum 90 day): Limited 90 days against
defects in material &
12 months workmanship only
4B Specified Items - Lincoln/Walker Parts
Manufacturer: Lincoln/Walker
Part Number: 248754 5
Manufacturer Offered No bid Lincoln
Part Number Offered No bid 248745
Price Per Each No bid $29.16
$ Discount No bid $1.46
Price Per Each After Discount: No bid $27.70
Extended Price: No bid $138.50




City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 4, 2016
For: Annual Contract for Shop Tools Parts & Service
Genuine Parts Company Sankey Equipment Co Inc
6100007454 DG 6374 Rittiman Rd. 4331 Milling Rd
Estimated San Antonio, San Antonio,
Annual TX 78218 TX 78219
Item Description Usage
Manufacturer: Lincoln/Walker
Part Number: 248731 5
Manufacturer Offered No bid Lincoln
Part Number Offered No bid 248731
Price Per Each No bid $40.31
$ Discount No bid $2.02
Price Per Each After Discount: No bid $38.29
Extended Price: No bid $191.45
Manufacturer: Lincoln/Walker
Part Number: 261512 5
Manufacturer Offered No bid Lincoln
Part Number Offered No bid 261512
Price Per Each No bid $16.08
$ Discount No bid $0.80
Price Per Each After Discount: No bid $15.28
Extended Price: No bid $76.40
4C Labor and Service - Lincoln/Walker Parts
Regular Labor and Service Rate:per hour No bid $70.00
Expedited Labor and Service Rate: per hour No bid $105.00
5A Champion Air Compressor Parts
A|Percent of discount offered No bid 10%
B|Product identification (Manufacturer): No bid Champion Pneumatic
C|Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.): No bid MSRP
D|Price schedule number: No bid 22-100
E|Date of price schedule: No bid 1/1/2016
F|Price schedule column on which discount is based: No bid Special
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)
G|Warranty (minimum 90 day): Limited 90 days against
defects in material &
No bid workmanship only
5B Specified Items - Champion Air Compressor Parts
Manufacturer: Champion
Part Number: PO5050A 8
Manufacturer Offered No bid Champion
Part Number Offered No bid PO5050A
Price Per Each No bid $14.75
$ Discount No bid $1.48
Price Per Each After Discount: No bid $13.27
Extended Price: No bid $106.16
Manufacturer: Champion
Part Number: P09043B 8
Manufacturer Offered No bid Champion
Part Number Offered No bid P09043B
Price Per Each No bid $41.50
$ Discount No bid $4.15
Price Per Each After Discount: No bid $37.35
Extended Price: No bid $298.80
Manufacturer: Champion
Part Number: PO9045A 8
Manufacturer Offered No bid Champion
Part Number Offered No bid P09045A
Price Per Each No bid $72.50
$ Discount No bid $7.25
Price Per Each After Discount: No bid $65.25
Extended Price: No bid $522.00
5C Labor and Service - Champion Air Compressor Parts
Regular Labor and Service Rate:per hour No bid $85.00
Expedited Labor and Service Rate: per hour No bid $127.50
6A Blackhawk Parts
A|Percent of discount offered No bid 5%
B|Product identification (Manufacturer): No bid Blackhawk
C|Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.): No bid MSRP
D|Price schedule number: No bid None on Excel Sheet
E|Date of price schedule: No bid 1/1/2016
F|Price schedule column on which discount is based: No bid Special
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)
G|Warranty (minimum 90 day): Limited 90 days against
defects in material &
No bid workmanship only




City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 4, 2016
For: Annual Contract for Shop Tools Parts & Service
Genuine Parts Company Sankey Equipment Co Inc
6100007454 DG 6374 Rittiman Rd. 4331 Milling Rd
Estimated San Antonio, San Antonio,
Annual TX 78218 TX 78219
Item Description Usage
6B Specified Items - Blackhawk Parts
Manufacturer: Blackhawk Parts
Part Number: H05-3-9901-100 5
Manufacturer Offered No bid Blackhawk
Part Number Offered No bid H05-3-9901-100
Price Per Each No bid $47.18
$ Discount No bid $2.36
Price Per Each After Discount: No bid $44.82
Extended Price: No bid $224.10
Manufacturer: Blackhawk Parts
Part Number: H10-3-9903-107 5
Manufacturer Offered No bid Blackhawk
Part Number Offered No bid H10-3-9903-107
Price Per Each No bid $61.66
$ Discount No bid $3.08
Price Per Each After Discount: No bid $58.58
Extended Price: No bid $292.90
Manufacturer: Blackhawk Parts
Part Number: H10-5-1804-103 5
Manufacturer Offered No bid Blackhawk
Part Number Offered No bid H10-5-1804-103
Price Per Each No bid $28.63
$ Discount No bid $1.43
Price Per Each After Discount: No bid $27.20
Extended Price: No bid $136.00
6C Labor and Service - Blackhawk Parts
Regular Labor and Service Rate:per hour No bid $70.00
Expedited Labor and Service Rate: per hour No bid $105.00
7A Coats Tire Service Equipment Parts
A|Percent of discount offered 45% No bid this item
B|Product identification (Manufacturer): Coats No bid
C|Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.): Jobber No bid
D|Price schedule number: RPTO086 No bid
E|Date of price schedule: 3-2016 No bid
F|Price schedule column on which discount is based: List No bid
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)
G|Warranty (minimum 90 day): 12 months No bid
7B Specified Items - Coats Tire Service Equipment Parts
Manufacturer: Coats
Part Number: 181675 12
Manufacturer Offered Coats No bid
Part Number Offered 181675 No bid
Price Per Each $125.50 No bid
$ Discount $56.48 No bid
Price Per Each After Discount: $69.02 No bid
Extended Price: $828.24 No bid
Manufacturer: Coats
Part Number: 5000768 4
Manufacturer Offered Coats No bid
Part Number Offered 5000768 No bid
Price Per Each $813.58 No bid
$ Discount $443.77 No bid
Price Per Each After Discount: $369.81 No bid
Extended Price: $1,479.24 No bid
Manufacturer: Coats
Part Number: 101491 3
Manufacturer Offered Coats No bid
Part Number Offered 101491 No bid
Price Per Each $22.62 No bid
$ Discount $10.18 No bid
Price Per Each After Discount: $12.44 No bid
Extended Price: $37.32 No bid
7C Labor and Service - Coats Tire Service Equipment Parts
Regular Labor and Service Rate:per hour $85.00 No bid this item
Expedited Labor and Service Rate: per hour $95.00 No bid




City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 4, 2016
For: Annual Contract for Shop Tools Parts & Service
Genuine Parts Company Sankey Equipment Co Inc
6100007454 DG 6374 Rittiman Rd. 4331 Milling Rd
Estimated San Antonio, San Antonio,
Annual TX 78218 TX 78219
Item Description Usage
8A Norco Equipment Parts
A|Percent of discount offered No bid 5%
B|Product identification (Manufacturer): No bid Norco
C|Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.): No bid MSRP
D|Price schedule number: No bid None
E|Date of price schedule:
No bid| None- factory updates weekly
F|Price schedule column on which discount is based: No bid Special
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)
G|Warranty (minimum 90 day): Limited 90 days against
defects in material &
No bid workmanship only
8B Specified Items - Norco Equipment Parts
Manufacturer: Norco
Part Number: 222538 5
Manufacturer Offered No bid Norco
Part Number Offered No bid 222538
Price Per Each No bid $16.84
$ Discount No bid $0.84
Price Per Each After Discount: No bid $16.00
Extended Price: No bid $80.00
Manufacturer: Norco
Part Number: 222567 5
Manufacturer Offered No bid Norco
Part Number Offered No bid 222567
Price Per Each No bid $294.56
$ Discount No bid $14.73
Price Per Each After Discount: No bid $279.83
Extended Price: No bid $1,399.15
Manufacturer: Norco
Part Number: 222583 5
Manufacturer Offered No bid Norco
Part Number Offered No bid 222583
Price Per Each No bid $59.84
$ Discount No bid $2.99
Price Per Each After Discount: No bid $56.85
Extended Price: No bid $284.25
8C Labor and Service - Norco Equipment Parts
Regular Labor and Service Rate:per hour No bid $70.00
Expedited Labor and Service Rate: per hour No bid $105.00
9A Ammco Brake Lathe Equipment Parts
A|Percent of discount offered 27% No bid this item
B|Product identification (Manufacturer): Ammco No bid
C|Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.): Jobber No bid
D|Price schedule number: RPT086 No bid
E|Date of price schedule: 3-2016 No bid
F|Price schedule column on which discount is based: List No bid
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)
G|Warranty (minimum 90 day): 12 months No bid
9B Specified Items - Ammco Brake Lathe Equipment Parts
Manufacturer: Ammco
Part Number: 6920 3
Manufacturer Offered Ammco No bid
Part Number Offered 6920 No bid
Price Per Each $57.68 No bid
$ Discount $31.46 No bid
Price Per Each After Discount: $26.22 No bid
Extended Price: $78.66 No bid
Manufacturer: Ammco
Part Number: 6914-10 6
Manufacturer Offered Ammco No bid
Part Number Offered 6914-10 No bid
Price Per Each $62.15 No bid
$ Discount $33.90 No bid
Price Per Each After Discount: $28.25 No bid
Extended Price: $169.50 No bid




City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 4, 2016
For: Annual Contract for Shop Tools Parts & Service
Genuine Parts Company Sankey Equipment Co Inc
6100007454 DG 6374 Rittiman Rd. 4331 Milling Rd
Estimated San Antonio, San Antonio,
Annual TX 78218 TX 78219
Item Description Usage
Manufacturer: Ammco
Part Number: 76816 4
Manufacturer Offered Ammco No bid
Part Number Offered 76816 No bid
Price Per Each $120.12 No bid
$ Discount $65.52 No bid
Price Per Each After Discount: $54.60 No bid
Extended Price: $218.40 No bid
9C Labor and Service - Ammco Brake Lathe Equipment Parts
Regular Labor and Service Rate:per hour $85.00 No bid on this item
Expedited Labor and Service Rate: per hour $95.00 No bid
10A Robinair Air Condition Equipment Parts
AlPercent of discount offered 28% No bid
B|Product identification (Manufacturer): Robin Air No bid
C|Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.): Jobber No bid
D|Price schedule number: RPT086 No bid
E|Date of price schedule: 3-2016 No bid
F|Price schedule column on which discount is based: List No bid
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)
G|Warranty (minimum 90 day): 12 months No bid
10B Specified Items - Robinair Air Condition Equipment Parts
Manufacturer: Robinair
Part Number: 34724 16
Manufacturer Offered Robin Air No bid
Part Number Offered 34724 No bid
Price Per Each $138.58 No bid
$ Discount $38.63 No bid
Price Per Each After Discount: $99.95 No bid
Extended Price: $1,599.20 No bid
Manufacturer: Robinair
Part Number: 13203 16
Manufacturer Offered Robin Air No bid
Part Number Offered 13203 No bid
Price Per Each $16.58 No bid
$ Discount $3.63 No bid
Price Per Each After Discount: $12.95 No bid
Extended Price: $207.20 No bid
Manufacturer: Robinair
Part Number: 14388 5
Manufacturer Offered Robin Air No bid
Part Number Offered 14388 No bid
Price Per Each $146.51 No bid
$ Discount $39.56 No bid
Price Per Each After Discount: $106.95 No bid
Extended Price: $534.75 No bid
10C Labor and Service - Robinair Air Condition Equipment Parts
Regular Labor and Service Rate:per hour $95.00 No bid this item
Expedited Labor and Service Rate: per hour $125.00 No bid

Payment Terms

2% 10 days

Net % 30 days




