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Opened: March 30, 2016

For: Annual Contract for Automotive and Truck Air Conditioning Parts

Evapocore, Inc dba Carlisle 
Auto Air

Full Service Auto Parts Genuine Parts Company North Park Lincoln O'Reilly Auto Enterprises, 
LLC dba O'Reilly Auto Parts

Poppe Automotive

6100006620 HH 6411 San Pedro 4737 Broom St 6374 Rittiman Rd 9207 San Pedro Ave 233 S. Patterson 716 S. Frio Street

Item Description

Estimated 
Annual 
Usage

San Antonio,
TX 78216

San Antonio,                                 
TX 78217

San Antonio,                       
TX 78218

San Antonio,                       
TX 78216

Springfield,                           
MO 65802

San Antonio,                       
TX 78207

1A A/C COMPRESSORS
A Percent of discount offered

Net
0% Motorcraft,                           

10% Four Seasons 30% Cost Plus 8% 41% or Better 20%
B Product identification (Manufacturer): Universal Air 

Conditioner/Omega/Global 
Products/Four 

Seasons/Delco Motorcraft Motorcraft, Four Seasons NAPA Temp (Four Seasons) Motorcraft Motorcraft/Murray
Global/Four 

Seasons/Motorcraft
C Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.): Provided NET File Distributor Net, Price 4 Jobber Wholesale List Price Jobber
D Price schedule number: AP502, Computer Printout RPT086 FPS-3642 N/A, Online AC662O
E Date of price schedule: 3/30/2016 Jan 1, 2016, March 1, 2016 3/2016 3/29/16 N/A, Online 4/1/2016
F Price schedule column on which discount is based: NET Dealer Price, Price 4 Jobber Dealer Cost List Jobber

(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)
G Warranty: 12 Months from purchase 24 month/24000, 24 month 24 months/24000 miles 2 years/Unlimited Miles 2 years limited warranty 1 year

1B Specified Items - A/C Compressors
1 Manfacturer: Motorcarft

Part Number: YCC283 10
Manufacturer Offered UAC Motorcraft Four Seasons Motorcraft Global
Part Number Offered CO10906C 4CC395 supercedes YCC283 275523 9L2Z19V703E YCC283 6512268
Price Per Each Before Discount $180.51 $200.35 $363.96 $400.70 $1,147.44 $241.33
$ Discount $0.00 $0.00 $109.18 $184.32 $516.45 $48.27
Price Per Each After Discount: $180.51 $200.35 $254.78 $216.38 $630.99 $193.06
Extended Price: $1,805.10 $2,003.50 $2,547.80 $2,163.80 $6,309.90 $1,930.60

2 Manfacturer: Murray
Part Number: 58947 3
Manufacturer Offered UAC Four Seasons Four Seasons No Bid Murray Global
Part Number Offered CO20145C 58947 274083 58947 6511338
Price Per Each Before Discount $164.52 $245.68 $226.28 $364.39 $193.03
$ Discount $0.00 $24.57 $67.88 $179.61 $38.61
Price Per Each After Discount: $164.52 $221.11 $158.40 $184.78 $154.42
Extended Price: $493.53 $663.33 $475.20 $554.34 $463.26

3 Manfacturer: Murray
Part Number: 97271 3
Manufacturer Offered UAC Four Seasons Four Seasons No Bid Murray Global
Part Number Offered CO21471LC 255670 97271 6512520
Price Per Each Before Discount $206.72 $251.80 $310.46 $627.10 $273.58
$ Discount $0.00 $25.18 $93.13 $309.09 $54.72
Price Per Each After Discount: $206.72 $226.62 $217.33 $318.01 $218.86
Extended Price: $620.16 $679.86 $651.99 $954.03 $656.58

4 Manfacturer: Murray
Part Number: 57132 5
Manufacturer Offered UAC Four Seasons Four Seasons No Bid Murray Four Seasons
Part Number Offered CO101320C 253135 57132 57132
Price Per Each Before Discount $142.18 $142.16 $161.39 $288.12 $141.02
$ Discount $0.00 $14.22 $48.41 $142.01 $28.20
Price Per Each After Discount: $142.18 $127.94 $112.98 $146.11 $112.82
Extended Price: $710.90 $639.72 $564.90 $730.55 $564.10

5 Manfacturer: Murray
Part Number: 67192 5
Manufacturer Offered UAC Four Seasons Four Seasons No Bid No Bid Global
Part Number Offered CO10905C 255291 6512617
Price Per Each Before Discount $180.51 $250.97 $292.39 $225.23
$ Discount $0.00 $25.10 $87.71 $45.05
Price Per Each After Discount: $180.51 $225.87 $204.68 $180.18
Extended Price: $902.55 $1,129.35 $1,023.40 $900.90
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Opened: March 30, 2016

For: Annual Contract for Automotive and Truck Air Conditioning Parts

Evapocore, Inc dba Carlisle 
Auto Air

Full Service Auto Parts Genuine Parts Company North Park Lincoln O'Reilly Auto Enterprises, 
LLC dba O'Reilly Auto Parts

Poppe Automotive

6100006620 HH 6411 San Pedro 4737 Broom St 6374 Rittiman Rd 9207 San Pedro Ave 233 S. Patterson 716 S. Frio Street

Item Description

Estimated 
Annual 
Usage

San Antonio,
TX 78216

San Antonio,                                 
TX 78217

San Antonio,                       
TX 78218

San Antonio,                       
TX 78216

Springfield,                           
MO 65802

San Antonio,                       
TX 78207

6 Manfacturer: Motorcraft
Part Number: YCC250 3
Manufacturer Offered UAC Four Seasons No Bid No Bid Global
Part Number Offered CO10905C NOT GOOD# 275574 6512617
Price Per Each Before Discount $180.51 $442.81 $225.23
$ Discount $0.00 $132.84 $45.05
Price Per Each After Discount: $180.51 $309.97 $180.18
Extended Price: $541.53 $929.91 $540.54

7 Manfacturer: Motorcraft
Part Number: 9M6Z19D798A 13
Manufacturer Offered Ford/OEM Motorcraft Four Seasons No Bid No Bid Motorcraft
Part Number Offered 19D798 4B3108 255277 Y133108
Price Per Each Before Discount $176.71 $99.17 $252.54 $131.70
$ Discount $0.00 $0.00 $75.76 $26.34
Price Per Each After Discount: $176.71 $99.17 $176.78 $105.36
Extended Price: $2,297.23 $1,289.21 $2,298.14 $1,369.68

8 Manfacturer: Motorcraft
Part Number: YCC238RM 6
Manufacturer Offered UAC Motorcraft Four Seasons No Bid Murray Four Seasons
Part Number Offered CO103090C 4CC238RM 254470 57168 57168
Price Per Each Before Discount $142.18 $157.89 $151.48 $261.00 $141.02
$ Discount $0.00 $0.00 $45.44 $128.65 $28.20
Price Per Each After Discount: $142.18 $157.89 $106.04 $132.35 $112.82
Extended Price: $853.08 $947.34 $636.24 $794.10 $676.92

2A A/C CLUTCHES AND COMPONENTS
A Percent of discount offered 0% 0% Motorcraft, 10% AC Delco 20% Cost Plus 8% 41% or Better 20%
B Product identification (Manufacturer): Universal Air 

Conditioner/Omega/Global 
Products/Four 

Seasons/Delco/Motorcraft Motorcraft, AC Delco

NAPA, GATES/TECH 
EXPERTS/ECHLIN/DORMA

N/FOUR SEASONS Motorcraft
Dorman, Import Direct, Borg 

Warner
Motorcraft/Four 

Seasons/Standard
C Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.): Provided NET File Distributor Net, Price 4 JOBBER Wholesale List Price Jobber
D Price schedule number: AP502, Computer Printout RPT086 FPS-3642 N/A, Online AC6620
E Date of price schedule: 3/30/2016 Jan 1, 2016, Jan 1, 2016 3/2016 3/29/16 N/A, Online 4/1/2016
F Price schedule column on which discount is based: NET Dealer Price, Price 4 JOBBER Dealer Cost List Jobber

(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.) 12 Months from purchase 24 month/24000, 24 month Limited Lifetime 2 years/Unlimited Miles Limited Lifetime
G Warranty: 1 year

2B Specified Items - A/C Clutches and Components
1 Manfacturer: Motorcraft

Part Number: 9C2Z19893AD 10
Manufacturer Offered Ford/OEM NOT GOOD# FORD No Bid Motorcraft
Part Number Offered 19893 9C2Z19893AD 4C2Z19893AD
Price Per Each Before Discount: $38.21 $74.76 $37.38 $49.22
$ Discount $0.00 $14.95 $13.16 $9.84
Price Per Each After Discount: $38.21 $59.81 $24.22 $39.28
Extended Price: $382.10 $598.10 $242.20 $393.80

2 Manfacturer: Motorcraft
Part Number: 5M6Z19D784BA 13
Manufacturer Offered Ford/OEM Motorcraft NAPA GATES No Bid Motorcraft
Part Number Offered 19D784 4B3007 36467 YB3007
Price Per Each Before Discount: $118.81 $65.74 $24.97 $119.53 $87.31
$ Discount $0.00 $0.00 $4.99 $48.53 $17.46
Price Per Each After Discount: $118.81 $65.74 $19.98 $71.00 $69.85
Extended Price: $1,544.53 $854.62 $259.74 $923.00 $908.05

3 Manfacturer: AC Delco



City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

3

Opened: March 30, 2016

For: Annual Contract for Automotive and Truck Air Conditioning Parts

Evapocore, Inc dba Carlisle 
Auto Air

Full Service Auto Parts Genuine Parts Company North Park Lincoln O'Reilly Auto Enterprises, 
LLC dba O'Reilly Auto Parts

Poppe Automotive

6100006620 HH 6411 San Pedro 4737 Broom St 6374 Rittiman Rd 9207 San Pedro Ave 233 S. Patterson 716 S. Frio Street

Item Description

Estimated 
Annual 
Usage

San Antonio,
TX 78216

San Antonio,                                 
TX 78217

San Antonio,                       
TX 78218

San Antonio,                       
TX 78216

Springfield,                           
MO 65802

San Antonio,                       
TX 78207

Part Number: 22754988 37
Manufacturer Offered AC Delco AC Delco TECH EXPERTS No Bid Dorman Standard
Part Number Offered 22754988 15-74122 ADA112 604-108 F04008
Price Per Each Before Discount: $53.74 $29.39 $29.65 $61.00 $26.67
$ Discount $0.00 $2.94 $5.93 $26.78 $5.33
Price Per Each After Discount: $53.74 $26.45 $23.72 $34.22 $21.34
Extended Price: $1,988.38 $978.65 $877.64 $1,266.14 $789.58

4 Manfacturer: AC Delco
Part Number: 8716547020 13
Manufacturer Offered AC Delco ECHLIN No Bid IDI Standard
Part Number Offered 871654720 NOT GOOD# BR358 30-0175 RU455
Price Per Each Before Discount: $236.79 $168.03 $305.07 $158.03
$ Discount $0.00 $33.61 $143.93 $31.61
Price Per Each After Discount: $236.79 $134.42 $161.14 $126.42
Extended Price: $3,078.27 $1,747.46 $2,094.82 $1,643.46

5 Manfacturer: AC Delco
Part Number: 89018365 43
Manufacturer Offered Santech AC Delco TECH EXPERTS No Bid Dorman Standard
Part Number Offered MT1800 15-72971 ADA111 604-106 F04013
Price Per Each Before Discount: $51.77 $150.68 $120.23 $235.58 $108.16
$ Discount $0.00 $15.07 $24.05 $102.45 $21.63
Price Per Each After Discount: $51.77 $135.61 $96.18 $133.13 $86.53
Extended Price: $2,226.11 $5,831.23 $4,135.74 $5,724.59 $3,720.79

6 Manfacturer: Motorcraft
Part Number: YS4Z19D786CA 13
Manufacturer Offered Motorcraft Motorcraft FOUR SEASONS No Bid Motorcraft
Part Number Offered 19D786 4B3018 273250 YB3018
Price Per Each Before Discount: $68.83 $32.86 $96.54 $59.75 $43.64
$ Discount $0.00 $0.00 $28.96 $24.26 $8.73
Price Per Each After Discount: $68.83 $32.86 $67.58 $35.49 $34.91
Extended Price: $894.79 $427.18 $878.54 $461.37 $453.83

7 Manfacturer: Motorcraft
Part Number: YL5Z19E616AA 26
Manufacturer Offered Motorcraft Motorcraft DORMAN Dorman Standard
Part Number Offered 19E616 4H1767 655-1551 604-202 F04011
Price Per Each Before Discount: $89.45 $44.37 $42.38 $88.74 $67.78 $51.02
$ Discount $0.00 $0.00 $8.48 $40.82 $29.75 $10.20
Price Per Each After Discount: $89.45 $44.37 $33.90 $47.92 $38.03 $40.82
Extended Price: $2,325.70 $1,153.62 $881.40 $1,245.92 $988.78 $1,061.32

8 Manfacturer: Motorcraft
Part Number: 4W7Z19A706A 20
Manufacturer Offered Motorcraft Motorcraft ECHLIN BWD Four Seasons
Part Number Offered 19A706 4H1717 BR312 RU1102 20325
Price Per Each Before Discount: $38.08 $18.63 $20.18 $37.26 $33.88 $18.05
$ Discount $0.00 $0.00 $4.04 $17.14 $17.08 $3.61
Price Per Each After Discount: $38.08 $18.63 $16.14 $20.12 $16.80 $14.44
Extended Price: $761.60 $372.60 $322.80 $402.40 $336.00 $288.80

3A ACCUMULATORS
A Percent of discount offered 0% 0% Motorcraft, 10% Four Seasons 30% Cost Plus 8% 41% or Better 20%
B Product identification (Manufacturer): Universal Air 

Conditioner/Omega/Global 
Products/Four 

Seasons/Delco/Motorcraft Motorcraft, Four Seasons NAPA (FOUR SEASONS) Motorcraft Murray, Motorcraft Global/Four Seasons
C Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.): Provided NET File Distributor Net, Price 4 Jobber Wholesale List Price Jobber
D Price schedule number: AP502, Computer Printout RPT086 FPS-3642 N/A, Online AC6620
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Opened: March 30, 2016

For: Annual Contract for Automotive and Truck Air Conditioning Parts

Evapocore, Inc dba Carlisle 
Auto Air

Full Service Auto Parts Genuine Parts Company North Park Lincoln O'Reilly Auto Enterprises, 
LLC dba O'Reilly Auto Parts

Poppe Automotive

6100006620 HH 6411 San Pedro 4737 Broom St 6374 Rittiman Rd 9207 San Pedro Ave 233 S. Patterson 716 S. Frio Street

Item Description

Estimated 
Annual 
Usage

San Antonio,
TX 78216

San Antonio,                                 
TX 78217

San Antonio,                       
TX 78218

San Antonio,                       
TX 78216

Springfield,                           
MO 65802

San Antonio,                       
TX 78207

E Date of price schedule: 3/30/2016 Jan 1, 2016, March 1, 2016 3/2016 3/29/16 N/A, Online 4/1/2016
F Price schedule column on which discount is based: NET Dealer Price, Computer Printout JOBBER Dealer Cost List Price Jobber

(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)
G Warranty:

12 Months from purchase 24/24k, 24 month 24 months/24,000 miles 2 years/Unlimited Miles
Standard Manufacturer 

Warranty 1 year

3B Specified Items - Accumulators
1 Manfacturer: Motorcraft

Part Number: 9M6Z19959A 13
Manufacturer Offered UAC Motorcraft Four Seasons No Bid Global
Part Number Offered RD11079C 4L198 218116 1412013
Price Per Each Before Discount: $22.01 $73.53 $74.47 $147.06 $28.66
$ Discount $0.00 $0.00 $22.34 $67.65 $5.73
Price Per Each After Discount: $22.01 $73.53 $52.13 $79.41 $22.93
Extended Price: $286.13 $955.89 $677.69 $1,032.33 $298.09

2 Manfacturer: Murray
Part Number: 30-3194 3
Manufacturer Offered UAC Four Seasons Four Seasons No Bid MRY Four Seasons
Part Number Offered RD10892C 83107 408928 30-3194 83102
Price Per Each Before Discount: $28.08 $25.98 $34.29 $77.95 $15.09
$ Discount $0.00 $2.60 $10.28 $39.47 $3.02
Price Per Each After Discount: $28.08 $23.38 $24.01 $38.48 $12.07
Extended Price: $84.24 $70.14 $72.03 $115.44 $36.21

3 Manfacturer: Motorcraft
Part Number: YF3607 7
Manufacturer Offered UAC Motorcraft Four Seasons MOT Global
Part Number Offered RD10180C 4F3607 408911 8WTZ19C836A YF3607 1411654
Price Per Each Before Discount: $25.90 $65.35 $29.00 $130.70 $184.73 $16.98
$ Discount $0.00 $0.00 $8.70 $60.12 $83.90 $3.40
Price Per Each After Discount: $25.90 $65.35 $20.30 $70.58 $100.83 $13.58
Extended Price: $181.30 $457.45 $142.10 $494.06 $705.81 $95.06

4 Manfacturer: Motorcraft
Part Number: YF37399 5
Manufacturer Offered UAC Motorcraft Four Seasons MOT Global
Part Number Offered RD2496C 4F37399 408904 6C3Z19C836B YF37399 1411655
Price Per Each Before Discount: $27.87 $41.86 $28.58 $83.72 $118.63 $24.41
$ Discount $0.00 $0.00 $8.57 $38.51 $53.64 $4.88
Price Per Each After Discount: $27.87 $41.86 $20.01 $45.21 $64.99 $19.53
Extended Price: $139.35 $209.30 $100.05 $226.05 $59.99 $97.65

5 Manfacturer: Motorcraft
Part Number: YF3620 8
Manufacturer Offered UAC Motorcraft Four Seasons No Bid Global
Part Number Offered HA10890C 4F3620 408656 8C3Z19C836D 1411876
Price Per Each Before Discount: $30.90 $96.73 $53.32 $193.46 $27.64
$ Discount $0.00 $0.00 $15.99 $88.99 $5.53
Price Per Each After Discount: $30.90 $96.73 $37.33 $104.47 $22.11
Extended Price: $247.20 $773.84 $298.64 $835.76 $176.88

6 Manfacturer: Motorcraft
Part Number: YF2620 4
Manufacturer Offered UAC Motorcraft Four Seasons MOT Global
Part Number Offered RD8135C 4F2620 408353 YF2620 1411621
Price Per Each Before Discount: $27.28 $48.64 $30.05 $97.28 $181.34 $16.98
$ Discount $0.00 $0.00 $9.01 $44.75 $81.98 $3.40
Price Per Each After Discount: $27.28 $48.64 $21.04 $52.53 $99.36 $13.58
Extended Price: $109.12 $194.56 $84.16 $210.12 $397.44 $54.32
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Opened: March 30, 2016

For: Annual Contract for Automotive and Truck Air Conditioning Parts

Evapocore, Inc dba Carlisle 
Auto Air

Full Service Auto Parts Genuine Parts Company North Park Lincoln O'Reilly Auto Enterprises, 
LLC dba O'Reilly Auto Parts

Poppe Automotive

6100006620 HH 6411 San Pedro 4737 Broom St 6374 Rittiman Rd 9207 San Pedro Ave 233 S. Patterson 716 S. Frio Street

Item Description

Estimated 
Annual 
Usage

San Antonio,
TX 78216

San Antonio,                                 
TX 78217

San Antonio,                       
TX 78218

San Antonio,                       
TX 78216

Springfield,                           
MO 65802

San Antonio,                       
TX 78207

7 Manfacturer: Motorcraft
Part Number: YF3099 3
Manufacturer Offered UAC Motorcraft Four Seasons No Bid Four Seasons
Part Number Offered HA10484C 4F37395 28877 5F1Z19C836AB 55307
Price Per Each Before Discount: $32.89 $62.94 $48.95 $125.88 $42.61
$ Discount $0.00 $0.00 $14.68 $57.90 $8.52
Price Per Each After Discount: $32.89 $62.94 $34.27 $67.98 $34.09
Extended Price: $98.67 $188.82 $102.81 $203.94 $102.27

8 Manfacturer: Murray
Part Number: 70-3559 4
Manufacturer Offered UAC Four Seasons Four Seasons No Bid MRY Four Seasons
Part Number Offered RD5203C 3314D 208588 70-3559 33140
Price Per Each Before Discount: $23.33 $17.85 $21.35 $47.44 $14.42
$ Discount $0.00 $1.79 $6.40 $24.18 $2.88
Price Per Each After Discount: $23.33 $16.06 $14.95 $23.26 $11.54
Extended Price: $93.32 $64.24 $59.80 $93.04 $46.16

4A EXPANSION VALVES
A Percent of discount offered

0%
0% Motorcraft,                       10% 

Four Seasons 30% Cost Plus 8% 41% or Better 20%
B Product identification (Manufacturer): Universal Air 

Conditioner/Omega/Global 
Products/Four 

Seasons/Delco/Motorcraft
Motorcraft,                             Four 

Seasons Napa Temp (Four Seasons) Motorcraft Murray Global/Four Seasons
C Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.): Provided NET File Distributor Net, Price 4 Jobber Wholesale List Price Jobber
D Price schedule number: AP502, Computer Printout RPT086 FPS-3642 N/A-Online AC6620
E Date of price schedule: 3/30/2016 Jan 1, 2016, March 1, 2016 3/2016 3/29/16 N/A-Online 4/1/2016
F Price schedule column on which discount is based: NET Dealer Price, Computer Printout Jobber Dealer Cost List Price Jobber

(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)
G Warranty: 12 Months from purchase 24/24k, 24 month 24 months/24,000 miles 2 years/Unlimited Miles 1 year limited warranty 1 year

4B Specified Items - Expansion Valves 
1 Manfacturer: Murray

Part Number: 39009 4
Manufacturer Offered UAC Four Seasons Four Seasons No Bid MRY Four Seasons
Part Number Offered EX529458C 39009 217010 39009 39009
Price Per Each Before Discount: $26.10 $26.93 $26.25 $71.17 $17.42
$ Discount $0.00 $2.69 $7.87 $38.42 $3.48
Price Per Each After Discount: $26.10 $24.24 $18.38 $32.75 $13.94
Extended Price: $104.40 $96.96 $73.52 $131.00 $55.76

2 Manfacturer: Murray
Part Number: 39391 3
Manufacturer Offered UAC Four Seasons Four Seasons No Bid MRY Global
Part Number Offered EX10388C 39391 217391 39391 3411491
Price Per Each Before Discount: $26.95 $45.81 $54.17 $99.98 $17.94
$ Discount $0.00 $4.58 $16.25 $51.78 $3.59
Price Per Each After Discount: $26.95 $41.23 $37.92 $48.20 $14.35
Extended Price: $80.85 $123.68 $113.76 $144.60 $43.05

3 Manfacturer: Motorcraft
Part Number: YG416 2
Manufacturer Offered Motorcraft Motorcraft Four Seasons MRY Global
Part Number Offered YG416 4G416 217356 9L3Z19849A 39356 3411482
Price Per Each Before Discount: $124.21 $77.10 $31.50 $154.20 $59.31 $18.05
$ Discount $0.00 $0.00 $9.45 $70.93 $31.14 $3.61
Price Per Each After Discount: $124.21 $77.10 $22.05 $83.27 $28.17 $14.44
Extended Price: $248.42 $154.20 $44.10 $166.54 $56.34 $28.88

4 Manfacturer: Motorcraft
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Opened: March 30, 2016

For: Annual Contract for Automotive and Truck Air Conditioning Parts

Evapocore, Inc dba Carlisle 
Auto Air

Full Service Auto Parts Genuine Parts Company North Park Lincoln O'Reilly Auto Enterprises, 
LLC dba O'Reilly Auto Parts

Poppe Automotive

6100006620 HH 6411 San Pedro 4737 Broom St 6374 Rittiman Rd 9207 San Pedro Ave 233 S. Patterson 716 S. Frio Street

Item Description

Estimated 
Annual 
Usage

San Antonio,
TX 78216

San Antonio,                                 
TX 78217

San Antonio,                       
TX 78218

San Antonio,                       
TX 78216

Springfield,                           
MO 65802

San Antonio,                       
TX 78207

Part Number: AL8Z19849A 9
Manufacturer Offered Motorcraft X Four Seasons MRY Four Seasons
Part Number Offered YG422 4G422 217327 39327 39377
Price Per Each Before Discount: $143.86 $89.94 $28.92 $179.88 $59.31 $22.92
$ Discount $0.00 $0.00 $8.67 $82.74 $32.29 $4.58
Price Per Each After Discount: $143.86 $89.94 $20.25 $97.14 $27.02 $18.34
Extended Price: $1,294.74 $809.46 $182.25 $874.26 $243.18 $165.06

5 Manfacturer: Murray
Part Number: 38901 3
Manufacturer Offered UAC Four Seasons Four Seasons No Bid MRY Global
Part Number Offered EX9404C 38901 207338 38901 3411301
Price Per Each Before Discount $26.01 $20.29 $25.60 $50.83 $15.38
$ Discount $0.00 $2.03 $7.68 $26.89 $3.08
Price Per Each After Discount: $26.01 $18.26 $17.92 $23.94 $12.30
Extended Price: $78.03 $54.78 $53.76 $71.82 $36.90

5A OROFICE TUBES
A Percent of discount offered

0%
0% Motorcraft,                        10% 

Four Seasons 30% Cost Plus 8% 41% or Better 20%
B Product identification (Manufacturer): Universal Air 

Conditioner/Santech/Global 
Products/Four Seasons

Motorcraft,                             Four 
Seasons Napa Temp (Four Seasons) Motorcraft

Murray,                       
Motorcraft Global

C Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.): Provided NET File Distributor Net, Price 4 Jobber Wholesale List Price Jobber
D Price schedule number: AP502, Computer Printout RPT086 FPS-3642 N/A-Online AC6620
E Date of price schedule: 3/30/2016 Jan 1, 2016, March 1, 2016 3/2016 3/29/16 N/A-Online 4/1/2016
F Price schedule column on which discount is based: NET Dealer, Price 4 Jobber Dealer Cost List Jobber

(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)
G Warranty: 12 Months from purchase 24/24k, 24 month 24 months/24,000 miles 2 years/Unlimited Miles Standard Mfr Warranty 1 year

5B Specified Items - Orofice Tubes
1 Manfacturer: Motorcraft

Part Number: YG343 35
Manufacturer Offered Santech Motorcraft Four Seasons MOT Global
Part Number Offered MT0094-1 4G343 207319 F5DZ19D990AB YG343 3411250
Price Per Each Before Discount $2.50 $4.34 $1.92 $8.68 $12.69 $0.77
$ Discount $0.00 $0.00 $0.57 $3.99 $6.00 $0.15
Price Per Each After Discount: $2.50 $4.34 $1.35 $4.69 $6.69 $0.62
Extended Price: $87.50 $151.90 $47.25 $164.15 $234.15 $21.70

2 Manfacturer: Motorcraft
Part Number: YG346 16
Manufacturer Offered Santech Motorcraft Four Seasons MOT Global
Part Number Offered MT0093-1 4G346 207317 F50219D990AB YG346 3411247
Price Per Each Before Discount $2.50 $4.38 $1.92 $8.76 $11.85 $0.77
$ Discount $0.00 $0.00 $0.57 $4.03 $5.37 $0.15
Price Per Each After Discount: $2.50 $4.38 $1.35 $4.73 $6.48 $0.62
Extended Price: $40.00 $70.08 $21.60 $75.68 $103.68 $9.92

3 Manfacturer: Motorcraft
Part Number: YG380 5
Manufacturer Offered Santech Motorcraft Four Seasons MRY Global
Part Number Offered MT1243-1 4G380 217071 XC4Z19D990AA 39071 3411885
Price Per Each Before Discount $2.50 $4.13 $1.71 $8.26 $5.58 $0.91
$ Discount $0.00 $0.00 $0.51 $3.80 $2.89 $0.18
Price Per Each After Discount: $15.00 $4.13 $1.20 $4.46 $2.69 $0.73
Extended Price: $20.65 $6.00 $22.30 $13.45 $3.65

4 Manfacturer: Motorcraft
Part Number: YG345 6
Manufacturer Offered Santech Motorcraft Four Seasons MOT Global
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Opened: March 30, 2016

For: Annual Contract for Automotive and Truck Air Conditioning Parts

Evapocore, Inc dba Carlisle 
Auto Air

Full Service Auto Parts Genuine Parts Company North Park Lincoln O'Reilly Auto Enterprises, 
LLC dba O'Reilly Auto Parts

Poppe Automotive

6100006620 HH 6411 San Pedro 4737 Broom St 6374 Rittiman Rd 9207 San Pedro Ave 233 S. Patterson 716 S. Frio Street

Item Description

Estimated 
Annual 
Usage

San Antonio,
TX 78216

San Antonio,                                 
TX 78217

San Antonio,                       
TX 78218

San Antonio,                       
TX 78216

Springfield,                           
MO 65802

San Antonio,                       
TX 78207

Part Number Offered MT0092-1 4G345 207316 F5X219D990AB YG345 3411241
Price Per Each Before Discount $2.50 $4.35 $1.92 $8.70 $11.85 $0.77
$ Discount $0.00 $0.00 $0.57 $4.00 $5.41 $0.15
Price Per Each After Discount: $2.50 $4.35 $1.35 $4.70 $6.44 $0.62
Extended Price: $15.00 $26.10 $8.10 $28.20 $38.64 $3.72

5 Manfacturer: Murray
Part Number: 38638 6
Manufacturer Offered Santech Four Seasons Four Seasons No Bid MRY Global
Part Number Offered MT0098-1 38638 207301 38638 3411249
Price Per Each Before Discount $2.50 $1.23 $1.92 $3.37 $0.77
$ Discount $0.00 $0.12 $0.57 $1.74 $0.15
Price Per Each After Discount: $2.50 $1.11 $1.35 $1.63 $0.62
Extended Price: $15.00 $6.66 $8.10 $9.78 $3.72

6A A/C SWITCHES
A Percent of discount offered

0% 0% Motorcraft,                        10%   30% Cost Plus 8% 41% or Better 20%
B Product identification (Manufacturer): Universal Air 

Conditioner/Santech/Global 
Products/Four 

Seasons/ACDelco Motorcraft/AC Delco/Motorcraft Napa Temp (Four Seasons) Motorcraft Murray Global
C Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.): Provided NET File Distributor Net, Price 4 Jobber Wholesale List Price Jobber
D Price schedule number: AP502, Computer Printout RPT086 FPS-3642 N/A-Online AC6620
E Date of price schedule: 3/30/2016 Jan 1, 2016, Jan 1, 2016 3/2016 3/29/16 N/A-Online 4/1/2016
F Price schedule column on which discount is based: NET Dealer, Price 4 Jobber Dealer Cost List Jobber

(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)
G Warranty: 12 Months from purchase 24/24k, 24 month Limited Lifetime 2 years/Unlimited Miles 1 year limited warranty

6B Specified Items - A/C Switches
1 Manfacturer: Murray 

Part Number: 36485 3
Manufacturer Offered Santech Four Seasons Four Seasons No Bid MRY Global
Part Number Offered MT0444 36485 207671 36485 1711362
Price Per Each Before Discount $8.73 $18.01 $15.95 $25.41 $8.63
$ Discount $0.00 $1.80 $4.78 $1.73
Price Per Each After Discount: $8.73 $16.21 $11.17 $11.46 $6.90
Extended Price: $26.19 $48.63 $33.51 $20.70

2 Manfacturer: AC Delco
Part Number: 52467127 3
Manufacturer Offered Santech AC Delco Four Seasons No Bid MRY Global
Part Number Offered MT0205 15-50104 207654 36659 1711427
Price Per Each Before Discount $8.18 $29.63 $12.62 $20.32 $8.03
$ Discount $0.00 $2.96 $3.78 $1.61
Price Per Each After Discount: $8.18 $26.67 $8.84 $9.00 $6.42
Extended Price: $24.54 $80.01 $26.52 $19.26

3 Manfacturer: Motorcraft
Part Number: 3W1Z19E561AA 4
Manufacturer Offered Santech Motorcraft Four Seasons MRY Global
Part Number Offered MT1313 4H1613 207769 20957 1711530
Price Per Each Before Discount $11.20 $16.08 $14.73 $32.16 $11.14
$ Discount $0.00 $0.00 $4.41 $14.79 $2.23
Price Per Each After Discount: $11.20 $16.08 $10.32 $17.38 $8.91
Extended Price: $44.80 $64.32 $41.28 $69.48 $35.64

7A A/C CONDENSERS
A Percent of discount offered

0% 0%,                                       10% 15% Cost Plus 8% 41% or Better 20%
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Opened: March 30, 2016

For: Annual Contract for Automotive and Truck Air Conditioning Parts

Evapocore, Inc dba Carlisle 
Auto Air

Full Service Auto Parts Genuine Parts Company North Park Lincoln O'Reilly Auto Enterprises, 
LLC dba O'Reilly Auto Parts

Poppe Automotive

6100006620 HH 6411 San Pedro 4737 Broom St 6374 Rittiman Rd 9207 San Pedro Ave 233 S. Patterson 716 S. Frio Street

Item Description

Estimated 
Annual 
Usage

San Antonio,
TX 78216

San Antonio,                                 
TX 78217

San Antonio,                       
TX 78218

San Antonio,                       
TX 78216

Springfield,                           
MO 65802

San Antonio,                       
TX 78207

B Product identification (Manufacturer): Universal Air 
Conditioner/Omega/Global 

Products/Four 
Seasons/APC/TYC Motorcraft, OSC

Napa Condensers (Spectra 
Premium) Motorcraft Murray APDI/Motorcraft

C Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.): Provided NET File Distributor Net, Price 4 Jobber Wholesale List Price Jobber
D Price schedule number: AP502, Computer Printout RPT086 FPS-3642 N/A-Online AC6620
E Date of price schedule: 3/30/2016 Jan 1, 2016, March 1, 2016 3/2016 3/29/16 N/A-Online 4/1/2016
F Price schedule column on which discount is based: NET Dealer, Price 4 Jobber Dealer Cost List Jobber

(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)
G Warranty: 12 Months from purchase 24/24k, 24 month 24 months/24,000 miles 2 years/Unlimited Miles Standard Mfr Warranty 1 year

7B Specified Items - A/C Condensers
1 Manfacturer: Murray 

Part Number: 7-3618 2
Manufacturer Offered UAC OSC Spectra No Bid MRY APDI
Part Number Offered CN3618PFC 3092 73618 7-3618 7013618
Price Per Each Before Discount $81.63 $78.95 $140.68 $357.61 $71.83
$ Discount $0.00 $7.89 $21.10 $197.42 $14.37
Price Per Each After Discount: $81.63 $71.06 $119.58 $160.19 $57.46
Extended Price: $163.26 $142.12 $239.16 $320.38 $114.92

2 Manfacturer: Murray 
Part Number: 7-4984 2
Manufacturer Offered UAC OSC Spectra No Bid MRY APDI
Part Number Offered CN4984PFXC 4984 1K600294 7-4984 7014984
Price Per Each Before Discount $60.28 $70.18 $97.87 $223.71 $46.42
$ Discount $0.00 $7.02 $14.68 $112.47 $9.28
Price Per Each After Discount: $60.28 $63.16 $83.19 $111.24 $37.14
Extended Price: $120.56 $126.32 $166.38 $222.48 $74.28

3 Manfacturer: Motorcraft
Part Number: BW7Z19712A 40
Manufacturer Offered UAC Motorcraft Spectra MRY APDI
Part Number Offered CN3557PFC 4J564 73557 7-3557 7013557
Price Per Each Before Discount $78.13 $256.49 $126.39 $394.60 $461.00 $98.55
$ Discount $0.00 $25.65 $18.96 $117.59 $314.31 $19.71
Price Per Each After Discount: $78.13 $230.84 $107.43 $277.01 $146.69 $78.84
Extended Price: $3,125.20 $9,233.60 $4,297.20 $11,080.40 $5,867.60 $3,153.60

4 Manfacturer: Motorcraft
Part Number: AL1Z19712A 4
Manufacturer Offered UAC Motorcraft Spectra MRY APDI
Part Number Offered CN3618PFC 4J612 73618 A.LZ19712B 7-3618 7013618
Price Per Each Before Discount $75.50 $192.06 $140.68 $295.48 $357.61 $71.83
$ Discount $0.00 $0.00 $21.10 $88.06 $197.42 $14.37
Price Per Each After Discount: $75.50 $192.06 $119.58 $207.42 $160.19 $57.46
Extended Price: $302.00 $768.24 $478.32 $829.68 $640.76 $229.84

5 Manfacturer: Motorcraft
Part Number: BC3Z19860F 3
Manufacturer Offered UAC Motorcraft Four Seasons No Bid Motorcraft
Part Number Offered EV939932PFXC 4K238 234017 BC3Z19860G YK238
Price Per Each Before Discount $73.16 $162.93 $100.58 $250.66 $216.38
$ Discount $0.00 $0.00 $15.09 $74.70 $43.28
Price Per Each After Discount: $73.16 $162.93 $85.49 $175.96 $173.10
Extended Price: $219.48 $488.79 $256.47 $527.88 $519.30

8A A/C HOSES
A Percent of discount offered

0% 0%,                                       10% 30% Cost Plus 8% 41% or Better 20%
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Opened: March 30, 2016

For: Annual Contract for Automotive and Truck Air Conditioning Parts

Evapocore, Inc dba Carlisle 
Auto Air

Full Service Auto Parts Genuine Parts Company North Park Lincoln O'Reilly Auto Enterprises, 
LLC dba O'Reilly Auto Parts

Poppe Automotive

6100006620 HH 6411 San Pedro 4737 Broom St 6374 Rittiman Rd 9207 San Pedro Ave 233 S. Patterson 716 S. Frio Street

Item Description

Estimated 
Annual 
Usage

San Antonio,
TX 78216

San Antonio,                                 
TX 78217

San Antonio,                       
TX 78218

San Antonio,                       
TX 78216

Springfield,                           
MO 65802

San Antonio,                       
TX 78207

B Product identification (Manufacturer): Universal Air 
Conditioner/Omega/Global 

Products/Four 
Seasons/Delco/Motorcraft Motorcraft, AC Delco Napa Temp (Four Seasons) Motorcraft Murray, Motorcraft

Global/Delco/Four 
Seasons/Motorcraft

C Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.): Provided NET File Distributor Net, Price 4 Jobber Wholesale List Price Jobber
D Price schedule number: AP502, Computer Printout RPT086 FPS-3642 N/A-Online AC6620
E Date of price schedule: 3/30/2016 Jan 1, 2016, March 1, 2016 3/2016 3/29/16 N/A-Online 4/1/2016
F Price schedule column on which discount is based: NET Dealer, Price 4 Jobber Dealer Cost List Jobber

(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)
G Warranty: 12 Months from purchase 24/24k, 24 month 24 Months/24,000 miles 2 years/Unlimited Miles Standard Mfr Warranty 1 year

8B Specified Items - A/C Hoses
1 Manfacturer: Motorcraft

Part Number: 6W7Z19D734AA 117
Manufacturer Offered UAC Motorcraft Four Seasons MOT Global
Part Number Offered HA11093C 4F3223 282048 YF3223 4812124
Price Per Each Before Discount $51.97 $109.06 $125.16 $218.12 $306.76 $57.34
$ Discount $0.00 $10.91 $37.54 $100.34 $138.49 $11.47
Price Per Each After Discount: $51.97 $98.15 $87.62 $117.78 $168.27 $45.87
Extended Price: $6,080.49 $11,483.55 $10,251.54 $13,780.26 $19,687.59 $5,366.79

2 Manfacturer: Motorcraft
Part Number: DB5Z19972E 13
Manufacturer Offered Motorcraft Motorcraft Four Seasons No Bid Motorcraft
Part Number Offered DB5Z19972E 4F37176 282246 YF37176
Price Per Each Before Discount $66.44 $40.68 $46.83 $81.36 $60.30
$ Discount $0.00 $0.00 $14.04 $37.43 $12.06
Price Per Each After Discount: $66.44 $40.68 $32.79 $43.93 $48.24
Extended Price: $863.72 $528.84 $426.27 $571.09 $627.12

3 Manfacturer: Delco
Part Number: 22876353 3
Manufacturer Offered UAC AC Delco Four Seasons No Bid No Bid AC Delco
Part Number Offered HA111475C 15-34538 201707 15-34538
Price Per Each Before Discount $50.04 $50.58 $90.95 $54.69
$ Discount $0.00 $5.05 $27.28 $10.94
Price Per Each After Discount: $50.04 $45.52 $63.67 $43.75
Extended Price: $150.12 $136.56 $191.01 $131.25

4 Manfacturer: Mopar
Part Number: 55055960AD 5
Manufacturer Offered UAC Mopar Four Seasons No Bid MRY Four Seasons
Part Number Offered HA10094C 55055960AD 282522 56822 56822
Price Per Each Before Discount $40.49 $87.25 $33.53 77.95 $28.34
$ Discount $0.00 $20.56 $8.65 $39.36 $5.67
Price Per Each After Discount: $40.49 $66.69 $24.88 $38.59 $22.67
Extended Price: $202.45 $333.45 $104.40 $192.95 $113.35

9A A/C GASKETS
A Percent of discount offered 0% 10% 30% Cost Plus 8% 41% or Better 20%
B Product identification (Manufacturer): Universal Air 

Conditioner/Omega/Global 
Products/Four 

Seasons/Delco/Motorcraft Four Seasons Napa Temp (Four Seasons) Motorcraft Murray Four Seasons
C Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.): Provided NET File Jobber Jobber Wholesale List Price Jobber
D Price schedule number: Price 4 RPT086 FPS-3642 N/A-Online AC6620
E Date of price schedule: 3/30/2016 1-Mar-16 3/2016 3/29/16 N/A-Online 4/1/2016
F Price schedule column on which discount is based: NET Computer Printout Jobber Dealer Cost List Jobber

(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)
G Warranty: 12 Months from purchase 24 months 24 Months/24,000 miles 2 years/Unlimited Miles 1 year limited warranty 1 year
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Opened: March 30, 2016

For: Annual Contract for Automotive and Truck Air Conditioning Parts

Evapocore, Inc dba Carlisle 
Auto Air

Full Service Auto Parts Genuine Parts Company North Park Lincoln O'Reilly Auto Enterprises, 
LLC dba O'Reilly Auto Parts

Poppe Automotive

6100006620 HH 6411 San Pedro 4737 Broom St 6374 Rittiman Rd 9207 San Pedro Ave 233 S. Patterson 716 S. Frio Street

Item Description

Estimated 
Annual 
Usage

San Antonio,
TX 78216

San Antonio,                                 
TX 78217

San Antonio,                       
TX 78218

San Antonio,                       
TX 78216

Springfield,                           
MO 65802

San Antonio,                       
TX 78207

9B Specified Items - A/C Gaskets
1 Manfacturer: Murray 

Part Number: 24338 10
Manufacturer Offered Santech Four Seasons Four Seasons No Bid MRY Four Seasons
Part Number Offered MT2170 24338 207275 24338 24338
Price Per Each Before Discount $1.18 $2.65 $3.09 $6.76 $2.48
$ Discount $0.00 $0.27 $0.92 $3.49 $0.50
Price Per Each After Discount: $1.18 $2.38 $2.17 $3.27 $1.98
Extended Price: $11.80 $23.80 $21.70 $32.70 $19.80

2 Manfacturer: Murray 
Part Number: 24340 10
Manufacturer Offered Santech Four Seasons Four Seasons No Bid MRY Four Seasons
Part Number Offered MT2161 24340 207273 24340 24340
Price Per Each Before Discount $3.13 $4.84 $5.27 $7.95 $4.53
$ Discount $0.00 $0.48 $1.58 $4.12 $0.91
Price Per Each After Discount: $3.13 $4.36 $3.69 $3.83 $3.62
Extended Price: $31.30 $43.60 $36.90 $38.30 $36.20

3 Manfacturer: Murray 
Part Number: 24068 10
Manufacturer Offered Santech Four Seasons Four Seasons No Bid MRY Four Seasons
Part Number Offered MT1217 24068 207168 24068 24068
Price Per Each Before Discount $2.88 $2.97 $3.44 $8.97 $2.78
$ Discount $0.00 $0.30 $1.03 $4.86 $0.56
Price Per Each After Discount: $2.88 $2.62 $2.41 $4.11 $2.72
Extended Price: $28.80 $26.70 $24.10 $41.10 $22.20

10A A/C O-RINGS
A Percent of discount offered

0% 0%,                                       10% 30% Cost Plus 8% 41% or Better 20%
B Product identification (Manufacturer): Universal Air 

Conditioner/Omega/Global 
Products/Four 

Seasons/Delco/Motorcraft Motorcraft, Four Seasons Napa Temp (Four Seasons) Motorcraft Murray Four Seasons
C Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.): Provided NET File Distributor Net, Price 4 Jobber Wholesale List Price Jobber
D Price schedule number: AP502, Computer Printout RPT086 FPS-3642 N/A-Online AC6620
E Date of price schedule: 3/30/2016 Jan 1, 2016, March 1, 2016 3/2016 3/29/16 N/A-Online 4/1/2016
F Price schedule column on which discount is based: NET Dealer, Price 4 Jobber Dealer Cost List Jobber

(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)
G Warranty: 12 Months from purchase 24/24, 24 month 24 Months/24,000 miles 2 years/Unlimited Miles 1 year limited warranty 1 year

10B Specified Items - A/C O-Rings
1 Manfacturer: Murray 

Part Number: 24729 10
Manufacturer Offered Santech Four Seasons Four Seasons No Bid MRY Four Seasons
Part Number Offered MT0230-1 24729 407141 24729 24729
Price Per Each Before Discount $0.69 $2.37 $2.38 $4.56 $2.22
$ Discount $0.00 $0.24 $0.71 $2.50 $0.44
Price Per Each After Discount: $0.69 $2.13 $1.67 $2.06 $1.78
Extended Price: $6.90 $21.30 $16.70 $20.60 $17.80

2 Manfacturer: Murray 
Part Number: 24000 10
Manufacturer Offered Santech Four Seasons Four Seasons No Bid No Bid Four Seasons
Part Number Offered MT2100 24000 207173 24000
Price Per Each Before Discount $2.08 $7.39 $5.15 $6.92
$ Discount $0.00 $0.74 $1.54 $1.38
Price Per Each After Discount: $2.08 $6.65 $3.61 $5.54
Extended Price: $20.80 $66.50 $36.10 $55.40

3 Manfacturer: Murray 
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Opened: March 30, 2016

For: Annual Contract for Automotive and Truck Air Conditioning Parts

Evapocore, Inc dba Carlisle 
Auto Air

Full Service Auto Parts Genuine Parts Company North Park Lincoln O'Reilly Auto Enterprises, 
LLC dba O'Reilly Auto Parts

Poppe Automotive

6100006620 HH 6411 San Pedro 4737 Broom St 6374 Rittiman Rd 9207 San Pedro Ave 233 S. Patterson 716 S. Frio Street

Item Description

Estimated 
Annual 
Usage

San Antonio,
TX 78216

San Antonio,                                 
TX 78217

San Antonio,                       
TX 78218

San Antonio,                       
TX 78216

Springfield,                           
MO 65802

San Antonio,                       
TX 78207

Part Number: 24089 10
Manufacturer Offered Santech Four Seasons Four Seasons No Bid MRY Four Seasons
Part Number Offered MT0261-1 24089 407089 24089 24089
Price Per Each Before Discount $0.36 $1.32 $0.71 $2.19 $1.23
$ Discount $0.00 $0.13 $0.21 $1.30 $0.25
Price Per Each After Discount: $0.36 $1.19 $0.50 $0.89 $0.98
Extended Price: $3.60 $11.90 $5.00 $8.90 $9.80

4 Manfacturer: Motorcraft 
Part Number: 9W7Z19B596A 2
Manufacturer Offered Santech Motorcraft Four Seasons MRY Four Seasons
Part Number Offered MT1299 4F3534 910211 24241 24241
Price Per Each Before Discount $4.44 $10.60 $2.32 $21.20 $5.07 $2.42
$ Discount $0.00 $0.00 $0.69 $9.75 $2.38 $0.48
Price Per Each After Discount: $4.44 $10.60 $1.63 $11.45 $2.69 $1.94
Extended Price: $8.88 $21.20 $3.26 $22.90 $5.38 $3.88

11A A/C ADDITIVES
A Percent of discount offered 0% 10% 30% Cost Plus 8% No Bid 20%
B Product identification (Manufacturer): Universal Air 

Conditioner/Omega/Global 
Products/Four 

Seasons/Supercool/Johnson
s-TCC Johnson AC Delco Napa Temp (Four Seasons) Motorcraft Global/Four Seasons

C Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.): Provided NET File Computer Generated Jobber Wholesale Jobber
D Price schedule number: Price 4 RPT086 FPS-3642 AC6620
E Date of price schedule: 3/30/2016 Computer Printout 1/1/2016 3/2016 3/29/16 4/1/2016
F Price schedule column on which discount is based: NET Price-Jobber Jobber Dealer Cost Jobber

(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)
G Warranty: 12 Months from purchase 24/24 12 Months 2 years/Unlimited Miles 1 year

11B Specified Items - A/C Additives
1 Manfacturer: A/C Flush

Part Number: 2405 5
Manufacturer Offered Super Cool Johnson Four Seasons No Bid Global
Part Number Offered 22762 6545-6 419955 8011256
Price Per Each Before Discount $9.59 $9.65 $10.94 $8.67
$ Discount $0.00 $0.97 $3.28 $1.73
Price Per Each After Discount: $9.59 $8.68 $7.66 $6.94
Extended Price: $47.95 $43.40 $38.30 $34.70

2 Manfacturer: AC Delco Ref Oil
Part Number: 15118 96
Manufacturer Offered Super Cool AC Delco Four Seasons No Bid Global
Part Number Offered P150-8 15-118 409502 8011252
Price Per Each Before Discount $5.26 $14.21 $9.29 $7.77
$ Discount $0.00 $1.42 $2.78 $1.55
Price Per Each After Discount: $5.26 $12.79 $6.51 $6.22
Extended Price: $504.96 $1,227.84 $624.96 $597.12

3 Manfacturer: Hybrid AC Oil
Part Number: 409610 6
Manufacturer Offered Super Cool Johnson Four Seasons No Bid Four Seasons
Part Number Offered 24940 6830 409610 59889
Price Per Each Before Discount $10.73 $17.85 $16.21 $11.75
$ Discount $0.00 $1.79 $4.86 $2.35
Price Per Each After Discount: $10.73 $16.06 $11.35 $9.40
Extended Price: $64.38 $96.36 $68.10 $56.40

4 Manfacturer: AC UV Dye
Part Number: 78100 12
Manufacturer Offered Super Cool AC Delco Napa Cool Power No Bid Global
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Opened: March 30, 2016

For: Annual Contract for Automotive and Truck Air Conditioning Parts

Evapocore, Inc dba Carlisle 
Auto Air

Full Service Auto Parts Genuine Parts Company North Park Lincoln O'Reilly Auto Enterprises, 
LLC dba O'Reilly Auto Parts

Poppe Automotive

6100006620 HH 6411 San Pedro 4737 Broom St 6374 Rittiman Rd 9207 San Pedro Ave 233 S. Patterson 716 S. Frio Street

Item Description

Estimated 
Annual 
Usage

San Antonio,
TX 78216

San Antonio,                                 
TX 78217

San Antonio,                       
TX 78218

San Antonio,                       
TX 78216

Springfield,                           
MO 65802

San Antonio,                       
TX 78207

Part Number Offered 24452 10-5072 788100 8011254
Price Per Each Before Discount $27.28 $6.33 $31.46 $44.72
$ Discount $0.00 $0.63 $10.49 $8.94
Price Per Each After Discount: $27.28 $5.70 $20.97 $35.78
Extended Price: $327.36 $68.40 $251.64 $429.36

5 Manfacturer: AC Pag Oil
Part Number: 801651 10
Manufacturer Offered Super Cool Johnson Four Seasons No Bid Global
Part Number Offered P46-8PE 6812-6 801651 8011250
Price Per Each Before Discount $5.24 $4.14 $7.11 $7.77
$ Discount $0.00 $0.41 $2.13 $1.55
Price Per Each After Discount: $5.24 $3.73 $4.96 $6.22
Extended Price: $52.40 $37.30 $49.80 $62.20

6 Manfacturer: Pag 46 UV Dye
Part Number: 7656027 8
Manufacturer Offered Super Cool Johnson Four Seasons No Bid Global
Part Number Offered P46-8DPE 6812UV6 765-6027 8011250
Price Per Each Before Discount $6.84 $4.87 $8.48 $7.77
$ Discount $0.00 $0.49 $2.54 $1.55
Price Per Each After Discount: $6.84 $4.38 $5.94 $6.22
Extended Price: $54.72 $35.04 $47.52 $49.76

Payment Terms 2%, 10 days 2%, 10 days 2%, 10 days Net 30 Days 2%, 10 days Net 30 Days
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