
City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 31, 2015

For:        Annual Contract for Boulders, Granite & Rocks
Adamek Services Inc. Castillon & Sons 

Construction

Collier Materials Keller Material Ltd.

RS 29309 Seabiscuit Dr. 2731 Oak Island 201 CR 121 9388 Corporate Dr.

Item
Description

Est. Annual Qty
Fair Oaks Ranch                                              

TX 78015

San Antonio, 

TX 78264                        

Marble Falls,                                   

TX 78654                         

Selma,                                   

TX 78154                       

1 Decomposed Granite
Price per Ton Picked Up By City Truck 1200 No Bid $35.00 $11.00 $36.00

Total Price $42,000.00 $13,200.00 $43,200.00

Decomposed Granite

Price per Ton Delivered 1200 No Bid $15.00 $24.80 $47.60

Total Price $18,000.00 $29,760.00 $57,120.00

2 Limestone RIP RAP
Price per Ton Picked Up By City Truck 1000 No Bid $33.00 No Bid $39.50

Total Price $33,000.00 $39,500.00

Limestone RIP RAP

Price per Ton Delivered 1000 No Bid $15.00 No Bid $50.30

Total Price $15,000.00 $50,300.00

3 Antelope Stone Sawed Chopped Block
Price per Ton Picked Up By City Truck 80 No Bid $180.00 No Bid $280.00

Total Price $14,400.00 $22,400.00

Antelope Stone Sawed Chopped Block

Price per Ton Delivered 80 No Bid $17.90 No Bid $290.00

Total Price $1,432.00 $23,200.00

4 White Sawed Chopped Block
Price per Ton Picked Up By City Truck 80 No Bid $180.00 No Bid $145.00

Total Price $14,400.00 $11,600.00

White Sawed Chopped Block

Price per Ton Delivered 80 No Bid $17.90 No Bid $155.80

Total Price $1,432.00 $12,464.00

5 Santa Fe Mix Chopped
Price per Ton Picked Up By City Truck 80 No Bid $180.00 No Bid $200.00

Total Price $14,400.00 $16,000.00

Santa Fe Mix Chopped

Price per Ton Delivered 80 No Bid $17.90 No Bid $210.80

Total Price $1,432.00 $16,864.00

6 Pink Granite Gravel
Price per Ton Picked Up By City Truck 100 No Bid $50.50 $15.00 $52.50

Total Price $5,050.00 $1,500.00 $5,250.00

Pink Granite Gravel

Price per Ton Delivered 100 No Bid $15.00 $31.00 $63.30

Total Price $1,500.00 $3,100.00 $6,330.00

7 Catalina Sunset Grave
Price per Ton Picked Up By City Truck 50 No Bid $87.50 No Bid $148.00

Total Price $4,375.00 $7,400.00

Catalina Sunset Grave

Price per Ton Delivered 50 No Bid $15.00 No Bid $158.80

Total Price $750.00 $7,940.00

8 Limestone Boulders
Price per Ton Picked Up By City Truck 600 No Bid $140.00 No Bid $140.00

Total Price $84,000.00 $84,000.00

Limestone Boulders

Price per Ton Delivered 600 No Bid $17.90 No Bid $150.80

Total Price $10,740.00 $90,480.00

9 Sandstone Boulders
Price per Ton Picked Up By City Truck 300 No Bid $140.00 No Bid $260.00

Total Price $42,000.00 $78,000.00

Sandstone Boulders

Price per Ton Delivered 300 No Bid $17.90 No Bid $270.80

Total Price $5,370.00 $81,240.00

10 Moss Rock Boulders
Price per Ton Picked Up By City Truck 300 No Bid $180.00 No bid $160.00

Total Price $54,000.00 $48,000.00

Moss Rock Boulders

Price per Ton Delivered 300 No Bid $17.90 No Bid $170.00

Total Price $5,370.00 $51,000.00

11 Decomposed Granite 1/4" to minus
Price per Ton Picked Up By City Truck 1 No Bid $36.00 $11.00 No Bid

Total Price $36.00 $11.00

Decomposed Granite 1/4" to minus

Price per Ton Delivered 1 No Bid $15.00 $24.80 No Bid

Total Price $15.00 $24.80

12 Stabilizer Binder Powder 40 lb bag
Price per Bag Picked Up By City Truck 100 No Bid $150.00 No Bid No Bid

Total Price $15,000.00

Stabilizer Binder Powder 40 lb bag

Price per Bag Delivered 100 No Bid $17.90 No Bid No Bid

Total Price $1,790.00

Total Price $0.00

Delivery 2 days 3 days

Payment Terms 2%/10 Net 30 Net 30

6100005397


