
City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 30, 2016

For: Annual Contract for Light-Duty Automatic 

Transmission Parts & Service

Alamo City Chevrolet Mitson Automotive, Inc. DBA 

AAMCO Transmissions

6100007914 DG 9400 San Pedro 2105 Pat Booker Rd

Item Description

Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity

San Antonio,

TX 78216

Universal City,

TX 78148

 ITEM 1: Automatic Transmission Parts:

A. Percent of Discount Offered: 10% over G.M. cost 35%

Product Identification (Manufacturer): General Motors Transtar

Type of Price Schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.): Below Jobber Pricing List

Price Schedule Number: General Motors Dealer World Transtar List Price 12/12/15

Date of Price Schedule:

Current Run Thru General 

Motors Dealer World 12/12/15

Price Schedule Column on Which Discount is based: 

(i.e. distributor, net, wholesale, etc.) Cost Plus 10% D-List Price EA

Warranty (minimum 90 days): Yes 18 Month / 18,000 Mile

B. Specified Items - Automatic Transmission Parts:

1 Part Description: Filter 10 No bid

Part Number: 72010A

Manufacturer Offered: Transtar

Part Number Offered: 72010A

Price Per Each: $22.37

$ Discount: $7.83

Price Per Each after Discount: $14.54

Extended Price: $145.40

2 Part Description: Pump Assembly 10 No bid

Part Number: 66009879AB

Manufacturer Offered: Mopar

Part Number Offered: RL009879AE

Price Per Each: $460.00

$ Discount: $161.00

Price Per Each after Discount: $299.00

Extended Price: $2,990.00

3 Part Description: Overdrive Spring 10 No bid

Part Number: S36682

Manufacturer Offered: Transtar

Part Number Offered: A22936

Price Per Each: $3.75

$ Discount: $1.31

Price Per Each after Discount: $2.44

Extended Price: $24.40

4 Part Description: Solenoid Assembly 10 No bid

Part Number: F81Z7G391CA

Manufacturer Offered: Transtar

Part Number Offered: D36420D

Price Per Each: $501.97

$ Discount: $175.69

Price Per Each after Discount: $326.28

Extended Price: $3,262.80

5 Part Description: Bearing Retainer 10 No bid Discontinued

Part Number: B8TZ7085B N/A

Manufacturer Offered: N/A

Part Number Offered: N/A

Price Per Each: N/A

$ Discount: N/A

Price Per Each after Discount: N/A

Extended Price: N/A
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6 Part Description: Torque Converter 10 No bid

Part Number: CR2A

Manufacturer Offered: Transtar

Part Number Offered: CR2A

Price Per Each: $295.00

$ Discount: $103.25

Price Per Each after Discount: $191.75

Extended Price: $1,917.50

7 Part Description: Banner Kit W/Steel 10 No bid

Part Number: 72006B

Manufacturer Offered: Transtar

Part Number Offered: 720006B

Price Per Each $635.09

$ Discount: $222.28

Price Per Each after Discount: $412.81

Extended Price: $4,128.10

8 Part Description: Planetary Assembly 10 No bid

Part Number: 2L2Z7B446AA

Manufacturer Offered: Transtar

Part Number Offered: A46580A

Price Per Each: $192.95

$ Discount: $67.53

Price Per Each after Discount: $125.42

Extended Price: $1,254.20

9 Part Description: Reverse Drum 10 No bid

Part Number: 3L3Z7G484AA

Manufacturer Offered: Transtar

Part Number Offered: D76556G

Price Per Each $268.69

$ Discount: $94.04

Price Per Each after Discount: $174.65

Extended Price: $1,746.50

10 Part Description: Governor Solenoid 10 No bid

Part Number: 4617210

Manufacturer Offered: Transtar

Part Number Offered: 12432A

Price Per Each $82.78

$ Discount: $28.97

Price Per Each after Discount: $53.81

Extended Price: $538.10

11 Part Description: Valve Body Plate 10 No bid

Part Number: 52108308AC

Manufacturer Offered: Mopar

Part Number Offered: 08AC521083

Price Per Each $425.00

$ Discount: $148.75

Price Per Each after Discount: $276.25

Extended Price: $2,762.50

12 Part Description: Banner Kit 10 No bid

Part Number: 76004JW

Manufacturer Offered: Transtar

Part Number Offered: 76004JW

Price Per Each $296.65

$ Discount: $103.83

Price Per Each after Discount: $192.82

Extended Price: $1,928.20
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13 Part Description: Fluid Cooler 10 No bid

Part Number: OC1405

Manufacturer Offered: Transtar

Part Number Offered: OC1405

Price Per Each $65.89

$ Discount: $23.06

Price Per Each after Discount: $42.83

Extended Price: $428.30

14 Part Description: Pump Cover 10 No bid

Part Number: D72519

Manufacturer Offered: Transtar

Part Number Offered: D72519

Price Per Each $82.27

$ Discount: $28.79

Price Per Each after Discount: $53.48

Extended Price: $534.80

15 Part Description: Transducer 10 No bid

Part Number: 4799758

Manufacturer Offered: Transtar

Part Number Offered: 72415

Price Per Each $124.88

$ Discount: $43.71

Price Per Each after Discount: $81.17

Extended Price: $811.70

 ITEM 2: Transmission Fluid:

Description: Dextron III / Dextron VI / Mercon VI

or proven equal 30

Manufacturer General Motors Service Pro

Product Name Dexron VI ATF Global Full Synthetic

Product Number 88865601 SPL 00221

Unit Price 5.10 $4.99

Extended Price 153.00 $149.70

Description: Mercon V or proven equal 196 No bid

Manufacturer Service Pro

Product Name Global Full Synthetic

Product Number SPL 00221

Unit Price $4.99

Extended Price $978.04

Description: Mercon LV or proven equal 300 No bid

Manufacturer Service Pro

Product Name Global Full Synthetic

Product Number SPL 00221

Unit Price $4.99

Extended Price $1,497.00

Description: Mercon SP or proven equal 40 No bid

Manufacturer Service Pro

Product Name Global Full Synthetic

Product Number SPL 00221

Unit Price $4.99

Extended Price $199.60

Description: Chrysler ATF 4 or proven equal 76 No bid

Manufacturer: Service Pro

Product Name: Global Full Synthetic

Product Number SPL 00221

Price Per Quart: $4.99

Extended Price: $379.24



City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 30, 2016

For: Annual Contract for Light-Duty Automatic 

Transmission Parts & Service

Alamo City Chevrolet Mitson Automotive, Inc. DBA 

AAMCO Transmissions

6100007914 DG 9400 San Pedro 2105 Pat Booker Rd

Item Description

Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity

San Antonio,

TX 78216

Universal City,

TX 78148

Description: Honda CVT or proven equal 10 No bid

Manufacturer: Honda

Product Name: Honda CVT

Product Number 882009006

Price Per Quart: $7.75

Extended Price: $77.50

Description: Toyota TIV or proven equal 10 No bid

Manufacturer: Toyota

Product Name: Toyota TIV

Product Number 00279000T4

Price Per Quart: $5.05

Extended Price: $50.50

Description: VersaTans ATF or proven equal 200 No bid

Manufacturer: Nissan

Product Name: NS3CVT

Product Number 999MPNS300P

Price Per Quart: $19.99

Extended Price: $3,998.00

 ITEM 3: Labor and Services:

Labor and Service Rate - Regular, per hour 68.00 $42.50

Labor and Service Rate - Expedited, per hour N/A $42.50

Restocking Orders are place every __ days on ___ 

(day of the week) Monday thru Friday 3 ; Tuesday and Fridays

Parts and Service Facilities Name: Alamo City Chevrolet

Mitson Automotive, Inc. DBA 

AAMCO Transmissions

Parts and Service Facilities Address: 9400 San Pedro Ave. 2105 Pat Booker Rd

Universal City, TX 78148

Payment Terms Net 30 2.5 %; 10 days


