
City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 1, 2016

For: Annual Contract For Window Washing at the Alamodome

AHI Facility Services 

Inc.

Allegiance 

Environmental 

Services

In Convenant 

Cleaning Services

International Building 

Services

One Stop Services, 

Inc.

SJ&J Solutions LLC 

d/b/a Affordable 

Window Washing 

Services

Squeegee Squad

6100007654 MAB 625 Yuma Ct 15303 Tradesman 32329 Lavender Cove 8204 N. Lamar Blvd 5401 Bandera Road 10430 Eagle Fox 5150 Broadway #448

Item Description

Estimated

Annual 

Cycles

Dallas,

TX 75208

San Antonio,

TX 78249

Bulverde,

TX 78163

Austin,

TX 78753

San Antonio,

TX 78238

San Antonio, 

TX 78245

San Antonio,

TX 78209

1 South Side - Exterior 2

Price Per Cycle $5,488.00 $6,250.00 $4,004.00 No Bid $1,750.00 $7,140.00 $2,898.00

Total Price $10,976.00 $12,500.00 $8,008.00 $3,500.00 $14,280.00 $5,796.00

2 South Side - Interior 1

Price Per Cycle $2,744.00 $3,750.00 $4,004.00 No Bid $1,900.00 $5,100.00 $2,556.75

Total Price $2,744.00 $3,750.00 $4,004.00 $1,900.00 $5,100.00 $2,556.75

3 North Side - Exterior 2

Price Per Cycle $5,488.00 $6,250.00 $4,004.00 No Bid $1,750.00 $7,140.00 $2,898.00

Total Price $10,976.00 $12,500.00 $8,008.00 $3,500.00 $14,280.00 $5,796.00

4 North Side - Interior 1

Price Per Cycle $2,744.00 $3,750.00 $4,004.00 No Bid $1,900.00 $5,100.00 $2,556.75

Total Price $2,744.00 $3,750.00 $4,004.00 $1,900.00 $5,100.00 $2,556.75

5 East Side - Exterior 2

Price Per Cycle $1,944.00 $3,750.00 $1,330.00 No Bid $1,750.00 $6,020.00 $1,975.00

Total Price $3,888.00 $7,500.00 $2,660.00 $3,500.00 $12,040.00 $3,950.00

6 East Side - Interior 1

Price Per Cycle $972.00 $2,500.00 $1,330.00 No Bid $1,900.00 $4,300.00 $1,020.00

Total Price $972.00 $2,500.00 $1,330.00 $1,900.00 $4,300.00 $1,020.00

7 West Side - Exterior 2

Price Per Cycle $1,944.00 $3,750.00 $1,330.00 No Bid $1,750.00 $6,020.00 $1,975.00

Total Price $3,888.00 $7,500.00 $2,660.00 $3,500.00 $12,040.00 $3,950.00

8 West Side - Interior 1

Price Per Cycle $972.00 $2,500.00 $1,330.00 No Bid $1,900.00 $4,300.00 $1,020.00

Total Price $972.00 $2,500.00 $1,330.00 $1,900.00 $4,300.00 $1,020.00

9 Lift Rental 2

Price Per Cycle $3,000.00 $26,250.00 $2,500.00 No Bid $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $5,995.00

Total Price $6,000.00 $52,500.00 $5,000.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $11,990.00

Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 3%  14 Days 2%  10 Days 2.5%  15 Days Net 30

Prepared by Purchasing 7/20/2016


