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1

GLOVES, NITRILE, POWDER FREE, 

TEXTURED, LIGHT BLUE, SZ SMALL, 100/BX 100/Box

Dental Health Products 

Inc  (DHPI) SKU 430-

1116  Ecobee 1116 225 $8.95 25% $6.76 box 100 $9.49 $7.59 bx 100

2

GLOVES, NITRILE, POWDER FREE, 

TEXTURED, LIGHT BLUE, SZ MEDIUM, 100/BX 100/Box

DHPI SKU 430-1117    

Ecobee 1117 318 $8.95 25% $6.76 box 100 $9.49 $7.59 bx 100

3

GLOVES, NITRILE, POWDER FREE, 

TEXTURED, LIGHT BLUE, SZ LARGE, 100/BX 100/Box

DHPI SKU 430-1118     

Ecobee 1118 232 $8.95 25% $6.76 box 100 $9.49 $7.59 bx 100

4

GLOVES, NITRILE, POWDER FREE, 

TEXTURED, LIGHT BLUE, SZ XLARGE, 100/BX 100/Box

DHPI SKU 430-1119     

Ecobee 1119 3 $8.95 25% $6.76 box 100 $83.79 $67.03 ca 1000

5

HAND SANITIZER, 2 OZ BOTTLE, KLEENEX 

ULTRA Each DHPI SKU 350-34604 15 $5.75 25% $4.34 each 1 $8.49 $6.79 ea ea

6

HAND SANITIZER, 16 OZ BOTTLE, KLEENEX 

ULTRA Each DHPI SKU 350-34618      5 $23.45 25% $17.70 each 1 $26.49 $6.79 ea ea

7

HAND SANITIZER, 8 OZ PUMP BOTTLE, 

PURELL ADVANCED Each DHPI SKU 350-965212 53 $10.75 25% $8.12 each 1 $9.18 $6.39 ea 8oz

8 PROCEDURE MASK, BLUE, 50/BOX 50/Box

DHPI SKU 450-50102    

Halyard Health 47080 18 $11.45 25% $8.64 box 50 $11.99 $9.49 bx 50

9 EXAM MASK, EARLOOP, BLUE, 50/BOX 50/Box DHPI SKU 450-7000B2   3 $9.95 30% $6.97 box 50 $11.49 $5.29 bx 50

10 EYEWEAR, PURPLE Each

DHPI SKU 470-100705      

Hager Worldwide 

100705 2 $38.95 25% $29.41 each 1 $38.99 $31.19 ea ea

11

GOWN, GREEN, ELASTIC CUFF, PROTECTION 

PLUS, 50/CASE 50/Case

DHPI SKU 480-6000G     

Premier Marketing 

6000G 7 $52.25 25% $39.45 case 50 No Bid

12

GOWN, BLUE, 3" CUFF, PROTECTION PLUS, 

50/CASE 50/Case

DHPI SKU 480-7000B    

Premier Marketing 

7000B 5 $58.95 25% $44.51 case 50 No Bid

13

GOWN, PINK, 3" CUFF, PROTECTION PLUS, 

50/CASE 50/Case

DHPI SKU 480-7000P   

Premier Marketing 

7000P 5 $62.25 25% $47.00 case 50 No Bid

14

SURFACE WIPES, FLAT PACK, 7" X 9", 

CAVIWIPES, 45/PACK 45/Pack

DHPI SKU 510-131224       

Kerr 13-1224 125 $11.25 25% $8.49 pack 45 $11.49 $9.19 pk 45

15 VISION SAVER PINNACLE, 400/PACK 400/Pack

DHPI SKU 660-4575              

Kerr 4575C 14 $43.75 25% $33.03 pack 400 $45.79 $41.21 bx 400

16 CHAIR COVER, FULL, 29" X 80", 125/BOX 125/Box

DHPI SKU 660-50130              

Pac-Dent Intl 111 8 $44.25 25% $33.41 box 125 $40.29  $32.23 bx 125

17 RADII PLUS BARRIER SLEEVES, 100/PACK 100/Pack

DHPI SKU 660-5600055      

Southern Dental 

5600055 8 $59.25 25% $44.73 pack 100 $54.99 $43.99 pk 100

New Franklin,

WI 54229

Dental Health Products Inc

2614 North Sugar Bush Road

Henry Schein Dental Inc.

135 Duryea Rd

Melville, 

NY 11747-7382

Section 2 - Market Basket 

CATEGORY A: INFECTION CONTROL SUPPLIES AND EQUIPMENT

Typical products ordered from this section may include, but are not limited to gloves, gowns, masks, hand sanitizer, eyewear, cleaners, surface barriers.
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18

ETCHING GEL, SCOTCHBOND UNIVERSAL 

ETCHANT, 3ML SYRINGE, 2/PACK 2/Pack

DHPI SKU 223-41263           

3M ESPE 41263 66 $50.95 25% $38.47 pack 2 $52.49 $41.99 pk 2

19

ETCH GEL DISPENSING TIPS, SCOTCHBOND, 

25 /PACK 25/Pack

DHPI SKU 223-7523T          

3M ESPE 41274 220 $20.95 25% $15.82 pack 25 $19.49 $15.59 pk 25

20

SEALANT SYRINGE TIPS REFILL, CLINPRO, 

10/PACK 10/Pack

DHPI SKU 953-12626T         

3M ESPE 12626T 253 $5.75 25% $4.34 pack 10 $6.29 $5.49 bx 10

21 SEALANT REFILL SYRINGE, 1.2ML, CLINPRO Each

DHPI SKU 953-12627           

3M ESPE 12627 72 $25.25 25% $19.06 each 1 $26.49 $21.99 ea ea

22

SALIVA EJECTORS, RAINBOW, FLEXO, 

1,000/PACK

1,000/Pac

k

DHPI SKU 540-1662213   

Keystone 1662213 5 $73.75 25% $55.68 pack 1000 $72.99 $58.39 pk 1000

23

SALIVA EJECTORS, CLEAR/BLUE TIP, 

DISPOSABLE, HEALTH-TEC, 100/BAG 100/Bag

DHPI SKU 540-

HT100CB2 6 $4.95 30% $3.47 bag 100 $5.79 $2.85 pk 100

24

AIR WATER SYRINGE TIPS, DISPOSABLE, 

SEALT-TIGHT, 1,500/BX 1,500/Box

DHPI SKU 540-77500      

Kerr 77500C 4 $302.95 25% $228.73 box 1500 $309.99 $249.99 bg 1500

25

PROE-VAC UNIDOSE TUBES CERTOL, 1 OZ, 

24/PACK 24/Pack

DHPI SKU 550-

PVACU24   Certol Intl 

PVACU24 10 $24.95 25% $18.84 pack 24 $29.49 $23.59 bx 24

26

SALIVA EJECTOR TIP, AUTOCLAVABLE, 

GRAY, PUSH ON Each

DHPI SKU 580-DCI5754     

DCI 5754 11 $2.95 25% $2.23 each 1 $4.29 ea ea

27

MOUTH RINSE, TOTAL CARE, LISTERINE, 8.5 

OZ, 12/CASE 12/Case

DHPI SKU 360-30620     

Johnson & Johnson 

30620 14 $41.95 25% $31.67 case 12 $43.99 $35.19 ca 12

28

VARNISH, 5% SODIUM FLOURIDE, VANILLA 

CUPCAKE, D-LISH, 200/BOX 200/Box

DHPI SKU 540-214420    

Young Dental 214420 71 $358.25 25% $270.48 box 200 $377.99 $302.39 bx 200

29

VARNISH, 5% SODIUM FLOURIDE, BUBBLE 

GUM, .40mL, 200/PACK 200/Pack

DHPI SKU 950-12141           

3M ESPE 12141 3 $222.45 25% $167.95 pack 200 $224.99 $224.99 bx 200

30

VARNISH, CLEARSHIELD, 5% SODIUM 

FLOURIDE, KOLORZ, BUBBLE GUM, .40mL, 

200/PACK 200/Pack

DHPI SKU 950-799504    

DMG America 799504 90 $274.75 25% $207.44 pack 200 $282.99 $209.99 bx 200

31

TOOTHPASTE, CAVITY PROTECTION, KIDS, 

SPARKLE, BUBBLEGUM, .85 OZ, 72/BOX 72/Box

DHPI SKU 950-

84839310   Proctor & 

Gamble 8483910 162 $23.95 25% $18.08 box 72 $23.99 $21.59 ca 72

32

TOOTHPASTE, PRO-HEALTH JR, DISNEY 

FROZEN, .85 OZ, 72/BOX 72/Box

DHPI SKU 950-

80276288    Proctor & 

Gamble 80276288 93 $23.95 25% $18.08 box 72 $24.29 $21.86 ca 72

CATEGORY B: COSMETIC DENTISTRY EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Typical products ordered from this section may include, but are not limited to sealing and etching products, etc.

CATEGORY C: DENTAL EVACUATION SUPPLIES AND EQUIPMENT

Typical products from this section may include, but are not limited to evacuation tips, ejectors, cleaners , etc.

CATEGORY D:  PREVENTIVES

Typical products ordered from this section may include, but are not limited to toothbrushes, toothpaste, dental floss, varnish, mouthwash etc.
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33

TOOTHPASTE, PRO-HEALTH ADVANCED, 

MINT, 4 OZ, 24/BOX 24/Box

DHPI SKU 950-

80266826   Proctor & 

Gamble 80266826 49 $40.95 25% $30.92 box 24 $40.99 $36.89 ca 24

34

DENTAL FLOSS, ULTRACLEAN, MINT, 5 YD, 

72/CASE 72/Case

DHPI SKU 950-44026    

Johnson & Johnson 

44026 64 $21.45 25% $16.19 case 72 $21.99 $17.59 ca 72

35 FLOSSERS, FUN, 3/PK, 144PKS/BOX 144/Box

DHPI SKU 950-01008     

Dentek 01008 167 $38.75 25% $29.26 box 144 $38.99 $31.19 bg 144

36

FLOSSERS, CHILD, CRAYOLA, 3/PK, 48 

PK/CASE 48/Case

DHPI SKU 950-895PY    

Sunstar 895PB 6 $17.25 25% $13.02 case 48 $18.49 $13.89 bx 48

37 TOOTHBRUSH, TODDLER, 28 TUFT, 24/PACK 24/Pack

DHPI SKU 940-200359     

Preventive Dental 200- 18 $27.45 25% $20.72 pack 24 $28.49 $22.79 pk 24

38

TOOTHBRUSH, TODDLER, RING, SAFETY, 

24/PACK 24/Pack

DHPI SKU 940-900902     

Preventive Dental 900-

902 18 $48.95 25% $36.96 pack 24 $50.99 $40.79 bx 24

39

TOOTHBRUSH, PRESCHOOL, 19 TUFT, X-

SOFT, 72/BOX 72/Box

DHPI SKU 940-1900         

Tess Oral Health 1900 103 $29.95 25% $22.61 box 72 No Bid

40

TOOTHBRUSH, JUNIOR, WITH IMPRINT, 

72/BOX 72/Box DHPI SKU 940-HTC28 268 $30.95 30% $21.67 box 72 No Bid

41

TOOTHBRUSH, ADULT, WITH IMPRINT, 

72/BOX 72/Box DHPI SKU 940-HTA42 181 $36.95 30% $25.87 box 72 No Bid

42 TOOTHBRUSH, ADULT, FULL HEAD, 72/BOX 72/Box DHPI SKU 940-HTUA 28 $36.95 30% $25.87 box 72 No Bid

43

PROPHY ANGLE, DISPOSABLE, WITH WHITE 

TAPERED BRUSH, NON-LATEX, 144/BOX 144/Box

DHPI SKU 970-110003     

Preventech 1100033    22 $105.95 25% $79.99 box 144 $108.99 $87.19 bx 144

44

EXPLORER AND PROBE, DISPOSABLE, 

100/BOX 100/Box

DHPI SKU 700-

D002008P   Applied 

Dental D002-008-P 132 $85.95 25% $64.89 box 100 $88.99 $71.19 bx 100

45

ORAL EXAM PACKS, STERILE, I-PAK, 3 IN 1, 

50/BOX 50/Box

DHPI SKU 700-

D002009P   Applied 

Dental D002-009-P 141 $56.95 25% $43.00 box 50 $52.29 $49.83 bx 50

46 MIRROR, DISPOSABLE, FLECTA, 200/BOX 200/Box

DHPI SKU 700-FLEC     

Pulpdent FLEC 145 $49.45 25% $37.33 box 200 $50.99 $44.49 bx 200

47 RADII PLUS LED CURING LIGHT Each

DHPI SKU 770-5600202      

Southern Dental 

5600202 7 $1,014.95 25% $766.29 each 1 $1,020.99 $918.89 ea ea

48 HALOGEN BULB, 12V, 20W Each

DHPI SKU 780-

DNTL220002 5 $19.95 25% $15.06 each 1 $21.60 $21.60 ea ea

CATEGORY E:  INSTRUMENTS AND DEVICES

Typical products ordered from this section may include, but are not limited to probes, explorers, mirrors, handles, scalers, excavators, etc.

CATEGORY F:  DENTAL LIGHTS AND LAMPS

Typical products ordered from this section may include, but are not limited to bulbs, curing lights, etc.

CATEGORY G:  MISCELLANEOUS DENTAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Typical products ordered from this section may include, but are not limited to disposables, sponges, bibs, cups, stickers, toys etc.
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49 SAND TIMER, 3 MINUTE, 72/BAG 72/Bag

DHPI SKU 870-20403      

Oraline 20403 97 $35.45 25% $26.76 bag 72 No Bid

50

STICKERS, SPARKLE TOOTH SHAPE, 2.5", 

75/ROLL 75/Roll

DHPI SKU 870-STOT        

Smilemakers STOT 72 $7.25 25% $5.47 roll 75 No Bid

51 NEODRYS, YELLOW, SMALL, 50/PACK 50/Pack

DHPI SKU 240-DYS      

Microcopy DYS 77 $13.75 25% $10.38 pack 50 No Bid

52

PATIENT BIBS, 2PLY, AQUA, 18" X 13", 

500/CASE 500/Case DHPI SKU 640-2138 8 $29.95 30% $20.97 case 500 $31.99 $20.99 ca 500/ca

53

PATIENT BIBS, 2PLY, LAVENDER, 18" X 13", 

500/CASE 500/Case DHPI SKU 640-2140 3 $29.95 30% $20.97 case 500 $31.99 $20.99 ca 500/ca

54

TOWEL, BLUE, 3 PLY, POLYGARD, 18" X 30", 

300/CASE 300/Case

DHPI SKU 640-

WD1930BL    Crosstex 

W3D1930BL 4 $54.95 25% $41.49 case 300 $56.99 $45.59 ca 300

55

BIB, CHAIN-FREE, SANI-TAB, 2 PLY, DUSTY 

ROSE, 13" X 19", 400/CASE 400/Case

DHPI SKU 640-

WEXDRT       Crosstex 

WEXDRT 5 $37.95 25% $28.65 case 400 $38.99 $31.19 bx 400

56

COTTON ROLLS, ULTRA, NON-STERILE, 

MEDIUM, #2, 1.5" X 3/8", 2,000/BOX 2,000/Box DHPI SKU 240-CR001   7 $22.95 30% $16.07 box 2000 $24.99 $18.99 bx 2000

57 MOUTH PROPS, EZ PROP, 100/PACK 100/Pack

DHPI SKU 930-540900          

Dentsply Rinn 540900 9 $42.45 25% $32.05 pack 100 $45.49 $31.19 pk 100

Net 30 Net 30


