City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 20, 2016
For: Medium Equipment Il
American Material |Centerline Supply |H & E Equipment | Tejas Equipment Tejas Equipment Trantex Vermeer Equipment
Handling, Inc. Services Rentals Rentals Transportation
Products of Texas
Inc.
6100006993 A 3651 Mars Hill 1731 S. San 5327 Tex-Con Rd. |6380 Randolph 6380 Randolph 3310-D Frick Rd. 16593 IH 35N
Road Marcos Blvd Blvd
Watkinsville, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Houston, Selma,
ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITIES [GA 30677 TX 78207 TX 78220 TX 78233 TX 78233 TX 77086 TX 78154
1 Trailer Mounted Paint Striper 2
Price each No Bid $50,550.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $54,950.00 No Bid
Total $101,100.00 $109,900.00
2016 Trantex Model 2016, Trantex TR
Year, Make & Model Offered TR 1500SH 1500 SH
Warranty 12 months 12 months
Centerline Supply,
Warranty Service Provider Name Centerline Supply LTD
1731 S. San 1731 S. San
Marcos Bldg. 932 Marcos Bldg. #932
San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX
Warranty Facility Address 78207 78207
Delivery will be made within __ calendar days
after issuance of purchase order 120 120
Production cut-off date 31-Mar-16 31-Mar-16
Indicate the last day that the City can place
orders under this contract without missing the
production cut off date 15-Mar-16 15-Mar-16
Bid Prices shall remain firm for all orders
placed prior to this cut off date. In the event
that City does not award a contract prior to
production cut off date, can bidder provide bid
items, at the bid price submitted, after the
production cut off date? No No
2 Operator Propelled Paint Striper 2
Price each No Bid $14,763.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $15,550.00 No Bid
Total $29,526.00 $31,100.00
2016 Trantex Model 2016, Trantex,
Year, Make & Model Offered CH265M CH265M
Centerline Supply|
Warranty (12 months) 12 months
Centerline Supply,
Warranty Service Provider Name Centerline Supply| LTD
1731 S. San 1731 S. San

Warranty Facility Address

Delivery will be made within __ calendar days
after issuance of purchase order

Production cut-off date

Indicate the last day that the City can place
orders under this contract without missing the
production cut off date

Bid Prices shall remain firm for all orders
placed prior to this cut off date. In the event
that City does not award a contract prior to
production cut off date, can bidder provide bid
items, at the bid price submitted, after the
production cut off date?

Marcos Bldg. 932
San Antonio, TX
78207

120

31-Mar-16

15-Mar-16

No

Marcos Bldg. #932
San Antonio, TX
78207

30
31-Mar-16

15-Mar-16
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 20, 2016
For: Medium Equipment Il
American Material |Centerline Supply |H & E Equipment | Tejas Equipment Tejas Equipment Trantex Vermeer Equipment
Handling, Inc. Services Rentals Rentals Transportation
Products of Texas
Inc.
6100006993 A 3651 Mars Hill 1731 S. San 5327 Tex-Con Rd. |6380 Randolph 6380 Randolph 3310-D Frick Rd. 16593 IH 35N
Road Marcos Blvd Blvd
Watkinsville, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Houston, Selma,
ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITIES [GA 30677 TX 78207 TX 78220 TX 78233 TX 78233 TX 77086 TX 78154
3 Concrete/Pavement Saw 1
Price each No Bid No Bid $2,160.00 $2,647.00 $2,713.00 No Bid No Bid
Total $2,160.00 $2,647.00 $2,713.00
2015 SP118
Multiquip w/water 2015 Multiquip
2016 Husqvarna| kit. 18.0" concrete| SP213 w/water Kkit.
Year, Make & Model Offered FS400LV/ saw| 20.0" concrete saw
Specific make & model of engine offered Honda GX390| Honda GX390 11.7| Honda GX390 11.7
(include HP) 11.7hp HP HP
1 year parts /
Warranty 1 year services| 1 year parts / labor
H & E Equpiment Tejas Equipment Tejas Equipment
Warranty Service Provider Name Services Rentals Rentals
5327 Tex-Con Rd. 6380 Randolph 6380 Randolph
San Antonio, TX Blvd San Antonio Blvd San Antonio
Warrant Facility Address 78220 TX 78233 TX 78233
Delivery will be made within __ calendar days
after issuance of purchase order 14 30 30
Production cut-off date 31-Dec-16 None None
Indicate the last day that the City can place
orders under this contract without missing the
production cut off date 15-Dec-16 None None
Bid Prices shall remain firm for all orders
placed prior to this cut off date. In the event
that City does not award a contract prior to
production cut off date, can bidder provide bid
items, at the bid price submitted, after the
production cut off date? No Yes Yes
4 Skid Mounted Generator - MIG Welder 1
Price each No Bid No Bid $5,919.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total $5,919.00

Year, Make & Model Offered

Specific make & model of engine offered
(include HP)

Warranty

Warranty Service Provider Name

Warranty Facility Address

Delivery will be made within __ calendar days
after issuance of purchase order

Production cut-off date

Indicate the last day that the City can place
orders under this contract without missing the
production cut off date

Bid Prices shall remain firm for all orders
placed prior to this cut off date. In the event
that City does not award a contract prior to
production cut off date, can bidder provide bid
items, at the bid price submitted, after the
production cut off date?

2016 Miller Bobcat
250LP Part no.
907504;
300917-hose &
mounting assembly
Kohler CH730
21HP

3 years

H & E Equpiment
Services

5327 Tex-Con Rd.
San Antonio, TX
78220

14
31-Dec-16

15-Dec-16

No

Prepared by Purchasing 1/26/2016

Page 2



City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 20, 2016
For: Medium Equipment Il
American Material |Centerline Supply |H & E Equipment | Tejas Equipment Tejas Equipment Trantex Vermeer Equipment
Handling, Inc. Services Rentals Rentals Transportation
Products of Texas
Inc.
6100006993 A 3651 Mars Hill 1731 S. San 5327 Tex-Con Rd. |6380 Randolph 6380 Randolph 3310-D Frick Rd. 16593 IH 35N
Road Marcos Blvd Blvd
Watkinsville, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Houston, Selma,
ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITIES [GA 30677 TX 78207 TX 78220 TX 78233 TX 78233 TX 77086 TX 78154
5 6,000 Ibs LPG Forklift 1
Price each $32,917.00 No Bid No Bid $26,174.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total $32,917.00 $26,174.00
2015 Doosan G30P- 2015 Heli CPYD30
Year, Make & Model Offered 5MLP LPG powered
Specific make & model of engine offered Mitsubishi Engine GM - 3.0 Liter:
(include HP) 62HP Vortec LPG Engine
Power shift - single
Transmission Offered Powershift speed
Entire truck: 12
months or 2,000
hours whichever
comes first;
Drive train: 24
months or 4,000
hours, whichever
comes first; One year/2000
Oil Cooled Disc hour. P/L - 2 year
Brakes: 5 years or 4000 hour
Warranty 10,000 hours powertrain
Associated Supply Tejas Equipment
Warranty Service Provider Name Company Rentals
6380 Randolph
Blvd San Antonio
Warranty Facility Address San Antonio, TX TX 78233
Delivery will be made within __ calendar days
after issuance of purchase order 100 or earlier 90
Production cut-off date N/A None
Indicate the last day that the City can place
orders under this contract without missing the
production cut off date N/A None
Bid Prices shall remain firm for all orders
placed prior to this cut off date. In the event
that City does not award a contract prior to
production cut off date, can bidder provide bid
items, at the bid price submitted, after the
production cut off date? Yes Yes
6 Material Handling Man Lift 1
Price each No Bid No Bid $179,470.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total $179,470.00
2016 JLG X700AJ
Year, Make & Model Offered Electric
1 year full machine /
5 year structural
Warranty components
H & E Equpiment
Warranty Service Provider Name Services
5327 Tex-Con Rd.
San Antonio, TX
Warranty Facility Address 78220
Delivery will be made within __ calendar days
after issuance of purchase order 30
Production cut-off date 31-Dec-16
Indicate the last day that the City can place
orders under this contract without missing the
production cut off date 1-Dec-16
Bid Prices shall remain firm for all orders
placed prior to this cut off date. In the event
that City does not award a contract prior to
production cut off date, can bidder provide bid
items, at the bid price submitted, after the
production cut off date? No
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Opened:
For:

January 20, 2016
Medium Equipment II

6100006993

Al

City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

ITEM

DESCRIPTION

QUANTITIES

American Material
Handling, Inc.

3651 Mars Hill
Road
Watkinsville,
GA 30677

Centerline Supply

1731 S. San
Marcos

San Antonio,
TX 78207

H & E Equipment
Services

5327 Tex-Con Rd.

San Antonio,
TX 78220

Tejas Equipment
Rentals

6380 Randolph
Blvd

San Antonio,
TX 78233

Tejas Equipment
Rentals

6380 Randolph
Bivd

San Antonio,
TX 78233

Trantex
Transportation
Products of Texas
Inc.

3310-D Frick Rd.

Houston,
TX 77086

Vermeer Equipment

16593 IH 35N

Selma,
TX 78154

7

26' Electrical Scissor Lift
Price each
Total

Year, Make & Model Offered

Specific Make & Model of engine offered
(include HP)

Transmission Offered

Warranty

Warranty Service Provider Name

Warranty Facility Address

Delivery will be made within __ calendar days
after issuance of purchase order

Production cut-off date

Indicate the last day that the City can place
orders under this contract without missing the
production cut off date

Bid Prices shall remain firm for all orders
placed prior to this cut off date. In the event
that City does not award a contract prior to
production cut off date, can bidder provide bid
items, at the bid price submitted, after the
production cut off date?

Trailer Mounted Hydro-Jetter

Price each

Total

Year, Make & Model Offered

Specific make & model of engine offered
(include HP)

Transmission Offered

Warranty

Warranty Service Provider Name

Warranty Facility Address

Delivery will be made within __ calendar days
after issuance of purchase order

Production cut-off date

Indicate the last day that the City can place
orders under this contract without missing the
production cut off date

Bid Prices shall remain firm for all orders
placed prior to this cut off date. In the event
that City does not award a contract prior to
production cut off date, can bidder provide bid
items, at the bid price submitted, after the
production cut off date?

1

$19,098.00
$19,098.00

2016 Genie
GS2646 Scissor lift

N/A

N/A

12 month warranty
entire unit;

36 month warranty
hydraulics;

60 month warranty
structural

United Rentals
San Antonio, TX
45

N/A

N/A

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$15,425.00
$15,425.00

2016 Genie
GS2632

Genie 24V DC
N/A

1 year
comprehensive,

3 year hydraulic,

5 year structural
H & E Equpiment
Services

5327 Tex-Con Rd.
San Antonio, TX
78220

30
31-Dec-16

1-Dec-16

No

No Bid

$15,260.94
$15,260.94

2016 Skyjack 3226

Electric
Electric

2 years Parts/Labor
Tejas Equipment
Rentals

6380 Randolph
Blvd San Antonio
TX 78233

30

None

None

Yes

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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Opened:

For:

January 20, 2016
Medium Equipment II

6100006993

Al

City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

ITEM

DESCRIPTION

QUANTITIES

American Material
Handling, Inc.

3651 Mars Hill
Road
Watkinsville,
GA 30677

Centerline Supply

1731 S. San
Marcos

San Antonio,
TX 78207

H & E Equipment
Services

5327 Tex-Con Rd.

San Antonio,
TX 78220

Tejas Equipment
Rentals

6380 Randolph
Blvd

San Antonio,
TX 78233

Tejas Equipment
Rentals

6380 Randolph
Bivd

San Antonio,
TX 78233

Trantex
Transportation
Products of Texas
Inc.

3310-D Frick Rd.

Houston,
TX 77086

Vermeer Equipment

16593 IH 35N

Selma,
TX 78154

9

10

Ride On Street Sweeper

Price each

Total

Year, Make & Model Offered

Warranty

Warranty Service Provider Name

Warranty Facility Address

Delivery will be made within __ calendar days
after issuance of purchase order

Production cut-off date

Indicate the last day that the City can place
orders under this contract without missing the
production cut off date

Bid Prices shall remain firm for all orders
placed prior to this cut off date. In the event
that City does not award a contract prior to
production cut off date, can bidder provide bid
items, at the bid price submitted, after the
production cut off date?

Brush Chipper - Diesel
Price each
Total

Year, Make & Model Offered

Specific Make & Model of engine offered
(include HP)
Warranty

Warranty Service Provider Name

Warranty Facility Address

Delivery will be made within __ calendar days
after issuance of purchase order

Production cut-off date

Indicate the last day that the City can place
orders under this contract without missing the
production cut off date

Bid Prices shall remain firm for all orders
placed prior to this cut off date. In the event
that City does not award a contract prior to
production cut off date, can bidder provide bid
items, at the bid price submitted, after the
production cut off date?

Payment Terms

1

No Bid

No Bid

Net 30

No Bid

No Bid

Net 30

No Bid

No Bid

Net 30

No Bid

No Bid

Net 30

No Bid

No Bid

Net 30

No Bid

No Bid

Net 30

No Bid

$78,548.00
$78,548.00
2016 Vermeer
BC1800XL

John Deere Tier 4F
4045HFC09 173HP
1 year/1,000 hour
Vermeer Equipment
16593 IH35N Selma
TX 78154

90

N/A

N/A

No

Net 30
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