City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 20, 2015
For: Annual Contract for Industrial Gasoline & Diesel Engine Parts &
Service
Grande Truck Center Holt Texas, LTD
6100006675 MAB 4562 |H 10 East 3302 South W.W. White Rd.
Estimated [San Antonio, San Antonio,
Annual |TX 78219 TX 78222
Item Description Usage
1A Detroit Diesel New Parts
Percent of Discount Offered Cost + 11% No Bid
Product Identification (Manufacturer) Detroit - Genuine
Type of Price Schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Dealer Cost
Price Schedule Number N/A
Date of Price Schedule 11-18-15
Price Schedule Column on Which Discount Cost
is based (i.e. distributer, net, wholesale, etc.)
Warranty 12 Months Parts & Labor
90 Days on Workmanship
1B Specified ltems - Detroit Diesel New Parts
Part Description: Press Sensor 6
Part Number: A0071530228
Price Per Each Before Discount: $252.32
Discount Amount: $27.76
Price Per Each After Discount: $280.08
Extended Price: $1,680.48
Part Description: A/l Throttle Intake 6
Part Number: RA4600900065
Price Per Each Before Discount: $71.02
Discount Amount: $7.89
Price Per Each After Discount: $78.91
Extended Price: $473.46
Part Description: Coolant Filter 12
Part Number: A4722030255
Price Per Each Before Discount: $26.89
Discount Amount: $2.96
Price Per Each After Discount: $29.85
Extended Price: $358.20
Part Description: Fuel Filter 12
Part Number: AO000904251
Price Per Each Before Discount: $59.13
Discount Amount: $6.40
Price Per Each After Discount: $65.53
Extended Price: $786.36
Part Description: Oil Filter 12
Part Number: A4721800509
Part Number Offerred: A4731800109
Price Per Each Before Discount: $22.18
Discount Amount: $2.44
Price Per Each After Discount: $24.62
Extended Price: $295.44
1C Detroit Diesel, Exchange Parts:
Percent of Discount Offered Cost + 11% No Bid
Product Identification (Manufacturer) Detroit - Genuine
Type of Price Schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Dealer Cost
Price Schedule Number N/A
Date of Price Schedule 11-18-15
Price Schedule Column on Which Discount Cost
is based (i.e. distributer, net, wholesale, etc.)
Warranty 12 Months Parts & Labor
90 Days on Workmanship
1D Specified Items - Detroit Diesel Exchange Parts:
Part Description: Water Pump 8

Part Number: RA4602001301




City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 20, 2015
For: Annual Contract for Industrial Gasoline & Diesel Engine Parts &
Service
Grande Truck Center Holt Texas, LTD
6100006675 MAB 4562 IH 10 East 3302 South W.W. White Rd.
Estimated [San Antonio, San Antonio,
Annual [TX 78219 TX 78222
Item Description Usage
Price Per Each Before Discount: $313.26
Discount Amount: $34.46
Price Per Each After Discount: $347.72
Extended Price: $2,781.76
Part Description: Fuel Pump 6
Part Number: R23535540
Price Per Each Before Discount: $190.48
Discount Amount: $20.95
Price Per Each After Discount: $211.43
Extended Price: $1,268.58
Part Description: EGR Valve 7
Part Number: R23539301
Price Per Each Before Discount: $666.44
Discount Amount: $73.31
Price Per Each After Discount: $739.75
Extended Price: $5,178.25
Part Description: Injector 8
Part Number: R414703003
Price Per Each Before Discount: $287.00
Discount Amount: $31.57
Price Per Each After Discount: $318.57
Extended Price: $2,548.56
Part Description: Air Compressor 6
Part Number: RA4571306715
Price Per Each Before Discount: $623.96
Discount Amount: $68.64
Price Per Each After Discount: $692.60
Extended Price: $4,155.60
2 Labor and Service - Detroit Diesel
A.|% Off Door Rate 15% No Bid
B.|Door Rate Cost - Regular (Per Hour) $134.00
C.|Door Rate Cost - Expedited (Per Hour) $134.00
D.|Restocking orders are placed every__ days on __ (day of week) Day
E.|Parts and Service Facilities Name Grande Truck Center
Parts and Service Facilities Address 4562 |H 10 East
San Antonio, TX 78219
3A Caterpillar Series 3306 Parts, Truck Application:
Percent of Discount Offered Cost + 11% 0%
Product Identification (Manufacturer) Genuine CAT Caterpillar
Type of Price Schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Dealer Cost Customer List
Price Schedule Number N/A
Date of Price Schedule 11-18-15
Price Schedule Column on Which Discount Cost Customer List
is based (i.e. distributer, net, wholesale, etc.)
Warranty 12 Months Parts & Labor 1 Year
90 Days on Workmanship
3B Specified Items - Captive Caterpillar, New Parts:
Part Description: Injector 6
Part Number: 1780199
Price Per Each Before Discount: $533.36 $637.02
Discount Amount: $58.67 $0.00
Price Per Each After Discount: $592.03 $637.02
Extended Price: $3,552.18 $3,822.12
Part Description: Sensor GR Group Pressure 6
Part Number: 1611704
Price Per Each Before Discount: $112.23 $134.04




City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 20, 2015

For: Annual Contract for Industrial Gasoline & Diesel Engine Parts &
Service

Grande Truck Center Holt Texas, LTD
6100006675 MAB 4562 IH 10 East 3302 South W.W. White Rd.
Estimated [San Antonio, San Antonio,
Annual [TX 78219 TX 78222
Item Description Usage
Discount Amount: $12.35 $0.00
Price Per Each After Discount: $124.58 $134.04
Extended Price: $747.48 $804.24
Part Description: Oil Level Sensor 6
Part Number: 2954975 Invalid Part Number
Price Per Each Before Discount: $0.00 $0.00
Discount Amount: $0.00 $0.00
Price Per Each After Discount: $0.00 $0.00
Extended Price: $0.00 $0.00
Part Description: Hydraulic Injector Pump 6
Part Number: 1355459
Price Per Each Before Discount: $971.01 $1,159.73
Discount Amount: $106.81 $0.00
Price Per Each After Discount: $1,077.82 $1,159.73
Extended Price: $6,466.92 $6,958.38
Part Description: Harness 4
Part Number: 2225917
Price Per Each Before Discount: $154.24 $184.00
Discount Amount: $16.97 $0.00
Price Per Each After Discount: $171.21 $184.00
Extended Price: $684.84 $736.00
3C Captive Caterpillar, Exchange Parts Discount:
Percent of Discount Offered Cost + 11% 0%
Product Identification (Manufacturer) Genuine CAT Caterpillar
Type of Price Schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Dealer Cost Customer List
Price Schedule Number N/A
Date of Price Schedule 11-18-15
Price Schedule Column on Which Discount Cost Customer List
is based (i.e. distributer, net, wholesale, etc.)
Warranty 12 Months Parts & Labor 1 Year
90 Days on Workmanship
3D Specified ltems - Captive Caterpillar, Exchange Parts Discount:

Part Description: Pump Assembly 4
Part Number: 10R2129
Price Per Each Before Discount: $403.35 $481.74
Discount Amount: $44.37 $0.00
Price Per Each After Discount: $447.72 $481.74
Extended Price: $1,790.88 $1,926.96
Part Description: Pump GP General Purpose 4
Part Number: 10R7053
Price Per Each Before Discount: $769.34 $918.86
Discount Amount: $84.63 $0.00
Price Per Each After Discount: $853.97 $918.86
Extended Price: $3,415.88 $3,675.44
Part Description: Injector Assembly 4
Part Number: 10R0782
Price Per Each Before Discount: $280.09 $334.53
Discount Amount: $21.81 $0.00
Price Per Each After Discount: $301.90 $334.53
Extended Price: $1,243.60 $1,338.12
Part Description: Pump Assembly 4
Part Number: 10R9859
Part Number Offerred: 10R9359
Price Per Each Before Discount: $1,015.47 $0.00
Discount Amount: $108.70 $0.00
Price Per Each After Discount: $1,124.17 $0.00
Extended Price: $4,496.68 $0.00




City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 20, 2015
For: Annual Contract for Industrial Gasoline & Diesel Engine Parts &
Service
Grande Truck Center Holt Texas, LTD
6100006675 MAB 4562 IH 10 East 3302 South W.W. White Rd.
Estimated [San Antonio, San Antonio,
Annual [TX 78219 TX 78222
Item Description Usage
Part Description: Pump General Purpose 4
Part Number: 10R5407
Price Per Each Before Discount: $189.70 $226.57
Discount Amount: $11.87 $0.00
Price Per Each After Discount: $201.57 $226.57
Extended Price: $842.28 $906.28
4 Labor and Service - Caterpillar
A.|% Off Door Rate 15% 0%
B.|Door Rate Cost - Regular (Per Hour) $134.00 $127.00
C.|Door Rate Cost - Expedited (Per Hour) $134.00 N/A
D.|Restocking orders are placed every__ days on __ (day of week) Day
E.|Parts and Service Facilities Name Grande Truck Center Holt Cat Truck Centers
Parts and Service Facilities Address 4562 |H 10 East 3302 S. W.W. White Road
San Antonio, TX 78219 San Antonio, TX 78222
Cummins Parts, Industrial and Truck Application, All Models, New
5 Parts
Percent of Discount Offered Cost + 11% No Bid
Product Identification (Manufacturer) Genuine Cummins
Type of Price Schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Dealer Cost
Price Schedule Number N/A
Date of Price Schedule 11-18-15
Price Schedule Column on Which Discount Cost
is based (i.e. distributer, net, wholesale, etc.)
Warranty 12 Months Parts & Labor
90 Days on Workmanship
Specified Items - Cummins Parts, Industrial and Truck Application,
5B All Models New Parts:
Part Description: Turbo Charger 6
Part Number: 4040649
Part Number Offerred: 4309124
Price Per Each Before Discount: $1,764.00
Discount Amount: $194.04
Price Per Each After Discount: $1,958.04
Extended Price: $11,748.24
Part Description: Fuel Pump Assembly 6
Part Number: 3090942
Part Number Offerred: 3090842-7803
Price Per Each Before Discount: $1,260.00
Discount Amount: $138.60
Price Per Each After Discount: $1,398.60
Extended Price: $8,391.60
Part Description: Actuator Fuel Control 6
Part Number: 4903523
Price Per Each Before Discount: $163.75
Discount Amount: $18.01
Price Per Each After Discount: $181.76
Extended Price: $1,090.56
Part Description: Sensor Pressure 8
Part Number: 4954245
Price Per Each Before Discount: $85.69
Discount Amount: $9.43
Price Per Each After Discount: $95.12
Extended Price: $760.96
Part Description: Sensor Temperature 8
Part Number: 4902912
Price Per Each Before Discount: $56.87

Discount Amount:

$6.26




City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 20, 2015
For: Annual Contract for Industrial Gasoline & Diesel Engine Parts &
Service
Grande Truck Center Holt Texas, LTD
6100006675 MAB 4562 IH 10 East 3302 South W.W. White Rd.
Estimated [San Antonio, San Antonio,
Annual [TX 78219 TX 78222
Item Description Usage
Price Per Each After Discount: $63.13
Extended Price: $505.04
Cummins Parts, Industrial and Truck Application, All Models,
5C Exchange Parts:
Percent of Discount Offered Cost + 11% No Bid
Product Identification (Manufacturer) Genuine Cummins
Type of Price Schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Dealer Cost
Price Schedule Number N/A
Date of Price Schedule 11-18-15
Price Schedule Column on Which Discount Cost
is based (i.e. distributer, net, wholesale, etc.)
Warranty 12 Months Parts & Labor
90 Days on Workmanship
Specified Items - Cummins Parts, Industrial and Truck Application,
5D All Models Exchange Parts:
Part Description: Injector 6
Part Number: 2897518NX
Price Per Each Before Discount: $959.00
Discount Amount: $105.49
Price Per Each After Discount: $1,064.49
Extended Price: $6,386.94
Part Description: AFT Injector Kit 8
Part Number: 4309454RX
Price Per Each Before Discount: $250.50
Discount Amount: $27.56
Price Per Each After Discount: $278.06
Extended Price: $2,224.48
Part Description: Compressor 8
Part Number: 4318214RX
Price Per Each Before Discount: $680.00
Discount Amount: $74.80
Price Per Each After Discount: $754.80
Extended Price: $6,038.40
Part Description: Pump, Water 9
Part Number: 4955708NX
Price Per Each Before Discount: $394.40
Discount Amount: $43.38
Price Per Each After Discount: $437.78
Extended Price: $3,940.02
Part Description: Turbocharger 9
Part Number: 4089945RX
Price Per Each Before Discount: $2,025.00
Discount Amount: $222.75
Price Per Each After Discount: $2,247.75
Extended Price: $20,229.75
6 Labor and Service - Cummins Engines
A.|% Off Door Rate 15% No Bid
B.|Door Rate Cost - Regular (Per Hour) $134.00
C.|Door Rate Cost - Expedited (Per Hour) $134.00
D.|Restocking orders are placed every__ days on __ (day of week) Day
E.|Parts and Service Facilities Name Grande Truck Center
Parts and Service Facilities Address 4562 |H 10 East
San Antonio, TX 78219
Payment Terms 2% 10 Days Net 30
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