
City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 24, 2015
For: Purchase of Light Utility Vehicles

Professional Turf 
Products

River City Marketing 
d/b/a; Mission Golf Cars

San Antonio Southwest 
Trailers

6100006226 IM 5026 Service Center 
Drive

18865 Redland Rd 10302 IH 35 North

Item Description  Qty
San Antonio,                                        
TX 78218

San Antonio,                                     
TX  78258

San Antonio,                              
TX 78233

1 Four Wheeled, 6 Seat Utility Vehicle (Golf Cart) 2
Price Each No Bid $10,318.00 No Bid
Price Total $20,636.00
Make & Model & Year Offered Cushman Shuttle 8 Gas, 

2015
Authorized Warranty Provider Mission Golf Cars and 

Industrial Vehicles
Warranty Provider Address 18865 Redland Road, 

San Antonio Tx 78259
Delivery Days 35-60

2 Four Wheeled Light Utility Vehicle 1
Price Each $23,165.49 No Bid No Bid
Price Total $23,165.49
Make & Model & Year Offered 2015 Toro HDXD-07385
Authorized Warranty Provider Professional Turf 

Products
Warranty Provider Address 5026 Service Center, 

San Antonio Tx 78218
Delivery Days Not Specified

3 All Terrain Light Utility Vehicle 4x4 1
Price Each No Bid $14,741.00 No Bid
Price Total $14,741.00
Make & Model & Year Offered Cushman Hauler 4x4, 

2015

Authorized Warranty Provider Mission Golf Cars and 
Industrial Vehicles

Warranty Provider Address 18865 Redland Road, 
San Antonio Tx 78259

Delivery Days 35-60

4 All Terrain Light Utility Vehicle (4 or 6 wheel) 1
Price Each No Bid $14,741.00 No Bid
Price Total $14,741.00 
Make & Model & Year Offered Cushman Hauler 4x4, 

2016
Authorized Warranty Provider Mission Golf Cars and 

Industrial Vehicles
Warranty Provider Address 18865 Redland Road, 

San Antonio Tx 78259
Delivery Days 35-60

5 Utility Vehicle, 4 or 6 wheel 2
Price Each $24,120.68 $10,443.00 No Bid
Price Total $48,241.36 $20,886.00 
Make & Model & Year Offered Toro HDX-Auto 0390 Cushman Hauler 4x4 

2016
Authorized Warranty Provider Professional Turf 

Products
Mission Golf Cars and 

Industrial Vehicles
Warranty Provider Address 5026 Service Center, 

San Antonio Tx 78218
18865 Redland Road, 
San Antonio Tx 78259

Delivery Days Not Specified 35-60

6 Light Vehicle Cart Utility Vehicle 4x4 1
Price Each No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price Total
Make & Model & Year Offered
Authorized Warranty Provider
Warranty Provider Address
Delivery Days
Delivery Days



City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 24, 2015
For: Purchase of Light Utility Vehicles

Professional Turf 
Products

River City Marketing 
d/b/a; Mission Golf Cars

San Antonio Southwest 
Trailers

6100006226 IM 5026 Service Center 
Drive

18865 Redland Rd 10302 IH 35 North

Item Description  Qty
San Antonio,                                        
TX 78218

San Antonio,                                     
TX  78258

San Antonio,                              
TX 78233

7 Four Wheel Electric Cargo Cart 1
Price Each No Bid $15,987.00 No Bid
Price Total $15,987.00 
Make & Model & Year Offered Cushman Titan 48 Volt 
Authorized Warranty Provider Mission Golf Cars and 

Industrial Vehicles
Warranty Provider Address 18865 Redland Road, 

San Antonio Tx 78259
Delivery Days 45-60

8 Heavy Duty 4x4 Utility Vehicle 4
Price Each No Bid $10,345.00 No Bid
Price Total $41,380.00 
Make & Model & Year Offered Cushman Hauler 4x4 

2016
Authorized Warranty Provider Mission Golf Cars and 

Industrial Vehicles
Warranty Provider Address 18865 Redland Road, 

San Antonio Tx 78259
Delivery Days 35-60

9 Heavy Duty 4x4/4 Seat Utility Vehicle 2
Price Each No Bid $14,303.00 No Bid
Price Total $28,606.00 
Make & Model & Year Offered Cushman Hauler 4X4 

Crew diesel
Authorized Warranty Provider Mission Golf Cars and 

 Warranty Provider Address 18865 Redland Road, 
San Antonio Tx 78259

Delivery Days 35-60

10 Heavy Duty 4x4 utility Vehicle 1
Price Each No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price Total
Make & Model & Year Offered
Authorized Warranty Provider
Warranty Provider Address
Delivery Days
Delivery Days

11 Light Utility Golf Cart 4 Seat 1
Price Each No Bid $10,064.00 No Bid
Price Total $10,064.00 
Make & Model & Year Offered Cushman Shuttle 4, 

2016
Authorized Warranty Provider Mission Golf Cars and 

Industrial Vehicles
Warranty Provider Address 18865 Redland Road, 

San Antonio Tx 78259
Delivery Days Not Specified

12 Single Axle Light Utility Vehicle Trailer 1
Price Each No Bid No Bid $1,425.00 
Price Total $1,425.00 
Make & Model & Year Offered Southwest Gooseneck, 

BU 1283135, 2015
Authorized Warranty Provider Southwest Wheel
Warranty Provider Address 343 Gembler Rd, San 

Antonio Tx 78219
Delivery Days 60



City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 24, 2015
For: Purchase of Light Utility Vehicles

Professional Turf 
Products

River City Marketing 
d/b/a; Mission Golf Cars

San Antonio Southwest 
Trailers

6100006226 IM 5026 Service Center 
Drive

18865 Redland Rd 10302 IH 35 North

Item Description  Qty
San Antonio,                                        
TX 78218

San Antonio,                                     
TX  78258

San Antonio,                              
TX 78233

13 Tandem Trailer 1
Price Each No Bid No Bid $16,182.00 
Price Total $16,182.00 
Make & Model & Year Offered Southwest Gooseneck, 

PEH2986212E, 2015
Authorized Warranty Provider Southwest Wheel
Warranty Provider Address 343 Gembler Rd, San 

Antonio Tx 78219
Delivery Days 60

Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
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