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Opened: March 6, 2015

For:

Clampitt Paper Company
Staples Contract & 
Commercial, Inc., operating 
as Staples Advantage

6100005595 VF 3550 Ridgeside Drive 4353 Interstate Way

Item Description

Estimated 
Annual 

Quantity

San Antonio,                           
TX  78217

San Antonio,                           
TX  78219

A RECYCLED - ALL SIZES, PER CASE
1 Copy Paper - 100% Recycled, 8.5 x 11, 20 lb, 90 Brightness 105 $43.12 $50.78

Brand Boise Aspen 100 Staples
Brand P/N 054922 620014 US/CC
Brightness 92 92
Weight 20 20
# of Reams per Carton 10 10
Price Total $4,527.60 $5,331.90

2 Copy Paper - 30% Recycled, 8.5 x 11, 20 lb, 92 Brightness 891 $33.04 $41.95
Brand Boise Aspen 30 Staples
Brand P/N 054901 112350/461757
Brightness 92 92
Weight 20 20
# of Reams per Carton 10 10
Price Total $29,438.64 $37,377.45

3 Copy Paper - 100% Recycled, 8.5 x 11, 24 lb, 95 Brightness 25 No Bid $34.67
Brand Staples
Brand P/N 33509
Brightness 95
Weight 24
# of Reams per Carton 5
Price Total $866.75

4 Copy Paper - 50% Recycled, 8.5 x 11, 24 lb, 96 Brightness 15 No Bid $54.11
Brand Staples
Brand P/N 86059
Brightness 96
Weight 24
# of Reams per Carton 10
Price Total $811.65

5 Copy Paper - 100% Recycled, 8.5 x 14, 24 lb, 95 Brightness 20 No Bid $10.17 / $101.70
Brand Staples
Brand P/N 33509
Brightness 95
Weight 24
# of Reams per Carton 500/ream
Price Total $2,034.00

6 Copy Paper - 50% Recycled, 8.5 x 14, 24 lb, 96 Brightness 20 No Bid $115.99
Brand Staples
Brand P/N 86054
Brightness 96
Weight 24
# of Reams per Carton 10
Price Total $2,319.80

Annual Contract for Copier Paper and Card Stock
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For:

Clampitt Paper Company
Staples Contract & 
Commercial, Inc., operating 
as Staples Advantage

6100005595 VF 3550 Ridgeside Drive 4353 Interstate Way

Item Description

Estimated 
Annual 

Quantity

San Antonio,                           
TX  78217

San Antonio,                           
TX  78219

Annual Contract for Copier Paper and Card Stock

7 Copy Paper - 30% Recycled, 8.5 x 14, 20 lb, 92 Brightness 20 $44.88 $73.09
Brand Boise Aspen 30 Staples
Brand P/N 054904 112380
Brightness 92 92
Weight 20 20
# of Reams per Carton 10 Not Specified
Price Total $897.60 $1,461.80

8 Copy Paper - 30% Recycled, 11 x 17, 20 lb, 92 Brightness 22 $35.28 $63.99
Brand Boise Aspen 30 Staples
Brand P/N 054907 112390
Brightness 92 92
Weight 20 20
# of Reams per Carton 5 5
Price Total $776.16 $1,407.78

B VIRGIN FIBER PULP - ALL SIZES, PER CASE
9 Copy Paper - 8.5 x 11, 20 lb, 92 Brightness 5,593 $26.32 $34.00

Brand Boise Multipurpose Simply
Brand P/N 01555 324791
Brightness 92 92
Weight 20 20
# of Reams per Carton 10 10
Price Total $147,207.76 $190,162.00

10 Copy Paper - 8.5 x 11, 3 Hole Punched, 20 lb, 92 Brightness 1 $30.52 $41.33
Brand Glatfelter Go! Staples
Brand P/N 58261428 221192
Brightness 92 92
Weight 20 20
# of Reams per Carton 10 10
Price Total $30.52 $41.33

11 Copy Paper - 8.5 x 11, 20 lb, 92 Brightness, FSC Certified 6 $33.04 $34.00
Brand Hammermill Tidal MP Simply
Brand P/N 162008 324791
Brightness 92 92
Weight 20 20
# of Reams per Carton 10 10
Price Total $198.24 $204.00

12 Copy Paper - 8.5 x 11, 20 lb, 92 Brightness, Jam-Free 22 $33.04 $34.00
Brand Hammermill Tidak MP Simply
Brand P/N 162008 324791
Brightness 92 92
Weight 20 20
# of Reams per Carton 10 10
Price Total $726.88 $748.00
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Opened: March 6, 2015

For:

Clampitt Paper Company
Staples Contract & 
Commercial, Inc., operating 
as Staples Advantage

6100005595 VF 3550 Ridgeside Drive 4353 Interstate Way

Item Description

Estimated 
Annual 

Quantity

San Antonio,                           
TX  78217

San Antonio,                           
TX  78219

Annual Contract for Copier Paper and Card Stock

13 Copy Paper - 8.5 x 11, 22 lb, 98 Brightness 110 No Bid $59.05
Brand Staples
Brand P/N 22098
Brightness 92
Weight 22
# of Reams per Carton 10
Price Total $6,495.50

14 Copy Paper - 8.5 x 11, 20 lb, 96 Brightness 110 $31.92 $44.81
Brand Boise Polaris Staples
Brand P/N POL-8511 513096-BL
Brightness 97 96
Weight 20 20
# of Reams per Carton 10 10
Price Total $3,511.20 $4,929.10

15 Copy Paper - 8.5 x 14, 20 lb, 92 Brightness 96 $37.04 $52.13
Brand Boise USA Staples
Brand P/N USA-14 221193
Brightness 92 92
Weight 20 20
# of Reams per Carton 10 10
Price Total $3,555.84 $5,004.48

16 Copy Paper - 11 x 17, 20 lb, 92 Brightness 71 $29.12 $45.10
Brand Boise USA Staples
Brand P/N USA-17 190450
Brightness 92 92
Weight 20 20
# of Reams per Carton 5 5
Price Total $2,067.52 $3,202.10

17 Copy Paper - 11 x 17, 20 lb, 92 Brightness, FSC Certified 2 $35.28 $57.56
Brand Hammermill Tidal MP Domtar EarthChoice
Brand P/N 162024 2703/40480
Brightness 92 92
Weight 20 20
# of Reams per Carton 5 5
Price Total $70.56 $115.12

C CARD STOCK, PER CASE
18 Card Stock - 8.5 x 11, White, 110 lb, 92 Brightness 397 $5.55 $9.31

Brand Springhill Staples
Brand P/N 015300 49701
Brightness 92 92
Weight 110 110
# of Sheets per Pack 250 250
Price Total $2,203.35 $3,696.07
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Clampitt Paper Company
Staples Contract & 
Commercial, Inc., operating 
as Staples Advantage

6100005595 VF 3550 Ridgeside Drive 4353 Interstate Way

Item Description

Estimated 
Annual 

Quantity

San Antonio,                           
TX  78217

San Antonio,                           
TX  78219

Annual Contract for Copier Paper and Card Stock

19 Card Stock - 8.5 x 11, Colors, 110 lb, 92 Brightness 100 $5.85 $9.31
Brand Springhill Staples
Brand P/N Not Specified 49703
Brightness N/A 92
Weight 110 110
# of Sheets per Pack 250 250
Price Total $585.00 $931.00

20 Card Stock - 11 x 17, White, 110 lb, 92 Brightness 100 $11.70 $29.09
Brand Springhill Springhill
Brand P/N 015334 015334
Brightness 92 92
Weight 110 110
# of Sheets per Pack 250 250
Price Total $1,170.00 $2,909.00

21 Card Stock - 11 x 17, Colors, 110 lb, 92 Brightness 100 $12.29 No Bid
Brand Springhill
Brand P/N Blue (025320)

Canary (035320)
Green (045320)

Ivory (056320)
Brightness N/A
Weight 110
# of Sheets per Pack 250
Price Total $1,229.00

22 Card Stock - 12 x 18, White, 110 lb, 92 Brightness 100 $13.94 $51.09
Brand Exact Mowhawk
Brand P/N 40407 12-229
Brightness 94 98
Weight 110 110
# of Sheets per Pack 250 250
Price Total $1,394.00 $5,109.00

23 Card Stock - 12 x 18, Colors, 110 lb, 92 Brightness 100 $24.75 No Bid
Brand Exact
Brand P/N Blue(49525)

Canary (49545)
Green (49565)

Ivory (49585)
Brightness N/A
Weight 110
# of Sheets per Pack 250
Price Total $2,475.00

24 Card Stock - 13 x 19, White, 110 lb, 92 Brightness 100 $22.21 $53.97 / $13.49
Brand Springhill Lindenmeyr Munroe
Brand P/N Not Specified 015315
Brightness 92 TBD
Weight 110 TBD
# of Sheets per Pack 250 1000/Case
Price Total $2,221.00 $1,349.00
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Opened: March 6, 2015

For:

Clampitt Paper Company
Staples Contract & 
Commercial, Inc., operating 
as Staples Advantage

6100005595 VF 3550 Ridgeside Drive 4353 Interstate Way

Item Description

Estimated 
Annual 

Quantity

San Antonio,                           
TX  78217

San Antonio,                           
TX  78219

Annual Contract for Copier Paper and Card Stock

25 Card Stock - 13 x 19, Colors, 110 lb, 92 Brightness 100 $24.75 No Bid
Brand Exact
Brand P/N Blue(49525)

Canary (49545)
Green (49565)

Ivory (49585)
Brightness N/A
Weight 110
# of Sheets per Pack 250
Price Total $2,475.00

Payment Terms 1% Net 30 Net 30

Estimated Annual Total
Estimated Annual Award
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