City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tahulation

Opened: November 7, 2014
For Ready-Mix Concrete
Vulcan Construction
Materials, LP
6100005178 Bs P.O. 791550
ltem Description Estimated  |San Antonio,
Quantity  |[TX 78279
Section |Delivered Concrete with 5 Cubic Yards
Minimum
1 Basic Class A (3000 PSI) Mixes
a 3/8" Rock 4,000
Price per cubic yard $95.00
b 3/4" Rock 500
Price per cubic yard $95.00
2 Curly Mix Standzrd
a 3/8" Ruck 800
Price per cubic yard $57.00
3 Curb Mix Specialty
a 3/4" Rock 100
Price per cubic yard $97.00
b 7/8" Rock 100
Frice per cubic yard No Bid
4 Class A Specialty Mixes
a 5/8" Rock 200
Price per cubic yard No Bid
b 1 1/8" Rock 750
. |Price per cubic yard $95.00
c 1 1/4" Rock 750
Price per cubic yard $95.00
5 Exposed Pebble Finish Mixes
a 3/8" Rack 25
Price per cubic yard $125.00
b 5/8" Rock 25
Price per cubic yard $125.00
6 Basic Class B {2500 PSI) Mix
a 7/8" Rock 1,200
Price per cubic yard No Bid
7 Class B Specialty Mix
a 518" Peat Gravel Rock 200
Price per cubie yard $100.00
8 Additives
a 1% Calcium Chiloride 300
Price per cubic yard $4.00
b 2% Calciurmn Chloride 400
Price per cubic yard $8.00
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Qpened: November 7, 2014
For: Reacly-Mix Concrete
Vulcan Consiruction
"|Materials, LP
6100005178 DS P.0. 791550
tem Description Estimated |San Antonio,
: Quantity | TX 78279
Section I |Delivered Concrete - Quanfities less
than 4 Cubic Yards ’
9 Basic Class A (3000 PSI) Mixes
a 3/8" Rock 100
Price per cubic yard §149.00
b 3/4" Rock 50
Price per cubic yard $148.00
0 Cur Mix Standard
a 3/8" Rock 100
Price per cubic yard $151.00
kY Curb Mix Specialty
a 3{4" Rock 206 .
Price per cubic yard $151.00
b 718" Rock 20
Price per cubic yard No Bid
12 Class A Specialty Mixes
a 5/8" Rock 100
Price per cubic yard No Bid
Total Price
b 1 1/8" Rock 100
Price per cubic yard $150.00
4 1 1/4" Rock 100
Price per cubic yard No Bid
13 Exposed Finish Mixes
a 3/8" Rock 200 .
Price per cubic yard $165.00
b 5/8" Rock 100
Price per cubic yard $165.00
14 Basic Class B (2500 PS1) Mix
a 7i8" Rock 25
Price per cubic yard No Bid
15 Class B Specialiy Mix
a 5/8" Peat Gravel Rock 25
Price per cubic yard $160.00
16 Additives
a 1% Calcium Chloride 150
Price per cubic yard $4.00
b 2% Calcium Chloride 50
Price per cubic yard $3.00




City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 7, 2014
For: Ready-Mix Concrete
Vulcan Construction
Materials, LP
6100005178 DS P.0. 791550
fem Description Estimated |San Anfonio,
Quantity _ {TX 78279
Section lll [Concrete for Pick Lip by City Vehicles
17 Basic Class A (3000 PSI) Mixes
a 3/8" Rock 6,500
Price per cubic yard $74.00
b 34" Rock G600
Price per cubic yard - $74.00
18 Curh Mix Standard
a 36" Rock ’ 250
Prce per cubic yard $74.00
19 Curk Mix Specialty :
a 3/4" Rock 250
Price per cubic yard $74.00
b 718" Rock 250 -
Price per cubic yard Mo Bid
20 Class A Specialty Mixes
a 5/8" Rock 300
Price per cubic yard No Bid
b 1 1/8" Rock 760
. Price per cubic yard $74.00
c 1 1/4" Rock 300
Price per cubic yard No Bid
21 Exposed Finish Mixes
a 3/8" Rock 25
Prica per cubic yard $90.00
b 5/8" Rock 15
Price per cubic yard $90.00
22 |Basic Class B {2500 PSI} Mix
a. 7/8" Rock 600
Price per cubic yard No Bid
23 Class B Specialty Mix
a. 5/8" Peat Gravel Rock 300
Price per cubic yard $90.00
24 Additives
a 1% Calcium Chloride 250
Price per cubic yard $4.00
b 2% Calcium Chloride 500
Price per cubic vard $8.00
Delivery 2 days
Payment Terms Net 30




