City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 15, 2014
For: Copier and Printer Paper Clampitt Paper Western BRW Paper
3550 Ridgeside Drive 6301 E. Stassney Lane,
6100004904 CE Bldg. 9, Suite 200
Estimated
Item Annual [San Antonio, Austin,
Quantities |TX 78217 TX 78744
1 #1 Grade Color Copy Smooth 96 Brightness, White
la 8 1/2" x 11 Sub 28/70# text weight 250,000 ea $11.64 $15.64
1b 11" x 17" Sub 28/70# text weight 125,000 ea $24.40 $32.53
1c 12" x 18" Sub 28/70# text weight 85,000 ea $28.19 $37.56
1d 13" x 19" Sub 28/70# text weight 85,000 ea $39.97 $42.96
2 White Woven Poly Window/No Window Envelopes
2a #10 (4 1/8" x 9 1/2") Sub 24 with window, 500 per box 150 boxes $18.25 $9.10
2b #9 (3 3/4" x 8 3/4") Sub 24 with window, 500 per box 25 boxes $19.98 $9.45
2c #10 (4 1/8" x 9 1/2") Sub 24 with no window, 500 per box 150 boxes $16.25 $7.91
2d #9 (3 3/4" x 8 3/4") Sub 24 with no window, 500 per box 25 boxes $17.34 $7.91
2e Flat (9" x 12") Sub 24 with window, 500 per box 25 boxes $106.50 $49.70
2f Flat (9" x 12") Sub 24 with no window, 500 per box 25 boxes $52.32 $27.67
3 Color Copy "Bright Hue", Assorted Colors, Text
Weight
3a 8 1/2" x 11" Sub 24/60# text weight 20,000 ea $16.55 $12.60
3b 11" x 17" Sub 24/60# text weight 20,000 ea $33.10 $26.26
4 Color Copy "Bright Hue", Assorted Colors, Cover
Weight
4a 8 1/2" x 11" 65# cover weight 50,000 ea $32.73 $25.46
4b 11" x 17" 65# cover weight 125,000 ea $65.46 $53.03
4c 12" x 18" 65# cover weight 25,000 ea No Bid No Bid
4d 13" x 19" 65# cover weiaht 25.000 ea No Bid No Bid
5 Economy Color Copy, White, 80# text
5a 11" x 17" Sub 80# text weight 25,000 ea $26.66 $22.09
5b 12" x 18" Sub 80# text weight 25,000 ea $30.47 $25.65
6 Economy Color Copy Gloss, White, 100# text
6a 11" x 17" Sub 100# text weight 50,000 ea $33.01 $27.79
6b 12" x 18" Sub 100# text weight 25,000 ea $38.09 $32.07
7 Economy Color Copy Gloss, White, 80# cover
7a 11" x 17" Sub 80# cover weight 75,000 ea $51.32 $43.31
7b 12" x 18" Sub 80# cover weight 50,000 ea $58.81 $49.28
7c 13" x 19" Sub 80# cover weight 25,000 ea $67.72 $56.75
8 Economy Color Copy Gloss, White, 100# cover
8a 11" x 17" Sub 100# cover weight 75,000 ea $67.36 $53.76
8b 12" x 18" Sub 100# cover weight 50,000 ea $73.95 $61.98
8c 13" x 19" Sub 100# cover weight 25,000 ea $84.65 $68.77
9 Color Copy Paper, Assorted Colors, Sub 20# text
9a 8 1/2" x 11" Sub 20# text weight 25,000 ea $9.88 $7.71
9b 11" x 17" Sub 20# text weight 12,500 ea $20.82 $16.33
10 Digital Carbonless Paper for High Speed Digital
Printers, 2 Part NCR
10a 8 1/2" x 11" reversed sequence, 20# 50,000 ea $15.73 $13.12
10b 8 1/2" x 14" reversed sequence, 20# 25,000 ea $20.01 $16.68
10c 9" x 11" vertical perforation, reversed sequence, 20# 10,000 ea $29.30 $13.82
1od 8 1/2" x 11 1/2" horizontal perforation, reversed sequence, | 10,000 ea $28.74 $13.82
20#
11 Digital Carbonless Paper for High Speed Digital
Printers, 3 Part NCR
1lla 8 1/2" x 11" reversed sequence, 20# 50,000 ea $17.70 $14.77
11b 8 1/2" x 14" reveresed sequence, 20# 50,000 ea $22.53 $18.79
11c 9" x 11" vertical perforation, reversed sequence, 20# 10,000 ea $32.87 $15.53
11d 8 1/2" x 11 1/2" horizontal perforation, reversed sequence, | 10,000 ea $32.25 $15.53
20#
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12 Digital Carbonless Paper for High Speed Digital
Priners, 4 Part NCR
12a |8 1/2" x 11" reversed sequence, 20# 10,000 ea $18.62 $15.77
12b 8 1/2" x 14" reversed sequence, 20# 50,000 ea $23.68 $20.09
12c 9" x 11" vertical perforation, reversed sequence, 20# 10,000 ea $35.19 $16.62
12d 8 1/2" x 11 1/2" horizontal perforation, reversed sequence, | 10,000 ea $34.52 $16.62
20#
Prompt Payment Discount 1% 10 Days Net 30




