
City of San Antonio

Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 30, 2014

For: Annual Contract for Medical Supplies Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local

Midwest Medical Supply 

Co., Inc.

Bound Tree Medical, LLC Moore Medical, LLC.

SC 13400 Lakefront Drive 5000 Tuttle Crossing Blvd. 1690 New Britain Ave.

Item Description

Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity

Earth City,                                                       

MO 63045                                    

386-252-9960

Dublin,                                               

OH 43016

Farmington,                                               

CT 06034

NAS NAS

A Specified Items

1 Adult Disposable Resuscitator with Mask, 02 Supply Tubing 

and Tube Reservoir, and Medical Delivery Port., AMBU® 

SPUR® II ; 6/BX #521 611 000; NO SUBSTITUTION

630

Mfg. Name Ambu Ambu Ambu

Product # AMB 521-611-000 521611000 81050

Qty. Per Case 6/EA 6/CS 12

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $10.42 $9.00 $9.99

Extended Total $6,564.60 $5,670.00 $6,293.70

2

Airway, Color Berman 40mm, Non-Sterile, Plastic, Single 

Use, Rusch Brand, Teleflex Medical; 50/BX  #121801

NO SUBSTITUTION 

101

Mfg. Name Teleflex Teleflex Medical Moore Medical

Product # TEL 121801 021001 82126

Qty. Per Case 50/BX 50/BX Each

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $0.1458 $0.14 $0.23

Total $14.73 $14.14 $23.23

3
Airway ColorBerman 50mm, Non- Sterile, Plastic, Single 

Use, Rusch Brand, Teleflex Medical #121850; 50/BX

NO SUBSTITUTION 

330

Mfg. Name Teleflex Teleflex Medical Moore Medical

Product # TEL 121850 76-121850EA 82127

Qty. Per Case 50/BX 50/BX Each

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $0.1458 $0.14 $0.23

Total $48.11 $46.20 $75.90

4 Airway, PVC Nasal, 14F, Single Use, Sterile, Bevel Tip, 

Rusch Brand, Teleflex Medical #123314; 10/BX

NO SUBSTITUTION 

250

Mfg. Name Teleflex Teleflex Medical Rusch

Product # TEL 123314 023314 60100

Qty. Per Case 10/BX 10/BX Each

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $2.15 $2.10 $2.10

Total $537.50 $525.00 $525.00

5 Airway, Soft PVC Nasal, 16FR, Single Use, Sterile, Bevel 

Tip, Rusch Brand,Teleflex Medical #123316; 10/BX; NO 

SUBSTITUTION 

242

Mfg. Name Teleflex Teleflex Medical Rusch

Product # TEL 123316 023316 60099

Qty. Per Case 10/BX 10/BX Each

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $2.15 $2.10 $2.10

Total $520.30 $508.20 $508.20

6

Airway, PVC Nasal, 18FR, Single Use, Sterile, Bevel Tip, 

Rusch Brand, Teleflex Medical #123318; 10/BX

NO SUBSTITUTION 

312

Mfg. Name Teleflex Teleflex Medical Rusch

Product # TEL 123318 023318 60098

Qty. Per Case 10/BX 10/BX Each

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $2.15 $2.10 $2.10

Total $670.80 $655.20 $655.20

7 Airway, PVC Nasal, 20FR, Single Use, Sterile, Bevel Tip, 

Rusch Brand Teleflex Medical #123320; 10/BX

NO SUBSTITUTION 

220

Mfg. Name Teleflex Teleflex Medical Rusch

Product # TEL 123320 023320 60097

Qty. Per Case 10/BX 10/BX Each

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $2.15 $2.04 $2.10

Total $473.00 $448.80 $462.00

8 Airway, PVC Nasal, 24FR, Single Use, Sterile, Bevel Tip, 

Rusch Brand,Teleflex Medical #123324; 10/BX;                     

NO SUBSTITUTION 

120

Mfg. Name Teleflex Teleflex Medical Rusch

Product # TEL 123324 023324 60095

Qty. Per Case 10/BX 10/BX10/BX Each

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $2.15 $2.04 $2.10

Total $258.00 $244.80 $252.00

9 Albuterol Sulfate Solution for Inhalation, 0.083%, 3ML  

Nephron Pharm NCD/Item #00487-950125, or approved 

equal. ; 25/bx

7,725

Mfg. Name Nephron Nephron Pharm Nephron Pharm

Product # 00487-950125 9501-25 88283

Qty. Per Case 25/BX 25/BX sold in lots of 25 EA 24 EA

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $0.155 $0.13 $3.50

Total $1,197.38 $1,004.25 $27,037.50

10 Alcohol, Isopropyl 70%, 16 oz per bottle, Hydrox Lab # 

D0022, or approved equal.
2,354

Mfg. Name Hydrox QMed Corporation Aaron Ind.

Product # HYD00022 201001 81768

Qty. Per Case 12/EA 12/CS 12

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $1.15 $1.52 $1.20
Total $2,707.10 $3,578.08 $2,824.80

6100004347
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11 Aspirin, Adult, Chewable, 81 mg, Each  Bottle, or approved 

equal.
826

Mfg. Name New World Imports Geri-Care Gen Care

Product # NWICC A36 911316 64957

Qty. Per Case 36/BT;24BT/CS 36/BT BH-36

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $0.58 $0.67 $0.68

Total $479.08 $553.42 $561.68

12 Baby Bunting, Sterilized Metalized Polyester Film, Single 

use wrap, Duromed #650-4006-0600 or approved equal 
98

Mfg. Name Primacare Briggs Healthcare Gam Ind.

Product # PCMCS-6835 444006 43842

Qty. Per Case 12/BX; 10BX/CS 24/CS Each

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $2.37 $3.08 $3.70

Total $232.26 $301.84 $362.60

13 Bag Vomit Emesis Sickness Graduations, Medline 

Industries, #NON7066, or approved equal; 25/PK
14,510

Mfg. Name Medline Medline Industries Tri-State

Product # MED NON70600 1071-32801 93364

Qty. Per Case 100/BX; 586/CS 24/PK sold in lots of 24EA Pkg-24

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $0.40 $0.815 *$1.0829

Total $5,804.00 $11,825.65 $15,712.88

14 Bandage, Triangular, 37” x 37” x 52”, Woven Cotton Muslim 

Gauze, Dukal Corp. # TB37; or approved equal
2,916

Mfg. Name Medsource Dukal First Aid Only

Product # MSOMS-11050 276-TB37 15262

Qty. Per Case 12/BX; 2036/CS 

240/CS sold in lots of 

240EA 24

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $0.19 $0.3083 *$0.79125

Total $554.04 $899.00 $2,307.29

15 Blades, Disposable Laryngoscope, Miller 0 Greenline, 

SunMed #5-5333-00; 20/CA; NO SUBSTITUTION 
100

Mfg. Name Sun Med Sun Med Sun Med

Product # SUN5-5333-00 025330 80667

Qty. Per Case 20/CS 20/BX Each

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $3.45 $3.41 $4.91

Total $345.00 $341.00 $491.00

16 Blades, Disposable Laryngoscope, Miller 1 Greenline, 

SunMed #5-5333-01; 20/CA; NO SUBSTITUTION 
100

Mfg. Name Sun Med Sun Med Sun Med

Product # SUN5-5333-01 025331 80666

Qty. Per Case 20/CS 20/BX Each

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $3.45 $3.41 $4.91

Total $345.00 $341.00 $491.00

17 Blades, Disposable Laryngoscope, Miller 2 Greenline, 

SunMed #5-5333-02; 20/CA; NO SUBSTITUTION
300

Mfg. Name Sun Med Sun Med Sun Med

Product # SUN5-5333-02 025332 80665

Qty. Per Case 20/BX 20/BX Each

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $3.45 $3.41 $4.91

Total $1,035.00 $1,023.00 $1,473.00

18 Blades, Disposable Laryngoscope, Miller 3 Greenline, 

SunMed #5-5333-03; 20/CA; NO SUBSTITUTION
300

Mfg. Name Sun Med Sun Med Sun Med

Product # SUN5-5333-03 025333 80664

Qty. Per Case 20/CS 20/BX Each

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $3.45 $3.41 $4.91

Total $1,035.00 $1,023.00 $1,473.00

19 Blades, Disposable Laryngoscope, Mac 2, Greenline, 

SunMed #5-5332-02; 20/CA; NO SUBSTITUTION
300

Mfg. Name Sun Med Sun Med Sun Med

Product # SUN5-5332-02 025302 80670

Qty. Per Case 20/CS 20/BX Each

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $3.45 $3.41 $4.91

Total $1,035.00 $1,023.00 $1,473.00

20 Blades, Disposable Laryngoscope, Mac 3, Greenline, 

SunMed #5-5332-03; 20/CA; NO SUBSTITUTION
300

Mfg. Name Sun Med Sun Med Sun Med

Product # SUN5-5332-03 025303 80669

Qty. Per Case 20/CS 20/BX Each

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $3.45 $3.41 $4.91
Total $1,035.00 $1,023.00 $1,473.00
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21 Blades, Disposable Laryngoscope, Mac 4, Greenline, 

SunMed #5-5332-04; 20/CA; NO SUBSTITUTION
600

Mfg. Name Sun Med Sun Med Sun Med

Product # SUN5-5332-04 025304 80668

Qty. Per Case 20/CS 20/BX Each

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $3.45 $3.41 $4.91

Total $2,070.00 $2,046.00 $2,946.00

22 Blanket, Light Weight, Fleece, Orange, 50" x 80", Taylor 

Healthcare # 60-OFB5080. (With the logo “City of San 

Antonio Fire”); NO SUBSTITUTION

900

Mfg. Name Taylor Taylor Healthcare NO BID

Product # TAY60-OFB5084-SAFD 60-OFB5080

Qty. Per Case 10/CS 10/CS

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $5.91 $5.75

Total $5,319.00 $5,175.00

23 Blanket Visi, Poly Yellow, 50" x 84", Graham Medical 

#53382 25/CA; NO SUBSTITUTION
600

Mfg. Name Graham Graham Medical NO BID

Product # GRA53382 351-53382

Qty. Per Case 25/CS 25/CS

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $63.75 $70.00

Total $38,250.00 $42,000.00

24 Canister, Quick Replacement, Single Use, S-Scor Inc.                     

# 2480; 20/CA; NO SUBSTITUTION
550

Mfg. Name Sscor Sscor, Inc. NO BID

Product # SEES52480.20 590522

Qty. Per Case 20/CS 20/CS

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $15.00 $12.45

Total $8,250.00 $6,847.50

25 Cannula, Nasal Adult, Conventional, Straight, VentLab 

Corp., #1007; EACH; 50/CA; NO SUBSTITUTION
6,000

Mfg. Name Ventlab Ventlab Hudson RCI

Product # VEN1007 14645 50792

Qty. Per Case 50/CS 50/CS 50

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $0.233 $0.23 *$0.0266

Total $1,398.00 $1,380.00 $159.60

26 Collar Adjustable, Ace Perfit, Mini, AMBU Inc. #000-281-106 

3; 30/BX; NO SUBSTITUTION

500

Mfg. Name Ambu Ambu Ambu

Product # AMB000-281-106 260280 65666

Qty. Per Case 30/CS 30/CS 30

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $5.06 $4.55 $5.50

Total $2,530.00 $2,275.00 $2,750.00

27 Collar Adjustable, Ace Perfit, Adult, AMBU Inc. #000-281-

000; 30/BX; NO SUBSTITUTION
7,200

Mfg. Name Ambu Ambu Ambu

Product # AMB000-281-000 260281 59897

Qty. Per Case 30/CS 30/CS 30

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $5.06 $4.55 $5.50

Total $36,432.00 $32,760.00 $39,600.00

28 Container, Disposable Sharps Autodrop Collector, Red, 1 

Quart Size, Kendall Healthcare #8900SA; 100/BX; NO 

SUBSTITUTION

700

Mfg. Name Kendall Kendall Covidien

Product # KEN8900SA 298900 47446

Qty. Per Case 100/CS 20/CS 100

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $1.59 $1.57 $1.60

Total $1,113.00 $1,099.00 $1,120.00

29 Container, Disposable Sharps Collector, Red, Mailbox style 

lid, 5 Quart Size, Kendall Healthcare #85131; NO 

SUBSTITUTION

600

Mfg. Name Kendall Kendall Covidien

Product # KEN85131 5810-8513 89994

Qty. Per Case 20/CS 20/CS Each

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $3.76 $3.70 $3.50

Total $2,256.00 $2,220.00 $2,100.00

30 Dressing Multi-Trauma, Sterile, 12” x 30”, Dynarex #3532 or 

approved equal
1,200

Mfg. Name Medsource Medstorm Moore Medical

Product # MSOMS-6ZM001 16353 13873

Qty. Per Case 25/CS 50/CS Each

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $0.82 $0.85 $1.12
Total $984.00 $1,020.00 $1,344.00
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31 Dressing Veni Gard Adult IV Stabilization, ConMed Corp 

#705-4431; 5BX/CA; NO SUBSTITUTION
500

Mfg. Name Conmed Conmed ConMed

Product # CON705-4431 354431 40685

Qty. Per Case 100/BX; 5BX/CS 500/CS 100/BX

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $34.74 $34.43 $44.50

Total $17,370.00 $17,215.00 $22,250.00

32 Extension Set 8" Standard Bore T-Port B Braun #473443 

Ref 473443; 100EA/BX; NO SUBSTITUTION
40,000

Mfg. Name B. Braun B. Braun Medical B. Braun

Product # BBM473443 355402 73433

Qty. Per Case 100/CS 100/CS Each

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $2.39 $2.35 $2.80

Total $95,600.00 $94,000.00 $112,000.00

33 Gauze, impregnated with white petrolatum, sterile, non-

adherent, 3” x 18”, per box, Kendall #8884414600 or 

approved equal

36

Mfg. Name Derma Science Kendall Covidien

Product # DMADKC20059 1500061k1 08618

Qty. Per Case 12/BX; 6BX/CS 72/CS BX/12

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $8.33 $8.52 $8.69

Total $299.88 $306.72 $312.84

34 Glove Exam Diamond Grip, Microflex #MF-300-S; 10BX/CS

NO SUBSTITUTION 
300

Mfg. Name Microflex Microflex Microflex

Product # MICMF-300-S 290300 48813

Qty. Per Case 100/BX; 10/CS 1000/CS 10/BX

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $8.55 $10.00 $9.50

Total $2,565.00 $3,000.00 $2,850.00

35 Glove Exam Diamond Grip, Microflex #MF-300-M; 

10BX/CS; NO SUBSTITUTION
800

Mfg. Name Microflex Microflex Microflex

Product # MICMF-300-M 290301 48814

Qty. Per Case 100BX; 10/CS 1000/CS 10/BX

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $8.55 $10.00 $9.50

Total $6,840.00 $8,000.00 $7,600.00

36 Glove Exam Diamond Grip, Microflex #MF-300-L; 10BX/CS; 

NO SUBSTITUTION
3,500

Mfg. Name Microflex Microflex Microflex

Product # MICMF 300-L 290302 48815

Qty. Per Case 100/BX; 10/CS 1000/CS 10/BX

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $8.55 $10.00 $9.50

Total $29,925.00 $35,000.00 $33,250.00

37 Glove Exam Diamond Grip, Microflex #MF-300-

XL;10BX/CS; NO SUBSTITUTION
1,700

Mfg. Name Microflex Microflex Microflex

Product # MICMF-300-XL 290303 48816

Qty. Per Case 100BX; 10/CS 1000/CS 10/BX

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $8.55 $10.00 $9.50

Total $14,535.00 $17,000.00 $16,150.00

38 Glove Exam NitriDerm EP (extra protection) Orange, Nitrile 

Synthetic, Healthcare Corp. #189100 Small; NO 

SUBSTITUTION

500

Mfg. Name Innovative Healthcare Innovative Healthcare Innovative

Product # INN189100 1015-18901 96415

Qty. Per Case 100/BX; 10/CS 10/BX

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $10.20 $11.50 $12.00

Total $5,100.00 $5,750.00 $6,000.00

39 Glove Exam NitriDerm EP (extra protection) Orange, Nitrile 

Synthetic, Healthcare Corp. #189200 Medium; NO 

SUBSTITUTION

1,600

Mfg. Name Innovative Healthcare Innovative Healthcare Innovative

Product # INN189200 1015-18902 96416

Qty. Per Case 100/BX; 10/CS 1000/CS 10/BX

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $10.20 $11.50 $12.00

Total $16,320.00 $18,400.00 $19,200.00

40 Glove Exam NitriDerm EP (extra protection) Orange, Nitrile 

Synthetic, Healthcare Corp. #189300 Large; NO 

SUBSTITUTION

11,000

Mfg. Name Innovative Healthcare Innovative Healthcare Innovative

Product # INN189300 1015-18903 96417

Qty. Per Case 100/BX; 10/CS 1000/CS 10/BX

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $10.20 $11.50 $12.00
Total $112,200.00 $126,500.00 $132,000.00
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41 Glove Exam NitriDerm EP (extra protection) Orange, Nitrile 

Synthetic, Healthcare Corp. #189350 X-Large; NO 

SUBSTITUTION

3,000

Mfg. Name Innovative Healthcare Innovative Healthcare Innovative

Product # INN189350 1015-18904 96418

Qty. Per Case 100/CS; 10/CS 1000/CS 10/BX

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $10.20 $11.50 $12.00

Total $30,600.00 $34,500.00 $36,000.00

42 Glucagon Emergency Kit, 1MG 1 ML KT, Eli Lilly #00002-

803101; NO SUBSTITUTION
320

Mfg. Name Eli Lilly Cardincal Health Rx Bedford Lab

Product # 00002-803101 000002145001 71375

Qty. Per Case EA 1/EA Each

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $208.18 $186.99 $133.00

Total $66,617.60 $59,836.80 $42,560.00

43 Hand Sanitizer, 4 Fl oz, No Rinse, Safetec, #SAF17350 or 

approved equal; 25EA/BX; or approved equal
5,000

Mfg. Name New World Safetec Safetec

Product # NWIHS4 R3119 55123

Qty. Per Case 60/CS 24/CS Each

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $0.53 $1.00 $0.93

Total $2,650.00 $5,000.00 $4,650.00

44 Holder, Endotracheal Thomas Tube, Pediatric Size, Laerdal 

#600-20000; 25EA/pk; NO SUBSTITUTION
100

Mfg. Name Laerdal Laerdal Laerdal

Product # LAE600-20000 020400 54288

Qty. Per Case 25/EA; 4/CS 100/CS BX/24

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $63.41 $61.75 *$64.56

Total $6,341.00 $6,175.00 $6,456.00

45 Holder, Endotracheal Thomas Tube, Adult Size, Laerdal 

#600-10000; 25EA/pk; NO SUBSTITUTION
1,000

Mfg. Name Laerdal Laerdal Laerdal

Product # LAE600-10000 020500 54246

Qty. Per Case 25/PK; 4/CS 100/CS BOX/24

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $63.41 $61.75 *$64.56

Total $63,410.00 $61,750.00 $64,560.00

46 Sodium Chloride, Irrigant, 900 mg/1000mL; NDC 0338-

0048-04, or approved equal
200

Mfg. Name Baxter Baxter NO BID

Product # BAX2F7124 607124

Qty. Per Case 12/CS 12/CS

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $1.92 $1.67

Total $384.00 $334.00

47 Injection, Sodium Chloride, 0.9%, 500ML, in ViaFlex 

container, Baxter #2B1323Q; NO SUBSTITUTION
1,000

Mfg. Name Baxter Baxter Baxter

Product # BAX2B1323Q 601323 37072

Qty. Per Case 24/CS 24/CS 24/Case

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $34.80 $30.00 *$30.00

Total $34,800.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00

48 Injection, Sodium Chloride, 0.9%, 100ML, in ViaFlex 

container, Baxter #2B1307; NO SUBSTITUTION
10

Mfg. Name Baxter Baxter Baxter

Product # BAX2B1307 358437 86724

Qty. Per Case 96/CS 96/CS 96/Case

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $1.40 $1.17 $1.25

Total $14.00 $11.70 $12.50

49 Jelly, Sterile Lubricating, 2.7g Packets,144 packets per box, 

Dynarex, #DYN1250, or approved equal.
4,000

Mfg. Name Dynarex Nice-Pak Dynarex

Product # DYN1250 440128 15/25

Qty. Per Case 144/BX; 12BX/CS 1728/CS BX/144

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $5.66 $8.64 $5.40

Total $22,640.00 $34,560.00 $21,600.00

50 Lancet Surgilance Safety Grey, Medipurpose Inc, #SLN200; 

15BX/CS; NO SUBSTITUTION
1,200

Mfg. Name Medipurpose Medi Purpose Medipurpose

Product # SURSLN200 782-SLN200BX 68661

Qty. Per Case 100/BX; 15BX/CA 1500/CS BX/100

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $10.65 $14.50 $14.50
Total $12,780.00 $17,400.00 $17,400.00
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51 Lice Bedding Spray, 5 oz Perrigo Co., #49348-023787 or 

approved equal.
50

Mfg. Name Perrigo Cardinal OTC Bayer

Product # 49348.023787 0004-21 10938

Qty. Per Case EA 1/EA Each

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $5.02 $6.35 $4.99

Total $251.00 $317.50 $249.50

52 Lice Killing Shampoo, 4 oz Perrigo Co., #49348-044334, or 

approved equal. 
101

Mfg. Name Perrigo Cardinal Health Rx BSH

Product # 49348-044334 0931-90-60 ML 91116

Qty. Per Case EA 101/EA Each

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $6.43 $103.20 $2.79

Total $649.43 $10,423.20 $281.79

53 Nebulizer, Micro-Mist Nebulizer w/Tee, Tubing Mouthpiece 

and Reservior Teleflex Hudson RCI Ref 1883; 50EA/BX; or 

approved equal.

3,400

Mfg. Name Ventlab Teleflex Medical Hudson

Product # VEN5000 411883 63464

Qty. Per Case 50/CS 50/CS 50/Case

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $0.61 $0.77 *$0.9198

Total $2,074.00 $2,618.00 $3,127.32

54 Needle, 18G x 1 ½ inches, Sterican B Braun #4665120; 

100EA/BX; NO SUBSTITUTION
1,000

Mfg. Name B. Braun B. Braun NO BID

Product # BBM4665120-02 1641-12018

Qty. Per Case

100/BX; 10/CS

1000/CS                                     

solid in lots of 100EA or 1BX

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $0.0219 $0.0232

Total $21.90 $23.20

55 Needle, 21GA x 1 ½ inches, Eclipse Becton Dickinson 

#305765 B/D305765; 100EA/BX; NO SUBSTITUTION
7,000

Mfg. Name BD Becton Dickinson BD

Product # B/D 305765 1641-76521 74870

Qty. Per Case
100/BX; 12/CS

1000/CS                                         

sold in lots of 100EA or 1BX
BX/100

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $0.206 $0.2352 *$0.195

Total $1,442.00 $1,646.40 $1,365.00

56 Nitrostat, .4 mg tablets, 100 tablets per bottle, Pfizer 

#041824 EA (Bottle); NO SUBSTITUTION
220

Mfg. Name Pfizer Cardinal Health Rx Pfizer

Product # 00071-041824 0418-24 64757

Qty. Per Case 100/BTL 100/BT BTL/100

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $24.20 $21.80 $22.05

Total $5,324.00 $4,796.00 $4,851.00

57 Non-Rebreathing Mask, Adult Elongated w/o safety vent, 

Hudson RCITeleflex Medical #1060;50EA/BX or approved 

equal. 

12,000

Mfg. Name Ventlab Ventlab Hudson

Product # VEN2102 87-2102 50799

Qty. Per Case 50/CS 50/CS                                                           

sold in lots of 50EA
BX/50

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $0.61 $0.67 $1.05

Total $7,320.00 $8,040.00 $12,600.00

58 OXYGEN PREFILLED HUMIDIFIER; Prefilled Humidifier 

500ml filled with  bacteriostatic water. Comes with humidifier 

adapter; Part#002620 or approved equal.

520

Mfg. Name Allegiance Carefusion 303 NO BID

Product # ALG002620 022520

Qty. Per Case 12/CS 12/CS

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $2.11 $1.89

Total $1,097.20 $982.80

59 Nose Clip, (white thermoplastic), Grooved A-M Systems 

PACK (Each) #166000 or approved equal. 
300

Mfg. Name AM-System Allied Healthcare SDI Diagnostics

Product # AMS166000 1410-64019 62057

Qty. Per Case 100/CS 100/CS Case/25

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $0.386 $0.24 *$0.64

Total $115.80 $72.00 $192.00

60 Obstetrical Kit, Dynarex, #4902; 10/BX or approved equal. 200

Mfg. Name Motion Medical Dynarex Russe

Product # MMD1723 F1652BAG 68221

Qty. Per Case 10/CS 10/CS Each

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $3.75 $5.63 $5.79
Total $750.00 $1,126.00 $1,158.00
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61 Pack, Instant Cold Compress, up to 25 degrees F, 6” x 9”, 

Basic Medical Industries, #ICE1069 or approved equal.
11,000

Mfg. Name Dynarex Briggs Healthcare Swift First Aid

Product # DYN4512 1431-11210 92931

Qty. Per Case 24/CS 24/CS Each

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $0.36 $0.32 $0.95

Total $3,960.00 $3,520.00 $10,450.00

62 Pack, Instant Heat (Hot), up to 140 degrees F, Epsom 

formula, 4” x 8”, Morrison Medical, #6610 or approved 
1,400

Mfg. Name Dynarex Medstorm Nortech Lab

Product # DYN4516 11406 80550

Qty. Per Case 24/CS 24/CS Each

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $0.52 $0.25 $0.51

Total $728.00 $350.00 $714.00

63 Pad Prep Alcohol Large 1.25” x 1.75”, 100ea/bx; Dynarex, 

#DYN1106 or approved equal.
1,736

Mfg. Name Dukal Dynarex Covidien

Product # DUK861 F1654 93055

Qty. Per Case 100/BX; 10/CS 1000/CS BX/200

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $1.56 $1.97 $2.39

Total $2,708.16 $3,419.92 $4,149.04

64 Pad Prep Povidine, Medium 1” x 1.25”, Dynarex, #DYN1108, 

or approved equal. 
1,100

Mfg. Name Dynarex Dynarex Dynarex

Product # DYN1108 609153 96650

Qty. Per Case 100/BX; 10/CS 1000/CS BX/100

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $0.0327 $0.0329 *$0.0325

Total $35.97 $36.19 $35.75

65 Penlight with Pupil Gauge 6/pk, Aaron Medical Ind Inc, 

#66RN; NO SUBSTITUTION
940

Mfg. Name Aaron Aaron Medical Moore Medical

Product # AAR66RN *D0012 81238

Qty. Per Case 6/PK 6/PK 6/PK

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $1.25 $1.583 $3.69

Total $1,175.00 $1,488.02 $3,468.60

66 Shears, (EMT) Medical, 7 ¼”, Red or Black or Orange 

Stainless Steel Blade, Easily cuts through Clothing, 

American Diagnostics, #320NO; NO SUBSTITUTIONS

400

Mfg. Name American Diag. American Diagnostic Corp. ADC

Product # AME320N0 400005 42407

Qty. Per Case EA 1EA Each

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $2.09 $1.79 $2.10

Total $836.00 $716.00 $840.00

67 Sheet Drape 3-Ply 40” x 48”, White Graham Medical 

Products, #302; NO SUBSTITUTIONS
400

Mfg. Name Graham Medical Graham Medical NO BID

Product # GRA302 GRA 302

Qty. Per Case 100/CS 100/CS

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $19.12 $24.38

Total $7,648.00 $9,752.00

68 Splint, Ankle/Foot, Air with Push/Pull Valves, Adult, 

Mayflower Splint Co., #703; NO SUBSTITUTIONS
400

Mfg. Name Mayflower Mayflower Splint Co. Allied Healthcare

Product # MSC703 660025 76266

Qty. Per Case EA 1EA Each

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $7.84 $8.10 $8.70

Total $3,136.00 $3,240.00 $3,480.00

69 Splint, Full Arm, Air with Push/Pull Valves, Adult Mayflower 

Splint Co., #702; NO SUBSTITUTIONS
140

Mfg. Name Mayflower Mayflower Splint Co. Allied Healthcare

Product # MSC702 660020 76263

Qty. Per Case EA 1EA Each

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $9.05 $9.35 $8.99

Total $1,267.00 $1,309.00 $1,258.60

70 Splint, Full Leg, Air with Push/Pull Valves, Adult Mayflower 

Splint Co., #705; NO SUBSTITUTIONS
300

Mfg. Name Mayflower Mayflower Splint Co. Allied Healthcare

Product # MSC705 N/A 76265

Qty. Per Case EA N/A Each

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $10.38 $10.72 $11.25
Total $3,114.00 $3,216.00 $3,375.00
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71 Splint, Half Arm, Air with Push/Pull Valves, Adult Mayflower 

Splint Co., #701; NO SUBSTITUTIONS
192

Mfg. Name Mayflower NOT PROVIDED Allied Healthcare

Product # MSC701 76262

Qty. Per Case EA Each

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $7.26 $8.00

Total $1,393.92 $1,536.00

72 Splint, Half Leg, Air with Push/Pull Valves, Adult Mayflower 

Splint Co., #704; NO SUBSTITUTIONS
300

Mfg. Name Mayflower NOT PROVIDED Allied Healthcare

Product # MSC704 76264

Qty. Per Case EA Each

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $9.05 $9.25

Total $2,715.00 $2,775.00

73 Splint, Hand and Wrist, Air with Push/Pull Valves, Adult 

Mayflower Splint Co., #700; NO SUBSTITUTIONS
300

Mfg. Name Mayflower NOT PROVIDED Allied Healthcare

Product # MSC700 76267

Qty. Per Case EA Each

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $6.28 $7.20

Total $1,884.00 $2,160.00

74 Splint, Economy, Wood, ½” Foam Padded Board, 15” 

length, Morrison Medical, #1815; NO SUBSTITUTIONS
300

Mfg. Name Morrison NOT PROVIDED Moore Medical

Product # MOR1815 79691

Qty. Per Case EA Each

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $2.10 $2.15

Total $630.00 $645.00

75 Splint, Economy, Wood, ½” Foam Padded Board, 36” 

length Morrison Medical, #1836; NO SUBSTITUTIONS
100

Mfg. Name Morrison NOT PROVIDED Moore Medical

Product # MOR1836 79692

Qty. Per Case EA Each

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $3.30 $3.50

Total $330.00 $350.00

76 Sponge, 4 X 4, 4 Ply, NonWoven, Dynarex #DYN3254, 

EACH or approved equal  
900

Mfg. Name Dynarex NOT PROVIDED Dukal

Product # DYN3254 73952

Qty. Per Case 200/BX; 10/CS 100/BX

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $0.010 *$0.0525

Total $9.00 $47.25

77 Syringe Flush, Saline, 10cc Prefill B Braun #513576 0.9 

Sodium Chloride Injection, USP or approved equal  
62,000

Mfg. Name Excelsior NOT PROVIDED B. Braun

Product # EMCE0100-01 69606

Qty. Per Case 100/BX; 6BX/CS 100/BX

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $0.36 *$0.4599

Total $22,320.00 $28,513.80

78 Syringe, Omnifix 10cc Luer-Lok B Braun #4617100V-02; 

NO SUBSTITUTIONS
1,350

Mfg. Name B. Braun NOT PROVIDED NO BID

Product # BBM4617100V-02

Qty. Per Case 100/BX; 12/CS

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $0.0786

Total $106.11

79 Syringe, Becton Dickinson 30cc Luer-Lok, latex free, 

#302832; NO SUBSTITUTIONS
700

Mfg. Name BD NOT PROVIDED BD

Product # BID302832 13974

Qty. Per Case 56SP; 4SP/CS BX/56

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $0.329 *$0.32125

Total $230.30 $224.88

80 Syringe, Omnifix, 5cc, Luer-Lok B Braun #4617053V-02; 

NO SUBSTITUTIONS
3,800

Mfg. Name B. Braun B. Braun NO BID

Product # BRM4617053V-02 1633-05305

Qty. Per Case 100/BX; 20/BX/CS 2000/CS

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $0.07 $0.07
Total $266.00 $266.00
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81 Syringe, Eclipse 3cc, 23 g x 1”, Luer-Lok with detachable 

needle, Becton Dickinson #305782; NO SUBSTITUTIONS
100

Mfg. Name BD Becton Dickinson BD

Product # BID305782 *305782 74874

Qty. Per Case
50SP; 6SP/CS

300/CS                                         

sold in lots of 300EA
BX/50

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $0.247 $0.2103 *$0.2598

Total $24.70 $21.03 $25.98

82 Syringe, Tuberculin, 1cc, 26 g x 3/8”, Luer-Lok, SafetyGlide, 

Becton Dickinson #305946; NO SUBSTITUTIONS
700

Mfg. Name BD Becton Dickinson BD

Product # BID305946 *305946 88516

Qty. Per Case 100/BX; 4/CS 400/CS                                     

sold in lots of 400EA
BX/100

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $0.373 $0.3559 *$0.3599

Total $261.10 $249.13 $251.93

83 Test Strips, Blood Glucose, Contour #7099C, Bayer  

24bx/cs; 50ea/bx ; NO SUBSTITUTIONS
3,000

Mfg. Name Bayer Bayer Healthcare Bayer

Product # BAY06707245 2763-09950 80658

Qty. Per Case 50/BX

1200/CS sold in lots of 

50EA 50/BX

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $0.2904 $0.3098 *$0.40

Total $871.20 $929.40 $1,200.00

84 Meters Bayer Blood Glucose Contour Free with Purchasing 

of Test Strips For Test Strips #7099C As needed; NO 

SUBSTITUTIONS

200

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $0.00 $0.01 $0.00

Total $0.00 $2.00 $0.00

85 Hi and Low Solution for Meters BayerBlood Glucose 

Contour 1858; NO SUBSTITUTION
300

Mfg. Name Bayer Bayer Healthcare Bayer

Product # 7109/7110/7111 121-1858 807018-80705

Qty. Per Case EA 1EA Each

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $4.26 $4.58 $4.33

Total $1,278.00 $1,374.00 $1,299.00

86 Saline 250 mL 0.9 Sodium Chloride Inj. #2B1322Q; NO 

SUBSTITUTIONS
20

Mfg. Name Baxter Baxter Baxter

Product # BAX2B1322Q 601322 48663

Qty. Per Case 36/CS 36/CS 36/Case

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $1.38 $1.24 $1.25

Total $27.60 $24.80 $25.00

87 Sodium Chloride, Injection, Solution; 9 g/1000mL; #NDC 

0338-0049-48; NO SUBSTITUTIONS
700

Mfg. Name Baxter Baxter NO BID

Product # BAX2B1324X 358437

Qty. Per Case 14/CS 96/CS

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $1.58 $1.17

Total $1,106.00 $819.00

88 Mask, Non-Rebreathing, Elongated Pediatric, w/Safety Vent, 

Hudson TeleflexRCI Ref: 1058;50EA/BX; NO 

SUBSTITUTIONS

1,500

Mfg. Name Teleflex Teleflex Medical Hudson

Product # TEL1058 D6141 50808

Qty. Per Case 50/CS 50/CS 50/Case

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $0.92 $1.33 $1.29

Total $1,380.00 $1,995.00 $1,935.00

89 Sheet Fitted Standard Taylor Healthcare Products Inc. Ref# 

92-SFS3084; NO SUBSTITUTIONS
1,100

Mfg. Name Taylor Taylor Healthcare NO BID

Product # TAYCO-SFS3084 14339

Qty. Per Case 50/CS 50/CS sold in lots of 50EA

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $0.996 $1.02

Total $1,095.60 $1,122.00

90 Resuscitator Pediatric Spur II Ambu Ref 531617000, 

6EA/BX; NO SUBSTITUTION
1,500

Mfg. Name Ambu Ambu Ambu

Product # AMB531-617-000 11723 81049

Qty. Per Case 6/CS 6/CS 12/Case

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $13.25 $23.19 $13.79
Total $19,875.00 $34,785.00 $20,685.00
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91 Solution Set with DUO-VENT Spike ClearLink/Interlink Syste 

NonDEHP 92”(2.3m), Luer Activated Valve Interlink 

Injection Site Male Luer Lock Adapter #EMS3110; NO 

SUBSTITUTION

400

Mfg. Name Baxter Baxter Baxter

Product # BAXEMS3110 118-EMS3110EA 81839

Qty. Per Case 48/CS 48/CS 48/Case

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $1.39 $1.50 $1.49

Total $556.00 $600.00 $596.00

92 Tubing Suction Non Conductive Latex Free Sterile 3/16”x6’ 

with Straw Connector Dynarex Reorder No. 4682; 50EA/BX; 

NO SUBSTITUTION

2,500

Mfg. Name Dynarex Medline Industries Covidien

Product # DYN4682 325021 65090

Qty. Per Case 50/CS 50/CS 50/Case

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $0.41 $0.46 $0.70

Total $1,025.00 $1,150.00 $1,750.00

93 I.V. Catheter BD  Autoguard 14 ga 1.75inx1.75in, 2.1x45mm 

Ref 381467 4BOX/CASE; NO SUBSTITUTION
50

Mfg. Name BD Becton Dickinson BD

Product # BID381467 355141 66412

Qty. Per Case 50/BX; 4/CS 200/CS BX/50

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $107.73 $104.50 $115.00

Total $5,386.50 $5,225.00 $5,750.00

94 I.V. Catheter BD Insyte Autoguard BC16 ga 1.16in 

1.7X30mm Ref 382554 Becton Dickinson; 4BOX/CASE; NO 

SUBSTITUTION

120

Mfg. Name BD Becton Dickinson BD

Product # BID382554 1612-55416 14575

Qty. Per Case 50/BX; 4/CS 200/CS BX/50

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $105.00 $104.50 $115.00

Total $12,600.00 $12,540.00 $13,800.00

95 I.V. Catheter BD Insyte Autoguard BC 18ga 1.16in 

1.3x30mm  Ref 382544 Becton Dickinson;4BOX/CASE; NO 

SUBSTITUTION

530

Mfg. Name BD Becton Dickinson BD

Product # BID382544 1612-54418 12984

Qty. Per Case 50/BX; 4/CS 200/CS BX/50

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $105.00 $102.50 $110.00

Total $55,650.00 $54,325.00 $58,300.00

96 I.V. Catheter BD Insyte Autoguard BC 20ga 1.16in 

1.3x30mm; Ref 382534 Becton Dickinson;4BOX/CASE; NO 

SUBSTITUTION

700

Mfg. Name BD Becton Dickinson BD

Product # BID382534 1612-53420 12979

Qty. Per Case 50/BX; 4/CS 200/CS BX/50

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $105.00 $102.50 $110.00

Total $73,500.00 $71,750.00 $77,000.00

97 I.V. Catheter BD Insyte Autoguard BC 22ga 0.9in 25mm ; 

Ref 382523 Becton Dickinson; 4BOX/CASE; NO 
120

Mfg. Name BD Becton Dickinson BD

Product # BID382523 1612-52322 12220

Qty. Per Case 50/BX; 4/CS 200/CS BX/50

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $105.00 $102.50 $110.00

Total $12,600.00 $12,300.00 $13,200.00

98 I.V. Catheter BD Insyte Autoguard BC 24ga  0.75IN 

0.7inx19mm; Ref 382512 Becton Dickinson; 4BOX/CASE; 

NO SUBSTITUTION

70

Mfg. Name B/D Becton Dickinson BD

Product # B/D382512 1612-52224 14571

Qty. Per Case 50/BX; 4/CS 200/CS BX/50

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $105.00 $102.50 $110.00

Total $7,350.00 $7,175.00 $7,700.00

99 Swivel Elbow Super Set 22mm w/DBL Intersurgical 

Incorporated Ref: 3509031; 50EA/BX; NO SUBSTITUTION
200

Mfg. Name Intersurgical Intersurgical Incorp. NO BID

Product # IST 3509031 2421-99450

Qty. Per Case 50/CS 50/CS

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $2.38 $1.15

Total $476.00 $230.00

100 Yankauer Suction Amsino Ref AS833; 50EA/Bx; NO 

SUBSTITUTION
600

Mfg. Name Amsino Amsino International Amsino

Product # AMSAS838 16104 15093

Qty. Per Case 50/CS 50/CS Each

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $0.54 $1.16 $1.10
Total $324.00 $696.00 $660.00
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101 Salem Sump 16fr/ch (5.3mm) x48”(122cm) 

Ref:8888265132 Covidien Silicone Dual Lumen Stomach 

Tube; 10EA/BX; NO SUBSTITUTION

100

Mfg. Name Kendall/Covidien Kendall Covidien

Product # KEN8888265132 2231-96016 85614

Qty. Per Case 10/BX 50/CS Each

Price Each (COSA Net Price) *$1.516 $1.74 $1.79

Total $151.60 $174.00 $179.00

102 QuikClot Combat Gauze Hemostatic Dressing Z-Medica 

Ref:150; 50EA/BX; NO SUBSTITUTION
300

Mfg. Name Z-Medica Z-Medica Z-Medica

Product # ZME150 969-150EA 84794

Qty. Per Case 50/CS 50/CS Each

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $35.80 $33.90 $36.00

Total $10,740.00 $10,170.00 $10,800.00

103 Micro Pin Non-Vented vial access pin for withdrawal or 

injection; Ref 415019 B Braun; NO SUBSTITUTION
5,000

Mfg. Name B. Braun B. Braun NO BID

Product # BBM415019 C884386

Qty. Per Case 100/CS 100/CS

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $0.27 $0.27

Total $1,350.00 $1,350.00

104 Straps DMS Part# 11152MA Color Maroon, or approved 

equal
1,600

Mfg. Name DMS DMS NO BID

Product # DKM11152MA 506022M

Qty. Per Case EA 1EA

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $6.80 $6.50

Total $10,880.00 $10,400.00

105 Straps Extension Part# 1218 Color Black, or approved 200
Mfg. Name DMS Morrison Medical NO BID

Product # DKM1104BK 56-1200BK-9

Qty. Per Case EA 1EA

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $6.48 $8.25

Total $1,296.00 $1,650.00

106 Strap Wrist Part# 1290 Color Black, or approved equal 80

Mfg. Name Morrison Morrison Medical NO BID

Product # MOR1290 *1290

Qty. Per Case EA 1EA

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $8.33 $9.25

Total $666.40 $740.00

107 Glutose 15 Oral Glucose Gel (Low Blood Sugar); Lemon 

Flavor 3/Pk, or approved equal
3,000

Mfg. Name Level Level Foods Paddock

Product # LFL103405 0030-37-Madarin Flavor 80915

Qty. Per Case 3/PK 36/CS sold in lots of 3EA or 

1PK

Pkg/3

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $0.93 $0.9367 *$3.666

Total $2,790.00 $2,810.10 $10,998.00

108 Amiodarone Hydrochloride Injection 150mg/33ml 

(50mg/mL); 10x3ml Single use vials NDC 0143-9875-10; 

NO SUBSTITUTION

3,000

Mfg. Name West Ward West-Ward Pharma NO BID

Product # 00143-987500 987510

Qty. Per Case 10/CT 10/BX

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $1.66 $2.12

Total $4,980.00 $6,360.00

109 Epinephrine Injection, USP 1:1,000 (1mg/ml) 1ml 25 

Ampuls Hospria NDC 0409-7241-01; NO SUBSTITUTION
1,710

Mfg. Name Hospira Hospira NO BID

Product # ABB07241-01 0641142035

Qty. Per Case 25/BX 400/CS

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $3.38 $2.43

Total $5,779.80 $4,155.30

110 Metoprolol Tartrate Injection, USP; 5mg/5ml(1mg/ml); NDC 

63323-660-05; APP Pharmaceuticals, LLC; NO 

SUBSTITUTION

300

Mfg. Name AppPharm Sagent Pharma Hospira

Product # 63323-660005 303-05 87402

Qty. Per Case 10/CT 10/BX Pkg/10

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $1.135 $1.30 *$0.999
Total $340.50 $390.00 $299.70
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111 Sterile Water for injection, USP 25x5ml Single dose Vials 

NDC 0517-3005-25; American Regent; or approved equal
300

Mfg. Name Amer Regent Hospira NO BID

Product # 00517-300525 0074488710

Qty. Per Case 25/CT 400/CS

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $3.34 $1.10

Total $1,002.00 $330.00

112 Bandage CoFlex 2x5YD LF Blue ANDOVER ; 36RL/CS 

5200BL; NO SUBSTITUTION
350

Mfg. Name Andover Andover Healthcare Andover

Product # AND5200BL-036 12525BL 89947

Qty. Per Case 36/CS 36/CS 36/Case

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $1.25 $1.37 *$0.999

Total $437.50 $479.50 $349.65

113 Bandage CoFlex 3x5YD LF Blue ANDOVER ; 24RL/CS 

5300BL; NO SUBSTITUTION
300

Mfg. Name Andover Andover Healthcare Andover

Product # AND5300BL-024 12526BL 83095

Qty. Per Case 24/CS 24/CS 24/Case

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $1.54 $1.72 *$2.39

Total $462.00 $516.00 $717.00

114 Tourniquet 1x18 LF Orange Donovan Reorder# 

NLT4425OR Dawn Mist Ultra LFLatex Free 250EA/PK 

4PK/CA; NO SUBSTITUTION

33,000

Mfg. Name Dukal/Dunovan Dukal NO BID

Product # DONNLT 4425-OR 1880-42515

Qty. Per Case

250/PK; 4PK/CS

1000/CS sold in lots of 

1000EA or 1 case

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $0.1057 $0.131

Total $3,488.10 $4,323.00

115 Epinephrine 1:10,000 Inj USP ; (0.1mg/ml) 1mg per 10mL; 

NDC: 0548-3316-00; NO SUBSTITUTION
4,000

Mfg. Name IMS IMS Limited IMS

Product # IMS76329-3316-1 373316 12536

Qty. Per Case 10/CT 1EA Each

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $3.76 $2.70 $4.99

Total $15,040.00 $10,800.00 $19,960.00

116 Sodium Bicarbonate 8.4%; 50mEq (1mEq)mL; with male 

luer lock adapter and 18-guage protected needle; NDC 

0409-6637-34

4,000

Mfg. Name Hospira Hospira Hospira

Product # ABB06637-34 376637 56192

Qty. Per Case 10/BX 50/CS Each

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $7.29 $5.89 $5.99

Total $29,160.00 $23,560.00 $23,960.00

117 Dextrose 50%; 25grams(0.5g/mL) 50mL; with male luer 

lock adapter and 18-guage protected needle; NDC 0409-

4902-34 NO SUBSTITUTION

4,000

Mfg. Name Hospira Hospira Hospira

Product # ABB04902-34 0074490201 56197

Qty. Per Case 10/CT 50/CS Each

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $11.18 $10.69 $9.89

Total $44,720.00 $42,760.00 $39,560.00

118 Calcium 10%; 1gram(100mg/mL) represents 27mg 

(1.4mEq)c+/mL; Needless; NDC 0409-1631-10 NO 

SUBSTITUTION

2,000

Mfg. Name Hospira Hospira IMS

Product # ABB01631-10 371631 15645

Qty. Per Case 10/CT 1EA Each

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $5.43 $8.50 $5.15

Total $10,860.00 $17,000.00 $10,300.00

119 Naloxone Hydrochloride; (1mg/mL) 2mg per 2mL; 

Needless; NDC 76329-3369-1 NO SUBSTITUTION
6,000

Mfg. Name IMS IMS Limited IMS

Product # IMS 76329-3369-1 373369 11216

Qty. Per Case 10/CT 10/CS Each

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $16.85 $14.96 $17.99

Total $101,100.00 $89,760.00 $107,940.00

120 Diazepam; 10mg/2ml(5mg/ml); Needless; NDC:0409-1273-

32; NO SUBSTITUTION
1,500

Mfg. Name Hospira Hospira Hospira

Product # 00409-127332 371104 87268

Qty. Per Case 10/CT 10/BX sold in lots of                      

10EA or 1 box

Each

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $17.74 $12.633 $11.14
Total $26,610.00 $18,949.50 $16,710.00
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City of San Antonio

Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 30, 2014

For: Annual Contract for Medical Supplies Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local

Midwest Medical Supply 

Co., Inc.

Bound Tree Medical, LLC Moore Medical, LLC.

SC 13400 Lakefront Drive 5000 Tuttle Crossing Blvd. 1690 New Britain Ave.

Item Description

Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity

Earth City,                                                       

MO 63045                                    

386-252-9960

Dublin,                                               

OH 43016

Farmington,                                               

CT 06034

6100004347

121 Morphine; 10mg/ml; Needless;NDC:0409-1893-01; NO 

SUBSTITUTION
1,500

Mfg. Name Hospira Hospira Hospira

Product # 00409-189301 1893-01 12112

Qty. Per Case 10/CT 10/BX Box/10

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $2.55 $2.05 *$2.10

Total $3,825.00 $3,075.00 $3,150.00

122 Atrophine Sulfate; 1mg(0.1mg/mL) 10mL; Needless; NDC: 

76329-3339-1; NO SUBSTITUTION
4,000

Mfg. Name IMS IMS Limited IMS

Product # 96329-3339-1 371006 15811

Qty. Per Case 10/CT 10/PK Each

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $3.76 $3.28 $4.50

Total $15,040.00 $13,120.00 $18,000.00

123 Meret Magnum Oxygen Regulator PN: EMSMREG8725-

B2D; 0-25 LPM EMS Oxygen Regulator CGA870, Barbed 

Outlet, 2 Diss Check Valves Cleaned for Oxygen Service 

M4L LifeTime Warranty; NO SUBSTITUTION

100

Mfg. Name Meret Meret Meret

Product # MEPEMSMREG8725-B2D 661294 11002

Qty. Per Case EA 1EA Each

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $114.55 $130.90 $137.00

Total $11,455.00 $13,090.00 $13,700.00

124 Stethosope Sprague American Diagnostic Corporation; Ref 

641 ADSCOPE 641 Size 22” Black; NO SUBSTITUTION
100

Mfg. Name Ameri Diag American Diagnostic Corp. ADC

Product # AME641BK 540220 70200

Qty. Per Case EA 20/CS Each

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $7.65 $6.67 $7.25

Total $765.00 $667.00 $725.00

125 Backboard Ultra Plastic Short Color: Red Iron Duck with the 

logo “San Antonio Fire 210-207-7744”;NO SUBSTITUTION
10

Mfg. Name Iron Duck Iron Duck NO BID

Product # IRO35955-R-w/print 265775R + Logo

Qty. Per Case

EA

1EA                                      

(Pricing is the backboard 

and logo)

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $65.40 $157.23

Total $654.00 $1,572.30

126 Backboard Ultra w/12 pin Color: yellow Iron Duck with the 

logo “San Antonio Fire 210-207-7744”Product # 35900-P; 

NO SUBSTITUTION

260

Mfg. Name Iron Duck Iron Duck NO BID

Product # IRO35900-P-Y 265900PY + Logo

Qty. Per Case
EA

1EA                                               

(Pricing is the backboard 

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $154.00 $136.85

Total $40,040.00 $35,581.00

127 Cylinder D Jumbo w/Toggle Valve Meret ; NO 

SUBSTITUTION
50

Mfg. Name Meret Meret Meret

Product # MEPK870MJDT CRAK870MJDZ 95182

Qty. Per Case EA 1EA Each

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $76.00 $67.49 $72.50

Total $3,800.00 $3,374.50 $3,625.00

128 Blue Sensor, Adult Foam Electrode 48mm w/snap 25/pk, 

MFG : Ambu Part # : R00S25; NO SUBSTITUTION

55,000

Mfg. Name Ambu Ambu Ambu

Product # AMBR-00-S/25 230026 68738

Qty. Per Case 25/PK; 40/CS 1000/CS Pkg/25

Price Each (COSA Net Price) $7.38 $7.44 $8.99

Total $405,900.00 $409,200.00 $494,450.00

B1. Catalog Discount, Medical Supplies

Percent of Discount Offered 20% 35% with exclusion letter 15%

Catalog/Price List Title and/or Number EMS Product Catalog Bound Tree Medical Current 

Catalog or Website

mooremedical.com

Price Schedule Column on Which Discount is Based

(i.e., Distributor, Net, Wholesale, List)
Sugg List List Price N/A

Date of Catalog/Price List 3/12/2014 Current                                            

(Bound Tree is ready to 

release 2014-2015) Catalog

N/A

B2. Catalog Discount, Medical Equipment

Percent of Discount Offered 20% 20% with exclusion letter 15%

Catalog/Price List Title and/or Number
EMS Product Catalog Bound Tree Medical Current 

Catalog or Website
mooremedical.com

Price Schedule Column on Which Discount is Based

(i.e., Distributor, Net, Wholesale, List)
Sugg List List Price N/A

Date of Catalog/Price List 3/12/2014 Current                                            

(Bound Tree is ready to 

release 2014-2015) Catalog

N/A

Payment Terms 1.5% 15 Days Net 30 Net 30

*Prices adjusted for evaluation purposes. 
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