
City of San Antonio
Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 1, 2013

For: Zoll AED Pro Defibrillators and Accessories
Alamo Distribution, 
LLC
dba Alamo Iron Works Medwheels, Inc. Moore Medical, LLC

ZOLL Medical 
Corporaton

VF
943 AT&T Center 
Pkwy 1322 E. Houston 1690 New Britain Ave 269 Mill Road

Item Description
Estimated 

Annual 
Quantity

San Antonio, 
TX 78219

San Antonio, 
TX 78205

Farmington, 
CT  06032

Chelmford, 
MA 01824-4105

Category A Defibrillators
1 AED Pro Semi Auto Defibrillator with Voice Recording 10

Price Each $3,482.00 $1,330.00 No Bid $2,453.84
Manufacturer Zoll AED Zoll
Part No. 90110202499991010 901102024999910 90110202499991010
Total $34,820.00 $13,300.00 $24,538.40

2 AED Pro Semi-Auto Defibrillator, Non-Clinical Refurbished 10

Price Each No Bid $1,330.00 No Bid $1,875.60
Manufacturer AED Zoll
Part No. 701102004999910 70110200499991010
Total $13,300.00 $18,756.00

Category B Electrodes
3 Delete

4 CPR Stat-padz, HVP Multi-Function CPR Electrodes 500
Price Each $65.00 $71.25 $63.75 $54.60
Manufacturer Zoll AED Zoll Zoll
Part No. 8900-0402 8900-0402 8900-0402 8900-0402
Total $32,500.00 $35,625.00 $31,875.00 $27,300.00

5 Pedi-Padz II, Pediatric Multi-Function Electrodes 200
Price Each $82.35 $90.25 $80.75 $71.25
Manufacturer Zoll AED Zoll Zoll
Part No. 8900-0810-01 8900-0810-01 8900-0810-01 8900-0810-01
Total $16,470.00 $18,050.00 $16,150.00 $14,250.00

6 EGG Electrodes 500
Price Each $104.00 $119.00 $102.00 $90.00
Manufacturer Zoll AED Zoll Zoll
Part No. 8900-0003 8900-0003 8900-0003 8900-0003
Total $52,000.00 $59,500.00 $51,000.00 $45,000.00

Category C Batteries, Cables, Data, Software
7 AED Pro Non-Rechargeable Lithium Battery Pack 100

Price Each $138.75 $143.80 $133.50 $124.80
Manufacturer Zoll AED Zoll Zoll
Part No. 8000-0860-01 8000-0860-01 8000-0860-01 8000-0860-01
Total $13,875.00 $14,380.00 $13,350.00 $12,480.00

8 AED Pro ECG 3-Lead Monitoring Cable 30
Price Each $138.75 $163.00 $133.50 $124.80
Manufacturer Zoll AED Zoll Zoll
Part No. 8000-0838 8000-0838 8000-0838 8000-0838
Total $4,162.50 $4,890.00 $4,005.00 $3,744.00

9 Defibrillator Analyzer Adapter Cable, Universal 50
Price Each $91.05 $98.20 No Bid $81.90
Manufacturer Zoll AED Zoll
Part No. 8000-0804-01 8000-0804-01 8000-0804-01
Total $4,552.50 $4,910.00 $4,095.00

10 RS-232 IrDA Adapter 30
Price Each $91.05 $98.20 No Bid $81.90
Manufacturer Zoll AED Zoll
Part No. 8000-0816 8000-0816 8000-0816
Total $2,731.50 $2,946.00 $2,457.00

11 USB IrDA Adapter 30
Price Each $91.05 $98.20 $89.25 $81.90
Manufacturer Zoll AED Zoll Zoll
Part No. 8000-0815 8000-0815 8000-0815 8000-0815
Total $2,731.50 $2,946.00 $2,677.50 $2,457.00

12 Administrative Software for AED Pro 2
Price Each $28.90 $27.30 No Bid $21.06
Manufacturer Zoll AED Zoll
Part No. 8000-0843-01 8000-0843-01 8000-0843-01
Total $57.80 $54.60 $42.12
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Category D Cases
13 AED Pro Soft Carry Case 30

Price Each $91.05 $97.50 No Bid $81.90
Manufacturer Zoll AED Zoll
Part No. 8000-0810-01 8000-0810-01 8000-0810-01
Total $2,731.50 $2,925.00 $2,457.00

14 AED Pro Molded Vinyl Carry Case 30
Price Each $143.05 $168.00 No Bid $128.70
Manufacturer Zoll AED Zoll
Part No. 8000-0832-01 8000-0832-01 8000-0832-01
Total $4,291.50 $5,040.00 $3,861.00

15 AED Pro Hard Case with Foam Cut-Outs 30
Price Each $198.55 $205.52 $194.64 $178.62
Manufacturer Zoll AED Zoll Zoll
Part No. 8000-0875-32 8000-0875-32 8000-0875-32 8000-0875-32
Total $5,956.50 $6,165.60 $5,839.20 $5,358.60

16 Deleted

17 Deleted

Category E Simulators/Trainers
18 AED Pro Simulator/Tester 30

Price Each $255.80 $262.60 No Bid $230.10
Manufacturer Zoll AED Zoll
Part No. 8000-0829-01 8000-0829-01 8000-0829-01
Total $7,674.00 $7,878.00 $6,903.00

19 SeeThru CPR Simulator/Tester 10
Price Each $429.20 $448.20 No Bid $386.10
Manufacturer Zoll AED Zoll
Part No. 8009-0751-01 80009-0751-01 8009-0751-01
Total $4,292.00 $4,482.00 $3,861.00

20 Training CPR Stat-Padz 2
Price Each $102.90 $83.10 No Bid $69.42
Manufacturer Zoll AED Zoll
Part No. 8900-0190 8900-0190 8900-0190
Total $205.80 $166.20 $138.84

21 Real CPR Help Travel Trainer 1
Price Each $345.95 $357.00 No Bid $311.22
Manufacturer Zoll AED Zoll
Part No. 8008-0006-01 8008-0006-01 8008-0006-01
Total $345.95 $357.00 $311.22

22 Deleted

Category F Miscellaneous
23 AED Pro Operator's Guide 2

Price Each $25.30 $27.30 No Bid $21.06
Manufacturer Zoll AED Zoll
Part No. 9650-0350-01 9650-0350-01 9650-0350-01
Total $50.60 $54.60 $42.12

24 AED Pro Service Manual 10
Price Each $47.70 $52.50 No Bid $42.90
Manufacturer Zoll AED Zoll
Part No. 9650-0309-01 9850-0309-01 9650-0309-01
Total $477.00 $525.00 $429.00

Terms Net 30 1% 10 Days Net 30 Net 30

Estimated Annual Total

Estimated Annual Award
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