City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 14, 2014
For: Aluminum Signs
U.S Standard Sign Vulcan Inc., dba Vulcan
Aluminum
6100005216 DS 11400 W. Addison Ave |Vulcan Signs
400 East Berry Ave.
Item Description Estimated |Franklin Park, Foley,
Quantity _[IL 60131 AL 36535
1 24" Octagonal (Stop), .080" thickness, Wt. 3.74# 2,000
Unit Price $7.94 $7.74
Total Price $15,880.00 $15,480.00
2 30" Octagonal (Stop), .080" thickness, Wt. 5.84# 1,200
Unit Price $12.42 $12.08
Total Price $14,904.00 $14,496.00
3 36" Octagonal (Stop), .100" thickness, Wt. 10.52 # 200
Unit Price $22.34 $21.77
Total Price $4,468.00 $4,354.00
4 30" Square (A) /Diamond,.080" thickness, Wt. 7.03# 1,500
Unit Price $13.32 $13.00
Total Price $19,980.00 $19,500.00
5 36"Circle, .100" thickness, Wt. 9.94# 300
Unit Price $24.99 $21.37
Total Price $7,497.00 $6,411.00
6 36" Pentagon, .100" thickness, Wt. 9.50# 900
Unit Price $22.65 $21.10
Total Price $20,385.00 $18,990.00
7 18" x 18" Square A/Diamond, .080" thickness, Wt. 2.53# 800
Unit Price $4.79 $4.85
Total Price $3,832.00 $3,880.00
8 9" x 12" Horizontal Rectangle, .080" thickness 500
Unit Price $1.95 $1.82
Total Price $975.00 $910.00
9 9" x 24" Horizontal Rectangle, .125" thickness, Wt. 2.64# 3,000
Unit Price $5.00 $5.00
Total Price $15,000.00 $15,000.00
10 9" x 30" Horizontal Rectangle, .125" thickness, Wt. 3.30# 3,000
Unit Price $6.24 $6.28
Total Price $18,720.00 $18,840.00
11 9" x 36" Horizontal Rectangle, .125" thickness, Wt. 3.96# 2,000
Unit Price $7.50 $7.36
Total Price $15,000.00 $14,720.00
12 9" x 42" Horizontal Rectangle, .125" thickness, Wt. 4.62# 1,500
Unit Price $8.74 $8.93
Total Price $13,110.00 $13,395.00
13 9" x 48" Horizontal Rectangle, .125" thickness, Wt. 5.28# 1,500
Unit Price $10.00 $9.82
Total Price $15,000.00 $14,730.00
14 9" x 54" Horizontal Rectangle, .125" thickness, Wt. 5.94# 1,000
Unit Price $11.24 $11.26
Total Price $11,240.00 $11,260.00
15 12" x 30" Horizontal Rectangle, .125 thickness 3,000
Unit Price $8.34 $7.93
Total Price $25,020.00 $23,790.00
16 18" x 24" Rectangle, .080" thickness, Wt. 3.38# 3,000
Unit Price $6.39 $6.08
Total Price $19,170.00 $18,240.00
17 18" x 60" Overhead, .125" thickness, Wt. 13.19# 100
Unit Price $26.74 $24.22
Total Price $2,674.00 $2,422.00
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18 18" x 72" Overhead, .125" thickness, Wt. 15.83# 100
Unit Price $32.06 $29.05
Total Price $3,206.00 $2,905.00
19 24" x 30 Rectangle, .080" thickness, Wt. 5.63# 1,000
Unit Price $10.67 $10.28
Total Price $10,670.00 $10,280.00
20 6" x 18 Rectangle, .080" thickness, Wt. 84# 300
Unit Price $1.95 $1.76
Total Price $585.00 $528.00
21 30" x 36" Rectangle, .080 thickness, Wt. 10.55# 1,000
Unit Price $15.99 $15.63
Total Price $15,990.00 $15,630.00
22 15" x 72" Overhead, .125" thickness, Wt. 13.19# 200
Unit Price $27.00 $23.70
Total Price $5,400.00 $4,740.00
23 15" x 60" Overhead, .125" thickness, Wt. 10.99# 200
Unit Price $22.49 $19.57
Total Price $4,498.00 $3,914.00
24 15" x 48" Overhead, .125" thickness, Wt. 8.79# 200
Unit Price $17.99 $15.63
Total Price $3,598.00 $3,126.00
25 5" x 7 3/4 " Vertical Rectangle, .060" thickness, Wt. .24# 1,000
Unit Price $1.25 $0.69
Total Price $1,250.00 $690.00
26 12" x 36" Rectangle, .080" thickness, Wt. 6# 500
Unit Price $6.39 $6.40
Total Price $3,195.00 $3,200.00
27 24" x 24" Square (A)/Diamond, .080" thickness, Wt. 4.5# 500
Unit Price $8.53 $8.27
Total Price $4,265.00 $4,135.00
28 24" x 36" Rectangle, .080" thickness, Wt. 6.75# 500
Price per cubic yard $12.78 $12.58
Total Price $6,390.00 $6,290.00
29 36" x 48" Horizontal Rectangle ©,.080" thickness, Wt. 13.5# 500
Unit Price $25.59 $25.03
Total Price $12,795.00 $12,515.00
30 36" x 36" Square (A)/Diamond, .080" thickness, Wt. 10.13# 500
Unit Price $19.19 $18.76
Total Price $9,595.00 $9,380.00
31 12" x 18" Rectangle, .080" thickness, Wt. 1.69# 500
Unit Price $3.34 $3.09
Total Price $1,670.00 $1,545.00
32 20" x 36" Rectangle, .080" thickness, Wt. 5.63# 500
Unit Price $11.24 $10.51
Total Price $5,620.00 $5,255.00
33 24" x 48" Horizontal Rectangle Vertical Rectangle ©, .100"
thickness, Wt 11.26# 500
Unit Price $21.31 $20.70
Total Price $10,655.00 $10,350.00
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34 30" x 60" Horizontal Rectangle Vertical Rectangle ©, .100" 500
thickness, Wt. 17.59#
Unit Price $33.31 $32.74
Total Price $16,655.00 $16,370.00
35 36" Equilateral Triangle, .100" thickness, Wt. 5.5# 500
Unit Price $13.52 $11.32
Total Price $6,760.00 $5,660.00
36 48 x 60" Vertical Rectangle, .100" thickness, Wt. 5.5# 500
Unit Price $53.31 $51.59
Total Price $26,655.00 $25,795.00
37 R1-1, 30 inch x 30 inch - Sign, Stop 1,000
Unit Price No Bid $21.55
Total Price $21,550.00
38 S1-1, 36 inch X 36 inch - Sign, School 1,000
Unit Price No Bid $49.95
Total Price $49,950.00
39 SW 16-9P, 24 inch x 12 inch - Sign, Ahead 750
Unit Price No Bid $10.58
Total Price $7,935.00
40 S7-1T, 24 inch x 18 inch - Sign, Cell Phone Use Prohibited 1,000
Unit Price No Bid $13.10
Total Price $13,100.00
41 S5-1, 24 inch x 18 inch - Sign, School Speed Limit XX When
Flashing 1,000
Unit Price No Bid $36.86
Total Price $36,860.00
42 S6-1T (20 mph), 84 inch x 36 inch - Sign, School Speed Limit XX
When Flashing 400
Unit Price No Bid $145.24
Total Price $58,096.00
43 SW16-7P, 24 inch x 12 inch - Sign, Diagonal Arrow 750
Unit Price No bid $10.58
Total Price $7,935.00
44 S5-2aTP, 24 inch x 10 inch - Sign, End School Zone 1,000
Unit Price No bid $7.70
Total Price $7,700.00
45 12" x 24" Rectangle, .080" thickness 500
Unit Price $4.25 No Bid
Total Price $2,125.00
46 10" x 24" Rectangle, .080" thickness 500
Unit Price $3.74 No Bid
Total Price $1,870.00
Delivery 30 days 30 days
Payment Terms 2% 10 days Net 30
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