
City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 16, 2014  Bid # 1 Bid # 2

For: Heavy Equipment Associated Supply 
Company

Barco Pump Company H & E Equipment 
Services

Quality Equipment Co. Waukesha-Pearce 
Industries, Inc.

Western Oilfields 
Supply Company, dba 
Rain for Rent

Western Oilfields 
Supply Company, dba 
PowerPrime Pump

Frank J. Zamboni & 
Co, Inc.

6100004602 LD 4146 IH 10 East 8124 Bracken Creek 
Dr.

5433 Randolph Blvd. 11146 IH 35 North 3740 S. E. Loop 410 3744 Southeast Loop 
410 

115 Kentucky Street 15714 Colorado Ave.

Item Description QTY San Antonio,                 
TX 78219

San Antonio,                 
TX 78266

San Antonio,                 
TX 78233

San Antonio                 
TX 78233

San Antonio,                 
TX 78222

San Antonio,                
TX 78222

Bakersfield,                
CA 93305

Paramount,              
CA 90723         

1 Forklift, 6,000 lbs., LPG: 2
Price Each: $27,920.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total: $55,840.00  
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2014 Doosan G30PS-

EX20
 

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

GM 2.4L 64 HP Net  

Transmission Offered: Powershift 1 Forward  -
1 Reverse

Warranty: 1yr/2000 hr Machine - 
2yr/2000 hr Powertrain 

- 5 yr/10,000 hr Oil 
Disc Brakes

Warranty Service Provider Name: Associated Supply 
Company

Warranty Facility Address: 4146 IH 10 East, 
San Antonio, TX 

78219
Delivery: 120 Days  
Production Cut-off Date: None  
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date:

Aug 30, 2014

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date:

Not Provided  

2 Forklift, 8,000 lbs., Diesel, Rough Terrain: 1
Price Each: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total:   
Year, Make & Model Offered:   
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

  

Transmission Offered:  
Warranty:  
Warranty Service Provider Name:  
Warranty Facility Address:  
Delivery:   
Production Cut-off Date:   
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date:

 

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date:
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 16, 2014  Bid # 1 Bid # 2

For: Heavy Equipment Associated Supply 
Company

Barco Pump Company H & E Equipment 
Services

Quality Equipment Co. Waukesha-Pearce 
Industries, Inc.

Western Oilfields 
Supply Company, dba 
Rain for Rent

Western Oilfields 
Supply Company, dba 
PowerPrime Pump

Frank J. Zamboni & 
Co, Inc.

6100004602 LD 4146 IH 10 East 8124 Bracken Creek 
Dr.

5433 Randolph Blvd. 11146 IH 35 North 3740 S. E. Loop 410 3744 Southeast Loop 
410 

115 Kentucky Street 15714 Colorado Ave.

Item Description QTY San Antonio,                 
TX 78219

San Antonio,                 
TX 78266

San Antonio,                 
TX 78233

San Antonio                 
TX 78233

San Antonio,                 
TX 78222

San Antonio,                
TX 78222

Bakersfield,                
CA 93305

Paramount,              
CA 90723         

3 Loader / Backhoe, 4WD, Enclosed Cab: 2
Price Each: $72,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total: $144,000.00   
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2014 Case 580SN   
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

Case FPT F5C, 95Hp 
Net

  

Warranty: 12 Mo/Unlimited Hour 
Full Machine

Warranty Service Provider Name: Associated Supply 
Company

Warranty Facility Address: 4146 IH 10 East, San 
Antonio, TX 78219

Delivery: 120 Days   
Production Cut-off Date: None   
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date:

Aug 30, 2014

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date:

No   

4 Loader / Backhoe, 4WD, Open Cab: 1
Price Each: $79,345.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total: $79,345.00
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2014, Case 580SN, 

2014 Case CH-6M 
Hammer

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

Case FPT F5C 

Warranty: 12 Mo/Unlimited Hour 
Full Machine

Warranty Service Provider Name: Associated Supply 
Company

Warranty Facility Address: 4146 IH 10 East, San 
Antonio, TX 78219

Delivery: 120 Days
Production Cut-off Date: None
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date:

Aug 30, 2014

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date:

No

Prepared by Purchasing 8/18/2014 2 of 4



City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 16, 2014  Bid # 1 Bid # 2

For: Heavy Equipment Associated Supply 
Company

Barco Pump Company H & E Equipment 
Services

Quality Equipment Co. Waukesha-Pearce 
Industries, Inc.

Western Oilfields 
Supply Company, dba 
Rain for Rent

Western Oilfields 
Supply Company, dba 
PowerPrime Pump

Frank J. Zamboni & 
Co, Inc.

6100004602 LD 4146 IH 10 East 8124 Bracken Creek 
Dr.

5433 Randolph Blvd. 11146 IH 35 North 3740 S. E. Loop 410 3744 Southeast Loop 
410 

115 Kentucky Street 15714 Colorado Ave.

Item Description QTY San Antonio,                 
TX 78219

San Antonio,                 
TX 78266

San Antonio,                 
TX 78233

San Antonio                 
TX 78233

San Antonio,                 
TX 78222

San Antonio,                
TX 78222

Bakersfield,                
CA 93305

Paramount,              
CA 90723         

5 Trailer Mounted Trash Pumps: 3
Price Each: No Bid $36,710.00 $44,295.00 No Bid No Bid $39,120.00 $48,650.00 No Bid
Total:  $110,130.00 $132,885.00  $117,360.00 $145,950.00
Year, Make & Model Offered:  2014 Barco 6NHTA-

404SH
2014 Thompson 

6JSCE
 2014, PowerPrime 

Pumps, DV175C
2014, PowerPrime 

Pumps, DV175C
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

 John Deere 4045H-
115, 107 Hp @ 2400 

RPM

John Deere 4045TF 
290-80, 80 Hp

 John Deere 
JD4045HF285, 139 

HP, Tier 3

John Deere 
JD4045HFC93, 140 

HP, IT 4
Warranty: 2 year on Pump, 1 

year unlimited hour or 
2 year 2000 hour on 

Engine 

1 Year Pump, 1 Year 
Unlimited Engine or 
2 years 2000 Hours

Buyer for 24 months 
or 2000 hours, 

whichever comes first 
from date of shipment. 

Warranty does not 
cover damages due to 

freezing. 

Buyer for 24 months 
or 200 hours, 

whichever comes first 
from date of shipment. 

Warranty does not 
cover damages due to 

freezing. 

Warranty Service Provider Name: Barco Pump Company H & E Equipment 
Services

Rain for Rent Rain for Rent

Warranty Facility Address: 8124 Bracken Creek 
Dr., San Antonio, TX 

78266

5433 Randolph Blvd. 
San Antonio, TX 

78233

Rain for Rent-San 
Antonio, 3744 

Southeast Loop 410, 
San Antonio, TX 

78222

Rain for Rent-San 
Antonio, 3744 

Southeast Loop 410, 
San Antonio, TX 

78222

Delivery:  60 Days 60 Days  56 Days 70 Days
Production Cut-off Date:  12/31/14 N/A  NA NA
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date:

10/31/14 10/16/14 NA 9/20/14, in order to 
guarantee engine 

availability
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date:

 No No  Yes Yes, based on engine 
availability.

6 Loader, Skid Steer, with  Attachments ( 
Bucket, Auger, Pallet Forks, Planer, 
Sweeper Broom and Hydraulic Breaker):

2

Price Each: $55,250.00 No Bid $64,630.00 $52,718.36 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total: $110,500.00 $129,260.00 $105,436.72   
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2014 Case SR175HF 2014 GEHL R220 2014, Bobcat S550   
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

Case FPT N844LTA, 
64 Hp Net

Yanmar 4TNV98CT - 
NMS Tier IV Stage 3B 

70.7 H.P.

Bobcat-Doosan, 
60 SAE Net

  

Warranty: 12 Month/Unlimited 
Hour Full Machine

1 year machine, 2 
year, 2000 hours on 

Yanmar Engine

One Year   

Warranty Service Provider Name: Associated Supply 
Company

H & E Equipment 
Services

Quality Equipment Co. 
dba Bobcat of SA

  

Warranty Facility Address: 4146 IH 10 East, San 
Antonio, TX 78219

5433 Randolph Blvd. 
San Antonio, TX 

78233

11146 IH 35 North, 
San Antonio, TX 

78233

  

Delivery: 120 Days 45 Days 60 Days   
Production Cut-off Date: None N/A Nov 1, 2014   
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date:

Aug 30, 2014 10/16/14 Nov 1, 2014   

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date:

No No Nov 1, 2014   
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 16, 2014  Bid # 1 Bid # 2

For: Heavy Equipment Associated Supply 
Company

Barco Pump Company H & E Equipment 
Services

Quality Equipment Co. Waukesha-Pearce 
Industries, Inc.

Western Oilfields 
Supply Company, dba 
Rain for Rent

Western Oilfields 
Supply Company, dba 
PowerPrime Pump

Frank J. Zamboni & 
Co, Inc.

6100004602 LD 4146 IH 10 East 8124 Bracken Creek 
Dr.

5433 Randolph Blvd. 11146 IH 35 North 3740 S. E. Loop 410 3744 Southeast Loop 
410 

115 Kentucky Street 15714 Colorado Ave.

Item Description QTY San Antonio,                 
TX 78219

San Antonio,                 
TX 78266

San Antonio,                 
TX 78233

San Antonio                 
TX 78233

San Antonio,                 
TX 78222

San Antonio,                
TX 78222

Bakersfield,                
CA 93305

Paramount,              
CA 90723         

7 Dozer/Tractor, Tracked: 1
Price Each: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $427,872.84 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total:    $427,872.84  
Year, Make & Model Offered:    2014 Komatsu D85EX-

15E0
 

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

   Komatsu SAA6D125E-
5, SAE Net Hp 264

 

Warranty: One (1) Year-
Unlimited Hour

 

Warranty Service Provider Name: Waukesha-Pearce 
Industries, Inc.

 

Warranty Facility Address: 3740 S. E. Loop 410, 
San Antonio, TX 

78222

 

Delivery:    180 Days  
Production Cut-off Date:    12/31/2014  
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date:

10/31/2014  

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date:

   No  

8 Ice Resurfacing Machine: 1
Price Each: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $99,165.00
Total: $99,165.00
Trade–In Zamboni Model 500; Total 
Trade–In Price: 

$7,500.00

Year, Make & Model Offered: 2015 Zamboni 546
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

Kubota 1.6 Liter 57HP 

Transmission Offered: Saver Danfoss 
Hydrostatic

Warranty: One Year Warranty
Warranty Service Provider Name: IDS
Warranty Facility Address: 1106 Paulsun, San 

Antonio TX 78219, 
Zamboni Company, 

15714 Colorado Ave, 
Paramount, CA 90723

Delivery: 250 Days
Production Cut-off Date: 1/15/15
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date:

12/31/14

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date:

No

Payment Terms: Net 30 2%, Net 10 days Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30

Total: $389,685.00 $110,130.00 $262,145.00 $105,436.72 $427,872.84 $117,360.00 $145,950.00 $99,165.00
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