
City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 27, 2014

For: Refuse Trucks Body Parts & Service

Reliance Truck & Equipment, 
Ltd.

Texan Waste Equipment Inc. 
dba Heil Of Texas 

6100004511 LD 7200 South W. W. White Rd. 503 Pop Gunn

Item Description Qty
San Antonio,
TX  78222                            

San Antonio,                          
TX 78219                              

 
1A Heil Refuse Body Parts Discount

Percent of discount offered No Bid 13% off List
Product identification (Manufacturer) Heil 
Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Fleet
Price schedule number Heil 2014
Date of price schedule 2014
Price schedule column on which discount is based        
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale)

List

1B Specified Items 
1 HYD Tube "55" TAME054000 4  

Price Each: $92.66
Total Price: $370.64
Manufacturer Name of Item Offered: Heil OEM
Part Name & Number Offered: TAM E054-000

2 Color Camera (Rear) AWT90CT 2
Price Each:  $347.26
Total Price: $694.52
Manufacturer Name of Item Offered: Heil OEM
Part Name & Number Offered:  AWT90CT 

3 Proximity Switch 630109 26
Price Each: $119.91
Total Price: $3,117.66
Manufacturer Name of Item Offered: Heil OEM
Part Name & Number Offered: 063-0109

4 HYD Filter Indicator 750711012 11
Price Each: $67.75
Total Price: $745.25
Manufacturer Name of Item Offered: Heil OEM
Part Name & Number Offered: 075-0711-012

5 Joystick 316260 9
Price Each: $1,224.53
Total Price: $11,020.77
Manufacturer Name of Item Offered: Heil OEM
Part Name & Number Offered: 031-6260

6 Grabber Arm Cylinder (Small) 16768 1
Price Each: $1,567.04
Total Price: $1,567.04
Manufacturer Name of Item Offered: Heil OEM
Part Name & Number Offered: 001-6768

7 Lift Reach Arm Cylinder (Large)  0016767RB 5
Price Each: $942.12
Total Price: $4,710.60
Manufacturer Name of Item Offered: Heil OEM
Part Name & Number Offered: 001-7069

8 Core Charge for Lift Reach Arm Cylinder (Large) 
0016767RB

5

Price Each: $400.00
Total Price: $2,000.00
Manufacturer Name of Item Offered: Heil OEM
Part Name & Number Offered: 001-7069 CORE
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 27, 2014

For: Refuse Trucks Body Parts & Service

Reliance Truck & Equipment, 
Ltd.

Texan Waste Equipment Inc. 
dba Heil Of Texas 

6100004511 LD 7200 South W. W. White Rd. 503 Pop Gunn

Item Description Qty
San Antonio,
TX  78222                            

San Antonio,                          
TX 78219                              

9 Grabber Drive Gear (Large) 0933227SER 5
Price Each: $578.55
Total Price: $2,892.75
Manufacturer Name of Item Offered: Heil OEM
Part Name & Number Offered: 093-3227-SER

10 Grabber Drive Gear  (Small) 0933228SER 6
Price Each: $443.70
Total Price: $2,662.20
Manufacturer Name of Item Offered: Heil OEM
Part Name & Number Offered: 093-3228-SER

11 Valve Eject 3-Section 316378 4
Price Each: $2,926.25
Total Price: $11,705.00
Manufacturer Name of Item Offered: Heil OEM
Part Name & Number Offered: 031-6378

12 Regenerative Valve 316227 4
Price Each: $1,168.41
Total Price: $4,673.64
Manufacturer Name of Item Offered: Heil OEM
Part Name & Number Offered: 031-6227

Heil Sub-Total: $46,160.07

1C Labor and Service
Labor and Service Rate: $85.00
Expedited/Overtime Labor and Service Rate: $127.50
Business hours are from ________ a.m. to ________ p.m. 
________ per week. 

8 a.m. to 5 p.m. 5 days per 
week

Parts and Service Facilities Name: Heil of Texas
Parts and Service Facilities Address: 503 Pop Gunn, 

San Antonio, Texas 78219

2A Pak-Mor Refuse Body Parts
Percent of discount offered 0 No Bid
Product identification (Manufacturer) Pak-Mor  
Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Dealer  
Price schedule number N/A  
Date of price schedule N/A  
Price schedule column on which discount is based        
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale)

Net  

 
2B Specified Items 
1 Pump 2021121 3

Price Each: $1,161.56  
Total Price: $3,484.68  
Manufacturer Name of Item Offered: Pak-Mor  
Part Name & Number Offered: Pump 2021121

2 Switch Micro 2261201 3
Price Each: $160.00  
Total Price: $480.00  
Manufacturer Name of Item Offered: Pak-Mor  
Part Name & Number Offered: Micro Switch 2261201  
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 27, 2014

For: Refuse Trucks Body Parts & Service

Reliance Truck & Equipment, 
Ltd.

Texan Waste Equipment Inc. 
dba Heil Of Texas 

6100004511 LD 7200 South W. W. White Rd. 503 Pop Gunn

Item Description Qty
San Antonio,
TX  78222                            

San Antonio,                          
TX 78219                              

3 Hyd Tube 4210079 2
Price Each: $127.18  
Total Price: $254.36  
Manufacturer Name of Item Offered: Pak-Mor  
Part Name & Number Offered: Hyd Tube 4210079  

4 Fitting 2321180 10
Price Each: $15.68  
Total Price: $156.80  
Manufacturer Name of Item Offered: Pak-Mor  
Part Name & Number Offered: Fitting 2321180  

5 Solinoid Kit 2072710 4
Price Each: $554.04  
Total Price: $2,216.16  
Manufacturer Name of Item Offered: Pak-Mor  
Part Name & Number Offered: Solinoid Kit 2072710  

6 Sprocket, Shaft 2131104 2
Price Each: $1,293.75  
Total Price: $2,587.50  
Manufacturer Name of Item Offered: Pak-Mor  
Part Name & Number Offered: Sprocket Shaft 2131104  

7 Relay 2261225 4
Price Each: $44.52  
Total Price: $178.08  
Manufacturer Name of Item Offered: Pak-Mor  
Part Name & Number Offered: Relay 2261225  

8 Hose Assemble 2300538 4
Price Each: Not Provided  
Total Price:   
Manufacturer Name of Item Offered:   
Part Name & Number Offered:  

9 R/B Sweep Blade 4233139 R/B 2
Price Each: $3,428.04  
Total Price: $6,856.08  
Manufacturer Name of Item Offered: Pak-Mor  
Part Name & Number Offered: R/B Sweep Blade 4233139 

R/B

10 Sweep Shaft 3233464 4
Price Each: $1,072.00  
Total Price: $4,288.00  
Manufacturer Name of Item Offered: Pak-Mor  
Part Name & Number Offered: Sweep Shaft 3233464  

11 Shaft Bushing 2111120 4
Price Each: $300.00  
Total Price: $1,200.00  
Manufacturer Name of Item Offered: Pak-Mor  
Part Name & Number Offered: Shaft Bushing 2111120  

Pak-Mor Sub-Total: $21,544.86  

2C Labor and Service
Labor and Service Rate: $60.00  
Expedited/Overtime Labor and Service Rate: $90.00  
Business hours are from ________ a.m. to ________ p.m. 
________ per week. 

8 a.m. to 4:30 p.m. 5 days 
per week

Parts and Service Facilities Name: Reliance Truck & Equipment, 
LTD.

 

Parts and Service Facilities Address: 7200 S. W. W. White Rd., 
San Antonio, TX 78222
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 27, 2014

For: Refuse Trucks Body Parts & Service

Reliance Truck & Equipment, 
Ltd.

Texan Waste Equipment Inc. 
dba Heil Of Texas 

6100004511 LD 7200 South W. W. White Rd. 503 Pop Gunn

Item Description Qty
San Antonio,
TX  78222                            

San Antonio,                          
TX 78219                              

3A Wayne Refuse Body Parts
Percent of discount offered No Bid No Bid
Product identification (Manufacturer)   
Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.)   
Price schedule number   
Date of price schedule   
Price schedule column on which discount is based        
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale)

  

 
3B Specified Items 
1 Pin for Packer 35609-00-0A     4

Price Each:   
Total Price:   
Manufacturer Name of Item Offered:   
Part Name & Number Offered:   

2 Rocker Switch 345011010 4
Price Each:   
Total Price:   
Manufacturer Name of Item Offered:   
Part Name & Number Offered:   

3 Cam Pin 3065HL8055 6
Price Each:   
Total Price:   
Manufacturer Name of Item Offered:   
Part Name & Number Offered:   

4 Lock Hook 3065HL8052       6
Price Each:   
Total Price:   
Manufacturer Name of Item Offered:   
Part Name & Number Offered:   

5 Main Link 306HL8218      3
Price Each:   
Total Price:   
Manufacturer Name of Item Offered:   
Part Name & Number Offered:   

6 Valve Harness 3222100OA 4
Price Each:   
Total Price:   
Manufacturer Name of Item Offered:   
Part Name & Number Offered:   

7 Valve Kit 545004120     4
Price Each:   
Total Price:   
Manufacturer Name of Item Offered:   
Part Name & Number Offered:   

8 Valve 545004111 2
Price Each:   
Total Price:   
Manufacturer Name of Item Offered:   
Part Name & Number Offered:   

9 Step Assy. 3529300AB   1
Price Each:   
Total Price:   
Manufacturer Name of Item Offered:   
Part Name & Number Offered:   
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 27, 2014

For: Refuse Trucks Body Parts & Service

Reliance Truck & Equipment, 
Ltd.

Texan Waste Equipment Inc. 
dba Heil Of Texas 

6100004511 LD 7200 South W. W. White Rd. 503 Pop Gunn

Item Description Qty
San Antonio,
TX  78222                            

San Antonio,                          
TX 78219                              

10 Pack Cylinder 3559202AB 1
Price Each:   
Total Price:   
Manufacturer Name of Item Offered:   
Part Name & Number Offered:   

Wayne Sub-Total:   

3C Labor and Service
Labor and Service Rate:   
Expedited/Overtime Labor and Service Rate:   
Business hours are from ________ a.m. to ________ p.m. 
________ per week. 

 

Parts and Service Facilities Name:   
Parts and Service Facilities Address:  

 
4A New Way King Cobra Refuse Body Parts  

Percent of discount offered Cost + 20 No Bid 
Product identification (Manufacturer) New Way  
Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Dealer  
Price schedule number N/A  
Date of price schedule N/A  
Price schedule column on which discount is based        
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale)

Net  

4B Specified Items 
1 Wear Pad Shoes 116589 3

Price Each: $115.77  
Total Price: $347.31  
Manufacturer Name of Item Offered: New Way  
Part Name & Number Offered: Wear Pad Shoes116589  

2 Cylinder HYD 103680 3
Price Each: $624.57  
Total Price: $1,873.71  
Manufacturer Name of Item Offered: New Way  
Part Name & Number Offered: Cylinder Hyd 103680  

3 HYD Cylinder 111347 3
Price Each: $2,437.44  
Total Price: $7,312.32  
Manufacturer Name of Item Offered: New Way  
Part Name & Number Offered: Hyd Cyl 111347  

4 2 Section Valve 117742 4
Price Each: $1,983.60  
Total Price: $7,934.40  
Manufacturer Name of Item Offered: New Way  
Part Name & Number Offered: Valve 117742  

5 Toggle Valve on Front 101148 4
Price Each: $98.10  
Total Price: $392.40  
Manufacturer Name of Item Offered: New Way  
Part Name & Number Offered: Toggle Valve on Front 

101148
 

6 Single Joystick 121817 2
Price Each: $439.20  
Total Price: $878.40  
Manufacturer Name of Item Offered: New Way  
Part Name & Number Offered: Single Joystick 121817  
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 27, 2014

For: Refuse Trucks Body Parts & Service

Reliance Truck & Equipment, 
Ltd.

Texan Waste Equipment Inc. 
dba Heil Of Texas 

6100004511 LD 7200 South W. W. White Rd. 503 Pop Gunn

Item Description Qty
San Antonio,
TX  78222                            

San Antonio,                          
TX 78219                              

7 Cab Console Box 117881 2
Price Each: $419.94  
Total Price: $839.88  
Manufacturer Name of Item Offered: New Way  
Part Name & Number Offered: Cab Console Box 117881  

8 Relief Valve 51055-1 4
Price Each: $270.00  
Total Price: $1,080.00  
Manufacturer Name of Item Offered: New Way  
Part Name & Number Offered: Valve 51055-1  

9 Spring & Seal Kit 51799-1 4
Price Each: $77.90  
Total Price: $311.60  
Manufacturer Name of Item Offered: New Way  
Part Name & Number Offered: Kit 51799-1  

10 Lever Assembly 6105-1 4
Price Each: $579.60  
Total Price: $2,318.40  
Manufacturer Name of Item Offered: New Way  
Part Name & Number Offered: Lever 6105-1

New Way Sub Total: $23,288.42

4C Labor and Service
Labor and Service Rate: $60.00  
Expedited/Overtime Labor and Service Rate: $90.00  
Business hours are from ________ a.m. to ________ p.m. 
________ per week. 

8 a.m. to 4:30 p.m. 5 days 
per week

Parts and Service Facilities Name: Reliance Truck & Equipment, 
LTD.

 

Parts and Service Facilities Address: 7200 S. W. W. White Rd., 
San Antonio, TX 78222

Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30
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