
City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 3, 2013

For: Annual Contract for Erosion Control and Materials C-3 Environmental Geo-Solutions

6100002754 DS 132 Nell Deane Blvd. 7011 Bee Caves Road

Item Description Schertz,
TX 78154

Austin, 
TX 78746

1 Type 1A Ultra Short-Term Erosion Control Blanket - (< 60 days)
Manufacturer: NAG Western

Item Number:
DS150 SR-1, Rapid Go Netting 

(8' x 112.5)
Price per roll: $30.36 $27.50
Price per square yard: $0.38 0.275
Square yards per roll: 80 100

2 Type 1A Short-Term Erosion Control Blanket - (up to 12 months)
Manufacturer: NAG Western

Item Number:
S150 SR-1, Rapid Go Netting 

(8' x 112.5)
Price Per Roll: $25.01 $27.50
Price Per Square Yard: $0.31 0.275
Square Yards Per Roll: 80 100

3 Type 2A Extended-Term Erosion Control Blanket - (> 12 months and < 24 months)
Manufacturer: NAG Western
Item Number: SC150 CS-3 (7.5' x 120')
Price per roll: $69.00 $65.00
Price per square yard: $0.86 $0.65
Square yards per roll: 80 100

4 Type 3A LongTerm Erosion Control Blanket - (> 24 months and < 36 months)
Manufacturer: NAG Western
Item Number: C125 CC-4 (7.5' x 120')
Price per roll: $89.24 $75.00
Price per square yard: $1.11 $0.75
Square yards per roll: 80 100

5 Permanent Turf Reinforcement Mats (TRMs)
5A Type 1B Permanent Turf Reinforcement Mats (TRMs)

Manufacturer: T-RECS TRM Propex
Item Number: Landlok 435
Price per roll: $493.35 $280.00
Price per square yard: $8.22 $2.80
Square yards per roll: 60 100

5B Type 2B Permanent Turf Reinforcement Mats (TRMs)
Manufacturer: ECP2 TRM Propex
Item Number: Landlok 450
Price per roll: $345.00 $300.00
Price per square yard $3.45 $3.00
Square yards per roll 100 100

5C. Type 3B Permanent Turf Reinforcement Mats (TRMs)
Manufacturer: RECYC 1GX TRM Propex
Item Number: Pyramat
Price per roll: $218.50 $850.00
Price per square yard: $2.18 $10.00
Square yards per roll: 100 85

6 Accessories Needed for Installation of Temporary Erosion Control 
Blankets and Permanent Turf Reinforcement Mats

6.A.1. Wire Staples - Bulk
Manufacturer: Geo-Solutions, Inc.
Item Number: Staples 6" 11 gauge
Price Per 500: $12.65 n/a
Price Per 1,000: $25.30 $27.50
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6.A.2. Wire Staples - Cartridges
Manufacturer: No bid Discontinued
Item Number:
Price per 100:
Price per 500:

6.B.1. Biodegradable Stakes - 4 inch
Manufacturer: No bid Western
Item Number: 4" Bio-Stakes
Price per bundle: $40.25
Stakes per bundle: 500

6.B.2. Biodegradable Stakes - 6 inch
Manufacturer: No bid Western
Item Number: 6" Bio-Stake
Price per bundle: $50.75
Stakes per bundle: 500

6.C.1. Biodegradable Hardwood Stakes - 6 inch
Manufacturer: No bid North American Green
Item Number: 6" EcoStake
Price per bundle: $83.25
Stakes per bundle: 1,000

6.C.2. Biodegradable Hardwood Stakes - 12 inch
Manufacturer: No bid North American Green
Item Number: 12" EcoStake
Price per bundle: $78.75
Stakes per bundle: 500

6.C.3. Biodegradable Hardwood Stakes, Tapered - 18 inch
Manufacturer: No bid Easy Drive
Item Number: 18" Stake
Price per bundle: $12.00
Stakes per bundle: 50

6.C.4. Biodegradable Hardwood Stakes, Tapered - 24 inch
Manufacturer: No bid Easy Drive
Item Number: 24" Stake
Price per bundle: $13.50
Stakes per bundle: 50

6.D.1. Cartridge Staple Guns - Pneumatic
Manufacturer: No bid Discontinued
Item Number:
Price per each:

6.D.2. Cartridge Staple Guns - Manual
Manufacturer: No bid Discontinued
Item Number:
Price per each:

6.E.1. Cartridge Stake Guns - Pneumatic
Manufacturer: No bid Discontinued
Item Number:
Price per each:

6.E.2. Cartridge Stake Guns - Manual
Manufacturer: No bid North American Green
Item Number: F300B, Case of 24
Price per each: $518.50 per case

7.A. Temporay Sediment Control Fence w/ Stakes - 36" x 100'
Manufacturer: Geo-Solutions
Item Number:
Price per roll: $51.29 $40.00
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8 Biodegradable Sediment Filtration System
Manufacturer: No bid Western
Item Number: CS-3, (7.5' 120')
Price per roll: $65.00
Price per square yard: $0.65
Square yards per roll: $100.00

9 Gabion, Galvanized (Woven Wire Mesh) 
9.A. 6' length x 3' width x 3' height x 2 cells

Manufacturer: Terra Aqua Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $73.08 $60.25

9.B. 9' length x 3' width x 3' height x 3 cells
Manufacturer: Terra Aqua Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $104.19 $85.00

9.C. 12' length x 3' width x 3' height x 4 cells
Name of Manufacturer Terra Aqua Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $131.27 $95.50

9.D. 6' length x 3' width x 1.5' height x 2 cells
Manufacturer: Terra Aqua Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $54.10 $43.75

9.E. 9' length x 3' width x 1.5' height x 3 cells
Manufacturer: Terra Aqua Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $77.10 $60.25

9.F. 12' length x 3' width x 1.5' height x 4 cells
Manufacturer: Terra Aqua Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $96.08 $68.50

9.G. 6' length x 3' width x 1' height x 2 cells
Manufacturer: Terra Aqua Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $48.70 $39.00

9.H. 9' length x 3' width x 1' height x 3 cells
Manufacturer: Terra Aqua Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $74.95 $58.00

9.I. 12' length x 3' width x 1' height x 4 cells
Manufacturer: Terra Aqua Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $86.59 $61.50

10 Gabion, Galvanized (Woven Wire Mesh - PVC Coated) 
10.A. 6' length x 3' width x 3' height x 2 cells

Manufacturer: Terra Aqua Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $91.40 $70.75

10.B. 9' length x 3' width x 3' height x 3 cells
Manufacturer: Terra Aqua Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $131.15 $99.00
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10.C. 12' length x 3' width x 3' height x 4 cells
Manufacturer: Terra Aqua Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $141.73 $116.75

10.D. 6' length x 3' width x 1.5' height x 2 cells
Manufacturer: Terra Aqua Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $64.51 $49.75

10.E. 9' length x 3' width x 1.5' height x 3 cells
Manufacturer: Terra Aqua Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: 90.32 $70.75

10.F. 12' length x 3' width x 1.5' height x 4 cells
Manufacturer: Terra Aqua Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $112.41 $81.50

10.G. 6' length x 3' width x 1' height x 2 cells
Manufacturer: Terra Aqua Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $55.91 $45.00

10.H. 9' length x 3' width x 1' height x 3 cells
Manufacturer: Terra Aqua Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $80.64 $61.50

10.I. 12' length x 3' width x 1' height x 4 cells
Manufacturer: Terra Aqua Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $102.63 $72.00

11 Reno Mattress, Galvanized (Woven Wire Mesh) 
11.A. 9' length x 6' width x 6" height x 3 cells

Manufacturer: Terra Aqua Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $71.62 $71.25

11.B. 12' length x 6' width x 6" height x 4 cells
Manufacturer: Terra Aqua Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $107.26 $93.50

11.C. 9' length x 6' width x 9" height x 3 cells
Manufacturer: Terra Aqua Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $89.91 $78.00

11.D. 12' length x 6' width x 9" height x 4 cells
Manufacturer: Terra Aqua Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $115.42 $102.75

11.E. 12' length x 6' width x 12" height x 4 cells
Manufacturer: Terra Aqua Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $119.51 $106.75

11.F. 15' length x 3' width x 6" height x 5 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $54.75
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11.G. 15' length x 3' width x 9" height x 5 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $60.50

11.H. 15' length x 3' width x 12" height x 5 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $67.00

11.I. 15' length x 6' width x 6" height x 5 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $107.00

11.J. 15' length x 6' width x 9" height x 5 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $118.25

11.K. 15' length x 6' width x 12" height x 5 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $122.50

11.L. 18' length x 3' width x 6" height x 6 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $66.00

11.M. 18' length x 3' width x 9" height x 6 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $72.50

11.N. 18' length x 3' width x 12" height x 6 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per Each $102.50

11.O. 18' length x 6' width x 6" height x 6 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $128.25

11.P. 18' length x 6' width x 9" height x 6 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $141.50

11.Q. 18' length x 6' width x 12" height x 6 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $147.00

11.R. 21' length x 3' width x 6" height x 7 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $77.00

11.S. 21' length x 3' width x 9" height x 7 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $84.75
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11.T. 21' length x 3' width x 12" height x 7 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $93.75

11.U. 21' length x 6' width x 6" height x 7 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $149.25

11.V. 21' length x 6' width x 9" height x 7 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $164.75

11.W. 21' length x 6' width x 12" height x 7 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $171.50

11.X. 24' length x 3' width x 6" height x 8 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $88.25

11.Y. 24' length x 3' width x 9" height x 8 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $97.00

11.AA. 24' length x 3' width x 12" height x 8 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $107.00

11.AB. 24' length x 6' width x 6" height x 8 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $170.50

11.AC. 24' length x 6' width x 9" height x 8 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $188.25

11.AD. 24' length x 6' width x 12" height x 8 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $196.00

11.AE. 27' length x 3' width x 6" height x 9 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $94.25

11.AF. 27' length x 3' width x 9" height x 9 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $109.25

11.AG. 27' length x 3' width x 12" height x 9 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $120.50
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11.AH. 27' length x 6' width x 6" height x 9 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $191.50

11.AI. 27' length x 6' width x 9" height x 9 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $211.50

11.AJ. 27' length x 6' width x 12" height x 9 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $220.50

11.AK. 30' length x 6' width x 6" height x 10 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $110.50

11.AL. 30' length x 3' width x 9" height x 10 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $121.50

11.AM. 30' length x 3' width x 12" height x 10 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $133.75

11.AN. 30' length x 6' width x 6" height x 10 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $212.50

11.AO. 30' length x 6' width x 9" height x 10 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $234.75

11.AP. 30' length x 6' width x 12" height x 10 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $308.75

12 Reno Mattress, Galvanized (Woven Wire Mesh - PVC Coated) 
12.A. 9' length x 6' width x 6" height x 3 cells

Manufacturer: Terra Aqua Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $112.90 $79.25

12.B. 12' length x 6' width x 6" height x 4 cells
Manufacturer: Terra Aqua Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $143.01 $105.25

12.C. 9' length x 6' width x 9" height x 3 cells
Manufacturer: Terra Aqua Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $122.57 $87.50

12.D. 12' length x 6' width x 9" height x 4 cells
Manufacturer: Terra Aqua Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $152.68 $115.75
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12.E. 9' length x 6' width x 12" height x 3 cells
Manufacturer: Terra Aqua Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $129.36 $97.00

12.F. 12' length x 6' width x 12" height x 4 cells
Manufacturer: Terra Aqua Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $159.13 $120.50

12.G. 15' length x 3' width x 6" height x 5 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $73.75

12.H. 15' length x 3' width x 9" height x 5 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $81.25

12.I. 15' length x 3' width x 12" height x 5 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $80.50

12.J. 15' length x 6' width x 6" height x 5 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $128.25

12.K. 15' length x 6' width x 9" height x 5 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $141.50

12.L. 15' length x 6' width x 12" height x 5 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $145.50

12.M. 18' length x 3' width x 6" height x 6 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $79.25

12.N. 18' length x 3' width x 9" height x 6 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $87.00

12.O. 18' length x 3' width x 12" height x 6 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $96.00

12.P. 18' length x 6' width x 6" height x 6 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each $153.75

12.Q. 18' length x 6' width x 9" height x 6 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $164.25
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12.R. 18' length x 6' width x 12" height x 6 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $176.00

12.S. 21' length x 3' width x 6" height x 7 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $92.50

12.T. 21' length x 3' width x 9" height x 7 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $101.50

12.U. 21' length x 3' width x 12" height x 7 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $112.50

12.V. 21' length x 6' width x 6" height x 7 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $179.25

12.W. 21' length x 6' width x 9" height x 7 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $198.25

12.X. 21' length x 6' width x 12" height x 7 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $206.00

12.Y. 24' length x 3' width x 6" height x 8 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $106.00

12.Z. 24' length x 3' width x 9" height x 8 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $116.00

12.AA. 24' length x 3' width x 12" height x 8 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $128.25

12.AB. 24' length x 6' width x 6" height x 8 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $204.75

12.AC. 24' length x 6' width x 9" height x 8 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $224.75

12.AD. 24' length x 6' width x 12" height x 8 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $234.75
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12.AE. 27' length x 3' width x 6" height x 9 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $119.25

12.AF. 27' length x 3' width x 9" height x 9 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $131.50

12.AG. 27' length x 3' width x 12" height x 9 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $144.75

12.AH. 27' length x 6' width x 6" height x 9 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $229.25

12.AI. 27' length x 6' width x 9" height x 9 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $253.75

12.AJ. 27' length x 6' width x 12" height x 9 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $263.75

12.AK. 30' length x 3' width x 6" height x 10 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $132.50

12.AL. 30' length x 3' width x 9" height x 10 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $146.00

12.AM. 30' length x 3' width x 12" height x 10 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $160.50

12.AN. 30' length x 6' width x 6" height x 10 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $254.75

12.AO. 30' length x 6' width x 9" height x 10 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $281.50

12.AP. 30' length x 6' width x 12" height x 10 cells
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per each: $293.75

13 Rock Filter Dams
13.A. 20 Gauge Galvanized Wire - 6' x 150" rolls (for use with Types 1, 2, & 3)

Manufacturer: G C Supply
Item Number: Poultry netting 6' x 150'
Price per roll: $87.97 $78.75
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13.B. Type 4 Sack Gabions (Reinforced) - 2' width x 3' length
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per roll: $22.50

13.C. Type 4 Sack Gabions (Reinforced) - 2' width x 6' length
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per roll: $27.00

13.D. Type 4 Sack Gabions (Reinforced) - 2' width x 9' length
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per roll: $39.25

13.E. Type 4 Sack Gabions (Reinforced) - 3' width x 3' length
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per roll: $26.00

13.F. Type 4 Sack Gabions (Reinforced) - 3' width x 6' length
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per roll: $31.50

13.G. Type 4 Sack Gabions (Reinforced) - 3' width x 9' length
Manufacturer: No bid Maccaferri
Item Number:
Price per roll: $46.00

14 Curb, Gutter, and Median Inlet Protection
14.A. Curb Bag

Manufacturer: Dandy
Item Number: GeoCurve
Price per each: $86.25 $35.00

14.B. Curb Block
Manufacturer: No bid Dandy
Item Number: Curb 10'
Price per each: $82.25

14.C. Curb Sack
Manufacturer: Dandy
Item Number: Curb Sack 4' x 2'
Price per each: 86.25 $48.50

15 Flat Grate and Mountable Curb Inlet Protection
15.A. Bag

Manufacturer: Dandy
Item Number: Bag
Price per each: $86.25 $36.00

15.B. Sack
Manufacturer: Pollution Solutions
Item Number: Yellow Jacket 34 3 x 4
Price per each: $86.25 $50.00
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15.C. Pop Up
Manufacturer: No bid Dandy
Item Number: Pop
Price per each: $83.25

16 Warning Barrier Fencing
16.A. 4' width x 100' length (4.5" x 2.0" aperature size)

Manufacturer: CDOW
Item Number: Safety Fence
Price per roll: $22.71 $19.75

16.B. 4' width x 100' length (3.5" x 1.3" aperature size)
Manufacturer: CDOW
Item Number: Safety Fence
Price per roll: $55.77 $19.75

17 T-Post
17.A. Lightweight T-post

Manufacturer: W. Silver
Item Number: 6' 1.25
Price per 100: $2.02 $406.25
Price per 500: $2.02 $2,031.25

17.B. Heavy weight T-post
Manufacturer: W. Silver
Item Number: 6' 1.33
Price per 100: $2.85 $412.50
Price per 500: $2.85 $2,062.50

18 Non-Woven Geotextiles
Manufacturer: Terra Tex Mirafi
Item Number: 160N
Price per roll: $368.00 $495.00
Price per square yard: $0.61 $0.99
Square yards per roll: 600 500

19 Hydraulic Mulches
19.A. Wood Fiber/Cellulose Fiber Blend

Manufacturer: Enviro-Mix Central Fiber
Item Number: Wood Fiber Blend
Price per bag: $11.21 $9.65
Pounds per bag: 50 50

19.B. Wood Fiber
Manufacturer: Enviro-Gold Central Fiber
Item Number: Wood Fiber
Price per bag: $12.93 $10.65
Pounds per bag: 50 50

19.C. Cellulose Fiber
Manufacturer: Enviro Grow Central Fiber
Item Number: Paper Fiber
Price per bag: $10.17 $9.40
Pounds per bag: 50 50

20 Flexible Growth Medium- FGM
Manufacturer: Earth Guard Profile Products
Item Number: Flexterra HP-FGM
Price per bag: $35.60 $40.75
Pounds per bag: 50 50

Prompt Payment Discount: Net 30 1/2% 10 Days
Delivery: 3-Days 3-Days
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