City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 27, 2013

For: Firefighting Flashlights, Batteries and Bulbs
Casco Industries Fire Supply Sunbelt Mill Supply [T S C Distributing Unistore Direct
Incorporated Inc. LLC
6100002608 VF 607 W. 62nd Street 500 W. Railroad Ave |7715 Grissom Rd. 3828 Knoll Dr. 222 Seale Rd.
Estimated |Shreveport, Godley, San Antonio, Amarillo, San Antonio,
Iltem Description Annual |LA 71106 TX 76044 TX 78251 TX 79110-4402 TX 78219
Usage

Flashlights

1A Streamlight SL-20XP Rechargeable Flashlight 10
Price Each $85.87 $71.67 $70.91 $75.00 $83.47
Price Total $858.70 $716.70 $709.10 $750.00 $834.70
Manufacturer Streamlight Streamlight Streamlight Streamlight Streamlight
Manufacturer Part No. 25031 25027 25027 25027 SL-20XP (25027)

1B Streamlight LiteBox SL-45 Rechargeable Flashlight 10
Price Each $112.58 $109.05 $107.41 $113.00 $125.19
Price Total $1,125.80 $1,090.50 $1,074.10 $1,130.00 $1,251.90
Manufacturer Streamlight| Streamlight| Streamlight| Streamlight| Streamlight|
Manufacturer Part No. 45116 45110 45110 15110 SL-45 (45110),

1Cc Streamlight Survivor LED, Class 1, DIV 2 Flashlight 100
Price Each $102.88 $99.69 $98.18 $103.00 $117.86
Price Total $10,288.00 $9,969.00 $9,818.00 $10,300.00 $11,786.00
Manufacturer Streamlight| Streamlight| Streamlight| Streamlight Inc. Streamlight|
Manufacturer Part No. 90503 90503 90503 90503 Survivor (90503)

1D Koehler-Bright Star Division 1 Responder Flashlight 50
Price Each No Bid No Bid $153.40 $169.00 $157.41
Price Total $7,670.00 $8,450.00 $7,870.50
Manufacturer Koehler-Bright Star| ~ Koehler Bright Star| ~ Koehler-Bright Star
Manufacturer Part No. 500221 500221 500221

1E Streamlight Fire Vulcan LED Rechargeable Lantern Flashlight 50
Price Each $148.08 $137.41 $141.28 $149.00 $158.48
Price Total $7,404.00 $6,870.50 $7,064.00 $7,450.00 $7,924.00
Manufacturer Streamlight| Streamlight| Streamlight Streamlight| Streamlight
Manufacturer Part No. 44450 44450 44450 44450 44450
Flashlight Batteries

2A Batteries for Streamlight SL-20X, PN 20170 10
Price Each $30.42 $31.04 $29.03 $31.00 $30.46
Price Total $304.20 $310.40 $290.30 $310.00 $304.60
Manufacturer Streamlight Streamlight Streamlight Streamlight Inc. Streamlight
Manufacturer Part No. 20170 20170 20170 20170 SL-20X
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2B Batteries for Streamlight SL-20XP, PN 25170 10
Price Each $30.42 $31.04 $29.03 $31.00 $30.46
Price Total $304.20 $310.40 $290.30 $310.00 $304.60
Manufacturer Streamlight Streamlight, Streamlight Streamlight Inc. Streamlight
Manufacturer Part No. 25170 25170 25170 25170 SL-20XP

2C Batteries for Streamlight Litebox SL-45, PN 45937 10
Price Each $30.42 $31.04 $29.03 $31.00 $30.46
Price Total $304.20 $310.40 $290.30 $310.00 $304.60
Manufacturer Streamlight Streamlight| Streamlight Streamlight Inc. Streamlight|
Manufacturer Part No. 45937 45937 45937 45937 SL-45 (45937)

2D Batteries for Streamlgiht SL-90 Survivor, PN 90338 100
Price Each $30.20 $29.99 $28.81 $31.00 $30.23
Price Total $3,020.00 $2,999.00 $2,881.00 $3,100.00 $3,023.00
Manufacturer Streamlight Streamlight Streamlight Streamlight Inc. Streamlight
Manufacturer Part No. 90338 90338 Not Specified 90338 90338

2E Batteries for Koehler Flashlight, PN 500201-N 10
Price Each No Bid No Bid $62.12 $31.00 $63.72
Price Total $621.20 $310.00 $637.20
Manufacturer Koehler-Bright Star| ~ Koehler Bright Star| ~ Koehler Bright Star
Manufacturer Part No. 500201-N 500201-N 500201-N
Flashlight Bulbs

3A Bulbs for Streamlight SL-20X, PN 20110 10
Price Each $11.27 $11.13 $10.75 $11.50 $11.29
Price Total $112.70 $111.30 $107.50 $115.00 $112.90
Manufacturer Streamlight Streamlight Streamlight Streamlight Inc. Streamlight
Manufacturer Part No. 20110 20110 20110 20110 20110 (SL-20X)

3B Bulbs for Streamlight SL-20XP, PN 25107 10
Price Each $11.27 $11.13 $10.75 $11.50 $11.29
Price Total $112.70 $111.30 $107.50 $115.00 $112.90
Manufacturer Streamlight| Streamlight Streamlight| Streamlight Inc. Streamlight|
Manufacturer Part No. 25107 25107 25107 25107 25107

3C Bulbs for Streamlight Survivor SL-45, PN 45901 10
Price Each $5.74 $5.98 $5.47 $6.00 $5.76
Price Total $57.40 $59.80 $54.70 $60.00 $57.60
Manufacturer Streamlight| Streamlight Streamlight| Streamlight Inc. Streamlight|
Manufacturer Part No. 45901 45901 45901 45901 45901
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3D  [Bulbs for SL-90 Survivor, PN 90320 10
Price Each $5.74 $5.98 $5.47 $6.00 $6.65
Price Total $57.40 $59.80 $54.70 $60.00 $66.50
Manufacturer Streamlight| Streamlight Streamlight| Streamlight Inc. Streamlight|
Manufacturer Part No. 90320 90320 90320 90320 90320
3E Bulbs for Koehler Responder Div 1, PN 500310 10
Price Each No Bid No Bid $19.35 $10.50 $21.97
Price Total $193.50 $105.00 $219.70
Manufacturer Koehler-Bright Star|  Koehler Bright Star|  Koehler Bright Star|
Manufacturer Part No. 500310, PN 500310 500310,
Delivery 14 Days 14 - 21 Days 4 Days 10 Days| 2 - 4 Weeks
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 1% 10 Days Net 30

Estimated Annual Total

Estimated Annual Award
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