
City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: February 11, 2013

For:        Lawn Maintenance for DHS, Library, and Fire Locations Cantu Contracting, Inc. CTX Cleaning Services
 and Home Repair

La Med Facility 
Maintenance, Inc.

Pro Landscape Solutions RK Construction Co.

AV 3396 Rabel Rd. 10707 IH-35 N 10815 Gulfdale 1411 Range Finder PO Box 781243
Item Description Est. Annual 

Cycles
San Antonio, 
TX 78221

Austin, 
TX 78714

San Antonio, 
TX 78216

San Antonio, 
TX 78245

San Antonio, 
TX 78278

1 Landscape Maintenance - Libraries (locations with irrigation)

Bazan Branch Library 21
Cost Per Cycle $155.00 $300.00 $165.00 $65.00 $195.00
Total Cost $3,255.00 $6,300.00 $3,465.00 $1,365.00 $4,095.00

Brook Hollow Branch Library 21
Cost Per Cycle $185.00 $300.00 $250.00 $95.00 $195.00
Total Cost $3,885.00 $6,300.00 $5,250.00 $1,995.00 $4,095.00

Carver Branch Library 21
Cost Per Cycle $170.00 $300.00 $250.00 $38.00 $185.00
Total Cost $3,570.00 $6,300.00 $5,250.00 $798.00 $3,885.00

Central Library 21
Cost Per Cycle $305.00 $300.00 $165.00 $48.00 $365.00
Total Cost $6,405.00 $6,300.00 $3,465.00 $1,008.00 $7,665.00

Cody Branch Library 21
Cost Per Cycle $275.00 $300.00 $165.00 $56.00 $165.00
Total Cost $5,775.00 $6,300.00 $3,465.00 $1,176.00 $3,465.00

Cortez Branch Library 21
Cost Per Cycle $130.00 $300.00 $165.00 $30.00 $285.00
Total Cost $2,730.00 $6,300.00 $3,465.00 $630.00 $5,985.00

Great Northwest Branch Library 21
Cost Per Cycle $285.00 $300.00 $165.00 $40.00 $325.00
Total Cost $5,985.00 $6,300.00 $3,465.00 $840.00 $6,825.00

Guerra Branch Library 21
Cost Per Cycle $355.00 $300.00 $125.00 $86.00 $185.00
Total Cost $7,455.00 $6,300.00 $2,625.00 $1,806.00 $3,885.00

Igo Branch Library 21
Cost Per Cycle $350.00 $300.00 $165.00 $86.00 $275.00
Total Cost $7,350.00 $6,300.00 $3,465.00 $1,806.00 $5,775.00

Las Palmas Branch Library 21
Cost Per Cycle $125.00 $300.00 $165.00 $58.00 $165.00
Total Cost $2,625.00 $6,300.00 $3,465.00 $1,218.00 $3,465.00

Maverick Branch Library 21
Cost Per Cycle $325.00 $300.00 $165.00 $150.00 $185.00
Total Cost $6,825.00 $6,300.00 $3,465.00 $3,150.00 $3,885.00

Mission Branch Library (includes open field mowing and chlorination) 21
Cost Per Cycle $410.00 $300.00 $155.00 $400.00 $485.00
Total Cost $8,610.00 $6,300.00 $3,255.00 $8,400.00 $10,185.00
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Parman Branch Library 21
Cost Per Cycle $425.00 $300.00 $165.00 $675.00 $385.00
Total Cost $8,925.00 $6,300.00 $3,465.00 $14,175.00 $8,085.00

Semmes Branch Library 21
Cost Per Cycle $375.00 $300.00 $165.00 $330.00 $195.00
Total Cost $7,875.00 $6,300.00 $3,465.00 $6,930.00 $4,095.00

Thousand Oaks Branch Library 21
Cost Per Cycle $325.00 $300.00 $250.00 $95.00 $185.00
Total Cost $6,825.00 $6,300.00 $5,250.00 $1,995.00 $3,885.00

Sub Total $88,095.00 $94,500.00 $56,280.00 $47,292.00 $79,275.00

2 Landscape Maintenance - Libraries (locations without irrigation)

Collins Branch Library 21
Cost Per Cycle $175.00 $150.00 $125.00 $45.00 $185.00
Total Cost $3,675.00 $3,150.00 $2,625.00 $945.00 $3,885.00

Forest Hills Branch Library 21
Cost Per Cycle $275.00 $150.00 $165.00 $38.00 $195.00
Total Cost $5,775.00 $3,150.00 $3,465.00 $798.00 $4,095.00

Johnston Branch Library 21
Cost Per Cycle $125.00 $150.00 $165.00 $35.00 $185.00
Total Cost $2,625.00 $3,150.00 $3,465.00 $735.00 $3,885.00

McCreless Branch Library 21
Cost Per Cycle $150.00 $150.00 $145.00 $48.00 $185.00
Total Cost $3,150.00 $3,150.00 $3,045.00 $1,008.00 $3,885.00

Memorial Branch Library 21
Cost Per Cycle $165.00 $150.00 $185.00 $60.00 $185.00
Total Cost $3,465.00 $3,150.00 $3,885.00 $1,260.00 $3,885.00

Pan American Branch Library 21
Cost Per Cycle $155.00 $150.00 $165.00 $35.00 $185.00
Total Cost $3,255.00 $3,150.00 $3,465.00 $735.00 $3,885.00

San Pedro Branch Library 21
Cost Per Cycle $185.00 $150.00 $165.00 $65.00 $165.00
Total Cost $3,885.00 $3,150.00 $3,465.00 $1,365.00 $3,465.00

Tobin @ Oawell Branch Library 21
Cost Per Cycle $250.00 $150.00 $165.00 $50.00 $185.00
Total Cost $5,250.00 $3,150.00 $3,465.00 $1,050.00 $3,885.00

Westfall Branch Library 21
Cost Per Cycle $255.00 $150.00 $165.00 $55.00 $185.00
Total Cost $5,355.00 $3,150.00 $3,465.00 $1,155.00 $3,885.00

Sub Total $36,435.00 $28,350.00 $30,345.00 $9,051.00 $34,755.00
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3 Landscape Maintenance - DHS (locations with irrigation)

Willie Cortez 21
Cost Per Cycle $150.00 $300.00 $165.00 No Bid $175.00
Total Cost $3,150.00 $6,300.00 $3,465.00 $3,675.00

Willie Velasquez 21
Cost Per Cycle $135.00 $300.00 $165.00 No Bid $175.00
Total Cost $2,835.00 $6,300.00 $3,465.00 $3,675.00

Frank Garrett/West End 21
Cost Per Cycle $205.00 $300.00 $165.00 No Bid $245.00
Total Cost $4,305.00 $6,300.00 $3,465.00 $5,145.00

Bob Ross 21
Cost Per Cycle $175.00 $300.00 $165.00 No Bid $245.00
Total Cost $3,675.00 $6,300.00 $3,465.00 $5,145.00

Columbia Heights 21
Cost Per Cycle $170.00 $300.00 $165.00 No Bid $175.00
Total Cost $3,570.00 $6,300.00 $3,465.00 $3,675.00

Ferrari 21
Cost Per Cycle $180.00 $300.00 $165.00 No Bid $175.00
Total Cost $3,780.00 $6,300.00 $3,465.00 $3,675.00

Billa 21
Cost Per Cycle $125.00 $300.00 $165.00 No Bid $195.00
Total Cost $2,625.00 $6,300.00 $3,465.00 $4,095.00

St. Mary's 21
Cost Per Cycle $170.00 $300.00 $165.00 No Bid $175.00
Total Cost $3,570.00 $6,300.00 $3,465.00 $3,675.00

Sub Total $27,510.00 $50,400.00 $27,720.00 $0.00 $32,760.00

4 Landscape Maintenance - DHS (locations without irrigation)

Claude Black 21
Cost Per Cycle $165.00 $150.00 $165.00 No Bid $175.00
Total Cost $3,465.00 $3,150.00 $3,465.00 $3,675.00

District 2 21
Cost Per Cycle $105.00 $150.00 $165.00 No Bid $245.00
Total Cost $2,205.00 $3,150.00 $3,465.00 $5,145.00

District 5 21
Cost Per Cycle $95.00 $150.00 $165.00 No Bid $250.00
Total Cost $1,995.00 $3,150.00 $3,465.00 $5,250.00
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Kenwood 21
Cost Per Cycle $140.00 $150.00 $165.00 No Bid $195.00
Total Cost $2,940.00 $3,150.00 $3,465.00 $4,095.00

District 10 21
Cost Per Cycle $180.00 $150.00 $165.00 No Bid $275.00
Total Cost $3,780.00 $3,150.00 $3,465.00 $5,775.00

Benavides 21
Cost Per Cycle $130.00 $150.00 $165.00 No Bid $175.00
Total Cost $2,730.00 $3,150.00 $3,465.00 $3,675.00

Huantes 21
Cost Per Cycle $155.00 $150.00 $165.00 No Bid $175.00
Total Cost $3,255.00 $3,150.00 $3,465.00 $3,675.00

Sub Total $20,370.00 $22,050.00 $24,255.00 $0.00 $31,290.00

5 On Call Open Field Mowing

Fire Academy (10 acres) 8
Cost Per Cycle $870.00 $3,000.00 $1,250.00 $450.00 $850.00
Total Cost $6,960.00 $24,000.00 $10,000.00 $3,600.00 $6,800.00

Fire Station No. 49 (3/4 acre) 8
Cost Per Cycle $150.00 $225.00 $125.00 $150.00 $175.00
Total Cost $1,200.00 $1,800.00 $1,000.00 $1,200.00 $1,400.00

SAFD Warehouse (1/4 acre) 8
Cost Per Cycle $105.00 $75.00 $125.00 $85.00 $175.00
Total Cost $840.00 $600.00 $1,000.00 $680.00 $1,400.00

Nolan Street Houses (1/4 acre) 8
Cost Per Cycle $120.00 $75.00 $125.00 $85.00 $175.00
Total Cost $960.00 $600.00 $1,000.00 $680.00 $1,400.00

Fire Station No. 48 (3/4 acre) 8
Cost Per Cycle $155.00 $225.00 $125.00 $150.00 $175.00
Total Cost $1,240.00 $1,800.00 $1,000.00 $1,200.00 $1,400.00

Fire Station No. 46 (1/2 acre) 8
Cost Per Cycle $120.00 $150.00 $125.00 $150.00 $175.00
Total Cost $960.00 $1,200.00 $1,000.00 $1,200.00 $1,400.00

Fire Station No. 29 (1/4 acre) 8
Cost Per Cycle $105.00 $75.00 $125.00 $85.00 $175.00
Total Cost $840.00 $600.00 $1,000.00 $680.00 $1,400.00
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Fire Station No. 2 (3/4 acre) 8
Cost Per Cycle $135.00 $225.00 $125.00 $150.00 $175.00
Total Cost $1,080.00 $1,800.00 $1,000.00 $1,200.00 $1,400.00

New Fire Station No. 2 Lot (1 1/2 acres) 8
Cost Per Cycle $125.00 $450.00 $187.50 $175.00 $275.00
Total Cost $1,000.00 $3,600.00 $1,500.00 $1,400.00 $2,200.00

Fire Station No. 20 (3/4 acre) 8
Cost Per Cycle $150.00 $225.00 $125.00 $150.00 $175.00
Total Cost $1,200.00 $1,800.00 $1,000.00 $1,200.00 $1,400.00

Fire Station No. 25 (1 acre) 8
Cost Per Cycle $170.00 $300.00 $125.00 $160.00 $200.00
Total Cost $1,360.00 $2,400.00 $1,000.00 $1,280.00 $1,600.00

Fire Station No. 42 (3/4 acre) 8
Cost Per Cycle $150.00 $225.00 $125.00 $150.00 $175.00
Total Cost $1,200.00 $1,800.00 $1,000.00 $1,200.00 $1,400.00

Fire Station No. 27 (1/2 acre) 8
Cost Per Cycle $125.00 $150.00 $125.00 $150.00 $175.00
Total Cost $1,000.00 $1,200.00 $1,000.00 $1,200.00 $1,400.00

Fire Station No. 50 (1 1/2 acre) 8
Cost Per Cycle $175.00 $450.00 $187.50 $175.00 $275.00
Total Cost $1,400.00 $3,600.00 $1,500.00 $1,400.00 $2,200.00

Sub Total $21,240.00 $46,800.00 $24,000.00 $18,120.00 $26,800.00

Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 2% 10 Days

 Total $193,650.00 $242,100.00 $162,600.00 $74,463.00 $204,880.00
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Item Description Est. Annual 

Cycles
1 Landscape Maintenance - Libraries (locations with irrigation)

Bazan Branch Library 21
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

Brook Hollow Branch Library 21
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

Carver Branch Library 21
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

Central Library 21
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

Cody Branch Library 21
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

Cortez Branch Library 21
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

Great Northwest Branch Library 21
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

Guerra Branch Library 21
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

Igo Branch Library 21
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

Las Palmas Branch Library 21
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

Maverick Branch Library 21
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

Mission Branch Library (includes open field mowing and chlorination) 21
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

6100002328

Ron's Lawns Plus TruGreen Landcare, Inc.

10718 Shaen Crossing 214 Recoleta
San Antonio, 
TX 78254

San Antonio, 
TX 78216

$155.00 $121.00
$3,255.00 $2,541.00

$130.00 $121.00
$2,730.00 $2,541.00

$200.00 $88.00
$4,200.00 $1,848.00

$225.00 $209.00
$4,725.00 $4,389.00

$120.00 $198.00
$2,520.00 $4,158.00

$200.00 $176.00
$4,200.00 $3,696.00

$150.00 $264.00
$3,150.00 $5,544.00

$175.00 $308.00
$3,675.00 $6,468.00

$350.00 $248.00
$7,350.00 $5,208.00

$165.00 $130.00
$3,465.00 $2,730.00

$200.00 $210.00
$4,200.00 $4,410.00

$1,500.00 $285.00
$31,500.00 $5,985.00
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Parman Branch Library 21
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

Semmes Branch Library 21
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

Thousand Oaks Branch Library 21
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

Sub Total

2 Landscape Maintenance - Libraries (locations without irrigation)

Collins Branch Library 21
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

Forest Hills Branch Library 21
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

Johnston Branch Library 21
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

McCreless Branch Library 21
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

Memorial Branch Library 21
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

Pan American Branch Library 21
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

San Pedro Branch Library 21
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

Tobin @ Oawell Branch Library 21
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

Westfall Branch Library 21
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

Sub Total

Ron's Lawns Plus TruGreen Landcare, Inc.

10718 Shaen Crossing 214 Recoleta
San Antonio, 
TX 78254

San Antonio, 
TX 78216

$400.00 $175.00
$8,400.00 $3,675.00

$450.00 $225.00
$9,450.00 $4,725.00

$175.00 $110.00
$3,675.00 $2,310.00

$96,495.00 $60,228.00

$140.00 $105.00
$2,940.00 $2,205.00

$100.00 $116.00
$2,100.00 $2,436.00

$175.00 $98.00
$3,675.00 $2,058.00

$90.00 $78.00
$1,890.00 $1,638.00

$200.00 $110.00
$4,200.00 $2,310.00

$160.00 $80.00
$3,360.00 $1,680.00

$325.00 $132.00
$6,825.00 $2,772.00

$175.00 $107.00
$3,675.00 $2,247.00

$165.00 $110.00
$3,465.00 $2,310.00

$32,130.00 $19,656.00
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3 Landscape Maintenance - DHS (locations with irrigation)

Willie Cortez 21
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

Willie Velasquez 21
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

Frank Garrett/West End 21
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

Bob Ross 21
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

Columbia Heights 21
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

Ferrari 21
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

Billa 21
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

St. Mary's 21
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

Sub Total

4 Landscape Maintenance - DHS (locations without irrigation)

Claude Black 21
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

District 2 21
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

District 5 21
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

Ron's Lawns Plus TruGreen Landcare, Inc.

10718 Shaen Crossing 214 Recoleta
San Antonio, 
TX 78254

San Antonio, 
TX 78216

$275.00 $75.00
$5,775.00 $1,575.00

$175.00 $100.00
$3,675.00 $2,100.00

$400.00 $150.00
$8,400.00 $3,150.00

$60.00 $100.00
$1,260.00 $2,100.00

$125.00 $75.00
$2,625.00 $1,575.00

$800.00 $100.00
$16,800.00 $2,100.00

$200.00 $75.00
$4,200.00 $1,575.00

$100.00 $100.00
$2,100.00 $2,100.00

$44,835.00 $16,275.00

$250.00 $200.00
$5,250.00 $4,200.00

$50.00 $150.00
$1,050.00 $3,150.00

$30.00 $300.00
$630.00 $6,300.00
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Kenwood 21
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

District 10 21
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

Benavides 21
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

Huantes 21
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

Sub Total

5 On Call Open Field Mowing

Fire Academy (10 acres) 8
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

Fire Station No. 49 (3/4 acre) 8
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

SAFD Warehouse (1/4 acre) 8
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

Nolan Street Houses (1/4 acre) 8
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

Fire Station No. 48 (3/4 acre) 8
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

Fire Station No. 46 (1/2 acre) 8
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

Fire Station No. 29 (1/4 acre) 8
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

Ron's Lawns Plus TruGreen Landcare, Inc.

10718 Shaen Crossing 214 Recoleta
San Antonio, 
TX 78254

San Antonio, 
TX 78216

$100.00 $100.00
$2,100.00 $2,100.00

$275.00 $50.00
$5,775.00 $1,050.00

$200.00 $50.00
$4,200.00 $1,050.00

$275.00 $100.00
$5,775.00 $2,100.00

$24,780.00 $19,950.00

$1,200.00 $880.00
$9,600.00 $7,040.00

$150.00 $165.00
$1,200.00 $1,320.00

$40.00 $55.00
$320.00 $440.00

$30.00 $94.00
$240.00 $752.00

$175.00 $135.00
$1,400.00 $1,080.00

$300.00 $80.00
$2,400.00 $640.00

$75.00 $80.00
$600.00 $640.00
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Fire Station No. 2 (3/4 acre) 8
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

New Fire Station No. 2 Lot (1 1/2 acres) 8
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

Fire Station No. 20 (3/4 acre) 8
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

Fire Station No. 25 (1 acre) 8
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

Fire Station No. 42 (3/4 acre) 8
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

Fire Station No. 27 (1/2 acre) 8
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

Fire Station No. 50 (1 1/2 acre) 8
Cost Per Cycle
Total Cost

Sub Total

Payment Terms

 Total 

Ron's Lawns Plus TruGreen Landcare, Inc.

10718 Shaen Crossing 214 Recoleta
San Antonio, 
TX 78254

San Antonio, 
TX 78216

$125.00 $135.00
$1,000.00 $1,080.00

$175.00 $225.00
$1,400.00 $1,800.00

$100.00 $125.00
$800.00 $1,000.00

$90.00 $180.00
$720.00 $1,440.00

$125.00 $110.00
$1,000.00 $880.00

$200.00 $80.00
$1,600.00 $640.00

$125.00 $225.00
$1,000.00 $1,800.00

$23,280.00 $20,552.00

Net 30 Net 30

$221,520.00 $136,661.00
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