
City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened:  September 26, 2012
For: Asphalt and Pothole Paving Materials

HD Supply White Cap 
Construction

Vulcan Construction 
Materials, LP

6100001863 CMC
10500 Broadway St. 800 Isom Road, Ste. 

300

Item Description

Estimated 
Annual 

Quantity

San Antonio,
TX 78217

San Antonio, 
TX 78279

1 Cold Mix Limestone Rock Asphalt Pavement
Price per ton delivered 7,000 $135.00 $55.00
Price per ton picked up 500 $135.00 $37.00
Price Total $1,012,500.00 $403,500.00

2 Hot-Mix Cold Laid Asphaltic Concrete Pavement 500 No Bid
Price per ton picked up $60.00
Price Total $30,000.00

3 Hot-Mix Asphaltic Concrete Pavement - Type D No Bid
Price per ton delivered (belly or lift dump truck) 1,500 $60.00
Price per ton delivered (horizontal discharge trucks, flow boy) 1,000 No Bid
Price per ton picked up 56,800 $53.00
Price Total $3,100,400.00

4 Hot-Mix Asphaltic Concrete Pavement - Type C No Bid
Price per ton picked up 500 $52.00
Price Total $26,000.00

5 Hot-Mix Asphaltic Concrete Pavement - Type B No Bid
Price per ton delivered 1,000 $57.00
Price per ton picked up 14,000 $50.00
Price Total $757,000.00

6 Hot-Mix Asphaltic Concrete Pavement - Type D with G.T.R. - 10 No Bid
Price per ton picked up 550 $60.00
Price Total $33,000.00

7 Reclaimable Asphaltic Credit 15,000 No Bid
Credit per Ton $1.00
Credit Total -$15,000.00

Delivery 1-2 Days 1 Day

Payment Terms Net  30 Net 30

Estimated Annual Total $4,349,900.00

Prepared by Purchasing 10/2/2012


