City of San Ant: Draft Bid T:
Opened- September 17, 2012
For: Emergency Vehicle Truck Parts & Service Freightiiner of San Antonio Hal-Mark Fire Texas, 1LG Martin Emergency Group
100001397 CE 6700 H 10 East 601 Martin Duke Rd 14233 Interdrive W.
Est. Annuat |Converse, 'Van Alstyne, Houstor,
tem Deascription Qty. TX 78109 TX 75480 TX 77032
ITEM 1T E-ONE FIRE TRUCK PARTS & SERVICE
A PARTS DISCOUNT: ,
1 Percent of Discount Offered No Bid 20% Cost pius 50%
F4 Product ldentification No Bid E-One Parts Price Book N/A
3 Type of Price Schedula {dealer, jobber, etc.} No Bid Dealer| NJA
4 Price Schedule Number No Bid P2012-01 NrA
5 Date of Price Schedule No Bid March 3, 2012 WA
& Price Schedule Golumn on which discourt is based {i.e., No Bid 20% over cost| NIA
distributor, net, wholesale, etc.) )
B SPECIFIED ITEMS:
1 Part Description: Air Chamber Bracket 4
Mfr.Of Part Offered: N Bid Front Axel Chamber| NIA
Part Number Offered: Ne Bid 515245-003-LH NIA
Price: Per Each: No Bid $141.01 MIA
Price Toh No Bid $584.04 NfA
2 Part Description: Ar Drier 4
M.Of Part Offered: No Bid Bendix NiA
Part Number Offersd: No Bid 200137 NiA
Price Per Each: No Bid 352524 NiA
Price Total: No Bid $2,100.98 NiA
3 Pait Deseription: A/C Bracket 4
Mfr.Of Part Cffered: No Bid | E-One NifA
Part Number Offered: No Bid. 542126 NIA
Price: Per Each: No Bid $751.51 NIA
Price Total: No Bid $3.006.04 N/A
4 Part Description: Volmeter Gauge 4
Mir.OF Pait Offered: No Bid VDo NiA
Part Number Cffered: No Bid 405031 N/A
Price Per Each: No Bid $30.18 NIA
Price Total: Ne Bid $120.72 NIA
5 Part Deseription: Fan Blade 4.
Mifr.Of Part Offered: No Bid E-Cne NIA
Part Number Offered: No Bid 393229 WA
Price Per Each: No Bid $i32.81 NiA
Price Totl: No Bid $530.44 NIA
[i] Part Description: Hydraulic Cylinder 4
Mir.Of Part Offered: No Bid E-One NiA
Part Number Offerad: No Bid 576086/ NiA|
Price Per Each: No Bid 71212 NiA
Price Total: Na Bid $2.848.48] | NiA|
7 Part Description: PTO Rear Gasket 4
e Of Part Offered: No Bid E-One NA
Part Number Offered. No Bid 386127008 NIA
Price Per Each: No Ric 87678 NiA
Price Total: No Bid $307.12 N/A
c LABOR AND SERVICE:
1 Labor rate for service during regular business hours during No Bid $89.00 Per Hour $591.50 Per Hour|
itial contract term {Years 1-3)
2 Labor rate for service during regular business hours during Ne Bid $109.00 Per Hour| $95.50 Per Hour|
renewal contract term {Years 4-5)
3 Mileage charge Ne Bid $1.35 Per Mile $0.00 Per Mile|
TEM 2 FERRARA FIRE TRUCK PARTS & SERVICE
A PARTS DISCOUNT:
1 Percent of Discount Offered No Bid No Bd Gost plus 50%
2 Product identficatior: No Bid No Bid NIA
3 Typs of Price Schedule (dealer, jobber, etc ) No B No Bid NrA|
4 Price Schedule Number No Bid No B NiA
5 Date of Price Schedule No Bid No Bid NiA
B, Price Schadule Columre on which discount is based (ie, No Bid Na BH NiA
) distributor, net, wholesale, efc.)
B SPECIFIED ITEMS: -
1 Part Descrigtion: Coolant Reservolr 4
MirOf Part Offered: - No Bid Mo Bid N/
Part Number Offered: No Bid Mo Bid NIA
Price Par Each: No Bid No Bl NIA
Price Total: No Bid. No Bid NiA
2 Part Description: Air Drier 4
Mfr.Of Part Offered: No Bid No Bid NiA
Part Number Offered: No Bid No Bid NJA
Price Per Each: No Bid No B NIA
Price Total: MNo Bid No Bid NIA
3 Part Description: Door Ajar Switch 4
Mr.Of Part Offered: No Bid No Bid! WA
Part Number Cffered: No Bid Ne Bid; NIA
Price Per Each: Ne Bid No Bid NiA
Price Total: Ne Bid o Bid NIA
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City of San Antonic Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 17, 2012
For: Emergericy Vehicle Truck Parts & Servics Freightliner of San Antonic HalHMack Fire Apparatus, Texas, LLC | Skidons-Martin Emergency Group
&100001397 CE 8700 IH 10 East 601 Martin Duke Rd 14233 Interdrive W.
Est. Annual | Converse, Van Alstyne, Houston,
Hem Description Qty. TX 78109 TX 75495 TX 77032
4 Part Description: Master Switch 4
Mfr.Of Part Offered: No Bid No Bid NIA
Part Number Offered: No Bid No Bid N/A
Price Per Each: No Bid No Bid N/fA;
Price Total: No Bid No Bid| NiA
5 Part Description: Rear Suspension Air Bag 4
Mfr Of Part Offered: No Bid No Bid NiA
Fart Number Offered: No Bid No Bid NA
Price Per Each: No Bid Mo Bid N/A
Price Total: No Bid No Bid A
[ Part Description: Axle Gasket 4
Mfr.Of Part Offered: No Bid No Bid NIA
Part Number Cffered: No Bid No Bid WA
Price Per Each: No Bid Mo Bid NIA
Price Total: No Bid No Bid NIA
7 Part Description: Air Brake Chamber 4
Mir Of Part Offered: No Bid; Mo Bid NA
Part Number Offered: Ne Bid No B NIA
Price Per Each: Me Bid No Bid NIA
Price Toial: No Bid No Bid| NIA
c LABOR AND SERVICE: .
1 Labor rate for service during regular business hours during No Bid No Bid $91.50 Per Hour
initiat comtract term (Years 1-3) N
2 Labar rate for service during regular husiness hours during No Bid Mo Bid $95.50 Per Hour
renewal contract term (Years 4-5)
3 WRsage charge No Bid Mo Bid $0.00 Per Mie
ITEM 3 PIERCE FIRE TRUCK PARTS & SERVICE
A PARTS DISCOUNT:
1 Percent of Discount Offered No Bid No Bid 10%
2 Product Kentification No Bid ko Bid Pierce|
3 Type of Price Schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) No Bid Ne Bid N{A
4 Price Schedule Number No Bid No Bid NiA]
5 Date of Price Schedule No Bid No Bid NiA
3 Price Schedule Column on which discount is based (i.e., No Bid| No Bid RIA
distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)
B SPECIFIED TTEMS:
1 Part Description: Hydraulic Fifter 10
Mir Of Part Offered: No Bid No Bid| Pierce
Part Number Offered: No Bid No Bii| 1386001
Price: Per Each: No Bid No Bid $32.40
Price Total: No Bid No Bid $324.00
Z Part D fption: H i Filber 10
hfr.Of Part Offered: No Bid Wo Bid Prerce|
Part Number Offered: No Bid No Bid §1-5624
Price Per Each: Mo Bid No Bid $285.54
Price Total: No Bid ho Bid $2,855.40
3 Part Description: Air Drier 10
fr.OF Part Offered: No Bid No Bid Pierce/ Red Dot
Part Number Offered: No Bid No Bid 1301202
Price Per Each: No Bid No Bid $82.96
Price Tofal: No Bid No Bil $829.60
4 Part Description: Pump Over Heat Switch 3
Mfr.Of Part Offered: Ne Bid No Bl Pierce:
Part Number Offerad: No Bigt No Bid 1391963
Price Per Each: Ne Bid: Mo Bid $14026
Price Total: No Bid No BR $701.30
5 Pari Description: lgnition Switch 5
Mir.Of Part Offered: Ne Big No Bid Pierce
Part Number Offered: No B Mo Bid| 64-1705-0037
Price: Per Each: No Bid No Bid| $10.88
Ptice Total: No B No B $98.40
B Part Description: Dome Light 10
WMf.Of Part Offered: No Bd Ne Bid Pierce|
Part Number Offered: No Bid Mo Bid 81-0007
Price Per Each: No Bid Ne Bid $25.52
Price Total: No Bid Ne Bid $255.20
T Part Description: Sight Glass 5
Mfr.Of Part Offered: No Bid Ne Bid Pierce|
Part Number Offgred: No Bid No Bid 17KPE55
Price Per Each: No Bid Ne Bid $55.68
Price Total: No Bid No Bid $278.40
[+ LABOR AND SERVICE:
1 Labor rate for service during regular business hoirs guring No Bid No Bid $91.50 Per Hour
mitial contract term {Years 1-3)
2 Labor rate for senvice during regular business hours during No Bid No Bid $65.50 Per Hour
renewal contract term {Years 4-5)
3 Miicage charge Na Bid No Bid $0.00 Per e
iTEM 4 SPARTAN FIRE TRUCK PARTS & SERVICE
A PARTS DISCOUNT:
1 Percent of Discount Offered No Bid| No Bid Cost plus 50%
2 Product ldentification Mo Bid No 8id N/A
3 Type of Price Schedule (dealer, jobber, ste.) No Did: Mo Bid Y
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City of San Antonic Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: ‘September 17. 2012 .
For Emergency Vehicle Truck Parls & Service Freighiliner of San Antonio Hall-Mark Fire Apparatus, Texas, LLC  |Siddons-Martin Emergency Group
&1000071397 CE 8700 IH 10 East 601 Martin Duke Rd 14233 Interdrive W.
Est. Annual |Converse, Van Alstyne, Houston,
hem Description iy, TX 78100 TX 76495 TX 77032
4 Price: Schedule Number No Bid No Bid NrA,
&5 Date of Price Schedule No Bid No Bid NiA
6 Price Schedule Column on which discount is based {i.e., Na Bid No B NiA
distributor, net, wholesale, efc.)
g - SPECIFIED ITEMS:
1 Part Description: Power Steering Gasket 4
Mir.Of Pant Offered: No Bid No Bid NA
Part Number Offered: No Bid Ne Bid IN/A
Price Per Each: No Bid Ne Bid N/A
Price Total: No Bid No Bid NA
2 Part Description: Spring Roll Up Door 2
Mfr.Of Part Offered: Ko Bid No Bid NIA
Part Number Offered: No Bid No Bid| NIA
Price Per Each: MNer Bidd No Bid, NIA
Price Total: No Bid No Bid! A
3 Part Description: Headlight Switch ke
Mir.Of Part Offered: No Bid Na Bid NiA
Part Number Offered: No Bid No Bid NIA;
Price Per Each: No Bl No Bid NiA
Price Total: No Bid Mo Bid NiA
4 Part Description: Shock 4
Mifr O Part Offered: Mo Bid Ne Bid NIA
Part Number Offered: No Bid| No Bid INFA]
Price Per Each: No Bid No Bid NrA
Price Total: No Bid No Bid NIA
.5 Part Description: Blower Motor 4
M.Of Part Offered: No Bid No Bid NIA
Part Number Offered: Ne Bid No Bid NIA
Price Per Ea Ne Bid No Bid N/A
Price Total: Ne Bid No Bid N/A
& Part Description: A/C Low Pressure Switch 4
Mir.Cf Part Offered: No Bid No Bid N/A
Part Number Offered: No Bid No Bid NIA]
Price Per Each: No Bid No Bid NiA
Price Total: No Bid No Bid HNIA
7 Part Description: Hub Cover Gasket 10
MiT.Qf Part Offered: No Bid Ne Bid NIA
Part Number Offered: No Bid No Bid NiA
Price Per Each: No Bid No Bid! NiA
Price Total: No Bid No Bid N/A|
C LABOR AND SERVICE:
1 Labor rate for service during regular business hours during No Bid No Bid £01.50 FPer Hour
initial confract ierm (Years 1-3)
2 Laber rate for service during reguiar business. hours during Ne Bid No Bid $06.50 Per Hour!
renewal contract term (Years 4-5)
3 Mileage charge No Bid No Bid $0.00 Per Mie
ITEM 5 FRAZER AMBULANCE PARTS & SERVICE
A PARTS DISCOUNT:
1 Percent of Discount Offered ho Byl No Bid Gost plus 50%
2 Product dentification Mo Bid: No Bid NIA
3 Type of Price Schedule {dealer, jobber, ete.) No Bid No Bid NIA
4 Price: Schedule Number No Bid No Bid NiA
5 Date of Price Schedule No Bid Ne Bid - NiA
B8 Price Schedute Column on which discount is based (i.e., No Bid No Bd NiA
distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)
SPECIFIED ITEMS:
Part Deseripion: Door Latch 3
Mir.Of Part Offered: No Bid No Bid A
Part Number Offered: No Bid No 8 N/A]
Prive Per Each: No Bid| No Bid INJA
Price Total: No Bii| No Bid WA
2 Part Description: Shock 8
Mfr Of Part Offered: Ma Bid No Bid N/A
Part Number Offered: No Bid No Bid NIA
Price Per Each: No Bid No Bid NIA
Price Totak Ne Bid No Bid N/A
3 Part Description: Alrhag 10
Mir.Of Part Offered: No Bid Na Bid N
Part Number Offered: Mo Bid No Bid NIA
Price Per Each: No Bid Ne Bid NIA|
Price Total: No B Ne Bid NIA
4 Part Description: Relay 5
Mir.Cf Part Offered: No Bid No Bid NiA
Part Number Offered: No Bid No Bid NIA
Price Per Each: Na Bid No Bid Nis
Price Total: No Bid Na Bidd NiA
5 Part Description: Kwikee Step B8
Mir.Of Part Offered: No Bid No Bid NiA
Part Number Offered: No Bid No Bid NiA
Price Per Each: No Bid No Bid /A
Price Total: Mo Bid No Bid NIA
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

QOpened: September 17, 2012
Far: Emergency Vehicle Truck Parts & Service Freightliner of San Antenio Hall-Mark Fire A itus, Texas, LLC Maitin Emergency Group
8100601357 CE 8700 IH 10 East 601 Martir: Duke Rd 14233 Interdvive W.
Est. Annual Converse, Van Aistyne, Houston,
ltem D d Qty. TX 76100 TX 75405 TX 77032
8 Part Descripion: Mega Fuse 12
RAfr.Of Part Offered: Nec Bid. Mo Bid N/A
Part Number Offered: Mo Bid No Bid NIA
Price Per Each: No Bid No Bid N/A
Price Tatal: No Bid No Bd N/A
7 Part Description: Exhaust Manifold 4
Mr.Of Part Offerec: No Bid Ne Bid NIA]
Par: Number Offered: No Bid o Bid NIA
Price Per Each: No Bid e Bid NIA|
Price Totak No Bid No Bid NIA|
< LABCR AND SERVICE:
1 Labor rate for service during regular business hours during No Bid No Bid $91.50 Per Hour
inttial contract term {Years 1-3)
2 Labor rate for sesvice during regular business hours during No Bid; No Bid $95.50 Per Hour
renewal contract term (Years 4-5)
3 [Micage charge No Bid No Bid $0.00 Per Mile
ITEM & AMERICAN LAFRANCE FIRE TRUCK PARTS & SERVICE
A PARTS DISCOUNT:
1 Percent of Discount Offered Cost+ 25% No Bid| Gost plus 50%
z Product Wentification American Lafrance No Bid| /A
3 Type of Price Schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Dealer| No B\ N/A
4 Price Schedule Number N/A] No Bid| N/A!
5 Date of Price Schedule 1111372011 No Bid NiA
[ Price Schedule Golumn on which discount i based {i.e., Net No Bid NiR
distributar, net, wholesale, etc.)
B SPEGIFIED ITEMS:
1 Part Description: Shock 2
Mfr.Of Part Offered: Net Provided Na Bid N/A
Part Number Cffered: 10-12584-000 No Bid NIA
Price Per Each: £115.66 No Bd NIA
Price Total: $231.32 Ne Bid NIA
2 Part Descripiion: Master Cool 2 No Bid
W OF Part Offered: No Bid N Bid NIA]
Fait Number Offered: No Bid o Bid N/A!
Price Per Each: No Bid No Bid NiA
Price Total: Na Bid Ne Bid NiA
3 Part Description: Door Latch Block 2z No Bid
Mi.Of Part Offered: No Bid No Bid NiA
Part Number Qffered: Mo Big! Na Bid N/A
Price Per Each: No B! No B NrA
Price Totak: No Bid No Bid NiA
4 Part Description: Switch 2 No Bid
Mit.Of Part Offered: N Bid No Bid A
Part Number Offered: No Bid No Bid WA
Price Per Each: No Bid Mo Bid N/A|
Price Total: No Bid No Bid /A
5 Part Description: Air Bag 2
Mfr.Of Part Offered: Mot Frovided No Bid NiA
Part Number Offered: F1-W01-3778520 No Bid NiA
Price Per Each: $126.76| No Bid! NIA
Price Tofal: $241.52 Mo Bid N/A
& Part Description: Cab Tit Solenocid 2 No Bid
MiT.Of Part Offered: No Bid No Bid WA
Part Number Offered: No Bid| No Bi N/A|
Price Per Each: Ne By Mo Bid NIA
Price Total: No Bid Ne Bid NIA
K Part Description: Control Bax Cab Tit 2 N Bid
Mir.Gf Part Offered: Ne Bid Neo Bid MNIA
Part Number Cffered: No Bid Ne Bid /A
Price Per Each: No B No Bid N/A
Price Total: No Bid NoBid NIA
c LABOR AND SERVICE:
1 L abor rate for service during regular business heurs during $98.00 Per Hour| No Bid $91.50 Per Hour
initial contract term (Years 1-3)
2 tabor rate for service during regular business hours durng N/A| No Bid $95.50 Per Hour|
renewal contract term (Years 4-5)
3 Micage charge N/A No Bid $0.00 Per Mie
ITEM 7 KME FIRE TRUCK PARTS & SERVICE
A PARTS DISCOUNT:
1 Percent of Discount Offered No Bid Na Bid Cost pius 50%
2 Product Hentification No Bid No Bd NiA
3 Type of Price Schedule {dealer, jobber, ete) No Bid. Mo B NAA
4 Price Schedule Number ) No Bid! No Bid NeA
5 Date of Price Schedule No Bid Ne B N/A
3 Price: Schedule Column on which discount Is based (l.e., No Bid No Bid A
distrbutor, net, wholesaie, etc.)}
B SPECIFIED ITEMS:
1 Part Description: Windaw Crank 2
Mir.Of Part Cifered: No Bid Mo Bid NiA
Part Number Offered: No Bid Mo Bid NiA
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 7. 2012
For: Emergency Vehiole Truck Parts & Service Frefghtliner of San Antenio Hali-Mark Fire Apparatus, Texas, LLC | Siddons-Martin Emergency Group
&100001397 CE B700 IH 10 East 601 Martin Duke Rd 14233 interdrive W.
Est. Annual | Converse, Yan Alstyne, Houston,
liem DBescription Oty. TX 78108 TX 75495 TX 77032
Price Per Each: No Bid No Bid, NiA
Price Toml: No Bid No Bid NiA
2 Part Descriptior: Blower Moter 2
Mir.OFf Part Offered: No Bid| Neo Bid NiA
Part Number Offered: No Bid No Bid NiA
Price Per Each: No Bid No Bid /A
Price Total: Mo Bid No Bid NIA
3 Part Desoription: A/C Compressor ?
M. Of Part Offered: Mo Bid No Bid N/A
Part Number Offered: No Bid No Bid NfA
Price Per Each: No Bid No Bid NiA
Price Total: No Bid No Bid N/A
4 Part Description: Hom Assembly 2
Mfr.Of Part Offered: Ne Bid No Bid NIA
Part Number Offered: No Bid No Bid NA
Price Per Each: Ne Big No Bid NiA|
Price Total: No Bid! No Bid A
) Part Desctiption: Ar Cylinder 2
Mir.Of Part Cffered: No Bid No Bid NiA
Part Number Offered: No Bid No Bid NIA
rice Per Cach: No Bid Ne Bid NiA
Price Total: No Bid N Bid NiA
6 Part Description: Shaift 2
Mfr.Of Part Offered: No Bid Ne Bl NiA
Part Number Offered: No Bid No Bid NiA
Price: Per Each: Na Bid No Bid NiA
Price Total: No Bid No Bid NfA|
7 Part Description: AIC Temperature Select Knob 2
M Of Part Offered: No Bid| No Bid WA
Part Number Cffered: No Bid, No Bid N/A|
Price Per Each: Na Bid Na Bid NIA
Price Total: No Bid No Bid NI
c LABOR AND SERVICE:
1 Labor rate for service during regular business hours during No Bid No Bid $91.50 Per Hour|
mitial contract term (Years 1-3)
2 Labor rate for service during regular business hours during No Bid No Bid $95.50 Per Heur
renewal contract term (Years 4-5) -
3 i charge Ne Bid No Bid $0.00 Per Mile|
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