
City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 7, 2012
For: High Intensity Prismatic Sign Sheeting  (Barricade 

Tape)
3M Company Avery Dennison Corporation Norton Lewis Printing, Inc. Pathmark Traffic Product of 

Texas, Inc.
Rocal, Inc.

VS 3M Center , Bldg. 235-3A-09 7542 N. Natchez Avenue 722 Isom #3 4435 Hunter Road 3186  CR 550

Item  Description
Annual

Estimated 
Quantities

St. Paul,
MN  55144-1000
800-553-1380

Niles,
IL  60714

San Antonio,
TX  78216

San Marcos,
TX 78666

Frankfort,                                      
OH 45628

1 3M HIGH PERFORMANCE PRISMATIC SIGN 
36"x 50 Yd roll SHEETING  White

18
 

Price per Roll $535.50 $549.00 $825.42 13.86* $634.50
Total $9,639.00 $9,882.00 $14,857.56 $11,421.00
Brand 3M Avery Dennison 3M 3M 3M
Model 3930 T-6500 3930-36 Not Provided 3930

2 3M HIGH PERFORMANCE PRISMATIC SIGN 
48"x 50 Yds roll SHEETING - White

18

Price per Roll $714.00 $732.00 $1,100.58 No Bid $846.00
Total $12,852.00 $13,176.00 $19,810.44 $15,228.00
Brand 3M Avery Dennison 3M 3M
Model 3930 T-6500 3930-48  $3,930.00

3 3M HIGH PERFORMANCE PRISMATIC SIGN 
36"x 50 Yds roll SHEETING  - Yellow

18

Price per Roll $535.50 $549.00 $825.42 13.86* $634.50
Total $9,639.00 $9,882.00 $14,857.56 $11,421.00
Brand 3M Avery Dennison 3M 3M 3M
Model 3931 T-6501 3931-36 Not Provided 3930

4 3M HIGH PERFORMANCE PRISMATIC SIGN 
48"x 50 Yds roll SHEETING - Yellow

18

Price per Roll $714.00 $732.00 $1,100.58 No Bid $846.00
Total $12,852.00 $13,176.00 $19,810.44  $15,228.00
Brand 3M Avery Dennison 3M  3M
Model 3931 T-6501 3931-48  3930

5 3M HIGH PERFORMANCE PRISMATIC SIGN 
36"x 50 Yd roll SHEETING - Red

18

Price per Roll $535.50 $549.00 $825.42 13.86* $635.50
Total $9,639.00 $9,882.00 $14,857.56 $11,439.00
Brand 3M Avery Dennison 3M 3M 3M
Model 3932 T-6508 3932-36 Not Provided 3930

6 3M HIGH PERFORMANCE PRISMATIC SIGN 
48" x 50 Yd roll SHEETING - Red

18

Price per Roll $714.00 $732.00 $1,100.58 No Bid $846.00
Total $12,852.00 $13,176.00 $19,810.44  $15,228.00
Brand 3M Avery Dennison 3M  3M
Model 3932 T-6508 3932-48  3930

7 3M HIGH PERFORMANCE PRISMATIC SIGN 
36"x 50 Yd roll SHEETING - Orange

18

Price per Roll $535.50 $549.00 $825.42 13.86* $634.50
Total $9,639.00 $9,882.00 $14,857.56 $11,421.00
Brand 3M Avery Dennison 3M 3M 3M
Model 3934 T-6504 3934-36 Not Provided 3930

6100001115                                                             
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 7, 2012
For: High Intensity Prismatic Sign Sheeting  (Barricade 

Tape)
3M Company Avery Dennison Corporation Norton Lewis Printing, Inc. Pathmark Traffic Product of 

Texas, Inc.
Rocal, Inc.

VS 3M Center , Bldg. 235-3A-09 7542 N. Natchez Avenue 722 Isom #3 4435 Hunter Road 3186  CR 550

Item  Description
Annual

Estimated 
Quantities

St. Paul,
MN  55144-1000
800-553-1380

Niles,
IL  60714

San Antonio,
TX  78216

San Marcos,
TX 78666

Frankfort,                                      
OH 45628

6100001115                                                             

8 3M HIGH PERFORMANCE PRISMATIC SIGN 
48"x 50 Yd roll SHEETING - Orange

18

Price per Roll $714.00 $732.00 $1,100.58 No Bid $846.00
Total $12,852.00 $13,176.00 $19,810.44  $15,228.00
Brand 3M Avery Dennison 3M  3M
Model 3934 T-6504 3934-48  3930

9 3M HIGH PERFORMANCE PRISMATIC SIGN 
36"x 50 Yd roll SHEETING  - Blue

18

Price per Roll $535.50 $549.00 $825.42 13.86* $634.50
Total $9,639.00 $9,882.00 $14,857.56 $11,421.00
Brand 3M Avery Dennison 3M 3M 3M
Model 3935 T-6505 3985-36 Not Provided 3930

10 3M HIGH PERFORMANCE PRISMATIC SIGN 
48"x 50 Yd roll SHEETING  - Blue

18

Price per Roll $714.00 $732.00 $1,100.58 No Bid $846.00
Total $12,852.00 $13,176.00 $19,810.44  $15,228.00
Brand 3M Avery Dennison 3M  3M
Model 3935 T-6505 3935-48  $3,930.00

11 3M HIGH PERFORMANCE PRISMATIC SIGN 
36"x 50 Yd roll SHEETING  - Green

18

Price per Roll $535.50 $549.00 $825.42 13.86* $634.50
Total $9,639.00 $9,882.00 $14,857.56 $11,421.00
Brand 3M Avery Dennison 3M 3M 3M
Model 3937 T-6507 3937-36 Not Provided 3930

12 3M HIGH PERFORMANCE PRISMATIC SIGN 
48"x 50 Yd roll SHEETING  - Green

18

Price per Roll $714.00 $732.00 $1,100.58 No Bid $846.00
Total $12,852.00 $13,176.00 $19,810.44  $15,228.00
Brand 3M Avery Dennison 3M  3M
Model 3937 T-6507 3937-48  3937

13 3M HIGH PERFORMANCE PRISMATIC SIGN 
36"x 50 Yd roll SHEETING  - Brown

18

Price per Roll $535.50 $549.00 $825.42 13.86* $634.50
Total $9,639.00 $9,882.00 $14,857.56 $11,421.00
Brand 3M Avery Dennison 3M 3M 3M
Model 3939 T-6509 3939-36 Not Provided 3939

14 3M HIGH PERFORMANCE PRISMATIC SIGN 
48"x 50 Yd roll SHEETING  - Brown

18

Price per Roll $714.00 $732.00 $1,100.58 No Bid $846.00
Total $12,852.00 $13,176.00 $19,810.44  $15,228.00
Brand 3M Avery Dennison 3M  3M
Model 3939 T-6509 3939-48  3939

15 3M 4” LEFT STRIPE 334-L HIGH INTENSITY 
PRISMATIC REFLECTIVE 
6” X 50 Yds roll  White/Orange                                       

5

Price per Roll $89.25 $91.50 $154.78 $165.00 $122.25
Total $446.25 $457.50 $773.90 $825.00 $611.25
Brand 3M Avery Dennison 3M 3M 3M
Model 334L W-6142 Not Provided Not Provided 334L
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 7, 2012
For: High Intensity Prismatic Sign Sheeting  (Barricade 

Tape)
3M Company Avery Dennison Corporation Norton Lewis Printing, Inc. Pathmark Traffic Product of 

Texas, Inc.
Rocal, Inc.

VS 3M Center , Bldg. 235-3A-09 7542 N. Natchez Avenue 722 Isom #3 4435 Hunter Road 3186  CR 550

Item  Description
Annual

Estimated 
Quantities

St. Paul,
MN  55144-1000
800-553-1380

Niles,
IL  60714

San Antonio,
TX  78216

San Marcos,
TX 78666

Frankfort,                                      
OH 45628

6100001115                                                             

16 3M 4” LEFT STRIPE 334-L HIGH INTENSITY 
PRISMATIC  REFLECTIVE 
7” X 50 Yds roll  White/Orange                                       

5

Price per Roll $104.13 $106.75 $180.57 $195.00 $142.63
Total $520.65 $533.75 $902.85 $975.00 $713.15
Brand 3M Avery Dennison 3M 3M 3M
Model 334L W-6142 Not Provided Not Provided 334L

17 3M 4” LEFT STRIPE 334-L HIGH INTENSITY 
PRISMATIC  REFLECTIVE  
7.75” X 50 Yds roll  White/Orange                                  

5

Price per Roll $115.28 $118.19 $192.80 $225.00 $157.91
Total $576.40 $590.94 $964.00 $1,125.00 $789.55
Brand 3M Avery Dennison 3M 3M 3M
Model 334L W-6142 Not Provided Not Provided 334L

18 3M 4” LEFT STRIPE 334-L HIGH INTENSITY 
PRISMATIC  REFLECTIVE  
8” X 50 Yds roll  White/Orange                                       

5

Price per Roll $119.00 $122.00 $206.37 $225.00 $163.00
Total $595.00 $610.00 $1,031.85 $1,125.00 $815.00
Brand 3M Avery Dennison 3M 3M 3M
Model 334L W-6142 Not Provided Not Provided 334L

19 3M 4” LEFT STRIPE 334-L HIGH INTENSITY 
PRISMATIC  REFLECTIVE 
10” X 50 Yds roll  White/Orange                                     

5

Price per Roll $148.75 $152.50 $257.97 $275.00 $203.75
Total $743.75 $762.50 $1,289.85 $1,375.00 $1,018.75
Brand 3M Avery Dennison 3M 3M 3M
Model 334L W-6142 Not Provided Not Provided 334L

20 HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC  REFLECTIVE 
11.75” X 50 Yds roll  White/Orange                                

5

Price per Roll $174.78 $179.19 $303.11 $330.00 $239.41
Total $873.90 $895.94 $1,515.55 $1,650.00 $1,197.05
Brand 3M Avery Dennison 3M 3M 3M
Model 334L W-6142 Not Provided Not Provided 334L

21 3M 4” LEFT STRIPE 334-L HIGH INTENSITY 
PRISMATIC  REFLECTIVE  
12” X 50 Yds roll White/Orange                                      

5

Price per Roll $178.50 $183.00 $309.56 $330.00 $244.50
Total $892.50 $915.00 $1,547.80 $1,650.00 $1,222.50
Brand 3M Avery Dennison 3M 3M 3M
Model 334L W-6142 Not Provided Not Provided 334/336

22 3M 4” LEFT STRIPE 334-L HIGH INTENSITY 
PRISMATIC  REFLECTIVE  
12” X 50 Yds roll  White/Orange                                     

5

Price per Roll $178.50 $183.00 $309.56 $330.00 $244.50
Total $892.50 $915.00 $1,547.80 $1,650.00 $1,222.50
Brand 3M Avery Dennison 3M 3M 3M
Model 334L W-6142 Not Provided Not Provided 334/336
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 7, 2012
For: High Intensity Prismatic Sign Sheeting  (Barricade 

Tape)
3M Company Avery Dennison Corporation Norton Lewis Printing, Inc. Pathmark Traffic Product of 

Texas, Inc.
Rocal, Inc.

VS 3M Center , Bldg. 235-3A-09 7542 N. Natchez Avenue 722 Isom #3 4435 Hunter Road 3186  CR 550

Item  Description
Annual

Estimated 
Quantities

St. Paul,
MN  55144-1000
800-553-1380

Niles,
IL  60714

San Antonio,
TX  78216

San Marcos,
TX 78666

Frankfort,                                      
OH 45628

6100001115                                                             

23 3M 4” LEFT STRIPE 334-R HIGH INTENSITY 
PRISMATIC  REFLECTIVE  
6” X 50 Yds roll  White/Orange                                       

5

Price per Roll $89.25 $91.50 $154.78 $165.00 $122.25
Total $446.25 $457.50 $773.90 $825.00 $611.25
Brand 3M Avery Dennison 3M 3M 3M
Model 334R W-6143 Not Provided Not Provided 334/336

24 3M 4” LEFT STRIPE 334-R HIGH INTENSITY 
PRISMATIC  REFLECTIVE  
7” X 50 Yds roll  White/Orange                                       

5

Price per Roll $104.13 $106.75 $180.57 $195.00 $142.63
Total $520.65 $533.75 $902.85 $975.00 $713.15
Brand 3M Avery Dennison 3M 3M 3M
Model 334R W-6143 Not Provided Not Provided 334/336

25 HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC  REFLECTIVE  
7.75” X 50 Yds roll  White/Orange                                  

5

Price per Roll $115.28 $118.19 $192.80 $225.00 $157.91
Total $576.40 $590.94 $964.00 $1,125.00 $789.55
Brand 3M Avery Dennison 3M 3M 3M
Model 334R W-6143 Not Provided Not Provided 334/336

26 3M 4” LEFT STRIPE 334-R HIGH INTENSITY 
PRISMATIC  REFLECTIVE  
8” X 50 Yds roll  White/Orange                                       

5

Price per Roll $119.00 $122.00 $206.37 $225.00 $163.00
Total $595.00 $610.00 $1,031.85 $1,125.00 $815.00
Brand 3M Avery Dennison 3M 3M 3M
Model 334R W-6143 Not Provided Not Provided 334/336

27 3M 4” LEFT STRIPE 334-R HIGH INTENSITY 
PRISMATIC REFLECTIVE  
10” X 50 Yds roll  White/Orange                                     

5

Price per Roll $148.75 $152.50 $257.97 $275.00 $203.75
Total $743.75 $762.50 $1,289.85 $1,375.00 $1,018.75
Brand 3M Avery Dennison 3M 3M 3M
Model 334R W-6143 Not Provided Not Provided 334/336

28 HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC  REFLECTIVE  
11.75” X 50 Yds roll  White/Orange                                

5

Price per Roll $174.78 $179.19 $303.11 $330.00 $239.41
Total $873.90 $895.94 $1,515.55 $1,650.00 $1,197.05
Brand 3M Avery Dennison 3M 3M 3M
Model 334R W-6143 Not Provided Not Provided 334/336

29 3M 4” LEFT STRIPE 334-R HIGH INTENSITY 
PRISMATIC  REFLECTIVE 
12” X 50 Yds roll  White/Orange                                     

5

Price per Roll $178.50 $183.00 $309.56 $330.00 $244.50
Total $892.50 $915.00 $1,547.80 $1,650.00 $1,222.50
Brand 3M Avery Dennison 3M 3M 3M
Model 334R W-6143 Not Provided Not Provided 334/336
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 7, 2012
For: High Intensity Prismatic Sign Sheeting  (Barricade 

Tape)
3M Company Avery Dennison Corporation Norton Lewis Printing, Inc. Pathmark Traffic Product of 

Texas, Inc.
Rocal, Inc.

VS 3M Center , Bldg. 235-3A-09 7542 N. Natchez Avenue 722 Isom #3 4435 Hunter Road 3186  CR 550

Item  Description
Annual

Estimated 
Quantities

St. Paul,
MN  55144-1000
800-553-1380

Niles,
IL  60714

San Antonio,
TX  78216

San Marcos,
TX 78666

Frankfort,                                      
OH 45628

6100001115                                                             

30 3M 6” LEFT STRIPE 336-L HIGH INTENSITY 
PRISMATIC  REFLECTIVE  
6” X 50 Yds roll  White/Orange                                       

5

 
Price per Roll $89.25 $91.50 $154.78 $165.00 $122.25
Total $446.25 $457.50 $773.90 $825.00 $611.25
Brand 3M Avery Dennison 3M 3M 3M
Model 336L W-6144 Not Provided Not Provided 336-L

31 3M 6” LEFT STRIPE 336-L HIGH INTENSITY 
PRISMATIC  REFLECTIVE 
7” X 50 Yds roll  White/Orange                                       

5

Price per Roll $104.13 $106.75 $180.57 $195.00 $142.63
Total $520.65 $533.75 $902.85 $975.00 $713.15
Brand 3M Avery Dennison 3M 3M 3M
Model 336-L W-6144 Not Provided Not Provided 336-L

32 HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC  REFLECTIVE  
7.75” X 50 Yds roll  White/Orange                                  

5

Price per Roll $115.28 $118.19 $192.80 $225.00 $157.90
Total $576.40 $590.94 $964.00 $1,125.00 $789.50
Brand 3M Avery Dennison 3M 3M 3M
Model 336L W-6144 Not Provided Not Provided 336-L

33 3M 6” LEFT STRIPE 336-L HIGH INTENSITY 
PRISMATIC  REFLECTIVE 
8” X 50 Yds roll  White/Orange                                       

5

Price per Roll $119.00 $122.00 $206.37 $225.00 $163.00
Total $595.00 $610.00 $1,031.85 $1,125.00 $815.00
Brand 3M Avery Dennison 3M 3M 3M
Model 336L W-6144 Not Provided Not Provided 336-L

34 3M 6” LEFT STRIPE 336-L HIGH INTENSITY 
PRISMATIC  REFLECTIVE  
10” X 50 Yds roll  White/Orange                                     

5

Price per Roll $148.75 $152.50 $257.97 $275.00 $203.75
Total $743.75 $762.50 $1,289.85 $1,375.00 $1,018.75
Brand 3M Avery Dennison 3M 3M 3M
Model 336L W-6144 Not Provided Not Provided 336-L

35 HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC  REFLECTIVE  
11.75” X 50 Yds roll  White/Orange                                

5

Price per Roll $174.78 $179.19 $303.11 $330.00 $239.41
Total $873.90 $895.93 $1,515.55 $1,650.00 $1,197.05
Brand 3M Avery Dennison 3M 3M 3M
Model 336L W-6144 Not Provided Not Provided 336-L 

36 3M 6” LEFT STRIPE 336-L HIGH INTENSITY 
PRISMATIC  REFLECTIVE  
12” X 50 Yds roll  White/Orange                                     

5

Price per Roll $178.50 $183.00 $309.56 $330.00 $244.50
Total $892.50 $915.00 $1,547.80 $1,650.00 $1,222.50
Brand 3M Avery Dennison 3M 3M 3M
Model 336L W-6144 Not Provided Not Provided 336-L
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 7, 2012
For: High Intensity Prismatic Sign Sheeting  (Barricade 

Tape)
3M Company Avery Dennison Corporation Norton Lewis Printing, Inc. Pathmark Traffic Product of 

Texas, Inc.
Rocal, Inc.

VS 3M Center , Bldg. 235-3A-09 7542 N. Natchez Avenue 722 Isom #3 4435 Hunter Road 3186  CR 550

Item  Description
Annual

Estimated 
Quantities

St. Paul,
MN  55144-1000
800-553-1380

Niles,
IL  60714

San Antonio,
TX  78216

San Marcos,
TX 78666

Frankfort,                                      
OH 45628

6100001115                                                             

37 3M 6” LEFT STRIPE 336-R HIGH INTENSITY 
PRISMATIC  REFLECTIVE  
6” X 50 Yds roll   White/Orange                                      

5

Price per Roll $89.25 $91.50 $154.78 $165.00 $122.25
Total $446.25 $457.50 $773.90 $825.00 $611.25
Brand 3M Avery Dennison 3M 3M 3M
Model 336R W-6145 Not Provided Not Provided 336-R 

38 3M 6” LEFT STRIPE 336-R HIGH INTENSITY 
PRISMATIC  REFLECTIVE 
7” X 50 Yds roll  White/Orange                                       

5

Price per Roll $104.13 $106.75 $180.57 $195.00 $142.63
Total $520.65 $533.75 $902.85 $975.00 $713.15
Brand 3M Avery Dennison 3M 3M 3M
Model 336R W6145. Not Provided Not Provided 336-R

39 3M 6” LEFT STRIPE 336-R HIGH INTENSITY 
PRISMATIC  REFLECTIVE 
7.75” X 50 Yds roll  White/Orange                                  

5

Price per Roll $115.28 $118.19 $192.80 $225.00 $157.90
Total $576.40 $590.93 $964.00 $1,125.00 $789.50
Brand 3M Avery Dennison 3M 3M 3M
Model 336R W-6145 Not Provided Not Provided 334/336

40 3M 6” LEFT STRIPE 336-R HIGH INTENSITY 
PRISMATIC REFLECTIVE 
8” X 50 Yds roll  White/Orange                                       

5

Price per Roll $119.00 $122.00 $206.37 $225.00 $163.00
Total $595.00 $610.00 $1,031.85 $1,125.00 $815.00
Brand 3M Avery Dennison 3M 3M 3M
Model 336R W-6145 Not Provided Not Provided 334/336

41 3M 6” LEFT STRIPE 336-R HIGH INTENSITY 
PRISMATIC  REFLECTIVE  
10” X 50 Yds roll  White/Orange                                     

5

Price per Roll $148.75 $152.50 $257.97 $275.00 $203.75
Total $743.75 $762.50 $1,289.85 $1,375.00 $1,018.75
Brand 3M Avery Dennison 3M 3M 3M
Model 336R W-6145 Not Provided Not Provided 334/336

42 3M 6” LEFT STRIPE 336-R HIGH INTENSITY 
PRISMATIC  REFLECTIVE  
11.75” X 50 Yds roll  White/Orange                                

5

Price per Roll $174.78 $179.19 $303.11 $330.00 $239.41
Total $873.90 $895.94 $1,515.55 $1,650.00 $1,197.05
Brand 3M Avery Dennison 3M 3M 3M
Model 336R W-6145 Not Provided Not Provided 334/336

43 3M 6” LEFT STRIPE 336-R HIGH INTENSITY 
PRISMATIC  REFLECTIVE  
12” X 50 Yds roll  White/Orange                                     

5

Price per Roll $178.50 $183.00 $309.56 $330.00 $244.50
Total $892.50 $915.00 $1,547.80 $1,650.00 $1,222.50
Brand 3M Avery Dennison 3M 3M 3M
Model 336R W-6145 Not Provided Not Provided 334/336
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 7, 2012
For: High Intensity Prismatic Sign Sheeting  (Barricade 

Tape)
3M Company Avery Dennison Corporation Norton Lewis Printing, Inc. Pathmark Traffic Product of 

Texas, Inc.
Rocal, Inc.

VS 3M Center , Bldg. 235-3A-09 7542 N. Natchez Avenue 722 Isom #3 4435 Hunter Road 3186  CR 550

Item  Description
Annual

Estimated 
Quantities

St. Paul,
MN  55144-1000
800-553-1380

Niles,
IL  60714

San Antonio,
TX  78216

San Marcos,
TX 78666

Frankfort,                                      
OH 45628

6100001115                                                             

44 3M 6” LEFT STRIPE 336-R HIGH INTENSITY 
PRISMATIC  REFLECTIVE  
12” X 50 Yds roll  White/Orange                                     

5

 
Price per Roll $178.50 $183.00 $309.56 $330.00 $244.50
Total $892.50 $915.00 $1,547.80 $1,650.00 $1,222.50
Brand 3M Avery Dennison 3M 3M 3M
Model 336R W-6145 Not Provided Not Provided 334/336

45 3M DIAMOND GRADE TRANSLUCENT 
36"X 50 Yds roll  White                                                   

4

Price per Roll $2,250.00 $1,665.00 $3,630.51 $57.60 $1,867.50
Total $9,000.00 $6,660.00 $14,522.04 $7,470.00
Brand 3M Avery Dennison 3M 3M 3M
Model 4090T T-11500 Not Provided Not Provided DG3 4000 Series

Delivery 20-30 Days 21 Days 10-20 Days 14-17 days 21 Days

Terms Net 30 Net 30 2% Net 30 Net 30 Net 30

Estimated Annual Totals $186,815.80 $188,958.50 $292,396.84 Incomplete $221,944.90
Estimated Annual Award $186,815.80 $188,958.50 $292,396.84 Incomplete $221,944.90

* Bidder provided pricing by the Sq Yard.  Pricing requirement specified price per roll (roll = 50 yards).  
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