
City of San Antonio
Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: December 17, 2014
For: Annual Contract for Work Gloves Alternate

BKW Environmental BKW Environmental 
Midwest Quality 
Gloves, Inc.

Supply Innovations 
Co., LLC

6100004773 VF 2330 Pasadena Blvd 2330 Pasadena Blvd 835 Industrial Rd. 200 Chihuahua St.

Item Description

Estimated 
Annual 

Quantity

Pasadena,                   
TX  77502

Pasadena,                   
TX  77502

Chillicothe,                   
MO 64601

San Antonio,                
TX  78207

1 Leather Palm Glove, price per pair

Small 36 $1.14 $3.85 $1.57
Manufacturer Name Cordova Midwest Quality Liberty
Manufacturer Part # 7205 7733-S-00 3260QS
Price Total $41.04 $138.60 $56.52
Medium 36 $1.14 $3.85 $1.57
Manufacturer Name Cordova Midwest Quality Liberty
Manufacturer Part # 7205 7733-M-00 3260QM
Price Total $41.04 $138.60 $56.52
Large 132 $1.14 $3.85 $1.57
Manufacturer Name Cordova Midwest Quality Liberty
Manufacturer Part # 7205 7733-L-00 3260QL
Price Total $150.48 $508.20 $207.24
X-Large 72 $1.14 $3.85 $1.73
Manufacturer Name Cordova Midwest Quality Liberty
Manufacturer Part # 7205 7733-XL-00 3260QXL
Price Total $82.08 $277.20 $124.56

2 Dip Glove, price per pair
Small 12 $0.94 $1.85 $1.48
Manufacturer Name Seattle Midwest Quality Liberty
Manufacturer Part # 400 66-S-00 4729S
Price Total $11.28 $22.20 $17.76
Medium 12 $0.94 $1.85 $1.48
Manufacturer Name Seattle Midwest Quality Liberty
Manufacturer Part # 400 66-M-00 4729M
Price Total $11.28 $22.20 $17.76
Large 12 $0.94 $1.85 $1.48
Manufacturer Name Seattle Midwest Quality Liberty
Manufacturer Part # 400 66-L-00 4729L
Price Total $11.28 $22.20 $17.76
X-Large 12 $0.94 $1.85 $1.48
Manufacturer Name Seattle Midwest Quality Liberty
Manufacturer Part # 400 66-XL-00 4729XL
Price Total $11.28 $22.20 $17.76

3 Denim Cuff Glove, price per pair
Small 144 $2.17 No Bid $4.50
Manufacturer Name Cordova Liberty
Manufacturer Part # 7500 3120S
Price Total $312.48 $648.00
Medium 144 $2.17 No Bid $4.50
Manufacturer Name Cordova Liberty
Manufacturer Part # 7500 3120M
Price Total $312.48 $648.00
Large 60 $2.17 No Bid $4.50
Manufacturer Name Cordova Liberty
Manufacturer Part # 7500 3120L
Price Total $130.20 $270.00
X-Large 24 $2.17 No Bid $4.50
Manufacturer Name Cordova Liberty
Manufacturer Part # 7500 3120XL
Price Total $52.08 $108.00
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City of San Antonio
Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: December 17, 2014
For: Annual Contract for Work Gloves Alternate

BKW Environmental BKW Environmental 
Midwest Quality 
Gloves, Inc.

Supply Innovations 
Co., LLC

6100004773 VF 2330 Pasadena Blvd 2330 Pasadena Blvd 835 Industrial Rd. 200 Chihuahua St.

Item Description

Estimated 
Annual 

Quantity

Pasadena,                   
TX  77502

Pasadena,                   
TX  77502

Chillicothe,                   
MO 64601

San Antonio,                
TX  78207

4 Leather Driver Glove, price per pair

Small 168 $2.67 $3.02 $7.75 $2.95
Manufacturer Name Cordova Cordova Midwest Quality Liberty
Manufacturer Part # 8239 8214 609-S-00 6487S
Price Total $448.56 $507.36 $1,302.00 $495.60
Medium 312 $2.67 $3.02 $7.75 $2.95
Manufacturer Name Cordova Cordova Midwest Quality Liberty
Manufacturer Part # 8239 8214 609-M-00 6487M
Price Total $833.04 $942.24 $2,418.00 $920.40
Large 492 $2.67 $3.02 $7.75 $2.95
Manufacturer Name Cordova Cordova Midwest Quality Liberty
Manufacturer Part # 8239 8214 609-L-00 6487L
Price Total $1,313.64 $1,485.84 $3,813.00 $1,451.40
X-Large 396 $2.67 $3.02 $7.75 $2.95
Manufacturer Name Cordova Cordova Midwest Quality Liberty
Manufacturer Part # 8239 8214 609-XL-00 6487XL
Price Total $1,057.32 $1,195.92 $3,069.00 $1,168.20

5 Full Finger Mechanic Glove, price 
per pair
Small 60 $7.89 No Bid $6.63
Manufacturer Name Seattle Majestic
Manufacturer Part # MCV20 2139BKS
Price Total $473.40 $397.80
Medium 120 $7.89 $9.00 $6.63
Manufacturer Name Seattle Midwest Quality Majestic
Manufacturer Part # MCV20 MX420-M-00 2139BKM
Price Total $946.80 $1,080.00 $795.60
Large 192 $7.89 $9.00 $6.63
Manufacturer Name Seattle Midwest Quality Majestic
Manufacturer Part # MCV20 MX420-L-00 2139BKL
Price Total $1,514.88 $1,728.00 $1,272.96
X-Large 132 $7.89 $9.00 $6.63
Manufacturer Name Seattle Midwest Quality Majestic
Manufacturer Part # MCV20 MX420-XL-00 2139BKXL
Price Total $1,041.48 $1,188.00 $875.16

6 Brown Jersey Glove, price per pair

One Size Fits All 1 $0.32 $0.70 $0.49
Manufacturer Name Cordova Midwest Quality Liberty
Manufacturer Part # 1400RC 7792-L-00 4503SP
Price Total $0.32 $0.70 $0.49

7 Oil and Gas Hand Protection Glove, 
price per pair
Small 60 $14.48 No Bid $36.10
Manufacturer Name Seattle Mechanix
Manufacturer Part # ShopGrip X5 ORHD-CR5S
Price Total $868.80 $2,166.00
Medium 120 $14.48 No Bid $36.10
Manufacturer Name Seattle Mechanix
Manufacturer Part # ShopGrip X5 ORHD-CR5M
Price Total $1,737.60 $4,332.00
Large 180 $14.48 No Bid $36.10
Manufacturer Name Seattle Mechanix
Manufacturer Part # ShopGrip X5 ORHD-CR5L
Price Total $2,606.40 $6,498.00
X-Large 96 $14.48 No Bid $36.10
Manufacturer Name Seattle Mechanix
Manufacturer Part # ShopGrip X5 ORHD-CR5XL
Price Total $1,390.08 $3,465.60

Page 2



City of San Antonio
Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: December 17, 2014
For: Annual Contract for Work Gloves Alternate

BKW Environmental BKW Environmental 
Midwest Quality 
Gloves, Inc.

Supply Innovations 
Co., LLC

6100004773 VF 2330 Pasadena Blvd 2330 Pasadena Blvd 835 Industrial Rd. 200 Chihuahua St.

Item Description

Estimated 
Annual 

Quantity

Pasadena,                   
TX  77502

Pasadena,                   
TX  77502

Chillicothe,                   
MO 64601

San Antonio,                
TX  78207

8 Oil and Gas Hand Protection 
Waterproof Glove, price per pair
Small 60 $9.94 No Bid $45.86
Manufacturer Name Seattle Mechanix
Manufacturer Part # MC13GHV ORHD-ODS
Price Total $596.40 $2,751.60
Medium 120 $9.94 No Bid $45.86
Manufacturer Name Seattle Mechanix
Manufacturer Part # MC13GHV ORHD-ODM
Price Total $1,192.80 $5,503.20
Large 180 $9.94 No Bid $45.86
Manufacturer Name Seattle Mechanix
Manufacturer Part # MC13GHV ORHD-ODL
Price Total $1,789.20 $8,254.80
X-Large 96 $9.94 No Bid $45.86
Manufacturer Name Seattle Mechanix
Manufacturer Part # MC13GHV ORHD-ODXL
Price Total $954.24 $4,402.56

9 High Visibility Heavy Duty Glove, 
price per pair
Small 60 $9.94 No Bid $33.10
Manufacturer Name Mechanix Mechanix
Manufacturer Part # CC-40-91 CG40-61S
Price Total $596.40 $1,986.00
Medium 120 $9.94 No Bid $33.10
Manufacturer Name Mechanix Mechanix
Manufacturer Part # CC-40-91 CG40-91M
Price Total $1,192.80 $3,972.00
Large 180 $9.94 No Bid $33.10
Manufacturer Name Mechanix Mechanix
Manufacturer Part # CC-40-91 CG40-91L
Price Total $1,789.20 $5,958.00
X-Large 96 $9.94 No Bid $33.10
Manufacturer Name Mechanix Mechanix
Manufacturer Part # CC-40-91 CG40-91XL
Price Total $954.24 $3,177.60

Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30

Estimated Annual Award
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