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Opened: August 8, 2014

For: Veterinary Supplies for Animal Care Services
Butler Animal Health 
Supply, LLC 
dba Henry Schein Animal 
Health

Midwest Veterinary 
Supply, Inc.

MWI VeterinarySupply
Patterson Veterinary 
Supply

Pethealth Services USA 
Inc.

6100004850 VF 400 Metro Place North 1124- Grader Street 3041 W. Pasadena Drive 12625 Wetmore Rd., Ste 
1031

3315 Algoniquin Road 
East

Item Description
Annual 

Estimated 
Quantities

Dublin,
OH  43017

Dallas,
Texas 75238

Boise,
ID  83705

San Antonio,
TX  78247

Rolling Meadows,
IL  60008

1 Alcohol, 70% Isopropyl, gallon
Unit Cost 104 $15.28 $11.00 $9.66 $8.91 No Bid
Total Cost $1,589.12 $1,144.00 $1,004.64 $926.64
Supplier Part Number HS # 012186 193.33241.3 021345 078696277
Manufacturer Name Blending Not Provided Centaur Vedco
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided 1130023C 3280 VINV-IPA7-GALS

2 Autoclave Steam Indicator Tape, 3/4”
Unit Cost 26 $2.71 $4.64 $4.37 $3.24 No Bid
Total Cost $70.46 $120.64 $113.62 $84.24
Supplier Part Number HS # 037282 474.00019.4 039203 078394558

Manufacturer Name
Henry Schein
Private Label Not Provided 3M PRP

Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided 1322-18MM 1322-18MM 268005

3 Oster Blade Wash, 16oz aerosol spray can
Unit Cost 30 $5.84 $5.26 $5.62 $6.14 No Bid
Total Cost $175.20 $157.80 $168.60 $184.20
Supplier Part Number HS # 003460 525.00490.2 008272 078056833
Manufacturer Name Jarden-Sunbeam Not Provided Oster Sun
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided 076300-103-000 076300-103-00 076300-103-005

4 Clipper Cool 5-in-1 Cooling Spray, 13oz aerosol can
Unit Cost 30 $6.96 $5.92 $6.56 $7.32 No Bid
Total Cost $208.80 $177.60 $196.80 $219.60
Supplier Part Number HS # 024063 525.00480.2 021790 078342959
Manufacturer Name Andis Not Provided Andis And
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided 076300-101-004 12750 12750

5 Cobalt Plastic Prescription Vials, 13 Dram, 275/case
Unit Cost 1 $42.74 $39.89 $43.17 $33.35 No Bid
Total Cost $42.74 $39.89 $43.17 $33.35
Supplier Part Number HS # 038960 Not Provided 610169 078578572
Manufacturer Name Centor, 250/case 225.20010.2 VetOne 250/case DDW
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided MWREV13BL Not Provided WBREV13BL

6 Boston Rounds with Yorker Caps, 2oz
Unit Cost 1 $3.80 $19.60 $29.88 $33.33 No Bid
Total Cost $3.80 $19.60 $29.88 $33.33
Supplier Part Number HS # 003369 130.15010.2 616043 078079849
Manufacturer Name D&D, 12/bag Not Provided VetOne 4 bxs 25/bx VIP
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided SP-BY-002-025 Not Provided 20928
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7 Buster Clic Collars, Size 7.5 cm
Unit Cost 134 $0.94 $2.38 $1.64 $2.45 No Bid
Total Cost $125.96 $318.92 $219.76 $328.30
Supplier Part Number HS # 024583 350.01720.2 636006 078024695
Manufacturer Name Ganco Not Provided Vetone See Thru Jor
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided J0047A Not Provided J0047A

8 Buster Clic Collars, Size 10.0 cm
Unit Cost 730 $1.06 $2.76 $1.71 $2.90 No Bid
Total Cost $773.80 $2,014.80 $1,248.30 $2,117.00
Supplier Part Number HS # 024584 350.01721.2 637006 078024703
Manufacturer Name Ganco Not Provided Vetone See Thru Jor
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided J0047B Not Provided J0047B

9 Buster Clic Collars, Size 12.5 cm
Unit Cost 1,005 $1.20 $5.49 $1.92 $3.35 No Bid
Total Cost $1,206.00 $5,517.45 $1,929.60 $3,366.75
Supplier Part Number HS # 024585 350.01725.2 638006 078024711
Manufacturer Name Ganco Not Provided VetOne See Thru Jor
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided J0047F Not Provided J0047G

10 Buster Clic Collars, Size 15.0 cm
Unit Cost 1,120 $2.00 $3.49 $2.17 $3.70 No Bid
Total Cost $2,240.00 $3,908.80 $2,430.40 $4,144.00
Supplier Part Number HS # 024586 350.01722.2 639006 078024729
Manufacturer Name Ganco Not Provided VetOne See Thru Jor
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided J0047C Not Provided J0047C

11 Buster Clic Collars, Size 20.0 cm
Unit Cost 1,137 $2.28 $3.79 $2.30 $4.00 No Bid
Total Cost $2,592.36 $4,309.23 $2,615.10 $4,548.00
Supplier Part Number HS # 024587 350-01723.2 640006 078024737
Manufacturer Name Ganco Not Provided VetOne See Thru Jor
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided J0047D Not Provided J0047D

12 Buster Clic Collars, Size 25.0 cm
Unit Cost 990 $2.70 $4.88 $2.89 $5.00 No Bid
Total Cost $2,673.00 $4,831.20 $2,861.10 $4,950.00
Supplier Part Number HS # 024588 350.01724.2 641006 078024745
Manufacturer Name Ganco Not Provided VetOne See Thru Jor
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided J0047E Not Provided J0047E
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13 Buster Clic Collars, Size 30.0 cm
Unit Cost 683 $3.49 $5.49 $3.61 $5.80 No Bid
Total Cost $2,383.67 $3,749.67 $2,465.63 $3,961.40
Supplier Part Number HS # 024589 350.01725.2 642006 078024752
Manufacturer Name Ganco Not Provided VetOne See Thru Jor
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided J0047F Not Provided J0047F

14 Canine Clear Plastic Anesthesia Masks, Small
Unit Cost 5 $25.94 $26.70 No Bid $26.47 No Bid
Total Cost $129.70 $133.50 $132.35
Supplier Part Number HS # 020464 080.00012.2 078010696
Manufacturer Name Smiths Not Provided SRV
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided 5304 32393B4

15 Canine Clear Plastic Anesthesia Masks, Large
Unit Cost 5 $25.94 $28.64 $23.74 $26.47 No Bid
Total Cost $129.70 $143.20 $118.70 $132.35
Supplier Part Number HS # 020461 080.00013.2 20872 078010688
Manufacturer Name Smiths Not Provided Surgivet SRV
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided $5,305.00 32393B1 32393B1

16 Canine Snap Parvo Antigen Test, 5 tests per box
Unit Cost 56 $81.63 $78.75 $63.00 $63.00 No Bid
Total Cost $4,571.28 $4,410.00 $3,528.00 $3,528.00
Supplier Part Number HS # 017277 013.01300.2 020944 078015100
Manufacturer Name Idexx Not Provided Idexx Idx
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided 99-09214 99-09214 99-09214

17 Disposable Breathing Bags, 0.5 liter
Unit Cost 30 $4.88 $21.10 $16.63 $3.33 No Bid
Total Cost $146.40 $633.00 $498.90 $99.90
Supplier Part Number HS # 016062 001.04715.2 003423 078022117
Manufacturer Name Jorgensen Not Provided Bickford Wet
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided 2107502 18900 07-6205

18 Disposable Breathing Bags, 1 liter
Unit Cost 10 $4.88 $16.95 $15.48 $3.33 No Bid
Total Cost $48.80 $169.50 $154.80 $33.30
Supplier Part Number HS # 016065 001.04700.2 008302 078022125
Manufacturer Name Jorgensen Not Provided Bickford Wet
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided 2107102 18701 7-6201
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19 Disposable Breathing Bags, 2 liter
Unit Cost 15 $6.15 $18.10 $15.89 $3.33 No Bid
Total Cost $92.25 $271.50 $238.35 $49.95
Supplier Part Number HS # 021062 001.04705.2 005927 078025778
Manufacturer Name Smiths Not Provided Bickford Wet
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided 2107202 18702 7-6202

20 Disposable Breathing Bags, 3 liter
Unit Cost 20 $6.15 $18.72 $16.17 $3.33 No Bid
Total Cost $123.00 $374.40 $323.40 $66.60
Supplier Part Number HS # 021063 001.04710.2 005928 078010423
Manufacturer Name Smiths Not Provided Bickford Wet
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided 2107302 18703 7-6203

21 FLOMAX Needle with Plastic Hub, 18 ga
Unit Cost 175 $2.88 No Bid No Bid $3.03 $7.16
Total Cost $504.00 $530.25 $1,253.00
Supplier Part Number HS # 029470 078341330 8881250040-CP
Manufacturer Name Nipro NIP Kendall Price/100
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided AH+1825 Not Provided

22 FLOMAX Needle with Plastic Hub, 22 ga 
Unit Cost 13 $2.88 No Bid No Bid $3.03 No Bid
Total Cost $37.44 $39.39
Supplier Part Number HS # 029477 078341397
Manufacturer Name Nipro NIP
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided AH+2219

23 Disposable Surgeon’s Cap, 100/box
Unit Cost 15 $16.88 No Bid $7.70 $24.43 No Bid
Total Cost $253.20 $115.50 $366.45
Supplier Part Number HS # 031936 015149 078351933
Manufacturer Name Medline Jorgensen Bus
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided J735 335

24 F/Air Canister – Anesthesia Gas Filter Unit
Unit Cost 520 $6.49 No Bid $5.47 $5.78 No Bid
Total Cost $3,374.80 $2,844.40 $3,005.60
Supplier Part Number HS # 034252 009484 78010225
Manufacturer Name Bickford Bickford AMB
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided 80120 80120



City of San Antonio
Draft Bid Tabulation

Page 5 of 16

Opened: August 8, 2014

For: Veterinary Supplies for Animal Care Services
Butler Animal Health 
Supply, LLC 
dba Henry Schein Animal 
Health

Midwest Veterinary 
Supply, Inc.

MWI VeterinarySupply
Patterson Veterinary 
Supply

Pethealth Services USA 
Inc.

6100004850 VF 400 Metro Place North 1124- Grader Street 3041 W. Pasadena Drive 12625 Wetmore Rd., Ste 
1031

3315 Algoniquin Road 
East

Item Description
Annual 

Estimated 
Quantities

Dublin,
OH  43017

Dallas,
Texas 75238

Boise,
ID  83705

San Antonio,
TX  78247

Rolling Meadows,
IL  60008

25 Fecal Loop, Standard, 3/8” W 
Unit Cost 25 $2.44 $2.44 $2.30 $2.56 No Bid
Total Cost $61.00 $61.00 $57.50 $64.00
Supplier Part Number HS # 000994 350.04540.2 004711 078021927
Manufacturer Name Jorgensen Not Provided Jorgensen Jorg
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided J0147 J147 J0147

26 Fecal Loop, Puppy and Kitten, ¼” W 
Unit Cost 25 $2.44 $2.44 $2.30 $2.56 No Bid
Total Cost $61.00 $61.00 $57.50 $64.00
Supplier Part Number HS # 006549 350.04542.2 007991 078021935
Manufacturer Name Jorgensen Not Provided Jorgensen Jorg
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided J0147P J147P J0147P

27 FECA-Med Pre-Mixed Solution
Unit Cost 13 $5.85 $20.71 $5.45 $6.28 No Bid
Total Cost $76.05 $269.23 $70.85 $81.64
Supplier Part Number HS # 029905 266.20100.3 GAL 601038 078696459
Manufacturer Name First Priority Not Provided VetOne Ved
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided 411470 Not Provided VINV-GENA-3634

28 Feeding Tube and Urethral Catheter, 8 Fr 
Unit Cost 60 $0.97 $0.97 $9.89 $1.00 $79.67
Total Cost $58.20 $58.20 $593.40 $60.00 $4,780.20
Supplier Part Number HS # 002040 366.72200.4 037426 078061691 8890700811-CP

Manufacturer Name Covidien Not Provided Jorgensen 5/pack Ken Covidien/Kendall Price/100
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided 8890700811 J0348B 8890700811 Not Provided

29 Feeding Tube and Urethral Catheter, 3 ½ Fr 
Unit Cost 60 $0.97 $0.97 $34.48 $1.00 No Bid
Total Cost $58.20 $58.20 $2,068.80 $60.00
Supplier Part Number HS # 002038 366.72000.4 032897 078061451
Manufacturer Name Covidien Not Provided Jorgensen Ken
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided 8890700316 J386 8890700316

30 Canine Snap Heartworm RT Test
Unit Cost 360 $193.35 $207.00 $165.60 $165.60 No Bid
Total Cost $69,606.00 $74,520.00 $59,616.00 $59,616.00
Supplier Part Number HS # 011042 013.00314.2 020941 078015308
Manufacturer Name Idexx Not Provided Idexx Idx
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided 99-09440 99-06440 99-09440
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31 Witness Canine Heartworm PF Antigen Test
Unit Cost 350 No Bid No Bid $95.65 No Bid No Bid
Total Cost $33,477.50
Supplier Part Number 046721
Manufacturer Name Zoetis
Manufacturer Part Number 3205

32 Feline Snap FeLV Antigen/FIV Combo Test
Unit Cost 25 $490.38 $314.25 $406.80 $406.80 No Bid
Total Cost $12,259.50 $7,856.25 $10,170.00 $10,170.00
Supplier Part Number HS # 007232 013.00600.2 020946 078015480
Manufacturer Name Idexx Not Provided Idexx Idx
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided 99-08353 99-08354 99-08354

33 IV Cap, Luer Lock, 1”
Unit Cost 12 $7.93 $0.44 No Bid $0.46 No Bid
Total Cost $95.16 $5.28 $5.52
Supplier Part Number HS # 031890 193.34000.2 078067196
Manufacturer Name Private Label Not Provided Ter
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided 300700 300700

34 Extension Set with a CLEARLINK Luer 
Unit Cost 50 $1.19 $2.47 No Bid $2.05 No Bid
Total Cost $59.50 $123.50 $102.50
Supplier Part Number HS # 039227 070.24000.2 078454226
Manufacturer Name Practivet Not Provided Baxter
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided 2C5641 ACT5612

35 Kendall Curity Standard Porous Tape, 1”
Unit Cost 40 $12.48 $12.49 $12.99 $13.20 $10.55
Total Cost $499.20 $499.60 $519.60 $528.00 $422.00
Supplier Part Number HS # 001415 366.18100.4 001691 078053577 2531-CP

Manufacturer Name Covidien Not Provided Covidien Ken
Covidien/Kendall 

Price 12/box
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided 2531C 2531C 2531C Not Provided

36 Kendall Surgi-Drape, 38.5” wide
Unit Cost 52 $77.76 $77.85 $73.29 $81.75 $66.17
Total Cost $4,043.52 $4,048.20 $3,811.08 $4,251.00 $3,440.84
Supplier Part Number HS # 001412 366.21000.4 006369 078053726 2345-CP
Manufacturer Name Covidien Not Provided Covidien Ken Covidien/Kendall
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided 2345 2345 2345 Not Provided
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37 Kendall Sharps Container, 4 Qt 
Unit Cost 6 $2.75 $2.75 $2.60 $2.90 $2.65
Total Cost $16.50 $16.50 $15.60 $17.40 $15.90
Supplier Part Number HS # 004240 366.71050.4 022341 078419295 8881676236-CP
Manufacturer Name Covidien Not Provided Covidien Ken Covidien/Kendall
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided 8881676236 676236 8861676236 Not Provided

38 Kendall Sharps Container, 8 Gal 
Unit Cost 150 $15.07 $11.44 $15.23 $12.10 $11.22
Total Cost $2,260.50 $1,716.00 $2,284.50 $1,815.00 $1,683.00
Supplier Part Number HS # 023717 366.71320.4 023181 078061899 8980-CP
Manufacturer Name Covidien Not Provided Covidien Ken Covidien/Kendall
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided 8980 8980 8980 Not Provided

39 Maxon Suture with Reverse Cutting Needle Point, GS-11
Unit Cost 200 $161.00 $161.20 $151.75 $174.25 No Bid
Total Cost $32,200.00 $32,240.00 $30,350.00 $34,850.00
Supplier Part Number HS # 003977 366.85020.4 000824 078018175
Manufacturer Name Covidien Not Provided Ethicon Ken
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided 8886675561 8886675561 8886675561

40 Maxon Suture with Reverse Cutting Needle Point, C-14, 2/0
Unit Cost 200 $165.67 $165.87 $156.15 $174.25 $136.08
Total Cost $33,134.00 $33,174.00 $31,230.00 $34,850.00 $27,216.00
Supplier Part Number HS # 006935 366.85340.4 011761 078018324 8886664151-CP
Manufacturer Name Covidien Not Provided Ethicon Ken Covidien Ltd.
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided 8886664141 8886664151 8886664151 Not Provided

41 Maxon Suture with Reverse Cutting Needle Point, C-14, 3/0
Unit Cost 100 $165.67 $165.87 $156.15 $174.25 $138.29
Total Cost $16,567.00 $16,587.00 $15,615.00 $17,425.00 $13,829.00
Supplier Part Number HS # 005835 366.85140.4 010038 078018258 8886664141-CP
Manufacturer Name Covidien Not Provided Ethicon Ken Covidien Ltd.
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided 8886664151 888664141 8886664141 Not Provided

42 Maxon Suture with Reverse Cutting Needle Point, C-13
Unit Cost 3 $165.67 $165.87 $156.15 $174.25 No Bid
Total Cost $497.01 $497.61 $468.45 $522.75
Supplier Part Number HS # 009793 366.85320.4 009603 078018209
Manufacturer Name Covidien Not Provided Ethicon Ken
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided 8886663941 8886663931 8886663931



City of San Antonio
Draft Bid Tabulation

Page 8 of 16

Opened: August 8, 2014

For: Veterinary Supplies for Animal Care Services
Butler Animal Health 
Supply, LLC 
dba Henry Schein Animal 
Health

Midwest Veterinary 
Supply, Inc.

MWI VeterinarySupply
Patterson Veterinary 
Supply

Pethealth Services USA 
Inc.

6100004850 VF 400 Metro Place North 1124- Grader Street 3041 W. Pasadena Drive 12625 Wetmore Rd., Ste 
1031

3315 Algoniquin Road 
East

Item Description
Annual 

Estimated 
Quantities

Dublin,
OH  43017

Dallas,
Texas 75238

Boise,
ID  83705

San Antonio,
TX  78247

Rolling Meadows,
IL  60008

43 Monoject Syringe Luer Lock with Needle, 3 cc, 22 gauge
Unit Cost 773 $5.76 $12.22 $11.51 $12.55 No Bid
Total Cost $4,452.48 $9,446.06 $8,897.23 $9,701.15
Supplier Part Number HS # 029500 366.62200.4 002159 078062162
Manufacturer Name Covidien Not Provided Covidien Ken
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided 8881505223 505223 8881505223

44 Microscope Cover Slips
Unit Cost 696 $1.81 $2.20 $2.31 $3.31 No Bid
Total Cost $1,259.76 $1,531.20 $1,607.76 $2,303.76
Supplier Part Number HS # 010087 350.05959.2 605021 078424005
Manufacturer Name Longview Not Provided VetOne WVP
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided J0336 Not Provided 07-842-4005

45 Microscope Slides
Unit Cost 62 $2.00 $2.08 $2.38 $2.65 No Bid
Total Cost $124.00 $128.96 $147.56 $164.30
Supplier Part Number HS # 037993 350.05957.2 604021 078423997
Manufacturer Name Private Label Not Provided VetOne WVP
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided J0335 Not Provided 07-842-3997

46 Nail Trimmers, 747 Jumbo
Unit Cost 2 $7.29 No Bid $6.72 $7.44 $2.99
Total Cost $14.58 $13.44 $14.88 $5.98
Supplier Part Number HS # 006891 005156 078084178 W6210
Manufacturer Name Tecla Tecla Tel Coastal Pets
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided 747 PF0748 Not Provided

47 Non-Spermicidal Lubricating Jelly
Unit Cost 72 $1.71 $3.07 $1.78 $2.05 No Bid
Total Cost $123.12 $221.04 $128.16 $147.60
Supplier Part Number HS # 003800 001.38694.2 007804 078360577
Manufacturer Name First Priority Not Provided First Priority FIR
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided 0281.0205.36 Not Provided 1LU040

48 A5 Clipper Blades, Cyrogen-X, Size 40
Unit Cost 195 $20.48 $20.50 $19.30 $23.91 No Bid
Total Cost $3,993.60 $3,997.50 $3,763.50 $4,662.45
Supplier Part Number HS # 025107 525.00300.2 000306 078056718
Manufacturer Name Jarden-Sunbeam Not Provided Oster Sun
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided 078919-016-003 78919-016-005 078919-016-005
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49 Fecal Float Device
Unit Cost 2 $17.68 No Bid $19.54 $12.75 No Bid
Total Cost $35.36 $39.08 $25.50
Supplier Part Number HS # 022872 024661 078682625
Manufacturer Name Jorgensen Jorgensen PVS
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided J950 FEC01WB

50 Plastic Endotracheal Tubes with Cuff, 3.0 mm
Unit Cost 13 $8.05 No Bid $1.31 $2.73 No Bid
Total Cost $104.65 $17.03 $35.49
Supplier Part Number HS # 017195 601029 078636315
Manufacturer Name Jorgensen VetOne RUS
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided Not Provided 112480030

51 Plastic Endotracheal Tubes with Cuff, 3.5 mm 
Unit Cost 6 $1.50 No Bid $1.31 $2.73 No Bid
Total Cost $9.00 $7.86 $16.38
Supplier Part Number HS # 007944 602029 078011035
Manufacturer Name Dee VetOne RUS
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided Not Provided 112480035

52 Plastic Endotracheal Tubes with Cuff, 4.0 mm 
Unit Cost 6 $1.50 No Bid $1.31 $2.73 No Bid
Total Cost $9.00 $7.86 $16.38
Supplier Part Number HS # 007945 603029 078011043
Manufacturer Name Dee VetOne RUS
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided Not Provided 112480040

53 Plastic Endotracheal Tubes with Cuff, 4.5 mm 
Unit Cost 5 $1.50 No Bid $1.31 $2.73 No Bid
Total Cost $7.50 $6.55 $13.65
Supplier Part Number HS # 007946 604029 078011050
Manufacturer Name Dee VetOne RUS
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided Not Provided 112480045

54 Plastic Endotracheal Tubes with Cuff, 5.0 mm
Unit Cost 5 $1.50 No Bid $1.31 $2.73 No Bid
Total Cost $7.50 $6.55 $13.65
Supplier Part Number HS # 001768 605029 078007143
Manufacturer Name Dee VetOne RUS
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided Not Provided 112082-050
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Butler Animal Health 
Supply, LLC 
dba Henry Schein Animal 
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Supply, Inc.
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Dallas,
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Boise,
ID  83705

San Antonio,
TX  78247

Rolling Meadows,
IL  60008

55 Plastic Endotracheal Tubes with Cuff, 5.5 mm 
Unit Cost 5 $1.50 No Bid $1.31 $2.73 No Bid
Total Cost $7.50 $6.55 $13.65
Supplier Part Number HS # 001769 606029 078007150
Manufacturer Name Dee VetOne RUS
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided Not Provided 112082-055

56 Plastic Endotracheal Tubes with Cuff, 6.0 mm 
Unit Cost 8 $1.50 No Bid $1.31 $2.27 No Bid
Total Cost $12.00 $10.48 $18.16
Supplier Part Number HS # 001770 607029 078007168
Manufacturer Name Dee VetOne RUS
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided Not Provided 112082-060

57 Plastic Endotracheal Tubes with Cuff, 6.5 mm 
Unit Cost 1 $1.50 No Bid $1.31 $2.27 No Bid
Total Cost $1.50 $1.31 $2.27
Supplier Part Number HS # 001771 608029 078007176
Manufacturer Name Dee VetOne RUS
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided Not Provided 112082-065

58 Plastic Endotracheal Tubes with Cuff, 7.0 mm 
Unit Cost 18 $1.50 No Bid $1.31 $2.27 No Bid
Total Cost $27.00 $23.58 $40.86
Supplier Part Number HS # 001772 609029 078007184
Manufacturer Name Dee VetOne RUS
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided Not Provided 112082-070

59 Plastic Endotracheal Tubes with Cuff, 7.5 mm 
Unit Cost 15 $1.50 No Bid $1.31 $2.27 No Bid
Total Cost $22.50 $19.65 $34.05
Supplier Part Number HS # 001773 610029 078007192
Manufacturer Name Dee VetOne RUS
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided Not Provided 112082-075

60 Plastic Endotracheal Tubes with Cuff, 8.0 mm 
Unit Cost 15 $1.50 No Bid $1.31 $2.27 No Bid
Total Cost $22.50 $19.65 $34.05
Supplier Part Number HS # 001774 611029 078007200
Manufacturer Name Dee VetOne RUS
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided Not Provided 112082-080
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61 Plastic Endotracheal Tubes with Cuff, 8.5 mm
Unit Cost 8 $1.50 No Bid $1.31 $2.27 No Bid
Total Cost $12.00 $10.48 $18.16
Supplier Part Number HS # 001775 612029 078007218
Manufacturer Name Dee VetOne RUS
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided Not Provided 112082-085

62 Plastic Endotracheal Tubes with Cuff, 9.0 mm 
Unit Cost 8 $1.50 No Bid $1.31 $2.27 No Bid
Total Cost $12.00 $10.48 $18.16
Supplier Part Number HS # 001776 613029 078007226
Manufacturer Name Dee VetOne RUS
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided Not Provided 112082-090

63 Plastic Endotracheal Tubes with Cuff, 9.5 mm 
Unit Cost 1 $1.50 No Bid $1.31 $2.27 No Bid
Total Cost $1.50 $1.31 $2.27
Supplier Part Number HS # 001777 614029 078007234
Manufacturer Name Dee VetOne RUS
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided Not Provided 112082-095

64 Plastic EndotrachealTubes with Cuff, 10.0 mm
Unit Cost 1 $1.50 No Bid $1.31 $2.27 No Bid
Total Cost $1.50 $1.31 $2.27
Supplier Part Number HS # 001778 615029 078007242
Manufacturer Name Dee VetOne RUS
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided Not Provided 112082-100

65 Oster Power Pro Ultra Cordless Clipper 
Unit Cost 7 $187.68 No Bid $196.55 $146.15 No Bid
Total Cost $1,313.76 $1,375.85 $1,023.05
Supplier Part Number HS # 032487 029157 078594182
Manufacturer Name Jarden-Sunbeam Oster Sun
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided 78400-020 078400-020-000

66 Oster Power Pro Ultra Clipper Replacement Battery
Unit Cost 10 $40.24 No Bid $37.93 $42.31 No Bid
Total Cost $402.40 $379.30 $423.10
Supplier Part Number HS # 032490 029159 078560532
Manufacturer Name Jarden-Sunbeam Oster Sun
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided 78400-101 078400-101-000
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TX  78247
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67 Quick Muzzle, X-Small, 5-10 lbs
Unit Cost 10 No Bid No Bid $3.49 $3.80 No Bid
Total Cost $34.90 $38.00
Supplier Part Number 003701 078079377
Manufacturer Name FourFlags FOU
Manufacturer Part Number MD00 MD-00

68 Quick Muzzle, Small, 10-25 lbs
Unit Cost 10 No Bid No Bid $3.58 $3.80 No Bid
Total Cost $35.80 $38.00
Supplier Part Number 003702 078079344
Manufacturer Name FourFlags FOU
Manufacturer Part Number MD01 MD-01

69 Quick Muzzle, Medium, 25-45 lbs
Unit Cost 10 No Bid No Bid $3.72 $3.80 No Bid
Total Cost $37.20 $38.00
Supplier Part Number 003703 078079310
Manufacturer Name FourFlags FOU
Manufacturer Part Number MD02 MD-02

70 Quick Muzzle, Large, 45-60 lbs
Unit Cost 10 No Bid No Bid $3.60 $3.76 No Bid
Total Cost $36.00 $37.60
Supplier Part Number 003705 078079302
Manufacturer Name FourFlags FOU
Manufacturer Part Number MD03 MD-03

71 Quick Muzzle, X-Large, 60-80 lbs
Unit Cost 10 No Bid No Bid $3.73 $3.76 $6.29
Total Cost $37.30 $37.60 $62.90
Supplier Part Number 3706 078079351 1300-BLK
Manufacturer Name FourFlags FOU Coastal Pet Products
Manufacturer Part Number MD04 MD-04 Not Provided

72 TomKat Catheters 
Unit Cost 5 $0.80 No Bid $0.72 $0.81 $6.50
Total Cost $4.00 $3.60 $4.05 $32.50
Supplier Part Number HS # 002094 008277 078061378 8890703021-CP 50/box
Manufacturer Name Covidien Covidien Ken Covidien Ltd.
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided 88980703021 8890703021 Not Provided
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73 Silicone Foley Catheter, 6 Fr 
Unit Cost 5 $12.68 No Bid $20.11 $22.45 No Bid
Total Cost $63.40 $100.55 $112.25
Supplier Part Number HS # 022216 022065 078382450
Manufacturer Name Jorgensen Cook SRV
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided FC655 FC655

74 MILA Foley Catheter, 8 Fr 
Unit Cost 5 $34.52 No Bid $32.32 $36.55 No Bid
Total Cost $172.60 $161.60 $182.75
Supplier Part Number HS # 025035 Not Provided 078668684
Manufacturer Name Mila Not Provided MILA
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided Not Provided UC824

75 Snap Feline Triple Test
Unit Cost 15 $490.38 No Bid $406.80 $406.80 No Bid
Total Cost $7,355.70 $6,102.00 $6,102.00
Supplier Part Number HS # 049807 033346 078673972
Manufacturer Name Idexx Idexx Idx
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided 99-000673 99-0000673

76 Sodasorb CO2 Absorbent, 3 lb canister
Unit Cost 520 $10.14 No Bid $5.98 $7.22 No Bid
Total Cost $5,272.80 $3,109.60 $3,754.40
Supplier Part Number HS # 023840 032160 078084582
Manufacturer Name Allied Jorgensen SRV
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided J553 008860

77 Steriking Sterilization Packaging, 5" x 10.5"
Unit Cost 12 $6.02 No Bid $14.98 $21.49 No Bid
Total Cost $72.24 $179.76 $257.88
Supplier Part Number HS # 037275 008498 078020554
Manufacturer Name Henry Schein PVL Cotte Het
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided PM5410 SS4

78 Sterile Stainless Steel Suture
Unit Cost 13 $25.61 No Bid $24.14 $26.93 No Bid
Total Cost $332.93 $313.82 $350.09
Supplier Part Number HS # 001038 014797 078021703
Manufacturer Name Jorgensen Jorgensen Jorg
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided J91S J0091S20
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79 Terumo Surflo IV Catheter
Unit Cost 673 $0.83 No Bid $0.78 $0.87 No Bid
Total Cost $558.59 $524.94 $585.51
Supplier Part Number HS # 010289 008096 078067287
Manufacturer Name Terumo Terumo Ter
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided SROX2225V 22250

80 Surgical Masks, with earlooops
Unit Cost 8 $3.12 No Bid $3.08 $4.22 No Bid
Total Cost $24.96 $24.64 $33.76
Supplier Part Number HS # 037893 610124 078334513
Manufacturer Name Henry Schein PVL VetOne Jor
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided Not Provided J0733

81 Triflex Sterile Latex Surgical Gloves, Powdered, Size 6.5
Unit Cost 91 $20.07 No Bid $18.91 $23.22 No Bid
Total Cost $1,826.37 $1,720.81 $2,113.02
Supplier Part Number HS # 019732 011616 078347231
Manufacturer Name Cardinal Allegiance Alg
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided 2D7252 2D7252

82 Triflex Sterile Latex Surgical Gloves, Powdered, Size 7.0
Unit Cost 3 $20.07 No Bid $18.91 $23.22 No Bid
Total Cost $60.21 $56.73 $69.66
Supplier Part Number HS # 019733 011617 078347249
Manufacturer Name Cardinal Allegiance Alg
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided 2D7253 2D7253

83 Triflex Sterile Latex Surgical Gloves, Powdered, Size 7.5, 
Unit Cost 10 $20.07 No Bid $18.91 $23.22 No Bid
Total Cost $200.70 $189.10 $232.20
Supplier Part Number HS # 019734 011618 078347256
Manufacturer Name Cardinal Allegiance Alg
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided 2D7254 2D7254

84 Triflex Sterile Latex Surgical Gloves, Powdered, Size 8
Unit Cost 122 $20.07 No Bid $18.91 $23.22 No Bid
Total Cost $2,448.54 $2,307.02 $2,832.84
Supplier Part Number HS # 019735 011619 078347264
Manufacturer Name Cardinal Allegiance Alg
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided 2D7255 2DS7255
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85 Tuberculin Syringe/Needle Combo, 25 ga 
Unit Cost 372 $8.54 No Bid $20.41 $22.77 $16.99
Total Cost $3,176.88 $7,592.52 $8,470.44 $6,320.28
Supplier Part Number HS # 029504 002281 078061238 8881501160-CP 100/box
Manufacturer Name Nipro Covidien Ken Covidien Ltd.
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided 501160 8881501160 Not Provided

86 Monoject Syringe without needle, 6cc
Unit Cost 191 $8.94 No Bid $8.42 $9.40 $7.53
Total Cost $1,707.54 $1,608.22 $1,795.40 $1,438.23
Supplier Part Number HS # 009960 001383 078061030 8881516937-CP
Manufacturer Name Covidien Covidien Ken Covidien Ltd.
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided 516937 8881516937 Not Provided

87 Monoject Sterile Syringe, Luer Lock, 60CC
Unit Cost 10 $18.78 No Bid $18.05 $20.13 $93.97
Total Cost $187.80 $180.50 $201.30 $939.70
Supplier Part Number HS # 050397 005790 078337901 8881560125-CP
Manufacturer Name Covidien Covidien Ken Covidien Ltd.
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided 560125 8881560125 Not Provided

88 Monoject Sterile Syringe, 12 mL, Luer-Lock Tip
Unit Cost 52 $17.74 No Bid $16.74 $18.70 $14.56
Total Cost $922.48 $870.48 $972.40 $757.12
Supplier Part Number HS # 012571 013737 078061089 8881512878-CP
Manufacturer Name Covidien Covidien Ken Covidien Ltd.
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided 512878 8881512878

89 Ultrasonic Cleaner & Heater
Unit Cost 1 $468.29 No Bid No Bid $702.00 No Bid
Total Cost $468.29 $702.00
Supplier Part Number HS # 032100 078597539
Manufacturer Name Tuttanauer Tut
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided CSU1H

90 Vetoquinol IV Administration Set
Unit Cost 40 $2.90 No Bid No Bid $3.25 No Bid
Total Cost $116.00 $130.00
Supplier Part Number HS # 022998 078368247
Manufacturer Name Vetoquinol EVS
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided 411433
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91 Scalpel Blades, Individually Sealed, Size 10
Unit Cost 145 $9.06 No Bid $18.69 $12.50 No Bid
Total Cost $1,313.70 $2,710.05 $1,812.50
Supplier Part Number HS # 007319 011386 078367510
Manufacturer Name Private Label Cinc WVP
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided #10 07-836-7510

92 Webglue Tissue Adhesive
Unit Cost 365 $7.54 $16.45 $12.95 $9.48 No Bid
Total Cost $2,752.10 $6,004.25 $4,726.75 $3,460.20
Supplier Part Number HS # 031477 004.36000.3 006245 078910065
Manufacturer Name CP Medical Not Provided 3M WVP
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided 32046-04-01 VetBond 07-891-0065

93 Non-Woven Sponges, White, 3” x 3”, Viscose
Unit Cost 1,051 $1.01 $32.42 $1.53 $1.64 No Bid
Total Cost $1,061.51 $34,073.42 $1,608.03 $1,723.64
Supplier Part Number HS # 019924 366.03529.4 041019 078473539
Manufacturer Name Private Label Not Proivded Covidien WVP
Manufacturer Part Number Not Provided 441401 441401 07-841-3539

Terms 1% 10 Days Net 30 Net 30 1% 10 Day Net 30

Estimated Annual Total
Estimated Annual Award
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