Opened: June 16, 2014

City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

For: Rental of Construction Equipment Hertz quipment Rental Nueces Power Equipment |Sunbelt Rentals, Inc Tejas Rentals / Marentco |Vermeer Eguipment of
Corporation Texas-Louisana
6100004508 Al 668 North W.W. White Rd (4967 FM 1516 North 2341 Deerfield Drive 6380 Randolph Blvd 16593 IH35 N.
item Description San Antonio, Converse, Fort Mill, San Antonio, Selma,
TX 78219 TX 78109 SC 29715 TX 78233 TX 78154

1 Trencher Walk Behind
Make & Model Barreto E1324 or equivalent NO BID Vermeer - RTX100 Ditchwitch - 1330 Vermeer - RTX100
Price per Day $100.00 $95.00 $110.00 $300.00
Price per Week $200.00 $225.00 $425.00 $900.00
Price per Month $540.00 $695.00 $1,095.00 $2,700.00
Delivery & Pick up Price (per round trip) $60.00 $50.00 $65.00 $200.00

2 Trencher Riding
Make & Model D-W 3700 NO BID Vermeer - RTX450 Ditchwitch - RT45 Vermeer - RTX450
Price per Day $240.00 $250.00 $295.00 $600.00
Price per Week $665.00 $650.00 $795.00 $1,800.00
Price per Month $1,560.00 $1,595.00 $2,125.00 $5,400.00
Delivery & Pick up Price (per round trip) $60.00 $50.00 $65.00 $200.00

3 Loader Backhoe
Make & Model Case - 580M Case - 580M Case - 580N John Deere - 310J NO BID
Price per Day $210.00 $247.00 $225.00 $210.00
Price per Week $520.00 $740.00 $650.00 $625.00
Price per Month $1,495.00 $1,870.00 $1,225.00 $1,750.00
Delivery & Pick up Price (per round trip) $60.00 $250.00 $50.00 $95.00

4 Dump Truck
Make & Model NO BID Ford - F750 NO BID NO BID
Price per Day $175.00 $245.00
Price per Week $590.00 $615.00
Price per Month $1,495.00 $1,840.00
Delivery & Pick up Price (per round trip) $60.00 $150.00

5 Loader, Skid-Steer
Make & Model Bobcat - S130 Case - SR174 Bobcat - S175 Bobcat - 130 NO BID
Price per Day $145.00 $149.00 $150.00 $125.00
Price per Week $325.00 $447.00 $400.00 $365.00
Price per Month $775.00 $1,339.00 $1,095.00 $975.00
Delivery & Pick up Price (per round trip) $60.00 $250.00 $50.00 $65.00

6 Scissor Lift, 20'
Make & Model Genie - GS2032 NO BID Genie - GS1930 Genie - GS2032 NO BID
Price per Day $65.00 $95.00 $75.00
Price per Week $135.00 $195.00 $205.00
Price per Month $315.00 $350.00 $425.00
Delivery & Pick up Price (per round trip) $60.00 $50.00 $65.00

7 Scissor Lift, 26"
Make & Model Genie - GS2632 NO BID JLG - 2646ES Genie - GS2646 NO BID
Price per Day $75.00 $125.00 $95.00
Price per Week $150.00 $250.00 $265.00
Price per Month $395.00 $500.00 $495.00
Delivery & Pick up Price (per round trip) $60.00 $50.00 $65.00
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8 Air Compressor Portable
Make & Model Doosa - 5SWKU-TS NO BID Sullivan - D185PJD Sullivan - D185P3JD NO BID
Price per Day $55.00 $85.00 $75.00
Price per Week $130.00 $200.00 $205.00
Price per Month $400.00 $445.00 $525.00
Delivery & Pick up Price (per round trip) $60.00 $50.00 $65.00

9 Jack Hammer 60lb
Make & Model Breaker NO BID APT - 160 Sullair - MPB60 NO BID
Price per Day $25.00 $25.00 $40.00
Price per Week $35.00 $75.00 $125.00
Price per Month $85.00 $225.00 $295.00
Delivery & Pick up Price (per round trip) $60.00 $50.00 $65.00

10 |Jack Hammer 90Ib
Make & Model Breaker NO BID APT - 190 Sulliar - MPB90 NO BID
Price per Day $30.00 $25.00 $45.00
Price per Week $45.00 $75.00 $135.00
Price per Month $115.00 $225.00 $305.00
Delivery & Pick up Price (per round trip) $60.00 $50.00 $65.00

11 |Construction Forklift
Make & Model Case - 580G NO BID JCB-930 NO BID NO BID
Price per Day $165.00 $200.00
Price per Week $435.00 $500.00
Price per Month $1,250.00 $1,350.00
Delivery & Pick up Price (per round trip) $60.00 $50.00

12 |8 Ton Roller
Make & Model I-R SD-70D NO BID JCB - VM75PD NO BID NO BID
Price per Day $310.00 $465.00
Price per Week $805.00 $1,450.00
Price per Month $2,380.00 $3,655.00
Delivery & Pick up Price (per round trip) $60.00 $150.00

13 |3 Ton Roller
Make & Model I-R DD-24 Hamm - HD12 JCB - VMT270 Wacker - RD27-120 NO BID
Price per Day $105.00 $166.00 $295.00 $175.00
Price per Week $500.00 $493.00 $915.00 $525.00
Price per Month $990.00 $1,479.00 $2,605.00 $1,395.00
Delivery & Pick up Price (per round trip) $60.00 $250.00 $150.00 $95.00

14 Dozer
Make & Model John Deere - 550 Case - 650L John Deer - 450JLGP NO BID NO BID
Price per Day $320.00 $468.00 $400.00
Price per Week $900.00 $1,403.00 $1,200.00
Price per Month $2,480.00 $4,208.00 $3,200.00
Delivery & Pick up Price (per round trip) $60.00 $250.00 $150.00
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 16, 2014
For: Rental of Construction Equipment Hertz quipment Rental Nueces Power Equipment |Sunbelt Rentals, Inc Tejas Rentals / Marentco |Vermeer Eguipment of
Corporation Texas-Louisana
6100004508 Al 668 North W.W. White Rd (4967 FM 1516 North 2341 Deerfield Drive 6380 Randolph Blvd 16593 IH35 N.
item Description San Antonio, Converse, Fort Mill, San Antonio, Selma,
TX 78219 TX 78109 SC 29715 TX 78233 TX 78154
15 Dozer
Make & Model John Deere - 650J Case - 850L John Deere - 650JLT NO BID NO BID
Price per Day $335.00 $519.00 $500.00
Price per Week $950.00 $1,583.00 $1,350.00
Price per Month $2,995.00 $4,667.00 $3,500.00
Delivery & Pick up Price (per round trip) $60.00 $250.00 $150.00
16 |Track Excavator
Make & Model Case - CX225 Hyundai - 210 Kobelco - SK210 NO BID NO BID
Price per Day $505.00 $604.00 $600.00
Price per Week $1,500.00 $1,811.00 $1,750.00
Price per Month $4,505.00 $5,432.00 $5,500.00
Delivery & Pick up Price (per round trip) $60.00 $1,000.00 $150.00
17 |Track Excavator
Make & Model Case - CX135 Hyundai - 145 John Deere - 130G John Deere - 130GLC NO BID
Price per Day $390.00 $468.00 $500.00 $585.00
Price per Week $1,025.00 $1,403.00 $1,300.00 $1,350.00
Price per Month $3,210.00 $4,208.00 $4,000.00 $3,650.00
Delivery & Pick up Price (per round trip) $60.00 $850.00 $150.00 $110.00
18 |Water Truck
Make & Model Chevy - C7500 NO BID Ford Truck - F650 Ford - F750 NO BID
Price per Day $200.00 $325.00 $287.00
Price per Week $600.00 $865.00 $1,097.00
Price per Month $1,565.00 $2,750.00 $2,695.00
Delivery & Pick up Price (per round trip) $60.00 $150.00 $110.00
19 10 Ton Equipment Trailer
Ledwell 8'x24" -
Make & Model Anderson - TA10TC NO BID LW36X102PHT2 NO BID NO BID
Price per Day $90.00 $130.00
Price per Week $245.00 $325.00
Price per Month $740.00 $610.00
Delivery & Pick up Price (per round trip) $60.00 $50.00
20 1 Ton Roller
Make & Model I-R DD-12 NO BID MQ - AR13HA Wacker - RD12A NO BID
Price per Day $105.00 $150.00 $120.00
Price per Week $500.00 $400.00 $380.00
Price per Month $990.00 $1,000.00 $1,125.00
Delivery & Pick up Price (per round trip) $60.00 $50.00 $110.00
21 11 Ton Roller
Make & Model Bomag BW211D-4 NO BID HAMM - 3414 NO BID NO BID
Price per Day $325.00 $490.00
Price per Week $900.00 $1,410.00
Price per Month $2,795.00 $4,175.00
Delivery & Pick up Price (per round trip) $60.00 $150.00
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22 |Dump Truck
Make & Model Ford - F750 NO BID Ford - F750 NO BID NO BID
Price per Day $175.00 $245.00
Price per Week $590.00 $615.00
Price per Month $1,495.00 $1,840.00
Delivery & Pick up Price (per round trip) $60.00 $150.00

23 [Ride on Trencher
Make & Model D-W 3700 NO BID Vermeer - RTX450 Ditchwitch - RT45 Vermeer - RTX550
Price per Day $240.00 $250.00 $295.00 $722.00
Price per Week $665.00 $600.00 $795.00 $2,166.00
Price per Month $150.00 $1,495.00 $2,125.00 $6,500.00
Delivery & Pick up Price (per round trip) $60.00 $50.00 $65.00 $200.00

24 |Track Excavator
Make & Model Bobcat 325 NO BID John Deere - 27D Wacker - 3823 Yanmar - V104561A
Price per Day $145.00 $185.00 $175.00 $333.00
Price per Week $385.00 $515.00 $505.00 $1,000.00
Price per Month $1,200.00 $1,375.00 $1,495.00 $3,000.00
Delivery & Pick up Price (per round trip) $60.00 $50.00 $95.00 $200.00

25 |Dump Truck
Make & Model Freight M2 NO BID| International - 760006x4 NO BID NO BID
Price per Day $420.00 $510.00
Price per Week $1,400.00 $2,040.00
Price per Month $3,195.00 $6,120.00
Delivery & Pick up Price (per round trip) $60.00 $350.00

26 |3Yd Loader
Make & Model Case 621D Hyundai - 740 Case - 621D NO BID NO BID
Price per Day $390.00 $544.00 $425.00
Price per Week $1,300.00 $1,628.00 $1,225.00
Price per Month $3,400.00 $4,888.00 $3,150.00
Delivery & Pick up Price (per round trip) $60.00 $500.00 $150.00

27 |1 Ton Wacker
Make & Model I-R DD-12 NO BID MQ - AR13HA NO BID NO BID
Price per Day $105.00 $150.00
Price per Week $500.00 $400.00
Price per Month $990.00 $1,000.00
Delivery & Pick up Price (per round trip) $60.00 $50.00

28 |Manlift / Towable Trailer / 35'
Make & Model JLG - t350 NO BID JLG - T340 Nifty Lift - TM34 -TGE NO BID
Price per Day $155.00 $150.00 $140.00
Price per Week $465.00 $400.00 $465.00
Price per Month $1,400.00 $1,000.00 $975.00
Delivery & Pick up Price (per round trip) $60.00 $50.00 $95.00
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29 |Boom-125-4W Telescopic
Make & Model Genie - FF NO BID JLG - 125JP NO BID NO BID
Price per Day $930.00 $1,250.00
Price per Week $2,655.00 $3,000.00
Price per Month $6,795.00 $7,000.00
Delivery & Pick up Price (per round trip) $60.00 $150.00

30 |86' Boom Lift Diesel 4WD
Make & Model JLG - 860SJ NO BID JLG - 800AJP NO BID NO BID
Price per Day $410.00 $750.00
Price per Week $1,200.00 $1,750.00
Price per Month $3,795.00 $3,950.00
Delivery & Pick up Price (per round trip) $60.00 $150.00

31 |80 Boom Lift Diesel 4AWD
Make & Model Genie - S80 NO BID JLG - 800 Genie - 280 NO BID
Price per Day $385.00 $750.00 $645.00
Price per Week $1,050.00 $1,750.00 $1,875.00
Price per Month $3,450.00 $3,950.00 $4,450.00
Delivery & Pick up Price (per round trip) $60.00 $150.00 $125.00

32 |60' Boom Lift
Make & Model Genie - S60 or JLG 600S NO BID JLG - 600S JLG - 600A NO BID
Price per Day $270.00 $300.00 $365.00
Price per Week $615.00 $900.00 $985.00
Price per Month $1,999.00 $2,250.00 $2,435.00
Delivery & Pick up Price (per round trip) $60.00 $150.00 $110.00
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 2% 10 Days Net 30 Net 30
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