
City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 13, 2014

For:
LAWNMOWERS, EDGERS, CHAIN SAWS, PARTS
AND SERVICE

Dewinne Equipment Co. James Lawnmower Sales & 
Service

John H. Sorloa, Inc.

6100004525 LM

Item Description Quantity

1 BRIGGS & STRATTON
A) Parts
1 Percent of discount offered 10% 21% 20%
2 Product Identification (Manufacturer) BS Briggs & Stratton Briggs & Stratton
3 Type of price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) MFG Dealer Dealer
4 Price Schedule Number 1013 C-Systems C-Systems Price File 
5 Date of Price Schedule 10/1/2013 3/5/2014 10/1/2013

6
Price schedule column on which discount is based                  
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)     

MFG List List

7 Warranty 60 days 30 days 60 days

B) Labor and Service
1 Labor Rate for Service (annual estimate 12 hours) 12 $30.00 $48.00 $65.00

Price Total $360.00 $576.00 $780.00
2 Mileage Charge (if applicable) 1 $2.00 $0.60 $0.20

Price Total $2.00 $0.60 $0.20
Subtotal $362.00 $576.60 $780.20

C) Pickup and Service Hours

1
Parts will be available for pick up within _______ calendar 
days after receipt of order.

5 days 3 - 5 days 5 days

2
Business hours are from _____ A.M. to ______ P.M. 
_______ days per week.

8 am - 5 pm, 5 days per week 8 am - 5 pm, 5 days per week 8 am - 5 pm, 5 days per week

D) BRIGGS & STRATTON SPECIFIED ITEMS

1 493537S Filter Foam A/C 10
Price Each $4.68 $4.11 $4.16

Price Total $46.80 $41.10 $41.60

Manufacturer Name Briggs Stratton Briggs  Briggs & Stratton

Part Number Filter 493537S 493537S

2 491588S Filter A/C Cartridge 30
Price Each $4.82 $4.27 $4.32

Price Total $144.60 $128.10 $129.60

Manufacturer Name Briggs Stratton Briggs Briggs & Stratton

Part Number Filter 491588S 491588S

3 298090S Filter Fuel 30
Price Each $2.70 $2.37 $2.40

Price Total $81.00 $71.10 $72.00

Manufacturer Name Briggs Stratton Briggs Brigss & Stratton

Part Number Filter 298090S 298090S

4 796112 Spark Plug 30
Price Each $2.92 $3.92 $3.12
Price Total $87.60 $117.60 $93.60
Manufacturer Name Briggs Stratton Briggs Briggs & Stratton
Part Number Spark Plug 796112 796112

5 698369 Filter A/C Foam 10
Price Each $3.69 $3.24 $3.28
Price Total $36.90 $32.40 $32.80
Manufacturer Name Briggs Stratton Briggs Briggs & Stratton
Part Number Filter 698369 698369
Subtotal $396.90 $390.30 $369.60
BRIGGS & STRATTON Total $758.90 $966.90 $1,149.80

2 ECHO  
A) Parts
1 Percent of discount offered 10% 21% 15%
2 Product Identification (Manufacturer) Eco Echo Echo
3 Type of price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) MFG Dealer Dealer
4 Price Schedule Number C-Systems C-Systems Price File
5 Date of Price Schedule 3/5/2014 4/22/2014

6
Price schedule column on which discount is based                  
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)     

MFG List List Price

7 Warranty 60 days 30 days 60 days

B) Labor and Service
1 Labor Rate for Service (annual estimate 50 hours) 50 $30.00 $48.00 $65.00

Price Total $1,500.00 $2,400.00 $3,250.00
2 Mileage Charge (if applicable) 1 $2.00 $0.60 $0.20

Price Total $2.00 $0.60 $0.20
Subtotal $1,502.00 $2,400.60 $3,250.20

C) Pickup and Service Hours

1
Parts will be available for pick up within _______ calendar 
days after receipt of order.

5 days 3 -5 days 5 days

2
Business hours are from _____ A.M. to ______ P.M. 
_______ days per week.

8 am - 5 pm, 5 days per week 8 am - 5 pm, 5 days per week 8 am - 5 pm, 5 days per week

11002 Bandera Rd.
San Antonio,
TX  78250

5034 Rigsby
San Antonio,
TX  78222

523 W. Cypress
San Antonio, 
TX  78212



City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 13, 2014

For:
LAWNMOWERS, EDGERS, CHAIN SAWS, PARTS
AND SERVICE

Dewinne Equipment Co. James Lawnmower Sales & 
Service

John H. Sorloa, Inc.

6100004525 LM

Item Description Quantity

11002 Bandera Rd.
San Antonio,
TX  78250

5034 Rigsby
San Antonio,
TX  78222

523 W. Cypress
San Antonio, 
TX  78212

D) ECHO Specified Items
1 Echo V299000250 Knob Screw 25

Price Each $2.56 $2.25 $2.42
Price Total $64.00 $56.25 $60.50
Manufacturer Name Echo Echo Echo
Part Number Knob V299000250 V299000250

2 Echo A232000480 Lid Air Cleaner 5
Price Each $3.38 $2.97 $3.19
Price Total $16.90 $14.85 $15.95
Manufacturer Name Echo Echo Echo
Part Number Lid A232000480 A232000480

3 Echo A226001410 Element Air Filter 10
Price Each $4.56 $4.01 $4.31
Price Total $45.60 $40.10 $43.10
Manufacturer Name Echo Echo Echo
Part Number Filter A226001410 A226001410

4 Echo A021000771 3
Price Each $46.46 $40.78 $43.88
Price Total $139.38 $122.34 $131.64
Manufacturer Name Echo Echo Echo
Part Number Carb A021000771 S/S A021000772

5 Echo A226000032 8
Price Each $6.90 $6.06 $6.52
Price Total $55.20 $48.48 $52.16
Manufacturer Name Echo Echo Echo
Part Number Filter A226000032 A226000032
Subtotal $321.08 $282.02 $303.35
ECHO Total $1,823.08 $2,682.62 $3,553.55

3 FERRIS
A) Parts No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 Percent of discount offered
2 Product Identification (Manufacturer) 
3 Type of price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.)
4 Price Schedule Number
5 Date of Price Schedule

6
Price schedule column on which discount is based                  
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)     

7 Warranty

B) Labor and Service
1 Labor Rate for Service (annual estimate 10 hours) 10

Price Total
2 Mileage Charge (if applicable)

C) Pickup and Service Hours

1
Parts will be available for pick up within _______ calendar 
days after receipt of order.

2
Business hours are from _____ A.M. to ______ P.M. 
_______ days per week.

D) FERRIS Specified Items
1 5600100 (Roller Kit) 6

Price Each
Price Total
Manufacturer Name
Part Number

2 5046360 (Handle) 4
Price Each
Price Total
Manufacturer Name
Part Number

3 5022476 (Blade) 8
Price Each
Price Total
Manufacturer Name
Part Number

4 5022883X19C (Filter) 3
Price Each
Price Total
Manufacturer Name
Part Number

5 5022926X1 (Filter) 3
Price Each
Price Total
Manufacturer Name



City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 13, 2014

For:
LAWNMOWERS, EDGERS, CHAIN SAWS, PARTS
AND SERVICE

Dewinne Equipment Co. James Lawnmower Sales & 
Service

John H. Sorloa, Inc.

6100004525 LM

Item Description Quantity

11002 Bandera Rd.
San Antonio,
TX  78250

5034 Rigsby
San Antonio,
TX  78222

523 W. Cypress
San Antonio, 
TX  78212

Part Number

4 GRAVELY No Bid No Bid
A) Parts
1 Percent of discount offered 10%
2 Product Identification (Manufacturer) GRV
3 Type of price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) MFG
4 Price Schedule Number
5 Date of Price Schedule

6
Price schedule column on which discount is based                  
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)     

MFG

7 Warranty 60 days

B) Labor and Service
1 Labor Rate for Service (annual estimate 30 hours) 30 $30.00 

Price Total $900.00 
2 Mileage Charge (if applicable) 1 $2.00 

Price Total $902.00 
Subtotal $1,802.00 $0.00 $0.00 

C) Pickup and Service Hours

1
Parts will be available for pick up within _______ calendar 
days after receipt of order.

5 days

2
Business hours are from _____ A.M. to ______ P.M. 
_______ days per week.

8 am - 5 pm, 5 days per week

D) GRAVELY Specified Items
1 8300507 (Spring) 6

Price Each $14.85
Price Total $89.10
Manufacturer Name Gravely
Part Number Spring

2 7200620 (Belt) 6
Price Each $86.36 
Price Total $518.16 
Manufacturer Name Gravely
Part Number Hex Belt

3 7300526 (sheeve) 3
Price Each $28.31
Price Total $84.93
Manufacturer Name Shv-038"
Part Number

4 820311 (Filter) 3
Price Each $57.51
Price Total $172.53
Manufacturer Name Briggs
Part Number Filter

5 9290500 (Blade) 6
Price Each $22.05
Price Total $132.30
Manufacturer Name Gravely
Part Number Blade
Subtotal $997.02 $0.00 $0.00
GRAVELY Total $2,799.02 $0.00 $0.00

5 HONDA 
A) Parts No Bid
1 Percent of discount offered 15% 20%
2 Product Identification (Manufacturer) Honda Honda
3 Type of price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Dealer Dealer
4 Price Schedule Number C-Systems C-System Price File
5 Date of Price Schedule 6/12/2014 2/1/2014

6
Price schedule column on which discount is based                  
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)     

List List Price

7 Warranty 30 days 60 days

B) Labor and Service
1 Labor Rate for Service (annual estimate 60 hours) 60 $48.00 $65.00

Price Total $2,880.00 $3,900.00
2 Mileage Charge (if applicable) 1 $0.60 $0.20

Price Total $0.60 $0.20
Subtotal $0.00 $2,880.60 $3,900.20

C) Pickup and Service Hours

1
Parts will be available for pick up within _______ calendar 
days after receipt of order.

3- 5 days 5 days

2
Business hours are from _____ A.M. to ______ P.M. 
_______ days per week.

8 am - 5 pm, 5 days per week 8 am - 5 pm, 5 days per week

D) HONDA Specified Items
1 17620-ZH7-023 2



City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 13, 2014

For:
LAWNMOWERS, EDGERS, CHAIN SAWS, PARTS
AND SERVICE

Dewinne Equipment Co. James Lawnmower Sales & 
Service

John H. Sorloa, Inc.

6100004525 LM

Item Description Quantity

11002 Bandera Rd.
San Antonio,
TX  78250

5034 Rigsby
San Antonio,
TX  78222

523 W. Cypress
San Antonio, 
TX  78212

Price Each $9.52 $8.96
Price Total $19.04 $17.92
Manufacturer Name Honda Honda
Part Number 17620-ZH7-023 17620-ZH7-023

2 17210-ZE1-517 2
Price Each $9.34 $8.79
Price Total $18.68 $17.58
Manufacturer Name Honda Honda
Part Number 17210-ZE1-517 17210-ZE1-517

3 HON17510-ZE3-030ZATANK  (Fuel Tank) 1
Price Each $56.75 $53.41
Price Total $56.75 $53.41
Manufacturer Name Honda Honda
Part Number 17510-ZE3-030 17510-ZE3-030ZATANK

4 HON16100-ZF6-V01 (Carburetor) 2
Price Each $58.63 $55.18
Price Total $117.26 $110.36
Manufacturer Name Honda Honda
Part Number 16100-ZF6-V01 16100-ZF6-V01

5 HON98079-55846 (Spark Plug) 12
Price Each $2.54 $2.39
Price Total $30.48 $28.68
Manufacturer Name Honda Honda
Part Number 98079-55846 98079-55846
Subtotal $0.00 $242.21 $227.95
HONDA Total $0.00 $3,122.81 $4,128.15

6 HUSTLER  
A) Parts No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 Percent of discount offered
2 Product Identification (Manufacturer) 
3 Type of price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.)
4 Price Schedule Number
5 Date of Price Schedule

6
Price schedule column on which discount is based                  
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)     

7 Warranty

B) Labor and Service
1 Labor Rate for Service (annual estimate 10 hours) 10

Price Total
2 Mileage Charge (if applicable)

Price Total
Subtotal

C) Pickup and Service Hours

1
Parts will be available for pick up within _______ calendar 
days after receipt of order.

2
Business hours are from _____ A.M. to ______ P.M. 
_______ days per week.

D) HUSTLER Specified Items
1 796680 Spindle 4

Price Each
Price Total
Manufacturer Name
Part Number

2 796235 Spindle 4
Price Each
Price Total
Manufacturer Name
Part Number

3 767962 Washer 8
Price Each
Price Total
Manufacturer Name
Part Number

4 053199 Jam Nut 8
Price Each
Price Total
Manufacturer Name
Part Number

5 798702 Blade 72” 8
Price Each
Price Total
Manufacturer Name



City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 13, 2014

For:
LAWNMOWERS, EDGERS, CHAIN SAWS, PARTS
AND SERVICE

Dewinne Equipment Co. James Lawnmower Sales & 
Service

John H. Sorloa, Inc.

6100004525 LM

Item Description Quantity

11002 Bandera Rd.
San Antonio,
TX  78250

5034 Rigsby
San Antonio,
TX  78222

523 W. Cypress
San Antonio, 
TX  78212

Part Number
Subtotal
HUSTLER  Total

7 JOHN DEERE  No Bid No Bid No Bid
A) Parts
1 Percent of discount offered
2 Product Identification (Manufacturer) 
3 Type of price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.)
4 Price Schedule Number
5 Date of Price Schedule

6
Price schedule column on which discount is based                  
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)     

7 Warranty

B) Labor and Service
1 Labor Rate for Service (annual estimate 10 hours) 10

Price Total
2 Mileage Charge (if applicable)

Subtotal

C) Pickup and Service Hours

1
Parts will be available for pick up within _______ calendar 
days after receipt of order.

2
Business hours are from _____ A.M. to ______ P.M. 
_______ days per week.

D) JOHN DEERE Specified Items
1 TCU15882 Blade 8

Price Each
Price Total
Manufacturer Name
Part Number

2 TCU27152 Deck Wheel 6
Price Each
Price Total
Manufacturer Name
Part Number

3 TCU18744 Deck Wheel 6
Price Each
Price Total
Manufacturer Name
Part Number

4 15-6.00-6CTM Tire/Wheel Assy 4
Price Each
Price Total
Manufacturer Name
Part Number

5 26-12.00-12CTC Tire/Wheel Assy 4
Price Each

Price Total

Manufacturer Name

Part Number

Subtotal

JOHN DEERE Total

8 KOHLER  
A) Parts
1 Percent of discount offered 10% 21% 20%
2 Product Identification (Manufacturer) KO Kohler Kohler
3 Type of price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) MFG Dealer Dealer
4 Price Schedule Number C-System C-System Price File 
5 Date of Price Schedule 3/5/2014 9/1/2013

6
Price schedule column on which discount is based                  
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)     

List List Price

7 Warranty 60 days 30 days 60 days

B) Labor and Service
1 Labor Rate for Service (annual estimate 10 hours) 10 $30.00 $48.00 $65.00

Price Total $300.00 $480.00 $650.00
2 Mileage Charge (if applicable) 1 $2.00 $0.60 $0.20

Price Total $2.00 $0.60 $0.20
Subtotal $302.00 $480.60 $650.20

C) Pickup and Service Hours

1
Parts will be available for pick up within _______ calendar 
days after receipt of order.

5 calendar days 5 calendar days 5 calendar days



City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 13, 2014

For:
LAWNMOWERS, EDGERS, CHAIN SAWS, PARTS
AND SERVICE

Dewinne Equipment Co. James Lawnmower Sales & 
Service

John H. Sorloa, Inc.

6100004525 LM

Item Description Quantity

11002 Bandera Rd.
San Antonio,
TX  78250

5034 Rigsby
San Antonio,
TX  78222

523 W. Cypress
San Antonio, 
TX  78212

2
Business hours are from _____ A.M. to ______ P.M. 
_______ days per week.

8 am - 5 pm, 5 days per week 8 am - 5 pm, 5 days per week 8 am - 5 pm, 5 days per week

D) KOHLER Specified Items
1 108-9764-03 Blade- 22 inch 1

Price Each $13.40 *Toro Part Numbers
Price Total $13.40
Manufacturer Name Toro
Part Number 108-9764-03

2 106-3987 Driver Blade 1
Price Each $14.22 *Toro Part Numbers
Price Total $14.22
Manufacturer Name Toro
Part Number 106-3987

3 114-7997 Arm-Pivot, Rear 1
Price Each $6.10 *Toro Part Numbers
Price Total $6.10
Manufacturer Name Toro
Part Number 114-7997

4 108-3766-03 Support Blade 1
Price Each $3.95 *Toro Part Numbers
Price Total $3.95
Manufacturer Name Toro
Part Number 108-3766-03

5 106-3999 Spacer-Driver 1
Price Each $1.20 *Toro Part Numbers
Price Total $1.20
Manufacturer Name Toro
Part Number 106-3999
Subtotal $0.00 $38.87 $0.00
KOHLER  Total $302.00 $519.47 $650.20

9 REDMAX Specified Items No Bid No Bid
A) Parts
1 Percent of discount offered 15%
2 Product Identification (Manufacturer) Redmax
3 Type of price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Dealer
4 Price Schedule Number C-System Price File
5 Date of Price Schedule 1/2/2014

6
Price schedule column on which discount is based                  
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)     

List Price

7 Warranty 60 days

B) Labor and Service
1 Labor Rate for Service (annual estimate 75 hours) 75 $65.00

Price Total $4,875.00
2 Mileage Charge (if applicable) 1 $0.20

Price Total $0.20
Subtotal $0.00 $0.00 $4,875.20

C) Pickup and Service Hours

1
Parts will be available for pick up within _______ calendar 
days after receipt of order.

5 days

2
Business hours are from _____ A.M. to ______ P.M. 
_______ days per week.

8 am - 5 pm, 5 days per week

D) REDMAX Specified Items
1 511010601 Bump Head 24

Price Each $30.31
Price Total $727.44
Manufacturer Name Redmax
Part Number 511010601

2 506742601 Fuel Filter 3
Price Each $3.19
Price Total $9.57
Manufacturer Name Redmax
Part Number 506742601

3 511782501 Frame 1
Price Each $44.87
Price Total $44.87
Manufacturer Name Redmax
Part Number 511782501

4 00004007011/ST1 Plug 12
Price Each $6.80
Price Total $81.60
Manufacturer Name Stihl
Part Number 00004007011



City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 13, 2014

For:
LAWNMOWERS, EDGERS, CHAIN SAWS, PARTS
AND SERVICE

Dewinne Equipment Co. James Lawnmower Sales & 
Service

John H. Sorloa, Inc.

6100004525 LM

Item Description Quantity

11002 Bandera Rd.
San Antonio,
TX  78250

5034 Rigsby
San Antonio,
TX  78222

523 W. Cypress
San Antonio, 
TX  78212

5 528767401 Carburetor 2
Price Each $129.63
Price Total $259.26
Manufacturer Name Redmax
Part Number 528767401
Subtotal $0.00 $0.00 $1,122.74
REDMAX Total $0.00 $0.00 $5,997.94

10 SCHINDAIWA
A) Parts
1 Percent of discount offered 10% 21% 15%
2 Product Identification (Manufacturer) ECO Schindaiwa/Echo Schindaiwa/Echo
3 Type of price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) MFG Dealer Dealer
4 Price Schedule Number C-Systems C-System Price File
5 Date of Price Schedule 3/5/2014 4/22/2014

6
Price schedule column on which discount is based                  
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)     

MFG List List Price

7 Warranty 60 days 30 days 60 days

B) Labor and Service
1 Labor Rate for Service (annual estimate 30 hours) 30 $30.00 $48.00 $65.00

Price Total $900.00 $1,440.00 $1,950.00
2 Mileage Charge (if applicable) 1 $2.00 $0.60 $0.20

Price Total $2.00 $0.60 $0.20
Subtotal $902.00 $1,440.60 $1,950.20

C) Pickup and Service Hours

1
Parts will be available for pick up within _______ calendar 
days after receipt of order.

5 days 3 - 5 days 5 days

2
Business hours are from _____ A.M. to ______ P.M. 
_______ days per week.

8 am - 5 pm, 5 days per week 8 am - 5 pm, 5 days per week 8 am - 5 pm, 5 days per week

D) SCHINDAIWA Specified Items
1 ECHX411000880 Blade 4

Price Each $60.68 $53.27 $57.31
Price Total $242.72 $213.08 $229.24
Manufacturer Name Echo Echo Echo
Part Number Blade X411000880 X411000880

2 ECHX411000870 Blade 4
Price Each $60.68 $53.27 $57.31
Price Total $242.72 $213.08 $229.24
Manufacturer Name Echo Echo Echo
Part Number Blade X411000870 X411000870

3 0003503502 Fuel Filter 3
Price Each $5.94 $4.37 $4.79
Price Total $17.82 $13.11 $14.37
Manufacturer Name Sten Stihl Stihl
Part Number 610170 00003503502 00003503502

4 41801201800 Air Filter 3
Price Each $3.59 $1.47 $1.78
Price Total $10.77 $4.41 $5.34
Manufacturer Name Stens Stihl Stihl
Part Number 100705 41801201800 41801201800

5 0057030 2 Not good number
Price Each $3.50 $3.40
Price Total $7.00 $6.80
Manufacturer Name Stens Echo
Part Number 615792 0057030
Subtotal $521.03 $443.68 $484.99
SCHINDAIWA Total $1,423.03 $1,884.28 $2,435.19

11 SNAPPER No Bid
A) Parts
1 Percent of discount offered 21% 15%
2 Product Identification (Manufacturer) Snapper Snapper
3 Type of price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Dealer Dealer
4 Price Schedule Number C-Systems C-System Price File
5 Date of Price Schedule 5/16/2014 3/31/2014

6
Price schedule column on which discount is based                  
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)     

List List Price

7 Warranty 30 days 60 days

B) Labor and Service
1 Labor Rate for Service (annual estimate 20 hours) 20 $48.00 $65.00

Price Total $960.00 $1,300.00
2 Mileage Charge (if applicable) 1 $0.60 $0.20

Price Total $0.60 $0.00
Subtotal $0.00 $960.60 $1,300.00

C) Pickup and Service Hours



City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 13, 2014

For:
LAWNMOWERS, EDGERS, CHAIN SAWS, PARTS
AND SERVICE

Dewinne Equipment Co. James Lawnmower Sales & 
Service

John H. Sorloa, Inc.

6100004525 LM

Item Description Quantity

11002 Bandera Rd.
San Antonio,
TX  78250

5034 Rigsby
San Antonio,
TX  78222

523 W. Cypress
San Antonio, 
TX  78212

1
Parts will be available for pick up within _______ calendar 
days after receipt of order.

5 days 5 days

2
Business hours are from _____ A.M. to ______ P.M. 
_______ days per week.

8 am - 5 pm, 5 days per week 8 am - 5 pm, 5 days per week

D) SNAPPER Specified Items
1 7041939BZYP Blade Mulch 5

Price Each $9.77 $12.33 
Price Total $48.85 $61.65 
Manufacturer Name Snapper Snapper
Part Number 7041939BZYP 7041939BZYP

2 NGK BPM6A Spark Plug 30
Price Each
Price Total
Manufacturer Name
Part Number
Subtotal $0.00 $48.85 $61.65 
SNAPPER Total $0.00 $1,009.45 $1,361.65

12 STIHL No Bid
A) Parts
1 Percent of discount offered 21% 15%
2 Product Identification (Manufacturer) Stihl Stihl
3 Type of price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Dealer Dealer
4 Price Schedule Number C-Systems C-System Price File
5 Date of Price Schedule 5/2/2012 5/8/2014

6
Price schedule column on which discount is based                  
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)     

List List Price

7 Warranty 30 days 60 days

B) Labor and Service
1 Labor Rate for Service (annual estimate 68 hours) 68 $48.00 $65.00 

Price Total $3,264.00 $4,420.00 
2 Mileage Charge (if applicable) 1 $0.60 $0.20 

Price Total $0.60 $0.20 
Subtotal $0.00 $3,264.60 $4,420.20 

C) Pickup and Service Hours

1
Parts will be available for pick up within _______ calendar 
days after receipt of order.

3 - 5 days 5 days

2
Business hours are from _____ A.M. to ______ P.M. 
_______ days per week.

8 am - 5 pm, 5 days per week 8 am - 5 pm, 5 days per week

D) STIHL Specified Items
1 STI1110-400-7005 Plug 12

Price Each $2.06 $2.21
Price Total $24.72 $26.52
Manufacturer Name Stihl Stihl
Part Number 1110-400-7005 1110-400-7005

2 STI1121-120-1618 Filter 3
Price Each $20.74 $22.20
Price Total $62.22 $66.60
Manufacturer Name Stihl Stihl
Part Number 1121-120-1618 1121-120-1618

3 STI4230-710-6053 Blade Set 3
Price Each $87.36 $81.08
Price Total $262.08 $243.24
Manufacturer Name Stihl Stihl
Part Number 4230-710-6053 4230-710-6053

4 61PMM344 Blade 150
Price Each $12.64 $13.60
Price Total $1,896.00 $2,040.00
Manufacturer Name Stihl Stihl
Part Number 61PMM344 61PMM344

5 26RM367 Blade 150
Price Each $18.96 $20.40
Price Total $2,844.00 $3,060.00
Manufacturer Name Stihl Stihl
Part Number 26RM367 26RM367
Subtotal $0.00 $5,089.02 $5,436.36
STIHL Total $0.00 $8,353.62 $9,856.56

C) Pickup and Service Hours

1
Parts will be available for pick up within _______ calendar 
days after receipt of order.

3-5 days 3-5 days

2
Business hours are from _____ A.M. to ______ P.M. 
_______ days per week.

8 am - 5 pm, 5 days per week 8 am - 5 pm, 5 days per week

Prompt Payment Discount Net 30 Net 30 Net 30


