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Opened: May 20, 2014
For: Annual Contract for Small Engine Parts and Service James Lawnmower John H Sorola, Inc.

6100004333 HH 5034 Rigsby 523 W. Cypress

Item Description
Estimated 

Annual 
Quantity

San Antonio,                          
TX 78222

San Antonio,                           
TX 78212

1 Onan Gasoline Engines for Generators
1A Parts Discount and Delivery
a Percent of Discount Offered No Bid No Bid
b Products Identification (Manufacturer)
c Type of Price Schedule
d Price Schedule Number
e Date of Price Schedule
f Price Schedule Column on Which Discount is Based
g Warranty

1B Specified Items
1 Part Number: 149-1828 2

Manufacturer Name No Bid No Bid
Part Name and Number
Price Each
Extended Price

2 Part Number: 185-2252 1
Manufacturer Name No Bid No Bid
Part Name and Number
Price Each
Extended Price

3 Part Number: 307-2546 1
Manufacturer Name No Bid No Bid
Part Name and Number
Price Each
Extended Price

4 Part Number: 193-0318 2
Manufacturer Name No Bid No Bid
Part Name and Number
Price Each
Extended Price

5 Part Number: 6742014120 3
Manufacturer Name No Bid No Bid
Part Name and Number
Price Each
Extended Price

2 Briggs and Stratton Parts for Pressure Washer, Roller, 
Compactor, Crack Sealer, Mower and Concrete Saw

2A Parts Discount and Delivery
a Percent of Discount Offered 27% 20%
b Products Identification (Manufacturer) B&S Briggs & Stratton
c Type of Price Schedule Dealer Dealer
d Price Schedule Number C-Systems C-System,Price File, DVD 

Enclosed
e Date of Price Schedule 3/5/2014 10/1/2013
f Price Schedule Column on Which Discount is Based List List Price
g Warranty According to 

manufacturer/10 days
60 Days

2B Specified Items
1 Part Number: 711785 6

Manufacturer Name B&S B&S
Part Name and Number 711785 711785
Price Each $11.83 $12.56
Extended Price $70.98 $75.36

2 Part Number: 490652S 10
Manufacturer Name B&S B&S
Part Name and Number 490652S 490652S
Price Each $2.74 $2.36
Extended Price $27.40 $23.60
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Opened: May 20, 2014
For: Annual Contract for Small Engine Parts and Service James Lawnmower John H Sorola, Inc.

6100004333 HH 5034 Rigsby 523 W. Cypress

Item Description
Estimated 

Annual 
Quantity

San Antonio,                          
TX 78222

San Antonio,                           
TX 78212

3 Part Number: 710266 3
Manufacturer Name B&S B&S
Part Name and Number 710266 710266
Price Each $9.53 $10.44
Extended Price $29.58 $31.32

4 Part Number: 820311 5
Manufacturer Name B&S B&S
Part Name and Number 820311 820311
Price Each $46.91 $51.40
Extended Price $234.55 $257.00

5 Part Number: 272490S 9
Manufacturer Name B&S B&S
Part Name and Number 272490S 272490S
Price Each $2.71 $2.96
Extended Price $24.39 $26.64

6 Part Number: 691573 1
Manufacturer Name B&S B&S
Part Name and Number 691573 691573
Price Each $75.16 $82.36
Extended Price $75.16 $82.36

3 Kohler Parts for Welder, Air Compressor, Concrete Saw, 
Sprayer

3A Parts Discount & Delivery
a Percent of Discount Offered 27% 20%
b Products Identification (Manufacturer) KOHLER KOHLER
c Type of Price Schedule LIST DEALER
d Price Schedule Number C-CYSTEMS C-SYSTEM PRICE FILE
e Date of Price Schedule 3/5/2014 9/1/2013
f Price Schedule Column on Which Discount is Based LIST LIST PRICE
g Warranty 10 DAYS 60 DAYS

3B Specified Items
1 Part Number: 6308311S 11

Part Name and Number 6308311-S 6308311-S
Manufacturer Name KOHLER KOHLER
Price Each $11.92 $13.06
Extended Price $131.12 $143.66

4 Honda Gasoline Engines for Compactor, Pressure 
Washer, Concrete Saw, Crack Sealer, Roller

4A Parts Discount
a Percent of Discount Offered 18% 20%
b Products Identification (Manufacturer) HONDA HONDA
c Type of Price Schedule LIST DEALER
d Price Schedule Number C-CYSTEMS C-SYSTEM PRICE FILE
e Date of Price Schedule 3/14/2014 2/1/2014
f Price Schedule Column on Which Discount is Based LIST LIST PRICE
g Warranty 10 DAYS 60 DAYS

4B Specified Items
1 Part Number: 17210ZJ1842

Part Name and Number 5 17210ZJ1842 17210ZJ1842
Manufacturer Name HONDA HONDA
Price Each $28.61 $27.43
Extended Price $143.05 $137.15
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Opened: May 20, 2014
For: Annual Contract for Small Engine Parts and Service James Lawnmower John H Sorola, Inc.
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Estimated 

Annual 
Quantity

San Antonio,                          
TX 78222

San Antonio,                           
TX 78212

2 Part Number: 17218ZJ1840
Part Name and Number 2 17218ZJ1840 17218ZJ1840
Manufacturer Name HONDA HONDA
Price Each $5.06 $4.93
Extended Price $10.12 $9.86

3 Part Number: 35100ZJ1842
Part Name and Number 1 35100ZJ1842 35100ZJ1842
Manufacturer Name HONDA HONDA
Price Each $65.06 $63.48
Extended Price $65.06 $63.48

4 Part Number: 16200ZJ1842
Part Name and Number 2 16200ZJ1842 16200ZJ1842
Manufacturer Name HONDA HONDA
Price Each $32.56 $31.76
Extended Price $65.12 $63.52

5 Part Number: 28400ZH8013YA
Part Name and Number 3 28400ZH8013YA 28400ZH8013YA
Manufacturer Name HONDA HONDA
Price Each $72.15 $70.39
Extended Price $216.45 $211.17

6 Part Number: 17210ZE1517
Part Name and Number 50 17210ZE1517 17210ZE1517
Manufacturer Name HONDA HONDA
Price Each $9.01 $8.79
Extended Price $450.50 $439.50

7 Part Number: 17210ZE2515
Part Name and Number 16 17210ZE2515 17210ZE2515
Manufacturer Name HONDA HONDA
Price Each $9.83 $9.59
Extended Price $157.28 $153.44

5 Labor and Service
A Labor and Service Rate per Hour $48.00 $65.00
B Expedited/Overtime Labor and Service Rate per Hour $48.00 $95.00
C Vendor Business Days Monday-Friday Monday-Friday
D Vendor Hours of Operation 8-5, closed 1-2 lunch 8:00-5:00
E Parts and Service Facilities Name James Lawnmower John H Sorola, Inc
F Parts and Service Facilities Address James Lawnmower 523 W. Cypress

Prompt Payment Discount Net 30 Net 30
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