
City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tab
Herbicides

Opened: March 10, 2014  Alternate
For: Annual Contract for Herbicides John Deere Landscapes Red River Specialties, Inc. White Dove Dist. White Dove Dist. Winfield, LLC.

DS
1385 East 36th Street 1324 N. Hearne Avenue,           

Suite 120
9520 Ridgeline Rd. 9520 Ridgeline Rd. 6085 Corridor Parkway #150

Item Description Estimated 
Quantities

Cleveland,
OH 44114                           

Shreveport,                                
LA 71107

New Braunfels,                          
TX 78132

New Braunfels,                          
TX 78132

Schertz,                                     
TX 78154

1 Turbulence Methylated Vegetable Oil Plus 
Organosilicone Surfactant or approved equal 20
Manufacturerer: Monterey Red River Specialties, Inc. Exacto Red River Specialties No Bid Winfield
Product No: 34-00-MSO2.5G Sunrise Elite Supreme 1433752
Container Size: 2.5 gallon 2.5 gallon 2.5 gallon 2.5 gallon
Price per gallon: $20.66 $30.00 $37.00 $37.50
Extended Price: $413.20 $600.00 $740.00 $750.00

2 Droplex Deposition Aid, Canopy Penetrating 
& Drift Control Agent or approved equal 50
Manufacturer: No Bid Red River Specialties, Inc. Exacto Red River Specialties No Bid Winfield

 Product No: Elite Velocity Elite Velocity 1414380
Container Size: 1 gallon 2.5 gallon gallon
Price per gallon: $30.00 $38.95 $54.00
Extended Price: $1,500.00 $1,947.50 $2,700.00

3 Gulfstream Spreader-Activator with Buffering 
Agents or approved equal 15
Manufacturer: No Bid Red River Specialties, Inc. Exacto-RRSI No Bid Winfield
Product No: Elite Devine White Dove 90
Container Size: 2.5 gallon 2.5 gallon 2..5 gallon
Price per gallon: $20.00 $18.00 $26.00
Extended Price: $300.00 $270.00 $390.00

 
4 Plus Spreader-Activator with Buffering Agents 

for use w/Aquatic herbicide appl or approved 
equal 60
Manufacturer: No Bid Red River Specialties, Inc. Exacto-RRSI No Bid Winfield
Product No: Elite Amplify White Dove 90
Container Size: 2.5 gallon 2.5 gallon 2.5 gallon
Price per gallon:  $22.00 $18.00 $26.50
Extended Price: $1,320.00 $1,080.00 $1,590.00

5 Roundup Custom Herbicide, Broad Spectrum 
Turf, Aquatic, Ornamental and Right-of-Way 
or approved equal 80
Manufacturer: Nufarm Monsanto Monsanto-Roundup Custom No Bid Monsanto
Product No: 10021225 Aqua Neat Roundup Custom EPA #524-343
Container Size: 2.5 gallon 2.5 gallon 2.5 gallon 2.5 gallon
Price per gallon: $28.38 $21.00 $19.75 $19.67
Extended Price: $2,270.40 $1,680.00 $1,580.00 $1,573.60

6 Herbicide, Woody Plants, Broadleaf Weeds in 
ROWS, Non-irrigation Ditch Banks, roadsides 
and aquatic or approved equal 100
Manufacturer: Dow AgroScience Dow Dow AgroSciences-Garlon 3A Dow AgroSciences-Garlon 3A Dow AgroSciences
Product No: 502180 Garlon 3A Element 3A EPA #62719-37 EPA #62719-37
Container Size: 2.5 gallon 2.5 gallon 2.5 gallon 2.5 gallon Garlon 3A 2.5 gallon
Price per gallon: $102.44 $47.50 $66.50 $52.00 $60.00
Extended Price: $10,244.00 $4,750.00 $6,650.00 $5,200.00 $6,000.00
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7 Herbicide, Broadleaf Weeds and Woody 
Plants ROWS Non-irrigation, Ditch Banks, 
roadsides or approved equal 75
Manufacturer: Dow AgroScience Dow Dow AgroSciences - Capstone No Bid Dow AgroSciences
Product No: HPST00102 Capstone Capstone N/A  
Container Size: 2.5 gallon 2.5 gallon 2.5 gallon Capstone 2.5 gallon
Price per gallon: $63.50 $37.08 $42.50 $37.08
Extended Price: $4,762.50 $2,781.00 $3,187.50 $2,781.00

8 Herbicide, annual and perennial weeds and 
unwanted woody plants, ROWS, ditch banks 
or dry drainage ditches or approved equal 25
Manufacturer: Dupont Agsurf Dupont-Excort XP No Bid Dupont
Product No: 503421 Escort XP Metcel VMF EPA # 352-439  
Container Size: 16 oz. 16 oz 16 oz Escort 1 lb
Price per pound: $43.62 $80.00 $111.20 $99.36
Extended Price: $1,090.50 $2,000.00 $2,780.00 $2,484.00

9 Agro Sciences - Vista XRT Herbicide, annual 
and perenial broadleaf weed and woody 
brush ROWS, Non-irrigation, ditch banks and 
roadsides or approved equal 75
Manufacturer: No Bid Dow Dow AgroSciences - Vista XRT No Bid Dow AgroSciences
Product No: Vista XRT EPA #62719-586
Container Size: 2.5 gallon 2.5 gallon 2.5 gallon
Price per gallon: $180.00 $172.35 $171.96
Extended Price: $13,500.00 $12,926.25 $12,897.00

10 Outsider Herbicide, selective control of annual
and perennial grasses and broadleaf weeds 
pasture grasses, rangelands, non-crop areas 
or approved equal 600
Manufacturer: No Bid Monsanto Monsanto-Outrider No Bid Monsanto
Product No: Outrider EPA # 524-500
Container Size: 20 ounce 20 oz 20 oz
Price per gallon: $14.00 $13.99 $15.58
Extended Price: $8,400.00 $8,394.00 $9,348.00

11a Perspective Herbicide, broaleaf weeds, 
terrestrial and riparian invasive and noxious 
weeds ROWS, Non-irrigation ditch banks or 
approved equal 25
Manufacturer:  No Bid Dupont Dupont - Perspective No Bid Dupont
Product No: Perspective EPA # 352-846
Container Size: 1.25 pound 1.25 pound 1.25 lb
Price per pounds: $73.60 $73.55 $73.60
Extended Price: $1,840.00 $1,838.75 $1,840.00
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11b Perspective Herbicide, broadleaf weeds, 
terrestrial and riparian invasive and noxious 
weeds ROWS, Non-irrigation ditch banks or 
approved equal 25
Manufacturer: No Bid Dupont Dupont-Perspective No bid Dupont
Product No: Perspective EPA # 352-846
Container Size: 5 pound 5 # 5 lb
Price per pounds: $73.60 $73.55 $73.60
Extended Price: $1,840.00 $1,838.75 $1,840.00

12 Roundup Custom Herbicide, Broad Spectrum 
Turf, Aquatic, Ornamental and Right-of-Way 
or approved equal 30
Manufacturer: No Bid Dupont Dupont-Streamline No Bid Dupont
Product No: Streamline EPA # 352-848
Container Size: 3 pound 3 # 3 lb
Price per pounds: $82.40 $82.35 $82.40
Extended Price: $2,472.00 $2,470.50 $2,472.00

 
Delivery after order 5 days 7 days 1 - 3 days 1 - 3 days 2 days

Payment Term Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
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