
City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 1, 2012
For: Tractors and Mower Attachments Bid #1 Bid #2

Holt Agribusiness Mustang Equipment South Texas 
Implement Co. dba 
Tractor City

South Texas 
Implement Co. dba 
Tractor City

6100001553 JM 3302 S.W.W.White 
Rd.

3540 N Loop 1604 E 2800 SE Loop 410 2800 SE Loop 410

Item Description  Qty
San Antonio, 
TX 78222

San Antonio, 
TX 78247

San Antonio, 
TX 78222

San Antonio, 
TX 78222

1 Turnkey Unit, Tractor, 4x4 with 15' 
Batwing Mowing Deck Attachment 

2

a Tractor 4x4
Price Each $72,790.00 $55,264.44 $72,532.21 No Bid

b 15' Batwing Mowing Deck
Price Each $13,105.00 $13,671.68 $13,481.35 No Bid

Total Price per Turnkey Unit $85,895.00 $68,936.12 $86,013.56
Item Total $171,790.00 $137,872.24 $172,027.12

Production Cut Off Date March 15, 2013 November 1, 2012 September 30, 2012

Last Day that the City Can Place the 
Order

September 30, 2012 November 1, 2012 September 30, 2012

Can the bidder provide the item at the bid 
price submitted after the production cut 
off date? 

No No No

Year, Make, Model Offered 2013 Challenger 
MT465B

2012 John Deere 
5085M

2012 John Deere, 
6430 & HX 15 

Shredder

Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include 
PTO HP)

Caterpillar C4.4 
Engine - 95 PTO hp

70 PTO HP John 
Deere Power Tech 

PWX

John Deere 6430, 
John Deere 4.5L 
PowerTech E, 99 

PTO HP

Specific Make & Model of Attachment Modern Ag Super 
Predatorrr 15' 

John Deere HX15 John Deere HX15

Warranty Provider Through 
Manufacturer & 

Dealer

Deere & Company / 
Mustang Equipment

Tractor City

Delivery 180 days 180 days 180 days
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 1, 2012
For: Tractors and Mower Attachments Bid #1 Bid #2

Holt Agribusiness Mustang Equipment South Texas 
Implement Co. dba 
Tractor City

South Texas 
Implement Co. dba 
Tractor City

6100001553 JM 3302 S.W.W.White 
Rd.

3540 N Loop 1604 E 2800 SE Loop 410 2800 SE Loop 410

Item Description  Qty
San Antonio, 
TX 78222

San Antonio, 
TX 78247

San Antonio, 
TX 78222

San Antonio, 
TX 78222

2 Turnkey Unit, Tractor, 4x4 with 7' Mowing 
Deck Attachment 

7

a Tractor 4x4
Price Each $72,790.00 $55,264.44 $72,532.21 $72,532.21

b 7' Mowing Deck
Price Each $3,730.00 $4,692.43 $4,533.06 $3,182.80

Total Price per Turnkey Unit $76,520.00 $59,956.87 $77,065.27 $75,715.01
Item Total $535,640.00 $419,698.09 $539,456.89 $530,005.07

Production Cut Off Date March 15, 2013 November 1, 2012 September 30, 2012 September 30, 2012

Last Day that the City Can Place the 
Order

September 30, 2012 November 1, 2012 September 30, 2012 September 30, 2012

Can the bidder provide the item at the bid 
price submitted after the production cut 
off date? 

No No No No

Year, Make, Model Offered 2013 Challenger 
MT465B

2012 John Deere 
5085M

2012 John Deere, 
6430 & 709 

Shredder

2012 John Deere, 
6430 & MX7 

Shredder

Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include 
PTO HP)

Caterpillar C4.4 
Engine - 95 PTO hp

70 PTO HP John 
Deere Power Tech 

PWX

John Deere 6430, 
John Deere 4.5L 
PowerTech E, 99 

PTO HP

John Deere 6430, 
John Deere 4.5L 
PowerTech E, 99 

PTO HP

Specific Make & Model of Attachment Modern Ag 7' 
Predatorrr

John Deere 709 John Deere 709 
Shredder

John Deere MX7 
Shredder

Warranty Provider Through 
Manufacturer & 

Dealer

John Deere / 
Mustang Equipment

Tractor City Tractor City

Delivery 180 days 180 days 180 days 180 days
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 1, 2012
For: Tractors and Mower Attachments Bid #1 Bid #2

Holt Agribusiness Mustang Equipment South Texas 
Implement Co. dba 
Tractor City

South Texas 
Implement Co. dba 
Tractor City

6100001553 JM 3302 S.W.W.White 
Rd.

3540 N Loop 1604 E 2800 SE Loop 410 2800 SE Loop 410

Item Description  Qty
San Antonio, 
TX 78222

San Antonio, 
TX 78247

San Antonio, 
TX 78222

San Antonio, 
TX 78222

3 Turnkey Unit, Tractor, 4x4 with Mid-
Mount Boom Mower

1

a Tractor 4x4
Price Each $68,052.00 No Bid $72,532.21 No Bid 

b Mid-Mount Boom Mower
Price Each $62,559.00 No Bid $69,952.33 No Bid 

Total Price per Turnkey Unit $130,611.00 $142,484.54
Item Total $130,611.00 $142,484.54

Production Cut Off Date None - In Stock Unit September 30, 2012

Last Day that the City Can Place the 
Order

None - In Stock Unit September 30, 2012

Can the bidder provide the item at the bid 
price submitted after the production cut 
off date? 

N/A - In Stock Unit No

Year, Make, Model Offered 2013 Challenger 
MT465B

2012 John Deere, 
6430 & Alamo 24' 

Maverick Boom 
Mower

Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include 
PTO HP)

Caterpillar C4.4 
Engine - 95 PTO hp

John Deere 6430, 
John Deere 4.5L 
PowerTech E, 99 

PTO HP

Specific Make & Model of Attachment Alamo Industrial 24' 
Maverick w/ 60" 

Rotary Head

Alamo Group 24' 
Maverick Boom 

Mower

Warranty Provider Through 
Manufacturer & 

Dealer

Tractor City

Delivery 180 days 180 days
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 1, 2012
For: Tractors and Mower Attachments Bid #1 Bid #2

Holt Agribusiness Mustang Equipment South Texas 
Implement Co. dba 
Tractor City

South Texas 
Implement Co. dba 
Tractor City

6100001553 JM 3302 S.W.W.White 
Rd.

3540 N Loop 1604 E 2800 SE Loop 410 2800 SE Loop 410

Item Description  Qty
San Antonio, 
TX 78222

San Antonio, 
TX 78247

San Antonio, 
TX 78222

San Antonio, 
TX 78222

4 Turnkey Unit, Tractor, 2WD with 7' 
Mowing Deck Attachment 

1

a Tractor 2WD
Price Each $67,150.00 $47,049.20 $61,555.80 $61,555.80

b 7' Mowing Deck
Price Each $3,730.00 $4,692.43 $4,533.06 $3,182.80

Total Price per Turnkey Unit $70,880.00 $51,741.63 $66,088.86 $64,738.60
Item Total $70,880.00 $51,741.63 $66,088.86 $64,738.60

Production Cut Off Date March 15, 2013 November 1, 2012 September 30, 2012 September 30, 2012

Last Day that the City Can Place the 
Order

September 30, 2012 November 1, 2012 September 30, 2012 September 30, 2012

Can the bidder provide the item at the bid 
price submitted after the production cut 
off date? 

No No No No

Year, Make, Model 2013 Challenger 
MT465B

2012 John Deere 
5085M

2012 John Deere 
6430

2012 John Deere 
6430

Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include 
PTO HP)

Caterpillar C4.4 
Engine - 95 PTO hp

70 PTO HP John 
Deere Power Tech 

PWX

John Deere 6430, 
John Deere 4.5L 
PowerTech E, 99 

PTO HP

John Deere 6430, 
John Deere 4.5L 
PowerTech E, 99 

PTO HP

Specific Make & Model of Attachment Modern Ag 7' 
Predatorrr

John Deere 709 John Deere 709 
Shredder

John Deere MX7 
Shredder

Warranty Provider Through 
Manufacturer & 

Dealer

Deere & Company / 
Mustang Equipment

Tractor City Tractor City

Delivery 180 days 180 days 180 days 180 days
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 1, 2012
For: Tractors and Mower Attachments Bid #1 Bid #2

Holt Agribusiness Mustang Equipment South Texas 
Implement Co. dba 
Tractor City

South Texas 
Implement Co. dba 
Tractor City

6100001553 JM 3302 S.W.W.White 
Rd.

3540 N Loop 1604 E 2800 SE Loop 410 2800 SE Loop 410

Item Description  Qty
San Antonio, 
TX 78222

San Antonio, 
TX 78247

San Antonio, 
TX 78222

San Antonio, 
TX 78222

5 Turnkey Unit, Tractor, 2WD with 20' 
Batwing Mowing Deck Attachment 

1

a Tractor 2WD
Price Each $67,150.00 No Bid $61,555.80 No Bid

b 20' Batwing Mowing Deck Attachment
Price Each $17,076.00 No Bid $22,395.73 No Bid

Price per Each Turnkey Unit $84,226.00 $83,951.53
Item Total $84,226.00 $83,951.53

Production Cut Off Date March 15, 2013 September 30, 2012

Last Day that the City Can Place the 
Order

September 30, 2012 September 30, 2012

Can the bidder provide the item at the bid 
price submitted after the production cut 
off date? 

No No

Year, Make, Model 2013 Challenger 
MT465B

2012 John Deere 
6430

Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include 
PTO HP)

Caterpillar C4.4 
Engine - 95 PTO hp

John Deere 6430, 
John Deere 4.5L 
PowerTech E, 99 

PTO HP

Specific Make & Model of Attachment Modern Ag 20' 
Predatorrr

John Deere CX20 
Rotary Cutter

Warranty Provider Through 
Manufacturer & 

Dealer

Tractor City

Delivery 180 days 180 days
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 1, 2012
For: Tractors and Mower Attachments Bid #1 Bid #2

Holt Agribusiness Mustang Equipment South Texas 
Implement Co. dba 
Tractor City

South Texas 
Implement Co. dba 
Tractor City

6100001553 JM 3302 S.W.W.White 
Rd.

3540 N Loop 1604 E 2800 SE Loop 410 2800 SE Loop 410

Item Description  Qty
San Antonio, 
TX 78222

San Antonio, 
TX 78247

San Antonio, 
TX 78222

San Antonio, 
TX 78222

6 15' Batwing Mowing Deck Attachment 2
Price Each $13,105.00 $13,671.68 $13,481.35 No Bid
Price Total $26,210.00 $27,343.36 $26,962.70

Production Cut Off Date None - Produced 
Year Round

November 1, 2012 October 31, 2012

Last Day that the City Can Place the 
Order

None - Produced 
Year Round

November 1, 2012 October 31, 2012

Can the bidder provide the item at the bid 
price submitted after the production cut 
off date? 

Yes No No

Year, Make, Model 2013 Modern Ag 
Super Preadatorr

2012 John Deere 
HX15

2012 John Deere 
HX15 Rotary Cutter

Warranty Provider Mowing 
Manufacturer & 

Dealer

Deere & Company / 
Mustang Equipment

Tractor City

Delivery 180 days 180 days 180 days

Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Total $1,019,357.00 $636,655.32 $1,030,971.64 $594,743.67
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