City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 18, 2012 Bid 1 Bid 2 BuyBoard
For: Light Duty Trucks Caldwell Country Ford|Caldwell Country Grande Truck Center |Grande Truck Center |Grapevine Dodge Gunn Chevrolet Philpott Motors Tom Benson
Chevrolet Chrysler Jeep Chevrolet
6100001531 LD P.O. Box 27 P.O. Box 27 4562 IH 10 East 4562 IH 10 East 2601 William D Tate |12602 IH 35 North 1400 N. Hwy 69 9400 San Pedro Ave
Ave.
Item Description Qty |[Caldwell, Caldwell, San Antonio, San Antonio, Grapevine, San Antonio, Nederland, San Antonio,
TX 77836 TX 77836 TX 78219 TX 78219 TX 76051 TX 78233 TX 77627 TX 78216
1 3/4 Ton Truck, Regular Cab. Tool 10
Box
Price Each $21,443.00; No Bid $22,579.00; No Bid $24,039.00 $22,353.00 $20,516.30 $23,231.50
Price Total $214,430.00; $225,790.00; $240,390.00; $223,530.00; $205,163.00; $232,315.00;
Make, Model & Year Offered Ford F250 R/C 4X2, 2013 Ford F2A| 2012/2013 Dodge Chevrolet 2013 3/4 2013 Ford F250( Chevrolet CC20903
F2A-2013 2500 Reg Cab CC20903 2013
Production Cut-Off Date 15 April 2013 12/31/2012 2012-12/21/12 1/21/13] 7/1/13 April 2013
2013 Est 8/15/13
Last day order can be placed 15 April 2013 12/31/2012 2012-8/30/2012 10/12; 7/1/13] April 2013
without missing cut-off date 2013-5/15/2013
Can bidder provide bid items after Yes| No No No No No
cut-off date
Delivery 120 Days 75-110 Days 75-90 Days 120 Days 90 Days| 60-90 Days
2 3/4 Ton Truck, Regular Cab, 1
Diesel Engine, Dump Insert &
Cover w/ Fold Away Crane
Bumper
Price Each No Bid No Bid $43,833.00; No Bid No Bid $43,086.55 No Bid No Bid
Price Total $43,833.00 $43,086.55
Make, Model & Year Offered 2013 Ford F2A| Chevrolet Silverado
3/4 RC-2013
Dump Insert Make & Model Truck Craft Craft Dump-TC101
Production Cut-Off Date 12/31/2012 1/21/13
Last day order can be placed 12/31/2012 10/12;
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after No No
cut-off date
Delivery 75-120 Days: 120 Days|
3 3/4 Ton Truck, Regular Cab, 4X4 2
Price Each $23,630.00 No Bid $24,739.00 No Bid $25,605.00 $24,584.56 $23,260.38 $26,214.56
Price Total $47,260.00; $49,478.00 $51,210.00 $49,169.12 $46,520.76 $52,429.12
Make, Model & Year Offered Ford F250 R/C 4X4, 2012 Ford F2B! 2012/2013 Dodge Chevrolet 4WD| 2013 Ford F250 4X4| Chevrolet CK20903
F2B-2013 2500 Silverado 2013 2013
Production Cut-Off Date 15 April 2013 12/31/2012 2012-12/21/12 1/21/13 7/1/13] April 2013
2013 Est 8/15/13
Last day order can be placed 15 April 2013 12/31/2012 2012-8/30/2012 10/12] 7/1/13 April 2013
without missing cut-off date 2013-5/15/2013
Can bidder provide bid items after Yes| No| No| No| No| No|
cut-off date
Delivery 120 Days 75-110 Days 75-90 Days 120 Days 90 Days| 60-90 Days
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 18, 2012 Bid 1 Bid 2 BuyBoard
For: Light Duty Trucks Caldwell Country Ford|Caldwell Country Grande Truck Center |Grande Truck Center |Grapevine Dodge Gunn Chevrolet Philpott Motors Tom Benson
Chevrolet Chrysler Jeep Chevrolet
6100001531 LD P.O. Box 27 P.O. Box 27 4562 IH 10 East 4562 IH 10 East 2601 William D Tate |12602 IH 35 North 1400 N. Hwy 69 9400 San Pedro Ave
Ave.
Item Description Qty |[Caldwell, Caldwell, San Antonio, San Antonio, Grapevine, San Antonio, Nederland, San Antonio,
TX 77836 TX 77836 TX 78219 TX 78219 TX 76051 TX 78233 TX 77627 TX 78216
4 3/4 Ton Trucks, Extended Cab, 8
Tool Box
Price Each $23,361.00 No Bid $24,897.00 No Bid No Bid $24,244.91 $22,484.30 $25,939.91
Price Total $186,888.00 $199,176.00 $193,959.28 $179,874.40; $207,519.28
Make, Model & Year Offered Ford F250 Supercab 2013 Ford X2A| Chevrolet Silverado| 2013 Ford F250 Ext| Chevrolet CC20953
LWB 4X2-X2A-2013 2013 CC20953 2013
Production Cut-Off Date 15 April 2013 12/31/2012 1/21/13 7/1/13] April 2013
Last day order can be placed 15 April 2013 12/31/2012 10/12] 7/1/13 April 2013
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Yes| No| No| No| No|
cut-off date
Delivery 120-135 Days: 90-110 Days 120 Days 90 Days 60-90 Days
5 3/4 Ton Truck, Extended Cab, 2
4X4
Price Each $25,857.00 No Bid $26,913.00 No Bid No Bid $26,403.95 $25,099.58 $28,408.95
Price Total $51,714.00; $53,826.00 $52,807.90 $50,199.16 $56,817.90
Make, Model & Year Offered Ford F250 Supercab 2013 Ford X2B Chevrolet, CK20953,| 2013 Ford F250 Ext| Chevrolet CK20953
LWB 4X4-X2B-2013 2013 Cab 2013
Production Cut-Off Date 15 April 2013 12/31/2012 1/21/13 7/1/13] April 2013
Last day order can be placed 15 April 2013 12/31/2012 10/12] 7/1/13 April 2013
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Yes| No No No No
cut-off date
Delivery 120-135 Days: 90-110 Days 120 Days 90 Days| 60-90 Days
6A 3/4 Ton Truck, Crew Cab 3
Price Each $22,976.00 No Bid $25,073.00 No Bid $23,516.00 $24,891.91 $23,527.58 $26,189.66
Price Total $68,928.00: $75,219.00 $70,548.00 $74,675.73 $70,582.74 $78,568.98
Make, Model & Year Offered Ford F250 Crewcab| 2013 Ford W2A Dodge 2500 Crew| Chevrolet, CC20743,| 2013 Ford F250 Crew| Chevrolet CC20743
SWB 4X2-W2A-2013 Cab 2500 2013 2013 2013
Production Cut-Off Date 15 April 2013 12/31/2012 2012-12/21/12 1/21/13 7/1/13] April 2013
2013 Est 8/15/13
Last day order can be placed 15 April 2013 12/31/2012 2012-8/31/2012 10/12; 7/1/13] April 2013
without missing cut-off date 2013-5/15/2013
Can bidder provide bid items after Yes| No No No No No
cut-off date
Delivery 120 Days 90-110 Days 60-75 Days 120 Days 90 Days| 60-90 Days
6B 3/4 Ton Truck, Crew Cab, Camper| 1
Top
Price Each $25,988.00: No Bid $27,923.00; No Bid $25,356.00 $29,141.91 $25,181.53 $29,414.66
Price Total $25,988.00 $27,923.00 $25,356.00 $29,141.91 $25,181.53 $29,414.66
Make, Model & Year Offered Ford F250 Crewcab| 2013 Ford W2A Dodge 2500 Crew| Chevrolet, CC20743,| 2013 Ford F250 Crew| Chevrolet CC20743
SWB 4X2-W2A-2013 Cab 2012/2013 2013 2013
Make Model of Camper Top ARA-Camper Top Fiberglass Camper ARE Brand, Z Series| Leer Fiberglass Work Astro Fiberglass| Leer
OEM Top FSO-Terex| Top| Camper
Production Cut-Off Date 15 April 2013 12/31/2012 2012-12/21/12 1/21/13 7/1/13] April 2013
2013 Est 8/15/13
Last day order can be placed 15 April 2013 12/31/2012 2012-8/30/2012 10/12] 7/1/13 April 2013
without missing cut-off date 2013-5/15/2013
Can bidder provide bid items after Yes| No No No No No
cut-off date
Delivery 150 Days 90-120 Days 90 Days| 120 Days 90 Days| 60-90 Days
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 18, 2012 Bid 1 Bid 2 BuyBoard
For: Light Duty Trucks Caldwell Country Ford|Caldwell Country Grande Truck Center |Grande Truck Center |Grapevine Dodge Gunn Chevrolet Philpott Motors Tom Benson
Chevrolet Chrysler Jeep Chevrolet
6100001531 LD P.O. Box 27 P.O. Box 27 4562 IH 10 East 4562 IH 10 East 2601 William D Tate |12602 IH 35 North 1400 N. Hwy 69 9400 San Pedro Ave
Ave.
Item Description Qty |[Caldwell, Caldwell, San Antonio, San Antonio, Grapevine, San Antonio, Nederland, San Antonio,
TX 77836 TX 77836 TX 78219 TX 78219 TX 76051 TX 78233 TX 77627 TX 78216
6C 3/4 Ton Truck, Crew Cab, Painted 1
School Bus Yellow
Price Each $24,188.00; No Bid $25,273.00; No Bid $23,909.00: $24,891.91 $23,631.58 No Bid
Price Total $24,188.00 $25,273.00 $23,909.00 $24,891.91 $23,631.58
Make, Model & Year Offered Ford F250 Crewcab| 2013 Ford W2A Dodge 2500 Crew| Chevrolet, CC20743,| 2013 Ford F250 Crew
LWB-W2A-2013 Cab 2012/2013 2013
Production Cut-Off Date 15 April 2013 12/31/2012 2012-12/21/12 1/21/13] 7/1/13
2013 Est 8/15/13
Last day order can be placed 15 April 2013 12/31/2012 2012-8/30/2012 10/12; 7/1/13]
without missing cut-off date 2013-5/15/2013
Can bidder provide bid items after Yes| No No No No
cut-off date
Delivery 120-150 Days: 90-140 Days: 150 Days| 120 Days! 90 Days
7A 3/4 Ton Truck, Crew Cab, 4X4 2
Price Each $26,840.00 No Bid $27,839.00 No Bid $26,605.00 $27,678.45 $26,456.58 $28,868.45
Price Total $53,680.00: $55,678.00 $53,210.00 $55,356.90 $52,913.16 $57,736.90
Make, Model & Year Offered Ford F250 Crewcab 2013 Ford W2B Dodge 2500 Crew| Chevrolet, CK20743,| 2013 Ford F250 Crew| Chevrolet CK20943
4X4-SWB-W2B-2013 Cab 2012/2013 2013 4XA] 2013
Production Cut-Off Date 15 April 2013 12/31/2012 2012-12/21/12 1/21/13] 7/1/13 April 2013
2013 Est 8/15/13
Last day order can be placed 15 April 2013 12/31/2012 2012-8/30/2012 10/12; 7/1/13] April 2013
without missing cut-off date 2013-5/15/2013
Can bidder provide bid items after Yes| No| No| No| No| No|
cut-off date
Delivery 120 Days 90-110 Days 75-90 Days 120 Days 90 Days| 60-90 Days
7B 3/4 Ton Truck, Crew Cab, 4X4 2
Camper Top
Price Each $28,765.00 No Bid $30,139.00 No Bid $28,445.00 $30,228.45 $28,006.53 $31,568.45
Price Total $57,530.00: $60,278.00 $56,890.00 $60,456.90 $56,013.06 $63,136.90
Make, Model & Year Offered Ford F250 Crewcab 2013 Ford W2B Dodge 2500 Crew| Chevrolet, CK20743,| 2013 Ford F250 Crew| Chevrolet CK20943
4X4 SWB -W2B-2013 Cab 2012/2013 2013 4XA] 2013
Production Cut-Off Date 15 April 2013 12/31/2012 2012-12/21/12 1/12/13] 7/1/13 April 2013
2013 Est 8/15/13
Last day order can be placed 15 April 2013 12/31/2012 2012-8/30/2012 10/12; 7/1/13] April 2013
without missing cut-off date 2013-5/15/2013
Can bidder provide bid items after Yes| No No No No No
cut-off date
Delivery 150 Days 90-120 Days 90 Days| 120 Days 90 Days| 60-90 Days
7C 3/4 Ton Truck, Crew Cab, 4X4, 1
Diesel
Price Each $33,244.00 No Bid $34,268.00 No Bid $37,905.00 $34,702.00 $32,824.88 No Bid
Price Total $33,244.00; $34,268.00 $37,905.00 $34,702.00 $32,824.88
Make, Model & Year Offered Ford F250 Crewcab 2013 Ford W2B 2013 Dodge 2500( Chevrolet, CK20743,| 2013 Ford F250 Crew|
4X4 SWB -W2B-2013 2013
Production Cut-Off Date 15 April 2013 12/31/2012 Estimated order date 1/21/13 7/1/13
10/8/12, estimated
Job 1 for DEF diesel
2/25/13
Last day order can be placed 15 April 2013 12/31/2012 5/15/13 10/12] 7/1/13
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Yes| No No No No
cut-off date
Delivery 120 Days 90-110 Days Earliest estimated| 120 Days 90 Days

delivery 3/25/13
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 18, 2012 Bid 1 Bid 2 BuyBoard
For: Light Duty Trucks Caldwell Country Ford|Caldwell Country Grande Truck Center |Grande Truck Center |Grapevine Dodge Gunn Chevrolet Philpott Motors Tom Benson
Chevrolet Chrysler Jeep Chevrolet
6100001531 LD P.O. Box 27 P.O. Box 27 4562 IH 10 East 4562 IH 10 East 2601 William D Tate |12602 IH 35 North 1400 N. Hwy 69 9400 San Pedro Ave
Ave.
Item Description Qty |[Caldwell, Caldwell, San Antonio, San Antonio, Grapevine, San Antonio, Nederland, San Antonio,
TX 77836 TX 77836 TX 78219 TX 78219 TX 76051 TX 78233 TX 77627 TX 78216
8 3/4 Ton Cab & Chassis, Regular 7
Cab, 56" Cab to Axle, SRW with 8
Cages and 1 Storage
Compartment Animal Control Unit
Body
Price Each $44,480.00; $42,989.00; No Bid No Bid No Bid $41,683.70 $40,554.58 No Bid
Price Total $311,360.00; $300,923.00; $291,785.90 $283,882.06
Make, Model & Year Offered Ford F250 R/C F2A- Chevrolet 2500 HD Chevrolet, CC20903,| Ford 2013 F250 Reg
2013| Silverado Reg Cab w/ 2013 Cab
Body CC20903-2013
Make & Model of Body Mavron/Deerskin ATC Deer Skin ACCM§| Bowie - PRO8BWS9, 2012 Custom
7 Fiberglass Coaches
Pro 8W59
Production Cut-Off Date 15 April 2013 15 April 2013 1/21/13] 7/1/13
Last day order can be placed 15 April 2013 15 April 2013 10/12; 7/1/13]
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Yes| Yes| No| No|
cut-off date
Delivery 240 Days,| 180-210 Days: 160 Days 120 Days
9A 3/4 Ton Cab & Chassis, Regular 1
Cab, 56" Cab to Axle Chassis,
SRW, Service Body w/Telescopic
Roof and Pipe Rack
Price Each $30,986.00: No Bid $31,407.00 No Bid $34,027.00 $31,906.70 $28,496.58 No Bid
Price Total $30,986.00 $31,407.00 $34,027.00 $31,906.70 $28,496.58
Make, Model & Year Offered Ford F250 R/C F2A| 2013 Ford F2A| Dodge 2500| Chevrolet, CC20903, 2013 Ford F250
2013 2012/2013 2013
Make & Model of Service Body Knapheide 596J w/| Reading Classic || Knapheide 596J RKI - RKBL5680 RKI
Teletop
Production Cut-Off Date 15 April 2013 12/31/2012 2012-12/21/12 1/21/13 7/1/13]
2013 Est 8/15/13
Last day order can be placed 15 April 2013 12/31/2012 2012-8/30/2012 10/12] 7/1/13
without missing cut-off date 2013-5/15/2013
Can bidder provide bid items after Yes| No| No| No| No|
cut-off date
Delivery 180 Days 75-135 Days 75-90 Days 120 Days 120 Days
9B 3/4 Ton Cab & Chassis, Regular 2
Cab, 56" Cab to Axle Chassis,
SRW, Service Body with
Telescopic Roof and Ladder Rack
Price Each $30,440.00 No Bid $31,639.00 No Bid $33,560.00 $31,081.70 $28,721.58 No Bid
Price Total $60,880.00 $63,278.00 $67,120.00 $62,163.40 $57,443.16
Make, Model & Year Offered Ford F250 R/C F2A- 2013 Ford F2A Dodge 2500| Chevrolet, CC20903, 2013 Ford F250
2013 2012/2013 2013
Make & Model of Service Body Knapheide 596J Reading Classic Il Knapheide 596J RKI - RKBL5680 RKI!
Production Cut-Off Date 15 April 2013 12/31/2012 2012-12/21/12 1/12/13 7/1/13
2013 Est 8/15/13
Last day order can be placed 15 April 2013 12/31/2012 2012-8/30/2012 10/12; 7/1/13]
without missing cut-off date 2013-5/15/2013
Can bidder provide bid items after Yes| No No No No
cut-off date
Delivery 180 Days| 75-135 Days 75-90 Days| 120 Days| 120 Days
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 18, 2012 Bid 1 Bid 2 BuyBoard
For: Light Duty Trucks Caldwell Country Ford|Caldwell Country Grande Truck Center |Grande Truck Center |Grapevine Dodge Gunn Chevrolet Philpott Motors Tom Benson
Chevrolet Chrysler Jeep Chevrolet
6100001531 LD P.O. Box 27 P.O. Box 27 4562 IH 10 East 4562 IH 10 East 2601 William D Tate |12602 IH 35 North 1400 N. Hwy 69 9400 San Pedro Ave
Ave.
Item Description Qty |[Caldwell, Caldwell, San Antonio, San Antonio, Grapevine, San Antonio, Nederland, San Antonio,
TX 77836 TX 77836 TX 78219 TX 78219 TX 76051 TX 78233 TX 77627 TX 78216
9C 3/4 Ton Cab & Chassis, Regular 1
Cab, 56" Cab to Axle Chassis,
SRW, Service Body with Pipe
Rack
Price Each $30,575.00: No Bid $31,643.00; No Bid $33,560.00: $32,020.70 $28,941.58 No Bid
Price Total $30,575.00 $31,643.00 $33,560.00 $32,020.70 $28,941.58
Make, Model & Year Offered Ford F250 R/C-F2A- 2013 Ford F2A| Dodge 2500| Chevrolet, CC20903,| 2013 Ford F250 Reg
2013 2012/2013 2013 Cab
Make & Model of Service Body Knapheide 596J Reading Classic I Knapheide 596J RKI - RKBL5680 RKI
Production Cut-Off Date 15 April 2013 12/31/2012 2012-12/21/12 1/21/13 7/1/13]
2013 Est 8/15/13
Last day order can be placed 15 April 2013 12/31/2012 2012-8/30/2012 10/12] 7/1/13
without missing cut-off date 2013-5/15/2013
Can bidder provide bid items after Yes| No| No| No| No|
cut-off date
Delivery 180 Days 75-130 Days 75-90 Days 120 Days 120 Days
10 3/4 Ton Cab & Chassis, Crew 7
Cab, 56" Cab to Axle Chassis,
SRW, Service Body with Liftgate,
School Bus Yellow
Price Each $33,885.00 No Bid $35,423.00 No Bid $34,592.00 $34,492.05 $29,218.58 No Bid
Price Total $237,195.00 $247,961.00; $242,144.00; $241,444.35 $204,530.06
Make, Model & Year Offered Ford F250 Crewcab 2013 Ford W2A Dodge 2500| Chevrolet, CC20903, 2013 Ford F250
4X2-LWB-W2A-2013 2012/2013 2013
Make & Model of Service Body Knapheide 596J Reading Classic Il Knapheide 596J RKI - RKBL5680 RKI
Make & Model of Liftgate Tommy Gate 60-1040| Tommy Gate 54-1340| Tommygate 60-1340| Tommy Gate - TG60-| Tommy Gate|
TP27 TP27 TP27 1340TP27
Production Cut-Off Date 15 April 2013 12/31/2012 2012-12/21/12 1/21/13 7/1/13]
2013 Est 8/15/13
Last day order can be placed 15 April 2013 12/31/2012 2012-8/30/2012 10/12] 7/1/13
without missing cut-off date 2013-5/15/2013
Can bidder provide bid items after Yes| No| No| No| No|
cut-off date
Delivery 180 Days 90-130 Days 150 Days 120 Days 120 Days
11 1 Ton truck, Regular Cab, Diesel, 1
4X4, Long Bed, SRW
Price Each $30,776.00 No Bid $32,157.00 No Bid No Bid $32,378.05 $29,929.88 No Bid
Price Total $30,776.00:; $32,157.00 $32,378.05 $29,929.88
Make, Model & Year Offered Ford F350 Reg 4X4- 2013 Ford F3B! Chevrolet, CK30903, Ford 2013
F3B-2013 2013
Production Cut-Off Date 15 April 2013 12/31/2012 1/21/13 7/1/13]
Last day order can be placed 15 April 2013 12/31/2012 10/12; 7/1/13]
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Yes| No No No
cut-off date
Delivery 150 Days| 90-110 Days: 120 Days| 90 Days
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 18, 2012 Bid 1 Bid 2 BuyBoard
For: Light Duty Trucks Caldwell Country Ford|Caldwell Country Grande Truck Center |Grande Truck Center |Grapevine Dodge Gunn Chevrolet Philpott Motors Tom Benson
Chevrolet Chrysler Jeep Chevrolet
6100001531 LD P.O. Box 27 P.O. Box 27 4562 IH 10 East 4562 IH 10 East 2601 William D Tate |12602 IH 35 North 1400 N. Hwy 69 9400 San Pedro Ave
Ave.
Item Description Qty |[Caldwell, Caldwell, San Antonio, San Antonio, Grapevine, San Antonio, Nederland, San Antonio,
TX 77836 TX 77836 TX 78219 TX 78219 TX 76051 TX 78233 TX 77627 TX 78216
12 1 Ton Truck, SRW, Crew Cab, 2
Diesel, Long Bed, Tool Box
Price Each $32,470.00:; No Bid $34,011.00: No Bid $36,889.00: $36,052.10 $31,158.60 No Bid
Price Total $64,940.00 $68,022.00 $73,778.00 $72,104.20 $62,317.20
Make, Model & Year Offered Ford F350 Crewcab| 2013 Ford W3A Dodge 3500 2013 Chevrolet, CC30943, Ford 2013 F350
SRW LWB-W3A- 2013
2013
Production Cut-Off Date 15 April 2013 12/31/2012 Est. August 15, 2013 1/21/13 7/1/13]
Last day order can be placed 15 April 2013 12/31/2012 First order date| 10/12] 7/1/13
without missing cut-off date 12/3/12
Can bidder provide bid items after Yes| No| No| No| No|
cut-off date
Delivery 150 Days 90-110 Days Job 1 date 2/25/13 120 Days 90 Days
est. delivery start at|
3/25/13
13 1 Ton Truck, Regular Cab, Cab & 1
Chassis 60" Cab to Axle, Diesel
Engine, SRW, 9' Platform Body
with Tool Boxes
Price Each $34,490.00 No Bid $37,769.00 No Bid No Bid $36,243.96 $33,586.84 No Bid
Price Total $34,490.00:; $37,769.00 $36,243.96 $33,586.84
Make, Model & Year Offered Ford F350 Reg SRW- 2012 Ford F3E! Chevrolet, CC31003, Ford 2013 F350
F3E-141"-2013 2013
Production Cut-Off Date 15 April 2013 12/31/2012 1/21/13 7/1/13]
Last day order can be placed 15 April 2013 12/31/2012 10/12] 7/1/13
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Yes| No| No| No|
cut-off date
Delivery 180 Days 90-120 Days 120 Days 120 Days
14 Minimum 13,000 Ibs. GVWR, Cab 1
& Chassis, Regular Cab, 84" Cab
to Axle, Diesel, DRW, with Stand-
Up Enclosed Utility Body
Price Each $43,780.00: No Bid $42,607.00; No Bid $44,995.00; $47,033.20 $46,227.84 No Bid
Price Total $43,780.00 $42,607.00 $44,995.00 $47,033.20 $46,227.84
Make, Model & Year Offered Ford F350 Reg-F3G- 2013 Ford F3G 2012/2013 Dodge| Chevrolet, CC31403, Ford F350 2013
165"-2013 Ram 3500 2013
Production Cut-Off Date 15 April 2013 12/31/2012 2012-12/21/12 1/21/13] 7/1/13
2013 Est 8/31/13
Last day order can be placed 15 April 2013 12/31/2012 2012 August 31, 10/12; 7/1/13]
without missing cut-off date 2012, 2013 Estimated
May 31, 2013
Can bidder provide bid items after Yes| No No No No
cut-off date
Delivery 180 Days| 90-140 Days: 75-90 Days 120 Days| 120 Days|
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 18, 2012 Bid 1 Bid 2 BuyBoard
For: Light Duty Trucks Caldwell Country Ford|Caldwell Country Grande Truck Center |Grande Truck Center |Grapevine Dodge Gunn Chevrolet Philpott Motors Tom Benson
Chevrolet Chrysler Jeep Chevrolet
6100001531 LD P.O. Box 27 P.O. Box 27 4562 IH 10 East 4562 IH 10 East 2601 William D Tate |12602 IH 35 North 1400 N. Hwy 69 9400 San Pedro Ave
Ave.
Item Description Qty |[Caldwell, Caldwell, San Antonio, San Antonio, Grapevine, San Antonio, Nederland, San Antonio,
TX 77836 TX 77836 TX 78219 TX 78219 TX 76051 TX 78233 TX 77627 TX 78216
15 Minimum 13,000 Ibs. GVWR, 1
DRW, Crew Cab, Cab & Chassis,
60" Cab to Axle, with 2-3 CY
Dump Body
Price Each $41,490.00:; No Bid $41,681.00:; No Bid $42,072.00:; $41,754.51 $38,006.04 No Bid
Price Total $41,490.00 $41,681.00 $42,072.00 $41,754.51 $38,006.04
Make, Model & Year Offered Ford F350 Crewcab- 2013 Ford W3G Dodge 3500| Chevrolet, CC31043, Ford 2013 F350
W3G-176-2013 2012/2013 2013
Make & Model of Dump Body Rugby DU9-3 Rugby DU-9-3 2-3| Rugby DU9-3 w/| RUG-DU11.5-3] Wheeler
Yard HR520ED Hoist|
Production Cut-Off Date 15 April 2013 12/31/2012 2012-12/21/12 1/21/13 7/1/13
2013 Est 8/31/13
Last day order can be placed 15 April 2013 12/31/2012 2012-August 31, 2012 10/12; 7/1/13]
without missing cut-off date - 2013-Estimated May|
31, 2013
Can bidder provide bid items after Yes| No| No| No| No|
cut-off date
Delivery 180 Days 90-140 Days 75-90 Days 120 Days 120 Days
16 Minimum 17,500 Ibs. GVWR, 1
Regular Cab, 84" Cab to Axle,
Cab & Chassis Diesel, Minimum
36ft. Aerial Vehicle with Service
Body
Price Each No Bid No Bid $87,253.00:; $94,361.00:; $90,141.00:; No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price Total $87,253.00 $94,361.00 $90,141.00
Make, Model & Year Offered 2013 Ford F5G 2013 Ford F5G Dodge 5500
2012/2013
Make & Model of Aerial Bucket Versalift SST-37-E1H| Terex Hi-Ranger LT| Versalift SST-37-EIH|
38
Production Cut-Off Date 12/31/2012 12/31/2012 2012-12/21/12
2013 Est 8/31/13
Last day order can be placed 12/31/2012 12/31/2012{2012-August 31, 2012
without missing cut-off date - 2013-Estimated May|
31, 2013,
Can bidder provide bid items after No No No
cut-off date
Delivery 180-240 Days:! 270-330 Days: 180-240 Days:!
17 Cargo Van, Compact, Maximum 1
115" Wheelbase
Price Each $21,640.00 No Bid $20,937.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price Total $21,640.00; $20,937.00

Make, Model & Year Offered

Production Cut-Off Date

Last day order can be placed
without missing cut-off date

Can bidder provide bid items after
cut-off date

Delivery

Ford Transit Connect|
Cargo S6B 2013

1 April 2013

1 April 2013

Yes|

180 Days

2013 Ford S6A
Transit Connect]
12/31/2012
12/31/2012

No|

180-240 Days:!
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 18, 2012 Bid 1 Bid 2 BuyBoard
For: Light Duty Trucks Caldwell Country Ford|Caldwell Country Grande Truck Center |Grande Truck Center |Grapevine Dodge Gunn Chevrolet Philpott Motors Tom Benson
Chevrolet Chrysler Jeep Chevrolet
6100001531 LD P.O. Box 27 P.O. Box 27 4562 IH 10 East 4562 IH 10 East 2601 William D Tate |12602 IH 35 North 1400 N. Hwy 69 9400 San Pedro Ave
Ave.
Item Description Qty |[Caldwell, Caldwell, San Antonio, San Antonio, Grapevine, San Antonio, Nederland, San Antonio,
TX 77836 TX 77836 TX 78219 TX 78219 TX 76051 TX 78233 TX 77627 TX 78216
18A Sport Utility Vehicle, Midsize, 4 1
door, 2WD, Maximum 113"
Wheelbase
Price Each $23,488.00 No Bid $24,743.00 No Bid $26,456.00 No Bid $22,924.92 No Bid
Price Total $23,488.00 $24,743.00 $26,456.00 $22,924.92
Make, Model & Year Offered Ford-Explorer Base 2013 K7B Ford Dodge Durango SSV| Ford Explorer 2013
K7B 2013 Explorer 2013
Production Cut-Off Date 15 April 2013 12/31/2012 Est. August 15, 2013 9/1/13
Last day order can be placed 15 April 2013 12/31/2012 Est. May 15, 2013 9/1/13
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Yes| No| No| No|
cut-off date
Delivery 120 Days 90-110 Days 60 days| 90 Days|
18B Sport Utility Vehicle, Midsize, 4 4
door, 4WD, Maximum 113"
Wheelbase
Price Each $25,180.00: No Bid $26,523.00 No Bid $27,983.00: No Bid $24,704.00; No Bid
Price Total $100,720.00; $106,092.00; $111,932.00; $98,816.00
Make, Model & Year Offered Ford-Explorer 4X4 2013 K8B Ford Dodge Durango SSV/ 2012 Ford Explorer|
K8B 2013 Explorer| 2013
Production Cut-Off Date 15 April 2013 12/31/2012 Est. August 15, 2013 9/1/13
Last day order can be placed 15 April 2013 12/31/2012 Est. May 15, 2013 9/1/13
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Yes| No| No| No|
cut-off date
Delivery 120 Days 90-110 Days 60 days| 90 Days|
19A Minimum 13,000 GCWR, Van, 15 2
passenger, Grey Color
Price Each $24,978.00 No Bid $26,167.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $23,999.00 No Bid
Price Total $49,956.00 $52,334.00 $47,998.00

Make, Model & Year Offered
Production Cut-Off Date

Last day order can be placed
without missing cut-off date

Can bidder provide bid items after
cut-off date

Delivery

Ford E350 Super
Wagon S3B 2013
15 April 2013
15 April 2013

Yes|

120 Days

2013 Ford S3B 15
Passenger Van
12/31/2012
12/31/2012

No|

90-120 Days

Ford 2013 E350
7/1/13

7/1/13]

No|

90 Days
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 18, 2012 Bid 1 Bid 2 BuyBoard
For: Light Duty Trucks Caldwell Country Ford|Caldwell Country Grande Truck Center |Grande Truck Center |Grapevine Dodge Gunn Chevrolet Philpott Motors Tom Benson
Chevrolet Chrysler Jeep Chevrolet
6100001531 LD P.O. Box 27 P.O. Box 27 4562 IH 10 East 4562 IH 10 East 2601 William D Tate |12602 IH 35 North 1400 N. Hwy 69 9400 San Pedro Ave
Ave.
Item Description Qty |[Caldwell, Caldwell, San Antonio, San Antonio, Grapevine, San Antonio, Nederland, San Antonio,
TX 77836 TX 77836 TX 78219 TX 78219 TX 76051 TX 78233 TX 77627 TX 78216
19B Minimum 13,000 GCWR, Van, 15 2
passenger, White Color
Price Each $24,978.00; No Bid $26,167.00; No Bid No Bid No Bid $23,999.00: No Bid
Price Total $49,956.00 $52,334.00 $47,998.00
Make, Model & Year Offered Ford E350 Super 2013 Ford S3B 15 Ford 2013 E350
Wagon S3B 2013 Passenger Van
Production Cut-Off Date 15 April 2013 12/31/2012 7/1/13
Last day order can be placed 15 April 2013 12/31/2012 7/1/13]
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Yes| No No
cut-off date
Delivery 120 Days 90-120 Days 90 Days
20 Minimum GVWR 8,500 Ibs, Van, 4| 1
Passenger/Cargo
Price Each $20,447.00; No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price Total $20,447.00
Make, Model & Year Offered Ford-E250:
Cargo/Pass 47C-E2E-
2013
Production Cut-Off Date 15 April 2013
Last day order can be placed 15 April 2013
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Yes|
cut-off date
Delivery 120 Days|
21 Mini-Van, 6 Passenger 1
Price Each $26,180.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $21,608.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price Total $26,180.00:; $21,608.00

Make, Model & Year Offered

Dodge-Grand
Caravan SE-RTKH53-

Dodge Grand
Caravan SE 2013

2013
Production Cut-Off Date 15 April 2013 Est. August 15, 2013
Last day order can be placed 15 April 2013 Est. May 15, 2013
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Yes| Yes|
cut-off date
Delivery 120 Days| 60 days
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 18, 2012 Bid 1 Bid 2 BuyBoard
For: Light Duty Trucks Caldwell Country Ford|Caldwell Country Grande Truck Center |Grande Truck Center |Grapevine Dodge Gunn Chevrolet Philpott Motors Tom Benson
Chevrolet Chrysler Jeep Chevrolet
6100001531 LD P.O. Box 27 P.O. Box 27 4562 IH 10 East 4562 IH 10 East 2601 William D Tate |12602 IH 35 North 1400 N. Hwy 69 9400 San Pedro Ave
Ave.
Item Description Qty |[Caldwell, Caldwell, San Antonio, San Antonio, Grapevine, San Antonio, Nederland, San Antonio,
TX 77836 TX 77836 TX 78219 TX 78219 TX 76051 TX 78233 TX 77627 TX 78216
22 Step Van, Minimum 14,000 Ibs. 1
GVWR
Price Each $38,875.00: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price Total $38,875.00
Make, Model & Year Offered Ford E450-158-
Utilimaster E4K-2013|
Make & Model of Body Utilimaster 14/
Production Cut-Off Date 15 April 2013
Last day order can be placed 15 April 2013
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Yes|
cut-off date
Delivery 240 Days
23 Full Size, 1/2 Ton Truck, Extended| 7
Cab
Price Each $20,885.00: No Bid $19,769.00: No Bid $21,780.00 $21,354.65 $16,500.00 $22,544.70
Price Total $146,195.00; $138,383.00; $152,460.00; $149,482.55 $115,500.00; $157,812.90;
Make, Model & Year Offered Ford F150 Supercab 2013 Ford X1C Dodge 1500 Quad| Chevrolet, CC10753,| Ford 2011 F150 EXT| Chevrolet, CC10753-
SWB-X1C-2013 Cab 2013 2013 Cab! 2013
Production Cut-Off Date 1 May 2013, 12/31/2012 Est. August 15, 2013 1/21/13] In Stock| April 2013
Last day order can be placed 1 May 2013 12/31/2012 Est. May 31, 2013 10/12; In Stock| April 2013
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Yes| No No No In Stock| No
cut-off date
Delivery 120 Days| 90-110 Days: 60 days| 120 Days! 10 days| 60-90 Days
24 Full Size, 1/2 Ton Truck, Extended| 2
Cab, 4X4
Price Each $23,957.00 No Bid $23,257.00 No Bid $22,599.00 $24,362.05 $22,621.92 $25,653.05
Price Total $47,914.00; $46,514.00 $45,198.00 $48,724.10 $45,243.84 $51,306.10
Make, Model & Year Offered Ford F150 Supercab 2013 Ford X1E] Dodge 1500 Quad| Chevrolet, CK10753,| 2013 Ford F150 EXT| Chevrolet, CK10753-
4X4 SWB-X1E-2013 Cab 2013 2013 4XA] 2013
Production Cut-Off Date 1 May 2013 12/31/2012 Est. August 15, 2013 1/21/13 7/1/13] April 2013,
Last day order can be placed 1 May 2013 12/31/2012 Est. May 31, 2013 10/12] 7/1/13 April 2013
without missing cut-off date
Can bidder provide bid items after Yes| No| No| No| No| No|
cut-off date
Delivery 120 Days 90-110 Days 60 days| 120 Days 90 Days| 60-90 Days
BuyBoard Fee 1
Price Each $0.00; $0.00; $0.00; $0.00; $0.00; $400.00 $0.00; $0.00;
Price Total $0.00; $0.00! $0.00; $0.00; $0.00! $400.00 $0.00! $0.00;
Shop Manuals 4
Price Each $0.00; $0.00; $0.00; $0.00; $0.00; $250.00 $0.00; $0.00;
Price Total $0.00! $0.00; $0.00! $0.00! $0.00! $1,000.00 $0.00! $0.00!
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30| 2.5%-10 Days, Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Estimated Totals $2,175,693.00 $300,923.00; $1,975,857.00 $94,361.00 $1,544,909.00 $1,930,219.82 $1,884,547.11 $987,057.74;
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